
Vampire 1091

Chapter 1091  Misunderstandings (2)

Unaware of the chaos brewing back at home, Lith left Florencia's place with Alexandra and Hecate. 
Once he took an exit from the door, he found himself in an alley, and walking a little further, he and 
the rest arrived at a busy street of Greenville City. The Mother of all Witches around the world lived 
in a separate dimension, the door of which was at multiple places. It was known only to a select few 
people and as Hecate was the favorite child, she was given access to the door closest to her office.

The door was at a shady place and as there weren't any criminals or low life witches, none would 
try to hang out in an alley and definitely wouldn't open a door in a suspicious place like that. 
Greenville City resembled New York from Earth. There were a lot of high rise buildings and flashy 
billboards everywhere. The only difference was that it wasn't a concrete jungle and had lots and lots 
of greenery. The name Greenville City wasn't just for show. "What does His Highness want me to 
do next?" Hecate asked while walking beside Lith. Alexandra had her arms locked with the lady 
Lith's, and as this was a continent purely of women, such actions weren't taboo or unsightly. It was 
quite common. "You should show us around," said Lith, smiling. "My wife and I would love some
—"

Intense spatial fluctuations occurred right at this moment beside Lith and a shrill voice interrupted 
him.

"Yooouuuuuuuuu!"

Darkness flashed in front of Lith's eyes and in the next moment, he found himself standing under a 
dark sky filled with crimson brilliance. In front of him was a mature, motherly lady, someone who 
was the absolute pinnacle of beauty — Lilith. Surrounding Lilith were Arya, Alea, Luna, Qingyue, 
and Freya.

"Look at me!" Lith heard a familiar voice. Turning to the source, he saw his sister, Lucy, giving him 
a death glare. "What's going on…" Lith asked, dumbfounded. "That's what I'd like to ask!" Lucy 
exclaimed. She was holding Lith by his robes' scuffle and seemed really pissed. "Are you her 
child?" Lucy asked with knitted brows, pointing at Lilith. Lith was stupefied. What kind of question 
was this? No, first of all, why was his sister so angry? What happened?



Not getting an answer, Lucy's mood turned sour. She held Lith's chin and made him look at Lilith. 
"Her. Is she your mother or not?" Lith was completely taken aback. He could see his mother sighing 
and rubbing her temples while the maids behind her were smiling. There was also Alea who seemed 
to be deep in thought, and lastly,

Arya was back!

Lith hadn't seen her in a long time and wanted to greet her, but given the predicament he was in, it 
seemed like he had to wait. Also, he wondered why Arya was looking at him with a confused gaze. 
Although she had her opaque glasses on, he could still feel the confusion she was in through her 
body language alone. That's the level of understanding he had of her.

"Answer!" Lucy exclaimed, her tone slightly louder than before.

Lith snapped out of his thoughts and reflexively said, "Yeah, of course she is. Why would you ask 
such a stupid question?"

"…"

The maids, Alea, Arya, and even Lilith went silent. The maids covered their faces, their expressions 
reading: 'Oh no…' Lith didn't have to wait to understand why they made such a face. He could feel 
an intense bloodlust coming from his side.

Turning to look at Lucy, this was the first time Lith had ever seen her so angry. He frowned and 
held her shoulders. "Big sis, what's wrong—"

"Don't you dare call me big sister!" Lucy snapped and raised her voice. She did not get physical as, 
at the end of the day, the girl in front of her was her mother and brother's child. Hurting her was out 
of question as she was her family. Lucy held Lith's collar and stared right into his eyes. "You… 
whatever your name is… I am not accepting you. Not now, at least. Don't come near my sight for 
the next few decades otherwise…"



Lucy snorted and threatened Lith. Truly confused out of his wits, Lith turned to look at his mother, 
wondering what was up with his sister. Lilith sighed again and shook her head with a smile. She 
walked towards Lucy and held her shoulder.

"My dear, calm down, will you."

"No, I won't—"

"Listen to me, my dear." Lilith held Lucy's face with both her hands and stopped her from speaking. 
Her tone also got more motherly and warm, making Lucy feel comfortable and like a child, even 
though she was a proper adult now. "Calm yourself down for a second and look at who that is."

"What?"

Lilith didn't explain and directly turned Lucy to face Lith. "Look at her," Lilith smiled. "Doesn't she 
look oddly familiar?" Lucy felt irritated. What sort of question was this? "Of course she does! She's 
your and little brother's child. How can she not look like you two?"

"Eh?" Lith was dumbfounded. "What?"

"Ehhhhh?" Lith was shocked. He looked at his hands, then at himself, and then realized… he 
fucked up!

"Son of a— never mind. I get what's going on. You guys…"

Lith glared at his maids, then at his mother, and shot them a disappointed look. He then looked at 
Lucy and instead of explaining anything to her, took a step close to her and…



PAH!

"What!?!?" Lucy's eyes widened in shock. Did this girl just…

"You idiot," Lith held Lucy's face with one hand and squished it, making her appear like a fish. 
"How can you not make out who I am? And how did you even come to such an understanding?"

This statement caused a short-circuit in Lucy's brain box, making her thoughts go blank 
momentarily. Initially she thought that her mother's daughter had come up to her and spanked her 
ass out of nowhere, but when she felt the way in which it was spanked, the force used, and the tone 
in which the girl spoke, it all seemed oddly familiar. Watching the fiasco, the one who caused all the 
misunderstanding, Arya, was getting highly suspicious. It was to the point that she had to remove 
her glasses and see things unfold with her own two eyes. Lilith felt it was enough playing around. 
She snapped her fingers and signaled Luna to get into action. Lith's body flashed with a bright light 
and in an instant, the red witch robes were replaced by a fine black suit. "Ohhhhh!" Arya clapped 
her hands and exclaimed. It finally clicked her. "Huh?" Lucy blinked her eyes repeatedly and stared 
at Lith. "What?"

PAH!

"Ow!" Lucy felt a sharp pain run through her body as she got another hit. "Snap out of it." The 
situation finally became clear as she gained clarity and heard that deep, masculine voice of her 
husband. "…"

"Oh!" Alea clasped her hands. "So it was like that."

"My lady, it was always like that." Qingyue commented from the side. She couldn't fathom how 
Alea could even misunderstand something she clearly had a clear idea of. This young lady's thought 
process was difficult to gauge. It was best if she was left alone. Lucy, having understood what had 
transpired, felt her ears go red and covered her face. "What have you done…" She said softly. 
Everyone smiled at her response. Lith hugged her and while patting her back, looked at his mother. 
"You teased her a little too much, mom."



Lilith hugged the two and chuckled softly. "It seems like it."

Hugging Lith firmly, Lucy meekly said, "Seriously… I'll kill you if you have children with anyone 
before me."

Lith chuckled nervously at the blatant threat while Lilith placed her chin over Lucy's head and said, 
"He may have children with anyone, but my dear, you should know that, mama doesn't plan to have 
anymore kids. You two are my whole world and enough for me."

Lith decided to use his right to remain silent on this one. Commenting anything would get him in 
trouble. A few seconds later, the Evure trio felt another pair of hands wrap around them. "Tch. Tch. 
I'm part of the family too now. How can you guys hug without me?" Arya said as she placed her 
arm around Lith and Lilith. "Me too! Me too! Alea wants a hug too!" Alea said and dashed to hug 
them as well. The group had a hearty laugh at the union and after a few minutes, Lith broke the hug 
and said, "Alright, I should get back now."

"Get back?" Arya asked. "Where?"

Lith pointed at the tablet in Qingyue's hand. On the screen, Alexandra and Hecate were visible. 
They looked confused and were looking around, probably searching for Lith. "I was kidnapped 
against my wish. Alexandra must be worried. I should get her back."

"Oh." Arya nodded. "Yes, you should do that first."

She walked towards Lith and held his face. Giving him a peck on his lips, she said, "Don't be late. 
It's been a while since I've spent some alone time with you. We're going on a date after this."

Lith raised his eyebrows in amusement while the rest of the ladies were baffled by the 
straightforwardness and shamelessness of Arya. For a second, everyone had forgotten what sort of 
personality Arya was. She never hid anything that was on her mind and was carefree. She was 
definitely more shameless than even Lucifer, who had reservations at times due to her pride and 



didn't speak freely. "Wifey's wish is my command." Lith smiled and kissed Arya back. "Have some 
tea with the rest, I'll be back in a bit."

Saying so, Lith waved at Arya and the rest, and vanished from the spot, leaving for the Witch 
Continent again, unaware that he wasn't disguised as a girl anymore. 

Chapter 1092  Tug Of War For Date

VOOOOOOOOOOOMMMMM—!

A loud alarm resounded throughout Greenville City as Lith stepped foot in it. "Your Highness, 
nooooo!" Hecate exclaimed as she saw Lith. Alexandra immediately went to his side and took a 
defensive stance, ready to protect her husband for whatever may come. "What's happening?" Lith 
frowned and asked. Hecate went to Lith's side and covered him. She was in the midst of casting 
spells and in a great hurry. Despite that, she responded, "The capital is really sensitive to males. You 
wouldn't even find a worm that's male here."

"Oh… crap."

It hit him now. He wasn't disguised as a girl anymore and had triggered the alarms by entering this 
place. Here was thinking of having a good time with his wife, exploring the streets of Greenville 
City, eating hotdogs and donuts while admiring the greenery… but things never always go one's 
way, do they?

Lith held Alexandra and Hecate's hands and sent a strand of his spiritual power into the 
teleportation badge in his pocket.

Space fluctuated around the three and Lith vanished from the spot. The alarm went off and shortly 
after, a group of witches arrived at the spot Lith was previously at. "Suspect's vanished, senior." 
One of the witches said into her mouthpiece. "Continue the search. Be on the lookout in nearby 
areas." A professional voice resounded in her earpiece. "Roger that, senior."



The group of witches vanished and went in search of Lith, but alas, they would never succeed in 
doing so as Lith was back in the Royal Castle, right in the courtyard where he had just parted ways 
with Arya.

"That was quicker than I thought. Someone seems eager to go on a date, ey?" Arya asked with a 
smile as she placed her teacup down. Her carefree voice reached Alexandra's ears and her eyes lit 
up. She turned to look at her and called out, "Big sis!"

Arya got up and opened her arms with a smile. "Won't give your older sister a hug?"

"Big sis!" Alexandra called out again and ran towards Arya to hug her. She wrapped her arms 
around her body and placed her head on her shoulder. "You were gone for so long," she complained 
after getting comfortable. Arya rubbed Alexandra's back and said, "Had work, couldn't help it. You 
seem to have grown healthier and prettier in the time I haven't seen you."

"Mm." Alexandra had a slight blush form on her face and she rubbed her nose on Arya's shoulder in 
embarrassment. Arya smirked and caressed Alexandra's lushly hair. "You're my little sister and we 
both share the same husband. Too bad though, I'm going on a date with him right now. You won't be 
able to see him."

"Huh?" Alexandra broke the hug and stared at Arya with knitted brows. "What did you say, big sis?"

To make matters clear, Arya walked up to Lith and held his arm from the side. "Me. Date. Husband. 
Now."

"!!!?" All the warmth she got from Arya vanished as Alexandra's gaze got colder. She walked up to 
Lith as well and held his other arm. "You're not taking darling anywhere. He's mine right now."

Arya laughed and wore her pitch black glasses. She looked at Alexandra and said, "You're a million 
years too young to fight your big sis, Lexa."



Alexandra pouted in annoyance and pulled Lith away from Arya. "Let's go on our date, darling!"

"He's coming with me, honey." Arya said with a hearty laugh and pulled Lith to the other side.

Lith smiled helplessly and looked at the ladies sitting around the round table. Lilith and Lucy 
shrugged and sipped tea while Alea was…

'Hm? A tower?'

A card tower was slowly being built on the table. Alea was patient with the placement of each card 
and her complete focus was on this. Freya was giving her helping hand while Luna and Qingyue 
were busy doing something on their tablet screens. Alexandra and Arya continued to have their tug 
of war and tried to stretch Lith like string cheese. There seemed to be no end to their conflict, hence 
Lith intervened by wrapping his arms around the two and saying, "Ladies, ladies, ladies. Let's calm 
down, shall we?"

His soothing voice calmed the two down and made them look up at him, wondering what he had to 
say. He better not choose the other, was what was going on their minds as they stared at him. Lith 
smiled and kissed the two's heads one by one. "Why fight, when we can go on a date together?"

"No!" Alexandra shook her head. Arya rolled her eyes and pinched Lith's abdomen. "Didn't I tell 
you? I want some alone time, it's been a while."

Lith felt helpless once again. "Then, how about this? Let's do a coin toss. It'll be completely fair and 
you both will have a fifty-fifty chance at it."

"I'll do the tossing for you two, if you agree." Lilith interjected. "See. Even mom agrees with it." 
Lith clasped his hands and said. Alexandra and Arya thought about it, then nodded their heads. This 
was better than them fighting like wild cats.



"Okay, choose one." Lilith said and tossed an amethyst coin with a clinking sound. "Heads." 
Alexandra said quickly. "Tails for me then." Arya had no choice but to accept. The coin flew in the 
air at an unreasonably high speed, flipping so fast that neither Alexandra nor Arya could make out 
what was happening. The coin soon landed on the ground in front of the two and after some tossing 
and turning, it landed at tails.

"Ugh." Alexandra felt physical pain from watching the results. "Heh." Arya chuckled heartily and 
went to console her little sister. She patted her head and said, "better luck next time."

"Tsk. Don't talk to me." Alexandra brushed her hand away and went to sit beside Lucy at the round 
table, accepting her defeat. Lith shook his head and smiled. Some things couldn't be helped. "Let's 
gooooo!" Arya locked her arms with Lith's and said while raising her fist cheerfully. The pair of 
love birds bid the rest farewell and left for their private date. While they were gone, there was a 
certain someone in the courtyard that was feeling nervous. This young lady in purple witch robes 
stood at the side, unmoving, and awaited instructions from the people around her, hoping to get 
dismissed or given some work. Lilith didn't make her wait for long and said, "Have a seat, Hecate."

Hecate bowed and thanked Lilith. She took a seat at the opposite side, beside Luna and Qingyue, 
and looked at Lilith. Seated beside her, Lucy crossed her legs and asked, "What was going on? Why 
was my little brother with you?"

"It's like this…" Hecate began explaining the things that had transpired. Everyone except Alea 
listened carefully and tried to ponder over the things Lith was planning. Lucy raised her eyebrows 
in surprise and asked, "He made Florencia step down and submit to us?"

"Correction: you made her step down, not him." Lilith said with a smile. "What?" Lucy was 
confused. "How and when did I do that?"

Hecate replied to that, "His Highness resembles a lot like Your Majesty when disguised. He may not 
look completely similar, but I'm sure Mother would not be able to point this out."

Lilith nodded her head. "It's difficult to tell you two apart. If you two were to take pictures and 
place them side by side, even I would have trouble differentiating them."



"Seriously?" Lucy knitted her brows and asked. Was her little brother's disguise this good?

Lilith nodded her head.

"Your Majesty, simply differentiating you from Madam is a challenging task. When you were on 
live television across the continent, none thought that you weren't Madam. That's the level of 
resemblance you share with each other." Luna said with a smile. "Fufufu…" Lilith rubbed Lucy's 
head. "Didn't I do a good job in making them? No one would be able to tell we aren't related. It 
brings me great joy to see the mini mes I've created."

Lucy's eyebrows twitched at the lame joke while the maids giggled softly. Alea was as focused as 
before. She had made four floors of the tower with cards by now. They looked like they'd collapse 
due to a single gust of wind, but somehow, she was already moving to create the fifth one!

"Well, Ma'am, I cannot tell what His Highness is planning. I do not possess the necessary strength 
to be the Queen Mother and—"

"Do you want to?" Lilith cut her off and asked. "Pardon?" Hecate didn't understand. Lilith laidback 
on her chair and asked leisurely, "I said do you want to become the Queen Mother?"

"…oh." Hecate was at a loss for words. Did she want to? She thought to herself. There were many 
that would kill to be in that position, but was Hecate in the same category as the rest?

The answer was a big no. Being a Queen Mother meant a lot of responsibilities. Hecate did not want 
that. She wanted the absolute well being of the witches around the world, but did not want to be the 
one to take responsibility for providing them that. It was too tiring. However, being the Queen 
Mother, she could actually clear the bad image of her race as she would have all the witches obey 
her and listen to her. In this manner, she could lead them onto the right path and watch them grow 
mightier. Them growing would result in lots of innovations and exciting tech. Hecate liked these 
things and was eager to watch them. It was a difficult decision to make and she took a few minutes 
to decide. "So…?" Lilith asked after another minute. Hecate knew she couldn't make this almighty 
being wait. She cleared her throat, bowed, and said, "If Ma'am insists on this, then my answer is…"



Chapter 1093  Whimsical Wonderland

Jingmei Guild, Lenz City. Keith was working in her office as usual. Her devilishly beautiful face 
had glaring dark circles and she seemed quite tired while scribbling things on the papers. At this 
moment, a woman with slanted eyebrows walked in, wearing red high heels. She was Hei, the 
communicator between Keith and the guild staff of Jingmei Guild. Whenever Hei arrived, Keith 
would feel a headache as she did not appear without reasons. Only when something major would 
happen would Hei come to meet her. Lately, it has been happening often. Hei held a few files in her 
arms and gave a deep bow of respect to Keith. "President, there's trouble… again."

'Of course there is.' Keith was irritated, but didn't show it on her face. "What is it this time?" Hei 
placed the files in her hands onto Keith's desk and said, "The FAA members wanted to take a break 
from fighting the WAA. They collectively decided to go to the amusement park in Uklov, 
undercover, and have fun. However, the WAA got this information and are about to send a team of 
skilled personnel to wipe out our members once and for all." Keith propped her elbows on the desk 
and interlocked her fingers. She sighed and placed her forehead on her fingers, trying to 
contemplate the situation. 'Take a deep breath. Take a deep breath. Take a deep breath.' Keith 
chanted to herself.

Idiots. There were literal idiots in her organization. What did they think would happen if they pulled 
out such a move? What were they even expecting!?

Keith had a lot of such thoughts and was trying her best to stay sane. She was a really patient 
person. Extremely so. Her past had shaped her into such a being. However, years after becoming a 
president of this organization, Keith realized just how stupid people were. These morons couldn't 
get a single thing right and were adept at dying at the hands of the experienced members of the 
WAA. If Keith was allowed to use her strength, she would've long solved the situation. But being 
asked to use her brains, things were starting to get on her nerves.  Hei, watching the President's tired 
expression, cleared her throat and said, "President, the issue is big, but not as difficult to solve."

Keith raised her head and looked at Hei with tired eyes. Getting the lady's attention, Hei continued, 
"You once mentioned that you cannot meddle directly. This means that you can do it indirectly, 
right? If that's the case, President, you should visit the amusement park."



"Visit the park?" Keith asked. Hei nodded her head. "You will get a small break from the hectic 
schedule while you're there. It's going to be relaxing. While on this vacation, all the President has to 
do is keep the WAA and FAA members separated. I'm sure that with your skills, it'll be a cakewalk."

Keith pondered over it. She did not know how one could relax in an amusement park, and also had 
no idea what this amusement park was. As it was Hei that was suggesting it, she considered going 
there. She really needed a small break but was chained to this office as she had to manage the entire 
FAA. However, if she went to this park, she would still be working and also get to relax and have a 
breath of fresh air. It didn't seem that bad all of a sudden. "How much of my time will be consumed 
there?" Keith asked.

"Two days at best." Hei replied immediately. "Everyone had scheduled their vacation for two 
nights, so if nothing went wrong, President can be back at office after that."

"Okay." Keith replied. This seemed to be a good time to wind down and relax. "When are they 
leaving?"

Hei took out her phone from her space ring and checked the time. "…in about thirty minutes."

"…"

Keith was dumbfounded. "Thirty minutes? They're going today?" Hei nodded her head. "They made 
this plan last night in a hurry. The WAA is really quick to respond to such an emergency situation."

Keith rubbed her temples. 'What a headache!'

She had pending work and had to finish it by today, but if she did not leave now, she wouldn't be 
able to have a break again. It was truly a disaster. "President, we should hurry. If we do not reach 
that place on time, I'm afraid that our members would be killed mercilessly."

"Tsk." Keith clicked her tongue and got up. She grabbed long coat and said, "Let's leave then."



…..

Uklov, Neutral Continent. It was a warm yet cold morning in Uklov. It was winter yet the city was 
bustling with activities. Lith and Arya, hand-in-hand, stopped in front of a majestic colorful arch 
that had giant letters etched on it that read:

WHIMSICAL WONDERLAND This was the name of the amusement park they had just arrived at. 
The arch was the entry gate and it was said that walking inside would lead them to a whole new 
world. "Shall we?" Lith asked his wife. The two had purple bands on their wrists and a rectangular 
stamp on the area between their thumb and index fingers. The audacity to mark something on a 
royalty would result in getting beheaded, and to avoid that, the amusement park had other measures. 
They had vvip programs in which they provided the people with tokens and gave them unrestricted 
access to all places. They also gave them a guide and security so that normal people won't mess 
with them and get killed.

The Vampire Prince and the Ruler of Underworld were together in this place. They bought the most 
expensive tickets a normal person could buy and did not bother to get the vvip treatment. It would 
just freak everybody out and put the amusement park on high alert. No one could enjoy their time 
here due to them. It was in everyone's best interest and hence, the two were walking inside the gates 
like commoners. "Hahahaha! Finally! I finally get to be free!"

Lith and Arya heard loud cheerful noises behind them. They ignored it and continued to walk on the 
cobblestone pavement decorated with lush green vines. "It was the correct decision to be here! I am 
glad we did it!" Someone said behind Lith and Arya. A large group of men and women were talking 
loudly and having a fun time behind them. They were dressed in casual clothing with sun hats and 
shades to accessorize themselves. Lith wore an open white shirt with pink floral patterns on it along 
with white shorts and shoes. Inside the shirt was a white tank top and his eyes were covered by 
sunglasses while his hair breezed freely above his head. Arya wore a white t-shirt that clung 
perfectly to her body, blue ripped denim jeans that showed some of her skin on her legs, and had a 
pink shirt wrapped around her waist along with a pink hat and her usual opaque sunglasses. The 
two's outfits were matching and anyone could tell that they were a couple. Lith and Arya held hands 
and were enjoying the area they were walking at. This was a long tunnel that would lead them to a 
different dimension where the amusement park was actually located. "Hahaha, and then, and then— 
hahahaha!"

Bump!



"—ohhh!"

A man with his fits of laughter bumped into Lith accidentally. Lith turned his head to the side to 
look at him, and being a domineering, tall man with visible signs of being a warrior, the man 
laughed nervously and rubbed the back of his head. "My apologizes." The man said and went back 
to talking with his group of friends. Lith ignored the bearded guy and began conversing with Arya. 
"Hahaha, and that day, Ivan actually slipped and broke his legs!" Someone behind Lith said with a 
jolly tone. "Hahahahaha!"

"Hahahahaha!"

Their group went into relentless laughter and in the midst of this, the bearded man that had 
previously hit Lith bumped into Arya. "Haha— Ahh! My apologies. My sincere apologies!" The 
man began bowing and said. Arya looked at him for a second, then ignored him like how Lith had 
done before. The man got a way out once again and continued to chat with his group of friends. "I'm 
wondering whether we should've taken that vvip pass." Lith said.

Arya shook her head. "This feels more private and intimate. I wouldn't want dudes to be roaming 
around me while I'm on a date with you."

"Fair." Lith nodded. He then looked in the front and saw a long line. "But look at this. It'll take us a 
solid ten minutes to even enter the park."

"That's fine. We get to talk more in that period." Arya said and laughed. Not even a minute has 
passed with their conversation starting when the bearded man from before's laughter was heard 
again. "Hahahaha! Ivan is way too funny! Hahahaha—"

Bump!

The man bumped into Arya once again. Thinking he'll get away with it, he took a step back and said 
with a smile, "My apolog—"



BURST!

Arya slapped the man and made his entire body burst, not giving him another chance to speak. The 
explosion was contained and the blood and flesh didn't splatter around. A core was in front of Arya 
and it was the last piece of what remained of that man. If this was left alone, he would regenerate 
and come back to life. CRACK. CRACK. CRACCKKKKK!

Arya gripped the core in her hand, making cracks form, and eventually her fist tight, turning the 
core to dust. As everyone heard the sound, they gasped in horror and looked at Arya as if she was a 
monster. "W, w, what!?"

"What just happened?!?"

"Oh. My. God. Did someone kill Joquill?"

"What the fuck…"

"Shit there's an enemy here! Everyone get into position!"

The entire group took a defensive stance and stared at Lith and Arya vigilantly. Lith sighed and 
shook his head. "People just can't stop courting death, can they?"

Chapter 1094  They Should Be Grateful And Thank Us Instead

The entrance to the Whimsical Wonderland erupted in chaos as a large group saw one of its 
members get killed. Their initial panic and confusion soon turned into rage and one of the men in 
the group walked up to Lith and Arya, showing a golden-colored badge.

"Do you have any idea where we are from? See this badge? We—"



Arya touched her index finger to the guy's glabella. BURST!

"Hwaaaaa—!"

People gasped once again, this time in horror. "This bitch! She has the audacity to kill a gold ranker 
from the World Adventurer's Association!" "The Association won't leave you!" People screamed 
and once again charged at Arya, their judgment clouded with their high statuses in the association.  
Lith shook his head and took a step ahead. It was his duty to protect his lady, and although the lady 
was much stronger than him, it was the thought that counted!

"Get the fuck away from her!" A man said and tried to slap Lith's face. A sharp crack echoed 
through the air as Lith's foot connected with the man's chin, like a dry branch snapping in two. His 
bones broke and his face was disfigured instantly. "Ooooommmmmhhhhh!"

His scream was jarring and disturbing to hear. A man near him was watching the whole fiasco 
unfold silently. He hadn't spoken a single word since the start. Looking at how laidback this young 
man in a floral shirt and his lady seemed, he knew it was going to be a bad decision to fight them. 
Thus, he quickly put himself in between the disfigured face guy and Lith. "Wait, sir. Please." The 
man crossed his arms and tried to call in for peace.  "It was my colleague's mistake to have acted 
this way and I humbly apologize for it. No, not just me, we all apologize for the trouble we've 
caused. Everyone, bow down!"

On the man's commands, some bowed down, but the others said:

"Huh? You're afraid of mere commoners? Have you forgotten who we are? Where we belong to? 
And what our status is?" One of the women in the group said, her pride taking over her. "I agree. 
That lady killed Joquill for the actions he committed. The situation is resolved so why should we 
apologize? And it's already magnanimous of us to not pursue this matter further. That woman and 
her boyfriend should be grateful and thank us instead."

"Yes! I agree with her." A man beside the lady said. One after another, voices erupted in agreement 
and the man who had asked everyone to apologize felt dread. He was in a deep bow and sweating 



profusely. Only a few were bowing along with him and the rest were voicing out complaints in front 
of Lith and Arya. Lith took a step towards the bowing man and patted his shoulder. He fiercely 
stared at the crowd and said, "It takes a lot of courage to accept your wrongs and be accountable for 
it. It also takes a lot of wisdom to know when to surrender and in front of whom to surrender."

Calling for peace was the right option in a lot of situations. The greatest war victory is in a war that 
was never fought. This was applicable most of the time, but if the enemy had no intention of letting 
you go after surrender, it was best to fight them to death. Lith and Arya were on a date. They also 
wouldn't bother to kill anyone who surrendered in front of them as to them, they all felt like ants 
that could be crushed anytime. Killing them would only waste their precious time. The man did the 
right thing by submitting, and as for the ones that were heckling behind him…

Lith patted the man's shoulder again and took a step towards the heckling crowd. "If you had 
apologized like this man, me and my wife would've left you alone. But you just couldn't help 
making matters worse, could you?"

"What—"

A sizzling sound cut off any words that were about to come out of the people's mouths as a bright 
crimson ray shot from Lith's index finger towards them. This was a fusion spell made up of 
Destruction and Fire elemental energy. It used the elements within Lith instead of the surroundings 
and shot towards the people with the help of the surrounding elements. Throughout the years, Lith 
had learnt that throwing the elements from one's own body was faster than willing the elemental 
energies from the surroundings. The energies from the body did not mix with the energies from the 
surrounding. They did not get resisted either and were as if totally different things. The reason for 
such a change was due to the spiritual power mixed with the elemental energies of the body. The 
spell hit the man that was about to speak and melted his face, not giving him a chance to even 
scream. In a few seconds, only his core was left on the ground as gasps of absolute terror sounded 
from around him.  "I am trying my best to not kill unnecessarily yet I can't let this one slide. You'll 
just bother us again in the park. It's better if you left."

Lith said and pulled the elemental energies in front of him with his finger as if he was pulling a 
guitar string. As he let the elemental energy go, a hundred rays shot from his body and hit the many 
adventurers of WAA. The ones that weren't killed instantly were hit by Arya's Space spell and 
banished into the void. The only ones surviving were the bowing guys. Lith turned around, patted 
the bowing guy's shoulder again, and said while walking away, "Pick up the cores of the fools that 
weren't sent to the void. Take care of them and make sure to not bother us in the park."



Lith then held Arya's hand and gave her a smile. "See, I told you that the vvip program would've 
been better."

Arya smirked and said, "And I am telling you again that it's better this way."

She then leaned closer to Lith's ears and continued, "If we had security, we wouldn't be able to 
escape to a secluded place and have sex. We also couldn't do it in the open, behind some trees or in 
the bushes."

"Oh." Lith did not think about this before. "Shit, indeed."

Arya continued smirking and gave Lith's butt a slap. "The wife's always right."

Lith raised his eyebrow and said, "I get that, but why would you slap it? It should be the other way 
round, shouldn't it?"

"Oh, absolutely." Arya laughed softly. She leaned close to her husband's ear once again and said, 
"You're anyway going to slap it later. And it's going to be many times more than this. Let me have 
some fun till then."

Lith planned to refute her because no answer seemed correct to get his butt slapped like that. 
However, Arya's answer made him swallow his words and frown because of how much sense they 
made. "Tsk. It's dangerous to converse with you." Arya laughed again, this time heartily. "Then shut 
my lips."

Lith felt tempted, but then clicked his tongue and said, "Let's get out of this entrance first. We'll be 
stuck here forever if we give in to your thoughts."



Arya chuckled and didn't say anything further. She held Lith's hand and the two made their way 
inside the amusement park as fast as they could. Meanwhile, behind the two, another large group of 
people in casual clothings could be seen having a good time walking in the entrance. This group 
was relaxed and laid back. They seemed like the usual commoners and nothing about them was 
special. The group was at a distance from Lith and Arya. They entered the amusement park five 
minutes after them. Once the group vanished, a red-haired lady wearing a brown wide-brimmed hat, 
red skirt, white top, and white sandals appeared in the entrance along with another lady with similar 
clothing. "President, so far, nothing seems wrong." Hei said to Keith. "Mm. I hope my assistance is 
not required." Keith said and walked together with Hei. Hei nodded her head and replied, "Don't 
worry too much about them, President. Just try to relax. The amusement park has a lot to offer."

Keith gave her a nod and finally entered the park, about to see what it was all about and how she 
could relax here.  She was initially sceptical about it, but after watching a few videos online and 
knowing more about it, the park did not seem so bad.

'I hope they don't cause too much trouble...' 

Chapter 1095  Gold Rush

Crossing the entrance, Lith and Arya found themselves in the middle of four dark and giant tunnels. 
Each tunnel's entrance had an arched gate on which the letters read:

North Gate — Whimsical Wonderpark

East Gate — Whimsical Snowpark

South Gate — Whimsical Waterpark

West Gate — Whimsical Skypark

There were four different areas they could go in and each brought a different kind of experience. 
"Where to?" Lith asked Arya. Arya thought about it and said, "Water will be the last. As for the 
others, you decide."



In Arya's mind, she was thinking that the waterpark would be more laid back and she could have 
slow, poolside sex with her husband to end their date. Oblivious to her thoughts, Lith nodded and 
said, "Let's go to the wonderpark then. We would need a change of clothes in the other two and this 
one has a lot of forest area to fulfill your fantasies."

Lith winked at his wife, making her chuckle. "Then what are we waiting for? Let's go!"

Arya pulled Lith's hand and took him inside the wonderpark.

While the two left, right behind, a red-haired beauty wearing a brown sun hat stared at them with a 
dumbfounded gaze. 'That was… him. Wasn't it?'

Due to the delay in deciding which park to go to, Keith caught up to them. Looking at her staring at 
a cute couple, Hei tilted her head and asked, "Is something wrong, President? You've been staring at 
that couple for quite some time."

"Nothing." Keith replied instantly. "Let's go to that place."

Hei felt something was up when Keith decided to go in the same direction as the couple, but she 
didn't voice it out. She truly hoped that the President took a break and relaxed. The two redheads 
walked into the wonderpark entrance and what met their sight was a bright view of an amazing 
amusement park.

There were waterfalls, a large pond, roller coaster rides, people screaming in awe, and lots and lots 
of people wearing all sorts of fun things and having fun with the park mascots. "What sort of place 
is this…" Keith commented. She had never seen such a jolly atmosphere before. Hei gestured to a 
man who sold lollipops, headbands, and funny goggles to come near her. While doing so, she 
replied, "Some werewolf  from the Werewolf Continent came up with this genius idea about fifty 
thousand years ago. They called it an amusement park because one would be really amused in this 
place."



The man Hei had called came near her. She paid him coins and bought two big, flat lollipops and 
cat ears headbands. Making him go away, she continued, "People at that time were skeptical about 
this, but later genuinely began having fun as the werewolf man had expected them to. It became big 
news and people flocked to this place from around the world."

Hei handed the lollipop to Keith, who unconsciously took it. She placed a red-colored cat ears 
headband on her hat and continued speaking, "It was said that it took a lot of time for the werewolf 
man to create this. It was thousands of years of manual labor and research."

Keith saw a group of people seated on chairs sling shot their way up in the air, then fall with great 
acceleration, then sling shot back to the top. The people on it were screaming, some in terror, some 
in amazement. Keith unconsciously licked the lollipop as she got absorbed in watching the people 
and listening to Hei speak. Hei could see that the President was interested in this. She smiled and 
continued, "There's a lot to know about this and our whole day will be wasted by talking. It's best if 
President experiences things for herself."

"Okay." Keith agreed and gently nibbled on the top of her lollipop. Hei smiled and pointed in the 
direction of the 'Dare2Drop' ride. "Let's go there and experience it. They said that for the best 
experience, we are to suppress ourselves till Saint Rank."

"Okay." Keith said again and walked towards the ride where people were being shown the thrill of 
accelerated gravity. Meanwhile, on the ride next to Dare2Drop…

Eight rows consisting of two open seats in each were present in a roller coaster car. Seated in the 
front row, on the two seats was a pair of lovebirds — them being none other than Lith and Arya. 
Lith was momentarily so amazed by the view around him that he got busy gawking everywhere, 
fascinating Arya as she had not seen him this interested in anything before. There was a platform 
beneath him a few seconds ago and he was in the starting area. They looked like they were brought 
straight from Earth to this place. It didn't fascinate him initially as he had seen it, but the view next 
totally amazed him. Lith was in a gold rush ride and he expected himself to travel around him 
tunnels that looked like mines and whatnot. That's about it. The common stuff. However, within a 
few seconds, the surroundings totally changed as the platform beneath him folded and collapsed. 
The temperature rose sharply, the ride's seats changed into actual minecarts and the ambience had a 
golden tinge to it as it was lit by old worn out oil lamps. The mine they were in was a 
claustrophobic nightmare, but the scent, ambience, and everything else around them made it totally 
worth it. No amount of technology on Earth could change things to such a degree as some things 
were only possible with magic. Lith and Arya were free to move in their minecarts, but Lith could 



feel a tight hold on him, and knew that the seatbelts placed on him earlier were still there, albeit 
invisible to give a sense of freedom.

Like a curious child, Lith looked around. His expressions of awe brought great joy to Arya as she 
watched him. She thought that their date would be all lovey-dovey, but this was good in its own 
way too. With how the cultivation journey was, such moments of joy would get lesser and lesser as 
one ascended higher. This was one of those rare moments that absolutely must be cherished and 
enjoyed fully. "Miners, are you ready?!"

The operator's voice rang in everyone's ears. "Yeeaaahhh!!!" People shouted. CLICK. CLACK. 
CLICK. CLACK. The rusty minecarts began moving. It was slow as if the tracks did not have 
ample lubrications and were hindering the cart, but soon, the cart picked up pace and…

FWWSIISSSSHHHHH

"Woooooooooooo!"

Lith, Arya, and everyone else in the ride screamed on top of their lungs as their minecarts dived 
deep into an unknown abyss. The slope got steeper with each second and was almost a whole ninety 
degrees at one point, providing a level of thrill that could only be felt in a fantasy world. As his 
physique was suppressed, all Lith saw was a bright streak of golden lights, probably from the 
lamps. It vanished as quickly as it appeared and the fast forwarding minecart immediately 
decelerated when they entered a giant cave full of quartz veins and gold ores. A few figures with 
rough appearances could be seen hacking their pickaxes and trying to mine gold. "A few more 
weeks. A few more weeks and this will all be over!"

"Hehehahahehehaha! A few more weeks!"

Maniacal laughter could be heard from the figures as they dug around the cave. While everyone's 
attention was on them, most failed to notice the cave getting narrower. It was a subtle shift as the 
miners drew their attention away. "Gold… gold… we'll get all the gold and forever be done with 
it…"



Whispers could be heard from the miners. "Yes… I can reunite with my family… won't have to live 
in this place anymore…"

"Gold… gold… mine for a few more days…"

"Gold… gold… g..o..ld… g..o..l..d…"

The cave turned silent as the surroundings slowly turned dark. Nervous heartbeats of the people in 
the minecarts could be heard as everything had suddenly turned creepy. "…"

A pin drop silence ensued for a good few seconds. "…ld…"

"…ld… old…"

Murmurs could soon be heard and the surroundings were starting to become visible again. Everyone 
saw a few shovels around them and half dug areas of the mines. The gold ores became less and the 
quartz veins were disappearing. The golden mine seemed barren. It became damp, dark, and 
deserted. Soon, in this creepy, eerie silent, the fear of unknown made the riders' heart palpitate. Not 
only Lith, even Arya was focused now. One second… two second…

Click. Clack.

Creeeeeeaaakkkk.

The minecarts came to an abrupt halt. The people on the ride suddenly felt a cold sweat on their 
backs as they looked at the endless dark tunnel in front. The last oil lamp was flickering a few feet 
behind them and the sudden stop had caused them to be really nervous. Were they stuck in this 
place? Was the ride broken? Did something go wrong? They did not know and began overthinking. 
In the midst of deep despair, it was then…



"Gold…"

A deep and rough whisper was heard. It came from the dark tunnel in front. Tap. Tap. Tap.

A tall silhouette of a man holding a shovel came into view. Everything about him was dark. "So you 
want to see the true gold rush?

The figure spoke. His words were bone-chilling for some reason. It was then. A golden smile 
formed on the dark figure's face. "Very well then…"

Chapter 1096  Gold Rush (2)

Very well then…"

The creepy whisper echoed in everyone's ears and soon…

Wooooooooooom!

A loud siren replaced the eerie silence as the minecart accelerated forwards, making everyone's hair 
flutter backwards like a flag in stormy winds. "Hooooooooooo!!" The group cheered as they felt the 
strong force backwards.  The surroundings became streaks of light with how fast the minecart was 
moving and pumped everyone's adrenaline. The narrow tunnel switched to an extravagantly large 
gold mine. The people on the cart looked like ants in comparison to how big it was. The cart had not 
slowed down and despite that, everyone could clearly see a sea of people running around, trying to 
harvest the gold ores. The minecart moved from inside to the outside of the tunnel and the number 
of people had only increased. Each person carried huge backpacks, shovels, and pickaxes and were 
rushing in with aggressive looks on their faces. Screeched the minecart as it made a sudden dive and 
twisted upside-down, giving a feeling to everyone involved that they'll fall off in the dark abyss 
around them. Numerous miners could be seen falling down in slow motion around them, and the 
cart reached so close to a few that just a few inches in front of Lith, a scared face of a miner popped 
up. It was only there for a split second and vanished when everyone felt they were accelerating 
upwards. Darkness was replaced with bright light and…



"WOOOOOOHOOOOO—!"

"AHHHHHHHHH—!"

As clarity returned to Lith, he found himself in midair. The rail was gone and the minecart was 
accelerating like a magic train in thin air. The screams he just heard came from the people seated 
around a long rectangular pillar of metal. These people were being dropped down and raised up 
with intense speeds. The minecart coiled around them at great speeds. Those screaming people 
screamed even louder when they realized they were about to get hit by a random minecart that 
popped out of nowhere.  The ones on the minecart screamed as well, wondering how the fuck they 
arrived here and why they weren't in the gold mines.  Lith and Arya both felt thrilled. Their hearts 
began beating fast, but all of a sudden, Lith saw someone he never expected he would in this place. 
A red-haired seductive beauty wearing a wide brim hat and cat ears was nibbling a big lollipop 
while having her eyebrows raised. Her hair flowed against gravity as she dropped down in the ride, 
but her hat and cat ears were in place. None of her clothes had a wardrobe malfunction.

'Keith!?' Lith was amused to find this out. He couldn't see her for long as the minecart distanced 
itself from the ride and made its way inside a deep, dark tunnel again. A few more scenes of gold 
rush were shown to them until finally, they all felt an intense jerk that almost made their hearts leap 
out of their chests. CREAAAAKKKKKK!

The minecarts came to a halt. The surroundings changed and Lith was back to sitting on bucket 
seats and was buckled in place. The platform returned too and then the operator's voice was heard. 
"We hope you all had a pleasant time. Thank you for visiting Gold Rush, we hope you have a 
wonderful day ahead. For pictures, please visit booth number…"

It was the usual exit commentary while the staff members came to each seat to unbuckle everyone. 
Once Lith and Arya got off the ride, Arya stretched and said, "Woooo… that was amazing!"

"You liked it too?" Lith asked with a smile. Arya locked her arms with Lith and replied, "Yes. It was 
thrilling. Plus, you made a lot of new faces which was quite pleasing to look at."

"…" Lith wondered how he should reply to that. Arya didn't give him a chance anyway and said, 
"Let's get the photos from the booth!"



A being that ruled the entire underworld, a being that held immense treasures and mysteries, and a 
being that many dragons worshiped, was casually strolling around like an ordinary lady in love as if 
it was the most natural thing for her to do. The Prince of all Vampires in the world roamed along 
with her like a helpless husband and got dragged to multiple places to have fun with his wife. The 
lovebirds made their way to one attraction after another, going from adrenaline pumping roller 
coasters to soft, mellow unicorn rides made for kids. Both enjoyed their time together, had tons of 
amazing rides and food, and eventually, the day came to an end without even them realizing.  The 
night parade had begun with fireworks filling the skies. Lith and Arya were sitting in a giant Ferris 
wheel and watching the parade and fireworks from the top. Arya was on Lith's lap, getting her 
abdomen hugged by him. Her glasses were gone and her bluish-silver eyelashes and clear blue eyes 
shone brightly under the silver moonlight. Arya's eyes were so amazing that the reflection of the 
fireworks was clearly visible in them. As of this moment, there was no one more beautiful than his 
wife in the world for him. Lith's eyes were fully focused on Arya and she seemed so majestic that 
he couldn't help but gently bite her cheek and pull them. "Mhm…" Arya smiled at his gimmicks and 
instead of saying something, took out her phone and took a selfie. The power couple looked like a 
cute, playful couple in this picture. Lith let her go once he felt satisfied and glued his face to hers, 
swaying side to side. "Today was amazing." Lith said. "Yes. And we have a few more days to go. I 
wonder how it'll be." Arya said with a smile. This was one of the four parks. Three were still left to 
be explored. Actually, this park in itself was so big that they would need a couple of days to explore 
it fully. However, both did not have much time with them and had to call it a day for this park. They 
had explored the main attractions anyway. "I don't know about the park, but I am feeling more 
inclined to explore you instead." Lith said something naughty, setting the mood. Arya laughed softly 
and replied, "I totally forgot about it. The rides were enjoyable and I didn't feel bored enough to 
take you somewhere secluded. I guess, there are days like these too sometimes."

Lith chuckled. "Indeed. We have the whole night free now. We can either explore more of this park 
or relax in a hotel."

"Hotel please. I want to relax." Arya said while leaning back on Lith's shoulder. "I wonder if there's 
a Nine Roses Hotel here."

"You don't know your own hotels?" Lith asked, amused. "There's too many to keep count of." Arya 
yawned. "Let me check if there's one here."

Arya took out her phone and typed in a few things on it. "Oh. There is indeed one. Let's go there 
after this ride."



"Sure." Lith said and placed his chin on Arya's forehead. The two didn't speak further and enjoyed 
the ride that gave a complete view of the park. …..

Bells chimed and a jazzy jingle made one's feet irresistible to move. A red-haired lady with slanted 
eyes wearing a pair of cat ears headband danced slowly while holding a corn dog in one hand and a 
twisted pretzel in the other. "Woo! Even the music here is amazing, President!" Beside her, Keith, 
with her amazing curves that could barely be hidden under her modest top and skirt were swaying 
as she copied Hei and danced slowly. Her hat was gone and what was left was a pair of red cat ears. 
They looked like they were an extension of her own head and were moving along with her 
movements. Keith did not look like a beauty while holding fizzy pink peach iced tea in one hand 
and a couple of meat skewers in the other. However, this had its own charm and made many heads 
turn to look at her. Keith was slow dancing to an intense beat because she did not want to embarrass 
herself by dancing hard like Hei. She was not of the right age or in the right moment to do so. Keith 
obviously knew how to dance and she knew a variety of them from ball dancing to freestyle to 
contemporary and even a variety of folk dances. In her human past, she was sold to a variety of 
people and trained to dance, please the master, and do a lot of menial and odd jobs by the slave 
masters. She knew how to make the best tea, how to take care of her master, and excelled as a maid. 
Even though she was a fearsome devil, the past couldn't be changed. Being a maid was traumatic in 
the past, but in the current life, she was having some other thoughts. There was not a single dull day 
since she became Lith's maid. It was amusing and surprised her. Yes, she may be overworked, but 
this type of work was not a problem. And the biggest surprise of all that she got was today. Who 
would've thought that there would be something that could make her adrenaline shoot up and thrill 
her. She genuinely enjoyed today and after a point of time, came to a conclusion that following 
Hei's lead was not that bad. It was for this reason that she was here, in the middle of the park's 
square, dancing by the parade that was going on.  Keith took a bite of the meat from the skewers 
and thought to herself, 'I should bring my daughter here. She would love this place…'

Chapter 1097  Get Inside, Dear Husband*

The wonderpark offered exciting rides, haunted houses, mazes, and some mindless adventures 
which could only be done here. The snowpark offered similar things but completely snow themed 
along with a few modifications. A ride called Snow or Flow was one such example. It was a 
couple's ride where the train would throw the two towards their hurdles. The couple would have to 
finish those and quickly get back on the train otherwise they would flow into a long, transparent 
tube that ran across the entire theme park, and would render them unable to move anywhere for the 
next half an hour. The couple could snuggle closer and enjoy the view or they could scream and 
despair because of how fast they were moving in the tube. Everyone in the theme park could watch 
them as the tube was transparent and it would be thrilling for some embarrassing for someone else. 
On the other hand, in case the couple overcomes the hurdles and get back on the train, they would 
be sent towards another hurdle, and so on. If they manage to survive till the end then they would be 
rewarded with a day pass to various couple activities, free food, candle light dinner, and a ride 



across the entire theme park in that long transparent tube if they want to. Lith and Arya had to wear 
winter wear for this park and there were certain rides where Arya moved herself inside Lith's 
clothes for warmth and comfort, even though she was resistant to cold. Lith also did a similar thing 
in one of the instances to get his face stuffed between two big, soft pillows. The experience was 
heavenly. They had lots of hot chocolate, gingerbread cookies, and the entire park was an 
everlasting Christmas Eve. Next, they went to the Skypark. It was a fantastical wonderland that 
some thought could only be present in anime. Giant, city-size turtles floated in the air around the 
sky touching rock pillars. Above the turtles was civilization and activities available to do. Clouds 
and mist blocked the visions of people and nobody could make out exactly how big the park was. At 
various intervals, there were also big masses of land where one could see wildlife, vegetation, flora 
and fauna completely different from the ones present in their world. Lith and Arya hopped from one 
turtle to turtle, pillar to pillar, and land to land for a diverse experience. They enjoyed their time 
exploring various caves, kayaking, fishing, hunting, and bathing in secluded waterfall areas. These 
private places allowed them to be close to nature and give in to their primal urges. The two fucked 
so much that even rabbits would feel ashamed for their low standards of mating multiple times a 
day. Lastly, the husband-wife pair visited the waterpark. This was similar to the waterparks from 
Earth with the only difference being that things were much more realistic and adventurous. Lith and 
Arya had fun here with Lith having an even better time as he could see his wife in a bikini. He came 
to a realization that he needed to visit the beach with his harem otherwise it would be totally 
criminal for his eyes and soul. The waterpark had some intentional 'oops' moments. This happened 
in private when only the two were present. Things such as Arya's bikinis falling off or Lith's shorts 
vanishing. The former was a result of Lith's mischief and the latter… it didn't need to be said. The 
only sad thing in this was that Lith's underwear and shorts were traversing somewhere in the 
unknown void. Two days of activity had been stretched to five days. It was all worth it and the two's 
bond only grew stronger by the day. Currently, both had left the theme park and were in one of 
Arya's favorite spots in the Neutral Continent.  Arya was originally from the Dragon Continent, but 
the Neutral Continent was where she had spent most of her life. It was this place where she erected 
the banners of the mighty underworld empire and made Scelestus. There were lots of problems, but 
she overcame them herself. After a long day of hard work, the place Arya liked to relax the most 
was in a mountainous region, away from the bustling cities like Uklov and Lenz City. The mountain 
had a natural hot spring with a waterfall and a small stream of freshwater coming from a river 
nearby. The cold water of the river mixed with the hot waters of the spring and created this pleasant 
steam around which worked like a sauna. Also, the mountains were at a high altitude so they were 
all snow capped. Despite being cold, due to the hot spring, the vegetation nearby was quite green. 
The hot spring flew in multiple places and Arya liked to soak in a place close to the edge of the 
snow capped mountains, on a steep cliff. From here, she could see a long mountain chain with 
various sizes of peaks and greenery and snow.  Dragons loved nature, and Arya was no exception. 
They loved treasures too, but instead of going the conventional way, Arya chose to build her own 
treasure — Scelestus. She worked for her treasure day and night, and on the days she felt tired or 
wanted to wind down, she used to come to this place.  Right now, she was here, with the love of her 
life, at the very same spot, gazing at the distance. Completely naked, Arya's smooth skin and soft 
body was in Lith's embrace. Her perfect breasts were pressed against the edge and hid from him, but 
her entire back was available to be devoured. Lith's evil hands slithered down the beautiful dragon's 
shoulder and gently grabbed one of her perfect peaches, giving the tender flesh a gentle squeeze. 
"Mhm." Arya hummed and placed her head on Lith's shoulder while wrapping her arm around his 
waist. "You do know that you can grope harder, right?"



"Hm?" The sudden question put a pause to Lith's evil hands and he turned to look at her. The only 
thing that came as a response to his reaction was a dragon's paw, choking his little dragon in the 
waters and making him widen his eyes. Arya turned her head to look at her husband and smirked. 
"For the past few days, you've literally filled my insides, my womb, my pussy hundreds of times 
and seen me naked. Now you're afraid of a little groping?"

"…"

Lith was at a loss for words. How does one respond to such a question? Arya was the most vocal in 
his harem and did not shy away from saying anything. Even Lucifer was second to her in this 
aspect. Lith thought about her comment and said while squeezing her ass harder, "With how the 
atmosphere and mood around is, I thought something sensual would be better than something 
rough."

Arya's cold palm rubbed against Lith's dick in the hot waters and sent a tingle down his spine. She 
stroked his shaft harder and said while staring right into his amethyst eyes, "Sensual is for those 
who want to take things slow and have a lot of time in their hands."

Arya turned to the side and made sure to turn Lith too. While looking into his eyes, her hand 
continued to do its work right in front of him. Doing so, she continued, "We don't have that 
privilege. I have to leave soon and you have a lot to do as well. In the short period I am with you, I 
want to be bred as many times as possible."

Arya got closer to Lith and stuck her bare, soft, perfect body against his. She stopped stroking his 
shaft and instead made it rub against her toned belly. Putting her arms around her husband's neck, 
she continued, "I want you to leave a mark on me. Fuck me so much and so hard that I could feel 
the sensation every time I remember it. Stuff your cock in my mouth, make it go deep so that my 
throat remembers the assault it was put under. Do the same stuffing in my pussy and ass too. Make 
my lips tingle and quiver and wet themselves every time I think of you. Let me feel as if there's a 
long hot rod inside me at all times and…"

Arya went on and on while Lith's pupils dilated in shock. His wife was going wild and feral. Her 
hands had shifted from his neck to his back and then on his butt. She literally groped him and 
pushed his hips against herself, mimicking the thrusting action and had him rub his shaft against her 



belly. She also grinded herself on him and began kissing him around his neck and ears while saying 
all those dirty words. The mood was not matching the peaceful atmosphere. They should be in a sex 
dungeon instead of a chill place like that. Arya stopped speaking only after a solid five minutes. She 
placed herself against the edge once again and stuck her butt out, shaking it for her husband. She 
turned her head to the side and said with lovestruck eyes,

"Get inside, dear husband. Fuck me in the spot I love the most!"

Chapter 1098  Arya's Vulgarity**

With the way Arya was looking at him and the words she had spoken, let alone a man, not even a 
woman could stop herself from advancing and making her move. Perhaps only gay men could 
resist, but Lith had confidence that even gays would turn straight if they were to be around a perfect 
being like his wife. She was literally perfect!

Placing his hands on her hips, he positioned her vertical slit on his shaft. Giving her a hard slap on 
her ass, Lith thrust his cock deep inside her vagina.  "Ohhhh~! That's it! That's the way!" Arya 
moaned. Squelch… Squelch… Squelch…

Sounds of water splashing mixed with Lith's shaft sliding in and out of Arya's slippery insides was 
creating a lewd melody for both to hear. For reasons unknown, Arya was literally perfect from all 
angles. Her insides were of the right size as if they were tailor-made for him, her body had the 
perfect hourglass-like curves and she did not lack anywhere in the melons or peaches departments. 
The hot spring water was heating up his body, but Arya's insides were hotter. They were soft and 
tight, making him feel like someone was trying to suffocate his little brother with wet sponges. 
"Ohhh so amazing! My insides are turning into mush!" Arya placed her hands on the edge and 
moaned. "Ahh… just like that… just like that…"

Lith's cock rubbed against her sweet spot as he thrust violently. "…ohhh… harder, babe! Fill me up! 
Fill me up!"

Arya was too vocal, to the point that her moans echoed in the mountains far ahead. It was a good 
thing that there wasn't anyone in a ten thousand kilometers radius. Lith gripped Arya's hips, leaving 
visible prints on them, and intensely thrust in her for a couple of minutes before exploding fully. His 
shaft twitched in her as he emptied all his baby formula into her hungry vessel. "Ohhhhhhh~~!"



Arya's body twitched and her eyes rolled back as she felt an intense orgasm. Her head was going 
blank and she could only feel bolts of electricity running through her along with hot sensations 
outside and inside her body. Two minutes later, Arya and Lith both recovered. She turned around 
while ensuring Lith's dick stayed inside her, and wrapped her arms around his neck and legs around 
his waist. Kissing his lips, Arya said, "Eyes on me the whole time, babe."

Lith began moving his hips inside the slippery softness and said after giving his wife a kiss, "That's 
impossible. These things are too distracting."

Lith slapped her tits and ass. Arya smirked. "You can play with them as much as you want, but after 
this round."

Arya pulled Lith's face in between her breasts and ran her fingers along his silver hair. "I'll let you 
bite my nipples and pull them while you dominate my ass in a sideways fuck. I'll even let you choke 
me and breed me like a hungry beast."

With the way the talks were going, Lith was wondering who was dominating who here? "Do you 
thighjob after this? Or a titjob? Footjob? Blowjob?"

"…"

Lith was baffled, but continued to churn his wife's insides while groping her breasts and keeping his 
head stuffed in between them. Arya was a sophisticated lady every single day. But right now? Right 
now her feral side was running rampant. If one listened to her speak right now, they would realize 
what Lith meant by Arya being a carefree and vocal lady. This round's pounding lasted for a good 
ten minutes and Lith filled Arya's womb with his fertilization starter once again. Arya was all smiles 
after she recovered from her orgasm and placed Lith on the edge of the hot spring. She tied her hair 
into a ponytail and made Lith drool at the naked sight of her performing such a gesture, soaked 
from head to toe, and getting her tits to jiggle while she tied her hair. Once she finished, she 
devoured her husband's big meat stick and made lewd slurping sounds.



Gazing upwards and looking at him with her sharp eyes, Arya took off her mouth with a pop sound 
and stroked his shaft hard with both her hands. "Do you want to spice things up, babe? Do you want 
me to call Rain or Miko or Rain and Miko both for a threesome/foursome?"

Lith brushed the strands of hair that sneaked out of Arya's ponytail behind her ears and said, "No. 
I'm content and quite satisfied with what I already have."

Arya smiled and kissed the head of Lith's shaft. "Someone's a sweet talker for sure."

She then went back to stuffing herself with a large sausage until the outline of it could be made out 
on her throat. The deepthroat session lasted for quite some until Lith exploded and Arya got a taste 
of her husband's naturally produced cream. Later, the dominating sessions that Arya had promised 
began in full swing and their private time lasted for two nights and three days straight in the hot 
springs. …..

Royal Castle, Nightingale. The ladies close to Lith were seated around a round table. The size of the 
table had to be increased with the many ladies being at Lith's side. They were all in an open 
courtyard with the crimson-silver moonlight shining on them. It wasn't dark around them as there 
were a lot of magic lamps illuminating the surroundings. Magic lamps were the most superior forms 
of artificial light available on the planet. The light from them was not blinding and scattered in all 
places, lighting it up. Even if one looked directly at the lamps, they won't find it blinding. It was 
gentle on the eyes and soothing for the body due to the ambience it created. Around the round table 
in this courtyard, Lilith sat in between Lucy and Alea. Beside Lucy was Alexandra, and beside Alea 
was her aide Jasmine. There was also a new person around the round table, a certain green-haired 
girl with glasses. She was fidgeting and felt really nervous being around so many big shots. Apart 
from her, there was a petite blonde-haired girl wearing a white top and black pants. She looked 
elegant and sophisticated. Beside her was a ginger-haired girl with green eyes, somewhat trembling 
as there were many people with blood on their hands around the table. Lilith looked at Lizbeth and 
Meryl with interest. She already knew most of the things about Fei who was in between them, but 
barely knew anything about the rest. Alexandra, Lucy, Alea, and Jasmine's attention was also on the 
two. The latter two particularly gazed at Lizbeth with great interest.  "Meryl, is it?" Lilith asked 
softly. Meryl trembled, but nodded her head. "Y-yes, Ma'am."

In the short time she had spent with Fei, Meryl was taught to speak with respect and a lot of other 
basic etiquettes. Even though the members of the family did not care much about such things, such 
things had to be implemented. There were only a few ways to respect someone and manners were 
one of them. "Are you liking it here?" Lilith asked with a warm smile.



"…huh?" Meryl felt her ears ringing. Did she hear it correctly? She had fully expected to get a 
scolding for being useless and a freeloader, but she was actually getting questions on her wellbeing?

Well, now this was embarrassing. She was fearful of the lady in silver, but it seemed that putting her 
guard up was all for naught. Fei pinched Meryl's thigh, snapping her out of her daze, and gestured 
her to answer.

Meryl gave a light cough and said, "I-it's pleasant."

"Good." Lilith said with an understanding nod. "Have you thought about your future?"

The question took Meryl aback once again. She had not thought of her future as her circumstances 
didn't allow her to think of anything other than the present and next day. "Take a few minutes to 
collect yourself." Lilith said as she noticed Meryl's flustered face. She then turned to look at 
Lizbeth, making her fidget some more.  "Are you having any trouble here?"

Lilith was randomly checking up on these girls to pass time and also to make them comfortable in 
sitting around them. Lith and Arya were on their way here, and with how Arya was, the pressure she 
would unknowingly emit would scare these two to death. Arya looked harmless, but she was 
currently the most dangerous Supreme Rank in existence in this world and perhaps even in the outer 
worlds. She wouldn't do anything to these two, but they might unknowingly get their minds 
corrupted if they let their guard loose. Having seen her asking normal questions to Meryl, Lizbeth 
was not as surprised. She was being questioned by the mother of her god, and she felt that she had 
to be respectful to her and give a clear, satisfactory answer. Lizbeth bowed slightly and said, "There 
are no troubles, goddess."

That was the only thing she could think of at the moment and say because of her nervousness. Lucy 
cringed hearing that while Lilith's eyes twitched slightly. Being called goddess straight to the face 
like that sure was something. "You don't need to address me as goddess. Just say ma'am or 
mistress."



Lizbeth couldn't refute Lilith's order and gave her an understanding bow in response. Once the 
small talk with them was over, Alea, who wanted to speak for quite some time, asked Lizbeth out of 
nowhere: "Why do you feel so pure?"

Chapter 1099  Putting An End To World War

Alea's question confused Lizbeth as she did not understand how to answer it. In her stead, Meryl's 
eyes lit up and she excitedly asked, "You can feel it too?"

Alea seemed like a good person and gave off a comforting aura to Meryl. She thus did not hesitate 
to talk to her. Alea smiled and nodded her head. "Yes. I can feel a vibrant Life energy from her."

Alea misunderstood Meryl's question, but gave the right answer anyway. Meanwhile Lizbeth still 
had no idea what was going on. Thankfully, she did not have to answer anyone as a familiar aura 
distracted everyone, and made their heads turn. A tall silver-haired man with a chiseled face 
wearing an open floral shirt that revealed his sharp cut abs walked into the courtyard. He had black 
shades similar to the lady beside him, and seemed extremely pleasing to the eyes of the ladies in the 
room. Arya walked beside Lith, hand-in-hand, and watched the reaction of the many beautiful ladies 
present in the courtyard. All of them had their eyes on her husband and none even glanced at her, 
making her have a hearty chuckle. Arya wore a sports bra, tight leggings that showed her ankles, a 
crop-top jacket and some sandals while her bluish-silver hair was tied in a ponytail and her eyes 
were covered by a pair of black, round sunglasses. Despite being a perfect beauty, someone with 
everything right from head to toe, she was not the center of attention. This was something that could 
only happen in the Evure household. If she went to any other place, everyone would either gawk at 
her or try their best to avoid letting her know that they were sneaking a glance. "You're here!" 
Alexandra, who was silent for a long time, said while getting up and moving towards her husband. 
"I'm home." Lith said with a smile and caught the running Alexandra in a hug. If this was before, 
this silly girl would've jumped on him, but she had matured now and was understanding how to be 
responsible. Arya looked at the raven-haired vampire girl and said with a smile, "My, my… look at 
you, not even a second has passed since me and my husband appeared and you're already planning 
on stealing him from me. To steal your elder sister's husband so shamelessly… tch, tch, very bad!"

Alexandra stuck her tongue out at Arya and got back to burying her face in Lith's embrace. The rest 
of the ladies smiled at the banter and after a minute, Lith gestured to Alexandra to have a seat, then 
went ahead and hugged everyone in the courtyard. By everyone, it was exactly everyone. The 
maids, the Druid, the Yellow Phantom, the nerdy human, every single one!



Meryl and Lizbeth froze in their seats after getting their respective hugs from Lith. The former was 
frozen stiff because she couldn't believe she had just come across such a depressing set of negative 
energy while the latter couldn't believe that her God had just given her a hug! A hug, a physical 
touch, no blessing, but a hug! Can you believe it!?

The tip of Fei's ears were somewhat red but she tried to keep herself composed. When she looked at 
others, she found them to have a similar reaction, making her squint her eyes and lower her gaze. 
'Indeed… this shameless Master of mine is really perverted…'

Fei could see clear wrinkles on the standing maids' clothes. Luna, Qingyue, and Freya… all three 
had their buttocks groped while also getting their neck pierced during the hug. Lilith, Lucy, Alea, 
Jasmine, and even Fei suffered the same fate as them. Lith was really sneaky in his maneuver. He 
bit them all and quickly sucked their blood before breaking the hug. Fei turned to look at Meryl, 
wondering whether this girl was tormented too or not. She heaved a sigh of relief when she noticed 
that she was just given a hug. Had this little ginger kitty been bitten, she might've collapsed or gone 
into a coma from the trauma. Lizbeth was not touched too, and simply given a tight hug which had 
left her speechless. The cogs in her brain had stopped working and when she would come back to 
reality was unknown. Fei, noticing Meryl tremble, held her hand and rubbed the back of her palm 
with her thumb and calmed her down. Lith sat down beside Lilith as if he had not done anything. 
The little amount of blood leaking down the corner of his mouth gave away his mischief, but none 
around the table minded that.

"Darling, when are we going out?" Alexandra immediately asked. She was standing behind him and 
her hands wrapped around him. She couldn't wait to go out!

Lith smiled and patted her face gently. "There's some pending work, let's get that done first and then 
we can leave. How about you assist me in that?"

"Okay~" Alexandra agreed without even thinking. She was too weak to say no to anything Lith 
asked her to do. Lith then looked around and asked, "What's going on, ladies? It seems like I've 
intervened in some serious discussion."

Alea nodded her head. "Little cousin, we were discussing Lizbeth's purity."



"…" Lith's smile vanished hearing that. Arya, who was being served tea by Freya, stopped herself 
from taking it and turned to look at Alea, wondering what the heck was this conversation. Fei, 
knowing there was a misunderstanding happening, intervened and said, "The young lady was 
wondering why Liz has such a dense Life aura around her."

"Oh." Lith felt relieved. He turned to look at Alea and said while shaking his head and smiling, 
"You could have worded it better, Alea."

Alea smiled and asked, "Hmm?" Lith's words went above her head and she did not understand 
anything. "Anyway, what did you guys do on your date?" Lucy asked, changing the topic. She 
raised her eyebrows and continued, "You two seemed to be glowing quite a lot."

At this response, Alexandra squinted her eyes and stared at Arya. Indeed, this bully was definitely 
glowing. Her skin was glassy and her mood was on another level. Having been around with her for 
years, she could tell at a glance that something really good must've happened. Alexandra bit her 
lower lip and cursed Arya internally for snatching Lith away from her and having such a good time. 
Arya could feel the jealous stares from her little sister. She turned to look at Alexandra and sent her 
a flying kiss, which was instantly rejected when Alexandra snorted and turned to look at Lith. Arya 
chuckled, then took a sip of tea and looked at Lucy. "We went to an amusement park. Do you know 
about it?"

"Oh?" Lucy was invested. "Whimsical Wonderland?"

Arya nodded her head. "Do you know that it's not one park, but four different ones in one place?"

"What?" Lucy did not know. "Yes. There's actually four different parks under one name." Lith 
added. "It's worth visiting at least once."

"I see…" Lucy took note of it. "If a theme park like that is so amazing, what would an amusement 
park that's adult themed be like?" Arya suddenly posed a question. She propped her hands on the 
table and placed her chin on her interlocked fingers. Smirking, she continued, "Just imagine… all 
the beauties in one place, asking to be fuc—"



"Alright, we can put an end to this here, babe." Lith interrupted. The conversation was going on a 
direction he wanted, but now was not the time to be horny. He had to curb his hormones and focus 
on the important work at hand. Lith looked at the ladies and said while taking out a tablet, "The 
world war's going on and it's about time to put an end to it."

Lith handed the tablet to Arya and said, "Scelestus played a major role in assisting the Dragons and 
the plebeian Vampires. However, there were a lot of cases of backstabbing and information leak 
from there. Wifey, I believe you should do some cleaning in your organization."

"Hmm…" Arya said and had a look at it. What her husband had said wasn't wrong. It had been a 
long time since she actually bothered with her organization. Everything was handled by Rain in her 
stead, and perhaps, she might've gotten overloaded with work and couldn't see the rats in the house. 
Lith then turned to Lucy. "Big sis, I believe you should go and make the plebes and nobles get 
together and be at peace. If you don't want to, I'll personally make a visit."

Lucy shook her head. "No, I'll go."

Lucy then got up and stretched. "It's been a while since I've had my hands on administrative duties."

Lith nodded and wished her the best. He then turned to Alexandra and said, "Wifey, there's been 
some resistance in the Human and Witch continent about the new reforms. There's also some 
unknown organizations coming up. Can you take care of them?"

Alexandra nodded her head. She was the best when it came to assassinations. "Good." Lith said. He 
then turned to Fei. "Lastly, Fei, you and Meryl…"

Chapter 1100  Putting An End To World War (2)

A year passed. The war had come to an end. People around the world finally slept peacefully and 
reunited with their families while some lost them and were grieving. The bloodshed had caused a 
ten percent decrease in the population with prominent figures dying around the world and causing 
major economic and political crises. Nobody had any idea what they were supposed to do and the 



administrations around the world were working hard to stabilize their people. All the properties that 
were destroyed in the war were being restored. Whatever conflicts that took place were forced to be 
resolved, and those that just could not let their enemies live could have an official death match in 
designated locations around the world. The War Dragons that invaded the Witch Continent left their 
territories. The holy war between the Angels and Demons came to an end with none of the parties 
winning or losing. The situation between the Free Adventurer's Association and the World 
Adventurer's Association was resolved too with the FAA gaining respect of the WAA, and getting a 
proper place for their headquarters in Lenz City, exactly opposite to the WAA. The leader of FAA, 
Jingmei Guild, was now in the top ten guilds, achieving a feat that no other guild could even come 
close to achieving. It was the fastest guild to have ever reached such a spot, and they had done it 
within three centuries. The plebeians and the noble Vampires made peace with each other. The 
nobles hosted open banquets around the continent and feasted with the plebes, calling for peaceful 
times. Such a scene would not have been possible had the Queen not intervened herself. The plebes 
and the nobles wanted each others' blood. They would not stop at anything. However, with the 
Vampire Queen intervening herself, they could not go against her and had to accept whatever they 
were told to. Vampires were absolutely submissive towards their Royal Clan. The Royal Decree 
would never be rejected or protested against. The Human Continent saw stability as well with 
Arbour taking in as the new Supreme Rank. Arya was home and so was Keith. The three shared 
history with Darren with the former daring to attack her personally and the latter getting attacked by 
his ancestors. The two along with Fanny took Darren to the underground torture chambers in the 
outer ring of the castle. What happened next was unknown. Another Supreme Rank had fallen along 
with Darren. It was Florencia Rain. Sylvia was called back home and when she saw Florencia, her 
blood boiled and she was trying her best to not kill her on the spot. Florencia did not ask for 
forgiveness as she knew the consequences of actions could never result in a pardon. She simply 
stayed silent and waited for whatever Sylvia would throw at her. Lith intervened in the matter and 
comforted Sylvia. He convinced her to take Florencia as a slave and told her that she'll be a great 
asset. From that day on, Florencia turned into Sylvia's maid and followed her. A prideful and mighty 
ruler had fallen to the depths of the abyss due to her actions. However, what she did not realize was 
that it was actually a blessing in disguise. Florencia would find out about it for quite some time. 
Once her matters were settled, Lith took Alexandra out on her promised dates. The two went to the 
Whimsical Wonderland because Alexandra wanted to experience everything Arya had. She felt a 
little jealous of her older sister, but it all turned out fine once they were at the amusement park. Lith 
explored the places he hadn't before with Arya on his second visit, and after the park, went to one of 
Alexandra's favorite spots in the Neutral Continent near the Shadow River Sect. The Shadow River 
Sect was her home for quite some time, and she only hung out in the areas near it. It was a beautiful 
mountain cave where Alexandra would hang upside-down and relax. She was a Vampire, so it was 
normal for her to do so. The husband-wife pair indulged in tons of forbidden wrestling in this cave 
and filled it with their lewd voices. After his young lady was taken care of, Lith had Lucy approach 
him. She wanted to go on a date too, and this time, he took her to an ancient town in the Human 
Continent and roamed the streets while in a cultivator's attire. The two later indulged in dual 
cultivation in a secluded room and did not leave it for at least a week. Lith did not feel much 
changes by Lucy did. She felt her breakthrough could happen anytime soon and was close to it. 
Breakthrough King Rank took at least 1000 years on average. Lucy did it in 500 while Lith did it in 
300. The Half Emperor breakthrough happened in around 2500-3000 years, and it was to be seen 
when the two could break through.  When the two returned home, it was then Alea who wanted to 
go on a date. Lith could not refuse, and he understood that day what it meant to actually suffer from 



success. Alea was taken to the Whimsical Wonderland too because she wanted to have fun. Jasmine 
tagged along as Alea was someone who couldn't be handled by one single person. If even her mom 
could not handle her, there was no way her lover could. Due to tagging along, Jasmine was eloped 
into the dual cultivation activities as well. With faces brimming with wide smiles, Alea and Jasmine 
returned to the castle and went back to doing what they were doing. Things should've ended here, 
but they did not as Lilith wanted to go on a date too. Lith absolutely could not refuse her, and thus 
took her to a private beach along with a few maids. He wanted to see them in a bikini. Bella had 
returned at this point and was taken to the beach. She couldn't be happier. Fei was dragged along 
with Qingyue, Freya, and Luna.  She was back to the castle after her work, so Lith felt why not have 
her as well. It would be fun to see how this petite cutie looked in a bikini. Not a lot of time was 
spent on this small vacation. Lith returned home with the ladies in two weeks. All of them were 
glowing after spending time with him, and it had to do with the constitution Lith had. Being the 
inheritor of the lust sovereign, his body was getting fine-tuned to benefit the ladies and himself. If 
the ladies did not have after effects and benefits, why would they feel like dual cultivating again? 
This was one of the pressing matters the techniques focused on. When everyone was satisfied, Lith 
finally could get back to work and wrap up the world war. Many had died, but it was not a problem. 
The reason? It was the Array Master Supreme Rank called Vanessa Brown. Vanessa had erected an 
array around the globe and it protected the souls of the people who were killed. No one could 
permanently kill each other due to this array and overriding it was impossible as Supreme Ranks 
weren't involved in the war. Vanessa was staying with Duchess Rivera Adelstein, and with what 
Lith had seen, the Duchess was so capable that she made Vanessa submit to her. This may sound 
bad, but it was actually a good thing. Vanessa would do whatever Rivera asked her to do and Rivera 
in return would do whatever Lith would ask her to do. 14:05

Vanessa was a slut and could not be tamed. This was what Lith had initially thought. But turns out, 
things weren't like that. Vanessa was actually a virgin and Lith was the one who took her vaginal 
and anal virginities. He did not see any blood or Vanessa did not feel any different from her first real 
sex was because she used to play with herself with toys. There were lots and lots of toys in her 
personal stash and some were bigger than even Lith's shaft, going into the 'what the fuck is this!?' 
category. Rivera was able to tame Vanessa due to the fact that she was a virgin. Vanessa tried to use 
toys when with Rivera, but the latter did not like the sight of it. Vanessa used to argue that real cock 
felt much better than these artificial stuff and that Rivera should get laid too. Vanessa told Rivera 
that she'll put in a good word for her to the Prince if she wanted, and he could fuck them both when 
rewarding Vanessa for her work. Rivera only raised an eyebrow at this and did not discuss further. 
Lith was amused to find out such things had taken place. If Fei had not recorded their daily 
interactions and shown him the clips, he wouldn't have believed them.

Controlling Vanessa was slightly difficult for him, but who would've thought that Rivera would 
come in so handy. Not only was she a great strategist, but she was also an adept lesbian who could 
woo even the straightest of ladies. Rivera wasn't in love with Vanessa and neither was Vanessa. She 
only liked the sex aspect of it and how soft and cuddly women felt. Lith could understand her 



completely. His ladies were not only soft on the outside, but also inside. Being with them felt as if 
he was getting absorbed in some warm marshmallows.

Lith had to go see Vanessa and reward her for her hard work and also restore the souls and revive 
the dead people. This would offset his negative karma and completely remove the black halo on his 
head. Instead of going to see her directly, Lith decided it would be best if he saw Duchess Rivera 
first. And thus, he made his way to the Adelstein Territory in the Royal Carriage with his trusted 
maids, Luna and Fei.


	Vampire 1091
	Chapter 1091 Misunderstandings (2)
	Unaware of the chaos brewing back at home, Lith left Florencia's place with Alexandra and Hecate. Once he took an exit from the door, he found himself in an alley, and walking a little further, he and the rest arrived at a busy street of Greenville City. The Mother of all Witches around the world lived in a separate dimension, the door of which was at multiple places. It was known only to a select few people and as Hecate was the favorite child, she was given access to the door closest to her office.
	The door was at a shady place and as there weren't any criminals or low life witches, none would try to hang out in an alley and definitely wouldn't open a door in a suspicious place like that. Greenville City resembled New York from Earth. There were a lot of high rise buildings and flashy billboards everywhere. The only difference was that it wasn't a concrete jungle and had lots and lots of greenery. The name Greenville City wasn't just for show. "What does His Highness want me to do next?" Hecate asked while walking beside Lith. Alexandra had her arms locked with the lady Lith's, and as this was a continent purely of women, such actions weren't taboo or unsightly. It was quite common. "You should show us around," said Lith, smiling. "My wife and I would love some—"
	Intense spatial fluctuations occurred right at this moment beside Lith and a shrill voice interrupted him.
	"Yooouuuuuuuuu!"
	Darkness flashed in front of Lith's eyes and in the next moment, he found himself standing under a dark sky filled with crimson brilliance. In front of him was a mature, motherly lady, someone who was the absolute pinnacle of beauty — Lilith. Surrounding Lilith were Arya, Alea, Luna, Qingyue, and Freya.
	"Look at me!" Lith heard a familiar voice. Turning to the source, he saw his sister, Lucy, giving him a death glare. "What's going on…" Lith asked, dumbfounded. "That's what I'd like to ask!" Lucy exclaimed. She was holding Lith by his robes' scuffle and seemed really pissed. "Are you her child?" Lucy asked with knitted brows, pointing at Lilith. Lith was stupefied. What kind of question was this? No, first of all, why was his sister so angry? What happened?
	Not getting an answer, Lucy's mood turned sour. She held Lith's chin and made him look at Lilith. "Her. Is she your mother or not?" Lith was completely taken aback. He could see his mother sighing and rubbing her temples while the maids behind her were smiling. There was also Alea who seemed to be deep in thought, and lastly,
	Arya was back!
	Lith hadn't seen her in a long time and wanted to greet her, but given the predicament he was in, it seemed like he had to wait. Also, he wondered why Arya was looking at him with a confused gaze. Although she had her opaque glasses on, he could still feel the confusion she was in through her body language alone. That's the level of understanding he had of her.
	"Answer!" Lucy exclaimed, her tone slightly louder than before.
	Lith snapped out of his thoughts and reflexively said, "Yeah, of course she is. Why would you ask such a stupid question?"
	"…"
	The maids, Alea, Arya, and even Lilith went silent. The maids covered their faces, their expressions reading: 'Oh no…' Lith didn't have to wait to understand why they made such a face. He could feel an intense bloodlust coming from his side.
	Turning to look at Lucy, this was the first time Lith had ever seen her so angry. He frowned and held her shoulders. "Big sis, what's wrong—"
	"Don't you dare call me big sister!" Lucy snapped and raised her voice. She did not get physical as, at the end of the day, the girl in front of her was her mother and brother's child. Hurting her was out of question as she was her family. Lucy held Lith's collar and stared right into his eyes. "You… whatever your name is… I am not accepting you. Not now, at least. Don't come near my sight for the next few decades otherwise…"
	Lucy snorted and threatened Lith. Truly confused out of his wits, Lith turned to look at his mother, wondering what was up with his sister. Lilith sighed again and shook her head with a smile. She walked towards Lucy and held her shoulder.
	"My dear, calm down, will you."
	"No, I won't—"
	"Listen to me, my dear." Lilith held Lucy's face with both her hands and stopped her from speaking. Her tone also got more motherly and warm, making Lucy feel comfortable and like a child, even though she was a proper adult now. "Calm yourself down for a second and look at who that is."
	"What?"
	Lilith didn't explain and directly turned Lucy to face Lith. "Look at her," Lilith smiled. "Doesn't she look oddly familiar?" Lucy felt irritated. What sort of question was this? "Of course she does! She's your and little brother's child. How can she not look like you two?"
	"Eh?" Lith was dumbfounded. "What?"
	"Ehhhhh?" Lith was shocked. He looked at his hands, then at himself, and then realized… he fucked up!
	"Son of a— never mind. I get what's going on. You guys…"
	Lith glared at his maids, then at his mother, and shot them a disappointed look. He then looked at Lucy and instead of explaining anything to her, took a step close to her and…
	PAH!
	"What!?!?" Lucy's eyes widened in shock. Did this girl just…
	"You idiot," Lith held Lucy's face with one hand and squished it, making her appear like a fish. "How can you not make out who I am? And how did you even come to such an understanding?"
	This statement caused a short-circuit in Lucy's brain box, making her thoughts go blank momentarily. Initially she thought that her mother's daughter had come up to her and spanked her ass out of nowhere, but when she felt the way in which it was spanked, the force used, and the tone in which the girl spoke, it all seemed oddly familiar. Watching the fiasco, the one who caused all the misunderstanding, Arya, was getting highly suspicious. It was to the point that she had to remove her glasses and see things unfold with her own two eyes. Lilith felt it was enough playing around. She snapped her fingers and signaled Luna to get into action. Lith's body flashed with a bright light and in an instant, the red witch robes were replaced by a fine black suit. "Ohhhhh!" Arya clapped her hands and exclaimed. It finally clicked her. "Huh?" Lucy blinked her eyes repeatedly and stared at Lith. "What?"
	PAH!
	"Ow!" Lucy felt a sharp pain run through her body as she got another hit. "Snap out of it." The situation finally became clear as she gained clarity and heard that deep, masculine voice of her husband. "…"
	"Oh!" Alea clasped her hands. "So it was like that."
	"My lady, it was always like that." Qingyue commented from the side. She couldn't fathom how Alea could even misunderstand something she clearly had a clear idea of. This young lady's thought process was difficult to gauge. It was best if she was left alone. Lucy, having understood what had transpired, felt her ears go red and covered her face. "What have you done…" She said softly. Everyone smiled at her response. Lith hugged her and while patting her back, looked at his mother. "You teased her a little too much, mom."
	Lilith hugged the two and chuckled softly. "It seems like it."
	Hugging Lith firmly, Lucy meekly said, "Seriously… I'll kill you if you have children with anyone before me."
	Lith chuckled nervously at the blatant threat while Lilith placed her chin over Lucy's head and said, "He may have children with anyone, but my dear, you should know that, mama doesn't plan to have anymore kids. You two are my whole world and enough for me."
	Lith decided to use his right to remain silent on this one. Commenting anything would get him in trouble. A few seconds later, the Evure trio felt another pair of hands wrap around them. "Tch. Tch. I'm part of the family too now. How can you guys hug without me?" Arya said as she placed her arm around Lith and Lilith. "Me too! Me too! Alea wants a hug too!" Alea said and dashed to hug them as well. The group had a hearty laugh at the union and after a few minutes, Lith broke the hug and said, "Alright, I should get back now."
	"Get back?" Arya asked. "Where?"
	Lith pointed at the tablet in Qingyue's hand. On the screen, Alexandra and Hecate were visible. They looked confused and were looking around, probably searching for Lith. "I was kidnapped against my wish. Alexandra must be worried. I should get her back."
	"Oh." Arya nodded. "Yes, you should do that first."
	She walked towards Lith and held his face. Giving him a peck on his lips, she said, "Don't be late. It's been a while since I've spent some alone time with you. We're going on a date after this."
	Lith raised his eyebrows in amusement while the rest of the ladies were baffled by the straightforwardness and shamelessness of Arya. For a second, everyone had forgotten what sort of personality Arya was. She never hid anything that was on her mind and was carefree. She was definitely more shameless than even Lucifer, who had reservations at times due to her pride and didn't speak freely. "Wifey's wish is my command." Lith smiled and kissed Arya back. "Have some tea with the rest, I'll be back in a bit."
	Saying so, Lith waved at Arya and the rest, and vanished from the spot, leaving for the Witch Continent again, unaware that he wasn't disguised as a girl anymore.
	Chapter 1092 Tug Of War For Date
	VOOOOOOOOOOOMMMMM—!
	A loud alarm resounded throughout Greenville City as Lith stepped foot in it. "Your Highness, nooooo!" Hecate exclaimed as she saw Lith. Alexandra immediately went to his side and took a defensive stance, ready to protect her husband for whatever may come. "What's happening?" Lith frowned and asked. Hecate went to Lith's side and covered him. She was in the midst of casting spells and in a great hurry. Despite that, she responded, "The capital is really sensitive to males. You wouldn't even find a worm that's male here."
	"Oh… crap."
	It hit him now. He wasn't disguised as a girl anymore and had triggered the alarms by entering this place. Here was thinking of having a good time with his wife, exploring the streets of Greenville City, eating hotdogs and donuts while admiring the greenery… but things never always go one's way, do they?
	Lith held Alexandra and Hecate's hands and sent a strand of his spiritual power into the teleportation badge in his pocket.
	Space fluctuated around the three and Lith vanished from the spot. The alarm went off and shortly after, a group of witches arrived at the spot Lith was previously at. "Suspect's vanished, senior." One of the witches said into her mouthpiece. "Continue the search. Be on the lookout in nearby areas." A professional voice resounded in her earpiece. "Roger that, senior."
	The group of witches vanished and went in search of Lith, but alas, they would never succeed in doing so as Lith was back in the Royal Castle, right in the courtyard where he had just parted ways with Arya.
	"That was quicker than I thought. Someone seems eager to go on a date, ey?" Arya asked with a smile as she placed her teacup down. Her carefree voice reached Alexandra's ears and her eyes lit up. She turned to look at her and called out, "Big sis!"
	Arya got up and opened her arms with a smile. "Won't give your older sister a hug?"
	"Big sis!" Alexandra called out again and ran towards Arya to hug her. She wrapped her arms around her body and placed her head on her shoulder. "You were gone for so long," she complained after getting comfortable. Arya rubbed Alexandra's back and said, "Had work, couldn't help it. You seem to have grown healthier and prettier in the time I haven't seen you."
	"Mm." Alexandra had a slight blush form on her face and she rubbed her nose on Arya's shoulder in embarrassment. Arya smirked and caressed Alexandra's lushly hair. "You're my little sister and we both share the same husband. Too bad though, I'm going on a date with him right now. You won't be able to see him."
	"Huh?" Alexandra broke the hug and stared at Arya with knitted brows. "What did you say, big sis?"
	To make matters clear, Arya walked up to Lith and held his arm from the side. "Me. Date. Husband. Now."
	"!!!?" All the warmth she got from Arya vanished as Alexandra's gaze got colder. She walked up to Lith as well and held his other arm. "You're not taking darling anywhere. He's mine right now."
	Arya laughed and wore her pitch black glasses. She looked at Alexandra and said, "You're a million years too young to fight your big sis, Lexa."
	Alexandra pouted in annoyance and pulled Lith away from Arya. "Let's go on our date, darling!"
	"He's coming with me, honey." Arya said with a hearty laugh and pulled Lith to the other side.
	Lith smiled helplessly and looked at the ladies sitting around the round table. Lilith and Lucy shrugged and sipped tea while Alea was…
	'Hm? A tower?'
	A card tower was slowly being built on the table. Alea was patient with the placement of each card and her complete focus was on this. Freya was giving her helping hand while Luna and Qingyue were busy doing something on their tablet screens. Alexandra and Arya continued to have their tug of war and tried to stretch Lith like string cheese. There seemed to be no end to their conflict, hence Lith intervened by wrapping his arms around the two and saying, "Ladies, ladies, ladies. Let's calm down, shall we?"
	His soothing voice calmed the two down and made them look up at him, wondering what he had to say. He better not choose the other, was what was going on their minds as they stared at him. Lith smiled and kissed the two's heads one by one. "Why fight, when we can go on a date together?"
	"No!" Alexandra shook her head. Arya rolled her eyes and pinched Lith's abdomen. "Didn't I tell you? I want some alone time, it's been a while."
	Lith felt helpless once again. "Then, how about this? Let's do a coin toss. It'll be completely fair and you both will have a fifty-fifty chance at it."
	"I'll do the tossing for you two, if you agree." Lilith interjected. "See. Even mom agrees with it." Lith clasped his hands and said. Alexandra and Arya thought about it, then nodded their heads. This was better than them fighting like wild cats.
	"Okay, choose one." Lilith said and tossed an amethyst coin with a clinking sound. "Heads." Alexandra said quickly. "Tails for me then." Arya had no choice but to accept. The coin flew in the air at an unreasonably high speed, flipping so fast that neither Alexandra nor Arya could make out what was happening. The coin soon landed on the ground in front of the two and after some tossing and turning, it landed at tails.
	"Ugh." Alexandra felt physical pain from watching the results. "Heh." Arya chuckled heartily and went to console her little sister. She patted her head and said, "better luck next time."
	"Tsk. Don't talk to me." Alexandra brushed her hand away and went to sit beside Lucy at the round table, accepting her defeat. Lith shook his head and smiled. Some things couldn't be helped. "Let's gooooo!" Arya locked her arms with Lith's and said while raising her fist cheerfully. The pair of love birds bid the rest farewell and left for their private date. While they were gone, there was a certain someone in the courtyard that was feeling nervous. This young lady in purple witch robes stood at the side, unmoving, and awaited instructions from the people around her, hoping to get dismissed or given some work. Lilith didn't make her wait for long and said, "Have a seat, Hecate."
	Hecate bowed and thanked Lilith. She took a seat at the opposite side, beside Luna and Qingyue, and looked at Lilith. Seated beside her, Lucy crossed her legs and asked, "What was going on? Why was my little brother with you?"
	"It's like this…" Hecate began explaining the things that had transpired. Everyone except Alea listened carefully and tried to ponder over the things Lith was planning. Lucy raised her eyebrows in surprise and asked, "He made Florencia step down and submit to us?"
	"Correction: you made her step down, not him." Lilith said with a smile. "What?" Lucy was confused. "How and when did I do that?"
	Hecate replied to that, "His Highness resembles a lot like Your Majesty when disguised. He may not look completely similar, but I'm sure Mother would not be able to point this out."
	Lilith nodded her head. "It's difficult to tell you two apart. If you two were to take pictures and place them side by side, even I would have trouble differentiating them."
	"Seriously?" Lucy knitted her brows and asked. Was her little brother's disguise this good?
	Lilith nodded her head.
	"Your Majesty, simply differentiating you from Madam is a challenging task. When you were on live television across the continent, none thought that you weren't Madam. That's the level of resemblance you share with each other." Luna said with a smile. "Fufufu…" Lilith rubbed Lucy's head. "Didn't I do a good job in making them? No one would be able to tell we aren't related. It brings me great joy to see the mini mes I've created."
	Lucy's eyebrows twitched at the lame joke while the maids giggled softly. Alea was as focused as before. She had made four floors of the tower with cards by now. They looked like they'd collapse due to a single gust of wind, but somehow, she was already moving to create the fifth one!
	"Well, Ma'am, I cannot tell what His Highness is planning. I do not possess the necessary strength to be the Queen Mother and—"
	"Do you want to?" Lilith cut her off and asked. "Pardon?" Hecate didn't understand. Lilith laidback on her chair and asked leisurely, "I said do you want to become the Queen Mother?"
	"…oh." Hecate was at a loss for words. Did she want to? She thought to herself. There were many that would kill to be in that position, but was Hecate in the same category as the rest?
	The answer was a big no. Being a Queen Mother meant a lot of responsibilities. Hecate did not want that. She wanted the absolute well being of the witches around the world, but did not want to be the one to take responsibility for providing them that. It was too tiring. However, being the Queen Mother, she could actually clear the bad image of her race as she would have all the witches obey her and listen to her. In this manner, she could lead them onto the right path and watch them grow mightier. Them growing would result in lots of innovations and exciting tech. Hecate liked these things and was eager to watch them. It was a difficult decision to make and she took a few minutes to decide. "So…?" Lilith asked after another minute. Hecate knew she couldn't make this almighty being wait. She cleared her throat, bowed, and said, "If Ma'am insists on this, then my answer is…"
	Chapter 1093 Whimsical Wonderland
	Jingmei Guild, Lenz City. Keith was working in her office as usual. Her devilishly beautiful face had glaring dark circles and she seemed quite tired while scribbling things on the papers. At this moment, a woman with slanted eyebrows walked in, wearing red high heels. She was Hei, the communicator between Keith and the guild staff of Jingmei Guild. Whenever Hei arrived, Keith would feel a headache as she did not appear without reasons. Only when something major would happen would Hei come to meet her. Lately, it has been happening often. Hei held a few files in her arms and gave a deep bow of respect to Keith. "President, there's trouble… again."
	'Of course there is.' Keith was irritated, but didn't show it on her face. "What is it this time?" Hei placed the files in her hands onto Keith's desk and said, "The FAA members wanted to take a break from fighting the WAA. They collectively decided to go to the amusement park in Uklov, undercover, and have fun. However, the WAA got this information and are about to send a team of skilled personnel to wipe out our members once and for all." Keith propped her elbows on the desk and interlocked her fingers. She sighed and placed her forehead on her fingers, trying to contemplate the situation. 'Take a deep breath. Take a deep breath. Take a deep breath.' Keith chanted to herself.
	Idiots. There were literal idiots in her organization. What did they think would happen if they pulled out such a move? What were they even expecting!?
	Keith had a lot of such thoughts and was trying her best to stay sane. She was a really patient person. Extremely so. Her past had shaped her into such a being. However, years after becoming a president of this organization, Keith realized just how stupid people were. These morons couldn't get a single thing right and were adept at dying at the hands of the experienced members of the WAA. If Keith was allowed to use her strength, she would've long solved the situation. But being asked to use her brains, things were starting to get on her nerves. Hei, watching the President's tired expression, cleared her throat and said, "President, the issue is big, but not as difficult to solve."
	Keith raised her head and looked at Hei with tired eyes. Getting the lady's attention, Hei continued, "You once mentioned that you cannot meddle directly. This means that you can do it indirectly, right? If that's the case, President, you should visit the amusement park."
	"Visit the park?" Keith asked. Hei nodded her head. "You will get a small break from the hectic schedule while you're there. It's going to be relaxing. While on this vacation, all the President has to do is keep the WAA and FAA members separated. I'm sure that with your skills, it'll be a cakewalk."
	Keith pondered over it. She did not know how one could relax in an amusement park, and also had no idea what this amusement park was. As it was Hei that was suggesting it, she considered going there. She really needed a small break but was chained to this office as she had to manage the entire FAA. However, if she went to this park, she would still be working and also get to relax and have a breath of fresh air. It didn't seem that bad all of a sudden. "How much of my time will be consumed there?" Keith asked.
	"Two days at best." Hei replied immediately. "Everyone had scheduled their vacation for two nights, so if nothing went wrong, President can be back at office after that."
	"Okay." Keith replied. This seemed to be a good time to wind down and relax. "When are they leaving?"
	Hei took out her phone from her space ring and checked the time. "…in about thirty minutes."
	"…"
	Keith was dumbfounded. "Thirty minutes? They're going today?" Hei nodded her head. "They made this plan last night in a hurry. The WAA is really quick to respond to such an emergency situation."
	Keith rubbed her temples. 'What a headache!'
	She had pending work and had to finish it by today, but if she did not leave now, she wouldn't be able to have a break again. It was truly a disaster. "President, we should hurry. If we do not reach that place on time, I'm afraid that our members would be killed mercilessly."
	"Tsk." Keith clicked her tongue and got up. She grabbed long coat and said, "Let's leave then."
	…..
	Uklov, Neutral Continent. It was a warm yet cold morning in Uklov. It was winter yet the city was bustling with activities. Lith and Arya, hand-in-hand, stopped in front of a majestic colorful arch that had giant letters etched on it that read:
	WHIMSICAL WONDERLAND This was the name of the amusement park they had just arrived at. The arch was the entry gate and it was said that walking inside would lead them to a whole new world. "Shall we?" Lith asked his wife. The two had purple bands on their wrists and a rectangular stamp on the area between their thumb and index fingers. The audacity to mark something on a royalty would result in getting beheaded, and to avoid that, the amusement park had other measures. They had vvip programs in which they provided the people with tokens and gave them unrestricted access to all places. They also gave them a guide and security so that normal people won't mess with them and get killed.
	The Vampire Prince and the Ruler of Underworld were together in this place. They bought the most expensive tickets a normal person could buy and did not bother to get the vvip treatment. It would just freak everybody out and put the amusement park on high alert. No one could enjoy their time here due to them. It was in everyone's best interest and hence, the two were walking inside the gates like commoners. "Hahahaha! Finally! I finally get to be free!"
	Lith and Arya heard loud cheerful noises behind them. They ignored it and continued to walk on the cobblestone pavement decorated with lush green vines. "It was the correct decision to be here! I am glad we did it!" Someone said behind Lith and Arya. A large group of men and women were talking loudly and having a fun time behind them. They were dressed in casual clothing with sun hats and shades to accessorize themselves. Lith wore an open white shirt with pink floral patterns on it along with white shorts and shoes. Inside the shirt was a white tank top and his eyes were covered by sunglasses while his hair breezed freely above his head. Arya wore a white t-shirt that clung perfectly to her body, blue ripped denim jeans that showed some of her skin on her legs, and had a pink shirt wrapped around her waist along with a pink hat and her usual opaque sunglasses. The two's outfits were matching and anyone could tell that they were a couple. Lith and Arya held hands and were enjoying the area they were walking at. This was a long tunnel that would lead them to a different dimension where the amusement park was actually located. "Hahaha, and then, and then— hahahaha!"
	Bump!
	"—ohhh!"
	A man with his fits of laughter bumped into Lith accidentally. Lith turned his head to the side to look at him, and being a domineering, tall man with visible signs of being a warrior, the man laughed nervously and rubbed the back of his head. "My apologizes." The man said and went back to talking with his group of friends. Lith ignored the bearded guy and began conversing with Arya. "Hahaha, and that day, Ivan actually slipped and broke his legs!" Someone behind Lith said with a jolly tone. "Hahahahaha!"
	"Hahahahaha!"
	Their group went into relentless laughter and in the midst of this, the bearded man that had previously hit Lith bumped into Arya. "Haha— Ahh! My apologies. My sincere apologies!" The man began bowing and said. Arya looked at him for a second, then ignored him like how Lith had done before. The man got a way out once again and continued to chat with his group of friends. "I'm wondering whether we should've taken that vvip pass." Lith said.
	Arya shook her head. "This feels more private and intimate. I wouldn't want dudes to be roaming around me while I'm on a date with you."
	"Fair." Lith nodded. He then looked in the front and saw a long line. "But look at this. It'll take us a solid ten minutes to even enter the park."
	"That's fine. We get to talk more in that period." Arya said and laughed. Not even a minute has passed with their conversation starting when the bearded man from before's laughter was heard again. "Hahahaha! Ivan is way too funny! Hahahaha—"
	Bump!
	The man bumped into Arya once again. Thinking he'll get away with it, he took a step back and said with a smile, "My apolog—"
	BURST!
	Arya slapped the man and made his entire body burst, not giving him another chance to speak. The explosion was contained and the blood and flesh didn't splatter around. A core was in front of Arya and it was the last piece of what remained of that man. If this was left alone, he would regenerate and come back to life. CRACK. CRACK. CRACCKKKKK!
	Arya gripped the core in her hand, making cracks form, and eventually her fist tight, turning the core to dust. As everyone heard the sound, they gasped in horror and looked at Arya as if she was a monster. "W, w, what!?"
	"What just happened?!?"
	"Oh. My. God. Did someone kill Joquill?"
	"What the fuck…"
	"Shit there's an enemy here! Everyone get into position!"
	The entire group took a defensive stance and stared at Lith and Arya vigilantly. Lith sighed and shook his head. "People just can't stop courting death, can they?"
	Chapter 1094 They Should Be Grateful And Thank Us Instead
	The entrance to the Whimsical Wonderland erupted in chaos as a large group saw one of its members get killed. Their initial panic and confusion soon turned into rage and one of the men in the group walked up to Lith and Arya, showing a golden-colored badge.
	"Do you have any idea where we are from? See this badge? We—"
	Arya touched her index finger to the guy's glabella. BURST!
	"Hwaaaaa—!"
	People gasped once again, this time in horror. "This bitch! She has the audacity to kill a gold ranker from the World Adventurer's Association!" "The Association won't leave you!" People screamed and once again charged at Arya, their judgment clouded with their high statuses in the association. Lith shook his head and took a step ahead. It was his duty to protect his lady, and although the lady was much stronger than him, it was the thought that counted!
	"Get the fuck away from her!" A man said and tried to slap Lith's face. A sharp crack echoed through the air as Lith's foot connected with the man's chin, like a dry branch snapping in two. His bones broke and his face was disfigured instantly. "Ooooommmmmhhhhh!"
	His scream was jarring and disturbing to hear. A man near him was watching the whole fiasco unfold silently. He hadn't spoken a single word since the start. Looking at how laidback this young man in a floral shirt and his lady seemed, he knew it was going to be a bad decision to fight them. Thus, he quickly put himself in between the disfigured face guy and Lith. "Wait, sir. Please." The man crossed his arms and tried to call in for peace.  "It was my colleague's mistake to have acted this way and I humbly apologize for it. No, not just me, we all apologize for the trouble we've caused. Everyone, bow down!"
	On the man's commands, some bowed down, but the others said:
	"Huh? You're afraid of mere commoners? Have you forgotten who we are? Where we belong to? And what our status is?" One of the women in the group said, her pride taking over her. "I agree. That lady killed Joquill for the actions he committed. The situation is resolved so why should we apologize? And it's already magnanimous of us to not pursue this matter further. That woman and her boyfriend should be grateful and thank us instead."
	"Yes! I agree with her." A man beside the lady said. One after another, voices erupted in agreement and the man who had asked everyone to apologize felt dread. He was in a deep bow and sweating profusely. Only a few were bowing along with him and the rest were voicing out complaints in front of Lith and Arya. Lith took a step towards the bowing man and patted his shoulder. He fiercely stared at the crowd and said, "It takes a lot of courage to accept your wrongs and be accountable for it. It also takes a lot of wisdom to know when to surrender and in front of whom to surrender."
	Calling for peace was the right option in a lot of situations. The greatest war victory is in a war that was never fought. This was applicable most of the time, but if the enemy had no intention of letting you go after surrender, it was best to fight them to death. Lith and Arya were on a date. They also wouldn't bother to kill anyone who surrendered in front of them as to them, they all felt like ants that could be crushed anytime. Killing them would only waste their precious time. The man did the right thing by submitting, and as for the ones that were heckling behind him…
	Lith patted the man's shoulder again and took a step towards the heckling crowd. "If you had apologized like this man, me and my wife would've left you alone. But you just couldn't help making matters worse, could you?"
	"What—"
	A sizzling sound cut off any words that were about to come out of the people's mouths as a bright crimson ray shot from Lith's index finger towards them. This was a fusion spell made up of Destruction and Fire elemental energy. It used the elements within Lith instead of the surroundings and shot towards the people with the help of the surrounding elements. Throughout the years, Lith had learnt that throwing the elements from one's own body was faster than willing the elemental energies from the surroundings. The energies from the body did not mix with the energies from the surrounding. They did not get resisted either and were as if totally different things. The reason for such a change was due to the spiritual power mixed with the elemental energies of the body. The spell hit the man that was about to speak and melted his face, not giving him a chance to even scream. In a few seconds, only his core was left on the ground as gasps of absolute terror sounded from around him.  "I am trying my best to not kill unnecessarily yet I can't let this one slide. You'll just bother us again in the park. It's better if you left."
	Lith said and pulled the elemental energies in front of him with his finger as if he was pulling a guitar string. As he let the elemental energy go, a hundred rays shot from his body and hit the many adventurers of WAA. The ones that weren't killed instantly were hit by Arya's Space spell and banished into the void. The only ones surviving were the bowing guys. Lith turned around, patted the bowing guy's shoulder again, and said while walking away, "Pick up the cores of the fools that weren't sent to the void. Take care of them and make sure to not bother us in the park."
	Lith then held Arya's hand and gave her a smile. "See, I told you that the vvip program would've been better."
	Arya smirked and said, "And I am telling you again that it's better this way."
	She then leaned closer to Lith's ears and continued, "If we had security, we wouldn't be able to escape to a secluded place and have sex. We also couldn't do it in the open, behind some trees or in the bushes."
	"Oh." Lith did not think about this before. "Shit, indeed."
	Arya continued smirking and gave Lith's butt a slap. "The wife's always right."
	Lith raised his eyebrow and said, "I get that, but why would you slap it? It should be the other way round, shouldn't it?"
	"Oh, absolutely." Arya laughed softly. She leaned close to her husband's ear once again and said, "You're anyway going to slap it later. And it's going to be many times more than this. Let me have some fun till then."
	Lith planned to refute her because no answer seemed correct to get his butt slapped like that. However, Arya's answer made him swallow his words and frown because of how much sense they made. "Tsk. It's dangerous to converse with you." Arya laughed again, this time heartily. "Then shut my lips."
	Lith felt tempted, but then clicked his tongue and said, "Let's get out of this entrance first. We'll be stuck here forever if we give in to your thoughts."
	Arya chuckled and didn't say anything further. She held Lith's hand and the two made their way inside the amusement park as fast as they could. Meanwhile, behind the two, another large group of people in casual clothings could be seen having a good time walking in the entrance. This group was relaxed and laid back. They seemed like the usual commoners and nothing about them was special. The group was at a distance from Lith and Arya. They entered the amusement park five minutes after them. Once the group vanished, a red-haired lady wearing a brown wide-brimmed hat, red skirt, white top, and white sandals appeared in the entrance along with another lady with similar clothing. "President, so far, nothing seems wrong." Hei said to Keith. "Mm. I hope my assistance is not required." Keith said and walked together with Hei. Hei nodded her head and replied, "Don't worry too much about them, President. Just try to relax. The amusement park has a lot to offer."
	Keith gave her a nod and finally entered the park, about to see what it was all about and how she could relax here. She was initially sceptical about it, but after watching a few videos online and knowing more about it, the park did not seem so bad.
	'I hope they don't cause too much trouble...'
	Chapter 1095 Gold Rush
	Crossing the entrance, Lith and Arya found themselves in the middle of four dark and giant tunnels. Each tunnel's entrance had an arched gate on which the letters read:
	North Gate — Whimsical Wonderpark
	East Gate — Whimsical Snowpark
	South Gate — Whimsical Waterpark
	West Gate — Whimsical Skypark
	There were four different areas they could go in and each brought a different kind of experience. "Where to?" Lith asked Arya. Arya thought about it and said, "Water will be the last. As for the others, you decide."
	In Arya's mind, she was thinking that the waterpark would be more laid back and she could have slow, poolside sex with her husband to end their date. Oblivious to her thoughts, Lith nodded and said, "Let's go to the wonderpark then. We would need a change of clothes in the other two and this one has a lot of forest area to fulfill your fantasies."
	Lith winked at his wife, making her chuckle. "Then what are we waiting for? Let's go!"
	Arya pulled Lith's hand and took him inside the wonderpark.
	While the two left, right behind, a red-haired beauty wearing a brown sun hat stared at them with a dumbfounded gaze. 'That was… him. Wasn't it?'
	Due to the delay in deciding which park to go to, Keith caught up to them. Looking at her staring at a cute couple, Hei tilted her head and asked, "Is something wrong, President? You've been staring at that couple for quite some time."
	"Nothing." Keith replied instantly. "Let's go to that place."
	Hei felt something was up when Keith decided to go in the same direction as the couple, but she didn't voice it out. She truly hoped that the President took a break and relaxed. The two redheads walked into the wonderpark entrance and what met their sight was a bright view of an amazing amusement park.
	There were waterfalls, a large pond, roller coaster rides, people screaming in awe, and lots and lots of people wearing all sorts of fun things and having fun with the park mascots. "What sort of place is this…" Keith commented. She had never seen such a jolly atmosphere before. Hei gestured to a man who sold lollipops, headbands, and funny goggles to come near her. While doing so, she replied, "Some werewolf  from the Werewolf Continent came up with this genius idea about fifty thousand years ago. They called it an amusement park because one would be really amused in this place."
	The man Hei had called came near her. She paid him coins and bought two big, flat lollipops and cat ears headbands. Making him go away, she continued, "People at that time were skeptical about this, but later genuinely began having fun as the werewolf man had expected them to. It became big news and people flocked to this place from around the world."
	Hei handed the lollipop to Keith, who unconsciously took it. She placed a red-colored cat ears headband on her hat and continued speaking, "It was said that it took a lot of time for the werewolf man to create this. It was thousands of years of manual labor and research."
	Keith saw a group of people seated on chairs sling shot their way up in the air, then fall with great acceleration, then sling shot back to the top. The people on it were screaming, some in terror, some in amazement. Keith unconsciously licked the lollipop as she got absorbed in watching the people and listening to Hei speak. Hei could see that the President was interested in this. She smiled and continued, "There's a lot to know about this and our whole day will be wasted by talking. It's best if President experiences things for herself."
	"Okay." Keith agreed and gently nibbled on the top of her lollipop. Hei smiled and pointed in the direction of the 'Dare2Drop' ride. "Let's go there and experience it. They said that for the best experience, we are to suppress ourselves till Saint Rank."
	"Okay." Keith said again and walked towards the ride where people were being shown the thrill of accelerated gravity. Meanwhile, on the ride next to Dare2Drop…
	Eight rows consisting of two open seats in each were present in a roller coaster car. Seated in the front row, on the two seats was a pair of lovebirds — them being none other than Lith and Arya. Lith was momentarily so amazed by the view around him that he got busy gawking everywhere, fascinating Arya as she had not seen him this interested in anything before. There was a platform beneath him a few seconds ago and he was in the starting area. They looked like they were brought straight from Earth to this place. It didn't fascinate him initially as he had seen it, but the view next totally amazed him. Lith was in a gold rush ride and he expected himself to travel around him tunnels that looked like mines and whatnot. That's about it. The common stuff. However, within a few seconds, the surroundings totally changed as the platform beneath him folded and collapsed. The temperature rose sharply, the ride's seats changed into actual minecarts and the ambience had a golden tinge to it as it was lit by old worn out oil lamps. The mine they were in was a claustrophobic nightmare, but the scent, ambience, and everything else around them made it totally worth it. No amount of technology on Earth could change things to such a degree as some things were only possible with magic. Lith and Arya were free to move in their minecarts, but Lith could feel a tight hold on him, and knew that the seatbelts placed on him earlier were still there, albeit invisible to give a sense of freedom.
	Like a curious child, Lith looked around. His expressions of awe brought great joy to Arya as she watched him. She thought that their date would be all lovey-dovey, but this was good in its own way too. With how the cultivation journey was, such moments of joy would get lesser and lesser as one ascended higher. This was one of those rare moments that absolutely must be cherished and enjoyed fully. "Miners, are you ready?!"
	The operator's voice rang in everyone's ears. "Yeeaaahhh!!!" People shouted. CLICK. CLACK. CLICK. CLACK. The rusty minecarts began moving. It was slow as if the tracks did not have ample lubrications and were hindering the cart, but soon, the cart picked up pace and…
	FWWSIISSSSHHHHH
	"Woooooooooooo!"
	Lith, Arya, and everyone else in the ride screamed on top of their lungs as their minecarts dived deep into an unknown abyss. The slope got steeper with each second and was almost a whole ninety degrees at one point, providing a level of thrill that could only be felt in a fantasy world. As his physique was suppressed, all Lith saw was a bright streak of golden lights, probably from the lamps. It vanished as quickly as it appeared and the fast forwarding minecart immediately decelerated when they entered a giant cave full of quartz veins and gold ores. A few figures with rough appearances could be seen hacking their pickaxes and trying to mine gold. "A few more weeks. A few more weeks and this will all be over!"
	"Hehehahahehehaha! A few more weeks!"
	Maniacal laughter could be heard from the figures as they dug around the cave. While everyone's attention was on them, most failed to notice the cave getting narrower. It was a subtle shift as the miners drew their attention away. "Gold… gold… we'll get all the gold and forever be done with it…"
	Whispers could be heard from the miners. "Yes… I can reunite with my family… won't have to live in this place anymore…"
	"Gold… gold… mine for a few more days…"
	"Gold… gold… g..o..ld… g..o..l..d…"
	The cave turned silent as the surroundings slowly turned dark. Nervous heartbeats of the people in the minecarts could be heard as everything had suddenly turned creepy. "…"
	A pin drop silence ensued for a good few seconds. "…ld…"
	"…ld… old…"
	Murmurs could soon be heard and the surroundings were starting to become visible again. Everyone saw a few shovels around them and half dug areas of the mines. The gold ores became less and the quartz veins were disappearing. The golden mine seemed barren. It became damp, dark, and deserted. Soon, in this creepy, eerie silent, the fear of unknown made the riders' heart palpitate. Not only Lith, even Arya was focused now. One second… two second…
	Click. Clack.
	Creeeeeeaaakkkk.
	The minecarts came to an abrupt halt. The people on the ride suddenly felt a cold sweat on their backs as they looked at the endless dark tunnel in front. The last oil lamp was flickering a few feet behind them and the sudden stop had caused them to be really nervous. Were they stuck in this place? Was the ride broken? Did something go wrong? They did not know and began overthinking. In the midst of deep despair, it was then…
	"Gold…"
	A deep and rough whisper was heard. It came from the dark tunnel in front. Tap. Tap. Tap.
	A tall silhouette of a man holding a shovel came into view. Everything about him was dark. "So you want to see the true gold rush?
	The figure spoke. His words were bone-chilling for some reason. It was then. A golden smile formed on the dark figure's face. "Very well then…"
	Chapter 1096 Gold Rush (2)
	Very well then…"
	The creepy whisper echoed in everyone's ears and soon…
	Wooooooooooom!
	A loud siren replaced the eerie silence as the minecart accelerated forwards, making everyone's hair flutter backwards like a flag in stormy winds. "Hooooooooooo!!" The group cheered as they felt the strong force backwards.  The surroundings became streaks of light with how fast the minecart was moving and pumped everyone's adrenaline. The narrow tunnel switched to an extravagantly large gold mine. The people on the cart looked like ants in comparison to how big it was. The cart had not slowed down and despite that, everyone could clearly see a sea of people running around, trying to harvest the gold ores. The minecart moved from inside to the outside of the tunnel and the number of people had only increased. Each person carried huge backpacks, shovels, and pickaxes and were rushing in with aggressive looks on their faces. Screeched the minecart as it made a sudden dive and twisted upside-down, giving a feeling to everyone involved that they'll fall off in the dark abyss around them. Numerous miners could be seen falling down in slow motion around them, and the cart reached so close to a few that just a few inches in front of Lith, a scared face of a miner popped up. It was only there for a split second and vanished when everyone felt they were accelerating upwards. Darkness was replaced with bright light and…
	"WOOOOOOHOOOOO—!"
	"AHHHHHHHHH—!"
	As clarity returned to Lith, he found himself in midair. The rail was gone and the minecart was accelerating like a magic train in thin air. The screams he just heard came from the people seated around a long rectangular pillar of metal. These people were being dropped down and raised up with intense speeds. The minecart coiled around them at great speeds. Those screaming people screamed even louder when they realized they were about to get hit by a random minecart that popped out of nowhere. The ones on the minecart screamed as well, wondering how the fuck they arrived here and why they weren't in the gold mines.  Lith and Arya both felt thrilled. Their hearts began beating fast, but all of a sudden, Lith saw someone he never expected he would in this place. A red-haired seductive beauty wearing a wide brim hat and cat ears was nibbling a big lollipop while having her eyebrows raised. Her hair flowed against gravity as she dropped down in the ride, but her hat and cat ears were in place. None of her clothes had a wardrobe malfunction.
	'Keith!?' Lith was amused to find this out. He couldn't see her for long as the minecart distanced itself from the ride and made its way inside a deep, dark tunnel again. A few more scenes of gold rush were shown to them until finally, they all felt an intense jerk that almost made their hearts leap out of their chests. CREAAAAKKKKKK!
	The minecarts came to a halt. The surroundings changed and Lith was back to sitting on bucket seats and was buckled in place. The platform returned too and then the operator's voice was heard. "We hope you all had a pleasant time. Thank you for visiting Gold Rush, we hope you have a wonderful day ahead. For pictures, please visit booth number…"
	It was the usual exit commentary while the staff members came to each seat to unbuckle everyone. Once Lith and Arya got off the ride, Arya stretched and said, "Woooo… that was amazing!"
	"You liked it too?" Lith asked with a smile. Arya locked her arms with Lith and replied, "Yes. It was thrilling. Plus, you made a lot of new faces which was quite pleasing to look at."
	"…" Lith wondered how he should reply to that. Arya didn't give him a chance anyway and said, "Let's get the photos from the booth!"
	A being that ruled the entire underworld, a being that held immense treasures and mysteries, and a being that many dragons worshiped, was casually strolling around like an ordinary lady in love as if it was the most natural thing for her to do. The Prince of all Vampires in the world roamed along with her like a helpless husband and got dragged to multiple places to have fun with his wife. The lovebirds made their way to one attraction after another, going from adrenaline pumping roller coasters to soft, mellow unicorn rides made for kids. Both enjoyed their time together, had tons of amazing rides and food, and eventually, the day came to an end without even them realizing. The night parade had begun with fireworks filling the skies. Lith and Arya were sitting in a giant Ferris wheel and watching the parade and fireworks from the top. Arya was on Lith's lap, getting her abdomen hugged by him. Her glasses were gone and her bluish-silver eyelashes and clear blue eyes shone brightly under the silver moonlight. Arya's eyes were so amazing that the reflection of the fireworks was clearly visible in them. As of this moment, there was no one more beautiful than his wife in the world for him. Lith's eyes were fully focused on Arya and she seemed so majestic that he couldn't help but gently bite her cheek and pull them. "Mhm…" Arya smiled at his gimmicks and instead of saying something, took out her phone and took a selfie. The power couple looked like a cute, playful couple in this picture. Lith let her go once he felt satisfied and glued his face to hers, swaying side to side. "Today was amazing." Lith said. "Yes. And we have a few more days to go. I wonder how it'll be." Arya said with a smile. This was one of the four parks. Three were still left to be explored. Actually, this park in itself was so big that they would need a couple of days to explore it fully. However, both did not have much time with them and had to call it a day for this park. They had explored the main attractions anyway. "I don't know about the park, but I am feeling more inclined to explore you instead." Lith said something naughty, setting the mood. Arya laughed softly and replied, "I totally forgot about it. The rides were enjoyable and I didn't feel bored enough to take you somewhere secluded. I guess, there are days like these too sometimes."
	Lith chuckled. "Indeed. We have the whole night free now. We can either explore more of this park or relax in a hotel."
	"Hotel please. I want to relax." Arya said while leaning back on Lith's shoulder. "I wonder if there's a Nine Roses Hotel here."
	"You don't know your own hotels?" Lith asked, amused. "There's too many to keep count of." Arya yawned. "Let me check if there's one here."
	Arya took out her phone and typed in a few things on it. "Oh. There is indeed one. Let's go there after this ride."
	"Sure." Lith said and placed his chin on Arya's forehead. The two didn't speak further and enjoyed the ride that gave a complete view of the park. …..
	Bells chimed and a jazzy jingle made one's feet irresistible to move. A red-haired lady with slanted eyes wearing a pair of cat ears headband danced slowly while holding a corn dog in one hand and a twisted pretzel in the other. "Woo! Even the music here is amazing, President!" Beside her, Keith, with her amazing curves that could barely be hidden under her modest top and skirt were swaying as she copied Hei and danced slowly. Her hat was gone and what was left was a pair of red cat ears. They looked like they were an extension of her own head and were moving along with her movements. Keith did not look like a beauty while holding fizzy pink peach iced tea in one hand and a couple of meat skewers in the other. However, this had its own charm and made many heads turn to look at her. Keith was slow dancing to an intense beat because she did not want to embarrass herself by dancing hard like Hei. She was not of the right age or in the right moment to do so. Keith obviously knew how to dance and she knew a variety of them from ball dancing to freestyle to contemporary and even a variety of folk dances. In her human past, she was sold to a variety of people and trained to dance, please the master, and do a lot of menial and odd jobs by the slave masters. She knew how to make the best tea, how to take care of her master, and excelled as a maid. Even though she was a fearsome devil, the past couldn't be changed. Being a maid was traumatic in the past, but in the current life, she was having some other thoughts. There was not a single dull day since she became Lith's maid. It was amusing and surprised her. Yes, she may be overworked, but this type of work was not a problem. And the biggest surprise of all that she got was today. Who would've thought that there would be something that could make her adrenaline shoot up and thrill her. She genuinely enjoyed today and after a point of time, came to a conclusion that following Hei's lead was not that bad. It was for this reason that she was here, in the middle of the park's square, dancing by the parade that was going on. Keith took a bite of the meat from the skewers and thought to herself, 'I should bring my daughter here. She would love this place…'
	Chapter 1097 Get Inside, Dear Husband*
	The wonderpark offered exciting rides, haunted houses, mazes, and some mindless adventures which could only be done here. The snowpark offered similar things but completely snow themed along with a few modifications. A ride called Snow or Flow was one such example. It was a couple's ride where the train would throw the two towards their hurdles. The couple would have to finish those and quickly get back on the train otherwise they would flow into a long, transparent tube that ran across the entire theme park, and would render them unable to move anywhere for the next half an hour. The couple could snuggle closer and enjoy the view or they could scream and despair because of how fast they were moving in the tube. Everyone in the theme park could watch them as the tube was transparent and it would be thrilling for some embarrassing for someone else. On the other hand, in case the couple overcomes the hurdles and get back on the train, they would be sent towards another hurdle, and so on. If they manage to survive till the end then they would be rewarded with a day pass to various couple activities, free food, candle light dinner, and a ride across the entire theme park in that long transparent tube if they want to. Lith and Arya had to wear winter wear for this park and there were certain rides where Arya moved herself inside Lith's clothes for warmth and comfort, even though she was resistant to cold. Lith also did a similar thing in one of the instances to get his face stuffed between two big, soft pillows. The experience was heavenly. They had lots of hot chocolate, gingerbread cookies, and the entire park was an everlasting Christmas Eve. Next, they went to the Skypark. It was a fantastical wonderland that some thought could only be present in anime. Giant, city-size turtles floated in the air around the sky touching rock pillars. Above the turtles was civilization and activities available to do. Clouds and mist blocked the visions of people and nobody could make out exactly how big the park was. At various intervals, there were also big masses of land where one could see wildlife, vegetation, flora and fauna completely different from the ones present in their world. Lith and Arya hopped from one turtle to turtle, pillar to pillar, and land to land for a diverse experience. They enjoyed their time exploring various caves, kayaking, fishing, hunting, and bathing in secluded waterfall areas. These private places allowed them to be close to nature and give in to their primal urges. The two fucked so much that even rabbits would feel ashamed for their low standards of mating multiple times a day. Lastly, the husband-wife pair visited the waterpark. This was similar to the waterparks from Earth with the only difference being that things were much more realistic and adventurous. Lith and Arya had fun here with Lith having an even better time as he could see his wife in a bikini. He came to a realization that he needed to visit the beach with his harem otherwise it would be totally criminal for his eyes and soul. The waterpark had some intentional 'oops' moments. This happened in private when only the two were present. Things such as Arya's bikinis falling off or Lith's shorts vanishing. The former was a result of Lith's mischief and the latter… it didn't need to be said. The only sad thing in this was that Lith's underwear and shorts were traversing somewhere in the unknown void. Two days of activity had been stretched to five days. It was all worth it and the two's bond only grew stronger by the day. Currently, both had left the theme park and were in one of Arya's favorite spots in the Neutral Continent.  Arya was originally from the Dragon Continent, but the Neutral Continent was where she had spent most of her life. It was this place where she erected the banners of the mighty underworld empire and made Scelestus. There were lots of problems, but she overcame them herself. After a long day of hard work, the place Arya liked to relax the most was in a mountainous region, away from the bustling cities like Uklov and Lenz City. The mountain had a natural hot spring with a waterfall and a small stream of freshwater coming from a river nearby. The cold water of the river mixed with the hot waters of the spring and created this pleasant steam around which worked like a sauna. Also, the mountains were at a high altitude so they were all snow capped. Despite being cold, due to the hot spring, the vegetation nearby was quite green. The hot spring flew in multiple places and Arya liked to soak in a place close to the edge of the snow capped mountains, on a steep cliff. From here, she could see a long mountain chain with various sizes of peaks and greenery and snow.  Dragons loved nature, and Arya was no exception. They loved treasures too, but instead of going the conventional way, Arya chose to build her own treasure — Scelestus. She worked for her treasure day and night, and on the days she felt tired or wanted to wind down, she used to come to this place.  Right now, she was here, with the love of her life, at the very same spot, gazing at the distance. Completely naked, Arya's smooth skin and soft body was in Lith's embrace. Her perfect breasts were pressed against the edge and hid from him, but her entire back was available to be devoured. Lith's evil hands slithered down the beautiful dragon's shoulder and gently grabbed one of her perfect peaches, giving the tender flesh a gentle squeeze. "Mhm." Arya hummed and placed her head on Lith's shoulder while wrapping her arm around his waist. "You do know that you can grope harder, right?"
	"Hm?" The sudden question put a pause to Lith's evil hands and he turned to look at her. The only thing that came as a response to his reaction was a dragon's paw, choking his little dragon in the waters and making him widen his eyes. Arya turned her head to look at her husband and smirked. "For the past few days, you've literally filled my insides, my womb, my pussy hundreds of times and seen me naked. Now you're afraid of a little groping?"
	"…"
	Lith was at a loss for words. How does one respond to such a question? Arya was the most vocal in his harem and did not shy away from saying anything. Even Lucifer was second to her in this aspect. Lith thought about her comment and said while squeezing her ass harder, "With how the atmosphere and mood around is, I thought something sensual would be better than something rough."
	Arya's cold palm rubbed against Lith's dick in the hot waters and sent a tingle down his spine. She stroked his shaft harder and said while staring right into his amethyst eyes, "Sensual is for those who want to take things slow and have a lot of time in their hands."
	Arya turned to the side and made sure to turn Lith too. While looking into his eyes, her hand continued to do its work right in front of him. Doing so, she continued, "We don't have that privilege. I have to leave soon and you have a lot to do as well. In the short period I am with you, I want to be bred as many times as possible."
	Arya got closer to Lith and stuck her bare, soft, perfect body against his. She stopped stroking his shaft and instead made it rub against her toned belly. Putting her arms around her husband's neck, she continued, "I want you to leave a mark on me. Fuck me so much and so hard that I could feel the sensation every time I remember it. Stuff your cock in my mouth, make it go deep so that my throat remembers the assault it was put under. Do the same stuffing in my pussy and ass too. Make my lips tingle and quiver and wet themselves every time I think of you. Let me feel as if there's a long hot rod inside me at all times and…"
	Arya went on and on while Lith's pupils dilated in shock. His wife was going wild and feral. Her hands had shifted from his neck to his back and then on his butt. She literally groped him and pushed his hips against herself, mimicking the thrusting action and had him rub his shaft against her belly. She also grinded herself on him and began kissing him around his neck and ears while saying all those dirty words. The mood was not matching the peaceful atmosphere. They should be in a sex dungeon instead of a chill place like that. Arya stopped speaking only after a solid five minutes. She placed herself against the edge once again and stuck her butt out, shaking it for her husband. She turned her head to the side and said with lovestruck eyes,
	"Get inside, dear husband. Fuck me in the spot I love the most!"
	Chapter 1098 Arya's Vulgarity**
	With the way Arya was looking at him and the words she had spoken, let alone a man, not even a woman could stop herself from advancing and making her move. Perhaps only gay men could resist, but Lith had confidence that even gays would turn straight if they were to be around a perfect being like his wife. She was literally perfect!
	Placing his hands on her hips, he positioned her vertical slit on his shaft. Giving her a hard slap on her ass, Lith thrust his cock deep inside her vagina. "Ohhhh~! That's it! That's the way!" Arya moaned. Squelch… Squelch… Squelch…
	Sounds of water splashing mixed with Lith's shaft sliding in and out of Arya's slippery insides was creating a lewd melody for both to hear. For reasons unknown, Arya was literally perfect from all angles. Her insides were of the right size as if they were tailor-made for him, her body had the perfect hourglass-like curves and she did not lack anywhere in the melons or peaches departments. The hot spring water was heating up his body, but Arya's insides were hotter. They were soft and tight, making him feel like someone was trying to suffocate his little brother with wet sponges. "Ohhh so amazing! My insides are turning into mush!" Arya placed her hands on the edge and moaned. "Ahh… just like that… just like that…"
	Lith's cock rubbed against her sweet spot as he thrust violently. "…ohhh… harder, babe! Fill me up! Fill me up!"
	Arya was too vocal, to the point that her moans echoed in the mountains far ahead. It was a good thing that there wasn't anyone in a ten thousand kilometers radius. Lith gripped Arya's hips, leaving visible prints on them, and intensely thrust in her for a couple of minutes before exploding fully. His shaft twitched in her as he emptied all his baby formula into her hungry vessel. "Ohhhhhhh~~!"
	Arya's body twitched and her eyes rolled back as she felt an intense orgasm. Her head was going blank and she could only feel bolts of electricity running through her along with hot sensations outside and inside her body. Two minutes later, Arya and Lith both recovered. She turned around while ensuring Lith's dick stayed inside her, and wrapped her arms around his neck and legs around his waist. Kissing his lips, Arya said, "Eyes on me the whole time, babe."
	Lith began moving his hips inside the slippery softness and said after giving his wife a kiss, "That's impossible. These things are too distracting."
	Lith slapped her tits and ass. Arya smirked. "You can play with them as much as you want, but after this round."
	Arya pulled Lith's face in between her breasts and ran her fingers along his silver hair. "I'll let you bite my nipples and pull them while you dominate my ass in a sideways fuck. I'll even let you choke me and breed me like a hungry beast."
	With the way the talks were going, Lith was wondering who was dominating who here? "Do you thighjob after this? Or a titjob? Footjob? Blowjob?"
	"…"
	Lith was baffled, but continued to churn his wife's insides while groping her breasts and keeping his head stuffed in between them. Arya was a sophisticated lady every single day. But right now? Right now her feral side was running rampant. If one listened to her speak right now, they would realize what Lith meant by Arya being a carefree and vocal lady. This round's pounding lasted for a good ten minutes and Lith filled Arya's womb with his fertilization starter once again. Arya was all smiles after she recovered from her orgasm and placed Lith on the edge of the hot spring. She tied her hair into a ponytail and made Lith drool at the naked sight of her performing such a gesture, soaked from head to toe, and getting her tits to jiggle while she tied her hair. Once she finished, she devoured her husband's big meat stick and made lewd slurping sounds.
	Gazing upwards and looking at him with her sharp eyes, Arya took off her mouth with a pop sound and stroked his shaft hard with both her hands. "Do you want to spice things up, babe? Do you want me to call Rain or Miko or Rain and Miko both for a threesome/foursome?"
	Lith brushed the strands of hair that sneaked out of Arya's ponytail behind her ears and said, "No. I'm content and quite satisfied with what I already have."
	Arya smiled and kissed the head of Lith's shaft. "Someone's a sweet talker for sure."
	She then went back to stuffing herself with a large sausage until the outline of it could be made out on her throat. The deepthroat session lasted for quite some until Lith exploded and Arya got a taste of her husband's naturally produced cream. Later, the dominating sessions that Arya had promised began in full swing and their private time lasted for two nights and three days straight in the hot springs. …..
	Royal Castle, Nightingale. The ladies close to Lith were seated around a round table. The size of the table had to be increased with the many ladies being at Lith's side. They were all in an open courtyard with the crimson-silver moonlight shining on them. It wasn't dark around them as there were a lot of magic lamps illuminating the surroundings. Magic lamps were the most superior forms of artificial light available on the planet. The light from them was not blinding and scattered in all places, lighting it up. Even if one looked directly at the lamps, they won't find it blinding. It was gentle on the eyes and soothing for the body due to the ambience it created. Around the round table in this courtyard, Lilith sat in between Lucy and Alea. Beside Lucy was Alexandra, and beside Alea was her aide Jasmine. There was also a new person around the round table, a certain green-haired girl with glasses. She was fidgeting and felt really nervous being around so many big shots. Apart from her, there was a petite blonde-haired girl wearing a white top and black pants. She looked elegant and sophisticated. Beside her was a ginger-haired girl with green eyes, somewhat trembling as there were many people with blood on their hands around the table. Lilith looked at Lizbeth and Meryl with interest. She already knew most of the things about Fei who was in between them, but barely knew anything about the rest. Alexandra, Lucy, Alea, and Jasmine's attention was also on the two. The latter two particularly gazed at Lizbeth with great interest. "Meryl, is it?" Lilith asked softly. Meryl trembled, but nodded her head. "Y-yes, Ma'am."
	In the short time she had spent with Fei, Meryl was taught to speak with respect and a lot of other basic etiquettes. Even though the members of the family did not care much about such things, such things had to be implemented. There were only a few ways to respect someone and manners were one of them. "Are you liking it here?" Lilith asked with a warm smile.
	"…huh?" Meryl felt her ears ringing. Did she hear it correctly? She had fully expected to get a scolding for being useless and a freeloader, but she was actually getting questions on her wellbeing?
	Well, now this was embarrassing. She was fearful of the lady in silver, but it seemed that putting her guard up was all for naught. Fei pinched Meryl's thigh, snapping her out of her daze, and gestured her to answer.
	Meryl gave a light cough and said, "I-it's pleasant."
	"Good." Lilith said with an understanding nod. "Have you thought about your future?"
	The question took Meryl aback once again. She had not thought of her future as her circumstances didn't allow her to think of anything other than the present and next day. "Take a few minutes to collect yourself." Lilith said as she noticed Meryl's flustered face. She then turned to look at Lizbeth, making her fidget some more. "Are you having any trouble here?"
	Lilith was randomly checking up on these girls to pass time and also to make them comfortable in sitting around them. Lith and Arya were on their way here, and with how Arya was, the pressure she would unknowingly emit would scare these two to death. Arya looked harmless, but she was currently the most dangerous Supreme Rank in existence in this world and perhaps even in the outer worlds. She wouldn't do anything to these two, but they might unknowingly get their minds corrupted if they let their guard loose. Having seen her asking normal questions to Meryl, Lizbeth was not as surprised. She was being questioned by the mother of her god, and she felt that she had to be respectful to her and give a clear, satisfactory answer. Lizbeth bowed slightly and said, "There are no troubles, goddess."
	That was the only thing she could think of at the moment and say because of her nervousness. Lucy cringed hearing that while Lilith's eyes twitched slightly. Being called goddess straight to the face like that sure was something. "You don't need to address me as goddess. Just say ma'am or mistress."
	Lizbeth couldn't refute Lilith's order and gave her an understanding bow in response. Once the small talk with them was over, Alea, who wanted to speak for quite some time, asked Lizbeth out of nowhere: "Why do you feel so pure?"
	Chapter 1099 Putting An End To World War
	Alea's question confused Lizbeth as she did not understand how to answer it. In her stead, Meryl's eyes lit up and she excitedly asked, "You can feel it too?"
	Alea seemed like a good person and gave off a comforting aura to Meryl. She thus did not hesitate to talk to her. Alea smiled and nodded her head. "Yes. I can feel a vibrant Life energy from her."
	Alea misunderstood Meryl's question, but gave the right answer anyway. Meanwhile Lizbeth still had no idea what was going on. Thankfully, she did not have to answer anyone as a familiar aura distracted everyone, and made their heads turn. A tall silver-haired man with a chiseled face wearing an open floral shirt that revealed his sharp cut abs walked into the courtyard. He had black shades similar to the lady beside him, and seemed extremely pleasing to the eyes of the ladies in the room. Arya walked beside Lith, hand-in-hand, and watched the reaction of the many beautiful ladies present in the courtyard. All of them had their eyes on her husband and none even glanced at her, making her have a hearty chuckle. Arya wore a sports bra, tight leggings that showed her ankles, a crop-top jacket and some sandals while her bluish-silver hair was tied in a ponytail and her eyes were covered by a pair of black, round sunglasses. Despite being a perfect beauty, someone with everything right from head to toe, she was not the center of attention. This was something that could only happen in the Evure household. If she went to any other place, everyone would either gawk at her or try their best to avoid letting her know that they were sneaking a glance. "You're here!" Alexandra, who was silent for a long time, said while getting up and moving towards her husband. "I'm home." Lith said with a smile and caught the running Alexandra in a hug. If this was before, this silly girl would've jumped on him, but she had matured now and was understanding how to be responsible. Arya looked at the raven-haired vampire girl and said with a smile, "My, my… look at you, not even a second has passed since me and my husband appeared and you're already planning on stealing him from me. To steal your elder sister's husband so shamelessly… tch, tch, very bad!"
	Alexandra stuck her tongue out at Arya and got back to burying her face in Lith's embrace. The rest of the ladies smiled at the banter and after a minute, Lith gestured to Alexandra to have a seat, then went ahead and hugged everyone in the courtyard. By everyone, it was exactly everyone. The maids, the Druid, the Yellow Phantom, the nerdy human, every single one!
	Meryl and Lizbeth froze in their seats after getting their respective hugs from Lith. The former was frozen stiff because she couldn't believe she had just come across such a depressing set of negative energy while the latter couldn't believe that her God had just given her a hug! A hug, a physical touch, no blessing, but a hug! Can you believe it!?
	The tip of Fei's ears were somewhat red but she tried to keep herself composed. When she looked at others, she found them to have a similar reaction, making her squint her eyes and lower her gaze. 'Indeed… this shameless Master of mine is really perverted…'
	Fei could see clear wrinkles on the standing maids' clothes. Luna, Qingyue, and Freya… all three had their buttocks groped while also getting their neck pierced during the hug. Lilith, Lucy, Alea, Jasmine, and even Fei suffered the same fate as them. Lith was really sneaky in his maneuver. He bit them all and quickly sucked their blood before breaking the hug. Fei turned to look at Meryl, wondering whether this girl was tormented too or not. She heaved a sigh of relief when she noticed that she was just given a hug. Had this little ginger kitty been bitten, she might've collapsed or gone into a coma from the trauma. Lizbeth was not touched too, and simply given a tight hug which had left her speechless. The cogs in her brain had stopped working and when she would come back to reality was unknown. Fei, noticing Meryl tremble, held her hand and rubbed the back of her palm with her thumb and calmed her down. Lith sat down beside Lilith as if he had not done anything. The little amount of blood leaking down the corner of his mouth gave away his mischief, but none around the table minded that.
	"Darling, when are we going out?" Alexandra immediately asked. She was standing behind him and her hands wrapped around him. She couldn't wait to go out!
	Lith smiled and patted her face gently. "There's some pending work, let's get that done first and then we can leave. How about you assist me in that?"
	"Okay~" Alexandra agreed without even thinking. She was too weak to say no to anything Lith asked her to do. Lith then looked around and asked, "What's going on, ladies? It seems like I've intervened in some serious discussion."
	Alea nodded her head. "Little cousin, we were discussing Lizbeth's purity."
	"…" Lith's smile vanished hearing that. Arya, who was being served tea by Freya, stopped herself from taking it and turned to look at Alea, wondering what the heck was this conversation. Fei, knowing there was a misunderstanding happening, intervened and said, "The young lady was wondering why Liz has such a dense Life aura around her."
	"Oh." Lith felt relieved. He turned to look at Alea and said while shaking his head and smiling, "You could have worded it better, Alea."
	Alea smiled and asked, "Hmm?" Lith's words went above her head and she did not understand anything. "Anyway, what did you guys do on your date?" Lucy asked, changing the topic. She raised her eyebrows and continued, "You two seemed to be glowing quite a lot."
	At this response, Alexandra squinted her eyes and stared at Arya. Indeed, this bully was definitely glowing. Her skin was glassy and her mood was on another level. Having been around with her for years, she could tell at a glance that something really good must've happened. Alexandra bit her lower lip and cursed Arya internally for snatching Lith away from her and having such a good time. Arya could feel the jealous stares from her little sister. She turned to look at Alexandra and sent her a flying kiss, which was instantly rejected when Alexandra snorted and turned to look at Lith. Arya chuckled, then took a sip of tea and looked at Lucy. "We went to an amusement park. Do you know about it?"
	"Oh?" Lucy was invested. "Whimsical Wonderland?"
	Arya nodded her head. "Do you know that it's not one park, but four different ones in one place?"
	"What?" Lucy did not know. "Yes. There's actually four different parks under one name." Lith added. "It's worth visiting at least once."
	"I see…" Lucy took note of it. "If a theme park like that is so amazing, what would an amusement park that's adult themed be like?" Arya suddenly posed a question. She propped her hands on the table and placed her chin on her interlocked fingers. Smirking, she continued, "Just imagine… all the beauties in one place, asking to be fuc—"
	"Alright, we can put an end to this here, babe." Lith interrupted. The conversation was going on a direction he wanted, but now was not the time to be horny. He had to curb his hormones and focus on the important work at hand. Lith looked at the ladies and said while taking out a tablet, "The world war's going on and it's about time to put an end to it."
	Lith handed the tablet to Arya and said, "Scelestus played a major role in assisting the Dragons and the plebeian Vampires. However, there were a lot of cases of backstabbing and information leak from there. Wifey, I believe you should do some cleaning in your organization."
	"Hmm…" Arya said and had a look at it. What her husband had said wasn't wrong. It had been a long time since she actually bothered with her organization. Everything was handled by Rain in her stead, and perhaps, she might've gotten overloaded with work and couldn't see the rats in the house. Lith then turned to Lucy. "Big sis, I believe you should go and make the plebes and nobles get together and be at peace. If you don't want to, I'll personally make a visit."
	Lucy shook her head. "No, I'll go."
	Lucy then got up and stretched. "It's been a while since I've had my hands on administrative duties."
	Lith nodded and wished her the best. He then turned to Alexandra and said, "Wifey, there's been some resistance in the Human and Witch continent about the new reforms. There's also some unknown organizations coming up. Can you take care of them?"
	Alexandra nodded her head. She was the best when it came to assassinations. "Good." Lith said. He then turned to Fei. "Lastly, Fei, you and Meryl…"
	Chapter 1100 Putting An End To World War (2)
	A year passed. The war had come to an end. People around the world finally slept peacefully and reunited with their families while some lost them and were grieving. The bloodshed had caused a ten percent decrease in the population with prominent figures dying around the world and causing major economic and political crises. Nobody had any idea what they were supposed to do and the administrations around the world were working hard to stabilize their people. All the properties that were destroyed in the war were being restored. Whatever conflicts that took place were forced to be resolved, and those that just could not let their enemies live could have an official death match in designated locations around the world. The War Dragons that invaded the Witch Continent left their territories. The holy war between the Angels and Demons came to an end with none of the parties winning or losing. The situation between the Free Adventurer's Association and the World Adventurer's Association was resolved too with the FAA gaining respect of the WAA, and getting a proper place for their headquarters in Lenz City, exactly opposite to the WAA. The leader of FAA, Jingmei Guild, was now in the top ten guilds, achieving a feat that no other guild could even come close to achieving. It was the fastest guild to have ever reached such a spot, and they had done it within three centuries. The plebeians and the noble Vampires made peace with each other. The nobles hosted open banquets around the continent and feasted with the plebes, calling for peaceful times. Such a scene would not have been possible had the Queen not intervened herself. The plebes and the nobles wanted each others' blood. They would not stop at anything. However, with the Vampire Queen intervening herself, they could not go against her and had to accept whatever they were told to. Vampires were absolutely submissive towards their Royal Clan. The Royal Decree would never be rejected or protested against. The Human Continent saw stability as well with Arbour taking in as the new Supreme Rank. Arya was home and so was Keith. The three shared history with Darren with the former daring to attack her personally and the latter getting attacked by his ancestors. The two along with Fanny took Darren to the underground torture chambers in the outer ring of the castle. What happened next was unknown. Another Supreme Rank had fallen along with Darren. It was Florencia Rain. Sylvia was called back home and when she saw Florencia, her blood boiled and she was trying her best to not kill her on the spot. Florencia did not ask for forgiveness as she knew the consequences of actions could never result in a pardon. She simply stayed silent and waited for whatever Sylvia would throw at her. Lith intervened in the matter and comforted Sylvia. He convinced her to take Florencia as a slave and told her that she'll be a great asset. From that day on, Florencia turned into Sylvia's maid and followed her. A prideful and mighty ruler had fallen to the depths of the abyss due to her actions. However, what she did not realize was that it was actually a blessing in disguise. Florencia would find out about it for quite some time. Once her matters were settled, Lith took Alexandra out on her promised dates. The two went to the Whimsical Wonderland because Alexandra wanted to experience everything Arya had. She felt a little jealous of her older sister, but it all turned out fine once they were at the amusement park. Lith explored the places he hadn't before with Arya on his second visit, and after the park, went to one of Alexandra's favorite spots in the Neutral Continent near the Shadow River Sect. The Shadow River Sect was her home for quite some time, and she only hung out in the areas near it. It was a beautiful mountain cave where Alexandra would hang upside-down and relax. She was a Vampire, so it was normal for her to do so. The husband-wife pair indulged in tons of forbidden wrestling in this cave and filled it with their lewd voices. After his young lady was taken care of, Lith had Lucy approach him. She wanted to go on a date too, and this time, he took her to an ancient town in the Human Continent and roamed the streets while in a cultivator's attire. The two later indulged in dual cultivation in a secluded room and did not leave it for at least a week. Lith did not feel much changes by Lucy did. She felt her breakthrough could happen anytime soon and was close to it. Breakthrough King Rank took at least 1000 years on average. Lucy did it in 500 while Lith did it in 300. The Half Emperor breakthrough happened in around 2500-3000 years, and it was to be seen when the two could break through. When the two returned home, it was then Alea who wanted to go on a date. Lith could not refuse, and he understood that day what it meant to actually suffer from success. Alea was taken to the Whimsical Wonderland too because she wanted to have fun. Jasmine tagged along as Alea was someone who couldn't be handled by one single person. If even her mom could not handle her, there was no way her lover could. Due to tagging along, Jasmine was eloped into the dual cultivation activities as well. With faces brimming with wide smiles, Alea and Jasmine returned to the castle and went back to doing what they were doing. Things should've ended here, but they did not as Lilith wanted to go on a date too. Lith absolutely could not refuse her, and thus took her to a private beach along with a few maids. He wanted to see them in a bikini. Bella had returned at this point and was taken to the beach. She couldn't be happier. Fei was dragged along with Qingyue, Freya, and Luna.  She was back to the castle after her work, so Lith felt why not have her as well. It would be fun to see how this petite cutie looked in a bikini. Not a lot of time was spent on this small vacation. Lith returned home with the ladies in two weeks. All of them were glowing after spending time with him, and it had to do with the constitution Lith had. Being the inheritor of the lust sovereign, his body was getting fine-tuned to benefit the ladies and himself. If the ladies did not have after effects and benefits, why would they feel like dual cultivating again? This was one of the pressing matters the techniques focused on. When everyone was satisfied, Lith finally could get back to work and wrap up the world war. Many had died, but it was not a problem. The reason? It was the Array Master Supreme Rank called Vanessa Brown. Vanessa had erected an array around the globe and it protected the souls of the people who were killed. No one could permanently kill each other due to this array and overriding it was impossible as Supreme Ranks weren't involved in the war. Vanessa was staying with Duchess Rivera Adelstein, and with what Lith had seen, the Duchess was so capable that she made Vanessa submit to her. This may sound bad, but it was actually a good thing. Vanessa would do whatever Rivera asked her to do and Rivera in return would do whatever Lith would ask her to do. 14:05
	Vanessa was a slut and could not be tamed. This was what Lith had initially thought. But turns out, things weren't like that. Vanessa was actually a virgin and Lith was the one who took her vaginal and anal virginities. He did not see any blood or Vanessa did not feel any different from her first real sex was because she used to play with herself with toys. There were lots and lots of toys in her personal stash and some were bigger than even Lith's shaft, going into the 'what the fuck is this!?' category. Rivera was able to tame Vanessa due to the fact that she was a virgin. Vanessa tried to use toys when with Rivera, but the latter did not like the sight of it. Vanessa used to argue that real cock felt much better than these artificial stuff and that Rivera should get laid too. Vanessa told Rivera that she'll put in a good word for her to the Prince if she wanted, and he could fuck them both when rewarding Vanessa for her work. Rivera only raised an eyebrow at this and did not discuss further. Lith was amused to find out such things had taken place. If Fei had not recorded their daily interactions and shown him the clips, he wouldn't have believed them.
	Controlling Vanessa was slightly difficult for him, but who would've thought that Rivera would come in so handy. Not only was she a great strategist, but she was also an adept lesbian who could woo even the straightest of ladies. Rivera wasn't in love with Vanessa and neither was Vanessa. She only liked the sex aspect of it and how soft and cuddly women felt. Lith could understand her completely. His ladies were not only soft on the outside, but also inside. Being with them felt as if he was getting absorbed in some warm marshmallows.
	Lith had to go see Vanessa and reward her for her hard work and also restore the souls and revive the dead people. This would offset his negative karma and completely remove the black halo on his head. Instead of going to see her directly, Lith decided it would be best if he saw Duchess Rivera first. And thus, he made his way to the Adelstein Territory in the Royal Carriage with his trusted maids, Luna and Fei.

