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Chapter 121: No problems even if you make a harem 

Lilith and Lucy both chuckled at Lith's question. It was Lucy who patted Lith's head and 
explained, 

"Because we have no interest in having one. Mom only cares about one person from 
the opposite gender, and it's you. She has no interest in having a partner. There are 
people out there like that too. Many don't want to be with partners. 

The witches are a fine example of that. Many prefer being single all their life and only 
care about wealth. 

As for me, I too, like mom, don't have any interest in any person from the opposite 
gender apart from you. I don't need the love partner mom just talked about. 

I am more interested in battles and power, rather than a partner. Plus, I have you to 
fulfill my 'those' needs. 

Many want a lover or partner just to fulfil such a thing. Do you understand me?" 

"That's right. I am also only interested in taking care of both of you. I don't need a 
partner." Lilith nodded her head in understanding and added. 

"Hmm, one second. Mom, you said you are not interested in having a partner of the 
opposite gender. If that's the case, how was I born? Let alone me, how was big sis born 
too if you didn't have a partner?" Lith asked his doubt. 

This was also his first time asking about his father. He has been curious for years about 
his father's identity but since his mother didn't tell him and he had every need of his 
fulfilled, he didn't ask his mother about it. 

What if there was something tragic that happened with his father due to which his 
mother and sister had some type of trauma related to it? Asking a question related to 
his father would only lead to his mother and sister being sad, which he didn't want to do. 
Thus, he refrained himself from asking such questions but now that an opportunity 
arose, he asked it. 

"Fufufu…I told you baby, didn't I? I have no interest in anyone from the opposite gender. 
I wanted to have babies which was made possible with the help of witches. 

The witches have everything you could ask for. All you need to do is pay a price. I 
naturally did the same and the Supreme rank of the witches helped me with it. The 



things that happened at that time were…" Lilith told Lith about the story of how he and 
Lucy were born. 

Lith was shocked once again listening to his mother's explanation. After his mother 
finished explaining, he asked, "Mom, do you feel no guilt in killing another Supreme rank 
just like that?" 

"No. Why would I? You're still young so you might not know how the world works but 
mom will tell you a little today. The prawns are eaten by the small fish, the small fish by 
the big fish and the big fish by an even bigger fish. The laws of the world work in the 
same way. 

The strongest fist rules and the road to the top is through crossing the river of blood and 
climbing above the mountain of corpses of other people. No one at the top is a saint, 
baby. 

The person I killed wasn't strong enough to protect himself, that was his fault. 

It's not just that. Had I not been strong, I would've taken as a slave and raped day and 
night by vile people. This was not just a possibility, this was a thing that almost 
happened to me many times in the past. But thankfully, your mama was strong enough 
to protect herself. 

The Supreme rank I killed was a person who used to look at me lecherously everytime 
the Supreme rank meeting occurred but I always let that slide. Anyway, Florencia just 
gave me a reason and I used it as an excuse to kill him. 

Fufufu…mama is evil, isn't she?" Lilith explained calmly and asked the question 
chuckling at the end. 

Lith had no idea how to react. Should he be sad or angry knowing that his mother 
almost got raped in the past, be happy that she was strong or be shocked that she 
could kill Supreme ranks so easily. 

His mind was in turmoil, today he was getting shocks after shocks. He never would've 
believed that his mother had such a past and his own story of being born would be like 
this. 

After a few minutes of pondering over and thinking through many things, he calmed 
down and said while smiling to his mother, 

"No, mom. You aren't evil. It's the circumstances that made you choose these things. I 
do not blame you one bit for it." After saying this much he thought to himself, 'If 
someone ever blames you for it, they'd not live to see the day again.' 



Holding his mother's face with both his hands, he said with a smile, "No matter what, 
you are and will always be my mom and I will never blame you for anything. I love you, 
mom." 

Lilith's eyes were a bit moist after she heard this from her son. She wanted nothing but 
her children's love and to take care of them. Saying just a simple line such as this was 
enough for her. She felt as if she's achieved everything in life after she heard this from 
Lith. 

She hugged him and rested her head on his shoulder, trying her best to not show her 
tears to Lith or Lucy. 

Lucy joined in too and they did a three way hug. Lilith sneakily willed the wind and water 
elements around her face and cleaned her face ensuring that no tears were seen. 

Composing herself, she broke the hug and said to Lith, "fufufu…we seem to have gone 
off topic. Not slightly but by a huge margin. Anyway, back to it. Mom has a thing that 
she needs to tell you. 

My baby, please know, mom and your big sis will always love you. Our love will always 
be familial and familial love is the strongest among all. 

A partner may leave you someday and your bond with her may break at that time. 
However, the bond of us being mother-son and you having the sister-brother bond with 
Lucy, it will never break, no matter what. 

So, don't be afraid to have a partner. No, not just one, mama has no problems even if 
you make a harem." 

 
Chapter 122: No problems with a harem!? 

"...no problems even if you make a harem." 

"I have no problem either," Lucy added from the side. 

The reason both of them were so chill about Lith having a harem was, firstly, they had 
no interest in a person of the opposite gender and Lith was the only one for them. 
Secondly, they had faith in Lith. They believed that he would always love them more 
than he would love anyone else, just like how they loved him. 

"What!? Are both of you out of your mind? No problem with a harem!? And wait, why 
are you encouraging me to make a harem in the first place!?" Lith asked in shock. 



Were his mother and sister okay in the head? He thought to himself. Who in their right 
mind would suggest such a thing to the person they love? 

Weren't women supposed to be dramatic, possessive and jealous if another partner was 
involved? Wasn't sharing a thing loathed by everyone? Why are these two acting like it's 
just a casual thing? 

Many questions popped up in Lith's mind regarding it, making it a mess once again. 

"No, baby. We are both fine. And also, why would there be problems? Do you not know 
that having a harem is normal in the world? Many men have a harem of beauties and 
many women have a reverse harem too. It's very common. 

If one has the strength and power to maintain a harem, why would they not? It's not only 
limited to men and women. There's even people—" 

"I get it. I get it, mom. No need to explain further." Lith interrupted his mother and said 
hurriedly. He roughly knew what she was going to say next and thus asked her to stop 
as he didn't want to hear it. 

He thought over his mother's words for a good five minutes. Meanwhile, Lilith and Lucy 
didn't disturb him, but just waited for him to think it through thoroughly and speak. 

Lith sighed and calmed down. Only now did he realise that he was still thinking of this 
world as the same as his previous one, which was very wrong. 

This was a world where magic, resurrection, reincarnation and many other bizarre 
things existed. It was a totally different world than what Earth was. People would 
naturally have different sets of beliefs too. Having a harem would be loathed upon if he 
was on Earth, but here, it made sense as to why it was normal. 

If one is strong enough, they sure can make a harem without any qualms. The same 
thing also happened on Earth. Strong rulers generally had a harem. They had the power 
to do so. 

But as time passed and technology developed, the concept of the harem died down. 
Beliefs changed, morals changed and so did the way of living for everyone. 

This world was completely different. Here, one person could rule over a bunch of others 
as long as the person had a high magical rank. Women weren't weak and there was no 
biological strength difference between a male and a female. 

Anyone could be strong as long as they worked hard enough to cultivate their magic 
rank. Thus, the concept of harem stayed here, making it normal for men and women 
both to have harems. 



Though Lith felt weirded out thinking about a woman having a reverse harem, as he 
pondered over it more, he realised, a woman having a reverse harem is no different 
than a man having a harem. 

Both were the same with only the genders being switched. Even if he did understand so 
much, it didn't mean he wasn't weirded out. This world was still very new for him and he 
was still trying to adapt here. 

No matter what one said, beliefs he learnt as a child in his previous life were ingrained 
in him and to eradicate them in order to fully blend with this world would take time. 

Shoving aside those thoughts, he focused on the harem thing his mother talked about. 
He asked himself, 'If I make a harem, will my mother and sister really be okay with it? 
Will they not be sad? What makes them say this so confidently?' 

Lith looked at his mother, then at his sister and back at his mother and asked seriously, 
"Mom, big sis, you love me, right?" 

"Of course I do, my baby." Lilith wasn't weirded out by such a sudden question from Lith 
as she knew he must've thought about something and was confirming a few things by 
asking questions, so she replied normally. 

"I do." Lucy added. She wasn't weirded out for the same reasons as Lilith. 

"So if I have a harem, no, not even that, let's say I have a partner, do you not fear me 
not loving you two anymore?" Lith asked seriously. 

Lilith and Lucy looked at each other and, "pfft…hahahahaha!" 

Lith looked at them in confusion. He didn't understand why they started laughing all of a 
sudden. Not holding back his curiosity, he asked, "why are you laughing, mom, big sis?" 

"Because of how silly the question was," Lucy said, giggling. 

"How was it silly?" Lith asked, confused once again. 

"Dear, who do you think I am?" Lucy asked with a smile. 

"Hmm, yes, and who do you think I am?" Lilith too asked the same thing. 

Lith rubbed his temples thinking of how stupid this conversation was getting. 
Nevertheless, he replied, "you're my sister and you're my mom. Anything else?" 

"Correct. And me being your sister, I have taken care of you since your birth," Lucy 
replied. 



"I too did the same, plus I even gave you birth, hehe. Isn't it interesting?" Lilith added. 

"What has this got anything to do with the question I asked?" Lith asked, knitting his 
brows. 

"It has got everything, baby. I gave birth to you and took care of you. Your sister took 
care of you too. We both know everything about you. We have faith and confidence in 
you. We believe in you. We know that you will never lessen your love towards us and 
always give us priority, even if you have thousands of women by your side. 

You share an unbreakable bond with us. A bond deeper than anything one could ever 
think of. Now tell me, wasn't your previous question silly?" Lilith said with a smile. 

Lith raised his eyebrows as realisation dawned upon him. He teared up knowing the 
amount of faith his mother and sister had in him. They believed in him so much that he 
never even believed in himself at that level. 

He hugged both of them and sobbed. His eyes reddened, his throat became heavy and 
he was at a loss for words. Lilith patted Lith's back and Lucy caressed his hair while Lith 
sobbed. 

After a while of staying in such a position, Lith got back up. Lilith cleaned his face and 
gave him a kiss on his forehead. Following behind was Lucy, who did the same. 

Lith looked at them and said seriously, 

"Anyway, I want you to know, mom, big sis, that I don't really have plans for starting a 
harem, but even if I do, I promise you that you both will be my highest priority no matter 
what. You believe in me so much, I will never let it be in vain. 

I love you, mom, big sis, and I will always love you no matter what happens in the 
future. I promise you that I'll continue to do so for now and forever." 

 
Chapter 123: Do you actually know how to cook, 
mom? 

"I'll always love you too, my baby." Lilith hugged Lith and said, kissing the top of his 
head. 

"Me too." Lucy said, following to kiss Lith's cheeks. 

After such a long conversation together, Lilith didn't forget to feed her blood to Lith. After 
he had been fed, the three slept together with Lith in the center. 



There was a slight difference in their sleeping positions today, as today Lith wasn't 
squished between the heavenly softness but had them sleep on the sides, on his arm. 

He kissed them on their heads from above and slept along with them. Rena, who was 
sleeping on Lith's study table, continued to sleep. 

... 

Lith woke up the next morning and saw his mother and sister staring at him intently with 
a smile. He smiled upon witnessing such a scene. It's been so many days since he last 
saw them like this. 

"Goodmorning, mom, big sis." Lith greeted the two after waking up. 

"Good morning, baby." Lilith said and kissed his forehead. 

"Good morning, dear." Lucy said too, and did the same thing as her mother. 

Finishing their morning greetings, Lith went to the bathroom to freshen up while his 
mother and sister went to the kitchen present on his floor to cook for him. 

Rena was roaming around and looking at the things present on the floor Lith lived at. 

Lith walked towards the dining table in the room adjacent to the living room of his floor 
and waited for his mother and sister to arrive. 

Rena noticed Lith and went over to him. She got onto his lap and purred. Lith patted her 
and said, "let's register you today at the academy office so that you can roam around 
freely." 

Rena didn't have any idea what Lith was stating but purred in agreement nonetheless. 
She was still far from being totally intelligent like those from the Werewolf race. Though 
she was around the same age as Lith, mentally she was just a small child. 

After a few minutes, Lilith and Lucy walked out of the kitchen with the former holding a 
big tray on which lay many covered utensils, while the latter held a tray which had cups 
and saucers containing tea. 

Lilith and Lucy placed their trays on the dining table and sat beside Lith. Looking at the 
food in front of him, Lith turned to his mother and said, "Wow, you made this, mom?" 

"Of course. Have a taste." Lilith said, smiling. 

"It's the first time I will be eating food made by you. Do you actually know how to cook, 
mom?" Lith asked with a questioning look. 



Lilith smiled and pulled Lith's cheeks and said, "Do you think I am your mother just for 
show? How would I not know how to cook?" 

Lucy giggled while covering her face, listening to the conversation Lith had with their 
mother. 

The liveliness at the dining table continued since it's been sometime the three of them 
ate food together. Finishing his food, Lith said, "I have classes so I need to leave now. 
I'll see you next week, mom, and hopefully you too, big sis." 

Lilith and Lucy nodded their heads. Lith then got up and walked over to Lucy to give a 
peck on her lips. Walking over to Lilith, he did the same. All set, he picked up Rena who 
was wandering around on the floor and bid them goodbye at the door. 

The two waved their hands at him and said their byes. After Lith left, Lilith walked 
towards Lucy to grab her by her waist and vanished from the spot. The once lively room 
returned to being desolate and empty. 

... 

"Your highness, this…" Dennis said, looking at Rena in Lith's arms. 

"This is my beast companion," Lith said with a neutral face. 

"From where did you bring a beast companion, your highness? Last night you didn't 
have one," Dennis asked in confusion. 

"Oh well… Hmm…" Lith was about to say the truth but stopped himself after thinking 
about it for a bit. 

He couldn't just tell Dennis that his mother and sister had come to his dorm room last 
night and brought Rena. It would create unnecessary drama. No one could break into 
the academy, with the Supreme ranks being an exception. 

A Supreme rank visited the academy on a whim and if word got out, it would certainly 
be a hot topic that would be discussed. Lith didn't like dramas like these and thus 
stopped himself from speaking. 

Looking at Dennis, he said, "I went out for a while last night and found her near the 
park. Anyway, we need to hurry. The classes will start soon." 

Dennis didn't question Lith further and nodded his head in agreement. He did not have 
much interest as it was just a simple beast, at least that's what he thought. 

Ralph, on the other hand, found holes in Lith's words and he knew full well what the 
beast in his hands was. There was no way a beast could run free on the sky island with 



the authorities around. The island being under surveillance every minute just lessened 
the possibility even further. 

Nevertheless, he didn't question Lith or call him out for it as it didn't really matter. It was 
just a beast companion. Ralph wasn't interested in it, so just like Dennis, he chose to 
ignore Lith's words and behaviour. 

The trio left the dorm building after meeting together in the lounge room on the ground 
floor and walked towards the main building of the academy. 

Reaching the building, Lith parted ways with Dennis and Ralph and walked to the beast 
companion registration area to register Rena there. 

It wasn't too complicated to register, one only needed to fill in certain information and 
they were good to go. This simple process got even simpler as Lith was the top student. 
Everything about him was filled in by the registration officials themselves and he was 
handed out an ID card for Rena within a few minutes. 

After registering Rena, he walked to the beast day care area where one could leave 
their beast companions while they attended classes. This was a free service provided 
by the academy where everything from grooming to feeding was taken care of by them 
for free. 

Dropping Rena there, Lith went to his classroom and met with Ralph and Dennis there. 
The classes started shortly after, when an instructor arrived. 

 
Chapter 124: I wish I was the food 

"I am so tired… Huff…" Dennis slumped on the classroom desk he was sitting on and 
said in a tired tone. 

Lith and Ralph nodded their heads, agreeing with Dennis. They too were tired, not 
physically but mentally. The classes were too exhausting and most importantly, boring. 

They had four two-hour lectures and only one fifteen-minute break after the first two 
lectures. Because all four classes were theory-based, everyone was required to sit and 
listen to the instructors. 

The trio had to attend general classes like these at least once a week and today was 
that day. Even though they were bored to tears by it, they were helpless and couldn't 
skip them. 

"I am hungry. I need food." Dennis said while being in the same slumped position. 



"I am hungry too. The cafeteria is near. Let's go there." Lith added from the side. 

Ralph, like usual, didn't speak much and simply nodded his head, indicating his 
approval. The three got up and left for the cafeteria present on the ground floor of the 
main building. 

The main building had fifty floors among which twenty five floors had classrooms. The 
rest of the floors were for miscellaneous purposes such as some had a library, some 
specimen rooms, some practical labs, etc. 

The cafeteria was present on the ground floor. It had many counters, tables and chairs. 
With various types of students coming to hang out over here, it was built pretty huge to 
accommodate everything. 

There were myriad types of food available. Students and staff alike could purchase 
them via their monthly credits. There was free food available as well, but although 
limited in variety, it was still as delicious as the food that costs money. 

Abalax World Academy provided the best things to their students and food being an 
important resource to everyone, they naturally didn't sting on it either. 

A few people noticed the trio as soon as they reached the cafeteria. From these few, the 
word spread to the others and within a few seconds, everyone's gazes were on the trio. 

The three ignored the people's gazes and went to one of the counters, where Dennis 
ordered an extra large bowl of ramen along with a side of karaage. His choice of food is 
influenced by the anime he watches, with karaage and ramen being mentioned quite a 
few times in it. 

Ralph got himself a few pieces of French toast with powdered sugar, a chocolate filled 
croissant and an extra large mango milkshake. He never mentioned it but from the food 
he always had, Lith and Dennis deduced that Ralph had a sweet tooth. He hardly ate 
things which weren't sweet, with his beverages being sweet too. 

Lith got himself a soft drink and a bowl of biryani. This world had all sorts of food 
available from earth and due to food from earth being of superior quality, it was easily 
adapted with the already existing cuisines of the world. 

Thus, Lith found no problems with the food here. He was actually a bit excited about the 
food present here, as back on earth, he was from a middle class family,so he hardly 
ever got the chance to try out various other cuisines present. 

However, it was a different case now. He was born with a silver spoon in his mouth all 
thanks to his mother. He was the Vampire Prince and being from the Clan that ruled all 
over an entire main race, he was filthy rich. 



Though that was the case, he wasn't a wastrel. He hardly used the wealth he had. In the 
academy too, he didn't need to use money at all. He was a topper so everything was 
free. This was one of the merits of being a topper. Ralph and Dennis had everything for 
free as well, so they didn't need to waste their monthly credits on it too. 

Taking their food, the trio went to a table nearby and seated themselves on the chairs 
attached to it. Putting a piece of karaage in his mouth, Dennis exclaimed happily while 
chewing it, "man, this fried chicken is so nice! Ralph, you should try it." 

"Idiot, close your mouth and finish your food first before speaking." Ralph said, knitting 
his brows and took a sip of his mango milkshake. 

Lith didn't join in on their conversation and got busy eating the bowl of biryani present. 
He was eating it with his hands and took a sip of soft drink present in between. 

Everyone present in the cafeteria paid the utmost attention to what the toppers were 
doing. Looking at the food they were having, some of them went ahead and ordered the 
same thing. 

"Nyaa~ can you believe it? Lord Ralph is drinking a milkshake hihihihi." A girl from the 
Cat Tribe of the beastkins said excitedly and wagged her tail. 

"What's there to believe? It's normal. Can Lord Ralph not even have a milkshake now?" 
A werewolf girl replied nonchalantly to the catgirl. 

"Nyaa~ I wish I was the food on Lord Ralph's table nyahahahaha." The catgirl said 
happily. 

"You idiot cat. Watch your foul mouth." The werewolf girl replied. 

Such a conversation happened at many places and such lewd talks were done only for 
Ralph as the ones who liked Lith talked about how they would kidnap him, then, protect 
and cherish him due to how pretty and innocent he looked. 

As for Dennis, he was once again foreshadowed due to the weaker and younger girls 
lusting over Ralph and the older and stronger girls fawning over Lith. 

Meanwhile… 

At another table in the cafeteria, a human girl said to her human boyfriend present 
beside her, "look, look, how handsome and dashing Lord Ralph is. If only, if only I could 
spend a day and night with him, my life would be complete. Ahh~ how I wish I could be 
the one Lord Ralph is having in his mouth." 

The human boy gritted his teeth and slammed the table in anger, shocking his girlfriend. 
He couldn't take it anymore. Ever since his girlfriend saw Ralph, she has been head 



over heels for him. Had it not been for Ralph being out of reach for her, she would've 
already broken up with him. 

The boy knew about this and felt like a loser in front of his own girlfriend. He couldn't 
take it anymore. He got up from his seat and began walking towards where the trio were 
sitting. 

As he walked, he thought, 'I really do not believe that you can be stronger than me by a 
whole level. We are all elites of the world and got into this academy because we are 
strong. 

You may be strong, but I don't think by a huge margin. I'll defeat you today, Ralph 
Asmodeus and show my girlfriend and the whole world that you aren't as great as what 
they make you out to be.' 

 
Chapter 125: Do you think of yourself as some God? 

Lith, Ralph and Dennis were having their food, enjoying each other's company, oblivious 
to everyone's gazes. They were having a good time together, but paused when they 
sensed a blonde-haired, brown-eyed teen walking towards them. 

The three could sense clear hostility directed towards them but instead of taking any 
action, they waited further to see what the guy would do. They weren't worried about 
anything as the guy seemed to be in their year. They could tell via the tie he was 
wearing. 

The first years wore blue tie, green for second years , yellow for third , red for fourth and 
purple for fifth years. 

It would be a little troublesome if such hostility came from a fourth or a fifth year student. 
The three of them were at rank 2, while the fourth and fifth years were generally at rank 
4 or 5. Though Lith could win against rank 4, fighting against a rank 5 would be 
troublesome for even him. 

But, since the guy walking towards them was only a first year student, they chose to 
ignore it. They thought of him as nothing but a minor inconvenience. 

The human boy walked and came in front of Ralph, beside whom was Dennis and on 
the opposite seat was Lith. The human boy hit his fist on the trio's table and said, 
looking at Ralph dead in the eyes, 

"Ralph Asmodeus, I challenge you to a rank battle." 



Ralph put down his mango milkshake he was sipping on and looked back at the human 
boy. He said with a serious yet neutral face, "I am not obliged to battle." 

Though the toppers could be challenged for a fight and could even lose their status, 
they weren't obliged to do so if their merit points had a huge margin of difference 
compared to the person who challenged. 

Lith, Ralph and Dennis had very high potential and they also did their best in whatever 
tests or events they participated in. Thus, their merit points were very high, allowing 
them to reject the requests of rank battle. 

They were supposed to accept one rank battle from a person who challenged first 
among the rest, per week, had their merit points be low. But it wasn't, so they could 
reject the person without a hassle. 

"Are you afraid you'll lose your rank, Ralph Asmodeus?" The human boy said, frowning 
when his request was rejected. 

The boy could notice hostile gazes that fell on him from the onlookers. He knew full well 
that challenging Ralph meant offending many people, not just Ralph, but he wasn't 
worried about it. 

He was from a reputable family and had high potential too. Adding to that, he was 
ranked 117. He was from the same class A-1 and thus had confidence in himself that 
Ralph wasn't any stronger than himself. 

"Get lost." Ralph said to the boy. He took the croissant and took a bite from it. 

The boy's anger rose, slamming his hands on the table, he took Ralph's french toast 
and milkshake and threw it on the ground. He looked Ralph in the eyes once again and 
said, 

"Bastard! Do you think of yourself as some god? So what if you won in the flying race or 
became a topper? I know full well that you're trying your best to amass high merit points 
so that nobody can challenge you and you maintain this position. 

Fucker, I know you're afraid of doing rank battles. Accept it, you asshole, accept it. Tell 
everyone that you're nothing but a coward. A coward with slightly better looks. It's only 
your looks that are making you famous." 

Ralph looked at the guy dead in the eyes as he threw his food down. He waited to see 
what the reason was for this guy being so angry at him, but in the end, instead of 
hearing the reasons, he only received curses. Ralph was slightly angry now. 



Lith looked at such a scene with an amused expression. He was a bit angry at the guy 
who created such a mess but he suddenly thought of something and his anger died 
down. He thought to himself, 

'Wow, is this the so-called young master from the novels that I am looking at? Hmm, but 
wait a minute. His conflict is with Ralph and not me. Damn it, does it mean that I am not 
the MC of this world? 

Heh, just kidding lol. Being a MC would be so tiresome, I'd rather not. Good luck Ralph, 
your time to shine has come, my friend. Don't disappoint us, hehehe.' 

"Oi bastard what do you—" Dennis was about to ask what this guy was trying to do but 
Ralph interrupted him by waving his hand and asking him to stop. 

Dennis was angrier than Ralph even though it was Ralph's matter. The reason being, 
they were having such a good time together but this guy popped out of nowhere and 
ruined the atmosphere. Not only that, he even wasted Ralph's food. Dennis loved food 
as much as he loved to battle and wasting food like this seemed blasphemy in his eyes. 

After stopping Dennis, Ralph got up from his seat and quickly held the human boy's 
throat. He lifted him up in the air and brought him to eye level due to Ralph being a 
head taller than the boy. 

"Bastard, let me down. Fu—" 

Looking him dead in the eyes once again, Ralph said in a serious yet neutral tone, 
interrupting him, "I'll let you off this one time. An offense after this would not result in just 
a simple death." With the last part barely whispering near his ears. 

Saying so, he squeezed his throat, making blood spurt out not only on him but Lith, 
Dennis and the people nearby as well. The boy's body fell down and his head bounced 
a few meters away. 

Looking at such a scene, the entire cafeteria turned silent. Some who weren't used to 
gore and killing, almost puked looking at such a scene, but they managed to control 
themselves via spells and didn't make any noise. 

Nobody thought that Ralph would do such a thing. Not just that, everything was over 
within a few seconds, let alone minutes. This guy came, ran down curses and got killed 
instantly. It was how this event occurred to everybody. 

 
Chapter 126: Factors Affecting Resurrection 



Blood was splattered everywhere on the ground near Lith's table. Everyone present in 
the cafeteria was currently looking in his direction. 

More precisely, they were looking at Ralph in shock. Fighting on the academy grounds 
wasn't allowed, let alone killing someone. Ralph had violated the rules and messed up 
big time. This was what was going on in everyone's heads as they looked at this scene 
in shock. 

The staff members who were watching were shocked too. They never thought that 
Ralph would violate one of the rules of the academy, which stated no fights anywhere 
on the campus apart from a select few places. 

It wasn't even a fight, Ralph straight up killed the guy without warning. Because of their 
initial shock, the staff members panicked, causing them to forget to actually call the 
respective authorities for this matter. 

"Quick! Call the respective authorities!" A staff member sitting on one of the tables of 
the cafeteria said hurriedly to his partner present. 

The partner took out an emergency talisman and ripped it. The talisman was reduced to 
pieces and became a big round portal out of which a person wearing a black suit and a 
red armband walked out. The red armband indicated that the person was from the 
security staff. 

"What's happening?" The security staff asked the person in front of him after looking 
around a bit. 

He was a bit confused as to why someone would be in trouble in the cafeteria of the 
academy or cause trouble, so he asked the reason for being summoned. 

The people explained what had just occurred and the security staff, after listening to it, 
quickly rushed towards Lith's table. 

Lith had no reaction towards this person's death. The reason being, he knew he could 
be revived easily, this was just a small lesson for him. He himself had killed many in the 
entrance exam because of this convenience,so thus, he felt nothing when someone was 
killed like this. 

Reviving low ranks was easy and the success rate was close to a hundred percent, but 
it wasn't a hundred. Many factors had to be taken into consideration when the revival 
was carried out. The factors being: magic rank, time of death, power of the soul and 
mental consciousness. 

The higher the rank of a person who is dead, the lesser would be the chance to get 
revived fully or without any side effects. The higher the rank of the person carrying out 
the revival, the higher the chances of being revived. 



It was impossible for a low magic rank person to revive another of a higher rank. The 
chances of successfully reviving someone who had the same rank as the person who 
carried out the revival were also very low. 

The time of death also mattered a lot. The soul leaves the body when one is killed. The 
body acts as a cage for the soul. Once one is killed, the cage is broken, letting the soul 
be free. The soul then dissipates. One part of it turns into energy and blends in with the 
world and another part enters the reincarnation cycle. 

It is not always balanced as to how much part would turn to energy and how much part 
would go into the reincarnation cycle. If more of a part went towards reincarnation, the 
person would have their memory intact from their previous life with even a bit of their 
consciousness. 

If more of a part was converted into energy, the person may not even reincarnate. It 
wasn't in an individual's hands to decide this balance. It was all totally up to fate. Thus, 
nobody preferred death even if resurrection was a thing. 

The power of the soul will decide how long it will stay intact without being dissipated. If 
someone is of a high rank, it may stay intact for days. However, if someone is of a lower 
rank, which in this case would be the human boy, the soul will dissipate within a few 
minutes. 

A mortal with no magic cultivation would have his soul dissipate within a few seconds of 
being killed. 

The last factor was mental consciousness. If someone's mental consciousness is 
strong, even if a good part of their soul is dissipated into energy, they will still have their 
memories intact after reincarnation. However, if it was weak, even if a good portion of 
the soul goes into reincarnation, it isn't a sure thing that they may even remember who 
they were in their previous life. 

These were one of the main factors as to why nobody wanted to die. There were also 
side effects present. A person may get crippled and their magic rank would halt if 
resurrection wasn't done properly. 

One may also resurrect, but with a limb permanently missing or any body part. Even 
with the best magic techniques, it would be impossible to heal these wounds. One could 
also become mentally retarded, develop demons and stay traumatized for life. While 
cultivating magic rank, one can turn from a rational being to an irrational monster. 

These factors and side effects always scared people, thus nobody wanted to be dead 
even in their wildest dreams. Sure, they could reincarnate with a 100% probability, but, 
their magic rank, their hard-earned experiences, etc, may or may not be with them in 
the next life. 



This, as well as knowing about the side effects of resurrection, kept people scared of 
death. Thus, nobody tried to pull any stunts that might result in their death. 

The entrance exam, or more correctly, arenas where duels took place had high grade 
soul trapping barriers present. The soul wouldn't dissipate even a bit in these areas and 
the person could be resurrected with the help of higher rank people who managed the 
duels. 

Lith knew all these facts and thus went all out in the entrance exam. Everyone during 
the entrance exam was either rank 1 or rank 2. Their consciousness as well as soul 
would be intact,so they could revive easily there as the academy had officials of very 
high magic rank. 

Right now, it had been a few minutes since the person died, but since an academy 
official had arrived, there were no problems. The reason being that the person who died 
had a very low rank and the academy official was of a very high rank. 

 
Chapter 127: Can't give punishment 

The difference in prowess was too vast between the human boy and the academy 
official, thus the chances of him being revived without any problems or side effects were 
almost a hundred percent. 

The same was the case when Rena's pack was being revived. Lucy was a King rank 
whereas the highest in the pack wasn't more than rank 5. Add to that, Lucy had the 
most superior resurrection spells and techniques in the whole world. It was handed 
down to her by a Legendary rank, a literal god, her and Lith's mother, Lilith Evure. 

The academy official quickly cast a barrier around the body of the human boy to ensure 
no further dissipation of the soul occurs. Casting a restoration life spell, the body of the 
human boy and the blood, which was scattered all over the floor, started getting 
assembled. 

After the body was fully restored, the academy official finally cast a resurrection spell. 
The dissipated soul was first restored to its original state. After a complete restoration, it 
was channeled inside the restored body. 

Everyone present in the cafeteria watched this scene with great interest. No matter 
what, bringing a dead back to life will always be something that nobody will get bored 
with watching. 

Lith, Ralph and Dennis were too looking at this but the three did not have much interest 
in it like everyone else present. They had seen it happen many times, such as in places 



like the entrance exam and during their training in their clans and families, thus it was a 
common occurrence for the three. 

A few minutes later, the human body started twitching and the boy opened his eyes. 
Getting up, he looked around and spotted Ralph. He frowned, looking at him, and just 
as he was about to say something, he felt a tap on his shoulder and heard someone say 
something to him in a deep voice. 

"Go to the medical room. Right now." 

He turned towards the source of voice and found a man in a black suit wearing a red 
armband. Noticing this, he kept quiet and left the cafeteria to visit the medical room. 

The academy official had ensured that the human boy was in a good mental state when 
he was resurrected. The resurrection spell he cast ensured that any memory that might 
provide a high stimulus and result in trauma was sealed temporarily and, for the human 
boy, the memories from when his girlfriend had made those remarks till his death were 
all sealed by the spell. 

Thus, he was confused and looked at Ralph with a frown, who was in front of him 
because he already had a dislike for him from the start. He had no idea what had 
happened to him or why he was on the ground, but since he was instructed by an 
academy official to go to the medical room, he did so without complaining. 

The academy official then turned to Lith, Ralph and Dennis. Looking at them, he sighed, 
the three had too high of a status outside of the academy. Plus, judging from how Ralph 
was so close to Lith, the academy official could guess that this Lust family heir was 
close to the heir of the Royal Clan of the Vampires. 

Punishing them would be difficult for someone of his status. Nevertheless, he had to do 
his job, so he took out a slip from his pocket, wrote a few things on it and handed it over 
to Ralph. 

"Hand this over to your teacher and she'll guide you on the rest herself." Instructing this, 
he left as his job was done. 

Too many eyes were on the trio and, since they couldn't eat peacefully now, they 
decided to leave. Ralph's food was wasted, so he had to buy food again. Lith and 
Dennis took their food to the counter to have it packed so they could take it back to the 
dorms and eat it. 

Though food was in abundance and both of them had money to buy as much food as 
they wanted, they refrained from doing so. Dennis loved food and this was his only 
reason to never waste anything he got for himself. 



As for Lith, in his previous life, he was from a middle-class family. In such a household, 
wasting food was almost a sin, for which he could've gotten beaten up by his family 
members. It was because money was limited and a good portion of it went towards 
food. 

Wasting food was the same as wasting money in such families and children from a 
young age were taught not to waste food. Another reason was that there were 
emotional sentiments attached. 

A vast majority of people in his previous life couldn't fill their stomachs with even one 
meal. Therefore, almost everyone was taught to be grateful for the food they had on 
their plates as some couldn't even afford it. Thus, everyone in his previous life, for one 
of these reasons, tried their best not to waste food and, even after reincarnation, such 
small habits stayed with Lith. 

Taking their food, the three walked out of the main building of the academy and reached 
their dorms after walking for a few minutes. Their dorm was pretty close to the main 
building. It was a ten minute walking distance and if they ran without any magic, 
reaching the main building within two to three minutes would be easy. 

The three seated themselves on the couch in the lounge and placed their food on the 
glass table. Ralph then took out his phone and texted their teacher to come down if she 
was free as he had something important to give her. 

The three then went on to chat and eat their food, livening up the atmosphere along the 
way and, just like that, half an hour passed. 

"Teacher still hasn't come down. Should we call her?" Ralph looked at Lith and Dennis 
and asked. 

Lith looked at the two and then said, "If she didn't see your text, she won't answer your 
phone either. Either teacher is busy with her phone all day or her phone is dead or in 
silent mode. I think we need to ring that bell or go to her floor to call for her. So, who's 
going?" 

 
Chapter 128: Red Hands 

"...so who's going?" 

Dennis and Ralph didn't say anything and stared at Lith for a good few seconds. Lith 
sighed and said, "fine, I'll go." 

"Your highness, we didn't say anything." Dennis shrugged and said, to which Ralph 
nodded his head in approval. 



Lith didn't argue with them about this. These two tried to avoid their teacher as much as 
possible, because teacher teased them so much that they couldn't handle it. 

Except Lith, he was almost a professional in the aspect of not getting teased. His 
mother had trained him well and, in his opinion, his teacher, Arya, wasn't anywhere near 
close to the level of his mother. 

Taking the stairs, Lith reached the fourth floor and was now standing in front of a door. 
Behind the door lay his teacher's dorm. It wasn't correct to call any of the dorms in the 
building dorms because they were more like a complete apartment. 

Add on to that, only 1 person stayed on one floor, with the floor itself being pretty big. It 
was only called a dormitory because it was attached to the academy, so only students 
and teachers could use it. 

Lith rang the doorbell present beside the door and waited for his teacher to open it for 
him. A few minutes passed with no response whatsoever. He pressed it again and 
waited for a few more minutes but still received no response. 

Lith contemplated whether he should just barge in or come next time, but after thinking 
for a bit, he decided to go inside. Ralph had created a mess today by violating the rules 
of the academy. The punishment was pretty severe for such a thing, but him not being 
punished yet meant something was either wrong or they were still deciding on it. Ralph 
needed his teacher's help urgently, that was what Lith thought. 

Opening the door and coming inside, the scene Lith saw made him so shocked he 
stopped in his tracks. The living room was a mess. There was food, clothes and even 
alcohol messily scattered around. 

In this mess, Arya was sleeping in a very inelegant and unlady-like position on the sofa 
currently in the center of the living room. One of her legs was on top of the sofa's 
armrest and the other was dangling down. One of her hands was holding an alcohol 
bottle and, as for the other, it was inside her panties. 

She was currently only in her black laced panties and a light blue loose half top. She 
didn't even have a bra on and her top also didn't help with covering her boobs, which 
were the most perfect ones he ever came across, they were neither too small nor too 
big, just the perfect size with a perfect shape. 

Even though Lith had seen it before, it was only when she was clothed and now that he 
had a good look of it, he was right about Arya having the most perfect sized breasts he 
had ever seen. Though they were perfect, they had their own charm and it couldn't be 
compared to his mother's or sister's. 

There was alcohol near her mouth which seemed to have dried up, shattering her image 
of an elegant and domineering teacher that she was. 



Lith, looking at this scene, wondered how things could've become such a mess. Though 
his teacher was half naked in front of him, making him feel hot just looking at such a 
scene, he controlled his urges and his lewd thoughts. 

Having been around his mother and sister, whom he considered as the most beautiful, 
he had gotten well versed in controlling his urges. Had it not been the case, he would've 
already had thoughts about taking advantage of such a situation. 

Then he would've later hated himself for doing such a thing as he was a person who 
believed in consent. Lith was raised well by his mother and sister. Thus, he would never 
do non-consensual stuff. 

Lith walked towards Arya and first, he corrected her top and covered her breasts. Next, 
he took the alcohol bottle from her hand and placed it on the table. He then removed 
her hand from her panties and draped it over his shoulder and made her get up from the 
sofa. 

He then put her in a piggy back position and carried her to her bedroom. But as he 
arrived there, he saw the bedroom to be in a mess too. He sighed and took her 
downstairs to his own floor. Going inside his own bedroom, he placed Arya on the bed. 

Lith cast a cleaning spell on her and cleaned her face as well as her whole body without 
actually touching her. He then covered her with a blanket and left the room after closing 
the door and walked down to the ground floor. 

Meeting the two again, Lith said with a neutral face, "teacher is sleeping. We should talk 
to her once she wakes up." 

The two nodded their heads in understanding and continued to do the work they were 
previously doing, that is, playing a game together. 

After Lith left, Ralph and Dennis started playing red hands together. How it worked was, 
they would stack their hands alternately on top of each other and the person whose 
hand rested at the bottom would remove it and slap the hand which was on the top. 

The one who couldn't bear the pain anymore would lose the game and would have to do 
whatever the winner asked him to do. Ralph wanted to have Dennis solve riddles and 
puzzles which they got as homework because he wanted to see his suffering face. He 
knew he hated it, so he wanted to see just that. 

Dennis, on the other hand, had completely different thoughts. He wanted to have Ralph 
get together with a girl and take her as his gf. He knew Ralph didn't like such stuff, so he 
too, like Ralph, wanted to see the suffering face of his friend. 

They both didn't know each other's thoughts as it would only be revealed once there 
was a loser or else the players would back out even before playing the game. 



Lith looked at the two and smiled. He sat on his knees at one edge of the table just like 
the other two and stacked his hands in between. He looked at the two, smiled wickedly 
and said, "I am playing too now. Don't back out like cowards." 

"Heh. Who's a coward?" Ralph smiled and replied to Lith. 

"Your highness, although you are indeed strong, you underestimate us. Don't blame us 
later when you feel the pain, hehehe." Dennis replied. 

Lith raised an eyebrow and replied back, "Hoh? Challenging me? Alright. We shall see." 

 
Chapter 129: Red Hands (2) 

BAM! 

"Argmffh…" Dennis let out a suppressed groan when Lith smashed his hand on top of 
his own. 

Lith and Ralph both looked at the pained expression of Dennis and smiled. They were 
really enjoying his suffering. 

"Here I go." Ralph said and took out his hand from the bottom of the stack. 

BAM! 

Ralph smashed his hand on Lith's. Ralph and Dennis both quickly looked at Lith's face 
hoping to see him suffer but, like every other time, they didn't see even a slight change 
in his expression. 

Lith had a high tolerance for pain, all thanks to his sister's training, which was now 
showing its effect. Lith turned to them and said smiling, " Want to see me suffer? In your 
dreams, hehehe." 

Ralph and Dennis clicked their tongues and turned their gaze back to their stack of 
hands. Dennis looked at Ralph and said smiling, " My turn now. Get ready, Ralph." 

Ralph maintained a poker face and didn't say anything. Dennis took out his hand and 
smashed it on top of Ralph's. 

BAM! 

Ralph gasped lightly but still managed to keep his poker face. It was now Lith and 
Dennis who clicked their tongues after failing to see Ralph suffer. 



The three were using magic powers when hitting each other. The impact was strong 
enough for Ralph and Dennis to always display pained expressions when he hit them. 

The order in which their hands were stacked was, at the bottom was Dennis's left hand, 
above which was Lith's left hand with Ralph's left hand being on top of it. 

Above Ralph's left hand was Lith's right hand and above it was Dennis's right hand, 
followed by Ralph's right hand. This ensured that one was able to get hit by the other 
two rather than just one player hitting the other. 

Ralph and Dennis were both starting to lose. Lith's hits were too strong and they weren't 
able to handle many of them. After a few more rounds… 

"Argh, I am out!" Dennis took out both his hands. He fell back on the ground and started 
shaking his hands, trying to ease the pain. 

"Me too." Ralph took out his hand too and rubbed them together. It was clearly visible 
that he, too, was in pain but was trying his best not to show it. 

Lith, although he received powerful hits from the other two, his pain tolerance was high 
enough to not be pained just by the hits he received from the two. Lith looked at the two 
and said smugly, 

"I win. Now, let me guess what you two need to do. Hmm… let's see… oh! Alright, it's 
pretty simple. Go to teacher's floor and clean it up." 

Ralph and Dennis looked at each other in confusion and then at Lith. Lith could 
understand what they were trying to convey with just this small gesture. He said to them 

"Don't look at me like that. This isn't that simple. Visit the floor and you'll understand." 

The two nodded and got up from the ground. They waited for a few minutes to have 
their hands healed and then went to the top floor. Dennis was a vampire from an 
Emperor rank bloodline and had innate superior regeneration abilities. 

Ralph was from the Lust family of demons, an Emperor rank bloodline too, and the Lust 
family demons had innate healing abilities as well. Thus, the two didn't need to take any 
pills or apply any ointments to heal their hands and they naturally healed within a few 
minutes. 

As for Lith, his regeneration ability was so fast that just as someone hit his hand and got 
done with it, his hand would heal within a few seconds. This was the healing ability 
originating from a Legendary rank bloodline. 



The three walked onto Arya's floor and the scene they saw shocked Dennis and Ralph 
just like how it did to Lith before. However, this time there wasn't Arya present. Lith 
looked at the two and said smiling, 

"Alright, get to work. And also, don't ask me how this happened, even I have no idea." 

Ralph and Dennis nodded. Dennis then looked at Lith and asked, "where is teacher?" 

"She must've gone out I guess." Lith lied. It would be troublesome to tell them that she 
was half naked and sleeping in his own bedroom and thus lied. 

"Must be the case." Dennis said, nodding his head. 

The two got to cleaning the floor while Lith watched and supervised, ensuring 
everything was cleaned up well. After fifteen minutes, Dennis said while constantly 
rubbing a wet cloth on a red stain on the ground, 

"Damn it. There's so much to do. I think solving puzzles would be much easier than 
this." 

"Yes. I'd rather go on a date than do this," Ralph added. 

Dennis didn't like puzzles and Ralph didn't like dates, but in comparison to those, 
cleaning seemed more hateful to them. 

The liquor stains were the hardest for them to remove and Ralph just wanted to cast fire 
spells to erase them. Dennis wanted to cast water spells to clean this up but the floor 
would become wet and using wind spells to dry it would just make more of a mess. 

They couldn't use magic as any mishap would ruin the furniture or the floor and thus 
had to do it normally. 

This was the excuse Lith gave to them when, in reality, their control was top notch, but 
he just wanted to see them suffer and thus used this as an excuse. 

Ralph, of course, saw through Lith's lies but he couldn't do anything about it being the 
loser, as the whole point of the red hands was that the loser had to do anything the 
winner said. 

Lith chuckled watching their reactions but didn't say anything. After fifteen more 
minutes, the living room was all clean. 

"Phew… finally, all done." Dennis wiped the imaginary sweat from his forehead and said 
in relief. 



Ralph nodded his head. This suffering session was finally over and he could go back to 
his business now. 

"No. Not yet. This is just the living room. I asked you two to clean the whole floor." Lith 
said, smiling wickedly. 

The two glared at Lith, this hateful guy. They wished that they could just beat him up, 
but they couldn't. Dennis would instantly be suppressed due to the superior vampire 
bloodline of Lith and he was much stronger than Ralph, so Ralph knew that it was 
almost impossible to beat up Lith. 

They both gave up and sighed. The two then went to the other rooms and, after two 
hours, the whole floor was cleaned up. The two laid on the ground and closed their eyes 
to rest. They were mentally very exhausted from doing such menial jobs. 

 
Chapter 130: Surfing the Internet 

The trio exited Arya's floor after it was all neat and tidy. Ralph and Dennis did a good 
job of cleaning it up and, due to Lith's supervision, they didn't slack. 

Lith was now sitting on the sofa in the living room of his floor. Having nothing to do at 
the moment, he was surfing the internet like usual. 

He began by checking the news. His mother had informed him that his sister was 
occupied with matters related to the vampire hierarchy. As it was done in a hurry 
previously, there were certain flaws in it, so Lucy was busy fixing it. Once it was 
changed, it would be announced to the whole world again. 

Lith checked the news daily and, like before, he didn't find anything today either. 'It 
seems that it would take a while.' Lith thought to himself and continued on with surfing 
the internet. 

He closed the news app on his phone and opened a social media app. Browsing 
through it, he smiled and thought, 'Memes sure found their way here too, haha.' 

Such a thought occurred to him when he saw a post that had a gif of a green goblin 
crying, with his tears filling the glass he was holding and him drinking those tears. It was 
on a loop with the above and below area of gif having two statements. They read: 

'I just want the happy 

Not the birthday' 



"I wonder how the meme culture has come so far here. To understand this meme, one 
would need to understand a series of memes. Welp, seems like being sad is a problem 
here as well." Lith said and chuckled. 

He not just saw the posts, he saw the comments of other people too, while scrolling 
through many posts and kept wasting his time. After half an hour, he closed the app and 
opened a global video streaming platform. As he opened it, he saw many videos and 
some of the titles that caught his attention were: 

"How to be a Supreme rank explained." 

- Kazl81 

"I sneaked into the local king's castle. *NOT CLICKBAIT*" 

- Kylehax23 

"I pranked my succubus wife by sleeping with a man. Prank gone wrong!" 

- My wife is my life 

"An orc saw a helpless and injured beast in the forest. The next thing he did will shock 
you all!" 

- Instant Interesting Information 

"Raise your magic rank in just 1 month! Limited time video, take advantage now!" 

- Instructor Zeld 

"Reacting to Zvis's ongoing controversy, my honest opinions." 

- Professional Controversy Reactor 

Lith sighed while looking at those titles. He then went to the app's settings and logged 
into his account. He was using a guest account and thus saw such videos accidentally. 

Logging into his account, he started watching a video named cute beasts doing cute 
things compilation. This was one of the fun things he liked to watch to relax and pass 
time. 

He saw a big tiger-like beast playing with a small bird-like beast. The bird was chasing 
the tiger who was doing everything it could to not get caught. After a while, they stopped 
and the tiger slumped to the ground. The bird then landed on the body of the tiger and 
slumped on it. They slept like that and the clip ended. 



The next clip in the compilation was a fluffy beast jumping down from a small height and 
trying to fly. It kept failing to fly, followed by continuously falling down, but that was 
where the cuteness of it lied. It seemed very cute when falling down and trying hard to 
fly again. 

"This sho cuteeeeee, oh my poor heart 

(ﾉ≧∇≦)ﾉ ﾐ ┻━┻" 

- Distanced Wolfie 

"Today's daily dose of happiness: checked. I'll come tomorrow again (☞^o^) ☞" 

- Iki801 

"Mannnnnnn this is so damnnnn cuteeee ahhhhhh my heart!!!!!" 

- SovereignKeizer 

"@SovereignKeizer are you the real one?" 

- KenoKo 

"Dudeeeeee is this @SovereignKeizer the one who rules the Cangton Country in the 
Demon Continent!?" 

- Loik23 

"@KenoKo @Loik23 yeah I am the real one. You can check the profile. It's verified too. 
Can us rulers not watch such things? Even we have a heart and a place for cute things 
like these in it. Don't be so shocked and exaggerate things." 

- SovereignKeizer 

"IT'S THE REAL DEAL!! OH MY GOD!" 

- KenoKo 

"@SovereignKeizer Indeed. We should stop overreacting and all come together to 
appreciate such cute things." 

- Loik23 

"@SovereignKizer Your majesty, I didn't know you liked such things too like us common 
folks! Hahaha, I am so telling this to everyone! Let us all toast one tonight in the country 
of Cangton in appreciation of cute things!" 



- Not Cangton Resident 

'Well, I didn't know even rulers watched such things. No, that would be wrong. I didn't 
know that high-ranking people would also spend their time doing such things. What an 
interesting world.' Lith thought to himself as he read these comments on the cute beasts 
doing cute things compilation video. 

People had long lives and doing monotonous things every day was boring. Such 
entertainment was greatly sought out by everyone, mortals and immortals alike. Some 
took the time to comment and let others know that they were watching too, like 
SovereignKeizer while some just anonymously watched it. 

Lith was young right now and he didn't know how boring it gets when someone has a 
never ending lifespan. He was a mortal in his previous life and thus, his perspective was 
still like a mortal instead of an immortal. 

People from all over the world were connected with each other via the internet. There 
were people of all sorts of races and cultures ranging from the innocent angels to the 
scheming demons and thus, all the global platforms had quite a lively atmosphere. 

In Lith's opinion, this world's online platform was much bigger, much better and much 
crazier compared to the one from his previous life. 

He always compared every single thing with his previous one and it was done so 
unconsciously that it couldn't be helped. Everyone does such things unknowingly. One 
can't know the value of another thing without having something to compare it with. 

Thus, as days passed, Lith was starting to like this world more and more and was also 
getting adapted to this environment. He was finally starting to feel that he belonged 
here. 

He kept thinking about these things, leading to his thoughts going astray for some 
moments. He thought after a while, 'If this is a dream and nothing is real, I don't ever 
want to wake up from it.' 

His happy thoughts were starting to take a darker turn and before he could think of even 
darker things, his thoughts were interrupted when he heard a melodious voice asking, 

"Did you bring me here?" 

 
Chapter 131: Your shamelessness knows no bounds 
like me 

"Did you bring me here?" 



Arya asked, walking towards Lith while still having nothing but a loose blue half top and 
black laced panties. Her bluish silver hair swayed lightly as she walked and her boobs, 
not having the support of a bra, jiggled a bit, making her pink nipples visible from time to 
time as she walked. 

When Lith turned around, he noticed his teacher, Arya, approaching him half-naked. He 
didn't avert his gaze nor did he try to avoid looking at her private regions. He took a 
good look at her perfect body, then matched his amethyst eyes with her oceanic blue 
eyes and said with a smile, 

"That's right, teacher." 

Arya reached the sofa and sat beside Lith. She turned to face him and asked, "why did 
you do it?" 

Arya was curious as to why Lith would bother to take such good care of her. He wasn't 
obliged to and she was too much of a mess. She suppressed her magic rank to the 
point where she was almost a low-rank mortal last night. 

She wanted to get drunk and her magic rank was so high, it wasn't possible to get drunk 
easily. One needed to have drinks made of very rare ingredients. 

Whenever such drinks were available on the market, they would be instantly sold out. 
All Emperor ranks were rich enough to afford them and thus, many didn't have the 
chance to get them. 

Though Arya could use her connections to get it, it wasn't worth such a hassle. There 
was another easy way out of it. 

It was to suppress the rank and drink. Though one could get drunk, the problem lies 
with the fact that the person would become very vulnerable in those moments when the 
magic rank is suppressed. 

From last night up until a few minutes ago, Arya was in a very vulnerable position. If Lith 
wanted to, he could've taken advantage of her but he didn't and instead took good care 
of her. 

She woke up to find herself in a bedroom she was unfamiliar with, but after spreading 
out her senses, she understood that she was in Lith's dorm. 

She then got up and found herself all cleaned up. It was not just that. She caught onto 
the minute traces of magical energy coating her and understood that someone had 
casted a cleaning spell on her and didn't touch her. 

She then walked out of the room to see Lith zoned out, seemingly in his own thoughts 
while looking at his phone without any movement, not even moving an eyelid. 



She thus asked him that question to bring him out of his thoughts. What she didn't 
expect was Lith checking her out. She was at a loss for words when he did such a thing. 
Many men who did such a thing were wiped out by Arya. She didn't like it when 
someone looked at her in such a perverted way. 

Though she was carefree and open most of the time, she too felt creeped out like other 
ladies when someone gawked at her with a lustful gaze. Though that was the case, she 
noticed that Lith was just checking her out without any lustful intentions. 

Arya was an experienced lady who had lived for tens of thousands of years and had 
abundant experience. She could differentiate well in these things. Thus, she was even 
more curious about Lith's course of action. 

"Because I care about you. You're my teacher and even though our time together is 
short, I respect you for whatever you've done for me. From teaching to training as well 
as taking care of small menial stuff, you've done your best, teacher. Of course, I would 
reciprocate these things for you as well if needs arose." Lith replied calmly with a smile. 

Arya nodded her head in understanding. It made sense when Lith used such reasoning. 
However, it still didn't answer a few things for her. She looked at him and asked again, 

"You said you respect your teacher, right?" 

"Correct, teacher." Lith replied with the same smiling expression. 

"Then why were you checking me out just a few seconds ago?" Arya asked with a 
smile. 

Lith had no change in expression as Arya asked him this. Without any change in 
expression,he replied, 

"Who would not, given their teacher looks so beautiful. I am pretty sure everyone will 
check you out secretly and try to hide it when caught. As for me, well, isn't this your 
fault, teacher? 

First of all, your floor's door wasn't locked and I could easily enter. Secondly, you were 
sleeping almost naked on the couch in a position you wouldn't believe even if I told you. 

I saw your naked body once and now that you didn't bother to change your clothes to 
get in front of me, I assume you have no problems with being like that in front of me. So 
all I did was try to have a better look this time, as last time you were sleeping and I was 
busy taking care of you." 

Arya stared at Lith until he finished speaking. She kept her serious stare at him. Lith 
didn't avert his gaze either and looked Arya straight in the eyes. After a few seconds, 



"Pfft… hahahahaha! You indeed are my perfect student! Your shamelessness really 
knows no bounds like me and you don't shy away from speaking half truths. Good. 
Good." Arya laughed loudly and her body shook due to it, causing her boobs to jiggle 
and make her pink nipples visible to Lith once again. 

Lith didn't shy away and looked at her breasts once again. He then looked Arya in the 
eyes and said with a smile, 

"Teacher, I am nothing compared to you. In front of you, I seem too innocent. Look at 
you, sitting beside me in just panties and a top that doesn't even cover your breasts. Are 
you like, trying to purposefully show them off to me?" 

 
Chapter 132: You may have skipped too many steps 
here 

Arya stopped laughing and said to Lith with a smile, "You've seen everything there is to 
see. Why would I be bothered if you saw it again once, twice or thrice? There's nothing 
left to hide anyway." 

Immortals were crazy! 

Lith had such a thought previously when he understood how boring life was for 
immortals and they sought out entertainment in every possible way. This time, however, 
he thought about it for a different reason. 

Having a long life, there's a lot of experience accumulated and a person's attitude 
towards certain things also changes. If it were someone else in Arya's place right now, 
they would be embarrassed about it and would try to quickly hide their private regions 
after such a realisation. 

This would be the best case scenario. The worst would be that the individual would 
come after Lith's life. However, for someone like Arya who has lived for thousands of 
years, such a thing wouldn't bother her, and it wasn't enough for her to get 
embarrassed. 

This was what Lith thought, but though his reasoning for Arya making that comment and 
acting in such a way was correct, it was only half the truth. 

Arya was a carefree person and Lith being her student as well as the person who took 
care of her just recently, she didn't mind about such a thing. Had there been someone 
else, they would've long gotten killed by Arya. 

Lith looked at his teacher and replied smirking, "there are a few things left that I didn't 
see though." 



Arya pulled Lith's cheeks and said, "indeed, just as shameless as me, no matter how 
you deny it." 

She knew what he was speaking about, but didn't mind it. There were very few people 
in the world who had done something for Arya without having any ulterior motives. She 
had developed a good impression of Lith due to this one small gesture from him and, 
thus, didn't mind his words. 

"So, are you going to put on clothes or not? I have something to tell you, teacher. Do 
you want to chat with me in this getup?" Lith asked with a smile. 

"It's fine. What do you want to talk about?" Arya replied. As she had mentioned before, 
Lith had already seen it, so there was no point in hiding it anymore. She wasn't a shy or 
innocent lady either, so it didn't matter much to her. 

"So it's like this…" Lith began to explain everything that happened in the cafeteria to 
Arya while she listened quietly without interrupting him. 

After Lith finished speaking, Arya started laughing and said, "Hahahaha… that's it? I 
thought it was something serious. This is just a trivial matter. Leave it to your teacher, 
*wink*." 

Lith nodded his head in understanding. He was about to end the conversation here but 
looking at Arya's face, he thought of something and asked, "teacher, why do you always 
wear sunglasses?" 

"Do you know about unique abilities?" Arya questioned Lith instead of directly 
answering his questions. 

"Yes," Lith replied honestly. 

Arya nodded her head and paused for a few seconds to collect her thoughts. After 
thinking it through, she replied to Lith stating, 

"I was one of those people who was born with unique abilities. Well, it would be more 
accurate to say that it was passed down to me by my mother. Our unique ability is a 
hierarchical one, which means it is passed down into later generations. Though that's 
the case, it's not a sure thing that one would inherit it. 

Only one person is able to inherit the unique ability and it's completely out of our control. 
So, a person may even have ten kids but there lies a possibility of none of them getting 
it or a person could have just one and the child would inherit it. I belonged to the latter. 

The unique ability I got was a blessing and a curse for me. Blessing because I became 
stronger due to it and curse because I had to keep my eyes shut or the eye power 



would give me a headache. If overused, I would've even gone into a comatose state or 
may even die. 

The ability was dormant and was only active once I awakened my magic core. Since 
that time, my mother ensured that I protected myself by covering my eyes with a 
blindfold. 

I started wearing a blindfold to protect myself and as my magic rank increased, the 
power of the unique ability increased too. Thus, the blindfold was never off of me and it 
became a part of me. Now, my magic cultivation has overpowered my unique ability and 
there aren't any problems anymore. I just get a slight headache sometimes. 

I have full control over my unique ability now and it doesn't matter if I cover them or not. 
I just wear these glasses because covering my eyes has become a habit for me. 

And also, it looks cool." Arya explained to Lith a little bit about her backstory while he 
quietly listened to her speak. 

Nodding his head in understanding, Lith said, "I see, so you wear them just to look cool. 
Noted." 

Arya chuckled at Lith's sarcastic comment and didn't mind it. Lith then said to her with a 
smile, "Alright, you should go now, teacher. Or are you planning on permanently staying 
here with me?" 

"Are you trying to make me leave?" Arya asked with a smile. 

"Yes, of course." Lith replied back with a smile. 

"Haww, such a sexy lady, even half naked, is sitting in front of you and you want her to 
leave?" Arya joked. 

"Hmm, now that I think about it, didn't you say you would help ensure that I am not 
confused about my sexuality? You should take responsibility for saying such things, 
teacher." Lith said with a broad smile. 

"How do you want me to take responsibility? Do you want me too…" Arya crawled 
seductively towards Lith and rubbed one of her fingers on his lips and said. 

Lith put Arya's finger into his mouth and sucked it. Arya didn't mind it and looked at him 
with a smirk. Lith let go of the finger and said with a smug expression, 

"I would love to, teacher. But, you may have skipped too many steps here. You should 
first take responsibility by having dinner together with me and the rest we can figure out 
later." 



Lith could have a harem and he had all the support from his mother and sister for it. He 
didn't have any plans to have it but today, after so many events and conversations with 
Arya, he was beginning to like her. 

Though he was starting to, it was just a liking and he didn't feel any love for her yet. 
Thus, he didn't want to rush things. Another thing was, he had no prior dating 
experience and it would be a good opportunity to experience it for the first time now. 

Anyone with no experience would feel embarrassed to even say things like Lith so 
straightforwardly. Lith could do it because he wasn't someone who got easily 
embarrassed and shy. He had become bolder and more straightforward, all thanks to 
his mother's teasing. 

 
Chapter 133: Are you asking me out on a date? 

"Hoho, Are you asking me out on a date?" Arya asked Lith with a smile. 

"Of course not. It's you who wanted to help me. I am only telling you how to proceed." 
Lith answered shamelessly without hesitation. 

Arya covered her face and giggled hearing Lith's answer. She ruffled his hair and said, 
"do you feel no shame in asking an old lady like me out on a date like this? Are you not 
worried I'll reject you? And aren't you too young?" 

Lith moved closer to Arya and laid on her lap. Looking up, he saw Arya's underboob and 
her pink nipples grazing the top Arya was wearing. He got a bit to the side and his view 
changed and he now looked at Arya in the eyes and said smiling 

"Teacher, don't twist things. I am not asking you out on a date, and if I didn't ask 
anything, how are you going to reject it? As for being young, age is just a number." 

Arya didn't mind Lith getting closer to her and being on her lap. She had a good 
impression of him and after talking to him today, the impression only rose higher. He 
was just as shameless as her and she liked it. 

"Do you know, no man has ever seen me in such a form. Not to mention they haven't 
even had a chance to hold my hand. Aren't 7you getting ahead of yourself?" Arya asked 
with a smile while caressing Lith's hair. 

"Anyway, let's go for dinner tomorrow. Is it fine with you?" Lith ignored her words and 
said what was on his mind. 

"Yes." Arya answered and Lith nodded his head. 



He got up from Arya's lap and said to her, "I will go shower and sleep now. Bye, 
teacher." 

"Byebye~" Arya replied and waved her hand. 

After Lith left, Arya got up from the couch and went to her floor. Opening the door and 
walking inside, Arya stopped in her tracks. She looked at the all clean floor and it 
brought a smile upon her face. 

She shook her head and muttered, "just why would you do this?" 

Arya was a person who, being from a powerful clan, always had people around her with 
an ulterior motive. From a young age, many tried their best to get on good terms with 
Arya so that they could have a good relationship with the Relgar Clan of the Death 
Dragon tribe. 

Arya got endless marriage proposals as well as people courting her and she knew it 
was all just a political move. She thus left her clan and went on a journey to improve her 
magic cultivation. On her journey, she met Mayzin and the two became the best of 
friends. 

Mayzin was Arya's first friend who wasn't someone scheming. Later, Arya got herself 
another friend, the Seraphim Emilia. These two were the only genuine people she had 
and as for the question on why she didn't have more even though she's been living for 
thousands of years, Arya was busy cultivating her magic rank. 

To rise in ranks, one needed to understand the laws of the elements better and the 
whole world in general. This could be done in various ways and one of the best 
methods was through meditation. It takes years of meditation and people generally go 
into seclusion in areas rich with elemental energy of their own affinity or the one whose 
laws they wanted to comprehend better. 

Naturally, it took Arya thousands of years of cultivation to ascend and she hardly had 
any time to make friends or hang out with people. Thus, in all her life, Arya had too few 
people who gave her things without actually wanting anything back. 

Lith was the third person who did something for Arya without any ulterior motives. And 
he also was the first male to do so. Arya therefore had a good impression of him and 
now looking at how clean the floor was, her impression for him only became better. 

Though that was the case, Lith was oblivious to such thoughts and had no idea that 
doing something so simple would get him onto such good terms with Arya. 

He has underestimated how monotonous and boring the life of immortals was and he 
had no idea that Arya was someone who hardly had any friends. His thoughts went 
along the lines that she was an experienced mature lady who had a good amount of 



dating experience and him being with her would lead to him getting a better 
understanding on how everything worked. 

Arya walked to her bedroom and changed clothes. She wore a white shirt, black pants 
with black belt and black heels. She tied her bluish silver hair into a bun and left her 
room after wearing her black sunglasses. 

Below Arya's floor, Lith was currently showering. Shampooing his hair, he muttered to 
himself, 

'Hmm, I wonder what teacher meant by this being a trivial matter. Is breaking a rule of 
the academy a trivial matter? Didn't they say on the forums that one was instantly 
expelled from school if they broke any rule? I wonder what teacher will be doing.' 

... 

Principal's office, Abalax World Academy. 

"Yo Emmy." Arya said cheerfully to Emilia after entering without knocking on the door. 

"Arya, don't enter without knocking." Emilia looked up and said knowing full well that 
Arya won't follow it. 

"Emmy call Sel and tell her to ask the administration staff to come to the conference 
room." Arya got straight to the point and said. 

"What happened?" Emilia asked, a bit curious. 

"One of my students violated a rule. This needs to be discussed." Arya said with a 
smile. 

"Got it." Emilia nodded her head in agreement. 

The matter was a bit important and Emilia understood why Arya was straight to the point 
today and didn't joke around like she usually did. She called Sel and instructed her on 
things that were needed to be done. 

After a few minutes, Sel walked into the room and said to the two, "everyone's in the 
conference room now, madam, Miss Arya." 

"Let's go." Arya said and walked out of Emilia's office. 

 
Chapter 134: I think, I can do well. 



Main building, Abalax World Academy. 

Inside the conference room. 

Many people in various attires were busy discussing things in a well lit room while sitting 
on their chairs in front of a rectangular table. The room was big enough to hold 200 
people and had a high ceiling. At one side, it had a glass wall through which one could 
easily look at the buildings present in the sky island. Two sides were walls and the 
fourth side of the room had a tempered glass wall. 

The chattering noises stopped when the glass door present at the tempered glass wall 
side opened up and three figures walked in. The three were Arya who wanted to 
conduct this meeting, joining her Emilia and Sel who called for the meeting. 

Emilia and Sel sat together, just next to the head seat where Arya settled herself. The 
administrative staff noticed this and realised that the meeting will be hosted by Arya, 
one of the three Emperor ranks present in the academy. 

"I'll skip the greetings. I'm busy. Ralph broke a rule, he killed a boy from a Half Emperor 
rank family from the human continent but the boy was revived. Ralph wasn't at fault. 
The boy bothered him and things lead to such an end. You have 5 minutes, discuss 
what punishment is to be given to Ralph, me and Emilia will make the final judgement." 

Arya said to the people present domineeringly unlike her previous self which got happy 
due to Lith's small actions a few minutes ago. 

The people got into a discussion and five minutes later, a person wearing a pointy hat 
and purple robes stood up and said looking towards Arya 

"Your Excellency, after discussion, we would like to suggest that Ralph gets punished. 
However, since he wasn't at fault, the punishment would just be a show to the others 
but he won't actually get punished. 

Ralph will not go out of his dorms for a week but we will tell everyone that he's getting 
punished in the academy's disciplinary dungeon. Your excellencies, what do you think 
about this?" 

Arya and Emilia both listened to it and Arya smiled hearing their decision. The people 
present weren't stupid. They were all experienced and everyone knew full well what it 
would mean to offend an Emperor rank powerhouse. 

It would've been alright had there been only one Emperor rank involved, however, 
Ralph was not only the son of the Asmodeus family head, he was also the personal 
student of Arya Relgar, another Emperor rank. Arya had not taken any students before 
and everyone knew this fact well. They didn't want to offend her nor the Asmodeus 
family's head and thus came to this decision. 



There was also another thing that they had known, it was about Ralph breaking the rule. 
They were thus expecting such a meeting and were well prepared. They knew it wasn't 
Ralph who was at fault, but rules were broken and punishment was to be given. 

Thus everyone came up with such a plan to keep all parties happy. Arya liked their 
decision and there wasn't anything she needed to do. She looked at them and said, 

"This is final then. The punishment would come into effect starting three days from now. 
Spread the news." 

Emilia looked at Arya, sighed and thought 'If my opinion wasn't needed, why was I even 
involved in this?'. Though she thought this, she didn't speak it out and kept it to herself. 
Reason being, she was a humble lady and would never say rude things to people 
unless absolutely necessary. 

After giving her verdict, Arya got up and left with Emilia and Sel. The people in the room 
sighed. Dealing with Emperor ranks was sure a pain, they all thought. Had they made a 
wrong or stupid decision, everyone in the administrative staff would suffer the wrath of 
not only the Asmodeus family head, but also of Arya. They didn't want it and tried their 
best to avoid it and they finally succeeded and sighed in relief. 

... 

––Lith's POV–– 

Lith's dorm, Abalax sky island. 

Lith was sitting cross legged on the sofa and absent-mindedly staring at the tv which 
was on. 

I wonder how teacher must be doing. Though I did act shamelessly and asked her out 
for a dinner, would I really be able to succeed in dating her? I mean, she is probably 
very old like mom. She must have a lot of experience in dating people. Why would she 
even think of me? 

Lith fell back on the sofa and turned around and buried his face into the pillow present 
on the sofa. 

Ahhh, I am idiot. If I fuck this up, what would teacher think of me? She is so nice and I 
am probably gonna ruin it. Argh! I am such an idiot. Having no dating experience and 
going after an experienced woman… 

Alright nevermind. I'll do well and not fuck up. Mom and big sis taught me so many 
things about a lady, I think, I think, I can do well. Oh god, is this what anxiety is? Am I 
getting anxious for tomorrow? Ugh, I should calm down. What to do to calm down? 
Hmm, let me see… oh, that meme, heh. 



'Anakin, stop panakin.' was it? Hahahaha! 

Lith recalled memes from earth and laughed internally, forgetting his anxiety for a few 
moments. After a while, he got up and stretched himself. 

Mhmm, I should get some tea and study for a bit. I still haven't done the homework 
given in class today. Ah, theory class sucks no matter where. I wish I could skip the one 
class that I have to attend too. Anyway, let's get some tea and get back to studying. 

By doing work, be it of any kind, one could distract themselves and the emotions one is 
going through would temporarily be gone. This was a trick that everyone used to cope 
up with their unstable minds back on earth. I am glad I learnt it. The anxiety sure seems 
to have lessened. 

Lith then made tea for himself as he thought and got back to studying and waited for the 
next day to arrive. After he finished studying, he tried to sleep but he was too excited to 
do so and as he thought about how his future would be once he starts dating Arya. 

 
Chapter 135: Yeah we believe you, Dennis. 

Next day. 

Lith really couldn't sleep due to the excitement, anxiety and the nervousness he felt. He 
didn't know he would feel such emotions. He thought, having done the deeds already 
and being teased by his mother so much, he has become a professional in being 
shameless and in not getting embarassed. 

Though he was right, it was only partially right. The above mentioned things couldn't 
cover up for his inexperience self who had never dated anyone, even in his past life. 
This was his first time and he was bound to feel such emotions. 

A good thing was, all the years of training has made him have better control over his 
emotions. If that wasn't the case, he would've been mentally unstable right now and 
would be freaking out. 

What he was going to do now was the same as a rank 1 having a match next day with a 
rank 9 or above. Add on to that, there was the whole world watching this fight. 

The emotions that the rank 1 would be going through before the fight, was the same 
what any person in Lith's shoes would feel. Though it won't be that exaggerated of 
course, but would almost be a similar kind of feeling. 

Lith went to shower and after he was done, he dressed up in the academy uniform and 
went down to the common floor. He was the earliest there because he didn't sleep the 



whole night and was up early. He made some tea for himself and sat down on the 
couch and waited for the other two to arrive while he sipped on tea. 

"Goodmorning." Ralph walked down the stairs and said to Lith in a neutral tone as he 
walked towards him. 

"Goodmorning, Ralph." Lith greeted Ralph back. 

Ralph got to the teapot and poured himself some tea that Lith made and sat down on 
the couch. Drinking tea and waiting for the others to arrive was a daily thing. The others 
generally here referred to Dennis who was usually late. These two were always present 
before time and Dennis made sure to always get them late. 

Thankfully, they were the toppers and had some leeway or else it would've had a very 
bad result in their overall scores. Attendence was counted daily and failure for reaching 
on time would result in marked absent. 75% attendence was compulsory and below it 
would mean a student has failed that semester and would need to repeat again. 

Fifteen minutes later, Dennis rushed down the stairs and said, "let's hurry. Let's hurry, 
we are late!" 

"No, we are not." Lith said sipping tea. 

"That's right." Ralph replied. 

"Huh?" Dennis stopped in his tracks and asked in confusion. 

"You've become so used to being late that I am assuming whenever you wake up, you 
think you've gotten late and rush everything. It's 6:45am, there's still 15 minutes left for 
the class to start. You're up early today." Lith replied with a smile. 

"Oh. Hehe. I've changed. I will always be on time, I made this resolution yesterday and 
see, here I am, fulfilling it." Dennis said smugly. 

"Yeah we believe you, Dennis." Lith replied with a smile. 

"We definitely do." Ralph said with a neutral face while sipping tea. 

"I am saying the truth! I really made a resolution!" Dennis said hurriedly. 

"Like we said, we didn't deny it and believe in you." Lith said smiling once again. 

"Argh." Dennis couldn't win against their sarcastic replies and thus gave up. It was 2v1 
and he was bound to lose it. 



After a short morning chat, the trio left their dorms and went to attend their first class in 
the main building – advanced botany. 

Ralph's punishment would start from the day after tomorrow and he could still attend 
classes. He wasn't notified about the punishment yet, nor was anybody else in the 
whole academy. His punishment would be announced the day after tomorrow. 

The advanced botany class was half theory and half practical class. They would be 
taught theory while doing things practically. Today they were supposed to learn about 
the plant called as Jhasko. 

Jhasko was a plant found in deserted and hot climatic region with very scarce nutrients 
present to grow up with. Jhasko was the equivalent of cactus from Earth according to 
Lith however, Jhasko could move, hunt and produce nutrients itself and nourish the 
ground present in these nutrient scarce areas. 

Though it could nourish the areas, it would take hundreds of thousands of years and it 
would only be able to do so if it was able to hunt other beasts and plants. Jhasko were a 
weak magical plant species and thus it was almost useless. 

However, they still needed to learn about it in botany. What they were learning today 
was the mechanism on how Jhasko could produce nutrients as it would someday be 
helpful to them. Lith learnt the mechanism, so did Ralph and Dennis today via 
experiments and theory. 

The advanced botany class was over after three hours. Next was advanced magic class 
that ran for another three hours and this was fully practical and not much theory was 
involved. 

Being the toppers and in advanced classes, they didn't get too big of a break in between 
the two lectures. They were given just a short half an hour break. Such was the life of a 
topper. Their every minute was given priority by the academy and they ensured that 
they themselves didn't do things that would result in wastage of these bright students' 
time. 

The three were free after six hours of classes and were now hungry. They barely were 
able to eat anything in the half an hour break. The three learnt their lesson from last 
time and decided to not eat lunch at cafeteria or public places as it may lead to a scene 
that occurred previously once again. 

They brought their food from the stalls present on the sky island and were sitting in the 
park and having lunch together. 

Lith still had a few hours before his date with Arya and was trying his best to distract 
himself with whatever activities he could. He was starting to feel more anxious and 
nervous as the time neared. 



 
Chapter 136: Teacher, carry me please. 

Lith did various activities throughout the whole day to distract himself as much as he 
could. It helped to keep his mental state stable but as he neared close to the time of the 
date, these feelings returned. 

He was currently pacing around in circles in his room, all dressed up and worried about 
how the date would go. The time was 8 p.m., and it was now 7 p.m. They hadn't even 
decided the venue where they would have dinner and it worried him even more. 

'Ahhh, my brain would get fried thinking of so many things. Relax, Lith. Try to relax. 
You're overthinking things. Relax, relax.' Lith chanted in his mind. 

He decided to meditate while listening to calming music to relax which did help out a 
little. He wasn't worrying in the same way as he did a while ago. 

Soon, it was 8pm. 

Lith had forgotten to check the time and was currently sitting cross-legged on his bed, 
listening to music. While he was listening to it, he felt himself being wrapped around in 
someone's arms. Lith panicked and instantly turned around to see who it was. 

He let his guard down! Someone was trying to sneak attack, he thought and got into a 
battle ready state. However, as he turned and saw the intruder, he was dumbfounded. 

He saw the beautiful face of his teacher, Arya. Her blue eyes reflected her serene and 
calm self which made even Lith feel calm.Her rosy lips enticed him to bite them, and her 
unblemished face dispelled any impure thoughts he may have had about her. 

"Surprised?" Arya asked with a smile. 

"Yeah." Lith replied without thinking much. 

"Why do you seem so tired?" Arya asked, looking at Lith's tired face. 

Lith didn't sleep the whole night and was running around the whole day doing one 
activity after another to distract himself. He was bound to be tired as he was just a rank 
2 currently. 

People below rank 6 were all mortals. They needed sleep and food unlike immortals 
who could make do without it. Lith was exhausted, as evidenced by his expression, 
which Arya noticed. 



"I didn't sleep and did many activities today. I am bound to be tired." Lith said exhaling 
and being in relief of finding no intruder. 

His emotions had calmed down already due to music and meditation and looking at 
Arya's face made him even calmer. 

"Why did you not sleep? Were you thinking about how today's date would be and how 
the end result will be?" Arya hit the bull's eye by asking this question but she didn't know 
that she did. 

Lith was surprised at how easily she hit the mark, but would he agree with it? Obviously 
he would. 

"Of course. How could I not think of my beautiful teacher and how she is so nice. You're 
taking responsibility, It's a very nice thing to do. I am proud of you, teacher." Lith 
showed a thumbs up and answered shamelessly. 

He himself didn't realise this but he was very comfortable when he was around Arya. 
When they were around, their vibe resonated because she was a fun, carefree person 
who was just as shameless as he was. 

Arya giggled hearing Lith's response. She had no idea whether he was stating the truth 
or was being sarcastic about it. Answers such as these which could make even an 
Emperor rank herself feel confused were very rare. 

If Lith had a system with him currently, he would see a notification panel stating: 

[Impression +1] 

His good impression was rising constantly in front of Arya, who was now starting to like 
him. But It was just the start, it still wasn't anywhere close to where she could even think 
about dating Lith. 

"It seems that you like me a lot and are thinking so much about me. You really want to 
date me that bad, huh?" Arya said and chuckled. 

She wasn't someone shy and though she didn't know whether what Lith previously said 
was true or not, she just followed along without any worries. 

"Of course I do. Who wouldn't consider that they have such a nice and beautiful 
teacher. Anyway, are you going to waste time talking to me here, teacher? Or take 
responsibility and take me somewhere for dinner? I am hungry, you know?" Lith said 
while rubbing his stomach in the end. 



"When going on a date, isn't it the guy's responsibility to take the girl for dinner? I don't 
want a boyfriend who is dependent on me, you know? I want someone who can take 
care of me." Arya said. What she said was a mix of jokes, lies and truth. 

She was joking when she said about the guy taking the girl out on a date. It was just a 
stereotype which she made use of to joke. She lied when she said she wanted 
someone who won't be dependent on her and she was stating the truth when she said 
about having someone to take care of her. 

This was something that came out from deep within her heart. She hadn't opened up 
like this to anyone but being around Lith whose vibe matched her own, such a thing 
came out on its own. Even she didn't know that she would say something as such and 
only after the words were spoken did she realise it. 

It was too late now though. Words once said cannot be taken back. Though Arya knew 
she made a blunder, she didn't show it on her face, lest Lith caught it and just waited for 
his response with a smile on her face. 

"Teacher, that's a stereotype. It's the new age now. It's not the guys that need to take 
the girl out. Anyway, you're getting a boyfriend who will be dependent on you ahem, I 
mean, a student who will be dependent on you. 

And don't worry, I, Lith, would always take care of you. I am not kidding. Now take me to 
dinner quickly. I am very hungry, not even kidding. Ahhh, I am so hungry that I have 
become weak. Teacher, carry me please." 

Lith made full use of his shameless behaviour and in the end spread his hands out and 
asked Arya to carry him. 

 
Chapter 137: You're a shotacon? 

Arya looked at Lith's dramatic behaviour and shook her head with a smile. She 
wondered how things had come to such a point for a few seconds. A few days ago they 
were just teacher and student and now here she was, going on a date with her student. 

It wasn't just that, this student of hers was too shameless, even claiming that this was 
not a date at all. No matter the case, Arya had now gotten herself into it and it was all 
due to herself. Who would've thought that her small prank from before would lead to 
such things. 

Nevertheless, Arya wasn't someone who backs out and she wouldn't do it against Lith 
too. She was just as shameless as him and thus, spreading her hands open, she said 
smiling, 



"How do you want me to carry you? Princess style or a piggy back would do?" 

Lith put on a pondering expression and said after a few seconds, "I am not a princess, 
so that's out. Let's go with piggy back." 

"You aren't a pig too… or are you?" Arya asked, smirking. 

"Ahhh, I am so hungry that I can't even hear you, teacher. Please carry the poor and 
weak me or I'll probably starve to death now." Lith said dramatically. 

Arya let out a small chuckle and picked Lith up in a piggy back position. Lith wrapped 
his hands around her neck and had his legs supported beside Arya's waist by her 
hands. 

Arya walked out of the bedroom and stopped in the living room. She asked Lith without 
turning her head 

"Any place that you would like to go to?" 

"No." Lith answered while having his chin rest on her left shoulder. 

Arya nodded her head and took a step ahead and vanished from her spot along with 
Lith. 

... 

Nine Roses Hotel, Kerzo city, Espat. 

Space fluctuated on the highest floor of the Nine Roses Hotel, the 100th floor, and two 
people appeared out of thin air. One of them was carrying the other on his back, while 
the other simply lay down relaxedly and allowed himself to be carried. 

It was Arya and Lith who just arrived on the top floor of the Nine Roses Hotel. 

"Welcome, Madam." A lady wearing black and white business bowed and said to Arya. 

Arya didn't respond to her but just nodded. 

The lady then stood erect and said gesturing towards her left, "this way please, 
madam." 

"Did you book a table beforehand, teacher?" 

Lith asked Arya after noticing that the management lady seemed to know what they 
were here for. 



"Not really." Arya replied while walking towards the direction pointed by the 
management lady and replied to Lith. 

"The lady seems to know why you are here though. Don't tell me she thought that we 
are a couple and here for dinner just by looking at us. Hmm also, I thought you would 
teleport near some hotel and I would have to walk to the table but you directly came 
inside. 

Oh my… don't tell me this was your plan, teacher. You did this so that the management 
here would think that we are a couple and you would get a couple's discount. Tch, tch, 
you are so shameless, teacher." 

Lith falsely accused Arya shamelessly without feeling even an ounce of embarrassment. 

This was the same guy who was worrying that he would mess up the date a few 
minutes ago but as soon as Arya arrived, he got comfortable around her and totally 
forgot about it. 

This is a common occurrence . People tend to worry a lot about their dates beforehand, 
but if their partner is right, they feel comfortable around them and their worries fade 
away. The same thing happened to Lith today, so such a mood shift wasn't out of the 
ordinary. 

"That's right. I did all of these for that couple's discount. Your teacher is too broke and 
can't afford things. Isn't it very sad?" Arya turned her head a bit and said with a smile. 

"Yes, very sad. But now I've become your boyfriend for that reason and what would 
people think of you? Carrying me like this and I also seem very young. Not to mention 
you're much taller and more mature looking than me. My, my, teacher, do you plan on 
making people think that you're a shotacon? *Gasp*" 

Lith joked and faked a gasp. 

"Why would I make them think… when I actually am one? *Wink*" Arya turned her head 
and winked at Lith after finishing her reply. 

Lith raised both his eyebrows in amusement and smiled. He had no reply to give her for 
this or had no idea what to say anymore. It seemed that his teacher beat him into being 
shameless now. He cleared his throat and said 

"Ahem, teacher, we've reached, you can put me down now." 

Arya, instead of putting Lith down, changed his position from piggy back to princess 
carry and walked towards the table in front of her and placed him down on his seat. 



Lith's face turned slightly red after Arya did that. Now this was a bit too much for him to 
not feel embarrassed. However, he didn't voice out his complaints and pretended as if 
nothing happened. 

On a chair in front of a round table, Arya sat across from Lith. They were currently in a 
lavish room with a red carpet throughout. Lith began looking around after settling down, 
and Arya sat there watching him without interfering. 

A glass wall to Lith's left provided a view of the city of Espat. Tall towers, brightly lit 
roads, numerous large and small buildings, parks, and the forest at its edge 
characterised the city. 

In front and behind him was brownish wooden walls which seemed exquisite and were 
present at an angle. A wall stood to Lith's right, similar to the wooden ones but not at an 
angle. 

Many silver chandeliers hung from the high ceiling, and candles were lit on the round 
table, which was surrounded by roses. It was a perfectly romantic dining place in Lith's 
opinion. Looking at how he was still looking around, Arya cleared her throat and after 
bringing his attention onto her, she said with a smile 

"Ahem, weren't you hungry? Why are you looking around so much?" 

"This is a nice place, teacher. Thankyou for bringing me here." Lith said to Arya with a 
smile. 

"I promised you I would, didn't I?" Arya said with a smile. 

Lith nodded his head and looked at the menu in front of him. After a few minutes, he 
looked at Arya and asked 

"Teacher, did you decide on what you're getting?" 

"Nope. Whatever you're having, I'll just have it too." Arya said with a smile. 

She was an immortal so due to not needing food anymore, she didn't have any 
particular preference for food anymore. Thus, she just left it to Lith and gave such an 
answer. 

"Alright. Uhh, but there's no one around whom I can give my order to." Lith said, looking 
around. 

Arya clapped her hands twice and the lady from before walked into the big luxurious 
room and stood beside the table Lith and Arya were seated at. 

"What would you like to order, madam?" The management lady asked politely. 



Arya didn't look at the lady and just pointed at Lith. The management lady turned to Lith 
and asked 

"What would you like to order, sir?" 

"Fish and chips for starters with tartar sauce." Lith began with his order. 

The management lady noted it down without questioning him or suggesting anything. 
Everything was available on the menu and there was Arya present on the table too. She 
didn't want to do anything that may make her annoyed and thus, stayed quiet and 
silently noted everything Lith said. 

"Renzig Rabbit for main course." Lith said to the lady with a smirk. 

Arya covered her face and giggled hearing Lith's order. 

The management lady didn't understand what was happening but nevertheless minded 
her business and noted it down. 

"Steamed rice, lamb chop and sweet and sour soup for main course too. Chocolate as 
well as vanilla ice cream for desserts and two mojitos." Lith said and finished with his 
order. 

"Make one of the mojito without alcohol." Arya added. 

Lith was young and wasn't a rank 6 yet. Alcohol or any intoxicating substance would 
harm his body and Arya knew about it. Even though they were on a date and he was 
free to order anything he wanted, she was still his teacher who cared about his health 
and thus didn't let him have anything that may harm him. 

Lith didn't mind it and the lady left after taking their order. After she left, Arya looked at 
Lith and asked with a smile on her face, 

"Are you really this petty?" 

"Petty? Me? Why do you say so?" Lith asked by putting his hands on the table and 
resting his chin on the back of his palm. 

He knew what she was asking about but pretended he didn't know. 

"Heh. Playing dumb, are we? Well nevermind. Hmm also, I thought you would order the 
whole menu or something expensive or exquisite." Arya put out her thoughts. 

"Teacher, I am here to fill up my tummy with something yummy. Not to show off or act 
like royalty." Lith said honestly. 



 
Chapter 138: Dinner with Arya 

Arya chuckled and said, "alright, I understand." 

The two didn't have to wait too long as within the next minute, the management lady 
came back with a cart full of food. She placed the cutlery on the table and left after 
serving them food and beverages. 

Lith took the mojito glass and raised it slightly towards Arya and said, "thankyou for 
bringing me out for dinner." 

Arya raised her own glass and clinked it together with Lith and said, "you don't have to 
thank me. I am responsible for this. *Wink*" 

Lith smiled at this and took a sip of his mojito. The sweetness from the sugar and the 
sourness from the lime were blended in pretty well and he was starting to like this taste. 
He wondered how it would taste with alcohol in it but it was just a passing thought. 

He then took a bite of the Renzig rabbit roast and frowned. Taking a napkin present on 
the table, he spit the food out. Arya noticed this and asked, "is the food not good?" 

Lith shrugged and said, "I have no idea. The garlic in it ruins the whole flavour for me. I 
can't eat it. It tastes bad. I should've mentioned substituting it with allium, sigh." 

The taste of garlic was horrible for all vampires. They wouldn't want to eat it, even in 
their dreams. It was just that bad. Some vampires even said that it tasted like shit and 
every other vampire agreed with it even though they did or did not know what it actually 
tasted like. 

Lith too assumed the same. He read on forums about it and thus just assumed the taste 
to be shit. However, he couldn't just say that out in front of his teacher. Not today at 
least as he was out on a date with her. 

Arya shook her head with a smile. She clapped her hands and the management lady 
came back into the room. Arya said to her with a neutral face, "take it all away and 
make another batch of the same order. This time, make it fit for a vampire's palate." 

"Understood, madam." The management lady bowed and said respectfully. 

She cleared the table, except for the mojitos, placed them in the cart, took the cart and 
rushed back to the kitchen. Within a minute, she came back again and quickly placed 
the food back on the table. 



Lith saw two plates of lamb chops and two pots full of Renzig rabbit roast. This time, he 
saw bits of something dark in it and smiled knowing the food now had allium instead of 
garlic. 

Allium had the same taste as garlic but was dark in colour. Lith could testify it as being 
true since he knew how garlic tasted back on earth. Here in this world, people who 
could eat garlic have testified as allium having the same taste as garlic and the vampire 
people took their word for it. 

Lith took a sip of his mojito and cleansed his palate. He then took a bite of lamb chop 
and had a satisfied smile on his face. 

"Mhmm, this tastes so good." Lith said to Arya with his eyes closed and chewing onto 
the lamb chop. 

Arya chuckled and said, "I am glad you like it." 

The two ate their food together and talked for an hour and a half. They cracked jokes 
together, about their lives a bit and about how life was at the academy for them. They 
had a good time together and Lith didn't flirt with Arya this time. 

Flirting is good but one shouldn't over do it. It loses its essence and the other person 
would soon get bored of it. Lith knew about it and thus stopped. Arya was amused at 
how good Lith was at understanding the atmosphere and changing pace. 

Though she wouldn't have minded had he been his same shameless self even during 
dinner, a change of pace brightened the atmosphere even for her own self. 

Finishing their dinner, the two got up from their chairs and Lith walked closer to Arya. 
She held Lith by his waist and the two vanished from their spots. 

... 

Lith's dorm, Abalax sky island. 

Lith and Arya arrived at Lith's floor, in the living room. Lith sat on the sofa and patted 
beside him and said to Arya, "come teacher, let's watch some anime together. You were 
supposed to ensure that I am not confused about my sexuality right? Hehe, come, fulfill 
your responsibilities." 

Arya looked at Lith in amusement. This guy was back to his shameless self now. She 
wondered if he had a switch or something to change his mood so suddenly. 
Nevertheless, she sat beside him and waited for him to put some anime on. 



Lith smiled and was very happy when he saw this. His teacher didn't dislike him and it 
was showing. She didn't even put up any resistance against him and he knew that if he 
played his cards well now, he had a sure shot chance of dating her. 

Though he knew taking things so fast wouldn't result well but judging by how his teacher 
was the same as him, he understood that being slow wouldn't be fruitful either. He had 
to up his game and take things a little faster and be more proactive if he wanted to date 
Arya, these were his thoughts. 

Lith put on an anime, it was a romantic one and five minutes into it, he said to Arya, 
"teacher, this isn't comfortable like this. Let's change into something comfy and watch 
the anime together." 

"Let's change? Do you want me to change together with you?" Arya turned to Lith and 
asked with a smile. 

"Of course. Didn't you say that I've seen everything there is? Why would it bother you to 
change with me then?" Lith replied back with a smirk. 

Arya giggled hearing his reply. She said to him after a second with a smile, "aren't you 
too perverted? Do you want to see me naked that badly?" 

"Who wouldn't want to if they had a chance? My teacher is a beauty for whom people 
would kill each other just to see the face once. And I am the luckiest person in the world 
to have seen you up so close and naked ahem I mean in so detail." Lith praised Arya 
with a smile and said. 

Arya chuckled and asked, "what if I deny changing clothes with you and always ensure 
that you don't see me in such a state again?" 

Lith put on a pondering expression and said with a smile, "hmm, well that would be bad 
news but it doesn't matter. As long as you're with me, I am fine with everything." 

"So cheesy." Arya chuckled and said. 

"Alright, alright, I am gonna go change. It's totally up to you if you want to change with 
me or not but yeah, please do change. Oh right, I actually forgot to say this but I'll say it 
now, teacher, you look very stunning and beautiful in that outfit." Lith turned to Arya and 
said. 

He had forgotten to actually tell her this and only now did he realise. 

Arya was wearing a beautiful blue knee length one piece dress. Her arms and collar 
were exposed. The dress had a cut at the bottom from the side and one of her leg was 
exposed a few inches from above her knee. 



She was wearing black heels and silver earrings. She looked absolutely stunning as Lith 
had stated and her hair tied in a bun, making her nape visible increased her charms to 
another level. 

"I thought I was never gonna get a compliment today even after I dressed up so much 
for you." Arya said with a smile. 

Indeed, she didn't really dress up like this much. It's been years since she had done so 
and today, only for Lith did she dress like this. She knew it was a date no matter how 
much Lith denied it and so, she dressed up well for him. 

Was Lith someone very important to her because of which she dressed up like this? 
The answer was uncertain as she herself didn't know. She had no idea why she was 
following along with Lith's plans and why she was even bothering to take part in his 
jokes. 

She knew the taking responsibility thing was just a joke and she could've stopped 
herself from getting into all of this but she didn't. What was the reason for it? She didn't 
know. 

Arya wasn't someone experienced in the matters related to love. She was just as 
inexperienced as Lith. Lith matching her own vibe and energy made Arya feel 
comfortable around him. She found it fun too when she was around him. Add onto that, 
that small gesture from Lith created a very good impression of him in front of her. 

Thus, unknowingly, she was playing along with him because she was starting to like 
him. She liked Lith just as much as he did her. Their like for each other was at an early 
stage and there weren't any signs of love yet. 

Things would take a bit more time but judging from how fast the pace was at which Lith 
was taking things, it won't be long before their feelings for each other would grow and 
their like for each other would turn to love. 

 
Chapter 139: Cuddling 

Lith walked into his room and stood in front of the wardrobe. He took out a blue t-shirt 
and a white short out of it and changed into it. After changing, he walked back to the 
living room and as he arrived, he stood in his tracks and smiled looking at Arya. 

She was sitting on the couch and watching tv in just her blue bra and panty. Lith walked 
towards her and said smiling 

"Teacher, is this what something comfy means for you?" 



Arya looked at Lith and said shaking her head, "Nope, this isn't the comfy outfit for me. 
Comfy would be something such as a half top with short sleeves and just my panty." 

"Oh. So you don't have a half top with you right now?" Lith asked. 

"That's right. My clothes are in my bedroom. I forgot to put them in my ring." Arya said 
smiling. 

"Do you want me to get them for you?" Lith asked again. 

"No need." Arya replied with a smile. 

Lith nodded his head and sat beside her and both continued watching anime. The 
anime they were watching was a slice of life genre anime about teens doing their daily 
things in their academy and it had a romantic plot between the male lead who was the 
main character and the female lead. 

An hour into watching it, Lith slumped to the side of the sofa, on the arm rest and said to 
Arya, "teacher, sitting normally isn't comfortable. Come, let's sleep and watch it 
together." 

Arya turned to him, pulled his right cheek lightly and said smiling, "do you think I'll agree 
if you ask me such things? And aren't you going overboard?" 

"Ow, ow, ow. Teacher, it hurts, let gooooo." Lith said dramatically and tried to fake resist 
her. 

Arya chuckled and let go. She knew it didn't hurt him and he was only acting. 

Lith rubbed his cheek and said to Arya, "teacher, you're bullying me. You are very bad." 

"Yes, I am. What are you gonna do about it?" Arya said smugly. 

"I can't do anything. That's the problem. Teacher is too strong." Lith said with a sad 
expression and wiped a non existent tear from his face. 

Arya chuckled but didn't reply to it. Lith put one of his hand out and said to Arya with a 
smile, "don't worry teacher, I am no pervert who will take advantage of you. Just trust 
me, this feels super nice. And the anime we're watching, it'll feel even more nice if we 
watch it sleeping together." 

Lith avoided stating that he was inviting Arya to cuddle together and watch the anime. 
Doing so would create an awkward atmosphere between the two and he therefore 
avoided it. Though sleeping together meant an entirely different meaning, in this 
situation, it helped more than asking her out to straight up cuddle. 



Lith was gambling currently. He knew that their realtionship wasn't to the point where 
they could cuddle together but he still took the risk. If he won this gamble, they would be 
much more closer than before but if he lost this gamble, it'll mean in him moving a step 
backwards from what he wanted to achieve. 

Nevertheless, he was ready for a loss. Arya on the other hand was an inexperienced 
lady in the matters regarding dating and had no idea that Lith was indirectly inviting her 
to cuddle together. Thus, having no idea about it, she went along with his plans. She 
knew that he won't take advantage of her or do anything perverted and thus followed 
along. 

While she was carrying him on her back previously, he didn't do anything perverted 
even though he could easily. He also didn't take advantage of her when she was drunk 
last time. All these facts led to her trusting him and thus, she followed along. 

'YES!' Lith screamed internally as Arya accepted his proposal. 

The two now laid on the sofa together. Lith was behind, holding Arya by her waist and 
the two cuddled together while watching anime. Though Lith felt a little uncomfortable 
due to Arya being much taller than him, he didn't voice it out. This moment would decide 
their future together and he didn't want to mess it up. 

Arya seemed pretty comfortable in his embrace. She had the back of her head touch his 
chest and was sleeping on the couch facing away from Lith. Lith had his hand wrapped 
on her stomach but she didn't mind it. He wasn't taking advantage of her and didn't 
cross any lines, so she was fine with it. 

After two hours of watching anime together and cuddling together with Arya, Lith fell 
asleep. He was too tired today. He didn't sleep last night and was roaming around trying 
to distract himself and then there was the date with Arya, all these things made him very 
tired and he thus fell asleep after trying his best to not to. 

Arya sensed Lith sleeping and slowly turned around to see him. He was indeed sleeping 
and she could figure out that such a position would be uncomfortable to sleep in. She 
slowly got out from his embrace and stood up. She then cast a deep sleep spell on him 
and picked him up from the sofa. 

She took him to his bedroom and placed him on the bed and draped a blanket over. 
She patted his head slightly and said with a smile, "I enjoyed our time together today 
and thankyou for taking care of me yesterday. Sleep well, goodnight." 

Those were Arya's heartfelt words. She wasn't joking or was stating this playfully like 
she usually did. She felt warm in her heart being around with Lith today. They joked, 
chatted and shamelessly talked so much today, she loved her time with him and it was 
genuine. 



There was also her cuddling together with Lith. She didn't understand what this 
unknown feeling was when she was cuddling with him but if she were to describe it, it 
was roughly that she felt warm and comfortable in his embrace. 

 
Chapter 140: Last Step 

Arya felt comfortable and warm while she was in Lith's embrace. However, if someone 
were to say that she felt safer in Lith's embrace, she would deny it and never accept it. 
But, this was also one of the reasons. 

Arya had been cultivating diligently to increase her magic rank and now she was nearly 
at the top. Invincible and immortal. She had never taken a break before, and it was only 
a few hundred years ago that she decided to stop cultivating because she realised 
something was missing and that continuing to cultivate would be futile. 

She was the Emperor rank closest to breaking through to the Supreme rank, but 
something was lacking and she didn't understand what it was. 

She referred to this as the final step. She needed something to help her take this last 
step and ascend and as she was hanging around with Lith today, she felt herself 
change a little. She felt like she was approaching a breakthrough, and her final step had 
begun. 

Though it was only a slight change, she still noticed it. Such a feeling had never 
occurred to her in many years, which made her kind of excited too. 

Such a change occurred when she was with Lith and she thus started believing that he 
may really be the reason that would help her take the final step and have her 
breakthrough. 

Emilia did tell her that taking in students could help her and now she was starting to 
believe it. Who knew that what Emilia said would actually be true? She felt thankful for 
having Emilia as a friend and she made plans to thank her later. 

After putting Lith in his bed, Arya walked back to the living room and continued watching 
the anime while lying on the couch. 

... 

Next day. 

Lith woke up from his sleep, fully refreshed and energised. He got up and noticed that 
he was in his bedroom. 



'Hmm? Wasn't I with teacher cuddling together last night? Seems like she must've 
noticed me sleeping and put me to bed.' Lith thought to himself as he got down from 
bed. 

He turned to the clock present on the wall above the door of his bedroom and as he 
looked, his eyes widened and he said in shock, "shit! It's 1pm!? What the fuck!? Why 
did nobody call me or come to wake me up!?" 

Lith quickly rushed to his wardrobe and removed his clothes. He cast a cleaning spell 
on himself and, after getting all cleaned, dressed into the academy uniform hurriedly. 

He dashed out of his bedroom and through the living room, he reached the door and 
just as he was about to exit and leave, he heard a melodious voice saying 

"Why are you in such a rush?" 

It was Arya who asked this. She was currently in her normal everyday clothes – jacket, 
sports bra, leggings and shoes, along with her round sunglasses on her face. 

"Because I am late?" Lith turned around, said quickly, and opened the door. He was 
about to rush to the main building but Arya said quickly, 

"Wait." 

He turned once again to look at her and had a questioning look on his face. Why did 
she stop him again, he thought to himself. 

"No class today. I asked for a leave, just for you." Arya said with a smile. 

Lith sighed in relief. He said to Arya with a smile, "thank you, teacher." 

It was a good thing that there were no classes today. He was really in no mood to 
attend any. Even though he was refreshed after waking up, he was in no mood to do 
any activities today. He just wanted to relax and laze around today. 

"Teacher, it's lunch time, I haven't had any. You must not have had it either, right? Want 
to join me?" Lith asked Arya. 

"Oh, I'll join you if you're paying. All my money was spent yesterday on dinner. I am 
broke now." Arya said and winked to Lith. 

"I am broke too. I have no money. What now?" Lith put his hands on his waist and said 
with a sad expression. 

"Aren't you the Vampire Prince? Shouldn't you have a lot of money?" Arya said, walking 
towards the couch and sat down by the time she finished saying her words. 



"Aren't you an Emperor rank and a very powerful being? What would people think when 
they get to know that you're broke?" Lith said the same thing back to her. 

"I spent all my money on liquor. I am poor now." Arya slumped on the couch and said. 

"I don't earn or make any money. Everything belongs to my mom and she doesn't give 
me any pocket money." Lith said with a smile. 

"Wow. You are blatantly lying to me now. I don't believe you." Arya turned around and 
said, facing Lith. 

"Alright, alright, less jokes now, teacher. I am hungry. Are you ordering something or will 
I have to go out?" Lith asked Arya. 

"I'll order.* Arya replied. 

"Alright, I'll go freshen up then. See you in a while." Lith said as he walked back towards 
his bedroom. 

He took a shower after a while, changed clothes and returned to the living room. Arya 
was sitting on the dining table chair in one corner of the big living room with a lot of food 
in front of her. 

Lith walked towards Arya, sat opposite to her and started having his lunch. They talked 
while they ate food and started having a fun time together. 

... 

Haslingberg city, Uklov. 

On top of a seven-story building, a black-haired, blue-eyed teen lay prone. A long-range 
sniper rifle was in front of him, and he was aiming at a target fifty kilometres away who 
was strolling through a park. 

The target was an old man with horns protruding from his forehead. Accompanying him 
was a small girl who was playing around with him. 

"Target located… 3… 2…" The teen muttered softly. He put a talisman slip in between 
his teeth and muttered once again, 

"...1…" 

BANG! 

The teen quickly bit the slip and vanished from the spot along with his rifle. 



BURST! 

The bullet tore through the old man's head. His brain matter splattered everywhere in 
his immediate surroundings, including the little girl. 

The little girl was dazed as if her brain was still processing what just happened before 
shrieking in horror, 

"AHHHHH! GRANDPAAAAAA!" 

 

 

 


