
Vampire 381

Chapter 381 A Lewd Circle is formed**

The sacred water enchanted by reciting the verses from the ancient vampire language was 
something really strong and couldn't be drunk directly.

For this reason, the priestess played an important role.

The priestess would bear the pain that was caused due to the water and absorb any impurities that 
may be present in it. The water would then be purified fully and enter inside the bodies of the 
groom and the brides.

After entering inside their bodies, it would stay as energy and wouldn't really get absorbed until 
another ceremony is performed, which was now what Luna was about to make them do.

Luna made Lith sit cross-legged. She then bent down and sucked his cock to make it erect. After 
that was done, she made Alexandra to come towards Lith and made her sit on Lith's lap.

As she sat, Lith's shaft entered inside her cunt and ended up penetrating her womb when he was 
balls deep in her.

Luna then made Alexandra wrap her legs around Lith and made the two hug tightly.

After that was done, she made them kiss and asked them to keep their tongues wrapped around each 
other.

After this was done, Luna touched their lower back and started reciting the verses once again.

Soon, Lith felt some kind of energy flow from within his body towards Alexandra. It flowered from 
his Magic Core area and went down towards his shaft and from there, it entered inside Alexandra.

Alexandra felt something flow in her from down there and she felt slight discomfort from it. But it 
wasn't something she couldn't handle and then the energy flowed in her Magic Core.



From Alexandra's Magic Core, the energy flowed out once again and then went towards her mouth 
and then entered Lith. From Lith's mouth, it entered his core and the cycle repeated itself again.

After a few cycles were done, Luna took her hands off and let the energies flow naturally. She was 
the one to guide the energies and gave them a push and now it would flow naturally till the energy 
from Alexandra had finished being absorbed.

Alexandra had the lowest Magic Rank among the ladies and she couldn't hold onto these energies 
for long. It was for this reason that she was made to come first.

A few minutes later, the energies were all absorbed by Alexandra and Lith.

Alexandra was then made to get up and go back to her position.

It was then Lucy who came. She made herself comfortable and sat on Lith's shaft and then kissed 
him.

The same process repeated again and after she was done, it was Emilia who was called.

After Emilia was Arya, and then finally Lilith.

After the energies were absorbed by Lilith and Lith, Luna didn't make Lith get up and go away.

Instead, she made the two stand while still having Lith's shaft be lodged inside Lilith.

Luna then asked Lith to do something which he never would've imagined he had to do.

"Your Highness, please turn around, but ensure that you don't break your bond with Madam." Luna 
said calmly as if she hadn't just muttered something bizarre.

Lith looked at Lilith and Lilith could only chuckle and assure him that it wasn't something pointless 
and was important.



Lith nodded and he slowly twisted his body and turned around without having his shaft removed 
from Lilith's pussy.

"Madam, please turn around." Luna asked Lilith.

Lilith nodded and did the same thing.

Lith's dick was big and despite both facing away from each other, it didn't come out and was still 
inside Lilith.

Luna then called Arya.

She made Lilith bend down and also asked Arya to do the same while being in front of Lilith.

Luna then made Arya kiss Lilith and asked them to wrap their tongues together.

She slightly moved Arya's body to the side and then called Emilia.

She made Emilia bend down as well and insert her tongue inside Arya's pussy.

Emilia slightly hesitated but Luna explained the importance of it and Emilia let go of all hesitation 
and kissed Arya's pussy and inserted her tongue inside her.

Luna then called Lucy. She made her insert her tongue into Emilia's pussy and after she was done, 
she called Alexandra and made her do the same with Lucy.

After Alexandra inserted her tongue into Lucy's pussy, a circle was almost formed.

Now it was just Lith who needed to attach himself to Alexandra and the circle would be completed.

Lith was seriously very dumbfounded. Never in his life had he imagined that such a thing would 
happen. Who knew that these crazy vampires would have ceremonies like these?



Luna shifted Alexandra's body and brought her close to Lith's. She then made Lith bend as well and 
had him insert his tongue inside Alexandra's pussy and stay in that position.

After the circle was completed, Luna placed her hand on Lith's middle back and started reciting 
verses from a book in the ancient vampire language.

Soon, Lith felt something flow from his Magic Core and go towards his shaft and then leave his 
body.

It was the chaotic and dense energy that was leaving him. Though the ladies had absorbed their 
energies, Lith had only absorbed a part of it.

The ladies were made to drink the sacred water once, but Lith was made to drink it six times.

Despite being connected to all his ladies, Lith's body still hadn't absorbed the energies and this 
ceremony was being done for his own benefit.

The ladies wouldn't benefit anything from it. Their bodies just acted as channels that would absorb 
the impurities of the energies and lower the harmful effects of it. Their bodies were like purifiers 
and Lith would only end up having the purest form of energies.

The energy was in the most concentrated form when it entered Lilith. But Lilith was a God and she 
was a Legendary Rank. She could handle it.

Then passing from her body, the energy flowed towards Arya.

Arya was a Supreme Rank and she could manage having the concentrated energy flow from her 
mouth towards her pussy.

If it was Emilia or Lucy or Alexandra, and they were kissing Lilith and had the energy flow in them 
like this, they would end up having their heads bursted due to this.

Such a risky thing was happening so smoothly all thanks to Luna having planned it well.



The energy became more pure and less concentrated with impurities as it flowed from Arya's mouth 
towards her pussy.

It then entered Emilia's mouth and from there, it flowed to her pussy and entered Lucy. Then from 
Lucy it entered inside Alexandra and then into Lith's mouth and finally into his Magic Core.

The inside of Lith's Magic Core shook intensely as if a big earthquake had taken place. It was all 
caused due to this energy.

One cycle was finally completed after Lith's core stopped shaking and was stabilized.

Luna could feel it.

Luna then made this process repeat and after a few cycles, no more energy came out of Lith's core, 
indicating that everything was absorbed.

The thing that happened right now was an ancient vampire technique that only a select few people 
had knowledge about.

This was considered a demonic or evil technique as in the process, the lives of the ladies would be 
sacrificed or their life force would be sucked clean by the man.

But over the years, it was modified by the people and passed down after hundreds of thousands of 
trials and errors and sacrifices of lives.

But despite that, the technique that was known to a few people in this day and age, it was still 
something that would prevent the ladies from dying, but it wouldn't prevent the ladies from 
becoming crippled and shortening their lives by half.

Though that was the case, this technique was corrected and modified by Lilith, a God itself. It was 
the best technique out there and no harm would occur to any person present.

There would just be a bit of side effects such as having their lips and pussy and shaft swollen and 
sting, but apart from that, nothing else would happen.



The swollen thing could easily be healed by massages and potions or if they were a vampire, their 
bodies would naturally heal within a few moments depending on the prowess of the person.

Lith and the ladies sat down on the place they were standing. Their lips and lower areas were 
stinging and it was definitely a slightly painful process.

With this, the ceremony ended and the marriage was once again close to finishing.

Just a few more ceremonies and the marriage would finally end!

Chapter 382 Getting massaged*

As Lith and his ladies rested, Luna noticed their swollen areas. She smiled lightly and clapped her 
hands.

As she did, inside the ballroom, five maids entered.

Among the five, one was Freya Woods, the blonde-haired elven maid with F cup breasts. She was 
none other than Lucy's personal maid and also a King Rank.

Except Freya, the other maids were all Half Emperor Ranks and except for one, everyone else had 
breasts bigger than DD cup.

The one maid had C cup breasts, but apart from that, she had a pretty plump ass which made her 
figure appear really nice and pleasing to look at.

The maids were here to massage and ease the pain of the people present. They were really excited 
to do something like this since it had been a long time since their services were used.

Lilith let them be free and do whatever they wanted in the castle. She never restricted them or made 
them work like slaves. The servants were so free that they literally craved for work and wanted to 
provide their services in some or the other way.

When the wedding was announced, everyone was really happy. The maids now coming into the 
ballroom were the same and all were walking with big smiles on their faces.



Luna looked at the people sitting down and said with a smile, "Please let them ease your pain."

Nobody complained about it or had hesitation. Not even Emilia. The reason being, Emilia had little 
to no idea how the maids were going to ease her pain, but since they were here to do that, she 
agreed to let them do it as it was stinging her.

It was weird for an Emperor Rank like her to feel pain like this, even she had no idea how such 
things were happening. It had been a very long time since she last felt pain. She was a peace loving 
person and never involved herself in any form of brawl unless absolutely necessary.

Anyway, since people were here to help ease this pain, she was all in it. Though she could easily 
bear with it, why not let it go when she had the opportunity to?

Luna asked the people to move to one side. After they did, the maids took out massage tables from 
their rings and placed them on the stage.

There were six tables present on the stage and there were five maids plus there was the priestess 
Luna.

Freya went towards Lucy and holding her hand, she brought her to one table.

The other maids did the same thing and Lilith was brought to one table by the maid with C cup 
breasts and a big butt.

As for Lith, it was Luna who was going to ease his pain. There were reasons for it.

After having them be present near their respective tables, the maids stripped them and made them 
stand fully nude.

Except for Emilia, nobody had any problems with it. But Emilia's embarrassment was slightly 
lowered after a few seconds when she realized that the gray-haired Half Emperor Rank maid was an 
angel as well and here to ease her pain and not do something embarrassing to her like what 
happened in the previous ceremonies.



Arya's maid was a demon. She was a head shorter than Arya and had black horns and red hair and 
was a Half Emperor Rank.

Alexandra's maid was a blue-haired elven maid. She was a Frost Elf and the frost elves tribe lived in 
the snowy mountainous regions of the Elven Continent. Having blue hair was a common thing there 
and their attitudes were just as cold as the temperature there. The maid wasn't any different and her 
attitude seemed cold, but deep inside, she was a really warm and loving person.

As for Lilith's maid, she was a black-haired human. She was abandoned by her family and by 
chance, Lilith had found her and took her in. She was still a virgin and chances were that she would 
be converted to a vampire if she gets bitten by a noble vampire.

There were only a few humans in the royal servants and even they would be gone once they got 
bitten.

The maids then made Lith and the ladies lie down with their backs facing the maids on the table. 
After everyone was in position, they took out massage oils and spread them on their backs.

Lith felt a cooling sensation over his back and it was a really nice feeling. Luna skillfully used her 
hands to spread it all over his back, butt, hamstrings, calves, and feet.

After spreading it, she started massaging Lith's back. At first she used her thumbs to press and 
massage the regions which were stiff, then changed to using her elbows.

Despite it feeling a little weird, Lith really felt a lot relaxed.

A few minutes later, Luna placed her two index fingers close to Lith's neck, on his traps, and made a 
bolt of electricity pass through it and enter his body.

Lith's body shivered slightly as he felt great pleasure.

'Damn, is this even a massage? This feels too good to be a massage!' Lith thought to himself.

Luna then used her palms and massaged his back. She then went down and massaged his butt and 
then his legs, followed by his feet.



On the ladies' side, Arya was moaning in satisfaction as she felt greatly relaxed.

Arya's maid easily found her stimulative points and she hit those again and again and made Arya 
feel relaxed. This pleasure that Arya felt was a completely different one than having sex with Lith. 
It obviously couldn't match the same pleasure Arya felt while having sex with Lith, but it was still 
something that made her relaxed and she couldn't help but commend the maid.

"Amazing. What's your name?" Arya couldn't help but ask.

"It's Sophie, Miss Arya." The maid replied with a smile and rubbed Arya's back with her palms.

"Sophie, you're doing a good job. Ah… Mother-in-law, can I have Sophie as my personal maid?" 
Arya couldn't help but ask Lilith.

Lilith chuckled and answered, "these are your personal maids only. Feel free to take them with you 
or do whatever you feel you want to."

That was true. Now that they were a part of the same family, they were bound to have one personal 
maid assigned to them. These maids would take care of all their needs that they may have and this 
was just one of the many perks of entering the Royal Family.

"Mother-in-law is the best, hahaha!" Arya couldn't help but laugh. Lilith understood all their needs 
without even then asking, wasn't she really the best? The feeling of getting spoiled felt a bit weird to 
Arya but she didn't hate it.

Sophie massaged Arya's back and went down. She did the same thing as Luna, massaged Arya's 
butt, then legs and then her feet.

All maids did the same thing after they were done, they made the people turn.

Nobody felt any shame as they turned and freely let the maids watch their bodies, except for Emilia 
of course. She placed one of her hands over her breasts and covered them while her other hand 
covered her nether regions.



The people were now going to get massaged at the front and once that was done, it was just a final 
few things left to be done and the marriage would finally end!

Chapter 383 Getting massaged (2)**

Making Lith turn, Luna started massaging him again.

She poured oil all over his body and moved her palms while applying some pressure. She first 
massaged his chest, then his abs, and going down, she skipped his shaft and massaged his thighs 
and then the rest of his legs.

Beside him, as Freya pressed on Lucy's breasts to massage them, milk leaked out of it and flowed 
down her body. Freya let it leak and she continued to massage Lucy. The more she did that, the 
more milk leaked out.

Lucy hadn't taken a pill to stop the milk from coming out. The one she took when she went on a 
vacation with Lith was still having its effect and to stop it, the only way was to take another pill. 
But she didn't as she knew that Lith really liked it if there was milk in the breasts.

Freya moved her hands down and massaged Lucy's flat abdomen and then her legs. She didn't touch 
Lucy's private place and skipped over it for now.

The other maids did the same thing as well.

Emilia had stopped resisting after her maid said a few words and her embarrassment went away. An 
angel knew another angel the best and it wasn't just out of thin air that Lilith chose this maid for 
Emilia.

After Luna was done massaging Lith's body, she went for his shaft. It was now time to finally ease 
the pain from there.

Lith's lips and his shaft was in pain and also swollen. The same was with the other ladies. Their lips 
and lower lips both were swollen.

Luna held Lith's shaft with both her oily hands and stroked it lightly. She did it slowly and made 
sure that Lith felt her warm hands fully.



Luna then fondled his balls and as his shaft got fully erect, she stopped stroking it. It was time to 
move onto another step.

The other maids, they massaged the lower lips of their respective madams.

Sophie placed her hands on Arya's labias and massaged them. She first massaged the outer fleshy 
areas and then made her two fingers enter inside her pussy and slowly massaged it.

Lilith's, Lucy's, Alexandra's, and Emilia's maids did the same thing.

After massaging the outer areas, they stopped and looked at Luna, awaiting her approval to begin 
with the next step.

Luna nodded her head while looking at them and instructed them to proceed.

Luna then slowly took her robes off. She made sure that Lith was watching her. Stripping was also a 
part of entertainment that she heard men liked, and Lith surely did.

Though Lith liked what he was seeing, he preferred it more if it was one of his ladies.

The other maids stripped slowly as well and gave a good show to the ladies.

Emilia watched her maid with a blush, while Arya watched her demon maid with interest, and 
Alexandra watched hers with a neutral expression.

As for Lilith, she watched her maid with a neutral face as well and Lucy was the same.

After stripping down, Luna coated herself with oil. Her entire body got oiled up and it was shining 
slightly as the ballroom's light hit her body.

Luna snapped her fingers and the light inside the ballroom dimmed. She then snapped her fingers 
again and there were torches attached to the walls of the ballroom that lit up.



The atmosphere was perfect to do naughty things and that was Luna's intention.

Luna placed her knee on top of the table and then got on top of it. Her knees were parted and in 
between them were Lith's legs present.

Due to being in such a position, Lith could see Luna's well trimmed hairy pussy and her lower lips 
being parted slightly. He had inserted his shaft a lot of times in it but he could still see that Luna's 
pussy appeared as if she was a virgin.

Her big breasts were definitely a feast for his eyes and as he looked at her more, he suddenly started 
having naughty ideas. He then suddenly remembered that he was yet to punish her and his mind had 
an idea which he could implement later when they were together.

Luna took out two pills from her ring and they appeared like small snowballs. Luna placed one pill 
in her mouth and crushed it so that it spread all inside her mouth. She then inserted the other pill 
inside her pussy and crushed it there as well.

Luna then slowly slumped down and grazed her oiled up breasts on Lith's abdomen and went 
towards his face.

As she reached close to his mouth, she kissed his lips and immediately started a passionate kiss with 
him. While doing that, she lowered her hips on Lith's shaft and made it enter inside her cunt.

Lith felt Luna's soft breasts on his chest, her soft body on him, and most importantly, a cooling 
sensation on his lips and his shaft as it entered inside Luna.

This was a medicine that Luna used. It was there to remove swelling and heal Lith's lips as well as 
his shaft that was swollen due to the previous event.

Lith held onto Luna's big butt and grabbing her cheeks, he made her bounce up and down on his 
shaft. Their oiled up bodies slapped against each other and Lith pounding Luna could be heard by 
everyone.

By now, it felt normal to the ladies to watch Lith do the maid and they didn't feel anything from it. 
Even Alexandra was gone past the point of feeling jealous.



While Lith did Luna, the other maids had a different approach to things.

Lilith's maid popped the pill inside her mouth and crushed it while she didn't insert the other one 
inside herself, but into Lilith.

She then slumped on Lilith's body and moving closer to her face, she kissed Lilith and started a 
passionate kiss with her.

While doing that, she inserted her two fingers inside Lilith's pussy and made sure to spread the 
medicine around everywhere.

The same was done with the other ladies and the maids were doing a good job in easing the pain.

A while later…

*Pah* *Pah* *Pah*

Luna's ass cheeks slapped onto Lith's lower body as he intensely made her ride him. The cooling 
sensation was gone now and he was fully healed and what he was doing was just ensuring that he 
came and was done with it.

Luna soon broke the kiss and started bouncing voluntarily on Lith's dick. Her big tits jiggled and 
her hairy pussy that was being spread by his cock was visible to Lith.

Lith held Luna's big jugs and squeezed them as she rode him. He pinched and pulled her nipples for 
a while and then moved his hands down and pinched her clit.

"Ahhhh~" Luna couldn't help but exclaim. Her clit was her weak spot. Lith could tell and he 
continued to do it and even pulled it lightly.

Luna couldn't take it anymore and she lowered herself back onto Lith's body.

Lith moved his hips and increased the pace of his pounding.



Soon…

"Ahhh~ I am cumming…"

"Me too…"

Luna's lustful juices squirted out as she climaxed onto Lith's oiled up body while Lith held Luna 
tight in his embrace and shot his load deep into her womb.

It wasn't just him and her that climaxed right now.

Beside Lith, Alexandra and Lucy had orgasmed before him, just a few minutes ago.

The maids had changed their positions after the lips of their madams were healed.

They went down and ate their madams' pussies out while fingering them and brought them to an 
orgasm.

A few minutes later, Emilia, then Arya, and finally Lilith orgasmed and this marked the end of their 
healing break.

Luna got down from the table, but surprisingly, Lith's cum didn't leak out from her pussy. Luna had 
held it well inside her and prevented it from leaking. Lith's cum was precious to her and she couldn't 
let it go to waste.

Lith's semen was really potent but Lilith had casted a spell on him and so, no matter how much he 
came inside anyone any number of times, they wouldn't get pregnant.

Of course, he wasn't impotent by any means. He could break the spell anytime he wanted and could 
have babies. It wasn't much of an issue.

Still, if not used for making babies, his semen had a lot of benefits and nourishing properties. It 
was, in the end, the semen of someone of Legendary Rank bloodline. It shouldn't be 
underestimated.



The maids got down from the table and they helped their madams get down as well.

Lith got down from it as well and they all stood silently in their place and waited for Luna to 
instruct them further and do things.

Luna snapped her fingers and the tables disappeared. She then looked at Lith and said,

"Your Highness, we'll begin with the next ceremony."

Lith looked at her and asked while pointing towards himself and at her, "in this state?"

Luna nodded. "Yes, it doesn't matter much. Only a final few things are left to be done and the 
marriage will end. Cleaning up can be done after the marriage ends."

"Alright." Lith nodded.

"Then for the next ceremony…"

Chapter 384 Changes in Lith's body

For the next ceremony, Lith had to hold hands with each of his brides and the two were supposed to 
recite some verses in the ancient vampire language.

After that was done, they were made to pay respects to their ancestors, the moon, their parents, and 
the Vampire Queen.

Of course, since Lith had no ancestors, he simply paid respect to the ancestors of his brides and then 
the moon, and then the parents of the brides and his own.

This was what happened with everyone, except, there was a slight change when Lith held hands 
with Lilith and paid respect.



Lith was made to pay respect to the moon, and the elemental energies. That was about it. Lith didn't 
dwell much on it as these things, in his opinion, were just a form of respect that was meant to be 
shown and weren't really important in any other aspect.

After the paying respect ceremonies were done, Luna was about to go onto the next one when…

"Ugh…" Lith held his stomach and groaned.

He felt a burning sensation dwell up within his body and felt a lot of heat all over.

The ladies became concerned as they noticed this, but Luna simply clapped her hands and made the 
maids bring a few things.

"The energies haven't been absorbed fully, Your Highness. You need to take additional things." Luna 
explained to Lith calmly.

Lith was a Rank 9 and his body couldn't absorb so much energy. The energy from the sacred water, 
combined with the energies from the core of each of his ladies, was too much for his Rank 9 body.

His ladies weren't weak and it was for this reason that he wasn't able to fully absorb the energies.

But no worries as Lilith and Luna had it all planned out. Lilith was expecting something like this to 
happen and she had instructed Luna on what to do in advance.

The maids brought out a cauldron and placed it in the middle of the stage. They then poured a few 
ingredients into it and stirred it well.

Lilith took over their work and started making a potion in the cauldron. She added a few ingredients 
and then, as the final ingredient, she took out a vial of blood from her ring and poured it inside the 
liquid boiling in the cauldron.

This vial of blood was Lilith's blood, more precisely, her virgin blood. She had taken some out and 
preserved it because she knew that it had a lot of uses.



Smoke arose from the cauldron as Lilith added the virgin blood. Then, within a few seconds, Lilith 
made the liquid inside get out and flow inside a small tube.

She cooled the tube and finally, a bluish-purple potion was ready.

She went towards Lith and made him drink it.

Lith immediately felt a cooling sensation spread from his mouth to his throat, then his chest and 
then the rest of his body.

He soon had some strange feeling and closing his eyes and sitting down cross-legged, he checked 
his body to see what was this strange feeling.

His senses went inside his Magic Core and he noticed that the red color of his core had faded fully 
and it had become white.

Then, looking inside, Lith saw some organisms swimming inside water and some shrubs and plants 
to have grown. It was slightly strange as according to his previous world's scientific research, it was 
Kingdom Monera that first came into existence, then it was Protista, followed by Fungi, Plants, and 
then animals.

But whatever, there was already magic present here, it was something that didn't match his previous 
world and so, Lith didn't think too much about the plants.

He was just happy to know that life had come into existence and he would soon have people living 
inside his core.

After a while of exploring his core and then noticing the changes in his body, Lith realized that he 
was about to go through a break through!

'Damn… it was this fast?' Lith couldn't help but exclaim.

He would become the youngest person in history to have broken through to Half Saint Rank if he 
manages to achieve a breakthrough within 40 years of age, but to his surprise, he was going to 
ascend just at the age of 21!



Lith opened his eyes and got up. He looked at his ladies and said with a smile, "It seems I'll be 
breaking through to Half Saint Rank soon."

"What!?"

"Oh my…"

"Haha! Darling is the best among the best!"

"So soon?"

"Fufufu…"

Lucy, Arya, Alexandra, Emilia, and Lilith, all let out different kinds of reactions.

Lucy was genuinely very shocked as even for her, it took around 60 years to become a Half Saint 
Rank.

The average age at which a genius ascended to Half Saint Rank was 100 years. But if one were to 
take the average population into consideration, it would take around 500 to 1000 years for them to 
reach this stage.

If this news, that is, someone ascending to Half Saint Rank at just the age of 21, was given to the 
public, the entire world would go crazy and they would kill to know the secrets.

The outcome would be disastrous and it would be best if the news didn't leak out.

However…

"Oh my, this news should definitely get out. I want my baby to be known to the entire world… 
Fufufu." Lilith had some other plans, it seems.



Everyone looked at Lilith, even Luna, who was Lilith's personal maid, couldn't help but look at her. 
She always felt that everything her Madam did was the correct thing. But as of now, even a person 
without a brain could tell that this news was something that should never get out. She was 
genuinely surprised as well.

Noticing the curious and shocked filled gazes on her, Lilith simply chuckled. "Less talks on this, 
let's get the ceremonies started and finish up with the marriage."

Lith continued to stare at his mother despite her saying that. 'What is mom upto? Does she not know 
the chaos that'll unleash if this news was out? Or does she perhaps want some chaos? Tsk… I still 
don't understand how mom's mind works.'

Lilith didn't speak further on this. She just continued to stand still and waited for Luna to continue 
with the ceremonies.

Lilith wanted the best for her child. Having the memories of the future, she knew what outcome 
there would be. But it would be no fun to just have the same events repeat themselves, and thus, she 
decided to speed things up.

Lith was bound to reach great heights sooner or later anyway. She knew well just how much 
potential he had. According to her memories, Lith would be a Half Saint Rank around the age of 35. 
So it didn't really matter much if he ascended even faster.

Of course, continuous ascensions weren't a good thing in the world. A person had to consolidate his 
cultivation, learn things in that realm they've just reached and then after mastering and knowing 
everything about that realm, breakthrough to the next one.

If one doesn't go according to such things, they are bound to suffer and would have their cultivation 
stagnated.

But, Lith is an exception to everything.

Who was he? He was the son of the strongest being!

Lith's potential was limitless and even if makes one breakthrough after another, he would never 
have such problems.



Common sense couldn't be applied if the talks are about Lilith's children.

Lucy was a girl and the techniques Lilith had used in this marriage couldn't be applied to her. The 
ancient techniques Lilith had come across were all targeted towards a male.

The reason was that, firstly, the two Legendary Ranks before her were both males. Secondly, 
women usually tend to always keep their things a secret and they would hardly ever reveal things.

The thinking process of each person was different and the same was the case for the genders as 
well.

Many records were destroyed or washed away by the wheel of history and so for this, Lilith had to 
take a different approach if she wanted to increase Lucy's cultivation just like she did with Lith.

Lucy became a King Rank and it had not even been 50 years. She had already reached a benchmark 
which many couldn't achieve. There was a lot of time in Lilith's hand to focus on her daughter and 
currently, she was focusing fully on Lith.

With that being said, Lith, who was genuinely shocked upon his reincarnation to find that he had no 
hacks such as a system, a goldenrod, overpowered artifacts or any of such things, was now starting 
to realize that probably, just probably, it was his mother that was his biggest hack.

Little did Lith know that what he was thinking was right. Lilith was indeed his hack, but how did he 
end up having her or what caused him to become her son and other things was a story for another 
day…

Chapter 385 Lucy has become bolder**

Inside the ballroom of the Royal Castle, Lith, his five brides, and the six maids were all standing on 
the stage, naked and all oiled up.

They hadn't cleaned themselves up or changed into new clothes as the marriage was coming to an 
end according to Luna and it wouldn't take a lot of time.



Luna looked at everyone and said, "The coming ceremony is done to ensure that the groom and the 
brides are healthy and to ensure that their children that'll be born will be healthy as well. Let's begin 
with this, without further ado."

Emilia blushed as she heard this and as for the others, they had no reaction to it.

It felt just like a normal ceremony to everyone present.

Lith had no opinions on this. Children were something he hadn't thought about and wasn't planning 
to have anytime soon. He was just 21 years old, the average age at which a mortal had children in 
this world was around a thousand years and as for an immortal, the average was around ten 
thousand years.

To ensure that the groom and the brides had healthy children, the reproductive organs of theirs 
would be blessed and they would need to have a few things as well.

Luna made the square pit containing the sacred water be back on the stage. She dimmed the light 
and the rooftop was open, ensuring that the silver-crimson moon illuminated the room and was 
reflecting in the water in the square pit.

Luna then increased the size of the pit and where the moon was reflected in the water, she made a 
platform be present right above it and hover in mid air.

Luna brought Lith close to the square pit and made him stand beside it. She then squatted down and 
sucked on his shaft to make it erect.

Her doing this felt normal to everyone now and nobody even had anything to say about this, not 
even Lith.

Within a few minutes, Lith's mighty dragon was roaring towards the sky.

After that was ensured, Luna made Lith go sit on the platform with his legs hanging at the sides.

She then brought Alexandra close to the square pit and made her turn around and had her butt face 
towards the sacred water. She then made her bend down and Alexandra did as she was told.



Luna then took out a red colored round fruit of some sort. It had black dots on it and judging by its 
shape, it felt squishy.

Luna dipped the fruit into the sacred water and chanted a few verses. The sacred water got coated 
on the fruit and after that was done, Luna brought the fruit close to Alexandra's pussy.

Luna shoved the fruit in her vagina and since it was a squishy fruit and also as Alexandra was all 
oiled up, it smoothly went deep inside her and was present just at the entrance of her womb.

It felt weird to Emilia as she looked at it and Lith was the same. As for the other ladies, they had no 
opinion about this.

'And here I thought that this ceremony would be at least somewhat normal…' Lith thought to 
himself as he looked at Alexandra. 'Just which pervert made these ceremonies? I really am curious 
to know now.'

Luna then made Alexandra go on the platform and as she reached there, she instructed Luna to sit 
down on Lith's lap and wrap her legs around his waist.

After Alexandra did that, Luna instructed Alexandra to slowly take in Lith's shaft inside her.

Lith supported Alexandra's waist and made his dick slowly enter inside her pussy.

Alexandra looked at Lith with love filled eyes and said softly, "darling…"

Lith smiled and said, "we'll be husband and wife soon now."

Alexandra nodded.

Lith then went back to having Alexandra get down on him slowly.

Halfway through as his shaft entered inside her, Lith felt that his tip was touching something 
squishy. He looked at Luna and saw her nod her head, indicating that he should continue what he's 
doing.



Soon…

Squish!

"Ah…" Alexandra moaned as the fruit got crushed and entered her womb.

This was a really strange feeling and she couldn't describe in words how weird it felt. But she didn't 
voice this out as she knew that this ceremony would make her reproductive organs healthy and she 
can have lots of babies with Lith later.

Lith's shaft penetrated Alexandra's womb along with the fruit and soon, he felt a cooling sensation 
once again.

This sensation was traveling through his shaft, inside his body and was spreading all around his 
lower body and finally stopped when it reached his balls.

The cooling sensation was last felt by Lith in his balls and then it faded away.

As for Alexandra, she felt the same all over her lower body and it faded away at the same time 
when Lith's sensation faded.

Lith then looked back at Luna and awaited her next instruction.

Luna looked back and simply smiled. "If the cool sensation has faded, it's time for Your Highness to 
give your first healthy seeds to Miss Alexandra's healthy eggs. Don't worry, Your Highness, since 
this is the first time after the absorption of the fruit, Miss Alexandra wouldn't get pregnant."

"She would be only pregnant from the second time onwards, given that Your Highness doesn't use 
any birth control means."

Lith wouldn't lie, hearing all of these things by Luna as if it was something normal was a really 
weird feeling.



In his previous life, nobody openly talked about sex or things such as these and now looking at such 
a 180° flip, it was definitely weird.

But Lith didn't dwell on it much and nodded his head, indicating that he understood.

He started ramming his shaft inside Alexandra and soon, the sound of their flesh clapping was heard 
by everyone.

Luna sat down beside the square pit and started chanting the verses again while looking at the black 
book in her hand.

As she chanted, the water from the sacred pit rose up and it wrapped around Lith's legs that were 
hanging by the sides of the platform.

Lith noticed this but ignored it and continued to pound Alexandra. This felt normal to him now.

Soon, the illuminance of the silver-crimson moon concentrated on Lith and Alexandra and the water 
rose higher and Lith and Alexandra's whole body was covered in it.

Soon, the sacred water entered slowly inside Lith and Alexandra's bodies. It entered through Lith's 
shaft that was currently spreading Alexandra's pussy.

The sacred water went inside and it was as if it had disappeared into Lith and Alexandra's bodies.

The entire water that was covering their bodies was gone within a few minutes and at this time, both 
Lith and Alexandra felt really sensitive down there.

"Nghnn… honey, I am going to cum." Lith groaned and said.

"Ahh~... Me too… Darling… Ahh… Kiss…"

Alexandra asked for a kiss and Lith happily obliged and did that. Their lips locked together and 
soon their tongues got entangled together as well.



Lith hugged Alexandra and pounded her hard.

A few minutes later…

"Mhff… Mhhhnnn…" Alexandra's body shivered and she climaxed along with Lith.

Lith's semen shot deep inside her and rather than feeling warm as usual, it felt cool to Alexandra.

Luna could tell that both were done. She let them rest for a few minutes and then said,

"Alright, Your Highness, and Miss Alexandra, please come down."

Both followed Luna's instructions and got down.

Luna then asked Lucy to come towards the square pit and Alexandra went back to her original 
position with a happy face after she was done.

Luna then asked Lucy to wait for a bit and she squatted down once again close to Lith's shaft.

It was her duty to have it be erect and ready to penetrate the brides.

Normally, Lith's shaft would take a while to get erect as he climaxed lots and lots of time since the 
past few days.

This problem could be solved by taking pills and Lith would always be erect, but the problem was, 
it would hurt him slightly and there were some side effects of it as well.

Thus, the best and most efficient way was Luna. Her skills were really good and it would hardly 
take her more than a few minutes to get it erect.

Luna sucked on Lith's shaft once again and this time she played with his balls and stimulated him.



Without any surprise, Lith's sleeping dragon was woken up from his slumber again and it roared 
towards the sky.

Luna made Lith go back to the platform and she made Lucy be in the same position as Alexandra 
near the square pit.

She put the fruit enchanted with the sacred water inside Lucy and then made her go towards Lith 
and be in the same lap position.

Lucy happily did that and as she was in Lith's lap, there was a small smile on her face.

Noticing this, Lith smiled and said, "Big sis, are you perhaps fantasizing about our future babies and 
are happy or is it some other reason?"

Lucy came back to her senses and slightly blushed. She hit Lith's chest and said, "Shut up… there's 
nothing like that."

Lith chuckled. He held her hips and made his shaft slowly enter inside her warm fleshy walls.

"Then why are you smiling like that?" Lith asked while holding her.

Lucy knitted her brows slightly as she heard this. It seems her little brother was in the mood to tease 
her.

Not wanting to falter back, she held Lith's chin and made him look her in the eyes. "Are you in the 
mood to tease me?"

Lith chuckled. "Absolutely."

Lucy smiled back and said, "Oh? A mere subject of the queen dares to act with such impudence?"

Having went through so many embarrassing situations and acting as a Substitute Queen for so long, 
not to mention being around Arya constantly while Lith and her mother were away, Lucy had 
become a lot bolder than before.



Though she wasn't anywhere close to the shameless levels of Arya, Lith, or Lilith, she was still 
much bolder than the innocent and shy Emilia.

Lith raised an eyebrow in surprise as he heard that. 'It's just been a few years since I was away from 
her and my big sis seems like she's starting to become shameless like me. Amazing.'

Lith chuckled at his own thoughts and looking at Lucy, he got close to her ears and said, "Your 
Majesty, let's leave the talks about impudence aside. How does it feel to know that your pussy is 
being spread by a lowly subject of yours."

Lith couldn't sit back and joined in on the role play.

Before Lucy could think of anything or process Lith's words, Lith penetrated her fully and didn't 
give her a chance to talk.

"Ahh…" Lucy moaned as his shaft entered inside her and squished the fruit.

The cooling sensation that she felt along with the weird squishy thing being present inside her made 
her thoughts focus on this and not at what Lith had just said.

After a while when these feelings were gone, Lucy was back to realizing what Lith had just said.

She looked at him with knitted brows. "The way you talk, it seems you want a punishment."

Lith smiled. "I surely do."

Lucy smiled back and controlling herself from breaking character, she pushed Lith down and said, 
"then watch as the Queen punishes you…"

Chapter 386 Yuqova Fruit*

The platform was long and Lith didn't fall down in the water below as Lucy pushed him.

Lucy then placed her hands above Lith's chest and started riding him.



Lith was amazed to see this new side of his sister and he held her hips and supported her.

Lucy then bent down bringing her lips close to Lith's, she said, "you want a kiss?"

"Of course." Lith wouldn't deny it.

Lucy pulled back and continuing to ride him, she said, "Too bad. You're not getting it."

Lith chuckled. Lucy was still a rookie in all of this and he knew what she would do next to him.

As Lith had expected, Lucy brought Lith to an edge but didn't let him cum inside her. She was 
trying this trick of edging to show her dominance and it was seen through by the talented and 
shameless Lith easily.

Lith played along with Lucy for a while and in the end, Lucy was defeated and she ended up 
breaking her character and burying her face on Lith's shoulder.

She still had a long way to go and the dao of shamelessness was something that couldn't be 
achieved so easily. She had only just begun walking on this path while Lilith was at the peak and 
Arya was halfway through the peak.

As for Lith, he was ahead of Arya and within a few more years, he would definitely surpass his 
mother or at least reach close to her.

A while later, Lucy and Lith both orgasmed together and after being done, they both were called 
down.

The same thing repeated with Emilia, Arya, and Lilith.

All three had different reactions to this ceremony but they ended up finishing it without a hitch.

After this ceremony was done, Lith once again felt a burning sensation inside his body as he stood 
on the stage along with his ladies.



He held his stomach where it was burning and groaned lightly.

The ladies became concerned once again, except for Lilith who knew the reason for it.

Luna looked at Lith and explained that he would keep feeling this sensation for the coming few 
days as well as the energies weren't absorbed yet.

She then explained to him about the technique in great detail that Lilith had told her about and after 
realizing that, Lith couldn't help but feel surprised.

'So in the end… this technique was some dual cultivation technique? What the fuck? Do they even 
realize that this is a dual cultivation technique?' Lith couldn't help but think.

But Lith was slightly wrong in this. In dual cultivation, both the partners would benefit together but 
in this technique, it was only Lith who was benefiting.

As for the other ladies, there was little to no effect on them.

Lith then asked Luna to quickly finish up with the ceremonies. He knew that he would have to have 
sex a lot of times with his ladies to be at ease and thus, the sooner the marriage was over, the better.

Luna nodded her head. "But before beginning with the ceremonies, we'll have to take care of that, 
Your Highness."

Luna was talking about Lith's erect shaft.

Lith could only sigh and let things flow.

Luna clapped her hands twice and the maids standing at the sides walked towards Lith.

Lith was surprised to see them. Will he have to ask sex with them all to ease this?



But Lith's worries were for naught as Luna said, "Your Highness, you'll need to drink the juice of 
the Yuqova fruit. This fruit would help ensure that the chaotic energy inside you spreads all over 
your body and is slowly absorbed."

Oh. So he just had to have juice? It wasn't that difficult then. Lith thought to himself. He then 
signalled Luna to go ahead.

Luna nodded her head and walked towards the five maids standing near Lith.

Luna took out five fruits from her ring and the fruit looked like a star but was blue in color and 
appeared soft.

Luna then proceeded to insert the fruit inside the pussies of the ladies and as she did, Lith had some 
idea as to what she was going to do next.

"Hey, Luna, I just need to have juice right? Why are you placing it there?" Lith couldn't help but 
ask.

The entire ceremonies and the wedding, it was so perverted and what's with these new perverted 
things Luna was doing? Lith couldn't understand. Can't things be normal and more… uhh… family 
friendly?

Luna got up after inserting the last fruit inside Sophia, the personal maid of Arya. She looked at Lith 
and explained,

"The fruit juice starts to rot if it comes into contact with any elemental energy and if you keep it in 
some elemental-energy-less-container and drink it, you'll definitely feel an extremely bitter taste. 
Also, Your Highness, the same container cannot hold the juice again until a few years have passed. 
The juice will rot again."

"That's why, the best way to consume this juice is by having it inside virgin ladies. The fruit has a 
sweet taste and if you, by any chance, put it inside the ladies who aren't virgins, you'll once again 
feel an extremely bitter taste."

After Luna was done explaining, Lith couldn't help but knit his brows. 'What the hell is up with this 
fruit juice? Why is it perverted as well? And not to mention the level of its degeneracy. Who in the 
world was able to discover all of this and come up with such methods?'



Lith looked at Luna and not believing her, he said, "alright, let's test it out."

"Sure." Luna nodded.

She took another Yuqova fruit out of her ring and placed it inside a normal bowl. She crushed it and 
made juice out of it.

Sizzle!

As soon as the fruit became juice and came into contact with the elemental energies, it started 
sizzling. Then, a pungent smell permeated the room and the juice started rotting.

Lith frowned and held his nose. So it was true? He thought to himself.

Luna closed her palms that had the bowl on it and crushed it completely. She then snapped her 
fingers and the room was back to normal.

Luna then took out another Yuqova fruit and inserted it inside herself.

She massaged her pubes and the fruit inside turned into juice. Luna then clenched her pussy and 
held it inside.

"Your Highness, you can have a sip of it and you'll know how bitter it is." Luna said calmly.

"I'll see." Lith was still yet to test the authenticity of the lady being virgin. He got close to Luna and 
squatting down, he brought his mouth close to Luna's pussy.

Luna then slightly pushed Lith's head onto herself and his mouth touched her pussy.

Luna unclenched slightly and a bit of juice came out. As soon as it hit Lith's tongue…

Ptui!



Lith couldn't help but spit it.

'Damn! It's extremely bitter!' Lith thought to himself. 'So this means Luna was right… Damn it! 
How perverted can things be here?'

Lith got up and wiping his face, he said to Luna, "My apologies for doubting you."

Luna smiled and said, "Your Highness is too polite. There's no need for such words."

Lith nodded and then Luna made Lith drink the juice from the virgin maids.

Lith latched onto Freya's pussy. She was the first one and just as Freya unclenched and the juice 
entered inside Lith's mouth, Lith felt a sweet taste assault him.

'Oooh…' Lith couldn't help but exclaim.

He gulped down all the juices and also made sure to lick Freya's inside clean.

Freya slightly blushed as this happened. This was the first time the Prince had ever touched her like 
this.

Lith let go of her and drank the juice from the other ladies.

After he was done, he indeed felt his hotness to have reduced by a good margin.

Luna then looked at Lith and said with a smile, "It was a good sweet drink, right, Your Highness?"

Lith nodded.

"Then, shouldn't the brides have a taste of it as well?" Luna asked with a smile.

"Oh yeah, definitely." Lith nodded in agreement.



Emilia, who was watching everything, interrupted by saying, "Uhm… I am good…"

Lith looked at her and said with a smile, "Wifey, you don't know how amazing the taste was. You 
should give it a try."

Emilia was slightly hesitant. She didn't want to drink something from another woman's pussy like 
this…

Arya, who was beside Emilia, put her hands over her shoulder and pinched her cheeks, she said, 
"Emmy, give it a try. What's the harm anyway?"

Emilia didn't want advice from stinky Arya, but then she saw the other ladies looking at her and 
sighed. "I'll try…"

Pah!

"Haha! That's the spirit!" Arya spanked Emilia's ass and said cheerfully.

"Damn you stink lizard!" Emilia burst out.

Arya distanced herself quickly and Emilia, who was about to chase her, stopped when she heard 
Luna say the next few things.

"Your Highness, when it comes to ladies, the way to drink this juice is different. The juice must 
have a man's saliva mixed in it and it should come from a non virgin lady's inside only. This means, 
Your Highness, you would need to bear with the bitter taste and feed the juice to the ladies 
yourself."

"What in the…"

Chapter 387 Finally Married!

Lith stared at Luna and Luna simply smiled and shrugged. She didn’t make the rules, did she?



Lith sighed. “Tsk. I’ll bear with it.”

“You don’t have to do it if you don’t want to, you know?” Arya said with a smile.

Lith waved his hand and walked towards Luna. “It’s fine. The taste is really nice. Have it and you’ll 
know.”

Lith reached close to Luna and squatted down in front of her hairy pussy. “Let’s do this. Someone 
come close, I’ll feed you.”

Arya pushed Emilia forwards as Lith said that.

Emilia was hesitant at first but realizing that she would kiss Lith instead, she was fine. She walked 
towards Luna as well and squatted down near her pussy.

Lith took a deep breath. “Alright.”

Lith latched onto Luna’s lower lips and Luna unclenched her pussy, making the fruit juice come out 
and fall into Lith’s mouth.

“Brffghh…” The better taste made Lith barf but he held it in.

He then immediately turn towards Emilia and kissed her, making the juice flow from his mouth into 
hers.

Emilia’s eyes opened wide as she tasted the sweet juice. ‘Its really good…’

As someone who loved food and drinks, this was a really nice experience for Emilia.

While drinking the juice, Emilia thought that she shouldn’t have resisted it previously. It was so 
amazing!



As for Lith, he had calmed down. As soon as the juice entered inside Emilia’s mouth and her saliva 
came into contact with Lith’s mouth and the juice, the bitterness was reduced by a very good 
degree.

It was bearable now.

Emilia then went away after the juice was finished and Lith stood up and looked at Luna. “The juice 
is finished. Are you going to insert the fruit in someone else now?”

Luna shook her head. “I’ll put the fruit in me and make a juice out of it. Your Highness just needs to 
repeat the process again.”

“But wouldn’t it rot if you put the juice in the same container again? Didn’t you say this yourself?” 
Lith asked.

Luna shook her head. “There wouldn’t be any problems as-”

“Forget it. I don’t wanna know. Just do the thing, I’ll feed them.” Lith honestly couldn’t care less 
about this perverted fruit juice.

There were so many rules and dos and don’ts that it was tiring to know. Also, he didn’t want to have 
such useless information inside his head. If in future he ever wanted to consume this juice again, 
he’ll simply ask Luna and have her do it.

Luna nodded her head and put the fruit inside her vagina again. She massaged her pubes and then 
the fruit turned into juice.

One by one, Lith fed all his ladies the juice and they were all honestly very surprised when they felt 
its taste. Even Lilith was the same. Though she know about the fruit, she hadn’t ever tasted it until 
now.

After this was done, Luna popped a pill inside Lith’s mouth and made him chew on it and.

Lith did it and his mouth became clean and all the bitter taste was gone.



“All ceremonies have been completed and only one step is remaining. Once this is over, the 
marriage would officially end.” Luna said with a simple.

“Finally…” Lith couldn’t help but sigh in relief. His little brother was tired after working so much 
and he was the same as well. He needed some rest.

The ladies giggled lightly as they noticed the exhausted expression on Lith’s face.

Luna made the square pit smaller near her and the moon once again shone in it. This time, fhe moon 
was just silver and the crimson hue from it was gone.

Luna made Lith stand on side of the pit and made Alexandra stand on the other side.

These two were still oiled up and naked but they really didn’t care.

Luna dimmed the lights in the room and brilliance of the moon was just on Lith, Alexandra, and in 
the square pit containing sacred water.

Luna stood at one side of the pit, between Lith and Alexandra and took out a black book from her 
ring.

She made Lith hold Luna’s hands and started reciting verses from the book.

A few minutes later, Luna said, “…and that brings us to the final stage.”

Luna then looked at Lith and said, “Please say your vows.”

Lith looked Alexandra in the eyes and said, “With the moon as the witness, I, Lith Evure, take you, 
Alexandra Constantine, as my wife, and I solemnly vow to be a good husband and always look after 
you.”

Lith kept his vows simple and didn’t make it sound too extraordinary. Vows were just words, the 
actions were what mattered in the end. He knew himself well and he would always look after his 
wife and never let any harm befall her. He had the power and determination to do so and they 
weren’t just false promises or wishes.



Alexandra felt tearful as she heard her darling say that. But she held it in and looked at Lith with the 
same determination as him and said,

“With the moon as the witness, I, Alexandra Constantine, take you, Lith Evure, as my husband, and 
I solemnly vow as well to be a good wife and always look after you.”

“With this, the vows are completed. If anyone has any problems with this marriage, please say it 
now or forever hold your silence.” Luna said after turning around and looking at the ladies.

Nobody said anything and just stood still.

Luna waited for a few seconds as per traditions and then nodded her head. She turned around again 
and looking at Lith and Alexandra, said,

“With this, I declare you both, Lith Evure and Alexandra Constantine, as husband and wife.”

“You may now kiss.”

POP!

CRACKLE!

Clap! Clap! Clap! Clap!

Fireworks exploded in the sky above their heads. The maids popped some poppers and the other 
ladies clapped joyfully as Lith and Alexandra finally became husband and wife.

Lith pulled Alexandra close to him and she jumped over the sacred water between them and landed 
in his embrace.

He kissed Alexandra and Alexandra held his face and tightly sealed her lips with his, as if afraid that 
he’ll go somewhere.



They had a passionate kiss for a while and after that was done, the other ladies came towards the 
square pit one by one and the same process repeated.

All were done with their vows and Lith was finally a husband to Lilith, Lucy, Alexandra, Arya, and 
Emilia.

The fireworks kept bursting in the sky to mark this joyous occasion and the ballroom was also lit up 
brightly and poppers popped everywhere.

After a while, when everything subdued, Lith took a deep breath and said,

“I can rest now!”

The marriage had finally ended!

Luna, who was standing beside Lith, said calmly, “Your Highness, do you want to take a bath?”

Lith looked at her and nodded. “Yes, my whole body is oily. Can’t sleep like this.”

Luna nodded. She clapped her hands and the ballroom changed into an onsen.

The atmosphere of the ballroom became that of a hot spring bathhouse.

“What in the…” Lith couldn’t help but say in surprise. But then he shook his head and shoved aside 
his surprise. This was a magical world, this should be normal, he thought.

Lilith, standing beside Lith, held his hand and said to him with a smile, “this will be our first bath 
after getting married. You surely wouldn’t just want to bath, would you?”

Lith looked at her and chuckled. “Of course.”

Lith walked in the front and turning around to look at his ladies, he opened his arms and said, 
“wifeys, come here and give your husband a hug.”



The ladies smiled and happily went ahead and hugged Lith.

Lilith hugged Lith from one side, Lucy from the other, Arya from behind, and in front of Lith were 
Emilia and Alexandra.

Lith gave everyone a kiss on their foreheads and squeezing onto Emilia and Alexandra’s butt in 
front of him, Lith said, “let’s go and bath now.”

Emilia blushed as Lith did that but didn’t voice out any complaints. He was her husband now and it 
was all okay.

The six then went to take a bath and the maids were ready to help them with it.

Chapter 388 Ballroom turned into a hot spring bathhouse**

The ballroom had been changed to a hot spring bathhouse.

There was an area at one side where there were stools present and one could wash themselves up 
there before heading inside the hot water present on the other side.

Around the hot water were small Bamboo trees and the overall atmosphere of the entire ballroom-
turned-bathhouse was very cozy and relaxing.

Lith and his ladies were sitting on their stools and the maids were helping them clean themselves.

Lith was at one end and there was Luna helping him out with everything.

The maids all did the same actions and they were all following whatever Luna was doing.

Luna had applied soap all over Lith's body and her own as well. She was currently rubbing her 
breasts on Lith's back while massaging his shoulders.

Luna then moved her hands to Lith's chest and rubbed it and cleaned all the oil from there. She then 
moved her hands down and rubbed his abdomen, all the while ensuring she doesn't forget to rub her 
breasts on his back.



Lilith's maid, the Half Emperor Rank human, was feeling slightly embarrassed as she rubbed her 
breasts on Lilith's back. Her breasts weren't as big as the other maids and she definitely wouldn't be 
able to provide the softness on Lilith's back like the other maids.

While rubbing Lilith's back, she could only sigh and do her job and hope for the best.

She moved her hands from Lilith's shoulders towards her breasts and rubbed them. She didn't apply 
too much pressure as she didn't want to be mistaken that she was trying to take advantage of the 
situation and grope Lilith's breasts.

Lilith, feeling the awkwardness and restricted movements of the maid, chuckled and said while 
putting her hands over hers,

"Why are you so tense? I won't bite you or punish you. Relax and just follow Luna. It's okay if you 
apply pressure, I don't mind."

The maid didn't know how to feel when she was told this. She felt warm in her heart but then there 
was this doubt that will the Queen really not mind?

The maid could only sigh and follow the orders. She tried to relax herself and do her job properly.

The maid applied pressure on Lilith's breasts and cleaned the upper area. She then moved her hands 
towards her nipples and rubbed them over it. She was slightly afraid of pulling the nipples and 
cleaning them when she felt Lilith's hands on her hands.

Lilith made the maid pull one of her nipples and clean the areas around it. She wanted to let her 
know that it was okay to do your job.

Lilith also ensured that her milk didn't leak out. As she knew that if it did, the maid would panic 
once again.

This maid hadn't had much interactions with her and Lilith knew that she had to do things slowly 
and teach her things.



All maids and butlers in the castle were raised by her. She had treated them well and she continued 
to do so. They were her assets and people who she had invested her time and effort in.

All of this was done so that Lilith could simply relax and not do anything on her own. These maids 
and butlers were powerful enough to change the politics of the world if they so wanted or cause 
chaos. Lilith didn't need to do anything really.

This human maid was raised by her as well and Lilith was continuing to train her to be a good maid 
and provide her services well.

On the other side of her, Freya was cleaning up Lucy in the same way Luna did to Lith. Lucy felt 
relaxed as Freya massaged her and having a personal maid who understood your needs was a 
genuinely good thing.

On her side, Alexandra's Frost Elf maid was rubbing her breasts on her back while massaging 
Alexandra's boobs with her hands. She had a cold expression on her face as she did that. It was how 
she naturally looked and was not because she hated doing what she was doing.

Alexandra had her eyes closed and had a neutral look on her face as well. This sadist vampire had 
an ice cold maid who knew all her needs and understood her well. Lilith had personally made this 
choice and the effects were visible as Alexandra was relaxing while getting the massage from the 
maid.

On her side, there was Arya.

Arya's demon maid was rubbing her big breasts on her back while fondling Arya's own perfect and 
perky pair. The maid had a black tail that had a heart shape at the end and black horns and red hair.

While fondling Arya's breasts, she cheerfully said, "Lady Arya, your breasts are indeed perfect. Not 
just that but the same could be said about your figure."

That was true. Arya was perfect in all aspects no matter where one looked at.

Arya got a cheerful maid just like herself. Her maid was also as shameless as herself and free. Her 
vibes matched with Arya's and Arya also genuinely enjoyed the services she provided.



Arya couldn't thank her mother-in-law enough for providing her with someone like this maid.

"Talk less, work more." Arya closed her eyes and said while she relaxed.

"Yes, Lady!" The maid exclaimed and got back to washing Arya.

Beside Arya was Emilia and Emilia's maid was a calm and composed angel.

Emilia's maid was rubbing her big breasts on her back while massaging her breasts. Emilia did feel 
shy about it but her maid had assured her that this wasn't anything lewd or naughty and was just her 
providing normal services to her.

Just like the other ladies, Emilia's maid was also a perfect match for her. She was also chosen by 
Lilith to have her serve Emilia.

On Lith's side, Luna was done washing Lith's back and his chest and abdomen. She poured water on 
him and herself and then made him get up.

Luna then moved to the front and squatted down. She rubbed Lith's thighs with soap and then his 
butt and then legs and feet. She made sure to remove all the oil and when it was done, she poured 
water and made it clean.

Luna then applied some soap in between her breasts and started rubbing Lith's shaft in between 
them and gave him a boobjob. She wasn't here to make him cum, she was just here to clean him and 
she was doing just that, but in a slightly naughty way.

As for the ladies and their maids, they were doing what Luna had told them to do beforehand.

Lilith's maid was in front of her, squatting down and rubbing Lilith's thighs with soap and then her 
legs and feet. She was slightly afraid to touch the private areas of Lilith but then realizing that she 
had already done it previously during the massage, she rubbed soap on Lilith's plump butt and then 
moving her hands forward, she rubbed her soft labias.

To the maid's surprise, Lilith was standing calmly and in a relaxed manner. This made her assured 
that Lilith indeed didn't mind it.



The maid then poured water and cleaned Lilith's lower body. She then applied a cleaning spell on 
her two finger tips and inserted them inside Lilith's vagina and slowly cleaned it.

The other maids were doing something similar and after a while, Lith was the first to get all cleaned 
up.

He went inside the hot water and lay his back on the edge and relaxed.

Soon, it was Lilith that was finished with the cleaning and she entered the water as well and moved 
towards Lith. She hugged Lith from the side and put her head on his shoulder and closed her eyes to 
relax.

Lith looked at her and caressed her back. He then chuckled and asked, "is my wife tired?"

"Yes." Lilith said softly. She wasn't tired really, she was just trying to relax on Lith's shoulder 
because it felt cozy to her.

"Oh, then want me to help you relax?" Lith asked with a smile.

Lilith got up and looking at Lith, she chuckled. "You still have the energy to do naughty things?"

Lith smiled and pointing down, he said, "the energies in my body haven't been absorbed fully. Look 
at that, it still feels hot down there."

Lith's shaft was as erect as it could be. The energies had indeed not been absorbed yet and the only 
cure for it was to have sex with his wives multiple times for the coming few days.

Lilith chhckled noticing that. It was due to her that Lith was in this condition. But it wasn't a bad 
thing, once the energies are absorbed fully, Lith's ascension would start and it was all worth it. As 
for the cure of it, Lilith definitely knew that it was something Lith liked.

"Do you want this weak little wife yours to help you with that, husband-sama?" Lilith asked 
playfully.



"Yes, please." Lith smiled and said. He would never say no to the advances from his wives.

Lilith chuckled and moving in front of Lith, she placed her hands on his shoulder and made his 
erect shaft enter inside her.

Lith held Lilith's hips and slowly made her sit down on it. Soon, he was back inside the wonderland 
of fluff and warmth and got his hot and hard shaft massaged by Lilith's soft walls.

A few seconds later, Arya was the one to enter the water and looking at her mother-in-law and 
husband, she chuckled and said, "you can't stay still even for a while, can you, my dear husband?"

Lith chuckled. "Can't help it. My wives are too cute." He extended his hand and said while pulling 
Arya in his embrace.

"Oh? I am cute now and not hot and sexy?" Arya asked while flaunting her perfect body slightly.

Lith pinched her nose and giving her a peck on her lips, he said, "so playful."

Arya chuckled, Lith followed, and Lilith was the same.

Soon, the other ladies joined one by one and the ballroom was back to being filled with the moans 
of Lith's wives.

Chapter 389 Yin Yang Virya Sutra

"Mhm~..."

Arya moaned in satisfaction as Lith sensually thrust his shaft deep inside her.

Arya was hugging Lith from the front and had her head resting on his shoulder. Lith hugged her 
back and was slowly doing her.

Lith was done with Lilith and it was Arya's turn now. He had climaxed once already but it was 
nowhere enough to calm his raging boner.



He was doing it slowly and sensually so as to let his wives be at ease and feel relaxed while they 
enjoyed both — the hot spring as well as the pleasure arising from having the taste of each other's 
bodies.

Lith's hands were on Arya's smooth perky butt and though he only had the view of her back and her 
hips grinding on him, he very clearly could see his other wives relaxing beside him.

Lucy and Alexandra were at his sides and at their sides were Lilith and Emilia respectively.

In this soothing and calm atmosphere, Arya's soft moans were like a relaxing lo-fi music that Lith 
was hearing.

A while passed and Arya and Lith climaxed together. It wasn't a shaking orgasm for the two, just a 
normal one.

After Arya was gone, it was Alexandra who joined Lith, followed by Lucy, and then Emilia.

After Lith was done, he relaxed for a while in the hot water and then going out of it with his wives, 
they got dressed in their sleepwears by the maids present.

Lith wore a loose black t-shirt and gray sweatpants. Now that he was 21 years old and 195 cm tall, 
these sets of clothes made him appear really handsome and hot, despite them just being his 
sleepwears.

His silver hair was tied into a rough bun and his bangs were fluttering as he moved through the 
hallways with his ladies.

As for the ladies, they all wore comfortable and loose tops and pyjamas.

As they walked through the hallways, Emilia and Arya were at the front and discussing things. Now 
that they both had the same husband, they had gotten much closer than before and Emilia was 
currently discussing a few things about the academy with Arya and taking her opinions on it.



Behind the two were Lucy and Alexandra and they both were discussing their plans for the coming 
future and what they'll be doing. Lucy was an adult and senior to Alexandra.

Alexandra was just 28 years old and she was like a child in front of Lucy. Lucy considered her as 
her little sister and was advising her on a few things.

Behind the two were Lilith and Lith. They both were discussing about the marriage and while on 
this topic, Lith suddenly remembered something and asked,

"Mom, you said that what we did at that ceremony was a cultivation technique, right?"

Lilith nodded her head. "That's right."

"Oh, nice. Can I have its manual? I want to see a few things in it." Lith said.

"Sure." Lilith nodded and grabbed the air in front of her.

In her hands, a scroll appeared as she tried to grab the air and Lilith then presented it to Lith.

Lith was used to such magic and he felt that grabbing things out of thin air was normal stuff.

Lith took the manual and started reading it. Just one look at it and Lith was genuinely shocked as he 
read the manual's name.

Yin Yang Vīrya Sutra.

'What the fuck!? This is… This is…'

Lith couldn't believe what he was looking at and continued to read further into the manual.

Lilith at the side wondered why Lith was showing a shocked expression, but looking at him reading 
the manual with so much focus, she didn't disturb him by asking her doubts.



As Lith reached his own chambers, which was a new one made for him and his wives beside the 
Queen's chambers, he was almost done reading the manual.

Lith folded the manual and closing it, he sighed and thought to himself, 'It really is a dual 
cultivation technique. Who knew that the novels that I was reading, the stuff that I thought was just 
some work of fiction, was actually real in this world.'

'But… Isn't this a magical world of swords and spells and not cultivation and mediation? Hmm 
no… It probably isn't. I might've misunderstood things. There surely is magic, no doubt, but to 
ascend, one has to go through arduous meditation and isn't that basically just cultivation?'

'Ugh, it's hurting my head to think so much. Anyway, that doesn't matter. What matters is that 
technique. Did I just end up dual cultivating with my wives?'

Lith thought to himself for a while while walking.

"We're here." Lilith broke Lith's thought process and said to him as they reached his chambers.

Lilith was really curious to know what her baby was thinking so deeply about. She had the power to 
read his mind but she would never do such a thing and would just normally ask him.

Lilith broke his thoughts in hopes of getting some response from him. He had been quiet since he 
read the manual and was deep in his own thoughts. She wanted to know what he was thinking.

Lith, having his thoughts broken, looked at his mother. He then suddenly realized something and 
asked her, "Mom, that technique, it just benefits me right?"

Lilith nodded her head. "That's right. It's made solely for males and not for females."

"Hmm, I see…" Lith nodded. "Alright then, I've made up my mind."

Lilith was confused. "What made up?"



Lith smiled as he heard that. "Isn't it unfair if I am the only one to benefit from this technique, 
mom? I've made up my mind to modify it in a way that it'll benefit me and my wives both whenever 
I cultivate this."

Lilith was surprised to hear that. "You'll modify it?" She couldn't help but ask.

This was an ancient technique which hardly anyone was able to modify and make changes to it 
without having major side effects. What Lith just said meant that he could do something that even 
countless geniuses weren't able to do over the course of billions of years.

To Lilith, this was genuinely of a great surprise.

Not many things could surprise a Legendary Rank like this but this was one of them. Her son said it 
so casually as if it was a small matter to easily make changes to this ancient technique and modify it 
to suit the best needs of his wives and him.

Lith looked at his mother and nodded lightly. "That's right. I'll modify it. But I'll need to research 
for a while, look for resources and it'll take a bit of time. Though as far as I know, it shouldn't take 
too long."

"Oh my…" Lilith couldn't help but facepalm and say in a surprised tone.

If what Lith said becomes a success, not only it would mean that he would have surpassed the 
knowledge of countless geniuses in history, but it would also mean that he had limitless potential 
and his intelligence far surpassed hers as well.

Lilith would be the happiest and the proudest person in this world if this was true as this would 
mean that Lith had the potential to even surpass her own self!

Herself — a literal Goddess!

Lilith's body shook with anticipation and enthusiasm and she couldn't help but shiver slightly while 
facepalming and thinking of Lith's limitless potential and his boundless future.

Lith was oblivious to all of his mother's thoughts and had he known that she would end up having 
such hopes for him and overthink things this much, he would've kept his mouth shut.



But that was a true thing though. Modifying this manual wasn't really difficult for Lith. He knew 
some things about dual cultivation and that could act as the groundwork to do more research and lay 
the foundation of the dual cultivation path of his.

Lith's main goal wasn't to be a dual cultivator, but he wanted to provide the best things he could to 
his wives.

All his wives were geniuses and strong, independent women, who didn't really need many things in 
life apart from his love and care.

But providing them with such a technique, it would basically end up helping them reach even 
greater heights and they'll go from being strong women to being the strongest!

Lith had only just gotten married, but the desire to provide the best things to his wives as their 
husband was real and this was what fuelled him to work harder!

All things aside, Lith had to first go finish up the stuff in the Neutral Continent. There was a war 
going on and from the news he saw on his phone a while ago, the war was at its peak and he knew 
that he had to be there or it would end without even him gaining a single experience from it.

There were a few things on Lith's mind now and he had already gotten a lot of stuff on his plate.

– Help the sect win the war.

– Modify the Yin Yang Vīrya* Sutra.

– Absorb all the remaining energy in his body.

– Ascension to Half Saint Rank.

This was his current to-do list that he prepared mentally for himself.

Lith suppressed these thoughts for now and stretching, he got ready to go to bed.



Lith held Lilith's hands and walked inside the new room made solely for him and his wives.

As he entered it for the first time, the view inside made him stop in his tracks and say,

"Wow…"

Chapter 390 Back in Redstone City

"Wow, that sure is amazing."

Lith said in an amazed tone as he saw his new place.

The Prince's chambers had a dark and red theme to it and the ambience felt really comfortable and 
cozy to Lith.

The carpet, the walls, the ceiling, the furniture present, everything was designed in a way that it 
complimented it each other and the theme of the room was well maintained.

This luxurious and big room of Lith's had a big bed, dining table bigger than the one in Lilith's 
room, two sofa sets at each side of the room and at one side, instead of the walls, there was a big 
window which was facing the Dark Rose Forest.

It had sliding windows, outside of which there was a big balcony. The room was at a high level and 
he could experience the breeze if he went out.

'They definitely made sure to make it even more luxurious than mom's room.' Lith thought to 
himself as he looked at his new room with an amused expression.

On the bed, his ladies were sitting cross-legged and looking at him, waiting for him to come to them 
and sleep.

Lith's attention shifted from the room to the beauties sitting on the bed. He walked towards them 
and sat down cross-legged on the middle of the bed.



"Phew. I can finally have sleep as much as I want!" Lith exclaimed as he slumped back on the side.

Arya, Emilia, and Lilith chuckled as they noticed this and Lucy and Alexandra simply smiled.

Lith hugged Emilia and Lucy on the sides and Alexandra lay on top of him. Arya hugged Emilia 
and Lilith hugged Lucy. In this snuggling position, the six slept soundly.

Two days later.

Lith woke up feeling refreshed and energized. It was really a very good sleep. Though he was a 
vampire, he really enjoyed the warmth coming from the bodies of his ladies as he snuggled and 
slept with them.

Lith greeted his wives good morning and went to the washroom to freshen up.

After coming out of the bathroom, Lith went to the dining table in his room and all his wives joined 
him there.

Lith got himself a simple warm bowl of soupy noodles. The ladies got themselves food as well and 
while having food, they started chatting.

"So, what are the plans of my daughter-in-laws?" Lilith took a sip and asked.

Arya put down her teacup and said, "Emmy needs help in academy affairs, I'll go help her with it."

Emilia nodded. "I'll be going back to the academy with Arya and get back to work."

"I'll follow big sis Arya." Alexandra said while biting on a piece of croissant. She had a lot of things 
to learn from Arya and so it was best to follow her, she had such thoughts and was following those.

"And I'll be getting back to handling the affairs of vampire society and do my job as the Substitute 
Queen." Lucy answered.



As for Lith, he gulped down the noodles and looking at Lilith, he said, "I'll go back to the Shadow 
River Sect. I've got to deal with the war and gain some experience from it."

Lilith put on a pondering expression as she heard that. She then took a sip of her tea again and said, 
"but the energy in your body isn't fully absorbed yet. You would need their help to calm it down."

Lith shook his hand and said, "it's alright, not too big of an issue. I'll be able to manage."

Emilia shook her head as she heard that and said what all the ladies had in their minds:

"No, that won't do. I'll postpone my things. Let's have you fully healed first."

The others nodded their heads in agreement.

Lith smiled and said, "so sweet. But don't worry, I'll really manage."

Lilith shook her head this time and said, "No, you are not going anywhere until you're fully healed."

Lith sighed. "Trust me, I'll be okay."

Everyone looked at him with squinted eyes.

"You'll definitely not be okay." They all said.

Lith was surprised to see them be so unified on this topic. He chuckled and gave up going out after 
noticing their determination.

"Alright, I'll go out after the energies are absorbed." Lith agreed finally.

The ladies all had a happy smile on their faces and they continued to chat and have food.

…..



A week passed.

Redstone City, Neutral Continent.

All the energy in Lith's body was fully absorbed by now and he was back in his optimum state. The 
chaotic energies sure caused a lot of trouble to him, but his wives helped him resolve it easily.

Lith had lost track of how many times he actually ended up having sex with them in this past week.

But as everything was over now, Lith was back to the sect.

He could feel that his ascension was near, but he could also feel that he was lacking something. To 
fill this gap, Lith thought that the best course of action would be to go to war and see things for 
himself. He'll be on the Shadow River Sect's side and act accordingly and do things.

Lith didn't go straight to the Shadow River Sect after arriving in Redstone City, rather, he was 
walking through the city to see what all things have changed here in the past few years that he was 
gone.

Walking through the city, the rotting scent of corpses assaulted Lith's nose and he could see 
butchered corpses of a lot of different types of people from different races and blood and bones 
everywhere.

The buildings of the city were in ruins and painted red, black, and blue colors of blood of the 
different people dying here.

Lith didn't feel nauseated as he smelled these stuff, just disgusted. He was a vampire and used to the 
taste and smell of blood and such grotesque scenes weren't really something that bothered him. He 
only felt disgusted because the dried up blood and corpses, it was equivalent to smelling and 
looking at shit to him.

Lith observed who these people that were dead in these piles of corpses were but he had no idea 
about anything.

Redstone City was officially declared a temporary Conflict Zone and people from all around came 
here and duked it out with each other.



That, along with the two clan members killing the sect members and vice versa was the reason for 
such a scene in this city.

The two clans and the sect didn't go all out yet and were slowly accumulating power to unleash 
themselves onto one another and finally be the winners of this war.

Losing or winning these small battles didn't matter much to them and it was only acting as 
uncovering one layer of their enemies and it had been seven long years since they started doing this.

Now, as some time had passed, the war was entering its middle stage. The initial one had passed and 
after the middle was done, it would be the final stage after which the war would end.

Lith was wearing a formal white shirt and blue pants and was going through the battlefield looking 
like some elegant noble of a big family of a main race.

With his charms alone and him walking in with an elegant demeanor on the battlefield, Lith soon 
attracted some flies.

"Wait there!" Someone shouted in Lith's direction.

Lith looked back to see who it was and noticing that it was just a ghoul that shouted and was 
moving in his direction, Lith ignored it and continued to stroll.

"I SAID WAIT!" The ghoul shouted again.

"Where the fuck do you think you're going by not listening to the words of the squad leader!" A few 
ghouls joined the ghoul who had just shouted and yelled stuff at Lith themselves.

"Don't you dare ignore the squad leader!"

Lith stopped hearing that and once again turned to look at the ghouls coming towards him.

The ghouls immediately closed in on Lith as they saw him move and reaching just a few meters 
from him, the ghoul, also the squad leader of the rest, said in a creepy tone,



"Boy, where do you think you're roaming? This is the territory of the noble vampire Ultrix. You 
have invaded the territory of the noble vampire and since this is your first offence, consider yourself 
lucky. Now pay up ten amethyst coins for trespassing accidentally here and we'll choose to ignore 
this offense you just committed."

Lith stared at the guy for a few seconds and then decided to ignore him and get back to his work. 
This guy was just a scammer and since it was the ghouls that were talking, Lith didn't give two shits 
about it and went about his work.

The threat of these ghouls was no different than the annoying buzzing sound flies made. Ghouls 
were created by vampires originally and were still being created. It was a subsidiary race of the 
vampires and no vampire, even the weakest and poorest one, had any respect for them.

The ghouls felt annoyed and irritated as they saw Lith ignore them again. They couldn't take it 
anymore and since they were from a species that wasn't able to properly use their brains and think 
logically, they decided to attack Lith.

The ghouls charged towards Lith and the squad leader ghoul yelled,

"BOY! YOU DARE–"

"Get lost."

SPLAT! SPLAT! SPLAT!

The bodies of the ghouls immediately burst apart as Lith extended his aura and put a heavy 
suppression on them.

The ghouls weren't able to handle this suppression or even resist it as Lith's bloodline was a really 
powerful vampire one and he was also at the peak of Rank 9, about to ascend at any moment into 
Half Saint Rank.

Lith ignored the flies he had just swatted and continued with his stroll.



A few hundred kilometres away from Lith…

Ding! Ding! Ding!

"What?" A pale looking black-haired guy in a suit exclaimed as he heard the sound of the bells ring 
in his office.

He immediately walked in a certain room and looked at the stones tablets present there. The stone 
tablets were present in a hierarchical manner on a platform and he noticed that four stones in the 
upper middle section of the platform had been broken.

"Shit! That was not a wrong notification! Four Rank 8 ghouls indeed died!" The man exclaimed.

He soon calmed down after his initial shock and thought to himself, "is there a new player that has 
entered this zone? Or did the ghouls encounter someone stronger than them? No… that shouldn't be 
possible. The ghouls can detect who is strong and who is not."

"But… What if that person was hiding his prowess? Could be. But what if it wasn't some big shot, 
but simply a vampire? Tsk. It really isn't reliable to assume stuff from the deaths of the ghouls. I'll 
use that method to check stuff."

The man then went into another room. This room contained a lot of bones and blood and he 
dropped his blood on a black skull present on a platform in the middle of the room.

Soon, the skull turned gray and the man wiped his sweat and said, "So it was a vampire. But the 
question is, was it a bigshot vampire or a normal one? Hmm… I'll go see for myself."

The man left the room and walked towards where the ghouls had died, to see who was the killer.
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