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Chapter 665: Those who chant his true name will enter this realm and gain eternal life (1)

Su Qingge was stunned, it was the first time she saw Chan Hong Yi look like this. Looking back, 
her three thousand blue silky strands of hair were like waterfalls, dancing wildly under the mountain 
wind.

Her eyes were deep and cold, but the corner of the mouth outlined a curve, which was shockingly 
beautiful. Just like a witch who caused chaos in the world, she destroyed her former tranquility and 
detachment.

Chan Hong Yi, who looked like this, might be the Red Demon who was feared by the Immortal 
forces and the Supreme sects in the Upper Realm. The tranquility and aloofness before were 
nothing more than a superficial disguise.

However, Su Qingge quickly came back to her senses, and couldn’t help but ask, “Who is the man 
that the Ancestor mentioned? Why do I know him well?”

At this time, Chan Hong Yi’s expression had recovered, and the corner of her lips hooked slightly, 
“Of course you know.”

Hearing this, Su Qingge was taken aback again. Then a handsome figure gradually emerged in her 
mind, which made her a little surprised and unbelievable.

“Could it be Young Master?” She almost murmured, thinking it was impossible, but after thinking 
about it carefully, it seemed that there was no one else.

Although back then in Kunwu City, the Red Demon appeared and asked for one of the several Great 
Divine Stones. Gu Changge had fought against her before, and his attitude seemed very natural and 
casual, as if facing an old friend whom he hadn’t seen for a long time.

But in the eyes of many cultivators at that time, it was because Gu Changge had fought with the 
Red Demon before in the Divine City, and the two of them looked familiar.



Su Qingge also thought so. But judging from the current situation, it seemed that there was another 
secret relationship between the Red Demon and Gu Changge. The friendship between the two of 
them was definitely not that simple.

Chan Hong Yi’s attitude toward Gu Changge was also unusual. Even from Su Qingge’s point of 
view, the bond between the two was very deep, even to such a deep-rooted level.

She was very smart and never asked about these things. But today, Chan Hong Yi suddenly spoke 
up and mentioned it to her, which obviously meant something else. Was Dark Heaven actually 
related to Gu Changge? What else was he hiding?

The more she understood, the more Su Qingge felt that Gu Changge was unfathomable, like an 
unfathomable fog.

“Ancestor, you told me this, what do you want me to do?” Su Qingge asked after being silent for a 
while.

She understood that after Chan Hong Yi appeared in Demon Burying Abyss, she was in a state of 
confusion and hostility for a period of time. During that time, there were countless cultivators who 
died tragically at her hands.

Chan Hong Yi’s expression didn’t change about this, but a strange color flashed in her eyes, and 
said, “I just want to remind you of one thing, the biggest disaster in this world is not you, the so-
called inheritor of demonic arts.”

“I know, I never thought about being a disaster in the past, I just wanted to settle down in this 
world, and this is something beyond my control. I just want to grasp my own destiny, and I don’t 
want to be a fish in that river.” A flash of resoluteness flashed across Su Qingge’s clean and dustless 
face.

Hearing these words, Chan Hong Yi suddenly laughed, her beauty was thrilling, and she looked 
bewitching and seductive. She was extremely disdainful, even her voice was heartless and 
indifferent.

“It’s not up to you. Your fate has long been doomed. The person you think you love the most, the 
person you trust the most, has actually been looking down on you indifferently from a high place. 
His self-righteous touch was just revealed to you on purpose. Do you really think that he can’t see 



that you have twin souls in your body and that you have the inheritance of demonic arts? Even this 
ability of mine was taught by him, not to mention your incomplete demonic arts…”

“It’s ridiculous.” She was laughing, her voice was heavenly, but filled with deep hatred.

“What! It’s impossible…” When Su Qingge heard these words, she froze for a moment, as if struck 
by lightning. Her face became pale, and she couldn’t help but take a few steps back, unable to 
believe this.

If someone else said such a thing, she would definitely be suspicious. But the person who said this 
was the Red Demon who was so fierce and intimidating in the Upper Realm, how could she lie to 
herself?

There was such a deep relationship between Chan Hong Yi and Gu Changge. Her Ancestor was 
actually taught by Gu Changge himself?

What was his background? Gu Changge had been deceiving her all along, even helping her to 
conceal the identity of the inheritor of demonic arts.

Su Qingge’s reaction was within Chan Hong Yi’s expectation, the corner of her mouth curled up as 
if she really wanted to see such a scene.

Gu Changge wanted to maintain his gentle and detached image in Su Qingge’s heart, but she just 
wouldn’t let him do what he wanted.

“I will destroy everything about you with my own hands…” Chan Hong Yi looked toward the end 
of the sky. From the depths of her eyes, terrifying hostility and devilish energy emerged once again, 
but she quickly returned to her previous detached and calm appearance.

These days, the Upper Realm had become more and more chaotic. In the eyes of many cultivators, 
perhaps a terrible disaster would sweep across in the near future. Many forces from all over the 
world ordered the disciples who had gone out to cultivate to return to the sect and wait quietly for 
the end of this disaster.

The Absolute Heavenly Imperial Court had appeared in the world, and the Absolute Heavenly 
Extinction was sweeping across. Now there was a more mysterious Dark Heaven, hidden in the 
dark, like a shadow, which made people felt palpitated and disturbed.



A few days passed, and the chaotic rebellion from the Great Yu Immortal Dynasty that shook all 
forces in the Upper Realm gradually came to an end. Emperor Yu fought against his former brother 
Yu Tianzheng for the throne of the Great Yu Imperial Capital but was defeated and lost.

Even the Heavenly Dao Sword of the Great Yu Immortal Dynasty fell into his hands. That night, 
killings were rampant, blood flowed like rivers, and terrifying chaos swept the entire Great Yu 
Dynasty.

Countless cultivators trembled, feeling desperate and terrified. Many armies descended as the 
flames of war swept across the endless territory of Great Yu. During this period, many forces took 
advantage of the fire to loot.

Under internal and external troubles, many old Emperors from the depths of the Great Yu Immortal 
Dynasty had to appear in order to suppress all these.

According to the rules of the Great Yu Immortal Dynasty, although Yu Tianzheng had been expelled 
many years ago, it was an indisputable fact that he had royal blood flowing in his body.

In addition, during the battle, he killed the previous Emperor Yu, so he naturally had the strength to 
be the current Emperor Yu. Therefore, many old Emperors discussed it for a while and decided to 
let Yu Tianzheng take the throne in accordance with Great Yu’s rules.

Many ministers assisted him while announcing that if Yu Tianzheng’s virtue and talent did not 
match and he could not take up the important task, he would step down and give way to the 
virtuous. Since then, the chaos had gradually subsided.

In terms of ability, Yu Tianzheng was much more unruly than the previous Emperor Yu, and the last 
defeat was only due to a trick. Under his iron-blooded and tough tactics, a war broke out and wiped 
out many disturbing elements within the Great Yu territory.

This was also the next step for him since he became the new Emperor, and it really calmed many 
people down. Many ministers who were quite critical also gradually shut up and fell silent, 
unwilling to provoke Yu Tianzheng who was in full swing at this time. Some people even 
speculated whether Yu Tianzheng might have something to do with that Dark Heaven.



However, such speculations were not much. After all, there was no evidence to indicate that the 
group of Enlightened beings in black who attacked Gu Changge that day had any relationship with 
Yu Tianzheng. And just when the outside world was changing, in the depths of the current Great Yu 
Imperial Capital.
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