
W. Master 1181

Chapter 1181 - Repairing the cave

Currently, every one of the ten thousand mountains in the Great Xuan Lake were completely 
undamaged. The Supreme Mystery Temple at the center of the lake and the sword intent contained 
within the mountains were also completely intact.

This was Tang Huan's confidence.

Inside the Supreme Profound Hall, Tang Huan had already thoroughly activated the "Ten Thousand 
Endless Sword Formation".

At this moment, the innumerable veins that were spread out from the center of the hall seemed to 
have turned into crisscrossing pipes. As the sword formation operated at a high speed, the pure 
energy that gathered in the hall slowly rushed into the pipes and spread in all directions.

In the blink of an eye, the energy had already permeated the entire Supreme Xuan Lake.

"Rumble …"

Wherever the power passed through, space fluctuated rapidly, and a faint trembling sound resonated 
throughout the world.

Not long after, in a valley not far from the Great Xuan Lake, the spreading force came in contact 
with a spatial crack that was dozens of meters long.

Boundless energy began to converge, slowly merging into the world.

It was as if two giant invisible hands were grabbing the sides of the spacial rifts and moving closer 
to each other. After what seemed like a few hours or a few days, the spatial crack finally vanished 
completely. The power originating from the Supreme Mystery Temple stopped gathering in this 
direction and continued to frantically expand in all directions.

The spatial rifts closed one by one, and the spatial traps were filled up one by one. The fragile 
regions of space also gradually became more stable.

Inside the Supreme Profound Hall, Tang Huan's body was like a boulder, not moving an inch.

"Hu!"

After an unknown period of time, the power in the hall had been completely used up. Tang Huan 
sensed the "Illusory Sword Heavenly Palace" situation for a while and couldn't help but heave a 
sigh of relief.

So much power had only repaired about 20% of the space cracks and traps, as well as those spaces 
that could collapse at any time. Moreover, this kind of repair was only at the superficial level and 
not completely complete.

Repairing the "Illusory Sword Heavenly Palace" was indeed a heavy task with a long way to go.

"After I leave, I'll need to find even more strength."

Tang Huan thought for a bit, then a smile surfaced on his face. He slowly stood up, but just as he 
was about to leave the Supreme Profound Hall, a beautiful figure flashed and entered the hall. Her 
figure was graceful, and her beautiful face was like a flower.



"Shan Shan!"

After not seeing each other for a long time, Tang Huan couldn't help but feel his heart palpitate as 
he wrapped his arms around himself.

… ….

Tong Tian Tower, eastern part of the Wind Fire Thunder Realm.

The news of the entrance passage to the third floor of the "Tong Tian Tower" opening once again, as 
well as everything that had happened inside, had not only spread throughout the "Thunderstorm 
Realm of Wind and Fire" and "Snow Glacier Realm", but had also spread outside to the "Tong Tian 
Ancient Region".

However, their hearts were moved, and they were shocked by the terrifying death rate.

Only two hundred or so out of the one thousand that went in, and there were only nine people who 
managed to obtain a "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" and a small "Spiritual Beast". This meant that 
most of the Void Transformation experts that entered not only couldn't obtain the bead, but would 
also lose their lives there.

Even so, there were still many Void Transformation Stage experts rushing to the eastern entrance of 
the Firestorm Way.

Almost every day, there were shadows entering and exiting the arch on the platform.

However, almost everyone came in high spirits and left in disappointment. The entrance tunnel did 
open, but on the third floor of the "Tong Tian Tower", there was only a tall platform carrying an 
arch. Even the chaos surrounding the stage disappeared. As for the gathering of a thousand people, 
the matter of activating the Heavenly Road did not happen, and even the words "thousand people 
gathered, the universe begins to move" condensed from countless lines on the high platform had 
already disappeared.

Everyone finally realized that after the appearance of the "Universe Dao World", it was impossible 
for it to appear again in a short period of time.

Perhaps only when the third floor and high platform of the "Tong Tian Tower" was once again 
shrouded in chaos would the Pang Shuang Heavenly Road which connected to the "Heaven and 
Earth Dao World" once again be revealed.

This result made everyone feel incomparable regret.

As for Shao Yang, who sat cross-legged like a sculpture within a cloud of mist a thousand miles 
away from the entrance to the third floor's arch, he looked at the scroll in his hand with anxiousness 
filling his brows.

He did not accurately calculate how many days had passed, but he guessed that it had been no less 
than two months.

Back when Tang Huan had obtained the page "Hundred Lava Flaming Spear" from his hands 
outside Skypiercing City, he had used a day to forge the Divine Armament out.

But right now, Tang Huan had stayed inside for two months and still had not shown himself.



Even if it took a long time to forge a Saint-rank Divine Armament, it shouldn't grow so much, right? 
This caused Shao Yang to be unable to help himself from having wild thoughts. It was just that he 
didn't know the situation inside, and it was basically impossible for him to enter by himself now. No 
matter how anxious he was, he could only endure it.

According to his judgement, the Saint-rank Divine Armament that he wanted might have already 
failed to forge.

If that was really the case, he could only accept it. Even if a Saint-rank Heavenly Blacksmith were 
to be forged, they would have an extremely high failure rate, let alone a Saint-rank Divine 
Armament.

Forcefully suppressing the various complicated thoughts in his mind, Shao Yang slowly closed his 
eyes.

After a long time, a wave of strange fluctuations suddenly woke Shao Yang up. He looked down 
and discovered that the scroll in his hand had a big crack in it, and it was slowly unfolding.

Tang Huan was coming out?

Shao Yang's heartbeat slightly quickened as he thought of this. Unexpectedly, he started to get 
nervous as his eyes stared unblinkingly at the lifelike painting.

"Hu!"

He was holding onto a long sword in his hands, the sword was one metre long and three fingers 
wide, white as snow, but at the center of the sword blade, there was a shallow gold groove 
extending from the sword tip all the way to the armguard, and at the sharp sides of the sword blade, 
a faint gold light was released, the gold and white colors intertwined, causing the sword to have a 
unique feature.

Of course, the most important thing was that the aura radiating from the sword was terrifying to the 
extreme. Even a cultivator like him could not help but feel his soul tremble.

The instant Shao Yang saw the sword, his eyes seemed to stick to it, unable to move away. His face 
couldn't help but flush red. After a long time, Shao Yang finally came back to his senses, rubbed his 
hands in embarrassment and said, "Little brother, this …. "This sword …"

However, this Saint-ranked Divine Armament was still in Tang Huan's hands after all. If Tang Huan 
had a few more requests, no matter how unwilling he was, he would accept it.

"Senior, take it. Now it is yours!"

Tang Huan swung his hand, throwing the sword in his hand over.

Shao Yang subconsciously took the longsword, but was a little dazed. He had thought of many 
possibilities, but never thought that Tang Huan would so readily hand over the Saint-rank Divine 
Armament to him. Only after a while did Shao Yang wake up as if he had just woken up from a 
dream. He felt quite ashamed in his heart. "Little Brother, thank you very much."

"Senior Shao Yang, you and I owe each other nothing now."

Tang Huan smiled indifferently. This time, he stayed in the cave for such a long time, other than 
spending a lot of time to repair the cave, he also forged six Divine Armament s, including Shao 



Yang's longsword. This was also because the five Saint-rank Divine Armament s that belonged to 
him did not have enough materials at the moment.

Otherwise, Tang Huan could have completely forged all eleven Divine Armament s.

"..."

Shao Yang took the Saint-rank Divine Armament and bid his farewells to Tang Huan happily. Tang 
Huan withdrew his gaze, and immediately passed through these clouds, heading straight into the 
violent Domain of the Wind.

Chapter 1182 - Ancient Cave of the Sky King

Firestorm Lightning World, northwest border.

"This old man has finally recovered!"

From within the hall formed by clouds, the sound of wild laughter suddenly rang out. The person 
who spoke was an old man in green robes with a face full of wrinkles. Surprisingly, it was Duan 
Wuya.

After being severely injured in the "Universe Dao Realm", he had not fully recovered even after the 
exit had been opened.

As a result, almost as soon as he returned to the "Wind Fire Thunder World," he fled to this area 
with his fastest speed and hid in the clouds for a period of time. Only after he confirmed that the 
woman who had severely injured him had left the "Wind Fire Thunder World" did he dare enter his 
own nest.

After several more days of focused healing, the injuries within his body were finally completely 
healed.

Moments later, Duan Wuya's laughter abruptly stopped. His gaze turned as cold as a venomous 
snake, and he suddenly shouted in a low voice, "Completed!"

"Here!"

Outside the hall's door, a middle-aged man in green stood up and answered, "What orders does the 
Patriarch have?"

Duan Wuya's tone was grim, "Have you investigated that person's identity?"

"Yes."

The green robed middle aged man said in a deep voice, "According to the information provided by 
the ancestor, this junior sent people to investigate, the person was known to be surnamed Tang, and 
came from the 'Pure Yang Sword Sect' of the southeast region. He is around thirty years old, and not 
only is he a Heavenly Blacksmith, but he is also a Gem Synthetic Master.

"It seems that he is a genius from the heavens." Duan Wuya snorted coldly, "Then where is Tang 
Huan now?"

"He should still be in the Firestorm Way." The green robed middle-aged man said.

"Good!" The heavens are truly helping this old one! "



Duan Wuya leaped up, his tone icy cold. "This time, I want to see how he will escape from me 
without that woman!"

"Whoosh!"

At almost the same instant he finished speaking, Duan Wuya had already disappeared from the hall 
….

… ….

"Bam!"

In the Lightning Territory, Tang Huan's spear moved like lightning as the "Heavenly Radiance 
Lightning Serpent" that had suddenly appeared in front of him directly exploded into pieces. 
Following which, a purple thunder crystal was grabbed by Tang Huan.

After parting ways with Shao Yang, Tang Huan began to walk in circles around the "Wind Fire 
Thunder World".

First was the Wind and Fire Domains, then the Fire Domains, and finally the Thunder Domains … 
Now, after killing many "Wind Spirit Mist Eagles", "Three-eyed Fire Rats", and "Heavenly Light 
Thunder Snakes", Tang Huan had collected over two thousand wind, fire, and thunder crystals.

This number was already extremely shocking.

It was extremely difficult to kill the vicious beasts on the first and second floors of Tong Tian 
Tower. Even a powerhouse at the peak of the Void Transformation Stage would have to put in a lot 
of effort to kill one of them.

However, to Tang Huan, it was not that difficult. With his super strong Perception Ability, he could 
kill these fierce beasts in one blow.

"I should be able to leave the 'Wind Fire Thunder World' now."

Tang Huan took a light breath and sent the thunder crystal back into the "Sumeru Magical Ring". 
He then thought, "Once we go to the" Mystic Frost Snow Realm "and gather some more ice 
crystals, we will be able to head to the southern part of the" Realm of the Ancient Clear Heaven ". 
The power inside the" Ancient Cave of the Sky King ", is just enough to repair the" Illusory Sword 
Heavenly Palace "."

The Heavenly King's Ancient Cave was also a secret realm of this "Heavenly Ancient Region".

The cave accumulated an incomparable amount of power. It was said that even the Nine Revolving 
Core Cultivators were unable to refine that power. However, it should be possible to use it to repair 
the cave. Of course, this was only Tang Huan's judgement. As for the details, he would only know 
after looking through the "Ancient Cave of the Sky King".

Within the Archaeus region, there were many other places where high-quality strength could be 
found. However, none of them had the strength of the "Ancient Celestial King Cave".

If he hadn't coincidentally met Shao Yang this time and wanted to head to the "Wind Fire Thunder 
Realm" to help Hu Si, the first place Tang Huan wanted to go to would be the "Ancient King Cave".

"Whoosh!"



In a blink of an eye, Tang Huan nimbly dodged the lightning bolts that came crashing down from 
the skies, flying straight towards the direction of the exit of the "Wind Fire Thunder World".

He was already extremely close to the exit, and in not even a quarter of an hour, he could already 
see the familiar high platform.

"Hmm?"

Even before rushing out of the Lightning Territory, Tang Huan couldn't help but raise his eyebrows 
slightly.

On the stage, not a single person could be seen.

However, Tang Huan could feel a subtle fluctuation from that place. If Tang Huan was not that 
powerful, he might have thought that it was just an illusion. But now, he was completely sure that 
there was definitely a guy with extremely profound concealing skills hiding there.

"Nie Zhitong?" Duan Wuya? Or some other Void Transformation Stage expert? "

Tang Huan did not stop, but his brain was working hard.

If there was someone who was interested, finding out that Hu Si had already left the Tong Tian 
Tower was not difficult at all. A few cultivators who coveted the "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" or 
who hated him for absorbing almost all of the power of the "Heaven and Earth dao realm" might 
find a chance to harm him.

"Master Hu Si is right!"

Tang Huan laughed coldly in his heart, but he did not take the person on the stage too seriously, nor 
did he plan to use that slight fluctuation to determine his identity. The moment he neared the stage, 
with a thought, he used the "Heavenly Invisibility" and "Air Escape" respectively.

Without any warning, Tang Huan's figure disappeared from underneath the stage.

"Hmm?"

On the high platform, a cry of surprise suddenly sounded out, and immediately after, a green figure 
separated from the air. It was Duan Wuya.

Doubt surfaced on Duan Wuya's aged face, and his gaze instantly turned cold as he quickly scanned 
the surroundings like a falcon. After a short moment, Duan Wuya seemed to have thought of 
something. He turned around abruptly and saw a black shadow flash past in the middle of the sky, 
which was filled with endless fluctuations.

"Tang Huan, don't run!"

Unexpectedly, Tang Huan was able to escape the "Wind Fire Thunder World" right under his nose. 
Duan Wuya was instantly enraged to the extreme, he growled under his breath, and then charged 
into the arch. However, in a split-second, Duan Wuya appeared on the western platform of the 
"Blackfrost Snow World". Within his line of sight, the slender black shadow was already a hundred 
meters away.

But before he could chase after it, the figure disappeared without a trace again.



"How could he leave the Firestorm Way, or the Snow Glacier Realm?" This old man would like to 
see whether you go first to the exit of the 'Snow Glacier Realm of Ice and Snow', or this old man go 
first! " Duan Wuya was even more infuriated, his tone was as cold as a strand of yin wind from hell.

"Hu!"

After an instant, Duan Wuya no longer bothered to chase after the black silhouette that had 
disappeared in front of him. Instead, he sprinted towards the exit of the "Snow Glacier Realm" at a 
breakneck speed, as if he was a wisp of cyan colored flowing light, constantly flashing across the 
surface of the shaking layer of ice.

Chapter 1183 - Waiting for Rabbits

"That old fellow Duan Wuya is really persistent!"

Frost Flowers fill the sky. Tang Huan watched as Duan Wuya's figure disappeared into the horizon, 
yet he himself stopped in his tracks and stopped maintaining his ability of "Heavenly Invisibility." 
His figure then revealed itself, and a hint of a sneer quietly emerged from between his brows.

Tang Huan was naturally clear of what Duan Wuya was planning.

If he was unable to stop Tang Huan at the exit of the "Wind, Fire, Thunder" Realm, then that old 
fellow had placed his hope on the "Mystic Frost Snow Realm" exit, wanting to stop Tang Huan 
before he could.

He obviously felt that, with the previous example of the "Wind, Fire, and Thunder Realms", he 
would never fail again in this "Realm of Ice and Snow".

Unfortunately, this was only his wishful thinking.

No matter what methods he used to completely seal off the platform that was carrying the arch, 
Tang Huan could still use the third stage of the Yin and Yang Void Method technique "Yin Yang dao 
diagram" to travel straight through, directly entering the arch. His plan would definitely fail.

Right now, there was no need for Tang Huan to fight with him over who would arrive at the exit 
first. Since he wanted to rush there with all his might, he could simply let it go. It just so happened 
that Tang Huan could collect a few ice crystals in this "Mystic Frost Snow World".

"Hu!"

In the span of a moment, the corner of Tang Huan's lips curled up into a ridiculing smile. After that, 
he casually chose a direction and dashed forward, his Perception Ability rising to the extreme. He 
carefully checked the surrounding ice layers to find the hiding spot of the "Phantom Ice Butterfly."

In just a moment, Tang Huan's figure had already disappeared into the falling frost.

… ….

The eastern exit of the Blackfrost Snow World.

Duan Wuya sat cross-legged like a wooden statue, not moving in the slightest. However, through 
his slightly narrowed eyelids, one could see the gloominess in his eyes.

This time, he learnt from his previous experience and no longer hid his body. Instead, he directly sat 
on the high platform.



Around the stage, he had set up a small array, and the invisible barrier formed by the array 
formation enveloped the entire stage, and he could sense anyone who entered, so he did not need to 
worry about Tang Huan sneaking in.

In addition, since he had been in charge of this place, he could only enter and not exit to ensure that 
everything was safe.

His actions caused many Void Transformation Stage cultivators that wanted to leave the Tong Tian 
Tower to be extremely dissatisfied, but since they were weaker than him, they dared not to say 
anything and could only swallow their anger.

Initially, Duan Wuya was still filled with confidence. However, as time passed by, his expression 
became more and more unsightly, and his mood became increasingly anxious.

He had arrived early and made all his preparations, but Tang Huan still did not appear. It was as if 
he had just punched the air, causing his heart to burn with extreme rage.

What made him especially frustrated was that it seemed like someone had seen Tang Huan hunting 
"Phantom Ice Butterfly" everywhere in the "Snow Glacier Realm". After such a long period of time, 
the number of ice crystals in his hands had probably reached an astonishing level.

He was waiting here like a fool, but Tang Huan was actually tormenting herself in the "Frosty Snow 
Realm", how could he endure this?

Other than that, there was another matter that made him extremely anxious. He could faintly sense 
that the Heavenly Road was about to descend.

After entering the "Ancient Clear Heaven Domain" for over a thousand years, he had suppressed his 
cultivation for close to a thousand years. Now, he was completely at death's door. No matter when 
the Heavenly Road descended, he would not be surprised.

He had long since prepared himself for this tribulation, and he was fully confident.

At this time, the thing he ought to do the most was to leave the "Tong Tian Tower" and return to the 
"Realm of Eternal Heaven" outside. If he had enough time, he could even return to the Forging God 
Great World.

The longer he stayed here, the worse his tribulation would be for him.

However, after being tormented for such a long time, if he was unable to kill Tang Huan and snatch 
the treasures off his body, even if he were to ascend into the sky, he would find it hard to accept it.

"Let's wait for another day. If he doesn't appear soon, then …."

Duan Wuya leaped up, as if he wanted to turn around and enter the arched door behind him, but he 
gritted his teeth in an instant and forcefully suppressed the impulse in his heart. He sat down again 
and closed his eyes, his cold gaze completely concealed by his eyelids.

If he had enough time, ten years would have passed in the blink of an eye. But now ….

On the side of the high platform, there were dozens of Void Transformation Stage powerhouses that 
wanted to escape but were stopped by Duan Wuya.



With their cultivations, they could faintly sense what caused Duan Wuya to have such a reaction. 
Although he didn't make a sound, when their gazes intersected, they could see the gloating look in 
each other's eyes.

However, after a short moment, a few people frowned, as if they had noticed something.

Soon after, almost all cultivators raised their eyes to look, and uncontrollably, a look of 
astonishment appeared on their faces. Amidst the fluttering frost in the sky, a figure actually shot 
forward with a speed as fast as a meteor. In an instant, his appearance was very clearly imprinted in 
their eyes; it was a very young man dressed in black.

"Tang Huan!"

Such an age, such a outfit … The reason why Duan Wuya had gone through so much trouble was 
precisely because of this young man. He didn't want to continue hunting the Mirage Ice Butterfly, 
but instead ran over here and fell into his trap. Was he tired of living?

Of course, Tang Huan wasn't here to throw away his life.

Although he was not afraid of Duan Wuya, he was not a reckless person. He used the sacred art 
"Heavenly Invisibility" to hide and observe nearby for a good while before suddenly appearing and 
rapidly approaching them.

From Duan Wuya's state, Tang Huan reckoned that if he had waited a few more days, Duan Wuya 
would probably have left on his own accord.

"Whoosh!"

Ignoring the bewildered gazes of the crowd, his footsteps did not stop. In an instant, he was less 
than twenty meters away from the stage. He continued forward and he made contact with the 
formless barrier formed by the formation.

Duan Wuya finally sensed something, and his eyes snapped open. His hawk-like gaze locked onto 
Tang Huan, and within the cold chill, there was actually a hint of ecstasy.

"Little bastard, you finally decided to show up!"

Duan Wuya slowly stood up with a cold and harsh tone, then he gnashed his teeth and laughed.

However, after an instant, his expression suddenly changed.

In front of Tang Huan, a black and white vortex suddenly appeared. In the blink of an eye, Tang 
Huan had already merged with the black and white vortex, disappearing without a trace.

"This is bad!"

In the center of Duan Wuya's heart, he had a premonition that something bad was about to happen. 
He turned around at the fastest speed possible, and at the same time that he turned around, his 
emaciated right palm also slammed towards the direction of the arched door. A terrifying blood-red 
shadow of the palm exploded with shocking might, bringing with it a monstrous, ruthless aura, as if 
it wanted to tear the arched door to pieces.

Chapter 1184 The good show was at hand!



As expected, a black and white vortex suddenly appeared in front of the lightly fluctuating void 
inside the arch. Tang Huan's figure shot out from the depths of the vortex in less than half a blink of 
an eye.

"Hu!"

Amidst the hissing sounds, the blood-red palm shadow came crashing over like a bolt of lightning.

Unfortunately, Duan Wuya was one step too slow.

When the blood red palm image and the black and white vortex clashed together, Tang Huan's body 
had already quickly merged into the endless void, and instantly disappeared without a trace.

The vortex swiftly scattered, while the palm shadow exploded, transforming into an extremely 
ferocious blood wave that blotted the sky. It frantically surged across the tall platform. However, the 
arch remained unmoving.

"How hateful!"

Originally, he was fully prepared, yet Tang Huan managed to escape once again. Duan Wuya was 
furious to the extreme, and before he even thought about it, his figure had already shot forward like 
an arrow that had left the bow.

"This is bad!"

He had already sensed the existence of the Heavenly Road a long time ago, and it was only because 
he was staying in the Tong Tian Tower that the Heavenly Road did not descend. If he went out now, 
the Heavenly Road would definitely appear, and the heavenly tribulation would soon follow.

However, it was already too late to stop.

Moreover, Tang Huan had already escaped Tong Tian Tower, so there was no longer any need for 
him to continue staying here.

He failed twice in a row. He was prepared for the last time. The opportunity was in front of him, yet 
he couldn't grab it. It seemed like the gods were keeping the little bastard's life. It was impossible to 
break the heavens' will!

"Hu!"

With a flick of his finger, his body flashed out from within the arched door and appeared on the first 
floor of the Tong Tian Tower. Just as the familiar figure rushed out from the entrance, Duan Wuya 
reflexively chased after it.

Outside of Skysplit Tower, there was white snow. That black figure was incomparably eye-catching 
on top of the snow.

At this moment, Duan Wuya couldn't help but stop in his tracks and raise his head to look at the sky.

"Boom!"

In the distant skies, a bunch of dense white-colored odor poured down like a waterfall.

In the time it took to snap a finger, Duan Wuya who had just rushed out of Tong Tian Tower was 
enveloped within. Surprisingly, it was a massive tunnel formed by the energy of heaven and earth.



Duan Wuya's Heavenly Road had arrived!

"Sure enough!"

A kilometer away, Tang Huan suddenly turned his head, his face revealing a strange smile.

In the next moment, the "Absolute Yang Scarlet Scale Sword" appeared in his palm, but he 
immediately transformed into a "Exquisite Carving Bow". With one hand holding the bow and the 
other holding the bow, a fiery red arrow immediately formed.

"Tang Huan, you dare!"

In front of Tong Tian Tower, at the bottom of the Heavenly Road, Duan Wuya seemed to have 
sensed something.

He understood, Tang Huan was interfering with his tribulation. Of course, although he was angry, 
he wasn't in a hurry.

He didn't think that Tang Huan's next actions would be of any threat to him with his seven 
transformations. It would've been Nie Zhitong's turn, especially the white-clothed female's, whose 
power was terrifying to the extreme.

"Whooosh."

Suddenly, an ear-piercing howl tore through the air.

At the top of the Heavenly Road, a dark blue aura suddenly appeared. It was actually an enormous 
current of energy that roiled down like an angry dragon with unstoppable force. An incomparably 
violent aura instantly filled the entire Heavenly Road, as if wanting to smash Duan Wuya into 
smithereens below.

Duan Wuya could no longer afford to observe Tang Huan's movements. The True Essence in his 
body circulated crazily, and a large number of Blood Red Odor surged out of his body like a broken 
dam, instantly condensing into an incomparably sturdy blood-colored barrier that enveloped him 
within.

In the distance, Tang Huan's body stood as straight as a spear, his eyes squinted, carefully observing 
the area for movements, but he did not immediately make his move, the might of the arrow in his 
hand increasing instead.

After a short moment, an earth-shattering explosion resounded from within the Heavenly Road. It 
was the dark blue torrent that descended upon the blood-red barrier that Duan Wuya had activated.

Seeing that, Tang Huan smiled.

Duan Wuya endured the water tribulation within the Five Elements heavenly tribulation, but 
looking at the might that the heavenly tribulation had shown in the Heavenly Road, it was definitely 
stronger than the fire tribulation that Shan He had endured back then. It seems like his heavenly 
tribulation had long since descended, yet he still forcefully endured for a period of time in the 
"Tong Tian Tower".

"Chi!"



With a thought, Tang Huan could not help but laugh, following that, cracking sounds could be 
heard, following that, an extremely sharp sound of breaking through the air resonated through the 
heaven and earth.

Tang Huan pointed to the side as the flaming arrow left his bow.

Wherever it passed by, a terrifying storm would follow. The surrounding space fluctuated rapidly, as 
if a huge hole had been pierced through by the fiery red light.

"Chi!" "Swish …"

After the first arrow was the second, the third … Up to the ninth arrow!

The nine fiery arrows connected head to tail like a string of beads, forming a straight line in the air.

This was the archery skill "Nine Stars Connecting Bead" that originated from a small world.

Although Tang Huan had never learned this archery technique before, with Tang Huan's current 
strength, coupled with the fact that he had comprehended the Divine Dragon Abyss's "Arrow 
Defense", he could use all kinds of archery techniques. Grasping the "Nine Star Beads" was not 
difficult at all for him.

In an instant, the nine fiery arrows landed on the Heavenly Road.

The Heavenly Road could block the internal heavenly tribulation and the Strength Qi's leakage, but 
if the external force was strong to a certain extent, it could easily penetrate the Heavenly Road's 
barrier and enter.

"Boom …"

In a split-second, those streaks of fiery red light pierced through the Heavenly Road as well as the 
surging dark blue torrent, ruthlessly smashing into the blood-red barrier that was under the assault 
of the torrent.

In a blink of an eye, the Strength Qi churned like a tide, its explosive sound seemingly endless, as if 
it could even penetrate the eardrums.

However, the blood-red barrier remained motionless.

"Tang Huan, you think you can interfere with my tribulation? You are overestimating yourself!"

Inside the protective barrier at the end of the Heavenly Road, Duan Wuya glanced at Tang Huan and 
laughed maniacally. His expression was actually one of ridicule and the stifling feeling in his heart 
had finally dissipated.

In the distance, Tang Huan smiled indifferently. He was not angry and did not try again.

Judging from the situation just now, the "Nine Star Chain Pearl" did not have the slightest effect. 
Even if he continued to use the more powerful "Arrow Defense", it would not have much of an 
effect.

Duan Wuya was indeed worthy of being one of the strongest experts in this "Ancient Realm of 
Clear Heaven".

However, this was only the beginning, and the good show was yet to come.

Wait and see!



Tang Huan smiled as he floated forward for a while. He was getting closer to the Heavenly Road.

Chapter 1185 - Dual Threats

"Hmm... Elder Wuya … Duan Wuya is actually undergoing a tribulation! "

At the entrance of Skysplit Tower, cries of surprise rose up. It was a handsome middle-aged man. 
The "Ancestor" that had just reached his mouth swallowed his words and directly called him by his 
name.

Duan Wuya's actions of coming to the entrance of the "Ice Snow Realm" during this period of time 
had caused many to lose respect for him.

Now that Duan Wuya's Heavenly Tribulation had arrived, regardless of whether he succeeded or 
failed, he was no longer a threat to the crowd. Naturally, there was no need for them to be 
concerned about him.

"That is... Tang Huan? "

After a while, the middle-aged man noticed Tang Huan's figure and muttered in confusion, "Why is 
he standing at the side of the Sky Road instead of leaving? Could he be trying to interfere with 
Duan Wuya's tribulation? " As he finished speaking, the middle-aged man couldn't help but exclaim 
in surprise.

Immediately after, his gaze towards Tang Huan started to become somewhat strange.

As time passed, more and more cultivators gathered outside of Skysplit Tower. When they saw the 
figure on the Heavenly Road, almost everyone let out a sigh of relief. Duan Wuya was undergoing 
his tribulation, and Nie Zhitong was probably not far away. Without the two of them, there would be 
two mountains missing.

However, when their gazes landed on Tang Huan, their gazes were as strange as the middle-aged 
man's.

During a cultivator's tribulation, outsiders can interfere, but it requires a lot of strength. At the very 
least, it can't be that much weaker than a tribulation user.

Tang Huan was only a Qiankun cultivator but Duan Wuya was one of the strongest in the Ancient 
Regions. Even the heavenly tribulation could not do anything to him, so no matter how strong Tang 
Huan was, could he be stronger than the heavenly tribulation? If Tang Huan really planned to 
interfere with Duan Wuya's tribulation, then this action of his was indeed overestimating his own 
abilities and was quite laughable.

Time flew by. Within the Heavenly Road, the heavenly tribulations came one after another, 
becoming more and more intense.

At the bottom of the Heavenly Road, Duan Wuya was like a huge rock nailed into the surging tides. 
No matter how hard he tried to break through, he remained unmoving. Unknowingly, it was already 
the third water tribulation. An incomparably terrifying water dragon fell from the sky, seeming as 
though it wanted to crush Duan Wuya into dust.

At the entrance of Skysplit Tower, many cultivators couldn't help but suck in a cold breath when 
they saw this scene.

"Haha, good one!"



Duan Wuya's pupils constricted as he started laughing maniacally.

Before this, he had not made a single move. He had only relied on his blood-red barrier to forcefully 
endure the first two water tribulations, but this time, he finally made his move.

The instant the blood-red barrier disappeared, his slightly hunched body crazily expanded like a 
balloon. In the blink of an eye, he had turned into a three-meter tall and burly giant and punched 
towards the approaching water dragon.

Over a hundred fist shadows rapidly merged together and turned into an incomparably large fist. In 
an instant, it collided with the water dragon.

"Boom —"

A loud sound echoed out rapidly.

The water tornado suddenly exploded, and a dark blue intent immediately filled the entire bottom of 
the Heavenly Road. The powerful Strength Qi wreaked havoc crazily, but Duan Wuya's muscular 
body did not budge in the slightest. He continued punching the air, and at this moment, another 
water tornado descended.

"Hu!"

Outside of the Heavenly Road, with a thought from Tang Huan, a "Nine Yang Divine Furnace" 
flashed out of the Dantian, and blasted it with a speed that even the naked eye could not catch.

This time was different from the past. Although there were many Void Transformation Stage 
cultivators watching the door of Tong Tian Tower, Tang Huan did not have any qualms.

Even though his current cultivation was only at the seventh circulation, he had treasures like the 
"Nine Yang Divine Furnace", a space like the "Illusory Sword Heavenly Palace", and abilities like 
the "Yin and Yang Void Method". He already had enough confidence and was not afraid of any 
threats, so naturally he did not need to hide anything.

In a split-second, "Nine Yang Divine Furnace" had already pierced through the side wall of the Sky 
Road, striking at the figure at the bottom of the road.

"This is …" "Dao Artifact?"

Duan Wuya's expression changed at first, but then his eyes flashed with an unconcealable greed. His 
right fist continued to bombard the cauldron nonstop, while his left arm turned to the side, reaching 
out to grab the cauldron. In the blink of an eye, his fingers were like hooks as he forcefully grabbed 
the mouth of the cauldron.

"Weng — —" Tang Huan laughed coldly in his heart. In that split-second of his mind instructs (in a 
second), the cauldron had begun to tremble intensely.

Just at this moment, the roaring water tornado clashed against the huge fists made up of fist 
shadows. The water tornado exploded again, turning into a boundless Strength Qi that raged at the 
bottom of the Heavenly Road. Almost at the same time, Duan Wuya frowned slightly. He suddenly 
realized that under the fierce impact of the Strength Qi and the intense vibrations of the cauldron, 
his five fingers had started to crumble.



"This is bad!"

"In the blink of an eye, Duan Wuya's facial expression changed drastically. The cauldron had 
already broken free and slammed into his chest with the force of a thunderbolt." Bang! With a 
thunderous sound, Duan Wuya explosively retreated. His face immediately flushed red, yet he 
forcefully suppressed the raging Qi and blood in his chest.

Although Duan Wuya managed to hold on, his complexion became even more unsightly.

This was because high up in the sky, the third water dragon was howling as it descended. Not only 
that, the cauldron had once again smashed towards him. Duan Wuya gritted his teeth, his right fist 
continued to smash towards the sky, while his left hand turned into a claw that punched out towards 
the cauldron.

"Bam!"

The water tornado instantly shattered, and the "Nine Yang Divine Furnace" retreated while Duan 
Wuya retreated explosively. This time, however, he could not hold on any longer, and fresh blood 
spurted out of his mouth. Before it could even splash onto the ground, he was swept clean by the 
surrounding Strength Qi.

Without the slightest bit of delay, the water dragon and "Nine Yang Divine Furnace" continued to 
approach.

The greed in Duan Wuya's eyes had already disappeared completely, and what replaced it was an 
unconcealable anger. He suddenly realized that if he continued on like this, he would very likely fail 
this Heavenly Tribulation.

Originally, he did not pay any attention to Tang Huan's interference, but after the suspected Dao 
item furnace appeared, the situation within the Heavenly Road had undergone a huge change. Under 
the dual attacks of the third heavenly tribulation and the Dao Artifact, his internal organs had 
already suffered heavy injuries.

"Tang Huan!"

Duan Wuya almost gnashed his teeth as he shouted out this name. His eyes were filled with anger as 
he swung both of his fists in different directions.

Under normal circumstances, no matter how powerful this Dao Artifact was, it would not have been 
able to affect him much if it was controlled by Tang Huan, who was at the seventh circulation. 
However, it was currently experiencing the most violent water tribulation. This sudden appearance 
of a Dao weapon was a huge threat to him.

Unfortunately, it was too late for him to realize this point.

An instant later, under the dual impact of the water tornado and the cauldron, Duan Wuya's sturdy 
body was sent flying like a kite with its string cut.

Chapter 1186 - Mental and physical annihilation

"Bam!"

Accompanied by the intense tremors, Duan Wuya first heavily crashed into the wall of the Sky 
Road, then smashed onto the ground, causing blood to spurt out from his mouth once more.



At the entrance of Skysplit Tower, all of the cultivators finally regained their senses and cries of 
alarm rose up one after another.

"Duan Wuya is actually injured!"

"How is this possible? Tang Huan only has the cultivation of the seventh circulation, how can he 
actually interfere with Duan Wuya's tribulation?"

"What weapon is that? How is it so powerful?"

"..."

"Haha, Duan Wuya is in danger this time!"

"He asked for it!" If it were not for him chasing after Tang Huan, why would Tang Huan look for 
trouble with him while he was undergoing his tribulation? "

"..."

"Bam!"

On the Heavenly Road, a huge noise burst out once again. It was Tang Huan's "Nine Yang Divine 
Furnace" that was flying towards the cauldron once again, and Duan Wuya who had just gotten up, 
smashed his fist with all his might. The blood-red fist landed on the cauldron, and produced an 
earth-shaking collision sound.

However, in the instant that Duan Wuya sent the cauldron flying, the water tribulation descended 
once again.

When it was this time, Duan Wuya had no time to defend against the heavenly tribulation. He 
immediately roared like a wild beast in a desperate situation, and the exceptionally dense Blood Red 
Odor rose up from his body like a volcanic eruption, condensing into a protective barrier with the 
fastest speed possible, and encasing him within.

After the flick of a finger, a loud explosion resounded through the sky. Under the bombardment of 
the heavenly tribulation, the blood-red barrier could not even last for half a breath before it 
completely shattered into nothingness. Duan Wuya, who was within the barrier, was instantly swept 
up into the air and heavily crashed onto the ground.

"Old fellow, how does this water tribulation taste?"

Outside of the Heavenly Road, Tang Huan clicked his tongue, and said with a tone full of ridicule.

Right now, Duan Wuya's appearance was extremely miserable. Not only were his clothes tattered, 
his body was covered in blood, and it looked as if he had just been fished out of a pool of blood.

This was only a superficial wound, and the injuries to his internal organs must be even more severe.

Given his current condition, even if Tang Huan no longer intervened, his chances of surviving the 
heavenly tribulation would be extremely slim.

"Tang Huan, even if I become a ghost, I won't let you off!"



Duan Wuya roared in a low voice, his appearance was that of an evil ghost, and he was extremely 
malevolent and terrifying. He clearly realized that he had no hope of reaching the heavens, and his 
roars were filled with resentment and despair.

"Unfortunately, you don't even have the chance to become a ghost!"

Tang Huan sneered, and the "Nine Yang Divine Furnace" made its move once again. High in the 
sky, the water tribulation appeared once again.

"Bam!"

Duan Wuya hastily threw out a punch, but it no longer contained the might he had before. He was 
sent flying and sent flying by the Heavenly Tribulation.

"Duan Wuya, it's over!"

Outside of Skysplit Tower, everyone was already silent, but these words flashed in their minds at 
almost the same time.

"Ahhhhhhhhh!"

Sure enough, high up in the sky, a mournful scream spread out.

Soon after, within the blue water tornado, a figure exploded like a firework, turning into a cloud of 
bloody mist and disappearing without a trace. After a short moment, the water dragon had already 
melted into the air, and Pang Shuo's Heavenly Road also gradually faded away. In the end, it 
dissipated between the heaven and earth.

In the water tribulation, Duan Wuya had already been killed.

"Hu!"

The cauldron flew backwards, and instantly returned to Tang Huan's Dantian. Seeing Duan Wuya's 
miserable state, he secretly sighed, and couldn't help feeling a little regretful in his heart.

Duan Wuya's strength was already tyrannical to begin with. If he could successfully ascend into the 
sky with the help of the Heaven and Earth dao pearl, he would be able to rapidly rise to greatness 
even in the Heaven Realm where experts were as numerous as the clouds. He wouldn't fall too far 
behind, but it was a pity that the thousand years of cultivation had all gone down the drain.

However, although it was a pity, Tang Huan did not have the slightest bit of sympathy. Duan Wuya 
had brought this upon himself.

"Hmm?"

After a while, Tang Huan calmed himself down and prepared to leave. But just as he was about to 
turn around, his heart suddenly moved, and he looked towards the small piece of space where Duan 
Wuya had exploded into a bloody mist.

"Cosmos Sack?"

Tang Huan's mind shook a little. Duan Wuya still hadn't merged with the "Universe Heavenly Dao 
Bead"?



Fusing with the "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" was indeed beneficial to him, but with Duan Wuya's 
strength, if nothing unexpected happened, then even if he did not fuse with the "Heaven and Earth 
dao pearl", he could still successfully pass through the heavenly tribulation.

After transcending tribulation, it was said that fusing with the Heaven and Earth bead would have a 
much greater effect.

Luckily, Duan Wuya was too confident in himself. If he had merged with the Heaven and Earth 
powers before leaving Skysplit Tower, it would not be so easy to kill him with the help of the 
heavenly tribulation.

"Whoosh!"

With that thought, Tang Huan had already leaped into the air and extended his hand to grab at the 
"Heaven and Earth dao pearl" in the air. In the "Heaven and Earth dao world", one person could 
only obtain one dao pearl. Now that they had left the Tong Tian Tower, there probably wouldn't be 
such a restriction.

"That is …"

"It can't be the Heaven and Earth dao pearl, right?"

"Everything within the heavenly tribulation has been destroyed, and only it is completely intact! 
There's no doubt that it's the Heaven and Earth dao pearl!"

"..."

At the entrance of Skysplit Tower, everyone had also discovered the existence of the white bead. 
After a brief moment of surprise, cries of surprise suddenly filled the air.

Although everyone had never seen the "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" before, they could not help but 
think of it.

It was rumored that Duan Wuya was the third person to obtain the Heaven and Earth Pearl within 
the "Universe Dao World". Currently, Duan Wuya's soul had been shattered by the Heavenly 
Tribulation, and all the items on his body had been turned to dust. However, the pearl was not safe 
and sound.

It was difficult for people to not think of it as the "Heaven and Earth Pearl".

Furthermore, not only was there a "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" that Duan Wuya left behind, Tang 
Huan also had a "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" on his body, and he had even acquired the "Heaven 
and Earth dao pearl" earlier than Duan Wuya. According to the recent news that spread, Tang 
Huan's "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" was also larger than Duan Wuya's pearl.

Instantly, many cultivators' faces flushed red, and even their breathing became hurried. Their eyes 
couldn't help but reveal signs of greed.

"Whoosh!" "Whiz …"

When Tang Huan finally got his wish granted, more than a dozen figures appeared around him. The 
auras emitted from their bodies were extremely tyrannical, and were actually the experts of the Void 
Transformation Stage and the Void Transformation Stage. They all stared at Tang Huan's right palm 
with shining eyes.



Tang Huan flung the "Universal Dao Bead" in his hand, his gaze turned and he was surrounded by 
so many Void Transformation Stage experts. Not only did he not reveal the slightest hint of panic, 
his lips even formed a playful smile: "You want this" Universe Dao Bead ", have all of you made 
the preparations to leave your lives in my hands?"

Chapter 1187. Play well!

Hearing Tang Huan's words, all the surrounding cultivators could not help but be stunned.

What big words from this fellow!

Duan Wuya did die because of him, but did he really think that he could kill Duan Wuya with his 
own strength? The reason he had been able to obtain it earlier was mainly because of the power of 
the heavenly tribulation. Otherwise, even if he was given a hundred guts, he probably wouldn't have 
dared to contend against Duan Wuya!

At the side, a skinny old man laughed out in anger: "A mere seven cycles of Void Transformation 
dares to be so arrogant. This old man has truly experienced it today."

"Everyone, stop wasting time with him. Let's get rid of him first!"

A rough voice sounded. The one who spoke was a Black Costume Brawny Man with a full beard, 
and a sinister smile floated between his brows. The fact that Tang Huan was able to escape Duan 
Wuya's pursuit and was only able to force him to stop her at the exit of the "Snow Profound Realm" 
showed how capable he was in fleeing for his life.

The longer he stayed here, the easier it would be to find him. If he took the chance and tried to find 
him from the "Ancient Clear Heaven Domain," it would be extremely difficult.

"Kill —"

Seemingly the instant Black Costume Brawny Man's voice fell, the skinny elderly man had already 
let out a stern shout and pounced towards Tang Huan. The longsword in his hand danced quickly, 
and waves after waves of incomparably sharp cyan sword beams whistled forth like locusts, 
instantly enveloping an area dozens of meters in radius.

Seeing that, Black Costume Brawny Man and the rest did not want to fall behind, and started to 
attack.

In an instant, the entire area seemed to have been set off a violent storm as the Strength Qi churned 
and surged. The air violently fluctuated, and it seemed as if Tang Huan, who was within it, was 
about to be torn to shreds.

Seeing this scene, a few Void Transformation Stage cultivators that were at the door of Tong Tian 
Tower couldn't help but exclaim.

With so many experts of the Void Transformation Stage and the Void Transformation Stage acting at 
the same time, the area around Tang Huan was completely sealed off by streams of oppressive 
power; Let alone Tang Huan who was only at the seventh circulation, even if he was a strong 
practitioner at the ninth circulation, he would only be able to resist. However, it was almost 
impossible for him to endure such a violent attack.



He had just borrowed the power of the divine tribulation to kill Duan Wuya and acquire the 
"Universe Dao Bead", and was immediately besieged by this kind of attack. Furthermore, it was 
very likely that he would be burnt to ashes in an instant after being besieged.

Without sufficient strength, he had lost his formidable backer, but now that he had such an enviable 
treasure in his possession, no one would be able to survive if he didn't!

Everyone secretly shook their heads as they sighed in their hearts.

The many Void Transformation experts that surrounded Tang Huan high up in the sky, evidently had 
also predicted that something would happen next. Their faces revealed smiles, but right after, their 
eyes flickered as they were pondering how to snatch the "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" from so 
many of their opponents.

However, in the next moment, they were stunned.

Under layer after layer of attacks, not only was Tang Huan not smashed into smithereens by the 
terrifying power, he had even disappeared from the encirclement the moment the attacks landed!

"That little bastard has escaped!"

After being stunned for a short while, the many Void Transformation Stage experts were startled 
and angry at the same time. They all looked around in a blink of an eye and from several hundred 
meters away, Tang Huan's figure once again appeared.

"Over there!"

"Chase!"

"Kill him!"

"..."

Almost without any hesitation, a dozen people shot out.

A cold smile flashed past Tang Huan's eyes as his gaze swept across the group of figures that were 
rushing over. In a flash, the "Myriad Sword Heavenly Diagram" appeared in his palm and with a 
flash, one figure after another appeared between Tang Huan and the group of cultivators.

At this moment, Tang Huan summoned all of the Void Transformation Puppets that had entered the 
"Heaven and Earth dao world".

They had all taken's "Profound Ice Red Lotus" in the first place and experienced the "heavenly 
tribulation of Five Elements" at the third floor of the "Tong Tian Tower" afterwards, so their 
cultivations had already increased by a huge margin. For example, Ji Haitian and the other Tian 
Clan Warriors, after breaking through to the Void Transformation Stage through the "Black Ice Red 
Lotus" and going through the Heavenly Road's trial, their cultivation had already reached the peak 
of the Void Transformation Stage. They were not much weaker than that old Shao Yang.

Not only these two Tian Clan Rankers, even Geng Xu and Chou Rui, who were originally at the 
Seventh Cycle of the Void Transformation, had become Rankers at the Ninth Cycle of the Void 
Transformation.

As for Yin Yu, Yu Zi Chen, and Wang Hao, they were all at the peak of the eighth circulation.



Two of them were at the peak of the Void Transformation Stage, two were at the Void 
Transformation Stage and three were at the peak of the Void Transformation Stage. The instant they 
saw them, the dozen or so cultivators that were at the Void Transformation Stage and the Void 
Transformation Stage all stopped in midair, revealing expressions of shock.

"Everyone, we can have a good time now!"

Tang Huan laughed sinisterly, his figure suddenly disappearing into the sky, as though he was a 
beast that had revealed its sharp fangs yet immediately dived into the darkness, as though he was 
choosing to swallow someone.

At this moment, the dozen or so Void Transformation Stage experts felt an extreme sense of danger 
in their hearts.

"Whoosh!" "Woosh ~ ~ ~"

Ji Haitian and the rest of the seven looked at each other, then brandished their weapons and moved 
at the same time. Numerous terrifying attacks roared forward. At this time, the dozen Void 
Transformation Stage powerhouses did not have much time to think and could only fight with all 
their might. An intense battle broke out in front of Skysplit Tower.

Thunderous rumbles rose and fell one after another. The violent vibrations caused by the violent 
clash of power was actually unable to withstand it any longer. It continuously twisted and changed, 
causing the ice and snow below to be churned up one after another before being instantly melted 
away.

Unknowingly, the thick ice and snow had already disappeared, and the rocks and sand on the 
mountain had been exposed.

Within a range of several thousand meters, only Tong Tian Tower remained unmoving.

Initially, they thought that Tang Huan would definitely die under the siege from earlier. However, 
they didn't expect that not only did he escape from the blockade, he had even summoned seven Void 
Transformation Stage experts with astonishing strength from the scroll like object.

At this time, although almost all of the people in the sky were fighting two against one, none of the 
fellows that Tang Huan had summoned were at a disadvantage.

At this moment, everyone finally understood.

Even though the one who had easily intimidated Nie Zhitong and heavily injured Duan Wuya 
behind Tang Huan was no longer there, some Void Transformation Stage expert still wouldn't be 
able to easily bully him. Duan Wuya had just died. In the current "Heavenly Ancient Region", 
perhaps only Nie Zhitong, who was as famous as him, could suppress Tang Huan.

However, with Duan Wuya's previous experiences, Nie Zhitong would probably not attack Tang 
Huan's "Heaven and Earth Dao Bead" again. Duan Wuya's Heavenly Tribulation had already 
arrived, so her Heavenly Tribulation shouldn't be too far away. If the Heavenly Road suddenly 
appeared while chasing after Tang Huan, she might follow in Duan Wuya's footsteps.

"I wonder where Tang Huan is hiding?"

While everyone was feeling emotional, their gazes started to search high up in the sky. In an instant, 
a shrill scream suddenly echoed out.



Chapter 1188 - Killing two enemies together

"Boom —"

High up in the sky, amidst an earth-shattering ringing sound, the boundless Strength Qi rolled out in 
all directions like a tide.

Under this strong and unusual impact, Ji Haitian, who was at the peak of the Nine Revolutions 
Transcendental Tower, was pushed back more than ten meters. As for the two gray-robed elders 
who were at the Nine Revolutions Transcendental Tower and the blue-robed elder, they were sent 
flying.

However, before they could even stabilize their bodies, a figure suddenly appeared behind the 
elderly man in grey robes. The figure was slender and straight with an extremely handsome face, it 
was Tang Huan.

"Be careful!"

The old man who was standing next to them caught sight of a figure that almost appeared out of 
thin air. But before he finished speaking, the Fire Red Long Spear in Tang Huan's hands pierced 
forward.

"Chi!"

A sharp sound pierced through the air.

The speed of the spear seemed rather slow, but the trajectory of the spear was clearly visible, as 
though under the spear, the space of a few meters was instantly reduced to less than three meters. 
With just a simple thrust, the spear tip landed on the back of the gray-robed elder.

"Spear Extreme!"

The power that was mixed with the burning heat exploded out like raging waves, overwhelming the 
world. It was extremely terrifying.

The gray-robed warrior's face changed dramatically.

He did not expect the attack behind him to be so quick. Almost at the same time he felt the 
sharpness and blazing heat, his body felt as if it had been heavily struck. Immediately after, he felt 
as if a burning red sharp thorn had instantly pierced through his back.

"Hu!"

An indescribable pain gushed out from the depths of his soul, causing him to uncontrollably scream 
out in pain. He circulated his true essence with all his might to his back, but his body had already 
been uncontrollably sent flying forward.

The spear that came from behind him had severely injured him, and even the Dantian "Void Spirit" 
had almost collapsed. Fortunately, he had managed to preserve his life.

However, before he even had the chance to enjoy the joy of surviving a calamity, his expression 
became even uglier, and his eyes revealed panic and even despair.

This was because Ji Haitian had once again brandished the exquisite golden staff in his hand.



"Save …"

The grey-robed elder could no longer suppress the fear of death, and hysterically roared out loud. 
However, before he could even utter the word "life", his body had already been completely covered 
by the golden wave that rolled over in front of him. He was like a sharp blade cutting into countless 
tiny pieces, and only one weapon was left as it began to fall.

A dignified expert of the Nine Revolutions Transcendental Tower would be scared out of his wits at 
this point.

At this time, the old man in blue who had fought against Ji Haitian had only just stabilized his body. 
He was too late to save him.

Seeing this terrifying scene, the blue-clothed old man immediately felt a great sense of fear flood 
his heart. His face instantly turned pale, and even his soul began to tremble uncontrollably.

After a moment, the blue clothed elderly man seemed to have thought of something and looked 
around anxiously. The intense battle was going on around them, but Tang Huan, who had just 
launched a sneak attack, had once again disappeared without a trace, as if he had never appeared.

Suddenly, the fear in his heart grew even stronger, and he had the urge to retreat.

The "Heaven and Earth dao pearl" was indeed very precious, it had an unparalleled enticing power, 
but that was under the condition that Tang Huan's own strength was insufficient.

Now, not only did Tang Huan possess seven extremely powerful helpers, he had even revealed a 
mysterious sneak attack. As a result, the enticement of the "Heaven and Earth Pearl" was extremely 
fatal, if he lost his life like that person just now, it would not be worth it.

"Whoosh!"

The thought of escaping immediately became action. With a flick of his finger, the blue-clothed old 
man turned around and flew away. He seemed to have used some sort of sacred art and his speed 
was extremely fast.

However, after a short moment, his eyes were wide open.

Within his line of sight, the familiar figure once again appeared out of nowhere. Along with the 
figure, there was also a flash of red light — dazzling, sharp, and scorching.

It was the Fire Red Long Spear that had heavily injured the gray-robed elder earlier!

"Tang Huan!"

The blue clothed old man gasped in shock, forcefully stopping his charge, thus he did not directly 
collide with the Fire Red Long Spear.

However, even though he did not charge forward, the long spear was still thrusting towards him 
with an unstoppable force. It seemed extremely slow, but by the time he had reacted to it, the sharp 
point of the spear had already pressed against his chest.

"You want to leave without taking your life with you?"

When the cold laughter entered his ears, the blue clothed elderly man's face was immediately filled 
with shock. He had personally witnessed how the grey robed elderly man's soul was scattered under 
Tang Huan's sneak attack.



Am I going to follow in that person's footsteps?

The blue-clothed old man let out a beast-like roar. At the same time that he explosively retreated, a 
dark blue intent surged out from his chest. With a force that could topple mountains and overturn 
seas, it smashed towards the fiery red spear tip.

However, he was still a bit slow. Almost at the same instant he circulated the true essence within his 
body, a terrifying force erupted from the tip of the spear.

"Bam!"

As if he had been struck by a meteorite falling from the sky, the blue-clothed old man let out a 
painful groan. His body soared through the clouds as he flew backwards like he was riding on a 
cloud.

Under normal circumstances, this kind of injury would not be fatal for a Void Transformation Stage 
powerhouse. As long as they had enough time, their destroyed flesh and internal organs could be 
reborn. If there was no other way, they could use their hollow spirits to possess.

However, in this situation, it was more or less clear what would happen to him. Ji Haitian's attack 
was already whistling towards him from behind.

"Hu!"

In a split-second, the golden tide had already surged forth, following the movements of the staff in 
Ji Haitian's hand. The blue-robed old man had nowhere to run, so he was immediately covered.

Immediately after, the blue-clothed old man's body was torn apart by the golden wave without any 
suspense. Then, it turned into fine powder, and disappeared into thin air along with the golden 
wave.

Yet another expert at the Void Transformation Stage had vanished like smoke in thin air!

However, this guy had left behind more things. Other than the weapon that fell to the ground, there 
was also a small jade pendant. That should be a spatial artifact.

"Only two, and twelve!"

Tang Huan's body moved, and grabbed the jade pendant, after that, his eyes flashed with a cold 
killing intent, and in the next moment, his figure melted into the air, without any trace, as though he 
had never appeared.

The expression in Ji Haitian's eyes changed slightly. Immediately, he dashed towards a Void 
Transformation Stage expert that was hundreds of meters away.

After capturing the scene just now, the entrance to Skysplit Tower fell into a deathly silence.

The shock in everyone's heart could not be described with words. Two experts at the Void 
Transformation Stage Nine Revolutions, under the sneak attack from Tang Huan at the Void 
Transformation Stage Seven Transformations, were actually killed so easily?

Chapter 1189 - Willing to Be a Servant!

High up in the sky, the remaining dozen or so Void Transformation Stage experts also sensed the 
scene that just occurred and were extremely shocked.



With such a profound concealment technique, coupled with the attacks from his comrades, Tang 
Huan was basically unable to gain any advantage.

In just a short span of one or two breaths, two experts of the Void Transformation Stage had already 
died.

Next, if Tang Huan were to continue his attack, how could these disciples who were also in the Nine 
Revolutions Transcendental Tower, and especially those who were in the Eight Revolutions 
Transcendental Tower, possibly survive?

In a split-second, the expressions of the dozen Void Transformation Stage experts changed 
drastically. Everyone was in danger.

Many people had already started to retreat in their hearts, and they were even beginning to take 
action. However, in such a situation, it was not as if they could retreat just because they wanted to. 
Geng Xu, Chou Rui and the others seemed to have gone crazy. They didn't care about life and death 
at all, dragging them into this area with their lives.

Tang Huan's concealment once again caused them to be fearful, fearful, and apprehensive. In 
addition to the enemy's desperate attacks, although they had the advantage in numbers, they had 
already displayed a very obvious weakness.

What made things worse was that after the two Nine Revolutions of his comrades turned into ashes, 
their opponent at the peak of the Nine Revolutions also changed his target. The skinny old man who 
was the first to be targeted by it was scared out of his wits, his face full of fear.

At that instant, not only did the skinny old man push his pressure to the limit, he even used a 
protective skill on himself. The alertness in his heart rose to the limit.

The Black Costume Brawny Man at the side did not dare to be negligent, he crazily waved the huge 
blade in his hand, and streams of black light shot out, cutting a dozen meters wide space apart, 
including himself, in preparation for a sneak attack.

Unfortunately, this was useless.

With the addition of Ji Haitian, a short while later, the skinny old man and Black Costume Brawny 
Man were forced to retreat by the two experts of Tian Clan who were at the peak of the Void 
Transformation Stage.

Not long later, a painful scream came out from Black Costume Brawny Man's mouth.

Tang Huan's first opponent was not the skinny old man, but the Black Costume Brawny Man. At his 
side, Tang Huan showed up without any warning, and as if he was Xu Zhen, he quickly thrust the 
"Hundred Lava Flaming Spear" in his hands, his terrifyingly sharp intent directly piercing through 
the void.

At this moment, the Black Costume Brawny Man had just been forced back.

Before he could withstand the impact, he had no time to react, thus, in the next moment, he 
followed the footsteps of the two previous Void Transformation Stage powerhouses. He was 
seriously injured by a single spear attack, and was then enveloped by the spells of the Tian Clan 
Ranker.



Its majestic body was reduced to fine powder, leaving only its gigantic blade lying on the Heavenly 
Horse Snow Mountain.

The skinny old man was frightened out of his wits. He was anxious like a frightened bird. While 
defending against the magical attack launched by Ji Haitian, he was trying his best to escape from 
this world.

He was already weaker than Ji Haitian to begin with, and the more he acted this way, the more 
danger he would face.

If he had been able to calm down, he might have been able to hold on for a while longer. Especially 
when he saw the Tian Clan Ranker who had killed the Black Costume Brawny Man approaching 
him, he could not help but run away without a care.

This accelerated his death.

There was even no need for Tang Huan to launch a surprise attack. A moment later, Ji Haitian and 
the others' magic attacks had already engulfed this expert of the Nine Revolutions Transcendental 
Tower.

"Four!" "Only eight are left!"

At the entrance of Skysplit Tower, those Void Transformation Stage cultivators that were watching 
the battle finally recovered from their extreme shock. They exchanged glances and could see the 
deep fear in each other's eyes.

In a short span of time, of the fourteen Void Transformation Stage cultivators that surrounded Tang 
Huan, the four strongest had already fallen.

If nothing unexpected happened, the remaining ten would definitely be doomed.

Looking at the terrified expressions of the ten Void Transformation Stage experts in the sky, 
everyone was extremely glad. Fortunately, they had forcefully restrained their greed and had not 
followed them to join in the fun. Otherwise, they would be just like them, worried about their own 
lives.

"Tang Huan..."

Behind the crowd of spectators, a purple figure quietly appeared. It was Nie Zhitong, who was on 
par with Duan Wuya. In the third floor of the Tong Tian Tower's Heavenly Road, the heavenly 
tribulation from the Five Elements caused her entire person to age, and her current appearance was 
a lot younger than before.

Two pairs of eyes swept across the sky. Within Nie Zhitong's line of sight, Tang Huan's figure 
suddenly appeared.

"Chi!"

With a sharp piercing sound, a red light flashed and a cultivator that was at the eighth circulation 
didn't even have time to groan before his body exploded into a cloud of blood mist.

Hundreds of metres above, Tang Huan seemed to have sensed something. Looking down, he saw a 
purple shadow quietly flying away at the entrance of Tong Tian Tower.

"Nie Zhitong!"



Tang Huan squinted his eyes as he sneered in his heart. Then, he activated Yin and Yang Void 
Method once again as he blended into the air.

There was almost no suspense in the following battle.

Deafening collisions, hysterical curses, and shrill, shrill screams resounded in the air as the number 
of Void Transformation Stage experts continued to decrease.

It did not take long before only three people remained. They were all at the Void Transformation 
Stage, but compared to the four powerhouses who were at the Void Transformation Stage, they were 
slightly weaker.

They could only watch helplessly as the Void Transformation Stage powerhouses perished one by 
one beside them. Their eyes were filled with despair as the feeling of death approaching made them 
feel as if their minds were about to collapse.

"I'm not fighting anymore!" I'm not fighting anymore! "

A fat yellow robed old man suddenly threw away the sword in his hand and screamed, "Tang Huan, 
I surrender! If you are willing to spare my life, I am willing to be your servant." With that, the elder 
in yellow closed his eyes and completely ignored the surrounding attacks.

"Tang Huan, I am also willing to be your servant!"

When the white-clothed middle-aged man and the gold robed old man noticed the pause in their 
attacks, they immediately seemed to wake up from their stupor. A hint of hope involuntarily flashed 
through their eyes, and then, just like the yellow-clothed old man, they simultaneously threw away 
their weapons, as if they had been captured.

"Ji Haitian, seal their hollow spirits!" Behind the yellow robed elder, Tang Huan suddenly appeared, 
her eyes flashing, as she shouted.

"Yes sir!"

The magical attack unleashed by the staff in Ji Haitian's hand vanished in a flash. Then, like a bolt 
of lightning, he appeared in front of the yellow-clothed old man.

As expected, the elder in yellow did not resist, allowing Ji Haitian's palm to land on his Dantian. 
The hollow spirit was sealed and his true energy was restrained. His body then sank down, only to 
be caught by Geng Xun. Ji Haitian appeared before the white robed middle-aged man and the 
golden-robed elder one after another, doing the same thing.

Although they were completely restrained, the three of them secretly heaved a sigh of relief.

However, their eyes soon revealed signs of nervousness, but they quickly calmed down. Since Tang 
Huan did not kill them now, it meant that their lives were saved. As for what would happen next, 
there was no need to worry about it anymore. No matter how bad it was, it was better than losing 
their lives.

It was true that he had been on the train for the whole day, but he had finally reached home. He 
thought that the next one would be around 11 pm, and he would be back to normal tomorrow.

Chapter 1190 - Exposure



The fierce battle in front of Skysplit Tower had finally ended with the surrender of the three Void 
Transformation Stage cultivators.

After the battle, no one knew what would happen to the three Void Transformation Stage 
cultivators, nor did they know where Tang Huan and his companions had gone to. However, as they 
left, the effects of the great battle continued to ferment in the Ancient Regions.

"... Fortunately, they did not take action at that time! "

On the island in the center of the lake, among the mountains in the eastern part of the Realm of 
Ancient Clear Heaven, Nie Zhitong sighed in relief.

After a while, she could not help but shake her head in regret. "That old fellow Duan Wuya is such 
a waste. He actually died in the midst of heavenly tribulation because of Tang Huan."

When they came out of Tong Tian Tower, Duan Wuya had already failed in his tribulation. She 
could only see the scene of Tang Huan attacking the Void Transformation cultivators in the sky.

After thinking about it for a long time, she finally stopped her greed and did not attack Tang Huan.

The reason he chose to leave this place was not because of the extremely terrifying white-clothed 
woman, but because he was thinking about the long time he had spent in the "Wind Fire Thunder 
Realm" to chase down and kill Tang Huan. Tang Huan's method of escape was simply too strong, 
she was not completely confident that she could make Tang Huan stay behind.

Fortunately, this was the case. If Tang Huan were to escape after taking action, it would be her turn 
to worry.

High up in the sky, the Heavenly Road had already appeared.

… ….

"Tsk tsk, his death was not worth it!" If Duan Wuya knew that he would end up like that, he 
probably wouldn't have provoked that Tang Huan no matter what. "

"People die for money!" It's no wonder that Duan Wuya was moved. The temptation of the Heaven 
and Earth Pearl is too great! "

"Who would've thought that a mere Void Transformation Stage cultivator would be able to interfere 
with Patriarch Wuya's tribulation! Sigh, that Tang Huan is too strong! Oh right, I heard that Tang 
Huan used a 'Dao Artifact' back then? It shouldn't be possible, but it's said that the device is a 
weapon that would only appear in the Heaven Realm. "

"..."

… … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … … 

… … … … … … … ….

"Tang Huan..."

In the south of Skypiercing City, in a wooden building, a young man in snow-white clothes was 
frowning slightly. In the south of Skypiercing City, in a wooden building, a young man in snow-
white clothes was frowning slightly.

The person he drew was Tang Huan, his figure and appearance was exactly the same.



After pausing for a moment, his finger once again quickly moved up Tang Huan's shoulder. In a 
short span of time, he changed into nine different types of pigments, and on Tang Huan's right 
shoulder, appeared a brightly-colored little bird of nine colors.

Satisfied, the young man nodded his head. With a thought, a scroll appeared in his hand and slowly 
unfurled. Inside was also a portrait of a man in black robes.

There was also a small bird squatting on the shoulder of the man in black. Its body was as black as 
ink.

After comparing the two portraits for a moment, the young man's face finally revealed a wisp of a 
smile of understanding as he lightly muttered, "So that's how it is."

Immediately, he raised his eyes to look at the thin Black Costume Old Man and smiled: "Elder 
Hong, have you found something?"

Black Costume Old Man's gaze had already wandered back and forth between the drawings, 
"Although these two birds are of different colors, they look extremely similar to each other, and 
these two … "Their figures are extremely similar as well …" After a moment, he was slightly 
shocked, "Could it be that the person who barged into the 'Sword Illusion Paradise' is Tang Huan?"

"It's pretty close!" The white clothed man said with a smile.

"This is too hateful!" The anger between the brows of the Black Costume Old Man surfaced, "Elder 
Xu, I will return to the Ling Xiao Sword Sect and report this matter to the sect master."

"..."

… ….

Tang Huan did not know that his identity in the Primordius Sect had been exposed.

Of course, even if he knew, Tang Huan wouldn't mind.

He knew very well that his disguise could only be concealed for a short period of time, and it was 
impossible for him to hide it for an entire lifetime. If the "Ling Xiao Sword Sect" were to inspect 
carefully, he would definitely find some clues. Whether it was the weapons that he used in the 
Hunyuan Sect or the existence of the nine spirits, both of them could potentially lead to his identity 
being exposed.

Once it was exposed, they would definitely face Ling Xiao Sword Sect's revenge. However, if the 
Ling Xiao Sword Sect wanted to connect these clues with him, it would definitely take a long time.

By the time it was exposed, his strength would definitely be incomparable to his strength from the 
past. Just like now, he had long since broken through to the Seventh Cycle of Void Transformation, 
and his true strength had far surpassed his cultivation level. Even experts like Duan Wuya and Nie 
Zhitong couldn't do anything to him, so how could he be afraid of those Void Transformation Stage 
cultivators from the Ling Xiao Sword Sect?

At this moment, in a mountain range in the southern part of the ancient region, Tang Huan was 
standing in front of a cave.



This cave was incredibly huge. It was a hundred meters tall and ten meters wide, forming a circular 
arch. Although the stone wall at the entrance of the cave was mottled, it was obvious that there were 
still traces of being excavated.

inside the cave, white-colored odor surged and surged, an incomparably terrifying energy aura 
whizzed out from within, and the space several hundred meters outside the cave violently fluctuated 
without end. Because of this, this area was filled with a terrifying pressure. Ordinary Void 
Transformation Stage cultivators simply could not get close to it.

This was the "Ancient Celestial King Cave".

After that battle, Tang Huan planted a "Puppet Soul Seal" in the souls of the three Nine Revolving 
Cultivators, and then proceeded south without stopping. As for the three puppets that he had just 
received, as well as Ji Haitian, Geng Xi, Chou Rui, and the other Void Transformation experts, they 
were all sent by Tang Huan to search for Natural Divine Stone s.

He still had five Sacred Ranked Divine Armament s and would need a large number of precious 
Divine Level Stone to forge them.

In front of Tong Tian Tower, after killing those Void Transformation Stage experts, Tang Huan 
obtained four dimensional equipment, and found a portion of suitable Natural Divine Stone s. He 
could also gather a portion of the remaining Divine Level Stone s from the inside, so he could only 
leave the rest to Ji Haitian and Geng Xu.

As for Tang Huan, he would probably stay here for the rest of the time.

Using his "Nine Yang Divine Furnace" and the Dantian hollow spirit to their limits, Tang Huan 
activated his primeval essence, forcefully shouldering the boundless pressure, and walked to around 
ten meters away from the cave. With his current strength, he could only advance a few more meters 
at most. It would be impossible for him to enter the cave filled with power.

Even experts like Duan Wuya and Nie Zhitong would find it difficult to enter the cave.

As for whether Hu Si was able to do it, Tang Huan didn't dare to. After all, Hu Si's strength was 
much stronger than Duan Wuya's and Nie Zhitong's. Amongst all the Rankers that knew, other than 
the Yan Zu who possessed unparalleled strength, Hu Si was the strongest.

Being in front of the cave at such a close distance, the white-colored odor that was condensed from 
energy seemed like a monstrous wave that was about to descend from the sky and strike at one's 
soul.

Tang Huan secretly took a deep breath, he calmed his mind and released the tyrannical power of 
sucking from his body.
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