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Chapter 2111 - 85!

"The appearance of the Emperor Board?"

In a quiet and elegant valley in the encampment of the Northern Dipper Immortal Sect, a confused 
voice sounded out in the hall covered by trees, "Is a new Heavenly Emperor on the leaderboard, or 
is there someone on the leaderboard …"

"Tang Huan?"

After a moment, the muttering turned into a soft cry.

Within the palace, the white-colored odor that was churning rapidly like mist withdrew. In the next 
moment, a slim and graceful figure appeared. It was a woman in white with an extremely beautiful 
face.

It was none other than the Sect Leader of the Northern Dipper Immortal Sect, Zhuo Qinglan.

At the moment, her face was extremely gloomy, she never expected that the Heavenly Emperor who 
appeared on the Emperor Board this time, would actually be the Tang Huan that she hated to the 
extreme.

The things that had happened back then, regardless of whether it was to the people from the Beitang 
Immortal Sect or to her, was an enormous humiliation.

Only a powerful expert like her knew in her heart that the Northern Dipper Immortal Sect had not 
only lost the "Divine Moon Crystal Soul", there was also the "Yan Luo Golden Immortal". And the 
role of the "Yan Luo Golden Immortal" was even more important than the "Divine Moon Crystal 
Soul".

The Northern Dipper Immortal Sect was extremely lucky to have obtained the Spirit Moon Crystal 
Soul and the Yan Luo Golden Immortal.

He had wanted to be able to

"Heavenly Moon Golden Immortal" was repaired, he did not expect to fail to steal a chicken and eat 
it, even the "Heavenly Moon Crystal Soul" and the "Heavenly Moon Golden Immortal" were all 
taken care of by Tang Huan … The most hateful thing was that even though they knew where Tang 
Huan was, the Northern Dipper Immortal Sect still could not do anything to him.

It had already been more than ten years, and the "Divine Moon Crystal" had probably been refined 
to a large extent already. The "Heavenly Moon Golden Immortal" had definitely been completely 
repaired and reorganized by Tang Huan as well, and there was a possibility that she might have 
already broken through the mysteries of the "Heavenly Moon Golden Immortal". When she thought 
of this, the hatred in her heart deepened.

After the Grand Elder Black Cicada had returned without any success, even though the Northern 
Dipper Immortal Sect did not make a move against Tang Huan, they had been paying close attention 
to the Nine Palace Peak's movements.

As long as Tang Huan dared to leave the Nine Palace Peak, it would not be difficult for him to find 
an opportunity to strike. The existence of Qin Hongye was indeed cause for concern. However, the 



Northern Dipper Immortal Sect did not need to openly attack Tang Huan, they only needed to 
secretly kill him.

It would be the best if he could take back the Yan Luo Golden Immortal.

However, all these years, she had not been waiting for news of Tang Huan stepping out of the Nine 
Palace Peak, and instead, saw Tang Huan's name on the Emperor List that suddenly appeared.

The one hundred people on the Emperor Board were all Upper Sky Emperors.

Zhuo Qinglan himself, who had already reached the peak of the Upper Sky Realm, was ranked 
seventh on the Emperor Board.

That Tang Huan had only been in the Heaven Realm for more than ten years. Even taking into 
account the time he spent in the middle Heaven Realm to go to the Heaven Realm, it was only about 
twenty years.

In just that amount of time, Tang Huan had advanced from the lower level Sky Emperor to the 
upper level Sky Emperor?

"Impossible!" "Impossible!"

As soon as this thought flashed across his mind, Zhuo Qinglan shook her head in disbelief, "How 
can someone use such a short period of time to advance from a lower level Heavenly Emperor to a 
upper level Sky Emperor? There is a possibility of advancing from the lower level to middle level 
Sky Emperor, but how can a middle level Sky Emperor get on the God Rankings? "

"What the hell is going on?"

"..."

… ….

"Huh?"

At the Pangu Heaven Sect encampment, a quiet voice suddenly rang out from within the inside the 
cave.

The middle-aged man sitting cross-legged in the cave suddenly opened his eyes. He was stunned for 
a moment, but his eyes revealed an unconcealable shock and astonishment.

This middle-aged man was none other than the sect head of the Pangu Heavenly Sect, Pan Lie.

"Tang Huan?"

Pan Lie frowned. "Why is it him?"

On the Emperor Board, all of them were Upper Sky Emperors.

Those ranked at the top had even reached the peak of the Upper Realm, while Tang Huan was only 
an Inferior Sky Emperor more than ten years ago. No matter how fast his cultivation speed was, it 
shouldn't be to this extent, right? In such a short amount of time, it was already quite good for him 
to advance to a God Emperor with the help of the Northern Dipper Immortal Sect's Spirit Moon 
Crystal Soul.

Could it be that he was ranked on the Emperor Board with the cultivation of a God Emperor?



Just as this thought surfaced in Pan Lie's mind, he could not help but laugh. This was impossible! 
From ancient times until now, there had not been a single God Emperor that had managed to reach 
the Emperor Board!

If that wasn't the reason, then what was it?

"Someone, come!" While he was thinking, Pan Lie suddenly shouted.

"Here!" From outside the cave, a reply immediately came, "Sect Leader, what orders do you have?"

"Summoning people to quickly investigate the situation of the Crimson Sky Kingdom's Nine Palace 
Peak."

"Yes sir!"

"..."

… ….

At almost the same time, all the Celestial Emperors of the various sects in the upper nine heavens 
felt the changes on the Emperor Board.

Ranking, eighty-fifth place, Tang Huan!

Many Heavenly Emperors were familiar with this name that suddenly appeared on the Emperor 
Board.

More than twenty years ago, Tang Huan had suddenly entered the King Board, and she had even 
reached the top, causing this name to spread far and wide for nine days. Five years later, when Tang 
Huan had advanced to the lower Heavenly Emperor Stage, her name had disappeared from the King 
Board, causing countless cultivators to sigh in amazement at her speed of cultivation.

Some of the changes that had occurred more than ten years ago due to the "crystal body of the 
divine moon" had spread further. In all of the first nine days, there were very few cultivators who 
didn't know of this name.

However, his appearance on the Emperor Board at this moment was incomparably shocking.

Back then, the lower Sky Emperor, after disappearing for more than ten years, was actually able to 
be ranked on the Emperor Board, surpassing more than ten upper level Sky Emperors, and was even 
ranked eighty-fifth on the Emperor Board.

All of a sudden, many of the Celestial Emperors were thinking about the reason. However, even 
after racking their brains, they were still unable to come up with an answer.

"A God Emperor."

However, deep in her beautiful eyes, there was still a hint of surprise remaining. She praised, "With 
the cultivation of a middle level Heavenly Emperor, I'm afraid that for the past nine days, only this 
little brother Tang Huan has been on the Emperor Board."

At the end, Liu Li could not help but feel somewhat regretful.

Before Tang Huan, practically all of the Heavenly Emperors needed to break through to the 
Sovereign Realm in order to be able to enter the Emperor Board. Today, Tang Huan could be said to 
have set a precedent.



For example, in the years to come, the probability of this happening would be very slim.

The reason why Tang Huan was able to do this was because she knew clearly that her powerful 
main body and Immortal Body doppelgänger had allowed Tang Huan to possess a strength that far 
exceeded her cultivation. This was something that other Heavenly Emperors could not compare to, 
and just the fact that she had a pure Immortal Body doppelganger was not possible.

"Haha, it's big brother Tang Huan."

In another hall on the mountainside, after a short moment of shock, the nine spirits and Xiao Budian 
both started dancing with joy and cheered out loud. Beside the two of them, Ling Tian, who had just 
become a lower level Heavenly Emperor, remained seated with his eyes closed. However, his 
slightly twitching eyebrows were an indication of the fluctuations in his emotions. As a new lower 
level Heavenly Emperor, he could clearly feel the change in his emotions.

Chapter 2112 - Clear Void Dao Pavilion

Not long after, the aura of the Heavenly Dao had disappeared and everything was back to normal.

"I've finally broken through."

At the waist of the nine palace peaks, Tang Huan let out a light breath, and slowly opened her eyes, 
revealing a relaxed smile on her face. At this moment, the "Divine Moon Crystal Spirit" in his palm 
had completely disappeared. If the other Celestial Emperors were to hear his words, they would 
probably be so angry that they would vomit blood.

So many middle level Heavenly Emperors and even upper level Heavenly Emperors were not 
related to the Emperor Leaderboard, he had just advanced to a middle level Heavenly Emperor, yet 
he was already ranked 85th on the Emperor Leaderboard, but he was only ranked 'not bad'. How 
could the other Heavenly Emperors, especially those that had been bitterly cultivating not entered 
the Emperor Leaderboard, endure?

However, in Tang Huan's eyes, this ranking was indeed not considered very high.

In addition, Tang Huan did not really care about the ranking of the Emperor Board, even if she 
wanted to get first place, for him, that was it.

After all, the ranking was an estimate of the Heavenly Dao. It could only be used as a reference, and 
it couldn't completely represent one's strength.

Liu Li, who was ranked lower on the Honor Ranking, was able to defeat the higher ranked black 
cicada due to this principle.

Tang Huan also believed that for him, who had the Immortal Body clone, the "Primal Chaos Daos 
Fire" and many other treasures, the true strength of she definitely wasn't ranked eighty-fifth on the 
Emperor Board.

"After staying in the Nine Palace Mountain for so long, it's about time I went out and took a walk." 
Tang Huan laughed lightly, stood up, and walked out of palace with leisure.

"You're leaving?"

After a while, inside the palace on the summit, Liu Li looked at Tang Huan who had just come in 
with some surprise. It was obvious that he did not expect him to come to bid his farewell.



"Yeah, Sister Liu Li, I'm going to the 'Flying Star' for a trip." Tang Huan nodded and smiled.

"The Starry Sky is in the westernmost part of the last nine days." Liu Li said doubtfully, "For you to 
suddenly think of that place, it must not be an impulsive action."

"That's right." Tang Huan nodded, she did not hide anything and slowly revealed her own situation.

"So that's how it is."

Liu Li suddenly realized something, and her expression turned serious. "Little brother Tang Huan, 
the Clear Void Dao Pavilion in the Meteor sky, is also a super sect that goes up to the ninth heaven, 
and is even the strongest super sect. The experts that are ranked first on the revered list and third on 
the revered list are all Supreme Elders of the Clear Void Dao Pavilion."

"I've heard of the cultivation method that you want."

"It is said that it is the secret scripture of the Clear Void Dao Pavilion. As an external cultivator, 
even if you joined the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, no matter how talented and talented you are, it 
would be impossible to be imparted to you. At the very least, it would be impossible in a short 
period of time."

"I thought of that too."

Tang Huan frowned slightly, but immediately calmed down, "It is said that only the Pavilion Master 
s who have been to the 'Clear Void Dao Pavilion' can be taught such a technique. However, there are 
also exceptions. In the history of the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, there have been very few disciples 
and elders who have contributed greatly to the sect.

Liu Li shook her head and said, "Those disciples and elders that you mentioned were all chosen by 
the Pavilion Master. In the end, they all became Pavilion Master s of the 'Clear Void Dao Pavilion'."

"Huh?"

Tang Huan couldn't help but freeze for a moment upon hearing this. Her understanding of the "Clear 
Void Dao Pavilion" came partly from Pan Ji, partly from Mo Wuyun and the rest. The former's 
memories were far too distant, but the latter's memories came mostly from hearsay and were not 
very accurate.

If Liu Li had not mentioned it, he would not have known that those people had all ascended to the 
Pavilion Master's throne of the "Clear Void Dao Pavilion".

After a moment of silence, Tang Huan's expression became determined again: "Sister Liu Li, no 
matter what, I have to give it a try. "Other than the method used by the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, I 
can't think of any other way for me to use my own blood to find traces of my mother."

"Indeed."

Liu Li frowned slightly and felt a headache coming on. "Even if your mother was still in the lower 
realms, she would be able to sense the cultivation method of the Clear Void Dao Pavilion."

Saying this, Liu Li could not help but shake her head regretfully, "Unfortunately, that kind of 
cultivation technique can only be investigated after you train in it yourself. Otherwise, I could ask 
Qin Xian Ye to help introduce the Supreme Elder of the 'Clear Void Dao Pavilion' to them and have 
them help investigate your mother's whereabouts."



"Elder Sister Liu Li, there's no need to think too much into it."

Hearing this, Tang Huan couldn't help but smile, "There's always a path before a car arrives. When a 
boat arrives at the bridge, naturally it will be straight. Nine spirit, Xiao Budian and Ling Tian, the 
three little fellows, I plan to have them stay at the Nine Palace Mountain, I will have to trouble Big 
Sis to take care of them for me. "

"Forget it."

After a moment of thought, Liu Li lightly nodded and said, "Since you insist on going, then I won't 
try to persuade you anymore. Fortunately, with your current cultivation, even a peak stage Heavenly 
Emperor would not be able to do anything to you. As for the other Empyreans, they would not dare 
to touch you so brazenly if they were to fear Sky Sovereign Qin Xian … "

"So, as long as you are careful, there shouldn't be any danger."

After a slight pause, Liu Li warned again, "However, this matter cannot be forced. The Black 
Cicada, Pan Zhou, and the other Empyreans would care for the Qin Immortal, Ye Tian Zun, but the 
two from the Clear Void Dao Pavilion might not. If that doesn't work out, then you should come 
back to the Nine Palace Peak first.

"I understand." Tang Huan laughed.

"Take these three leaves first. If you really encounter an Empyrean attacking you, you can still 
avoid them. There's nothing you can do about it." While speaking, Liu Li lightly waved her right 
hand and three leaves that were green and white appeared in front of Tang Huan in succession.

"Thank you, Sister Liu Li."

"..."

After around ten days, Tang Huan quietly left the Nine Palace Peak.

Mo Hanyun, Hua Tian Chi, and Tang Huan were going together. After all, if it was inconvenient for 
Tang Huan to show her face, he could leave some things to them. As for the nine spirits, Xiao 
Budian and Ling Tian, they were all kept at the Nine Palace Mountain by Tang Huan. Because of 
this, the three little fellows and Tang Huan had an awkward time.

This time, other than the few of them, Tang Huan did not disturb anyone else.

Even the group of maids and servants who had returned long ago, as well as the group of servants at 
the Nine Palace Peak, did not know that Tang Huan had already disappeared from the mountain. 
The reason why Tang Huan did this, was also to be safe. If one less person knew where he was, 
there would be less risk of him being exposed.

Tang Huan had long known from Liu Li that in these past few years, there had always been a lot of 
people secretly observing the Nine Palace Peak.

Regarding this, Tang Huan naturally had to be prepared.

As a result, Tang Huan unleashed her "Heavenly Invisibility" and "Void Escape" ability almost at 
the same time the moment she left the Nine Palace Peak. In an instant, she was already several tens 
of thousands of kilometers away.

Chapter 2113 - Star City



Different from the other super sects that occupied the most central area of Heaven Realm, the Clear 
Void Dao Pavilion was not located in the central area of the Flying Star Pavilion. It was located at 
the northeastern border of the Heaven Realm.

The ancient transfer array of the Flying Star Tribe was located in the center of the Flying Star 
Palace.

If the cultivators that arrived at the Flying Star Pavilion through the ancient transfer array wanted to 
go to the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, they would have to travel across half of the sky.

Of course, for cultivators of the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, there was no need to go through so much 
trouble.

Not far from the ancient transfer array, there was a transfer array that connected directly to the Clear 
Void Dao Pavilion. However, that transfer array must belong to the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, and 
only the cultivators of the sect or outsiders who had obtained permission to use it would be able to 
use it.

The place that possessed the Great Teleportation Array exclusive to the Clear Void Dao Pavilion 
was called Star City. It was the number two city in the entire Flying Heaven City.

It was said that while the Immortal World was still around, Star City was a vassal city of the 
Immortal World's great "Star Fantasy Immortal Sect". After the Immortal World collapsed and 
morphed into the current Heaven Realm, the Star Fantasy Immortal Sect turned into ashes, and the 
Star Fantasy Immortal Sect vanished. However, this Star Fantasy City didn't disappear along with it, 
but continued to exist until today.

Right now, Star City was a ownerless city. It was in a state of chaos, with countless battles 
happening every day.

Over the course of a year, countless cultivators had their souls destroyed.

Even so, the cultivators of the Flying Star Realm would often gather here. This was because it was 
the location of the ancient teleportation formation, and also because it was the central city of the 
Heaven Realm. In Star Fantasy City, the cultivators of the various sects could communicate with 
each other, and they would often find what they needed the most.

Most importantly, according to the legends, this area contained the countless treasures left behind 
by the "Star Fantasy Immortal Sect."

One could imagine just how enticing the treasures of a great sect were. This also led to countless 
cultivators coming here every year with the intention of searching for the Star Illusion Relic. 
Although all of the cultivators with this goal all had to leave with regret in their hearts, there were 
still a lot of cultivators that rushed over.

South of Star Illusion City, Starlight Guest House.

Not only was it the largest inn in Star Fantasy City, it also dealt in a type of part-time business, 
which was the house trade in Star Fantasy City. If they wanted to sell it, they would hand it over to 
the Starlight Guest House for sale. If they wanted to buy it, they would most likely find a suitable 
room source at the Starlight Guest House.

Starlight Guest House was used as an intermediary to earn a lot of money from the transaction.



In Star City, there were countless people who wanted to sell their houses because they were leaving 
for good every day, and there were also countless people who wanted to stay here for a long time …

Although cultivators could easily find a place to sit for ten days to half a month, due to the inertia of 
humans, if they wanted to stay permanently, they would subconsciously want to own a place to stay.

Because of this, the house trade in the city had always been very hot.

After entering the Starlight Guest House, cultivators who wanted to stay at the left side of the inn 
and move to the right side of the house would come in an endless stream every day.

The night gradually turned darker, and Star Illusion City also gradually quieted down.

In the spacious hall on the right side of the Starlight Guest House, Meng Gaofei was smiling as he 
sent away the last batch of important guests who had asked for a price. His face subconsciously 
relaxed.

As a steward in charge of house transactions in this Starlight Guest House, he had to entertain many 
guests every day. For ordinary guests, they would naturally have their own underlings, but for 
important guests, they would need him to leave. For example, there were Heavenly King Stage and 
above Heavenly King Stage experts who had personally come.

Although some people were not Heavenly Kings, their status and position were more important, and 
he would personally receive them.

Because of this, he was busy almost every day until late at night.

For other cultivators, they would have to be extremely resistant to this kind of task. The reason was 
very simple; they would have to spend most of the day there, so how could they have the time to 
cultivate? However, Meng Gaofei was different. He was happy at this, and the reason was also 
simple. There was no hope for him to break through to the next level.

Currently, Meng Gao Fei was a peak-tier ninth level Heaven Marquis.

Roughly three hundred years ago, both his soul and Dao Soul were severely injured, and in the end, 
his Dao Nascent Soul was completely healed, but it was very difficult for his soul to completely 
recover. This had already become a chronic disease of his, and it was difficult for his cultivation to 
increase even the slightest bit.

It was difficult to raise one's cultivation. One could only wait for the end.

The feeling of waiting for death to come was indeed not an easy one. He'd invested almost all of his 
energy into the transaction.

Meng Gaofei let out a light breath, then instructed a nearby attendant to close the door to the hall, 
before turning around and leaving.

"Are there any good houses for sale today?"

However, just as he took a few steps forward, a vigorous voice suddenly came from behind him.

Meng Gaofei continued to walk forward. He couldn't help but to turn around. Three silhouettes 
appeared in his line of sight.

The person walking in the front was a young man in white. He had a beautiful face with an elegant 
demeanor, but his eyes seemed to be filled with an endless vicissitudes of life. His age obviously 



wasn't as young as it appeared on the surface, and his real age might even be much higher than the 
manager of Starlight Restaurant.

In addition, the aura that faintly seeped out from the youth's body was extremely tyrannical.

Although Meng Gaofei was just a Heaven Lord, his eyes were extremely sharp, and he could 
immediately tell that this young man was a Heavenly King, possibly even a God King.

Beside the young man was a beautiful lady. She wore a red dress, exuding an extremely tyrannical 
aura. The only difference was that she was slightly weaker than the young man in white. Obviously, 
she was also a Heavenly King. Peak of Inferior Sky King.

The two Heavenly Kings came over together. This was the reason why Meng Gaofei stopped in his 
tracks.

As for the white-clothed youth and the black-clothed man behind the red-dressed woman, although 
they were also very handsome, Meng Gafei didn't take them to heart. The main reason was that that 
person's aura was not strong enough. It was likely that he was only at the ninth level of Heavenly 
Lord. Presumably, he was the descendant or even servant of the couple in front.

"Welcome, seniors."

Meng Gaofei was full of smiles. Without waiting for the attendant's response, he quickly walked up 
to them, "I wonder if you two seniors would like to rent or purchase a house. What are your 
requirements for the house?"

"To buy, of course."

The white-robed youth laughed calmly, then said, "Our request is very simple. First, we need to 
have a good seat, second, we need to have enough space, and third, we need to be suitable for 
cultivation …" As long as we are satisfied, the price is not a problem. "

"Senior's request is indeed very simple."

Meng Gafei flattered. After pondering for a moment, he smiled and said, "In this city, there are a 
total of 232 houses that meet Senior's requirements. Senior, may I know …"

Chapter 2114 - Thousand Star Garden

"How many places can you pick that are the most expensive?" The youth in white interrupted Meng 
Gaofei.

"The most expensive?"

When Meng Gao Fei heard this, he could not help but be slightly surprised.

Most people who bought a house would try to get it as cheaply as possible under conditions that 
met their own requirements. However, this Heavenly King actually wanted the most expensive one. 
However, Meng Gaofei had been a steward here for hundreds of years, and he had seen many 
people. Although the young man in white was a good customer, he had his share.

"Alright, we'll do as senior says."

Meng Gaofei came back to his senses in a flash, and introduced with a smile, "The most expensive 
place is in the center of Star City, with the Heavenly Star Mountain as his back, and not far in front 
is the station of the top nine sects in Star City. Also, the biggest auction house in Star City is nearby, 



and if you live near it, you can get all kinds of information faster. Most importantly, there is a 
formation there that can rapidly absorb immortal sky's spiritual energy. Other than that … "

The second spot is in the vicinity of Heavenly Star Mountain ….

"..."

Meng Gaofei was very familiar with the houses in Star City and very quickly, he introduced them to 
everyone and then smiled at the youth in white.

However, after a while, the white-clothed young man suddenly turned around. He slightly bowed to 
the black-clothed man and respectfully said, "Master, what do you think?"

"Master... "Master?"

Hearing these two words, Meng Gaofei's smile froze on his face, and he looked over in shock. His 
brows were filled with disbelief, this young man, who was suspected to be a Ninth Heaven Marquis, 
was actually called "Master" by a Heavenly King Stage powerhouse?

Who would have thought that the black clad man would actually have a Heavenly King servant?

After a moment of shock, Meng Gaofei's brain began to work faster as he tried to guess the identity 
and origins of this person. This Heavenly King youth was his servant, how could he know if this 
Heavenly King Girl was not? To have two Heavenly King servants, this was definitely not 
something to be trifled with. Perhaps it was the birth of some super great sect.

Or could it be that there was another story behind this?

Thinking of this, Meng Gao Fei quickly gathered his thoughts and looked at the man in black.

"I'll choose the Thousand Star Garden." In an instant, the man in black slightly nodded his head and 
quickly made a decision, "Is it convenient to bring us to the Thousand Star Garden to take a look?"

"Of course it's convenient!"

"..."

Moments later, Meng Gaofei said a few words to the waiters in the guesthouse, then led the three of 
them out the door.

After about two hours, Meng Gaofei returned to the Starlight Inn.

At this time, when he thought back to what happened tonight, Meng Gaofeng still felt that 
something was off. Originally, he had suspected that the youth in white had called the man in black 
"Master" because there was some sort of secret behind it. However, after further observation, he 
realized that the two Heavenly Kings were indeed his servants.

It was amazing, of course, but the deal was done, and it was done with a special alacrity.

The "Thousand Star Garden" had excellent conditions, so its price was naturally not cheap. 
However, towards his bid, the other party didn't even have the slightest intention of haggling and 
directly agreed to it. Moreover, on the spot, he went through the transaction procedures with the 
cultivator stationed at the Starlight Palace.

Now, the three of them must have already lived there.



After staying in Star City for hundreds of years, he had seen even more bizarre things. Since this 
transaction had already been completed, then naturally, there was nothing for him to do in the 
Thousand Star Garden. However, even after he returned to the Starlight Guest House, he was still 
overwhelmed by emotions and was unable to control himself.

When he was preparing to leave after completing the transaction, the youth in white actually invited 
him to be a manager of the Thousand Star Garden. Furthermore, he revealed a piece of news, and 
that was that his master seemed to have a way to cure the illness in his soul.

Meng Gaofei was both surprised and excited, but he didn't immediately agree. He only said that he 
needed to consider before making a decision. After all, he couldn't be sure if what the other party 
said was true or not.

After thinking about it along the way, he came to a decision.

After all these years, although he had given up on trying to become a Heavenly King, deep in his 
heart, he did not have a single shred of hope. That was, he had met a noble who could heal his soul 
and give him a chance to learn the secrets of a Heavenly King. Now, such a noble person had finally 
appeared.

Although he did not know why the other party wanted to invite him to be the steward of the 
Thousand Star Garden, it was likely because he was familiar with this Star Mirage City like the 
back of his hand. After all, a cultivator like him could be invited by a large group of people in Star 
Illusion City. It was impossible for him to be interested in his cultivation level.

A peak-level ninth level marquis with a cultivation base that was difficult to break through was 
indeed nothing to worry about.

Since he had already made his decision, Meng Gao Fei didn't think about it anymore. After a while, 
his mood had finally calmed down. After finding the head of the guest hall and bidding farewell, 
Meng Gaofei returned to his own residence and waited quietly. The next day, when the first rays of 
dawn appeared, he left the Starlight Guest House that he had stayed in for hundreds of years.

When he arrived at the Thousand Star Garden's gate, the closed gate had already opened, and 
immediately after, a familiar figure entered Meng Gaofei's line of sight. The youth in white leisurely 
walked out of the Thousand Star Garden, a smile hanging on his face. He seemed to know that he 
was coming, so he came out to welcome him.

"Thank you, senior." Meng Gaofei did not dare to keep the Heavenly King waiting. He quickly 
stepped forward and bowed in greeting as if he was overwhelmed by the unexpected favor.

"Brother Meng, there's no need to call me senior. My name is Fang Meng. Just call me brother 
Fang." The youth in white said with a smile.

"Alright, alright, Brother Fang, then I won't bother with formalities anymore."

"..."

He followed Fang Yuan and entered the Thousand Star Garden. When Meng Gaofei saw the man in 
black again, he could not help but become excited.

However, before he could open his mouth, he found that his mind was in a trance.



When he woke up again, he was in a quiet bedroom. Then, Meng Gaofei heard a laugh, "Brother 
Meng, how do you feel?"

"Just now, I …"

Meng Gao Fei was startled, then he suddenly sat up.

Before he finished speaking, an incomparably joyful and relaxed feeling emerged from the depths 
of his soul, as if the heavy shackles that were pressing down on his soul had completely disappeared 
without a trace. It had been hundreds of years since he had experienced this sort of feeling. Now 
that it had suddenly appeared, it actually made him at a loss. His voice also abruptly stopped.

"I... I've recovered? " After a moment of absent-mindedness, Meng Gaofei finally understood what 
was going on. He felt as if his whole body was struck by a great happiness and ecstasy. He looked at 
the smiling Fang Yuan with disbelief.

"Of course! Master personally made a move and cured that chronic disease of yours. "

"..."

Chapter 2115 - Immortal Yuan Heavenly Bead

"Is everything settled?"

In the center of the Thousand Star Garden, in an exquisite pavilion, seeing Fang Yuan who had just 
come in, the cross-legged man in black couldn't help but laugh.

This black clothed man was Tang Huan, who had just arrived from the peak of the ninth palace in 
the Crimson Sky Kingdom.

In order to not reveal his whereabouts, no matter if it was Tang Huan, Hua Tian Chi, or Mo Wuyun, 
they all had to adjust their appearances.

In fact, Tang Huan had even used her "Primal Chaos Dao Fire" to transform the meaning of Five 
Elements to change the auras of Hua Tian Chi and Mo Wen Yun respectively.

At this time, let alone others, even if Xiao Budian and Jiu Ling were to stand in front of them, they 
probably wouldn't recognize them.

However, Tang Huan's "Primal Chaos Dao Flame" was just enough to solve this problem. Of 
course, this change could not last long, so she would have to start over every once in a while.

After leaving the Crimson Nimbus Guild, Tang Huan rushed over immediately.

However, Tang Huan still did not have any clue as to what she was about to do. She might as well 
stay in Star City and see if she could find a suitable opportunity.

As for finding Meng Gaofei to be the manager of the Thousand Star Garden, it was indeed because 
he had a wide range of knowledge and was very familiar with Star Mirage City.

To Tang Huan, healing the injury of her soul was as easy as lifting a finger.

"Yes."

Hua Tian Chi laughed, "He is indeed very suitable for the position of the Thousand Star Garden's 
manager. With him here, there's no need to worry about anything. "Oh right, Master, I have already 



ordered him to recruit more people. Since he is going to stay there for a long time, only two or three 
people will be able to make people suspicious."

Tang Huan nodded her head, "You and Meng Gao Fei can handle these matters." At this point, Tang 
Huan suddenly said, "We don't have many 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads' left, right?"

The so-called "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Bead" was actually the upgraded version of the Heavenly 
Jewel.

In the lower Heaven Realms, Heavenly Jewels could be considered as currency, but in the Heaven 
Realm, especially in the upper Heaven Realms, when they needed to buy and sell precious items, 
ordinary Heavenly Jewels were no longer of use, they could only be used with the "Immortal Yuan 
Heavenly Bead". Generally speaking, only a hundred thousand Heaven beads could condense a 
single "Immortal Yuan Heaven Bead".

Just like how Tang Huan spent a total of three hundred "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads" to 
purchase this Thousand Star Garden. This was equivalent to thirty million Heaven beads.

To be able to buy such a good place in the central region of Star City with the equivalent of thirty 
million Heavenly Jewels, it was indeed a very good idea.

"Only five hundred left." Hua Tian Chi said.

"Five hundred pills … "Indeed, there aren't many left. I'll refine a few saint rank dao tools later in 
order to prepare for future emergencies." Tang Huan only pondered for a short while before smiling.

"A saint rank dao tool?"

When Hua Tianzhi heard this, he couldn't help but be surprised. "Master, are you planning on 
exchanging the saint rank dao tools for the 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Bead'?"

Due to the fact that Tang Huan was the Principal of the Heavenly Way Holy Courtyard, Hua Tianzhi 
had always called Tang Huan "Principal". Recently, in order to not let others doubt their relationship 
as master and servant, he had directly addressed Tang Huan as "Master" and entirely considered 
herself a servant.

Tang Huan had warned him a few times, but seeing that he was determined to do it, could only let 
him do it.

The reason for this was very simple. The heaven's saint rank was extremely rare, and the success 
rate of forging a saint rank dao tool was also very low. Many Heavenly Emperors, especially the 
middle and lower heaven emperors, were still using their heaven rank dao tools.

Now, Tang Huan actually planned to forge a few saint rank tools in exchange for the "Immortal 
Yuan Heavenly Bead".

One had to know that saint rank dao tools were priceless. The appearance of every saint rank dao 
tool was enough to make the Celestial Emperor of the Nine Heavens scramble like a flock of ducks. 
Using a saint rank dao tool to exchange for the "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Bead" was truly a bit too 
much of a loss. After all, the "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Bead" was easy to obtain, and saint rank 
dao tools were hard to come by.

Tang Huan glanced at Hua Tian Chi in surprise, and then laughed hoarsely: "Relax, a saint rank dao 
tool is extremely difficult to forge, but to me, forging a saint rank dao tool is as easy as forging a 



heaven rank dao tool or a high rank dao tool. It's not difficult at all, as long as I have enough 
ingredients, I can forge as many as I want, and they are all of perfect quality."

"..."

Hua Tianzhi could not help but be speechless.

In the next thirty-six days, he naturally had heard of Tang Huan's reputation in the Tools Method 
Attainments, and he had never displayed any doubts regarding this either. However, what Tang 
Huan wanted to forge this time was a Holy-ranked Dao Artifact, in his mind, this level of Dao 
Artifact should not be easy to forge, even for Tang Huan.

But unexpectedly, Tang Huan did not even put forging saint artifacts in her eyes.

Only after a long while did Hua Tianzhi come back to his senses. He said somewhat hesitantly, 
"Master, that was a bit of a loss. That is a saint rank dao tool."

At the end, Hua Tianzhi revealed a pained expression.

"I don't necessarily have to exchange it for a 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Bead'."

Tang Huan could not help but smile, "I will just forge it first, and leave it as a backup. If we 
encounter a treasure that we need but are not willing to exchange with the 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly 
Bead', we can definitely exchange it with a saint artifact. I don't think anyone would be able to 
refuse such a deal. "

"That's true."

Only then did Hua Tianzhi heave a sigh of relief. He revealed a smile on his face, "Master, if I still 
lack a saint rank dao stone and a saint rank iron crystal, I'll go ask Meng Gaofei."

Tang Huan muttered to herself, "There's no need to rush this matter. I'll first look at the Saint rank 
Dao Stones and iron crystals that I have before making my plans. First, you and Meng Gaofei 
should investigate the situation regarding the 'Clear Void Dao Pavilion'." As she spoke till here, 
Tang Huan warned again in a serious tone, "Be careful, don't arouse the suspicion of others."

"Understood, I'll go right away."

Hua Tianzhi nodded and left.

As soon as he left, Mo Hanyun's figure appeared in the doorway. Seeing her, Tang Huan unwittingly 
smiled: "How's the cultivation effect in this' Thousand Star Garden '?"

"He's slightly weaker than Nine Palace Mountain, but he's still not bad."

Mo Wuyun nodded in satisfaction, then said with a smile, "Even though it is a little expensive to 
buy this place with three hundred Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads, it is indeed worth it … Master, 
how long do we need to stay here? " When he said the word "master", he was gritting his teeth in 
anger.

"Let's see what we can find out first."

Tang Huan sighed lightly, and rubbed her forehead helplessly. She really didn't have any good 
methods right now.



At the end of the day, his strength was still lacking. If he was a true Divine Realm expert, even if he 
hadn't stepped into the Divine Realm, as long as his power far surpassed the first rank of the Divine 
Seal Decree, it would be enough. That way, as long as he went to the "Clear Void Dao Pavilion", he 
could easily obtain what he wanted.

Chapter 2116 - Helplessness

There were many battles in Star City, and every day, many cultivators would lose their lives in the 
city. However, Tang Huan's following days were very peaceful.

There was no need for him to worry about the Thousand Star Garden at all.

Recruitment, assignment …

Meng Gao Fei was indeed worthy of being the deacon of the Starlight Guest House for several 
hundred years. He was more than capable of handling these small matters, and he managed the 
Thousand Star Garden well.

However, with Meng Gaofei's actions, the news of the Thousand Star Garden having a new owner 
quietly spread throughout the city.

Many people were secretly inquiring about who spent so many "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads" to 
buy this manor, and to think that it would allow Meng Gaofei to become the steward.

Meng Gao Fei's cultivation level in Star Fantasy city wasn't high, but his reputation wasn't small.

Before this, it wasn't as if no one had recruited him.

But, he had never promised anyone. And now, he had actually left the Starlight Guest House and 
come to the Thousand Star Garden. Just what sort of preferential treatment and rewards had he 
received?

Because of this, the curiosity of the people in the city towards the master of the Thousand Star 
Garden increased.

It was a pity that no matter how hard they tried, they wouldn't be able to obtain much information. 
After all, Tang Huan, Mo Wen Yun and Hua Tian Chi had almost never left the manor ever since 
they had taken up residence here.

Everything in Star Fantasy City was left to Meng Gao Fei.

In the entire Star City, only Meng Gaofei was truly in contact with Tang Huan, Mo Wen Yun and 
Hua Tian Chi. As for the newly recruited servants, they had only seen Mo Wen Yun and Hua Tian 
Chi, and as for the owner of the manor, Tang Huan, they had not even seen a shadow of him.

The pavilion which Tang Huan resided in was a kilometer in radius, and was considered a forbidden 
ground. Without permission, no one was allowed to go near it.

"Master."

In the evening, when the lanterns were lit, within the Thousand Star Garden's pavilion, Hua Tianchi 
gave a brief summary of the information he had gathered regarding the "Clear Void Dao Pavilion".

"The Void Clear Dao Association that occurs every 50 years?" Tang Huan frowned slightly.

"Exactly."



Hua Tianchi nodded and slowly said, "The Clear Void Dao Pavilion will hold a meeting of the Clear 
Void Sect every fifty years to recruit disciples from all the nine heavens. The sect is under one 
hundred years old and has the cultivation base of the Heavenly Dipper Realm. There's still three 
years until the next Clear Void Sect Meeting. "

"This request is not low at all."

When Tang Huan heard this, she sighed with emotion, and could not help but say with some 
surprise: "However, this' Clear Void Sect 'doesn't seem to have anything to do with me right?"

"Master, I'm wondering if we can find someone to infiltrate the 'Clear Void Dao Pavilion' and see if 
there's any way to get what Master wants. However, I'm afraid this method will take a very long 
time and it might not succeed."

"It's not that he might not succeed, but that he definitely will not succeed."

"In the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, only the successor of the Pavilion Master would have the chance to 
obtain that cultivation technique. Furthermore, as far as I know, there is a 'Heart Inquisition Tunnel' 
in the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, the moment one is selected as the successor of the Pavilion Master, 
they would have to enter the 'Heart Inquisition Tunnel'. Any person with ill intentions would not be 
able to walk out of it safely."

"That's right."

Tang Huan nodded her head, "If it's better than that, there's no need to go through so much trouble. 
It's much easier to find an opportunity to capture a disciple from the Clear Void Dao Pavilion and 
control them using the Puppet Soul Seal. Of course, the easiest way is to take down the Pavilion 
Master from the Clear Void Dao Pavilion. "

As he finished speaking, Tang Huan couldn't help but laugh, while Hua Tian Chi also smiled 
awkwardly at his immature suggestion.

As the strongest of the nine great sects, the Pavilion Master of the "Clear Void Dao Pavilion" was an 
Empyrean that was even more famous on the list. Let alone them, even if Liu Li personally made a 
move, she would at most only be able to defeat the Pavilion Master of the Clear Void Sect and not 
capture him.

Therefore, with Tang Huan's current situation, wanting to control him was no different from a 
fantasy.

If Tang Huan had already become an Empyrean, she could give it a try, but she was only ranked 85 
on the Emperor List, which was still a far cry from becoming an Empyrean.

"I still have to think of another way." Tang Huan retracted his smile and sighed.

"Master, I have an idea." Mo Youyun suddenly spoke up.

"Oh?"

Tang Huan looked at Mo Wuyun in surprise, only to hear her smiling: "Using a treasure that the 
'Clear Void Dao Pavilion' would never reject, to exchange with them."

Hearing this, Tang Huan's heart was moved, but she immediately glared at Mo Wuyun unhappily.



This method of hers did sound reasonable at first glance, but upon further thought, it was no 
different from courting death. The Clear Void Dao Pavilion was the strongest super sect in the 
Upper Nine Heavens. However, it did not have much of a difference in character compared to the 
Beitang Immortal Sect. It could even be said that all of the super sects had the same virtue.

If Tang Huan really took out a treasure that the "Clear Void Dao Pavilion" would not reject, then the 
first thing the sect would want to do was not trade with him, but rather snatch that treasure away. In 
the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, there were already three Ascendants. Among them, two of them were 
ranked first and third.

This was not something that the Beitang Immortal Sect could compare with.

The Northern Dipper Immortal Sect would worry about Qin Xian Ye who was on good terms with 
Liu Li, and the Clear Void Dao Pavilion would not care about that. If Tang Huan really wanted to 
make a deal with the Clear Void Dao Pavilion, the result would be very tragic. If one did not have 
the strength to make such a transaction, it would be no different from courting death.

"We still can't be too hasty on this matter." Tang Huan let out a light breath and said helplessly, 
"Heaven Lake, have you gathered all the saint rank dao stones and iron crystals I need?"

"It's ready."

"No one knows, it's those saint rank dao stones and iron crystals that our Thousand Star Garden 
bought. "In that case, even if a saint rank Dao Artifact were to appear in Star City in the future, no 
one would doubt us." Hua Tianchi said these words with complete confidence.

"Very good."

Tang Huan nodded his head in satisfaction, "Later on, you will hand over the dao stones and iron 
crystals to me. Go and check if there are enough precious cultivation resources in this city. Since I 
am unable to think of a good plan for the time being, I cannot wait here for nothing to happen.

After becoming a God Emperor, his Immortal body once again entered the "Heavenly Palace". 
Although his main body could use the "Chaos Source Crystals" to cultivate, if there were treasures 
that contained the source energy, they would allow the "Chaos Source Crystals" to accumulate more 
chaos energy faster, which would be of great help to his cultivation.

"Yes, I will go now." Hua Tian Chi immediately became excited.

"..."

Chapter 2117 - The Spirit Dao Tower

In the blink of an eye, several months had passed.

"Rumble …"

In the pavilion at the center of the Thousand Star Garden within the Illusory Sword Heavenly 
Palace, an incomparably excited cry suddenly burst forth, and in an instant, it seemed to resound 
throughout the entire dwelling.

At almost the same time, the space within the cave violently fluctuated. A terrifying Heavenly 
Energy also flashed and appeared. It filled every inch of space in this area, causing one's mind to be 
filled with shock.



Inside the Supreme Profound Hall, Tang Huan sat cross legged, and the gigantic "Nine Yang Divine 
Furnace" quickly shrank, and entered the Dantian. At the location of the cauldron, there was 
actually a halberd floating in the air, it was over three meters long, the body of the halberd was as 
clear as jade, releasing a dazzling, golden luster.

This luster did not exist on the surface of the halberd, but rather on the body of the halberd.

The body of the halberd slightly trembled as the sound of the halberd shook. Looking from afar, the 
entire halberd seemed to contain a golden spring water that was slowly flowing.

Only after a long while did the golden halberd finally calm down, and the Heavenly Dao's aura also 
gradually disappeared.

Tang Huan stretched out her hand and the halberd fell into her palm. A strong feeling rose 
involuntarily, as if she was holding not only a weapon, but a vast ocean. Every single drop of water 
in the ocean could transform into an unstoppable sharp weapon, capable of destroying the heavens 
and the earth.

This golden halberd was naturally a saint artifact.

During this period of time, Tang Huan had first raised her original body's "Pure Yang Divine 
Sword" and the Immortal Body's "Brahma Divine Thunder Blade" to the Holy-ranked, before 
starting to forge Holy-ranked Dao Artifacts.

Until now, Tang Huan had only forged three Holy-ranked Dao Artifacts.

Adding in the two "Pure Yang Divine Sword" and "Brahma Divine Thunder Blade", there were 
already five saint rank Dao artifacts that had appeared within the cave.

If this news were to spread out, the entire upper nine heavens would be in an uproar.

Aside from the fact that the golden halberd was perfect, the other two saint artifacts that Tang Huan 
had forged were of high quality. After all, Tang Huan was prepared to use those two items to 
exchange for cultivation resources.

In these nine days, a superior saint rank dao tool was enough to cause one to go mad for it.

As for the perfect saint rank dao tools, even in the history of the Heaven Realm, the number of 
times they appeared could be counted on one hand. The amount of time needed to forge a saint rank 
dao tool far surpassed that of a heaven rank dao tool. And the amount of time needed to forge a 
perfect saint rank dao tool was at least twice that of the superior quality.

Time was of the essence; the key lay in the difficulty of forging.

In the process of forging a perfect saint rank dao tool, one had to maintain communication with the 
heavenly dao at all times. Furthermore, one had to reach an extremely meticulous level of 
communication. This was not something an ordinary saint rank heaven craftsman could do. It had 
extremely high requirements for one's mind and mental strength, as well as their probing abilities.

Tang Huan was only able to do this because she possessed treasures such as the "God Casting 
Crystal" and the "Nine Yang Divine Furnace".

Otherwise, the limit of Tang Huan's ability to forge a Holy-ranked Dao Artifact was its superior 
quality. No matter how high its attainment in this aspect was, the possibility of it being able to forge 
a Perfect Holy-ranked Dao Artifact was minuscule.



At this moment, Tang Huan couldn't help but think of Ancestor Ji Qingtian, who was born in the 
"Emperor Dragon's Heavenly Palace".

He was now the supreme elder of the Black Yellow Dao Sect. According to what Liu Li had 
revealed, he was ranked fifth on the revered list, and was even higher than the Myriad Dragon 
Sword Sect's Yun Xiu. The strength of his strength could be imagined, but with his current strength 
and Tools Method Attainments, could he forge a perfect saint artifact?

According to Liu Li, he was the only Divine grade heavenly work in the entire world. Because of 
this, even the two from the Clear Void Sect would be polite when they saw him.

Unfortunately, he didn't have the chance to see her for the time being. Otherwise, he would be able 
to have a good exchange with her.

In a moment of thought, the golden halberd had already been kept within the spatial ring, and Tang 
Huan's figure had also disappeared without a trace from the Supreme Profound Hall.

"Master!"

In the pavilion, the Hua Tian Lake who was currently immersed in cultivation was suddenly 
awakened. Opening his eyes, he saw Tang Huan's figure approaching him as he hurriedly stood up 
and bowed.

"How's the investigation going this time?"

Tang Huan nodded and smiled.

After hearing this, a smile finally appeared on Hua Tian Chi's face, "Master, you came out at the 
right time. Manager Meng just found out from an acquaintance that in three days, there will be a 
Crimson Moon Buddha Pill in the Spirit Dao Restaurant's auction."

"Scarlet Moon Buddha Elixir?"

Tang Huan's heart was moved.

The Spirit Dao Pavilion was the biggest auction in Star Mirage City. It was said that it was opened 
by the Clear Void Dao Pavilion. As for the "Scarlet Moon Buddha Elixir", it sounded like a pellet, 
but in reality, it was a type of medicinal herb. It was extremely precious, and the medicinal power it 
contained was not only boundless, it was also extremely pure.

The most miraculous thing was that this Crimson Moon Buddha Pill could be consumed directly 
like a medicinal pill. If it was used to refine a medicinal pill, it would instead suffer a great loss to 
the medicinal strength.

This kind of herb would require at least a Heavenly King Stage powerhouse to refine.

Then, Tang Huan asked: "The starting bid for the auction is presumably not low, right?"

"The base price is …" "Five thousand 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads'." Hua Tian Chi said.

"This is the equivalent of five hundred million Heavenly Jewels." Tang Huan slightly nodded her 
head, then laughed and slowly said, "I'm afraid the final transaction price will have to be several 
tens of thousands of 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads'."



This Thousand Star Garden only had 300 "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads", and it could already be 
said to be expensive. The Scarlet Moon Buddha Pill was actually 20 times more expensive, and this 
was only the starting price.

However, this was also normal. After all, the two of them were things that were completely different 
in nature. The Thousand Star Garden was only a place to stay. To cultivators, it was just a place to 
rest. Although the great formation inside the garden could absorb celestial spiritual energy, it was 
not irreplaceable for cultivation, and the 'Scarlet Moon Buddha Pills' were extremely rare.

The most important thing was that it could quickly raise his cultivation. Even for the Celestial 
Emperor, it was extremely helpful.

He could foresee that the competition for the "Scarlet Moon Buddha Pill" would be extremely fierce 
after three days.

"Besides the Crimson Moon Buddha Pill, are there any other valuable items?" Tang Huan asked 
again.

"For the time being, this is the only thing that can be considered precious." A treasure suitable for 
the cultivation of the Celestial Emperor was not so easily found. Sometimes, even if one found it, 
they would leave it in their own sect and wouldn't be in the auction house at all. They would only 
take it out if they didn't need it.

"Fine, we'll go take a look at that Spirit Dao Tower in three days."

Tang Huan nodded, and then thought about it, "Go and ask Meng Gao Fei, in Star Fantasy City, 
what is the price for a high quality saint artifact?"

"Master, you've forged it?" Surprise exploded in the eyes of the Heavenly Lake. 

"..."

Chapter 2118 - OP

The Spirit Dao Tower was not far from the Thousand Star Garden and it was only a few thousand 
meters in length. It was also built by the Heavenly Star Mountain.

Heavenly Star Mountain was not considered high, but it took up a large amount of space. Star City 
was located in the center of Heavenly Star Mountain, and it continuously spread out in all 
directions. At the foot of Heavenly Star Mountain, it was an extremely good location. Those who 
could occupy such a place were either extremely powerful or had a very powerful background.

Just like the Thousand Star Garden, it was said that it belonged to the Clear Void Dao Pavilion when 
it was first built, and was sold for countless times before falling into Tang Huan's hands.

It was also like the Spirit Dao Tower. It was still the property of the Clear Void Dao Pavilion.

In the evening, the Spirit Dao Tower was already brightly lit. Outside the building, it was bustling 
with activity. Cultivators would occasionally enter the building by themselves or in groups of two or 
three.

As the biggest auction venue in Star Fantasy City, the Spirit Dao Restaurant held an auction every 
half month.



However, not everyone could participate in this kind of auction. In order to enter, one first had to 
pay a hundred "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads" to prove one's wealth. Moreover, after the auction, 
this fee was not refunded. If they were unwilling to pay this price, they would naturally not be able 
to participate in the auction.

The facts had proven that there were many cultivators who could not bear to spend such a large sum 
of money.

After all, a hundred "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads" was equivalent to ten million Heaven beads. 
That was indeed not a small number. As a result, there were cultivators that were stopped at the 
entrance of the Spirit Dao Tower from time to time. They had to stop and watch from the outside, or 
they would curse from time to time, causing the area in front of the building to become even noisier.

The auction hall of the Spirit Dao Restaurant was on the first floor and could accommodate close to 
a thousand people at the same time.

On both sides of the hall, there were many private rooms.

At this moment, Tang Huan, Mo Wen Yun Hua Tian Chi were in a private room with number 58. 
Since they were participating in the auction, not only did Tang Huan and Mo Wen Yun change their 
appearances once again, Tang Huan even helped them change their auras. Even if Meng Gao Fei 
was standing in front of them, he wouldn't be able to recognize them.

The reason why Tang Huan was able to get a private room inside was very simple. It was because 
he had shown a high quality saint rank dao tool, which was enough for him to become an honored 
guest of the Spirit Dao Tower.

"Dong, dong, dong!"

Knock! Knock! Knock! Knock!

Tang Huan smiled slightly, with an "as expected" expression on her face. She then nodded towards 
Hua Tian Chi.

He quickly walked over and pulled open the door of the private room. Two silhouettes immediately 
emerged, revealing an old man clad in black robes. He was thin and tall, and behind him was a 
middle-aged man with a handsome countenance.

"Friend, I am Yang Yi, the tower lord of the Spiritual Dao Tower."

Black Costume Old Man's eyes swept across the room as her gaze swept past Hua Tian Chi who 
was standing at the door and fell upon Tang Huan who was sitting motionlessly. She had obviously 
realized that among the three people in the room, Tang Huan's position was even higher, and thus, 
naturally turned her attention to Tang Huan.

"Gao Ling!"

Tang Huan smiled lightly, and casually mentioned the name of an old friend from the lower realm.

The moment he saw the Tower Lord called Yang Yi, Tang Huan faintly felt a wave of consciousness 
quickly scout out for him. That mind was as fine as a thread, yet extremely powerful, and perfectly 
blended into the space of this realm.

Without a doubt, his mind came from eating the sun.



From Tang Huan's judgement, Yangyi should be a lower level Heavenly Emperor. As a result, when 
Yang Yi probed, Tang Huan feigned ignorance, and only made her faintly discernible Qi become 
more distinct. This was enough for Yang Yi to make an accurate judgement, and know that he was 
also an Inferior Heavenly Emperor.

Sure enough, the moment Tang Huan's voice fell, a hint of understanding flashed between Yang Yi's 
brows, and then she walked in with a smile.

"It doesn't matter. Tower Lord Yang, you must have something important to attend to?" Tang Huan 
laughed.

"According to what Yang Feng said, Brother Gao Ling, you have a high-grade saint rank Dao 
Artifact?" Yang Yi looked straight at Tang Huan, and said slowly, as for Yang Feng, he was the 
middle-aged manager behind him.

"Exactly."

Tang Huan nodded her head. Regarding the appearance of Yang Yi, he was not surprised at all, she 
had even already expected it. Since she had displayed that saint rank dao tool to the steward of the 
Spiritual Dao Tower, she would surely alarm the owner of the Spiritual Dao Tower. The truth was 
indeed like that. Just as Tang Huan sat down, Yang Yi came over.

"I wonder what Brother Gao Ling plans on doing with that saint rank dao tool?" Yang Yi's voice 
sounded anxious.

"This will depend on whether the Spirit Dao Tower's auction is valuable enough or not." Tang Huan 
smiled slowly.

"How is the Crimson Moon Buddha Pill?"

Yang Yi hurriedly said, "The auction has yet to begin. If Brother Gao Ling needs it, I can remove it 
from the auction tonight." Yang Yi did not wish for Tang Huan to take out the high grade saint 
artifact to auction, but wanted to directly buy it from Tang Huan.

"How can a Crimson Moon Buddha Pill be compared with a high-grade saint rank Dao item?" Mo 
Wuyun harrumphed.

"Naturally."

Yang Yi nodded slightly and pondered for a moment. Then, he gritted his teeth and said, "Our Spirit 
Dao Restaurant has another treasure that we originally wanted to keep for the next auction. If 
Brother Gao Ling needs it, I can use it and the Crimson Moon Buddha Pill to exchange for this saint 
rank dao tool."

"Oh? "What treasure?" Tang Huan asked somewhat curiously.

"Chaos source crystal!" Yang Yi said slowly, "The starting price I set for it is fifty thousand 
'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads'. The final offer will definitely not stop there."

"Chaos source crystal?"

"The 'Primal Chaos Source Crystal' is indeed a treasure, but the Chaotic Force within it is extremely 
difficult to refine. It wouldn't be of much help to my cultivation in the short term, Tower Lord Yang 
…"



"Two!"

Seeing that Tang Huan was pretending to send him off, Yang Yi became anxious and immediately 
shouted, "Two 'Primal Chaos Source Crystals', and that 'Scarlet Moon Buddha Elixir'!" Finished 
speaking, Yang Yi stared at Tang Huan, with the look of someone who wanted to leave the Holy-
ranked Dao Artifact at all costs.

"If it's two …"

Tang Huan frowned, she seemed to be deep in thought, but her heart was filled with joy.

The two "Primal Chaos Crystals" from Spirit Dao Tower were definitely incomparable to the one he 
had obtained in the "Heavenly Imperial Dragon Palace". The Chaotic Force contained within them 
was even more incomparable.

However, if he could obtain them and fuse them with the "Chaos Source Crystal" that he originally 
possessed, it would definitely be greatly improved. < span
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"Add another fifty thousand 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads'!" After a moment, Tang Huan spoke 
with determination.

It belongs to you!

"This …"

When Yang Yi heard this, his face could not help but turn black.

A single Scarlet Moon Buddha Pill and two Chaos Origin Crystals were already considered 
priceless. If he added them all together, they would be worth an entire city. If he offered another 
fifty thousand Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads …

The price was too high.

"Brother Gao Ling, aren't you asking for too much?" Yang Yi could not help but forcefully laugh as 
he spoke. Behind him, Yang Feng also frowned when he heard this.

"How much? I don't think so much at all! "

Tang Huan smiled slightly and said, "Although 'Primal Chaos Source Crystals' are rare, as long as 
one has enough 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads', one can buy them. Although the medicinal power 
of the 'Scarlet Moon Buddha Pellet' is sufficient, it is not irreplaceable. "But a saint rank dao tool 
cannot be bought even if one wanted to, much less a saint rank dao tool of high quality."

"..."

Yang Yi and Yang Feng were both speechless.

Just as Tang Huan had said, although the "Primal Chaos Origin Crystal" and "Scarlet Moon Buddha 
Elixir" were precious, they were both bought using the "Immortal Yuan Sky Bead". In addition, 
although the extra 50,000 "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads" were a pain, but as long as he spent 
some time, he would still be able to earn it back. However, a high grade saint rank Dao Artifact was 
something that could only be found by luck and not sought.



Otherwise, he wouldn't have run over so quickly the moment Yang Feng mentioned it.

"The auction is about to begin. The tower lord has already made his decision." Tang Huan looked at 
Yang Yi and said slowly.

"Alright!"

Yang Yi's expression kept changing. He gritted his teeth and said in a deep voice, "It's settled!" He 
had already made his decision. Yang Yi did not hesitate any longer and immediately ordered, "Yang 
Feng, remove tonight's Scarlet Moon Buddha Pill auction and bring back the two Chaos Source 
Crystals and the fifty thousand Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads."

"Yes sir!"

Yang Feng immediately accepted the order and left.

In less than half a quarter of an hour, Yang Feng had already re-entered the private room. "Tower 
Lord, the items have been brought."

"Let's check on Brother Gao Ling." Yang Yi waved his hand.

"Yes sir!"

Yang Feng slightly nodded, and in between the mind instructs (in a second), a ball of red or red 
color exploded in front of him.

The shape of this kind of herb was rather unique. It was round and round like a full moon, about the 
size of a bowl, and its entire body was sparkling and translucent like jade. However, it revealed a 
fiery-red color.

In the center of the medicinal herb, the fiery red turned into a dark red. As for that dark red ball, it 
looked like a Buddha sitting cross-legged.

It was for this reason that this medicinal herb was called the "Scarlet Moon Buddha Pill". The 
breath that faintly seeped out from the herbs was serene and auspicious, as if it contained a 
mysterious power that would cause one to be able to calm their hearts and concentrate. However, 
this power gave off a feeling that it was extremely majestic.

"The medicinal strength of this Crimson Moon Buddha Pill is formidable as expected."

Tang Huan slightly nodded. Feeling the aura of the medicinal plant, his mind also inexplicably 
calmed down.

Yang Yi smiled and gestured to Yang Feng. After placing the "Scarlet Moon Buddha Pill" on the 
table, two more faint white lights appeared on Yang Feng's palms. These were two pebbles that 
were only the size of walnuts, and the chaos energy continuously emanated from them.

These were the "Chaos Origin Crystals".

Tang Huan only sensed it slightly, and couldn't help but reveal a slight smile between her brows.

His own "Primal Chaos Crystals" were hundreds of thousands of meters tall. As for these two 
"Primal Chaos Crystals" … According to the information given to Tang Huan, if he were to let her 
recover her original appearance, she should be able to reach a height of between eight thousand and 
ten thousand meters.



Of course, his Origin Crystal had been specially refined by an expert, and these two Origin Crystals 
maintained their original form.

"That's right." Tang Huan nodded again.

"This is fifty thousand Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads."

Yang Feng took out a green jade pendant and handed it over.

Hua Tian Chi took it and probed it with his mind. He instantly nodded towards Tang Huan and 
confirmed that there were a corresponding number of Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads inside.

"Put it away."

Tang Huan instructed with a smile.

Yang Feng subconsciously glanced at Yang Yi and hesitated a little. Seeing that he did not have any 
objections, he finally gave the "Scarlet Moon Buddha Pellet" and the two "Primal Chaos Crystals" 
to Hua Tian Chi who was walking up to him.

"Brother Gao Ling, can you take out that saint rank weapon and let me experience it?" Yang Yi said 
impatiently.

"Of course, it now belongs to you, Tower Lord."

Tang Huan smiled slightly.

In an instant, a long sword appeared in his hands. The sword had a long and narrow body, and was 
pitch-black like ink. In the instant it appeared, the light in the room was almost completely 
engulfed, the darkness had already enveloped the entire area.

Suddenly, an exceptionally terrifying aura surged in the space.

Every box here had a formation that isolated the outside from the outside.

However, the moment the aura appeared, it seemed to want to break through the restraints on the 
box and roar outwards. Not only was this aura tyrannical, it was also tyrannical to the extreme, 
causing one's mind to tremble and even their soul to be greatly affected. Wild emotions surged 
uncontrollably from the bottom of their heart.

Tang Huan moved her palm slightly, and the pitch black sword flew towards Yang Yi like cotton.

"Good sword!"

Yang Yi's eyes shone with a breathtaking light, just like a hungry wolf seeing delicious fat. He 
stretched his arm slightly, and the long sword flew into his right palm. He gently swept the sword 
with two fingers of his left hand, and the light in his eyes became increasingly bright, "As expected 
of a top saint rank dao tool."

"Looks like we have already completed this transaction." Tang Huan laughed.

"Not bad, it's done."

With a slight movement of his thought, the black sword disappeared from his palm. The darkness 
disappeared, and the room returned to its former brightness as both his eyes landed on Tang Huan 
once more, "Brother Gao Ling, if I feel that it's not wrong, this saint rank Dao Artifact seems to 
have just been forged. May I dare to ask, which Weapon Refiner did this for us?"



After Tang Huan heard this, she smiled but did not speak.

"I was rude."

Yang Yi was slightly stunned for a moment before regaining his senses. He then laughed, "Brother 
Gao Ling, since the transaction has been completed, I won't disturb you any further. If Brother Gao 
Ling has a saint rank Dao Artifact, you can always contact me at any time even if it's of low or 
medium quality.

"Good, if there are more, then the Spirit Dao Tower will definitely be my first choice." Tang Huan 
laughed.

"Thank you, thank you." Yang Yi said with a smile.

"..."

Moments later, Yang Qian and Yang Feng left the room satisfied. The joy in their eyes was still 
completely uncontrollable.

Chapter 2120 - Primeval Dao-stone

The auction of the Spirit Dao Tower had finally begun.

This was truly worthy of being the Star City's largest auction house. Every single item being 
auctioned off by the Spirit Dao Restaurant could be said to be extremely precious, causing the city 
to constantly be the scene of intense competition.

However, Tang Huan was not very interested in those things.

He had already obtained the "Scarlet Moon Buddha Pellet", as well as two "Primal Chaos Origin 
Crystals" and fifty thousand "Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads".

"Let's go."

After watching several rounds of the auction, Tang Huan had already stood up. As for the "Scarlet 
Moon Buddha Pellet", "Primal Chaos Origin Crystal" and "Immortal Yuan Sky Pearl", they had all 
been kept in his spatial equipment.

Just as he reached the door, Tang Huan had a feeling in his heart, and suddenly stopped in his 
tracks: "You guys go in first." With that, the "Myriad Sword Heavenly Diagram" appeared.

"Is there any danger?" Hua Tian Chi and Mo Wen Yun looked at each other, and their expressions 
changed slightly.

"We'll know very soon."

Tang Huan gave a slight smile and revealed the painting as she immediately pulled Hua Tian Chi 
and Mo Hanyun into the Supreme Profound Hall inside the cave.

Keeping the scroll, Tang Huan walked out of the private box.

Almost everyone's attention was focused on the woman sitting on the platform inside the hall. 
Beside her, someone was handing a small jade box to her, the seventh item of the auction.

At this time, basically no one noticed Tang Huan walking out of the private box.



Tang Huan did not stay any longer. With a sweep of his eyes, she walked out of the hall at a 
moderate pace, but after taking a few steps, she suddenly stopped and turned back, the light in his 
eyes sweeping past. Immediately after, Tang Huan returned to her room number 58.

On the high platform, the auctioneer young woman slowly opened the jade box, revealing a soft 
luster. At the same time, an exceptionally powerful aura also spread out.

Everyone, this is the 'Primal Dao-stone'. It is a divine grade Dao-stone, and everyone knows its 
uses.

The young woman had a beautiful smile on her face, "This' Primeval Dao Stone 'is the family 
heirloom of an esteemed guest of our Spirit Dao Tower. It is said that his family's Lord s found it 
countless years ago from the Nether Realm.

"Each bid should not be less than one thousand 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads'. Everyone, please 
begin your bidding."

"..."

"10,000 Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads and a single Divine Grade Dao Stone. That's indeed not 
considered expensive."

"It's not expensive, but it's useless for us." "It's not like we're divine item craftsmen. Even if we buy 
it, we can only use it as a decoration."

"Not bad. This' Primeval Dao Stone 'will definitely be auctioned off."

"If I'm not wrong, this is the thirteenth time that the Spirit Dao Tower has auctioned this' Primeval 
Dao Stone '. It's a good item, but unfortunately, no one wants it."

"Only a fool would like to see that. Unless some divine rank heaven-rank work of art has taken a 
fancy to it, auctioning it for a hundred times would be useless."

"..."

The hall was instantly filled with a wave of murmurs.

After seeing everyone's expressions, the young woman on the platform also had a helpless look on 
her face.

Without a doubt, Divine Grade Dao Stones were priceless treasures. Unfortunately, Heaven Realm 
Divine Grade Heaven Arts were extremely rare, and it was said that there was only one of them. No 
one would be willing to sell a Dao Stone like this for a low price. However, no one would be 
willing to buy it if the price was too high because it could only be used as a collection and would 
not be of any use at all.

The owner of this "Primeval Dao Stone" was a good friend of OP Yang Yi. This was why, after 
every round, he would take it up for auction again and again.

"Is there anyone bidding?"

The young woman's loud voice did not receive any response.

She had long since been mentally prepared for this, and had long since become accustomed to it. 
After more than ten auctions, she had only gone through the motions of this "Primeval Dao Stone" 
auction.



Quickly scanning her surroundings, the young woman closed the jade box and signaled to the 
attendant at the side: "Next..."

"10,000 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads'. I want this Divine grade Dao Stone!"

Before she was able to utter the word "item", a clear voice suddenly sounded out, startling her. She 
forcibly swallowed the character behind her, then her two stunned eyes looked towards the origin of 
the sound, her expression filled with surprise and surprise.

Not only her, even the other cultivators in the hall looked towards the source of the sound in 
surprise.

Room number 58!

That voice came from room number 58!

After so many auctions, someone finally took the "Primeval Dao Stone"!

All of a sudden, all the cultivators in the hall were extremely curious. Just where did the owner of 
the room come from that he was actually interested in the divine grade dao stone? Could it be that 
he himself was a Weapon Refiner, or that he had relatives and friends with him, so he wanted to buy 
the "Primeval Dao Stone" and investigate it?

It seemed like this was the only explanation. Otherwise, who would be willing to spend 10,000 
immortal elemental energy beads to buy a divine grade dao stone?

"Humph!"

On the high platform, the young woman finally regained her senses after being momentarily 
stunned. She quickly retracted the surprise in her eyes and revealed a joyful smile on her charming 
face, "The guest in room number 58 has bid ten thousand 'Immortal Yuan Heavenly Beads', is there 
anyone else who wants to increase the bid?"

Seeing that there were no other bidders in the hall, the young woman immediately opened her 
mouth and said: "Since no one else bids, then this' Beginner Dao Stone 'will belong to number 58. 
Come, take this stone to room 58 and finish this auction."

The young woman spoke very fast as if she was afraid that Number 58 would go back on his word.

Thus, as soon as she finished speaking, the young woman impatiently handed the jade box to a 
waiter, and then let out a long sigh of relief.

The "Primeval Dao Stone" that couldn't be sold for so many times had finally fallen out of his 
hands!

Watching the attendant as he entered room fifty-eight, the young woman's smile became even wider 
and more cheerful. "Come, let's continue. Next …"

Inside room fifty-eight, Tang Huan had just received the jade case.

After opening it and taking a look, Tang Huan straightforwardly took out the jade pendant that 
contained the fifty thousand immortal elemental Heaven beads, and handed it over to the waiter. 
After the servant left, Tang Huan's gaze fell on the box once again, and an uncontrollable smile 
surfaced on her face.

The other cultivators might not know it, but he knew it very well.



Although the name "Primeval Dao Stone" had the word "Dao Stone" in it, it was not a real Dao 
Stone. It came from the Nether Realm and was closely connected to the Primordial Immortal Cult.
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