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Chapter 651 - Heaven and Earth

The white mist roiled about, gradually enveloping the two figures within. A beautiful melody that 
could captivate the hearts of anyone began to resound within the region.

After a long time, everything returned to normal.

Unknowingly, the fog began to dissipate and the surrounding space became more and more distinct. 
It was almost as if it was laughing out loud for a radius of ten meters, but was shaped like a 
hemisphere. In the center region of this hemisphere, Tang Huan and Shan Shan sat facing each other 
without uttering a word.

Shan Shan's black robe that had been drenched in sweat had already started to dry up, yet, it was 
still a little messy. Her originally fiery red skin was much more normal now, but there was still a 
hint of scarlet left on it, which made her already beautiful face even more charming and alluring.

However, at this moment, her eyes were drooping slightly, and she seemed to want to say 
something, but her entire body was surrounded by a captivating charm.

On the other side, Tang Huan was seated cross legged, his expression complex.

What happened after he entered the cave was truly something that Tang Huan did not expect. 
Initially, Tang Huan was still a little confused, he did not understand why Shan Shan would make 
such a move, but he immediately understood what happened.

Back then in the Luo Fu World, Shan Shan condensed the "Extreme Yin Spirit Body", while Tang 
Huan condensed the "Sun Spirit Body".

When Shan Shan went berserk and the Genuine Qi in his body became chaotic, the appearance of 
the "Sun Spirit Body" could be said to be a fatal attraction for the "Extreme Yin Spirit Body". Shan 
Shan's consciousness sank into a muddled state, and everything he did after that, were the 
instinctive reactions of "Extreme Yin Spirit Body".

This kind of most primitive matter was completely compatible with Way of Nature. "Sun Spirit 
Body" and "Extreme Yin Spirit Body" merged together, Yin and Yang mixed, and water and milk 
merged together.

During the process of the union of the two, the chaotic Genuine Qi in Shan Shan's body could also 
be said to have found a way to vent. It would rush into Tang Huan's body, and then return back into 
his own body. As the cycle continued, not only was Shan Shan's Genuine Qi being treated smoothly, 
it was also becoming more and more pure.

After this matter, not only did Shan Shan resolve the "Qi deviation" crisis, her cultivation had also 
soared and her master, the "Extreme Yin Spirit Body", had levelled up greatly. As for Tang Huan, he 
also received a huge benefit. The two spirit bodies blending together and circulating energy was 
also a form of refinement for Tang Huan's Genuine Qi.

Currently, Tang Huan's Genuine Qi had also increased, and his "Sun Spirit Body" had become even 
stronger.



This kind of thing would benefit both sides, so Tang Huan naturally would not resist. Furthermore, 
Tang Huan had always liked Shan Shan. It was just that all of this happened while Shan Shan was 
still in a daze, causing him to feel like he was taking advantage of someone.

"Shan Shan, when do you think we should get married?" Tang Huan finally opened his mouth and 
broke the silence of this place.

"Marry?"

Hearing Tang Huan's words, Shan Shan could not help but freeze for a moment, like a kitten whose 
tail had been stepped on, but just as she was sitting up, her eyebrows knitted slightly. With a groan, 
she sat back down, her beautiful face flushed red as she stared at Tang Huan, "Who … Who said 
they were going to marry you? "

Seeing that, Tang Huan unconsciously revealed a slight smile.

"You're still laughing!"

Shan Shan glared at Tang Huan shamelessly, but her superficial anger only made her even more 
emotional.

Tang Huan immediately stopped smiling, coughed twice, and said sternly: "Shan Shan, don't you 
think that the two of us are a match made in heaven?"

As they spoke, Tang Huan's gaze towards Shan Shan became abnormally hot.

They looked at each other, causing Shan Shan's heart to tremble. He turned his head and said 
forcefully: "You …. If you wish it to be so, I won't marry you! "

"If you won't marry me, then I'll marry you." Tang Huan moved closer to Shan Shan, and said while 
grinning.

"Tang Huan, you … How shameless, I... "I won't tell you anymore …"

Under Tang Huan's burning gaze, Shan Shan couldn't help but become a little flustered. Just as she 
finished speaking with her eyes averted, both of her arms pushed off the ground. However, before 
she could stand up, Tang Huan extended his arms and tightly held her slim waist.

"Tang Huan, you … Let go! " Shan Shan's cheeks were boiling as she struggled.

"Shan Shan, actually, I had liked you since long ago in the Furious Waves City. However, my 
cultivation was too low at that time, so I didn't say it. When I saw you in the sky quadrant, I had 
already made up my mind that I would make you mine. Now that we are married, how can I let go? 
Shan Shan, I want you! " Tang Huan's voice was gentle, but his tone revealed a sense of 
determination.

"Tang Huan, you have to give me some time. I once swore that I will not marry anyone if I don't 
find big brother!"

Shan Shan's delicate body softened, and an indescribable happiness surfaced from the bottom of her 
heart. But right after, she raised her head to look at Tang Huan, and her bright eyes held a hint of 
pleading, "Tang Huan, don't force me to break my oath, alright? As long as you find big brother, I'll 
marry you."

"Shan Shan, what if Shan Shi has already passed on?" Tang Huan hesitated.



"He's dead … If he is alive, I want to see him, if he is dead, I want to see his corpse! " Shan Shan's 
expression was a little blank, but she bit her lips and her tone became firm.

"He really passed away. He was buried in the Phoenix City." Tang Huan hesitated for a moment, 
before finally replying.

"How do you know?" Shan Shan was shocked.

"Because he is my father! Master only told me about this a few days ago. " Tang Huan took a light 
breath and laughed bitterly.

"What?" My brother is. "Your father..." Shan Shan's delicate body stiffened and her eyes widened. 
Her originally bright red face instantly turned pale white.

"Shan Shan, don't be afraid. Even though Stone is my father, you and him aren't blood related."

The reason why Tang Huan revealed this secret, was because he did not want Shan Shan to bear a 
grudge that she shouldn't have, and help them take revenge. This should have been his 
responsibility, and furthermore, Shan Shan had the authority to know the truth of the matter, and to 
know who her biological parents were.

Shan Shan's face finally gained an additional tinge of color, but as he stared blankly at Tang Huan, 
his eyes stared blankly for a long while.

"Shan Shan..."

Tang Huan called out worriedly.

She had always thought that she and Shan Shi were siblings. Now that she suddenly found out the 
truth, she would definitely find it hard to accept it.

"I'm fine."

Shan Shan finally came back to his senses and forced out a smile, "Actually, I already guessed that I 
might not be a descendant of the Sacred Emperor."

As he spoke, Shan Shan looked to the right in the blink of an eye. "Over here, there is another 
dimension. According to my observation, that dimension needs to have the bloodline of the Saint 
King in order for it to open, and I have tried many times to not be able to enter. It's just that I dared 
to believe it before, but now, I have finally confirmed it. "

Chapter 652 - Divine Weapon Catalogue Superclass

"Tang Huan, can you tell me who my biological parents are?"

His voice paused, Shan Shan turned back to look at Tang Huan, with tears in his eyes.

Seeing her like this, Tang Huan felt an intense love in his heart. The arm around her waist 
uncontrollably increased its strength by a few degrees, and it sighed lightly: "Your father is called 
Shan Guo, and your mother is called Shan Yao."

"So that's how it is."

Shan Shan muttered, "Every year, when I go to pay respects to my parents … When your 
grandfather and grandmother were, Grandfather Lu and Grandma Zhang would bring me along to 
pay respects to Mountain Country and Shan Yao. So it turns out that they were my real parents … " 



As he said till here, Shan Shan could no longer hold it in any longer and two streams of tears fell 
from the corners of his eyes.

Tang Huan said in a deep voice, "Shan Shan, Shan Guo and Shan Yao are your parents, and Shan 
Shan and Nie Yan are also your parents."

"What about you?" Shan Shan said in a daze.

"Me?" Tang Huan began to laugh, and said slowly, "Of course I'm Tang Huan. I was Tang Huan in 
the past, and now I am Tang Huan. I can only be Tang Huan in the future."

"You … You don't want to acknowledge your ancestors? "

Shan Shan was shocked, and looked at Tang Huan with misty eyes.

Hearing this, Tang Huan raised his hand to wipe away the tears at the corner of his eyes. A tender 
smile flashed across his eyes: "Compared to this, I want to be your husband even more." If he was 
still the same young man from before, he would definitely want to recognize and return to his clan. 
But for the current Tang Huan, there was no meaning in recognizing and returning to his clan.

"Shan Shan, you wouldn't be refusing to marry me now right?"

Tang Huan smiled again.

A bashful expression flashed between Shan Shan's brows, but following that, her eyes started to 
struggle, and she stuttered: "Tang Huan, I … "I …"

"Don't be in such a hurry to answer."

Tang Huan did not force her, and laughed: "Didn't you say that you need the bloodline of the Saint 
King to open that space? We will head over right now and see what exactly is inside?"

With that said, Tang Huan's left arm went through the bend of Shan Shan's leg and he leaped up into 
the air while hugging her.

Shan Shan couldn't help but exclaim out tenderly, and twisted her delicate body in Tang Huan's 
embrace: "Tang Huan, let me down, I … I can walk by myself! "

"I'm not letting go!" Tang Huan said while beaming.

"If you don't let me down, don't even think about me agreeing to marry you." Shan Shan said in 
embarrassment.

"You mean, if I put you down, you agreed." Tang Huan said with a face full of smiles.

"I didn't say that."

"..."

When he arrived in front of the wall on the right, Tang Huan still put Shan Shan down, yet he was 
still holding onto her small hand. And after such a small interlude, Shan Shan's originally depressed 
mood had clearly improved by a lot.

On the wall, there were many shallow indentations the size of a finger, crisscrossing one another.

The width and height were both almost two meters, and at the center of the grooves, there was a 
clear handprint. Almost all of the grooves could possibly be connected to the handprint.



Tang Huan only tried to react slightly, but his left palm had already pressed down on the palm.

In the next moment, under Tang Huan's control, the golden blood already came out from his palm, 
and like a small stream of water, it flowed through the grooves. In just a few breaths of time, all the 
grooves had been stained with golden blood. Tang Huan then raised his hand.

"Buzz!"

Right at this moment, a deep trembling sound rose up, and a dazzling white light bloomed out of the 
groove, making it difficult to look at. Tang Huan and Shan Shan squinted their eyes, only to see that 
the part of the wall enveloped by the white light was like ice and snow under the blazing sun, 
continuously melting at a speed visible to the naked eye.

A moment later, the white light disappeared and an arch appeared.

Behind the arch was a small, semi-spherical space. However, it was only half the size of the space 
outside.

"This place really requires the blood of the Saint King to open." Shan Shan let out a faint sigh, as a 
trace of sadness and bitterness appeared on his face.

"Let's go in together."

Tang Huan hugged Shan Shan's waist, and they went through the arch together. Besides the small 
jade table in the central area, there was almost nothing else in the small space.

On the table was a small jade box.

The two of them looked at each other before walking over and opening the lid of the box, what was 
placed on top was actually a piece of golden paper. Inside the paper were countless fiery red lines 
crisscrossing and densely packed, and with a closer look, one could vaguely make out six characters 
from them.

Divine Weapon Catalogue Superclass!

Tang Huan was a little surprised: "There's actually a Superclass for 'Divine Weapon Catalogue'?"

When he was in the Furious Waves City, the old man once said that the Saint King left behind some 
things for him that might be of help. From the looks of it, this old man was probably talking about 
this "Divine Weapon Catalogue" Superclass. This old man knew that the Sacred Emperor left 
something behind, but he probably didn't know that it was the Superclass. Otherwise, this old man 
would have said anything after knowing Tang Huan's current Tools Method Attainments and 
cultivation level.

"This is something that Grandpa Lu, Grandma Zhang, and even Aunt Zeng do not know."

Shan Shan's eyes also showed some surprise, but he immediately laughed, "You are currently 
Weapon Refining Grand Master, so it just happens to suit you. With it, your attainments in artifact 
forging might even rise to the next level. Above the Stage Nine is the Heavenly Domain, but I don't 
know what is above the Grandmaster? "

Hearing her words, Tang Huan was moved, and subconsciously took out the golden page with the 
words "Divine Weapon Catalogue Superclass" written on it. Underneath the page, a thin golden 
book appeared.



"Divine Armament's offensive skill?"

After clearly seeing the runes on the cover of the book, Tang Huan and Shan Shan could not help 
but look at each other.

In that moment, Tang Huan took out the book and flipped through it. Inside were gold pages, the 
pages were actually the same as the Divine Weapon Catalogue, glittering and translucent. The only 
difference was that what was drawn on the paper was not a weapon, but a variety of battle skill 
names. In addition, although the cover of the book was also gold in color, it was clearly an ordinary 
piece of paper. It should have been added by Mountain and River later on.

"Ten Thousand Li Ice Edge Sword Art!"

"Sword Art of the Jun Lin Clan!"

"..."

"Unparalleled Halberd Art!"

"Dazzling Spring Art!"

"..."

"Every single sword strike of the Divine Armament actually had a matching battle skill."

After quickly flipping through it, Tang Huan couldn't help but exclaim, "Shan Shan, that 'Dazzling 
Spring of Ten Thousand Flowers Arrows' should be compatible with your Divine Armament 
'Peacock Plume', right?"

"That's right, I'm cultivating the 'Dazzling Spring of Ten Thousand Flowers' archery." Shan Shan 
nodded her head, also feeling astonished. When Tang Huan was flipping through the pages, she 
counted and discovered that there were a total of thirty-six pages of "Divine Armament's War Skill", 
which just happened to match the number of Divine Armament s.

Chapter 653 - A Letter!

There were thirty-six Divine Armament s and thirty-six different battle skills!

The Divine Weapon Catalogue and the Divine Armament's battle skills came from the Forging God 
Great World, but they did not know that they were created by others. The Divine Weapon Catalogue 
might have been created by a single person, but the battle skills of the Divine Armament was not 
something that a single person could create. After all, among the thirty-six Divine Armament, there 
were various weapons such as swords, spears, swords, axes, hammers, spears and bows.

After a long while, Tang Huan and Shan Shan finally regained their senses and their eyes landed on 
the box once again. There was even a yellowed page that was filled with words.

After putting down the "Divine Armament's War Skill", Tang Huan picked up the piece of paper and 
read it with Shan Shan.

This was actually a letter from Mountain River to his descendant!

Tang Huan remained calm throughout, but the more Shan Shan saw, the uglier his expression 
became. From time to time, he would glance at Tang Huan with a hint of worry in his eyes, "Tang 
Huan, you …"



"..."

Tang Huan raised his index finger and made a gesture of silence, then slowly folded the paper and 
kept it in the [Sumeru Magical Ring].

Immediately after, Tang Huan passed the "Divine Armament's War Skill" to Shan Shan and laughed: 
"Shan Shan, the" Ten Thousand Flowers Dazzling Bow Technique "you are training in, was it 
taught to you by Senior Shan Lan? If you were to obtain the cultivation method from her, then it 
would be better for you to get more information from this place. Moreover, there are many different 
types of archery skills. If you can sense them once, then your battle skill will definitely increase by 
quite a bit. "

"This …" Shan Shan slightly hesitated, but in the end, he still extended his hand and received it.

"Shan Shan, let's go out right now. Master and the others must be getting anxious from waiting." 
Tang Huan kept the page on Divine Weapon Catalogue s and suddenly smiled, "This place is rather 
far from Senior Shan Lan's residence. Can you walk now?

"Tang Huan, why don't you go and die!"

It was unknown what Shan Shan was thinking about, but her pretty face was blushing red, and even 
her ears were burning hot. She embarrassedly spat and stomped on the ground, then quickly walked 
out of the small space.

"Shan Shan, I can't die. If I die, wouldn't you be a widow?"

Hearing this, Shan Shan's legs staggered and she almost fell to the ground. After stabilizing her 
delicate body, she couldn't help but turn around and glare at him in anger and embarrassment. Tang 
Huan laughed, and in a flash, he appeared by Shan Shan's side. Amidst her anxious and delicate 
voice, Tang Huan picked her up once again and walked away in large strides …

… ….

Time flew, and in the blink of an eye, several days had passed.

At dusk, in an exquisite hall in Glory Sacred Temple, Tang Huan who had already sat cross-legged 
on a prayer mat for the entire day finally opened his eyes.

At this moment, an unconcealable astonishment could be seen in his eyes.

In the past few days, Tang Huan spent most of his energy on clearing up Shan Shan and treating the 
old fatty's injuries. It was only this morning that he started to study the page "Divine Weapon 
Catalogue Superclass".

The way to obtain information about the Superclass was the same as the way to obtain Divine 
Weapon Catalogue s.

However, the information on this page was countless times larger than that of a single night's worth 
of Divine Weapon Catalogue. When the fiery red qi transformed from the words "Divine Weapon 
Catalogue Superclass" entered Tang Huan's forehead, countless information immediately exploded 
in the depths of Tang Huan's mind.

After spending an entire day, Tang Huan finally managed to understand all the information little by 
little.



It was only now that Tang Huan finally understood why Shanhe had kept the Superclass in the 
inside the cave and not gave it to the old man or anyone else. The information in the Superclass was 
simply too astonishing. If one's cultivation level wasn't high enough, knowing too much would only 
bring them advantages and disadvantages.

"Divine Armament is divided into low, middle, high, heaven, and saint levels."

"These thirty-six Divine Armament s are actually only the lowest level Divine Armament s, and 
those thirty-six page Divine Weapon Catalogue are also only the lowest level maps!"

"The number of complete Divine Weapon Catalogue s is actually as many as 180 pages!"

"I wonder who the Divine Weapon Catalogue came from? Even low-ranked Divine Armament s are 
already so shockingly powerful, I wonder how strong are Heaven Ranked and Saint Ranked Divine 
Armament s? "

"..."

Tang Huan thought.

It wouldn't be long before the Ling Xiao Arch appeared, and the test that Yun Zhan had set in the 
Ling Xiao Ancient Road would definitely be passed. This way, master, the old fatty, and the Aunt 
Xing would all have the chance to head towards the Forging God Great World.

"Clank!" "Clank, clank …"

The crisp sound of footsteps rang out, pulling the thinking Tang Huan back to reality. Looking up, it 
was actually Shan Shan who was elegantly walking over. At this time, Shan Shan was still dressed 
in black. Her face was extremely beautiful, her delicate body floated in the air, and when she raised 
her hands and legs, she gave off a mature flirtatious air.

"Shan Shan, I was just about to go look for you, when you came over."

Tang Huan stood up, welcomed the attack with a smile, and naturally stopped Shan Shan's slender 
waist.

Shan Shan's arms wrapped around Tang Huan's back, her cheeks flushed red, her beautiful eyes 
became lively, as though there was spring water flowing inside them. After a moment, she suddenly 
chanted: "Tang Huan, you want me …."

Tang Huan was startled, Shan Shan's current performance seemed to be abnormal.

Ever since he and Shan Shan had become husband and wife, during these few days, although Shan 
Shan didn't really resist his coquettish actions, every time Tang Huan wanted to take a step further, 
he would always refuse. Naturally, Tang Huan wouldn't force it either. But now, Shan Shan had 
actually become active.

But, before Tang Huan could think about it, Shan Shan had already stood on her tiptoes and covered 
his mouth with her fiery red lips.

Tang Huan felt as if a flame was burning inside his body.

In palace, spring had quickly arrived.

Night passed and day came. Unknowingly, dawn had arrived in the sky.



Inside the grand hall, Shan Shan picked up the clothes scattered on the ground, covering her 
beautiful body. The inlaid gems on the surrounding walls constantly released a soft luster, 
illuminating her flushed face with an incomparably seductive charm.

"Tang Huan, I'm leaving now …" Shan Shan suddenly said.

"I've already guessed it." Tang Huan sighed as he sat up straight and looked at Shan Shan.

"You're not advising me to stay?" Shan Shan was a little surprised.

"After hesitating for a few days, you have already made up your mind. My advice is of no use, you 
can go out and walk around, and it will be good as well. When the 'Ling Xiao Arch' appears, I will 
wait for you there." Tang Huan laughed, "Forging God Great World is too big, all alone, it's really 
too lonely."

"You aren't alone, aren't you? Didn't the Furious Waves City have two women waiting for you at 
home?" Shan Shan snorted.

"They are not my women, you are!" Tang Huan laughed.

"I might not go to the Foggy Sea Island." Shan Shan's brows slightly bent, and then she curled her 
lips.

"If you don't come, I'll have to wait ten more years for you."

"You …"

"..."

Chapter 654 - Heaven's Halberd

After Shan Shan left the Heavenly Forging City, she did not say where she wanted to go, and Tang 
Huan did not say everything she could think of.

Her cultivation had always been one of the Peak Stage Nine s. After the fusion of "Sun Spirit Body" 
and "Extreme Yin Spirit Body", her cultivation had advanced another step and she was now able to 
activate the half-finished state of the fake Heavenly Domain. Her current strength was completely 
comparable to Fen Tian's strength before she had entered the Heavenly Domain Realm.

In the current small world, the number of people whose strength surpassed hers could be counted on 
one hand.

Furthermore, when she left the Heavenly Forging City, she had the company of a pair of "Blood 
Plume Heavenly Hawk". It could be said that the possibility of her encountering danger was 
extremely small.

Under such a situation, Tang Huan naturally did not need to worry about her safety.

A few days later, Tang Huan also left the Heavenly Forging City. Other than him, the old fatty and 
Shan Lan also left together with him.

The old fatty's injuries were rather strange. His internal organs had all been corroded by a demonic 
energy.

What Tang Huan was doing now, was slowly using the power of the "Nirvana Sacred Fire" to 
dissolve the evil energy. However, that power had been hidden within the old fatty's body for 



decades, and had already fused with his internal organs. When they were going to attack, they had 
to be extremely careful, otherwise, it would easily injure his internal organs.

During this process, no matter if it was the control over the Genuine Qi or the control over the 
power of the Spiritual Fire, one needed to reach an extremely strong level. It was also fortunate that 
Tang Huan was already a Heavenly Domain-level Expert. If he was still a Stage Nine Martial Saint, 
even if his "Nirvana Sacred Fire" was strong enough, he wouldn't dare to act rashly.

The old fatty had once said that Tang Huan had to possess a strength that exceeded the Stage Nine 
in order to treat him.

Of course, the old fatty's injuries were already deeply rooted, and even Tang Huan would not be 
able to completely remove the evil energy within a few days. Tang Huan reckoned that it would take 
at least a month, so naturally he had to invite the old fatty to stay in Furious Waves City for a period 
of time.

Within the Furious Waves City, even after many days had passed, the heated discussions about Tang 
Huan and the great battle had still yet to come to an end.

As more and more Martial Warriors returned from Origin Continent, more and more detailed news 
began to spread throughout the entire Furious Waves City. The enthusiasm of the people in the city 
was also growing. There were even people who bravely ran towards the smithy in the north of the 
city from time to time.

Tang Huan knew of their existence, but he did not care about them. After entering the blacksmith 
shop, he did not come out again.

Three days later, in the evening.

"Hu!"

An abnormally terrifying wave suddenly swept out in all directions like a wave, vast and mighty, in 
an instant, it had engulfed the entire Furious Waves City.

In an instant, countless people in Furious Waves City felt their hearts palpitate. They were 
inexplicably shocked, and the originally noisy city immediately became deathly silent. Soon after, 
from the north side of the city, a dazzling beam of fiery red light suddenly soared into the sky, 
instantly coalescing into a long halberd.

A terrifying aura spread out, filling up the entire space.

"Divine Armament! This kid can forge a Divine Armament so quickly! " In a four-story pavilion on 
the north side of Furious Waves City, the old fatty rushed out of the window like a whirlwind. When 
he looked up, his chubby face was full of surprise.

"This is the 'ancient halberd'!"

Shan Lan looked over, and was shocked, "From the Qi he can see, this heavenly halberd has already 
surpassed any Divine Armament that my brother forged."

"Only three days have passed, right?"

A hint of surprise flashed across Ou Xie's eyes, but very quickly, this surprise was replaced with 
excitement.



Before this, he had always heard the old fatty talking to Shan Lan about how powerful Tang Huan's 
Tools Method Attainments was. Even though he did not doubt it, he had never personally seen it.

Amongst the thirty-six Divine Armament s, the difficulty of forging the "halberd art" was no less 
than that of the "Conqueror Spear".

According to Ou Xie's knowledge, when Tang Huan was forging the "Conqueror Spear", he had 
used around ten days. But now, Tang Huan had only used three days to forge the "ancient halberd", 
which was even less than the time he spent to forge the "Flame Dancing Sword".

From this, it could be seen that, compared to when he was in the Forging God Cave back then, Tang 
Huan's current Tools Method Attainments had once again increased by an enormous amount.

"As expected, 'A green man wins over a blue'."

Ou Xie inexplicably thought of Tang Huan's words and deeply agreed with him. A few years ago, he 
had painstakingly forged the Divine Armament's "Rains Sword", but today, Tang Huan had easily 
forged the "ancient halberd". It could be seen that Tang Huan's Tools Method Attainments had 
already far surpassed his master.

Even the Sacred Emperor from a hundred years ago found it difficult to compare to Tang Huan.

"Come, let's go over now and take a look at his new halberd art …" The old fatty excitedly turned 
around and ran out of the room.

"..."

Ou Xie and Shan Lan laughed as they looked at each other, then followed along quickly. However, 
they were also rather looking forward to the newly born "halberd art".

… ….

"Divine Armament?"

On the top floor of Divine Weapon Pavilion, a shout suddenly sounded, and in that instant, a figure 
appeared at the western window. Her figure was graceful and her face was flirtatious, it was Qing 
Ye.

At this moment, her beautiful face couldn't help but reveal a surprised expression.

She had just returned to Furious Waves City from Origin Continent, and in the end, she hadn't even 
sat down to catch her breath when she witnessed the scene of the Divine Armament coming out 
from the furnace and taking form with her own eyes. When she was in Sword Crafting Valley, she 
had seen it before, but it was not as clear as it was now, nor as shocking as it was now.

"Tang Huan..."

Qing Ye almost subconsciously said the name.

The abnormal sign appeared from the north side of the city, showing that the Divine Armament 
must have been created by Tang Huan. Adding the Flame Dancing Sword, Conqueror Spear, Ghost-
killing Saber, and the newly created halberd, Tang Huan's number of Divine Armament s had 
already reached four.



Qing Ye couldn't help but have a strong urge to immediately run over to take a look, but the moment 
she turned around, she suppressed this impulse.

"With Tang Huan's temperament, he definitely wouldn't stop just forging one Divine Armament. He 
would wait a few days, then forge a few more Divine Armament before heading over."

"..."

… ….

"I really didn't expect that even in Furious Waves City, I would still be able to see the Divine 
Armament coming out." In front of the Star Ocean Weapon Shop, Hai Kun looked up at the fiery 
red halberd in the sky and sighed to himself, thinking back to when he had activated the fire totem 
in the weapon shop, and obtained the True Fire. In the blink of an eye, several years had passed and 
the little Martial Disciple back then had already become the peerless expert who could kill Demon 
Lord Fen Tian today.

"Well, we have to tell the young lady about this news as soon as possible."

"..."

Inside the Furious Waves City, some of the higher cultivation people came back to their senses even 
faster and exclaimed in shock. Not long after, the shadow of the fiery red halberd disappeared from 
the northern part of the city. The terrifying aura that filled the sky dissipated at the same time, and 
the city that had been silent for a while started to boil.

PS: There is an award event in your palm culture. For more information, please see the comments 
on the page. If you are interested, you can check it out.

Chapter 655 - Dragon Slaughtering Saber

Combined with the various rumors about Sword Crafting Valley, many clever people immediately 
thought of Divine Armament.

The news of Tang Huan forging three Divine Armament s had long ago spread throughout the world 
and the current Furious Waves City had never heard of him before. However, the people had only 
heard of him before, and had never seen the image of him forming his true form with his intent.

The scene that had just revealed itself in the north of the city was so strange that the excitement in 
everyone's hearts could be imagined.

"So this is what it means to take form …" Master Tang Huan! The one who was forging this Divine 
Armament must be Master Tang Huan! I never thought that he would silently forge a Divine 
Armament in this Furious Waves City. "

"What I saw just now seemed like a halberd. Among the 36 Divine Armament s, there are 
halberds?"

"Last time in the Sword Crafting Valley, Master Tang Huan consecutively forged three Divine 
Armament s. I wonder how many of them he will continuously refine this time?"

"..."

Inside Furious Waves City, there were different opinions.



Another three days passed. It was late at night.

A wave of terrifying aura once again swept across heaven and earth. Many Martial Warriors were 
either awakened from their cultivation or slumber, and their hearts were trembling uncontrollably. 
At this time, in the northern part of Furious Waves City, a beam of green light shot into the sky like 
a pillar of smoke, quickly congealing into a long blade.

"Azure Dragon's crescent moon blade?" On the top floor of the Divine Weapon Pavilion, Qing Ye 
stood coquettishly in front of the window.

"He forged a Divine Armament in three days?" Gu Family, in a courtyard, Gu Jingcheng 
involuntarily gasped out.

"Tsk tsk, this speed, even the His Sacred Emperor Majesty back then would not be able to compare 
to it!"

"..."

When that halberd type Divine Armament appeared last time, very few people knew how long Tang 
Huan took to forge it. However, the amount of time Tang Huan spent forging this Divine Armament 
was clearly known to everyone within the city. Instantly, exclamations of surprise sounded in every 
corner of the city.

However, as time passed, everyone was shocked and calmed down. In the end, they were even 
somewhat numb to it.

Divine Armament was the strongest weapon in this small world, and due to the fact that the 
materials were hard to find and the fact that very few Weapon Refining Grand Master were able to 
successfully forge them, they became more and more precious. However, once they appeared once 
every three days, no matter how shocked they were at the start, they would slowly get used to it.

However, although everyone was not surprised, the Furious Waves City became increasingly rowdy.

Almost every day, a large number of Martial Warriors who had heard of the news gathered from 
every single direction, wanting to form the shape of a Divine Armament.

To all Martial Warriors, this opportunity to broaden their horizons was something they could only 
hope for. After all, there were only so many Divine Weapon Catalogue and there would be one less 
page to create a Divine Armament if they succeeded. When Tang Huan turned all the Divine 
Weapon Catalogue in his hands into Divine Armament, there would probably be no more Divine 
Armament appearing in the future.

Unknowingly, over a month had already passed.

The first glimmer of dawn appeared, and the smithy in the north of the city, which had been silent 
all night, became lively once more.

Inside the wide courtyard, Xiao Budian was flapping her little wings and floating around happily. At 
this time, the number of fleshy wings on Xiao Budian's back had already increased to four pairs. 
Before Tang Huan returned from the Heavenly Forging City, it had woken up from its deep slumber, 
and the two sarcoma-like bulges on its back formed a new pair of wings.

On the ground, Xiao Ai and the little ghost head chased after Xiao Budian's figure, jumping up from 
time to time and landing on its back, playing around happily.



Feng Ming and Mu Yan, on the other hand, were cultivating in their rooms.

Although the two of them disliked each other and often mocked and ridiculed each other after 
meeting, they had never relaxed when it came to cultivation. Especially Mu Yan, he felt a sense of 
urgency. She knew very well that once the "Ling Xiao Arch" appeared on the ancient battlefield in 
the sea of fog, Tang Huan would definitely enter the "Ling Xiao Ancient Road".

That "Ling Xiao Ancient Road" could only be entered by experts from the Stage Nine.

If Tang Huan passed the examination and passed the "Ling Xiao Ancient Road", if she was still a 
Martial Lord of the eighth step, she could only watch "Ling Xiao Ancient Road" anxiously. 
However, she also knew the principle of haste makes waste. Even though her heart was filled with 
anxiety, she wasn't impatient during the process of cultivation.

"Hu!"

After a long while, Mu Yan opened his eyes and exhaled lightly.

But at this moment, an incomparably tyrannical wave of aura suddenly surged out without any 
warning. It was like a stormy sea that churned and churned, causing her heart to tremble 
uncontrollably.

In the past few days, she had felt this kind of aura many times.

"This is the first time... Thirteen Divine Armament s! "

Mu Yan's face revealed a hint of joy. She knew that Tang Huan had a total of sixteen pages of the 
Divine Weapon Catalogue s' remnant scrolls, and after using three pages in the Sword Crafting 
Valley, there were still thirteen pages remaining. This meant that after this Divine Armament was 
successfully forged, all of the Divine Weapon Catalogue on Tang Huan's body had been used up.

In a blink of an eye, Mu Yan had already stood up, and with a slight movement of his feet, he left 
the room.

But just as she arrived outside Tang Huan's room, a red figure appeared out of nowhere. It was Feng 
Ming. The two of them simultaneously let out a light snort. In the next moment, they pushed open 
the door at the same time again and entered Tang Huan's bedroom.

In the room, Tang Huan stood up and looked at the large blade in his hand with a big smile.

The shape of the blade was quite unique. The handle was not considered thick, only about two feet 
long. However, the width of the blade was astonishing, and its length was close to three times that 
of the hilt. On the handle of the red-hot blade, a golden line appeared, spiraling upwards. After 
leaving the hilt, the golden pattern rapidly expanded, turning into a golden dragon that bared its 
fangs and brandished its claws. It crawled on the back of the saber, making it look extremely 
domineering.

"Tang Huan, what's the name of this blade?" Mu Yan was extremely curious and asked 
subconsciously.

"Dragon Slaughtering Saber!"

Tang Huan spouted the three words, and a thick smile appeared on his face.



Tang Huan was extremely familiar with this name blade in his previous life. Martial Saint with a 
treasured blade that could slay dragons, commanding the world, no one dared to disobey! If the 
Heavens do not appear, who will be able to contend against them? " This sentence from the wuxia 
novel, "Lean on the Sky and Kill the Dragon", can be considered a household name. He never 
thought that there would actually be a Divine Armament among the Divine Weapon Catalogue 
named "Dragon Slaughtering Saber" … Of course, this had to be a coincidence. It was just that he 
did not know if the existence of Dragon Slaughtering Saber would mean that he had the Heavenly 
Sword to rely on.

This thought flashed across Tang Huan's mind in a sinister manner.

"This name is indeed domineering." Feng Ming started laughing, two eyes swept past the shining 
Divine Armament behind Tang Huan, and could not help but ask, "Tang Huan, there are so many 
Divine Armament, how do you plan to deal with them?"

"Of course it's a gift."

Tang Huan laughed out loud, "Feng Ming, now that you have the 'Flame Dancing Sword', all of 
these Divine Armament s are not fated for you anymore. However, Mu Yan doesn't have any Divine 
Armament s yet …." After saying that, Tang Huan looked up at Mu Yan, and waved his hand, "Mu 
Yan, which Divine Armament have you taken a fancy to, take it directly."

Chapter 656 - Heavenly Luo Soul Refining Art

After obtaining Fen Tian's "Soul Method True Explanation", Tang Huan had complete Spirit 
Adhesion techniques. During this period of time, among the thirteen Divine Armament s that he had 
forged, the artifact spirit no longer contained his own Mind Stigma. No matter who these Divine 
Armament s landed in, they were able to successfully merge with each other.

"Tang Huan, then I won't be polite."

Mu Yan beamed with joy, her beautiful eyes revealed a trace of excitement, and her gaze landed on 
a longbow. The bow was bent, and was extremely exquisite.

"The name of this bow is' Dragon Tongue '."

Following Mu Yan's gaze, Tang Huan could not help but smile.

There were a total of three Divine Armament s that he had first inherited from this old man. First, 
there was the "Conqueror Spear," second, there was the "Xuanyuan Sword," and second, there was 
the "Dragon Tongue Bow."

"I choose it."

Mu Yan squinted his eyes and laughed, he lightly stepped forward a few steps and picked it up, then 
he sat down with his legs crossed. Under her urging, the next moment, fresh blood oozed out from 
the tip of her finger and continuously seeped into the bow. Not long after, the bow was covered in 
blood.

Time passed bit by bit, and the blood-red color on the bow became even more intense. It even 
emitted out, forming a blood-red fog that completely enveloped the longbow.

Seeing this scene, Feng Ming's eyes flashed with a tinge of envy.



The thirteen Divine Armament s that Tang Huan had forged were definitely much more powerful 
than the Flame Dancing Sword, Conqueror Spear and Ghost-killing Saber that he had forged in the 
Sword Crafting Valley back then. Of course, the difference was mainly in the Spirit of Divine 
Weapon s. The first three Spirit Adhesion s all used the soul of the Stage Nine, and the thirteen 
Divine Armament s such as the Dragon Slaughtering Saber all used the soul of the Heavenly 
Domain Fierce Beasts.

Looking at her expression, Tang Huan unwittingly smiled: "There is a type of 'Heavenly Luo Soul 
Refining Art' in the 'Soul Method True Explanation'. It can absorb and refine souls, and increase the 
quality of spirit artifacts."

"Heavenly Luo Soul Refining Art …"

Feng Ming's eyes lit up, and then she went close to Tang Huan's ear. Her eyes were bewitching, and 
she laughed with an orchid like breath: "Tang Huan, I came to find you tonight, teach me this 
technique again." As she said that, her red and tender tongue actually stuck out, sliding past Tang 
Huan's earlobes, her expression was extremely enchanting.

"What are you waiting for tonight? I'll teach you later."

Tang Huan's heart skipped a beat, and he immediately collected his thoughts, snappily giving her a 
punch. Feng Ming had never learnt these things before, he had only stayed with Mu Yan for a little 
more than a month and he already broke his promise.

If it was in the past, Tang Huan wouldn't have too much of a feeling towards this kind of 
enticement. But after the two times he had intertwined with Shan Shan in the Heavenly Forging 
City, his "Sun Spirit Body" had actually started to have a drastic change in its taste.

"Humph!"

Feng Ming curled his lips, and the look in his eyes towards Tang Huan became somewhat bitter.

This was a move that he had learned from Mu Yan! Tang Huan pretended not to see it, his gaze 
landed on Mu Yan's body once again, the blood mist was quickly flowing into his right palm, and 
before long, the blood mist and the Dragon Tongue Bow that was covered by it disappeared, as the 
Divine Armament had already merged with his body.

The strange feeling of being connected to the Divine Armament by blood and having the same 
thought filled her beautiful eyes with amazement. Then, like a child who had obtained a fresh toy, 
she turned the Dragon Tongue Bow over and over, sizing it up.

Tang Huan smiled. Just as he was about to speak, he seemed to have sensed something and laughed 
loudly: "Miss Xing Yan, since you are already at my place, why not come and have a chat with 
me?" While they were talking, Tang Huan had already put down the Dragon Slaughtering Saber. He 
took a step out of the bedroom, and although his voice was not loud, it was clearly heard.

"Whoosh!"

After a while, a figure floated and landed in the courtyard. She was dressed in purple and had a 
black veil over her face and was Xing Yan from Star Ocean Commerce.

"Brother Tang Huan, how have you been?" Xing Yan's eyes were bright and beautiful, her voice was 
clear and pleasant like the chirping of an oriole, her words were filled with laughter, "I came here to 



take a look, and was just planning to wait for you to finish forging Divine Armament, and pay a 
visit, but I didn't expect you to find out after a while."

"All of the Divine Weapon Catalogue on my body have been refined into Divine Armament."

Tang Huan said with a smile.

"Oh?"

Xing Yan's beautiful eyes lit up, "It looks like I've come at the right time. Brother Tang Huan, those 
thirteen Divine Armament s, would they be able to broaden my horizons?"

"Please."

Tang Huan invited Xing Yan into his room with a smile on his face.

Xing Yan first nodded her head towards Feng Ming, and when she saw Mu Yan, who had just stood 
up, she actually also nodded. Her face still revealed a hint of a smile, and immediately after, she 
impatiently went over to the table that was filled with Divine Armament.

Mu Yan smiled back at Xing Yan, but a trace of surprise flashed past his eyes.

She was once the general director of the Flowing Flower Merchant Guild and could be considered 
to be in a hostile position with the Star Ocean Commerce. Back then, when the Star Ocean 
Commerce was forced to hold the "Phoenix Spirit Martial Meeting", it was her masterpiece. She 
even participated in the Martial Competition match and obtained a portion of the "Phoenix Flame 
Essence".

What surprised her was that Tang Huan and Xing Yan's relationship seemed to be quite good.

"Brother Tang Huan, your Tools Method Attainments, in our world, has never been seen before and 
will never be seen again." After a long while, Xing Yan reluctantly withdrew his gaze, and when he 
looked at Tang Huan again, he looked like he wanted to say something, but was a little hesitant.

"You're too kind."

Tang Huan laughed, then said: "Miss Xing Yan, you and I are old friends, if there's anything you 
need my help with, feel free to say it."

"Alright, Tang Huan, then I won't bother with formalities anymore." Xing Yan gave a carefree smile 
and retrieved a small wooden box from his sleeve. He quickly opened it and found a golden page 
quietly lying inside, on it was a purple sword sketched out.

"Divine Weapon Catalogue?"

Tang Huan was stunned for a moment, then understood what Xing Yan meant, and laughed, "Miss 
Xing Yan, if you trust me, then leave this page behind. In three or four days, you can come and 
fetch the sword."

As for why Xing Yan took out a page of the "Divine Weapon Catalogue", Tang Huan was not 
surprised.

Star Ocean Commerce was spread throughout the two continents of glory and origin, and had a 
large amount of power. It was normal for a page of "Divine Weapon Catalogue" to be collected.



"Brother Tang Huan, then I'll be counting on you." Xing Yan closed the wooden box without 
hesitation and handed it over to Tang Huan, "The reward for forging the Divine Armament …"

"To me, forging a Divine Armament is not a difficult task, so there's no need for the reward." Tang 
Huan waved his hand.

"..."

Not long after, Xing Yan left the blacksmith shop.

However, Xing Yan's appearance was merely the beginning. She had left for less than fifteen 
minutes, and Tang Moyang, Shamei and Mo Huang had already joined forces and arrived.

Chapter 657 - Reentering the Infernal domain

The return of the Stage Nine Rankers of the Human Clan meant that the great battle between the 
three clans had completely ended.

Xing Meng, Mu Qing and the rest, as well as the tens of thousands of Tian Clan soldiers, had 
already left the Tranquil Continent and returned to the Holy Spirit Continent.

In this battle, the Tian Clan obtained the magic essence stone vein within the Two Realms Plain, and 
the Human Clan occupied a vast amount of territory within the Tranquil Continent, so they were not 
attacked by the Demon Clan. As for the Demon Clan's veterans, they retreated to the west and north 
of the Tranquil Continent's numerous large and small islands, with an extremely slim chance of 
returning to the continent.

After a long while, some of the Human Allied Forces s started to return to the Glory Continent.

And at this moment, Tang Huan had already arrived at the Infernal domain's desert. On this trip, 
only Feng Ming, Xiao Budian and Xiao Ai followed along, while Mu Yan brought along the little 
ghost to enter the "sky spirit secret realm." She possessed the Human Clan's bloodline, and she 
wasn't even thirty years old yet, so they could continue cultivating inside.

"I can't!" I can't accept this! "

In a simple stone room in Star Stone Continent, Cang Mo looked at the three Divine Armament s in 
front of him and shook his hands in shock. Back then, when Tang Huan left the Star Stone 
Continent, he gave three pages of Divine Weapon Catalogue and many materials to Tang Huan.

"Senior Cang Mo, you don't have to be this polite with me, I forged quite a few Divine Armament s 
a while ago."

Tang Huan said with a smile.

Then, with a slight movement of this thought, the Space Aircraft in Feng Ming's hand trembled and 
released a large amount of cyan light. A moment later, one after another, Divine Armament 
appeared from within the light. The space of the Sumeru Magical Ring was limited, and most of the 
Divine Armament s could not fit inside. However, the interior of the aircraft was spacious enough.

However, if he just took the items out from there, it wouldn't be as convenient as taking out the 
"Sumeru Magical Ring".

Following the continuous appearance of the Divine Armament, terrifying auras spread out one after 
another, and this stone house, was illuminated by all kinds of dazzling lights as if it were a dream.



Seeing this scene, Cang Mo stared blankly at the door, at the entrance, the elders who had rushed 
over due to being alarmed by the Qi were also dumbstruck.

Tang Huan smiled and kept the Divine Armament one by one.

He knew very well that if he did not show off, Cang Mo would definitely not accept those three 
Divine Armament s. Cang Mo had been of great help to him, and if not for Cang Mo telling him the 
location of the secret passage, it would have been impossible for him to have entered the "Furious 
Billows Castle" without anyone noticing.

"Senior Cang Mo, please accept this."

Tang Huan smiled from between his brows.

The three Divine Armament s he had given out were sword, hammer and axe respectively. Their 
sword names were "Blood Embers", their hammers were "Orange Hammer" and their axes were 
"Ferocious Chasing".

"Alright, alright, I'll take it."

Cang Mo finally no longer refused, and bitterly smiled as he nodded his head, but deep down his 
heart, he was filled with emotion.

He had never thought that one day, he would also be able to own a Divine Armament. One must 
know that at that time, only Ye Chongshan, Feng Wuye and the other generals possessed Divine 
Armament, which was bestowed upon them by the Sacred Emperor. Now, Tang Huan had sent three 
of them out in an instant. If this news were to spread, it would cause everyone to go crazy.

After a while, Cang Mo calmed himself down: "Little brother, you just said that you have 
something to take care of this time in Origin Continent, if there's anything that you need from us old 
fellows, feel free to ask. Although we are not very strong, running errands is not a problem. "

"Thank you, Senior Cang Mo." Tang Huan laughed, "Actually, I want to try and see if I can find that 
'Secluded Night Divine Palace'." This was the last thing on Tang Huan's mind before he left. To 
eradicate the "Secluded Night Divine Palace", not only was it Shan Shan's wish, it was also his 
wish.

"Secluded Night Divine Palace..."

Hearing Tang Huan's words, Cang Mo's expression suddenly changed slightly, "Little brother, 
dozens of years ago, when Glory Sacred Temple was attacked by the 'Secluded Night Divine 
Palace', Lord General unintentionally mentioned that the 'Secluded Night Divine Palace' might be 
within that Foggy Sea Island."

"Foggy Sea Island?"

Tang Huan was startled at first, but then his face changed: "Senior Cang Mo, is what you said for 
real?" He never thought that he would be able to obtain such important information in the Star 
Stone Continent, he suddenly felt lucky that he had mentioned something to Cang Mo right when he 
arrived.

Cang Mo nodded: "General, I agree, Glory Sacred Temple being attacked by the 'Secluded Night 
Divine Palace' was a great matter that shook the world, so I have a deep impression of it. Although 
the general's judgement may not be completely accurate, it was at least seventy to eighty percent 



likely. At that time, Lord General had entered the Foggy Sea Island several times to explore the 
ancient battlefield remains, and was extremely familiar with the situation there. "

"Great!"

Tang Huan clapped heavily, excitement flickering in his eyes.

All these years, whether it was the Human Clan, or the Tian Clan, all of them had been searching 
for the base of the "Secluded Night Divine Palace". He had searched for all possible places he could 
find. Now that he had found a place that was seventy to eighty percent likely to be the residence of 
a "Secluded Night Divine Palace," he basically wouldn't run away anymore.

By the side, Feng Ming couldn't help but laugh as well. "Tang Huan, why don't we leave right now 
and head to the Foggy Sea Island?"

"Yes!" "Right away!"

Just as he was about to bid farewell to Cang Mo, he seemed to have thought of something and 
suddenly slapped his head, and laughed: "I am not in a hurry either, since we have reached the 
'Demon Region Desert', I naturally have to go back to that place."

"Little brother, where are you going?" Cang Mo asked with some curiosity.

"Infernal domain!"

Tang Huan smiled slightly.

Just now, he had been in such a hurry that he had forgotten about it. Aside from sending three 
Divine Armament s to Cang Mo, he also came to the Infernal Realm this time. Tang Huan had been 
salivating over the Space Aircraft in the Infernal Realm for a long time. The aircraft possessed a 
spirit artifact, and its quality definitely surpassed that of the current Space Aircraft. If he could get 
hold of it, he would come to Forging God Great World, and it would definitely be of great use.

"Infernal domain?"

Hearing the two words that came out of Tang Huan's mouth, other than Feng Ming, no matter if it 
was Cang Mo or the elders at the entrance, they were all shocked. Others might not be able to 
escape from that place, but Tang Huan, on the other hand, after going there once, wanted to go there 
again.

In an instant, persuasion and dissuasion could be heard.

However, Cang Mo and the rest were still unable to sway Tang Huan. Not long after, the Space 
Aircraft turned into a wisp of green light and pierced through the air, moving faster than lightning. 
In an extremely short amount of time, it floated to the edge of the Demon Area, from within which, 
numerous figures flashed and appeared.

Cang Mo, Feng Ming, Xiao Budian and the others all stopped at the Gobi Desert, while Tang Huan 
walked into the boundaries of the Demon Area under numerous gazes.

In that moment, the terrifying power of the sucking swept over. Tang Huan did not resist at all and 
immediately soared into the sky, disappearing into the depths of the Demon Area.

Chapter 658 - Spirit Essences

In the blink of an eye, Tang Huan once again entered that familiar white space.



With just a thought, Five Colors Heavenly Domain whizzed out from his body. Compared to 
before,'s Heavenly Domain could shrink even smaller, and furthermore, he did not maintain his 
circular shape from before, but maintained the same shape as his body. Looking at it, Tang Huan 
looked as if he was enveloped in a rainbow colored figure.

This shape of the Heavenly Domain could allow Tang Huan to control it more easily and smoothly.

With his strength, if Heavenly Domain were to be pushed to his limits, he could completely 
withstand the power of the Space Aircraft's sucking. However, in that case, it would be the complete 
opposite of Tang Huan's original intentions. If one felt that Tang Huan was too powerful, then the 
artifact spirit would very likely seal the aircraft.

Now that he was inside the aircraft, there was naturally no need for Tang Huan to hide anymore.

Following the appearance of the Five Colors Heavenly Domain, a majestic and vast aura pervaded 
the air and Tang Huan's Perception Ability instantly rose to an unprecedented level.

"Whoosh!"

Tang Huan's footsteps moved, and with an astonishing speed, he smashed into the right wall where 
the wall rippled slightly like a ripple. He appeared in a triangular-shaped space.

Almost as soon as Tang Huan's body appeared, the wall behind him regained its calm.

This was obviously caused by the Space Aircraft's artifact spirit, but Tang Huan was not worried at 
all. Smiling, he arrived in front of the round platform in the center of the stage, raised his hand and 
pressed it down on the stage. The vigorous Mind Power immediately rushed in like a flood.

The last time he was trapped here, Tang Huan had carefully studied and calculated the Spirit Map 
that Shan Shan provided. Currently, he was extremely familiar with the structure of this Space 
Aircraft. Once the Mind Power entered the round table, it scattered like silk and quickly spread 
along the Spirit Map.

In just a few breaths of time, Tang Huan's Mind Power had followed the Spirit Map to every corner 
of the Space Aircraft. Immediately after, the entire situation of the Space Aircraft appeared 
abnormally clear in Tang Huan's mind, with not the slightest bit of information that was left out.

To reach this step, one would need to possess a huge amount of Mind Power. Furthermore, the 
control over the Mind Power was extremely high as well.

If Tang Huan was still in the Stage Nine realm, he would never be able to do it. Now that Tang 
Huan was already a Heavenly Domain-level Expert, whether it was the Mind Power or his control 
of the Mind Power, both had increased by leaps and bounds.

After a while, Tang Huan caught a glimpse of a ball of white mist.

It was hiding on the wall behind Tang Huan, which had recovered its calmness. It was extremely 
intelligent, and the aura it emitted was also extremely powerful. However, that aura had already 
merged with the Space Aircraft and could not be sensed by ordinary means.

It was obviously the artifact spirit of the Space Aircraft.

Tang Huan could feel a panicked feeling from it. It could be seen that the terrifying power he had 
displayed made the artifact spirit feel a strong sense of danger.



At this time, with just a thought, Tang Huan could gather Mind Power and attack the artifact spirit.

Of course, Tang Huan did not do that. His goal this time was not to eliminate the artifact spirit, but 
to obtain the Space Aircraft. Once it succeeded, the stronger the Artifact Spirit would be, and would 
be of greater use to Tang Huan, thus, as long as it did not act rashly, Tang Huan would not make a 
move against it.

What Tang Huan needed to do now was to merge his Mind Stigma with them.

At that time, Tang Huan would be the master of the Space Aircraft and would completely integrate 
with it, so there was no way he would disobey Tang Huan's orders.

Amongst the Spirit Map, Tang Huan's Mind Power was quickly circulating, and in a short while, he 
had already found the most crucial point within the Space Aircraft.

This kind of node was called "Spirit Eye".

By condensing the Mind Stigma in the "Spirit Eye," he would be able to obtain the Space Aircraft. 
Tang Huan thought for a moment, then, an even more majestic Mind Power surged out, like a 
torrent, it rushed towards the Spirit Essence.

"Swish!"

Just at this time, a sharp piercing sound came out, and from the wall behind Tang Huan, an 
extremely condensed white light shot out, like a sharp sword piercing towards Tang Huan's back, an 
extremely tyrannical Qi rippled out, as though it was trying to shatter the space itself.

Tang Huan did not even turn his head around, his right palm remained unmoving, while his left arm, 
like a soft noodle, strangely twisted to the back and struck out. In the next moment, Five Colors 
Heavenly Domain followed the movement of Tang Huan's left palm and released a frightening 
power that gathered into Tang Huan's palm like flowing water.

"Bam!"

In a split-second, the white beam of light and Tang Huan's left palm, which was covered by the Five 
Colors Heavenly Domain, collided head on with the white beam of light. The Strength Qi surged 
crazily and ripples actually appeared in the air, visible to the naked eye.

In a split-second, the white light touched the wall behind it, then silently entered it.

The corner of Tang Huan's mouth hooked into a cold smile. That artifact spirit obviously couldn't 
accept the fact that the aircraft was being controlled by Tang Huan, so it actually started to attack. 
After the artifact spirit escaped from the trap the last time, he absorbed a large amount of energy 
and his strength had increased by quite a bit. However, it was still incomparable to the current Tang 
Huan.

The artifact spirit's decision to attack him was simply asking for trouble.

"Chi!"

Not long later, another sound of something tearing through the air could be heard from the right 
side.

His bones released a burst of crackling sounds, Tang Huan's left arm seemed to have suddenly 
lengthened a lot as he suddenly swept it across his chest, his palm that was filled with Genuine Qi 



flew out like lightning, but once again activated the power of the Five Colors Heavenly Domain, 
exploding forth with a mind-blowing might.

"Bam!"

Another deafening collision sound rang out.

The white light that had whizzed over from the right was immediately sent flying. It merged with 
the wall once more, and without a sound, it was like a clay ox entering the sea.

Following that, the artifact spirit seemed to have given up and did not make a move for a long time. 
However, a hint of ridicule flashed across Tang Huan's eyes.

"Humph!"

Abruptly, Tang Huan snorted softly, and his right foot suddenly lifted and stamped down. The 
powerful Genuine Qi and the gathered power of the Heavenly Domain burst forth from his feet, and 
with a "boom", it surged forth. It was as if a terrifying hurricane had risen out of thin air within this 
triangle.

Beneath Tang Huan's feet, a white-colored odor that had just appeared was stepped on back as if it 
had been struck by a huge hammer.

"Ahhhhhhhhh!"

In an instant, a scream rose up from the ground beneath his feet. However, his voice became weaker 
and weaker. It seemed that the artifact spirit was quickly fleeing into the distance. And it was also at 
this time that a faint smile appeared on Tang Huan's face. Previously, the artifact spirit had attacked 
consecutively, but his right palm had not even moved an inch in order to maintain the stable Mind 
Power's output and condense the Mind Stigma in his eyes. Now, he had finally succeeded.

"Buzz!"

After the flick of a finger, an incomparably intense trembling noise resounded within the triangle-
shaped space, and the surrounding walls released a resplendent white luster. Behind Tang Huan, the 
small piece of wall, which had already congealed into substance after he came in, actually began to 
ripple once again.

Chapter 659 - Submission

"Miss Feng Ming, is this really alright?"

Outside the Demon Area, Cang Mo was frowning as he worriedly worried about the Gobi Desert.

He had heard Tang Huan talking about the situation last time. At that time, only after gathering the 
power of four Stage Nine Warriors, Tang Huan, Shan Shan and the others could he open the passage 
and walk out of the Space Aircraft safely. But this time, it was only Tang Huan.

"Don't worry, Tang Huan will never do something that you aren't confident in."

The current Tang Huan is already a Heavenly Domain-level Expert, so even if the Space Aircraft 
gave birth to an artifact spirit, it still wouldn't be a threat to Tang Huan, "Come to think of it, even if 
Tang Huan didn't come out at the appointed time, we would still be able to enter as well. As long as 
there are four Stage Nine Martial Saint s, we can completely open the passage once more like last 
time."



"Yeah, why didn't I think of that?" Cang Mo was slightly startled, but immediately smiled, and his 
tightly knitted brows relaxed.

"Gu gu -" At this time, Xiao Ai's legs suddenly stepped on the ground, and shot forward explosively.

"Yiya!"

Xiao Budian flapped four pairs of wings, and like a blue flowing shadow, followed closely behind 
Xiao Ai.

Seeing that, Cang Mo was shocked.

However, before he could finish speaking, Xiao Ai and Xiao Budian had already rushed into the 
boundaries of the Demon Area. What happened next caused him to be stunned, as one of the two 
little fellows was still running on the ground while the other was flying in the air, and had actually 
not been affected by the power of the Demon Region's sucking.

"The Infernal domain has disappeared?" Cang Mo exclaimed.

"That's right."

Immediately after, two figures shot into the oasis like arrows that had just left the bowstring.

Not long later, Cang Mo and Feng Ming arrived at the center area of the oasis one after another. The 
Space Aircraft clearly appeared in their view, its two ends were thin like flying shuttles, crystal like 
jade, and were slightly trembling, releasing a brilliant white light.

Xiao Budian and Xiao Ai walked around the aircraft with curiosity written all over their faces.

"Looking at the situation, little brother Tang Huan has already controlled the Space Aircraft."

Cang Mo sized up the object in surprise and couldn't help but smile. Almost at the same time he 
finished speaking, the Space Aircraft started to undulate like water, following that, a white figure 
flashed from inside and floated down to the ground. It was actually a white skeleton.

This was only the beginning. In the next few breaths of time, all the complete and scattered bones 
from the aircraft flashed and appeared one after another.

"Over the past hundred years, the number of people who have died in this Infernal domain is truly 
not small."

Seeing that, Cang Mo sighed.

Feng Ming smiled slightly. Just as he was about to speak, a black figure flashed into his vision 
without any warning, and it was Tang Huan who left the Space Aircraft.

"Little brother, you succeeded?" Although he had already made his judgement beforehand, Cang 
Mo could not help but to ask.

"We've succeeded. From today onwards, this Infernal domain can be considered to have completely 
disappeared."

Tang Huan unknowingly smiled, and when he looked at the Space Aircraft, a satisfied smile 
appeared in the depths of his eyes.

As expected, after fusing the Mind Stigma into the "Spirit Essence", the aircraft's artifact spirit had 
completely lost its ability to resist. Now, even if he did not continue inserting Mind Power s into the 



round table in the first room of the aircraft, with just a thought, Tang Huan would still be able to 
know the entire situation of the aircraft.

The only thing that Tang Huan regretted was that, although he had the Space Aircraft, he was 
temporarily unable to control it to fly.

The aircraft was different from Tang Huan's original aircraft. The space of the aircraft was 
extremely small, and one could activate it by themselves, but the interior space of the aircraft far 
exceeded its own. If one wanted to activate it, they would need to use a gem like the Saint Ranked 
Magic Source Stone to activate it.

Once the gems placed on the four round tables inside the aircraft were used up, they would have to 
be placed back on the gems before they could continue flying.

"Tang Huan, this aircraft is so big, it's not easy to bring it with you." Feng Ming had a headache as 
he rubbed his forehead. Previously, the aircraft was only a little bigger than a bamboo hat, so he 
could carry it around.

"It's fine."

He waved his hand and smiled. Then, with a thought from Tang Huan, the Space Aircraft began to 
shrink at a rapid pace, and in a few breaths, the ten metres long and five metres wide Space Aircraft 
had already become as big as a walnut.

"So small!" Feng Ming and Cang Mo were not the only ones who were stunned, Xiao Budian and 
Xiao Ai had their eyes opened wide in shock.

"This is the beauty of Space Aircraft s who possess an artifact spirit." Tang Huan chuckled. It was 
extremely convenient to carry a Space Aircraft that could shrink itself to this state. "However, it's 
impossible to bring a Space Aircraft with you to the same place as the one from the past."

"Then what should I do?" Feng Ming said blankly.

"Let's go to the Cloud City first and give that Space Aircraft to the Aunt Xing. Then, we can get 
some Saint Ranked demon essence stones from the Aunt Xing."

"..."

This was the Foggy Sea Island. The danger level of this island was not inferior to the "Turbid Sea 
Area" in any way, and even if a Stage Nine Ranker was not careful, there was a possibility of death.

In the early morning, the first rays of the morning sun could be seen as the sun shone down in a 
slanted manner, making the mist-covered island seem all the more hazy.

"Whoosh!"

In the northwest sky, a white light pierced through the sky and arrived above Foggy Sea Island in an 
instant. It was a white flying shuttle that was dozens of meters long.

Inside the flying shuttle, in the middle of the triangular space at the front row, Tang Huan stood in 
front of the round stage with a solemn face, with his right palm pressing on the stage, the two walls 
on the left and right were completely transparent. Compared to the aircraft from before, inside the 
flying shuttle, one could see an even wider outer area.



After bidding farewell to Cang Mo in the Infernal domain's desert, Tang Huan and Feng Ming left 
for Holy Spirit Continent.

After staying in there for only a day, the two of them went south once again. It turned out that Tang 
Huan had erased the Mind Stigma inside and gifted it to Xing Meng. After acquiring the vein, Xing 
Meng was rich and imposing, thus the amount of Saint Ranked Demon Essence Stones he had dug 
up was not much. Otherwise, Xing Meng would have given him even more.

Not only was the space of the new aircraft more spacious, after placing the four Saint Ranked 
Magic Essence Stones into four round tables, it was then activated by Tang Huan. Its speed was at 
least twice that of the previous aircraft. It only took him a day to sense the Foggy Sea Island from 
the Spirit Cloud City.

"I can't see anything up there. It would be difficult to find the Secluded Night Divine Palace's lair." 
Looking at the rolling fog below, Feng Ming frowned.

"Let's walk around above it for a bit and get familiar with its general terrain before anything else."

"..."

Chapter 660 - Heart Twining and Soul Searching Method

The Foggy Sea Island was extremely vast, with a circumference of almost a thousand miles. 
However, with flying shuttles, these kinds of sharp tools to travel through space, to circle around the 
Foggy Sea Island, it wouldn't take long.

Every part of the island was covered in thick mist and nothing could be found high up in the sky. 
Therefore, after flying a circle around the Foggy Sea Island, the figures of Tang Huan, Feng Ming, 
Xiao Budian, and Xiao Ai appeared in the sky one after another. The aircraft had also shrunk to the 
limit and was placed in Tang Huan's embrace.

"Feng Ming, you and I will spread out to scout this island. Xiao Ai, follow Feng Ming. Tang Huan 
flapped his wings and ordered. Xiao Ai's strength was still above Feng Ming's. With it following 
Feng Ming, it wouldn't be a problem even if he met the Heavenly Domain-level Expert s. Moreover, 
this little fellow's cry was really loud; no matter which direction it roared at full power, the entire 
island would be able to hear it.

"Gu gu!" The little white rabbit nodded and jumped onto Feng Ming's shoulder from Xiao Budian's 
back excitedly.

"Tang Huan, then we will go down first. I will head this way, and you go that way." Feng Ming 
patted her fiery red wings lightly, and looked at Tang Huan with a sweet smile.

"Be careful!"

"..."

A while later, Feng Ming had already dived down, and before even the blink of an eye, her and Xiao 
Ai's figure had already been engulfed by the dense fog. Tang Huan patted Xiao Budian's head and 
immediately retracted his wings. Like a meteorite, he jumped down a few hundred meters into the 
sky and was also quickly enveloped by the fog.

Just by sensing it, Tang Huan's heart was immediately filled with amazement.



This fog was not really clouds and mist, but a strange power. One could clearly feel a great pressure 
coming from it. Of course, this kind of pressure didn't have any effect on Tang Huan, who was 
already a Heavenly Domain-level Expert. But, it was a huge threat to the Stage Nine Rankers.

On this island, even if one did not do anything, as long as there was a cloud in the surroundings, one 
would have to circulate the Genuine Qi to fight it out. This meant that in the Foggy Sea Island, the 
Genuine Qi would disappear like water. The Stage Nine Rankers, even the Peak Stage Nine 
Rankers, would not be able to stay here for a long time.

The same goes for Stage Nine Rankers. People under the Stage Nine, they couldn't even reach the 
island.

At this moment, Tang Huan became more and more convinced that the "Secluded Night Divine 
Palace" was actually within the Foggy Sea Island, because no matter how many Stage Nine experts 
he had, it was impossible for him to inspect the entire Foggy Sea Island. If he left his base here, the 
"Secluded Night Divine Palace" would never have to worry about it being completely annihilated.

As for how the "Secluded Night Divine Palace" resisted the invasion of the clouds and mist, Tang 
Huan was also rather curious. If all the clouds and mist on the island were to be mobilized, the 
power that would be released would be enough to destroy the heaven and earth.

"Hu!"

Tang Huan's body sank down quickly.

At this time, Tang Huan's vision was already in a blur. Even with his strength, he could only 
vaguely make out the area within a few meters around him. However, his figure did not slow down 
in the slightest.

Not long later, Tang Huan's feet touched the ground.

"Howl!" "Howl …"

In the next moment, a horrifying wailing sound could be heard, followed by several white skeletons 
crazily pouncing towards them. Inside the skulls, a red light flickered and a faint white luster 
covered their bodies. As they waved their claws, the Strength Qi stirred.

These skeletons were actually not inferior to Martial Lord s of the eighth step.

Tang Huan frowned, between the mind instructs (in a second), Five Colors Heavenly Domain 
erupted out from his body, quickly expanding. In just an instant, Five Colors Heavenly Domain and 
the few skeletons collided, and with a series of bangs, the skeletons were sent flying backwards 
while wailing.

In a short moment, the Five Colors Heavenly Domain had covered an area of about a hundred 
meters.

Within the boundaries of the Heavenly Domain, the clouds and mist had already been covered.

Tang Huan's vision became clear, the ground was littered with scattered bones, and outside of the 
Heavenly Domain, there were not only the few skeletons that were bounced back, there were even 
more skeletons that pounced at him crazily, but they were all stopped over a hundred metres away, 
and the sounds of bones hitting and crying rose and fell one after another.

"Yiya?"



Looking at this scene, Xiao Budian was surprised. Obviously, this was the first time seeing a 
skeleton that could move as though it was alive.

Tang Huan's eyes flashed, the Five Colors Heavenly Domain shook slightly, and in the next 
moment, a skeleton broke through the Heavenly Domain's barrier and rushed forward, its speed 
shockingly fast. However, after rushing forward for only a dozen meters, the skeleton seemed to 
have noticed that something was wrong. Suddenly, it turned around and ran.

Seeing that, Tang Huan laughed.

In between the mind instructs (in a second), the space around the skeleton began to fluctuate 
rapidly. His body uncontrollably shot towards Tang Huan. After an instant, Tang Huan reached out 
and grabbed hold of the skeleton's neck easily.

"Wuuuuuu ~ ~ ~"

The skeleton struggled with all its might, but under the Heavenly Domain's restriction, its range was 
extremely dangerous.

Tang Huan's other hand was already on the skull of the skeleton, and a burst of powerful sucking 
power poured down from the palm. A moment later, the ball of Blood Red Odor in the skull of the 
skeleton rose up, and landed on Tang Huan's left palm.

The Blood Red Odor struggled fiercely, trying to break free from Tang Huan's restraints.

It was actually the soul of this skeleton!

"What Tang Huan wanted to do now was to search the skeleton's memories. Since Secluded Night 
Divine Palace was hidden within the Foggy Sea Island, it was impossible for them to not move 
about on the island. As long as they revealed any traces or clues, they would also be able to leave an 
impression on the Foggy Sea Island's skeleton soul.

That "Soul Method True Explanation" encompasses everything, and just so happens to have a 
method called "Heart Twining and Soul Searching Method".

As he thought about it, Tang Huan had already put the ball of skeleton souls into his two palms, 
while his own soul began to faintly fluctuate according to a strange rhythm. Not long after, an 
invisible force surged out from the depths of his soul and seeped into the red aura in his palm.

The struggling range of the skeleton's soul became weaker and weaker. After about ten to twenty 
breaths, it had completely calmed down.

Tang Huan slowly closed his eyes and carefully sensed his surroundings.

However, after a short while, Tang Huan frowned. The skeleton did indeed have memories, but in 
its memories, there were only images of the skeletons. However, Tang Huan did not give up so 
quickly.

Another small period of time had passed and Tang Huan was completely disappointed.

In the skeleton's soul, the older the memory, the more blurry it would be. In the end, it was 
completely empty; this time Tang Huan did not gain anything from using "Heart Twining and Soul 
Searching Method."

"Pah!"



He retracted his five fingers, and crushed the skeleton spirit, but after a while, Tang Huan let out a 
surprised cry, as two pairs of eyes turned to look behind him from the right.
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