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Chapter 1743 

“The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands?” 

Ye Linglong frowned tightly, puzzled, and followed Xu Qingfeng’s direction. 

The firelight swayed. 

The wind and snow howled. 

Vaguely, she saw a plain, cloth-clad figure already standing on top of the roof of one of 
the mansions of the Heavenly Wolf Courtyard. 

Even from some distance away, she could still feel the terrifying oppressive feeling 
emanating from that figure! 

“The Huns have set a precedent, the seventy-two Heavenly Wolf Martial Dao bodies 
have really hooked these reclusive old undead out!” 

Xu Qingfeng’s expression was rare and grave as he cursed in a low voice, then laughed 
aloud in response to the Old Mother of the Leaving Island, “Old Mother of the Leaving 
Island, you couldn’t keep me on your Leaving Island over twenty years ago, this time, 
you still want to keep me?” 

The sound of laughter echoed through the Nuo Da Palace. 

Xu Qingfeng did not stop as he led Ye Linglong, but responded by still leaping in the 
process, heading towards the outside of the palace. 

Behind him, the four strong Qi Qi practitioners of the Heavenly Wolf Academy were like 
maggots on their bones, chasing after him. 

Other than that, it was as if the pause button had been pressed on the vast Xiongnu 
Palace, and there was dead silence. 

The cold wind whistled. 

After listening to Xu Qingfeng’s words, Ye Linglong was lowering her head, as if in 
thought. 

Suddenly. 

Another low, mellow voice came from the direction of the Heavenly Wolf Academy. 



“The Thief Saint is worthy of being a Thief Saint, a young and heavenly man, he does 
have the capital to be arrogant, but with his injuries, I still don’t believe that you can step 
out of the Xiong Nu King’s Palace with this crippled body and a person today!” 

There was a hint of teasing and disdain in his tone. 

Xu Qingfeng’s eyes instantly narrowed into slits as a cold aura appeared. 

“Old ghost of Yin Mountain, even you have given up to come out?” 

As he spoke, he looked intently in the direction of the Heavenly Wolf Courtyard. 

On top of the roof where the Old Mother of the Outlying Islands was, there was already 
another figure, and the two of them were standing side by side, but in silence, they were 
releasing two terrified, prison like auras that were vastly pressing in. 

Even though they hadn’t moved yet, the pressure they exerted on Xu Qingfeng was far 
greater than that of the four strong Qi Jin practitioners from the Wolf School who were 
chasing after them! 

Qi Jin was a watershed in the martial arts, and after the watershed, it was still a long 
and slow road. 

Compared to the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain, the four 
Qigong powerhouses behind Xu Qingfeng were just children learning to speak! 

“Ye girl, you should be more careful later on, I may not be able to care too much if we 
really fight!” 

Xu Qingfeng said to Ye Linglong in a deep cerulean voice. 

Ye Linglong’s eyes flickered for a moment, looking up at Xu Qingfeng: “Senior has 
risked his life to come to Linglong’s rescue, Linglong feels guilty, I hope senior will take 
care of himself.” 

“Hm?” 

Xu Qingfeng looked sideways, somewhat surprised. 

He saw that he was about to rush out of the king’s palace. 

Boom! 

Boom! 



In the direction of the Heavenly Wolf Courtyard, two majestic Qi coils, like python 
dragons, roared into the sky, and in an instant, swept away the wind and snow on that 
side of the world. 

The next second. 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain rushed towards Xu 
Qingfeng and Ye Linglong with a terrifying killing intent that was as frightening as a 
prison. 

“Stop him!” 

The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands bellowed in the air. 

In an instant. 

The four Qi powerhouses immediately behind Xu Qingfeng struck at the same time. 

Accompanied by four booming sounds. 

The four Qi Qi trains tore through the night sky and blatantly blasted at Xu Qingfeng 
who was about to leave the palace. 

“One Thought Formation!” 

Xu Qingfeng looked solemn as his tongue burst into spring thunder. 

Buzz! 

A stream of qi energy, in a flash, surrounded behind him, forming a spiral. 

Golden light burst forth, forming a golden light Taiji Bagua diagram in the air. 

Boom! 

It was like a bomb explosion. 

A loud roar resounded through the Hun king’s palace. 

The four trains of Qi energy blasted against the golden light Taiji Bagua and collapsed 
on the spot, spreading out a circle of ripples visible to the naked eye. 

The shockwave was so terrifying that even the four qi powerhouses’ steps were startled 
by it. 



The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain were still some 
distance away. 

Taking advantage of this gap. 

Xu Qingfeng grabbed Ye Linglong and with a whistle of Qi energy, he leapt towards the 
high wall outside the palace. 

“Ye girl, with this scene, I’m afraid I can only send you out of the city, it’s up to your own 
destiny whether you can go back or not!” 

Ye Linglong’s delicate body trembled, as if she sensed something, she hurriedly said, 
“Senior ……” 

Before she could finish her words, she was directly interrupted by a shout from Xu 
Qingfeng. 

“Dragon Ascension Technique!” 

The three words were like thunder, resounding through the heavens. 

Boom! 

A majestic and domineering Qi energy, like a rushing river, was released from Xu 
Qingfeng’s body. 

The astral wind raged. 

Originally, the two of them had fallen towards the ground after leaping out of the palace 
wall, but in a flash, as Xu Qingfeng took a step into the air, he actually leapt into the air 
again, even higher than the jump they had just made out of the palace wall! 

Looking at the ground, Ye Linglong’s whole body was confused. 

This step taken by Xu Qingfeng had completely exceeded her perception of gravity! 

It wasn’t just her. 

Even the four Skywolf Academy Qi Power powerhouses were stunned by this scene. 

“Old Devil Yinshan, go straight to full strength, this kid is so heavenly that even the old 
body alone on the Island of Leaves had not been able to keep him back then, if we don’t 
go to full strength, I’m afraid we can really let him run away with his girl!” 

The old mother of the island had a cold look in her eyes and said in a stern voice. 



“I don’t need you to say that!” 

The Old Ghost of Yin Mountain responded with a stern voice, and as he ran and jumped 
wildly, his hands were raised into the air. 

In a flash, an invisible vortex seemed to form between his hands. 

The qi surrounding the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain roared and whistled as it converged 
between his hands. 

“Ah!” 

With a hideous roar, the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain’s beard and hair waved about, and 
his hands seemed to be holding a great mountain, and in a seemingly slow but 
extremely fast stance, he slammed down in the direction of Xu Qingfeng and Ye 
Linglong. 

Rumble …… 

The wind and snow were silent, and the roar was like rolling thunder. 

A one-meter diameter Qi train burst out from between the hands of the Old Ghost of Yin 
Mountain, like a dragon flipping through the air, stretching all the way, and everywhere it 
passed, even the air was instantly burst, smashing headlong into Xu Qingfeng and Ye 
Linglong. 

“Senior, be careful!” 

Ye Linglong looked at the terrifying qi coils pouring down from the sky and turned pale 
with fear. 

“Coming up here with a big move, what a fucking dog!” 

Xu Qingfeng cursed, but he couldn’t hide the look of scorn on his face. 

Just as the thick Qi train, like a pale dragon, was about to smash down on top of his 
head. 

Xu Qingfeng’s body gave a fierce lurch into the air and let out a roar from his mouth. 

In an instant. 

The boundless Qi was like a waterfall rolling backwards, rising up to the sky and hitting 
the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain’s Qi, slowing down the speed of the Qi as it pressed 
down across the sky. 



“Go!” 

Xu Qingfeng fiercely gritted his teeth and took another step with his right foot, but a 
burst of golden light blossomed in the air beneath his feet. 

The golden light appeared. 

His and Ye Linglong’s bodies swayed at the same time, and they actually moved a 
dozen metres across with the speed of lightning and thunder. 

Boom! 

Just as he was carrying Ye Linglong across a distance of more than ten metres, he 
plunged towards the ground. 

The pale dragon-like qi force smashed down brazenly. 

The ground shook and destroyed. 

Rolling smoke and dust rose up from the ground. 

The impact was so terrifying that it lifted the ground a layer out! 

The wall of the palace was so strong and tall that a section of it collapsed. 

After landing on the ground, Xu Qingfeng took Ye Linglong to leap once again, avoiding 
the smoke and debris that came from the impact. 

At the same time he gritted his teeth and roared. 

“Old Mother of the Leaving Island, Old Ghost of Yin Mountain! Today, I must take this 
girl away, I am no match under the Heavenly Punishment, I will exchange one for two 
above the Heavenly Punishment!” 

The words resounded like a great bell, resounding through the King’s City! 

Chapter 1744 

The wind whistles. 

Qi energy surged. 

Although Old Ghost Yinshan’s move did not hurt Xu Qingfeng, it managed to delay Xu 
Qingfeng’s speed. 

By the time Xu Qingfeng led Ye Linglong to vanish far outside the city again. 



The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain were already leading 
four Qi Jin powerhouses and the distance between them was less than 20 metres. 

Such a distance was already almost the same as being close to a Qi Power strongman. 

“You are no match under the Heavenly Punishment, but above it, you still want to 
exchange one for two? What an arrogant tone!” 

The Old Ghost of Yin Mountain’s beard and hair waved about, his face full of fierceness 
and disdain, “Brat, if you have the guts, you can raise your strength above the Heavenly 
Punishment!” 

However, as soon as the words left her mouth, the Old Mother of the Island beside her 
said in a deep voice, “You have never fought with this brat, the old body had a battle 
with him back then, when you really reach above the Heavenly Punishment, you might 
as well be a pro.” 

At the end of her sentence, her tone was extraordinarily grave. 

The old ghost of Yinshan gave the Old Mother of the Leaving Island a startled look. 

They, the hermits, had long since stopped asking about the outside world. 

Xu Qingfeng had emerged in the last few decades, so he didn’t know him too well. 

But as a hermit, the words of the Old Mother of the Island caused his heart to tremble 
fiercely. 

A rising star of a few decades could really be as terrifying as this? 

“Let’s leave the man behind first, there are more than just you and I in this Norse King 
City, two people of Heaven’s Punishment.” 

The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands frowned deeply and subconsciously glanced 
back inside the king’s palace. 

The Old Ghost of Yinshan pulled the corners of his mouth gently and smiled without 
saying anything. 

With the strength of the two of them, they had already scouted out what existed within 
the king’s palace after they had joined Xiongnu to obtain the qualification to enlighten 
the seventy-two Heavenly Wolf Martial Bodies and entered the king’s palace. 

What’s more, the two of them had been deep inside the Heavenly Wolf Courtyard since 
they arrived in Xiongnu! 



“Please, two seniors, step up, if we let him take Miss Ye away, we’ll all be in big 
trouble!” 

A strong Qi Qi practitioner from the Celestial Wolf Academy suddenly spoke up and 
begged. 

“You’re teaching me to do something?” 

The old ghost of Yin Mountain stared back, “In the five hundred years I have lived, no 
one has been able to teach me to do anything!” 

“Forgive me, senior!” 

This glance frightened the pupils of the Qi Power powerhouse to tighten and he 
hurriedly apologised. 

“Little doll, life is in your own hands.” 

The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands smiled teasingly, “We will naturally give our best, 
but it is unwise for you four dolls to place your hopes on the two of us.” 

“Understood senior!” 

The next second. 

Boom, boom, boom, boom! 

The four Skywolf Academy Qi powerhouses suddenly surged with Qi energy and leapt 
in both left and right directions. 

In an instant. 

The situation, which had been limited to merely fleeing forward and chasing backward, 
had directly turned into a closing siege. 

“These little Hun dolls, they are a bit perceptive.” 

The Old Mother of the Islands laughed and stopped speaking, instead looking scornfully 
at Xu Qingfeng who was fleeing ahead. 

The distance of a dozen metres or so was equivalent to nothing to her and the Old 
Ghost of Yin Mountain. 

But Xu Qingfeng’s words had already been put out, and neither she nor the Old Ghost 
of Yin Mountain dared to really go all out until the moment of necessity. 



Once the threshold of Heavenly Punishment was breached and the Heavenly 
Punishment Thunderclap was triggered, it would be a bad ending! 

It would be safer for her to instruct the four Heavenly Wolf Far Qi powerhouses to fight 
for their lives than for the two of them to fight directly against Xu Qingfeng. 

After all, she knew Xu Qingfeng’s strength, and there was no way that four Qi Jin 
powerhouses could force Xu Qingfeng to break through the Heavenly Punishment 
threshold directly. 

This was like giving Xu Qingfeng a hope to escape. 

She and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain only needed to watch the battle from the 
sidelines, and once they found an opportunity, they would directly strike with all their 
might, so that even if Xu Qingfeng wanted to break through the Heavenly Punishment 
Threshold, it would be too late! 

Under the night. 

The Xiong Nu King City was eerily like a pool of stagnant water. 

Whether it was the attack by the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain just now, or the current 
commotion when Xu Qingfeng and the others were chasing and fleeing, not a single 
Xiong Nu citizen had ever come out to the streets to watch. 

It was as if they were the only ones left at this time of the day while the entire King City 
was reduced to a battlefield for Xu Qingfeng and the others. 

Roads of qi energy pizzas surged. 

Xu Qingfeng led Ye Linglong on top of one of the roofs, leaping and dashing towards 
the outside of the city at breakneck speed. 

In his line of sight, the lofty and towering city walls were getting closer and closer. 

Xu Qingfeng’s tightly furrowed brow was also slightly relaxed. 

Ye Linglong looked back in amazement at the Old Mother of the Leaving Island and the 
Old Ghost of Yin Mountain, who were pursuing him relentlessly, and wondered. 

“Senior, they really aren’t attacking anymore.” 

“Heh, they’re all afraid of death.” 



Xu Qingfeng snorted, “Those four Qi experts on the left and right are the main force 
now, and the two old undeads at the back are trying to take advantage of my 
unpreparedness and kill me with one blow!” 

“Linglong is not worth fighting for senior’s life.” 

Ye Linglong said in a complicated voice. 

Xu Qingfeng smiled faintly, “You are indeed not worth it, but considering the bigger 
picture, this life really must be fought for!” 

“The bigger picture ……” 

Ye Linglong wanly smiled, but her beautiful eyes were dense with mist, her gaze firm 
and determined. 

“Make a move!” 

Just at this moment, the four Skywolf Academy Qi powerhouses on the left and right 
suddenly let out an explosive cry. 

In an instant. 

The four Gu Qi coils directly stretched across the sky and shot towards Xu Qingfeng 
and Ye Linglong. 

Xu Qingfeng was prepared and leapt with Ye Linglong, easily dodging the four qi blasts. 

Boom! 

The four qi energy blasts landed on the roof of the house, and instantly the house 
collapsed and smoke and dust rolled around. 

The blow fell short. 

But the four Qi powerhouses didn’t stop anymore, as a Qi train shot out from their hands 
like a giant python across the sky, heading straight for Xu Qingfeng and Ye Linglong. 

Time and again, Xu Qingfeng led Ye Linglong to move and dodge the attacks, and 
occasionally, if he could not avoid them, he would directly use the Divine Ghost Eight 
Formation Diagram to counteract the attacks brutally. 

The scene was chaotic. 

One after another, explosions roared through the city. 



Everywhere they passed, the impact of the explosion collapsed a house, rolling smoke 
and dust, sweeping in all directions. 

Meanwhile. 

Inside the king’s palace, the king’s hall. 

Xixing leaned languidly on his throne as loud booms continued to be heard in the 
distance. 

Quietly. 

A shadow flickered out from behind her behind the throne. 

“Those two old devils are afraid that Xu Qingfeng will break through the threshold of 
Heavenly Punishment and won’t dare to exert their full strength for a while, do you need 
me to do it?” 

A voice so hoarse that it sounded like countless gravel rubbing against the throat 
resounded through the king’s hall, as eerie and ominous as possible. 

Shying yawned and opened his closed eyes to a slit: “I said that you would either not 
strike, or when you do, you will kill one person, are you sure?” 

Shade looked down and pondered for two seconds, “That Xu Qingfeng is injured, I 
should be able to kill him if I strike!” 

Shying smiled and reached out in a “please” gesture, “But please make yourself 
comfortable.” 

“I’ll be right back.” 

As she watched the shadows leave the king’s palace, Xixing rubbed her temples 
helplessly, “It’s a pity that it wasn’t Chen Daojun who came, this was all specially 
prepared for him, if I could kill Chen Daojun tonight, it would be much easier to swing 
the whip south in the future!” 

She did not doubt for a moment that Xu Qingfeng’s eventual end would come. 

Leaving aside the four Skywolf Academy Qi experts. 

With the configuration of Shade plus the two Hidden Worlds, even if Chen Daogun were 
to come in person, she would have complete certainty that Chen Daogun would be left 
dead on the spot. 
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Chapter 1745 

Boom! 

The house collapsed and smoke and dust rolled around. 

As soon as his feet touched the ground, a roar of Qi energy swept through the ground 
and he directly led Ye Linglong towards the city wall not far away. 

“Ye girl, whether you escape alone or the two of us escape together, it’s up to our fate!” 

The corners of Xu Qingfeng’s mouth outlined a smile, yet he looked unusually 
spontaneous. 

Ye Linglong’s expression was as deep as water, her lips mouthing, wanting to speak but 
not to. 

And behind them. 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain were close at hand, 
and the four Qigong powerhouses were only about ten metres away. 

After receiving a nod from the Old Mother of the Island, the four qi masters kept sending 
out qi attacks, which did not hurt Xu Qingfeng and Ye Linglong, but substantially slowed 
down Xu Qingfeng’s escape. 

The towering walls of the city were close at hand. 

Above the walls, bonfires danced as if a river of stars had fallen into the sky. 

Strangely, this section of the city wall was not guarded by soldiers and armour. 

But it was clear to everyone that this was a battle above qi, and ordinary Xiongnu 
soldiers, even if there were more, would be as good as nothing. 

“Two seniors, please also make a move!” 

One of the Skywolf Courtyard Qi Power powerhouses pleaded urgently. 

They were trained by the Skywolf Courtyard, born as Xiongnu people and dying as 
Xiongnu ghosts. 

This ambush, once it failed, allowed Xu Qingfeng to take away Ye Linglong. 



What would be the end of Old Mother Lijima and Old Ghost Yinshan, he did not know, 
but what would happen to them, the four Qi powerhouses of the Celestial Wolf 
Academy, was absolutely beyond doubt! 

“Old Mother Lijima, are you going to keep waiting?” 

Old Ghost Yinshan’s eyes narrowed into slits as he looked askance at Old Mother 
Lijima, “This King City is a cage, once he runs out, then the sky is as high as a bird can 
fly, the defensive chain constructed by the twelve star cities outside is as empty to him.” 

“But above the heavenly punishment ……” 

The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands still had some hesitation. 

If a desperate battle were to take place, she thought to herself that if she and the old 
ghost of Yin Mountain joined forces, they would definitely be able to defeat Xu 
Qingfeng, who was already injured. 

But the key was that …… this was on the premise of fighting to the death. 

Since they were all fighting for their lives, they were already not referencing the 
Heavenly Punishment Threshold in it. 

But she is not foolish enough to fight for her life directly because of such a thing, once 
the threshold of heavenly punishment is broken, the heavenly punishment thunder 
tribulation descends down, not to mention her, even if she and the old ghost of Yin 
Mountain plus Xu Qingfeng, want to end …… not dead but also seriously injured! 

“Always have to pay some cast, otherwise after today’s battle, you and I want to enter 
the Heavenly Wolf Academy again to enlighten the seventy-two Heavenly Wolf Martial 
Dao Body, I’m afraid it will be as difficult as ascending to heaven!” 

The Old Ghost of Yin Mountain pondered, “After so many days of enlightenment, you 
know what those 72 Heavenly Wolf Martial Dao Bodies mean, that is the last chance for 
us old, immortal Hidden Worlds!” 

The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands frowned and bowed her head in thought. 

She knew very well that once she made her move, Xu Qingfeng was bound to break 
through the Heavenly Punishment Threshold to fight to the death, but the words of the 
Old Ghost of Yin Mountain were indeed true. 

Just at that moment. 

Rumble …… 



On the night sky, thunder rolled. 

With the sound of rolling thunder, a terrifying pressure like a prison suddenly appeared 
above the night sky, invisibly as if there was a lofty mountain stretching across the sky, 
wanting to crush it down with a bang. 

“This is ……” 

The faces of the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain changed 
greatly. 

The four strong Qi Qi practitioners of the Heavenly Wolf Academy who were attacking 
from left and right also moved with a start. 

“That wolf?” 

Xu Qingfeng tilted his head to look up at the night dome and murmured while his face 
was as grave as it had ever been. 

The next second. 

Boom! 

A majestic Qi energy, like a great river breaking its banks, blasted out from Xu 
Qingfeng’s body, transforming into a column of Qi energy that was three metres in 
diameter and rushing straight into the night sky. 

“Dragon Ascension Technique!” 

Xu Qingfeng’s tongue burst into thunder as he took a step and stepped on the city wall. 

Another step was taken, but with the support of the majestic qi energy, he directly 
carried Ye Linglong, all the way up along the vertical city wall wall. 

“Make a move!” 

In a flash of lightning, Old Mother Lijima let out an explosive shout. 

The sudden appearance of the terrifying pressure at this moment gave her a frightening 
feeling, with the presence of this person who was secretly releasing the pressure, even 
if she and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain did not make a move, they would end up 
forcing Xu Qingfeng to break straight through the threshold of Heavenly Punishment in 
a desperate battle to the death! 

Boom! 



Boom! 

Two domineering Qi coils erupted from the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost 
of Yin Mountain at the same time. 

In a flash. 

Both of them took a step, but with their qi energy boosting them, they stepped into the 
air and rose into the air. 

Radiant and dazzling qi energy ravaged the long air. 

As the two waved their hands out, the two Qi energies were like swimming dragons, 
shooting into the long air, heading straight for Xu Qingfeng and Ye Linglong who 
stepped onto the wall. 

“Flying Star!” 

Xu Qingfeng shouted, and the Qi around his body rolled backwards towards his feet, 
forming a five-pointed star pattern. 

In the whistling wind, the pentagram made of qi energy shone brightly, and actually 
pushed Xu Qingfeng and Ye Linglong upwards by almost ten metres. 

Boom! 

Boom! 

The attacks of the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain landed 
directly on the city wall, and with two explosions, the Qi energy raged, leaving two 
terrifying craters directly on the rammed city wall. 

The aftermath of the explosion, the moment it reached Xu Qingfeng’s feet, was directly 
blocked and collapsed by the pentagram pattern formed by the qi energy. 

“Above the Heavenly Punishment, I can still exchange one for three!” 

Xu Qingfeng’s eyes exploded with a brilliant aura as he hissed with determination. 

Boom! 

As he charged towards the city head with Ye Linglong in tow, his entire aura, however, 
continued to boom and soar like a mountain being pulled up from the flat earth. 

This moment. 



Qi energy streaked across the city. 

Xu Qingfeng’s entire person was as harsh as if he was a sheathed sword, wanting to 
pierce the heavens. 

Rumble …… 

Above the sky, rolling thunder gusted. 

The terrifying pressure was like a prison, and as Xu Qingfeng’s aura changed, it rose 
again. 

Above the nine heavens, a thick cloud of darkness coalesced, layers upon layers of 
darkness surged and rolled. 

With the sound of rolling thunder, an electric snake suddenly swept through the sky, as 
if a plum blossom had blossomed, illuminating the dark night sky with light and 
darkness. 

Under the lightning, one can vaguely see a huge object on the side of the thick black 
clouds, coming towards the sky. 

But in the blink of an eye. 

Xu Qingfeng stomped three steps on the city wall in quick succession, leapt, and took 
Ye Linglong straight up the wall with him. 

As soon as he landed on the ground. 

Xu Qingfeng directly pushed Ye Linglong in the direction of the city with force, “Ye girl, 
you and I don’t have enough creation, you take a step first, I’ll take the back!” 

“Senior ……” 

Ye Linglong staggered forward a few steps with a pale expression, calling back in fear. 

But Xu Qingfeng ignored it, the wind was howling and as cold as a sword. 

He closed his eyes and let the wind sweep through his robes. 

As Ye Linglong watched, Xu Qingfeng stood loftily atop the city wall and slowly turned 
around to face the wall below. 

Boom, boom, boom, boom, boom! 

Five streaks of Qi energy rose up from beneath the city. 



In a flash. 

Five figures, following Xu Qingfeng, leapt into the air and were almost level with Xu 
Qingfeng on the city wall. 

“OW!” 

Almost simultaneously, a piercing wolf whistle resounded through the heavens and the 
earth. 

Xu Qingfeng slowly opened his eyes, but his right hand brushed across his waist. 

Clang! 

A sword sounded and roared long into the night sky. 

His eyes snapped open, and two beams of killing intent gushed out from his eyes like 
substance. 

At the same time. 

Xu Qingfeng’s voice was like loud thunder, and his killing intent rushed to the sky. 

“I have a sword that can go to the Yellow Spring, please all of you …… go with me!” 

Chapter 1746 

The breeze moves. 

Sound like great thunder. 

Clang! 

The sword chant echoed like a dragon, echoing for a long time at the top of the city. 

At this moment, Xu Qingfeng stood majestically at the top of the city, his aura majestic 
and overwhelming, facing the six Qijin powerhouses rising up in the air, and the huge 
Heavenly Wolf coming from the distance. 

In the night sky, black clouds rolled across the nine skies and thunder snakes stirred. 

A terrifying and hellish pressure was like a great mountain pressing down across the 
entire Xiongnu King City. 

“Make a move!” 



In an instant, the old ghost of Yin Mountain let out an explosive cry. 

The Heavenly Punishment Thundercloud above the nine heavens coalesced with a 
terrifying pressure that made even he shudder. 

Boom, boom, boom, boom, boom, boom! 

Six trains of qi energy, like a long rainbow, streaked across the night sky and roared 
across towards Xu Qingfeng on the city head. 

“One sword breaks it!” 

Xu Qingfeng’s robe danced as he faced the six Qi Qi streaks coming across the city, 
killing intent stirring in his eyes. 

Just as the Qi energy was approaching three metres in front of him. 

With his soft sword in hand, he slashed his sword horizontally. 

Buzz! 

The sword chanted softly. 

It was almost inaudible compared to the six powerful qi. 

But as the sword swung out, a three-metre-long sword qi stretched across the air and 
went straight ahead. 

The moment it collided with the six strains of qi. 

Four of the qi coils made a deafening sound and collapsed in the air. 

Only the Qi coils of the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain and the Old Mother of Lijima Island 
held for a moment with the sword Qi before they collapsed with a loud bang. 

Even so. 

Even so, Xu Qingfeng’s sword qi still moved forward again and only dissipated when it 
reached a distance of nearly two metres from the Old Mother of the Island and the Old 
Ghost of Yin Mountain. 

“What a strong sword qi!” 

The blue veins at the corners of Yinshan Old Ghost’s eyes twitched violently. 



“If it weren’t for us, the Hidden World, if it weren’t for that Chen Daojun who is crushing 
the world, he would be number one in the world!” 

The Old Mother of the Island of Departure’s surrounding Qi energy tumbled and blew 
her white hair about as she sighed and lamented, “Now …… do you know what the old 
body was worried about before? He is comparable to the second in the world!” 

At the end of the sentence, Old Mother Lijima’s tone was extraordinarily heavy. 

The old ghost of Yinshan, who had personally witnessed Xu Qingfeng’s sword, had his 
lips mumbling at this point, but he did not know how to refute it. 

This sword …… was still the same sword that the man on the city head had when he 
was wounded. 

If it was in full strength, I’m afraid this sword would have been a sword breath 
approaching! 

“On the road to Yellow Springs, I allow you, my companion!” 

Just as Old Mother Lijima and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain and the others were 
shocked by the sword just now. 

Xu Qingfeng’s cold and harsh voice was like a cold wind blowing from the depths of the 
Nine Underworlds, instantly causing the temperature in this side of the world to plummet 
to the freezing point. 

Boom! 

A loud boom roared. 

Under the gaze of the Old Mother of the Island and the others, Xu Qingfeng, who was 
standing on the city head, twisted his body and disappeared directly above the city 
head. 

“Be careful!” 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain’s face changed greatly 
as they exploded at the same time. 

Clang! 

Almost simultaneously, a sword chant resounded through the long sky. 

“Ah!” 



Screams of terror resounded through the long air. 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain turned their heads at 
the same time, but it was a Skywolf Academy Qi Power strong man who was in the air, 
his head had already separated, and blood was gushing out, while the panic scream 
was clearly from the Qi Power strong man next to him. 

In shock and panic. 

A thin bloodstained sword quietly appeared above the neck of the terrified screamer. 

Immediately afterwards, Xu Qingfeng’s cold face, like a ghost, appeared on the side of 
the Skywolf Academy’s Qigong practitioner’s head. 

Under the gaze of Old Mother Lijima and the others, the corner of one side of his mouth 
gently pulled up. 

“Invite the gentleman to the Yellow Spring!” 

The five simple words were like a death sentence. 

The Skywolf Academy Qi Power strongmen who were in a state of panic instantly 
changed their faces as if they were dead. 

A sense of unprecedented death crisis came over him. 

This was a feeling he hadn’t had for a long time! 

It had been decades since he had first stepped into the Skywolf Academy! 

In a trance, thoughts flew through the mind of this Skywolf Academy Qigong 
practitioner, from his memories as a child, which kept surfacing like lightning, until they 
were fixed at the present moment. 

His lips mumbled and he wanted to scream. 

But before the cry of terror could be uttered, he felt a cold chill rapidly burrowing into his 
brain from a certain location. 

Then he saw that he was flying rapidly upwards. 

The cold wind hissed in his ears. 

Time seemed to be frozen in this moment. 



He slowly shifted his eyes downwards and saw a headless corpse standing in the air 
below him, spewing blood with abandon. 

Another headless corpse was already plummeting towards the ground. 

Not far away, the Old Mother of the Island, the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain and the other 
two companions were all sputtering with horror and fear. 

He could even see the two long-time Qi powerhouses of the Wolf House opening their 
mouths wide and hissing something, but no matter how hard he tried to listen, he could 
no longer hear a single sound. 

But in the blink of an eye. 

Two Qigong practitioners perished on the spot. 

They were easily cut up like melons and fruits under Xu Qingfeng’s sword. 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain were still able to 
withstand such an impact. 

But for the two remaining Skywolf Academy Qi Jin powerhouses, it was a direct collapse 
of their three views, completely overturning their perception of the martial realm. 

“Impossible, why is this happening? The gap above Qi energy, why is it so big?” 

“He’s not human, what should I do? I, I don’t want to die, I’ve damn well advanced to Qi 
Jin, I’ve barely made it to where I am now, I, I don’t want to die!” 

A hiss of horror and fear resounded through the heavens and the earth. 

Under the extreme terror of death. 

The Qi energy around the two Heavenly Wolf Academy Qi Power powerhouses raged 
violently, but their bodies were rapidly falling towards the ground. 

“The dao heart has collapsed!” 

The Old Mother of the Islands looked down at the two Heavenly Wolf Academy Qi Qi Qi 
powerhouses who were falling towards the ground, showing a sympathetic look. 

“One sword has broken the dao heart of a Qi Jin powerhouse, he deserves to be 
second in the world!” 

The old ghost of Yinshan Mountain gruffly lamented. 



The next second. 

The pupils of the two Hidden Worlds suddenly tightened to the extreme. 

As they watched, Xu Qingfeng, holding a soft sword, was already standing on top of the 
ground where the two Skywolf Academy Qi Power powerhouses had fallen. 

The two Qi Jin powerhouses, who were gripped by the fear of death, did not notice Xu 
Qingfeng below them in the slightest. 

“I, Xu Qingfeng, respectfully invite you all to die, why do you ever have the face to 
escape?” 

In an instant, Xu Qingfeng smiled bitterly and swung his sword out. 

What?! 

The two Heavenly Wolf Academy Qi Power powerhouses were simultaneously startled. 

When the two looked down at Xu Qingfeng below, a cold and fierce sword qi had 
already stretched across the sky and was coming straight at them. 

The speed was so fast that it was difficult for people to react. 

Poof! 

Pfft! 

Two clusters of blood splashed in the air. 

The guts and the remains of the bodies spilled to the ground. 

Buzz! 

Xu Qingfeng stood with his sword in hand, his qi sweeping upwards, forming a barrier 
that directly dispersed all the blood and corpses that spilled into the sky. 

The breeze swept through his robes and hair. 

He tilted his head, his gaze locked on the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of 
Yin Mountain, who were falling towards the ground, and the fierce smile on the corner of 
his mouth became more and more ominous. 

It was as if he was a pale wolf hunting in the vast snowy plains, locking onto his prey 
…… 



This scene caused a chill to rise from the backs of the Old Mother of the Island and the 
Old Ghost of Yin Mountain. 

The two of them looked at each other and understood each other, and at the same time 
they shot their hands at each other. 

With a loud bang, they flew off in two directions with the force of their palms, avoiding 
Xu Qingfeng who was directly below them. 

“Two old hidden dogs, are they also afraid of me, Xu Qingfeng?” 

Xu Qingfeng snorted a laugh. 

The next second. 

He directly cast the Dragon Ascending Technique to stomp on the city wall and charged 
straight for the city. 

As soon as he got onto the city wall, he froze, even ignoring the Old Mother of the 
Leaving Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain who were coming in hot pursuit 
behind him. 

“Why haven’t you fled yet?” 

Xu Qingfeng looked at Ye Linglong standing on the city head, his eyes full of dismay. 
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Chapter 1747 

The cold wind and snow. 

As Xu Qingfeng leapt onto the city once again, his overbearing and fierce qi energy 
directly destroyed the wind and snow on this side of the city wall. 

But the cold silhouette standing at the end of his gaze astonished Xu Qingfeng. 

Just now he had deliberately leapt down the city wall in order to kill four strong Qi Qi 
practitioners of the Heavenly Wolf Academy and cut the “weeds” for the next battle, but 
also to buy time for Ye Linglong to escape. 

The time it took to kill the four Qigong powerhouses was very short, but Ye Linglong 
was able to use this time to escape! 

After all, the road ahead was already unobstructed. 



On top of the city walls, there was no Hun Rongwu guarding, but all the tools that 
should be there were still there. 

The two red sticks of the Hong Society, if with the help of these tools, leap off the wall 
and escape into the vast snowy plains, it is still easy to do so. 

She didn’t run. …… 

At this time Xu Qingfeng watched Ye Linglong at the same time, Ye Linglong also 
watched him. 

Qi energy rampant, instead of the wind and snow cry. 

It brushed Ye Linglong’s robe, as well as three thousand green threads. 

She looked forlorn and complicated, her beautiful eyes flushed with tinges of red blood, 
but dense with mist. 

She just stared at Xu Qingfeng in a daze. 

What had just happened, Ye Linglong had seen it all. 

She was also clear that Xu Qingfeng had gone out of his way to invoke that terrifying 
oppressive feeling above the Nine Heavens just to buy her time to escape. 

“Why don’t you leave?” 

Xu Qingfeng asked in a stern and scolding voice. 

A great battle was about to take place, with the Heavenly Punishment and Lightning 
Tribulation waiting to happen, the two Hidden Worlds of the Old Mother of the Island 
and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain behind him, and a Hunnu Heavenly Wolf stretched 
across the long sky watching intently. 

The time he could buy for Ye Linglong to escape was only a little bit ago! 

“Seniors ……” 

Ye Linglong said ruefully, “Please also ask senior to leave, how can Linglong let senior 
risk his life.” 

“You ……” 

Xu Qingfeng’s jealousy and anger surged. 



He felt the overwhelming Qi of the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin 
Mountain behind him. 

Xu Qingfeng’s right foot shattered the ground of the city wall with a bang, and like a 
cannonball, he rushed directly to Ye Linglong’s front. 

“Get out of here, you’re alive so that the Hong Society won’t turn against you!” 

Xu Qingfeng reprimanded in a stern voice, and was about to jump off the wall with Ye 
Linglong with his majestic Qi energy. 

Suddenly. 

“Ah!” 

Ye Linglong let out a scream and desperately struggled up, trying to break free from Xu 
Qingfeng’s large hand. 

The sudden scene caused Xu Qingfeng’s eyes to spit out fire. 

Ye Linglong’s abnormal behaviour had taken him by surprise. 

Feeling the struggle coming from his right hand, Xu Qingfeng’s eyebrows twisted, and 
he directly launched a force, his right hand was like an eagle’s claw, clamping down on 
Ye Linglong with a deadly grip. 

Ye Linglong let out a painful scream and could no longer resist. 

However, it was this delay. 

“Not good!” 

Xu Qingfeng was about to move when his face suddenly changed drastically and he let 
out an explosive cry. 

Almost instinctively, he stomped the ground with both feet, tugging Ye Linglong and 
retreating extremely quickly towards the city head on the inner side of the city. 

Buzz! 

A Qi energy drifted and swept across the straight ground where the two of them were 
standing just now. 

Boom! 



The moment the qi touched the ground, it exploded with a loud bang, blowing a big 
crater out of the ground, sending smoke and dust and debris flying. 

The towering walls of the city trembled a few times. 

The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands floated down to the side of the large crater, her 
wrinkled eyelids drooping, her eyes narrowed into slits, her cold light biting as she gave 
a teasing smile. 

“Xu brat, after the farewell twenty years ago, you are now even stronger than before!” 

That was close! 

Xu Qingfeng’s heart pounded fiercely and his pupils tightened as he stared at the Old 
Mother of the Outlying Islands. 

He did not respond, but his six senses quickly spread out. 

In such a short while, the Old Mother of the Island had already arrived, there was no 
way the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain was still lagging behind! 

Ye Linglong’s face was also pale and she scanned the surroundings in panic. 

Suddenly. 

“Sword come!” 

Xu Qingfeng let out a shout. 

Clang! 

The sword chant rose at first. 

The soft sword in his hand flew straight out of his hand and into the air, sword qi 
spreading across the air, turning into countless sword qi sword shadows that swept 
across the long sky, forming a circular barrier. 

Boom! 

A one-metre diameter Qi fist shadow blasted the barrier formed by the sword qi without 
warning. 

There was a loud roar. 

The Qi collapsed, forming ripples visible to the naked eye. 



The terrifying impact even forced Xu Qingfeng to the edge of the wall head near the city, 
even landing directly on his left foot. 

Just as he was about to fall off the city’s head. 

Xu Qingfeng’s tongue burst into thunder as his right foot tensed up and his qi energy 
was released. 

With the force of the recoil from the qi blast against the city wall, he dragged Ye 
Linglong back up to the city wall. 

But the moment he had just stabilised himself. 

“Ah!” 

With a scream. 

Xu Qingfeng’s face suddenly changed, and the right hand that was clamping down on 
Ye Linglong was suddenly empty. 

He jerked his head around, and saw Ye Linglong falling towards the city wall. 

Time, at this moment, became slow. 

Xu Qingfeng’s entire body was dumbfounded, his eyes wide open. 

A city wall that was tens of meters high, falling like that, unless one was a Qi power 
strong person, no one would survive! 

But …… for a moment just now, to the onlookers, it looked like he, Xu Qingfeng, had 
exhausted himself and let Ye Linglong fall off the wall by mistake. 

But Xu Qingfeng clearly felt that in that moment just now, Ye Linglong secretly made an 
effort to break free from his right hand grip. 

In other words …… it was Ye Linglong who deliberately jumped off the city wall by 
herself! 

Is this girl …… crazy? 

What the hell was she thinking? 

“Old ghost, save the people!” 

In a flash of lightning, the Old Mother of the Leaving Island bellowed, “It is more 
important to live than to die!” 



Rumble …… 

In the night sky, there was a loud burst of sound, and a majestic qi train crashed 
through the air and swooped straight down towards the city walls. 

At the forefront of the qi-pitches, there was the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain! 

“Ye Linglong!” 

Xu Qingfeng also reacted, although he didn’t know what exactly Ye Linglong was 
thinking, but if he didn’t save Ye Linglong now, the fall would only be a pile of rotten 
meat. 

“Xu Qingfeng, stay!” 

Not waiting for Xu Qingfeng to leap off the city wall, a long whistle sounded behind him. 

Buzz! 

Qi energy tore through the air, emitting an ear-piercing buzzing sound. 

Xu Qingfeng instinctively pronounced his qi energy, and his body turned to the side, 
flying out in the direction of a diagonal stab. 

In an instant. 

A long, blood-coloured whip, wrapped in Qi energy, brushed the bottom of Xu 
Qingfeng’s foot and struck the city head with a snap. 

The rammed and solid city head cracked in response. 

After the whip was swung, the Old Mother of the Island seemed to have anticipated it 
and twisted her waist violently, swinging the long bloody whip again. 

The long whip was like a wandering dragon under the aura of Qi energy, and it drew an 
arc in the air, directly wrapping around Xu Qingfeng’s feet. 

“Sword come!” 

Xu Qingfeng waved his hand in the air. 

The soft sword tore through the air and whistled as it flew into his hand. 

Without hesitation, he urged his Qi energy to energize the soft sword and chopped it 
directly onto the long bloody whip. 



Squeak …… 

The soft sword chopped against the bloody whip and released a toothsome metallic 
scraping sound. 

A cluster of bright sparks even erupted. 

But the sword did not break the bloody whip! 

Xu Qingfeng’s eyes were wide open, and a trace of panic was rarely revealed on his 
cold face. 

“Jie Jie …… old body’s life’s work, how can it be cut off by your sword?” 

The Old Mother of the Islands shrilly whistled, her hands gripping the long blood-colored 
whip and flinging it directly into the air, hardening Xu Qingfeng as if he were a broken 
pocket and throwing him into the air. 

“Ow!” 

At that moment, the Heavenly Wolf, which was watching from afar, suddenly let out a 
long whistle that resounded through the heavens and the earth. 

As Xu Qingfeng drew a parabolic line in the air, he saw a huge creature in the distance, 
rushing towards him like lightning! 

Chapter 1748 

Above the ninth heaven. 

Thunder clouds of heavenly punishment gathered and gathered momentum, thunder 
rolled and lightning snakes stirred. 

The lofty and gigantic figure of the Heavenly Wolf, like a terrified mountain, came 
treading through the air. 

As it approached, the light above the city where Xu Qingfeng and the Old Mother of the 
Island were located suddenly dimmed. 

A long wolf whistle accompanied the sound. 

The wolf swooped down towards Xu Qingfeng, its sharp claws sweeping through the air, 
leaving several cracks visible to the naked eye, and grabbed Xu Qingfeng head-on. 

Xu Qingfeng, who was imprisoned by the bloody whip of the Old Mother of the Island, 
was thrown to the highest point in the air. 



In a flash of lightning. 

Xu Qingfeng’s eyes shot out with a brilliant aura and he let out an explosive cry. 

“Activate the formation!” 

Boom! 

The Qi around him blasted out, like a rolling river reeling backwards as it rushed 
towards the sharp claws of the Heavenly Wolf. 

The majestic qi swirled in the air and transformed into a five-metre diameter transparent 
Taiji Eight Trigrams diagram. 

The moment the transparent Taiji Eight Trigrams diagram took shape, it was like a big 
hand that met the sharp claws of the Heavenly Wolf. 

Time seemed to be slowed down at this moment. 

When the Taiji Bagua Diagram and the Sky Wolf Claw were a few metres away from 
each other, the momentum of both of them gave a lurch. 

Dang, dang, dang …… 

The sound of qi clashing like a drumbeat erupted from the middle of the Taiji Bagua 
Diagram and the Sky Wolf Claw, resounding through heaven and earth. 

With a seemingly slow but unstoppable momentum, the transparent Taiji Bagua 
Diagram pushed the sharp claws of the Heavenly Wolf back upwards little by little. 

Each time it rose a notch, a drum burst would be emitted. 

“Hm?!” 

The Old Mother of the Islands let out a startled eek, “I never thought that the Zhuge 
Family’s Eight Formation Diagram of Gods and Ghosts could be brought into play to 
such an extent in your Xu Qingfeng’s hands, I’m afraid that even the Zhuge Family 
would be ashamed of themselves when they see it!” 

“Hmph, old immortal, how dare you distract yourself!” 

Almost simultaneously, Xu Qingfeng’s angry rebuke sounded like the sound of thunder 
from the nine heavens, violently exploding in the ears of the Old Mother of the Outlying 
Islands. 

What? 



The Old Mother of the Outlying Islands was shocked and her eyes hurriedly locked onto 
Xu Qingfeng. 

“Python Dragon Overturning the Sky!” 

Xu Qingfeng, who was wrapped in the long blood-coloured whip, twisted his waist in the 
air. 

Boom! 

With a loud sound of qi energy sweeping through him. 

His body spun in the air under the aegis of the Qi energy, and the long Qi train stretched 
out several dozen meters, like a python that rushed to the sky, twisting and flipping in 
the air. 

There was a bang! 

The long blood-coloured whip originally imprisoned on Xu Qingfeng’s feet exploded 
under the violent twisting and turning of Xu Qingfeng. 

With his first foot, he used the Taiji Bagua to resist the Heavenly Wolf, and with his 
second foot, he used the Python Dragon to flip the sky to break free from the 
confinement of the Old Mother of the Leaving Island. 

All this was in just a second! 

It was so fast that the Old Mother of the Outlying Islands could hardly react. 

The long whip was broken off and the unprepared Old Mother stumbled back with a cry. 

Not waiting for her to stabilise herself. 

Xu Qingfeng’s shouting voice exploded again. 

“Heaven Turning Hand!” 

Boom! 

On the vault of the sky, Xu Qingfeng’s qi was released like a rolling wild wave, wrapped 
in a roar of qi, he hung upside down in the air and pressed his palm down towards the 
Old Mother of the Island below. 

With a loud roar, the majestic qi energy gathered into a palm imprint of ten metres in 
size, wrapped in a terrifying killing intent as vast as a prison, and pressed down across 
the ground. 



The terrifying oppression enveloped the Old Mother of the Island, causing her, who was 
already staggering backwards, to almost stumble and fall to the ground. 

“Ah!” 

In the nick of time, the Old Mother of the Island retreated with her right foot and 
stomped on the ground, shaking the sky with debris. 

Faced with the huge hand falling on her head, she directly sank her waist and stood on 
her horse, her hands fiercely raised into the air to meet it. 

Boom! 

Two strands of qi instantly rushed out from her arms like two pillars in the sky, and with 
a loud bang, they crashed directly into the titanic hand. 

The moment the two strands of qi collided, waves of qi cascaded out. 

However, they were directly frozen in mid-air. 

“Hahahaha …… Xu Qingfeng, even if you go straight into the Heavenly Punishment 
Realm, you still can’t help the old body!” 

The pale white hair of the old mother of the Island of the Sea waved about as she 
laughed fiercely. 

In the air, Xu Qingfeng looked cold and stern, overlooking the old mother of the Island 
below, and suddenly snickered. 

“Old immortal, it’s not just Heavenly Punishment on top of Heavenly Punishment!” 

What?! 

The Old Mother of the Islands’ smile froze. 

The next second. 

High in the sky, Xu Qingfeng’s robe shook violently and a buzzing sound was emitted. 

“Rise again!” 

The two simple words even overshadowed the thunderous sounds that were gathering 
momentum above the nine heavens. 

The sound shook the heavens and the earth. 



The aftermath had yet to dissipate. 

Xu Qingfeng’s already majestic and domineering aura was once again soaring. 

Rumble …… 

Almost at the same time, the sound of rolling thunder suddenly became violent as 
countless lightning snakes ravaged the night sky, illuminating the heaven and earth. 

Bang Teen! 

The giant hand that was originally frozen in mid-air, as Xu Qingfeng’s aura surged 
again, in a brutal and domineering gesture, viciously pressed down again by a large 
margin. 

“Poof!” 

The Old Mother of the Island shook her body and spurted out a large mouthful of blood 
as she roared in horror, “Just now …… wasn’t your strongest?” 

“Not even now!” 

Xu Qingfeng’s voice, once again, resounded through the long air, “Three up!” 

Boom! 

Before the words left his mouth, Xu Qingfeng’s aura once again rose a great deal 
higher. 

Rumble …… 

Click! 

Above the ninth heaven, a lightning bolt, snaking down, tore through the night sky. 

It was as if in an instant, the heavenly punishment thunder clouds that had gathered in 
momentum boiled over. 

This lightning thunderstorm caused the entire King City to shake violently. 

Almost simultaneously. 

The “Heaven-Turning Hand” that was falling down once again made a loud sound and 
crushed a large part of it with a loud bang. 

“Poof!” 



The Old Mother of the Island was caught off guard and her body shook, her knees 
slammed to the ground with a bang and she spurted out another mouthful of blood. 

But she didn’t care about her injuries, and she didn’t even care about the huge hand 
that was close to her head. 

At this moment, she gazed up at Xu Qingfeng who was hanging in the air, her eyes 
were filled with fear, as if she was facing the ghosts and gods directly. 

“Aren’t you …… you …… afraid of prematurely inspiring the heavenly punishment 
thunder cloud above your head?” 

She wanted to question, at this time, Xu Qingfeng still had injuries, but was far too much 
stronger than the Xu Qingfeng she remembered from twenty years ago. 

Such an increase in strength was simply not something that could be done in a mere 
twenty years! 

But as the words reached her mouth, Old Mother Lijima forcefully swallowed them back 
into her stomach, because the truth was right in front of her eyes, and her questioning 
really seemed ridiculous. 

“Afraid?” 

Xu Qingfeng slowly tilted his head to look above the nine heavens, the black clouds that 
could not be seen beyond the borders, rolling in which thunder shook the sky and 
lightning stirred and raged. 

“I wouldn’t be called Xu Qingfeng if I were afraid of dying!” 

“Four rise!” 

Boom! 

With a tongue bursting into spring thunder, the ten-metre Qi giant hand finally broke 
through the last distance with the Old Mother of the Outlying Islands and, like a titanic 
mountain pressing down on her, directly covered her with a palm amidst the shrieks of 
the Old Mother of the Outlying Islands. 

On the top of the city, there was a loud sound, and the Qi energy tumbled out, countless 
debris shot into the air, and smoke and dust rolled around. 

At the same time. 

“Ow!” 



The Heavenly Wolf that was blocked by the Taiji Eight Trigrams Diagram fiercely let out 
a long whine. 

The next second. 

The huge Heavenly Wolf’s body was covered in blood, and it opened its mouth to reveal 
its fangs, biting into the Taiji Eight Trigrams Diagram. 

Immediately afterwards, without losing momentum, it pounced directly towards Xu 
Qingfeng and killed him. 

Xu Qingfeng stood suspended in the air, no longer paying attention to the Old Mother of 
the Island below, but with his hands behind his back and his hair dancing lightly, he 
turned to stare coldly at the oncoming Heavenly Wolf. 

At this moment, time seemed to slow down. 

As his eyes looked down below the city head, he saw that Ye Linglong, who had 
originally fallen to the city head, had been saved by the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain and 
was not seriously injured. 

A whirlwind. 

A smile of relief appeared on his face, when he looked up again to face the Heavenly 
Wolf directly. 

His smile disappeared and only endless killing intent remained. 

“Six up!” 

Boom click click …… 

The already boiling Heavenly Punishment Thundercloud turned directly into a wild 
dance of electric snakes and incessant thunder sounds as Xu Qingfeng’s aura surged 
once again. 

The terrifying might of the thunderclouds pressed down on King City. 

Countless currents ravaged the long sky, illuminating the heavens and the earth in a 
blanket of white. 

It was as if countless heavenly punishment lightning was about to descend directly in 
the next second. 

The lightning was enveloping. 



Even the movements of the Heavenly Wolf gave a start, and a look of fear flowed from 
its large, blood-coloured eyes. 

With his hands behind his back, Xu Qingfeng calmly shouted out two words. 

“Raise your sword!” 

Swish! 

The soft sword, which was close to his body, instantly sped behind him and hung in the 
air. 

The next second. 

Swish, swish, swish …… 

Within King Noah’s City, a sharp sword and battle sword all whistled and rose to the 
sky. 

Under the lightning, countless piercing cold lights were reflected. 

Like ten thousand stars rising in the sky, they were dense and spectacular! 
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Chapter 1749 

Rumble …… 

In the night sky, the heavenly punishment thunderclouds were black and raging, 
tumbling and cascading. 

Countless streaks of lightning tore through the night sky. 

It was as if the world was ending. 

Inside the Xiongnu King City, with Xu Qingfeng’s “Raise the sword”, ten thousand 
swords rose into the air, densely packed and hovering above the long sky. 

The bright and dazzling cold light swept through the air, piercing the bones with cold. 

As they hovered, the ten thousand swords trembled, emitting an ear-piercing sword 
chant in the air that resonated through the heavens and the earth. 

With his hands behind his back, Xu Qingfeng was calm and collected, his brows 
revealing his endless killing intent as he gazed at the Heavenly Wolf in the air. 



He smiled gently, “Sinful beast! Are these swords enough to kill you?” 

“Delusion!” 

The Heavenly Wolf stood proudly in the long sky, its body suddenly glowing with blood, 
and it actually let out a hoarse refutation sound. 

The next second. 

The Sky Wolf raised its head to the sky and let out a long whistle, the blood light rushed 
to the sky, rendering the white heaven and earth, a blood colour. 

“Kill!” 

Almost simultaneously, Xu Qingfeng held his hands behind his back, his lips and teeth 
lightly opened. 

The voice was very soft, but it resounded through this side of the world like a life-
sapping Sanskrit sound. 

In an instant. 

A sword chant rang out. 

The countless swords and sabres hanging in the air all struck across the sky, and under 
the impetus of wisps of qi, with Xu Qingfeng as the centre, they were like rivers of stars 
rushing to the sea, coming together in a vast manner. 

Everything seemed to be slow. 

In the blink of an eye, countless sharp swords swarmed around Xu Qingfeng and 
Skywolf, covering the sky and the earth in a dense mass. 

The swords and blades were all pointed at Skywolf! 

“Die!” 

Sky Wolf suddenly lowered his head, his wolf eyes were cold and stern. 

Boom! 

With a loud boom. 

The Heavenly Wolf fiercely charged towards Xu Qingfeng, and the great bloom of blood 
light even instantly shot out countless beams of light, densely shooting at the countless 
sharp swords. 



In an instant, blood light stirred and sparks erupted on the sky dome of the night. 

The sound of swords chanting resounded through the long sky. 

It was beautiful and majestic, but underneath this splendid scene was a terrifying killing 
machine that was enough to destroy everything. 

A sharp sword was struck down by the blood light, buzzing and whistling, shooting 
straight at the buildings in the Hun kingdom below, with a roaring explosion, smoke and 
dust, and debris flying about. 

Every now and then, another building was overwhelmed and collapsed with a crash. 

And in the centre of the swirling vortex of the agitated clash. 

Xu Qingfeng and Skywolf stood opposite each other, lofty and unmoving, invisible, and 
as if there was a vast and boundless killing force, clashing together. 

In the process of this stalemate against the blast. 

Compared to before, the lightning that shot through the sky disappeared even in its 
sinuous curves, and was a straight line of lightning that tore through the night sky in a 
brutal manner. 

The terrifying pressure was as terrifying as a prison, as if the sky had tipped over, and 
the air in this part of the world seemed to freeze. 

“Xu Qingfeng, come and die!” 

Suddenly, a frantic shrill whistle rang out from the ruins of the city wall. 

Boom! 

The pile of ruins exploded in response. 

The wife of the island, her clothes in tatters and in disarray, was surging and tumbling 
with a vast Qi energy, like a sharp sword rushing through the sky, charging towards the 
silent Xu Qingfeng. 

The fearful killing intent was stirring. 

Xu Qingfeng’s sword eyebrows knitted slightly, and a touch of depression surfaced on 
his cold face. 

The wolf remained motionless, its body exploding with countless beams of blood-
coloured light, but its huge mouth was pulled up with a human smile. 



“I know you want to die by fish, but …… as long as I kill you before the heavenly 
punishment comes, this vast thunder cloud will automatically collapse, and this is the 
reason why I am striking!” 

The hoarse voice was filled with a look askance complacency. 

Xu Qingfeng’s strength had indeed surprised even it for a moment. 

However, this did not stop Sky Wolf from making the initial decision to surround and kill 
Xu Qingfeng. 

Xu Qingfeng, who was injured, had the possibility of forcing out the Heavenly 
Punishment Lightning Tribulation by letting two Hidden Worlds hunt him. 

However, if it was added to him, he thought that even if Xu Qingfeng’s current strength 
rose even further, he would still be able to kill him before the Heavenly Punishment 
Thunderbolt descended! 

“Sinful beast!” 

Xu Qingfeng carried his hands behind his back and laughed disdainfully. 

Two beams of blood burst out from Sky Wolf’s eyes as he angrily rebuked, “How dare 
you be arrogant when you’re so close to death?” 

“An old, undead man, plus a sinful beast, and you still dare to speak shamelessly?” 

Xu Qingfeng narrowed his eyes, as if he had no qualms about the dangerous situation 
he was in at the moment. 

“Hahahaha …… do you really think that I and the Old Mother of the Outlying Islands are 
the only ones who are striking now?” 

Sky Wolf’s wolf head flicked sideways as he sneered, “What about adding in the Old 
Ghost of Yin Mountain?” 

Boom! 

The words had not yet ended. 

Below the city walls, there was another loud explosion. 

A voluminous Qi train instantly shot straight up into the sky. 



Xu Qingfeng’s eyebrows instantly knitted together into a “Chuan”, and when he looked 
down, he saw a huge boulder, five metres long and wide, wrapped up in the turbulent qi 
energy, blasting up towards him like a small mountain. 

On the ground below the boulder, a huge crater remained on the wall, which had been 
cut directly from the wall. 

A few dozen metres away from the crater in the city wall, Ye Linglong was woefully and 
desolately stationed there, looking at Xu Qingfeng with a disoriented look. 

Time became incomparably slow at this moment. 

There was a loud boom, thunder and lightning, and a huge sound from heaven and 
earth. 

At this moment, to Xu Qingfeng, it was as if they were all weakening rapidly until they 
disappeared completely. 

His cold face finally became bleak and obscure. 

His eyes slowly moved to meet the gaze of the disoriented Ye Linglong below. 

Xu Qingfeng smiled. 

The smile was poignant and spontaneous. 

“I came all the way here to save you, what exactly is your intention with this move? It’s 
just that, it’s just that, it’s the fate of God, Xu Qingfeng ……” 

A thought, Xu Qingfeng with his hands behind his back, tilted his head to look at the 
rolling thunder clouds above the ninth sky, bleak and dark suddenly became 
determined. 

The light of the determined eyes, as if sweeping past the rolling thunder clouds on the 
ninth heaven, looked higher up. 

“Qingfeng has come to this earth, and is bound to tread the heavens. If the heavens are 
to be reversed, this heavenly punishment and thunderstorm will be reversed as usual!” 

The words were resounding and terrified like thunder. 

What? 

As soon as the words were spoken, Sky Wolf, Old Mother Lijima and Old Ghost 
Yinshan were all startled at the same time. 



Not waiting for the three of them to react. 

Boom! 

The Qi around Xu Qingfeng’s body once again spread out in all directions, rampant and 
overbearing. 

Buzz! 

As the Qi spread out, a bright golden light suddenly exploded from behind him, spinning 
and twisting at great speed, forming a dazzling golden gossip ten metres in size. 

The golden light enveloped him, and the pressure was immense. 

At this moment, Xu Qingfeng’s entire aura soared once again. 

The golden light Taiji Bagua was printed behind him, making him seem like a god. 

In a whirl. 

Clang clang clang …… 

Above the firmament, thousands of sharp swords and battle swords simultaneously let 
out a sad cry, as if they had been summoned, and all gave up fighting against the blood 
light emanating from the Heavenly Wolf, and swarmed towards Xu Qingfeng’s feet as if 
a hundred rivers were returning to the sea. 

“You, what are you doing?” 

The Heavenly Wolf was utterly dumbfounded, having lost the Ten Thousand Swords 
entanglement, its pressure was instantly reduced. 

But then, its plan to stall Xu Qingfeng and create a second chance for the Old Mother of 
the Leaving Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain to kill him would be completely 
foiled! 

The long sky. 

The sound of thunder resounded through the heavens and the earth. 

Lightning stirred and the sky and earth were white. 

Stalks of sharp swords and battle daggers, reflecting a bone-chilling cold light under the 
lightning, converged vastly at Xu Qingfeng’s feet, forming a spectacular avenue of 
swords. 



“Hahahaha ……” 

Xu Qingfeng laughed out loud in a spontaneous manner as he took a step forward, 
stepping on the swords and walking towards the Heavenly Punishment Thundercloud. 

The sound of laughter echoed. 

Every step was idle and sprightly, a leisurely stroll. 

However, this move of facing the Heavenly Punishment Thundercloud directly made 
Sky Wolf, Old Mother Lijima and Old Ghost Yinshan dumbfounded. 

Was he …… going to commit suicide? 

Under the watchful eyes of the three, Xu Qingfeng took a step, that is, a dozen meters 
forward on the sword, and his laughter never stopped. 

Golden light taiji eight trigrams quickly rotate, mysterious majestic. 

Thousands of swords, emitting sword chants and mournful cries, bent down under his 
feet to pave the way for him. 

It was at this moment. 

With his hands behind his back, Xu Qingfeng, who was bashfully stepping towards the 
heavenly punishment, opened his lips and teeth lightly. 

“Humane Xu Qingfeng, go to death to borrow the Heavenly Punishment into a sword for 
one use, this word is followed by the law, the Heavenly Punishment cannot be 
disobeyed!” 

Overbearing and brutal, out of the corner of his eye and untamed. 

Chapter 1750 

The voice echoes. 

Out of the corner of its eye, it is domineering. 

Borrowing a heavenly punishment into a sword? 

“Are you crazy? Who do you think you are?” 

Sky Wolf tilted his head to look at Xu Qingfeng who was carrying the Taiji Eight 
Trigrams, his golden light was dazzling, and his feet were treading on ten thousand 
swords, and he cursed loudly. 



“Heavenly punishment into a sword? Xu Qingfeng, you’re really daydreaming!” 

“Hahahaha …… is at least second in the world, but I never thought that when you are 
about to die, you can be so arrogant and ignorant that you can disobey the ‘hand’ of the 
heavens!” 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain also laughed out loud. 

Even because Xu Qingfeng’s words and actions were so absurd that it made the three 
of them, at this moment, even temporarily put aside the thought of striking. 

Just now, with Sky Wolf restraining Xu Qingfeng, Old Mother Lijima and Old Ghost 
Yinshan would have been able to kill Xu Qingfeng with a single blow. 

But now Xu Qingfeng’s intentions seem to the trio to be simply ridiculous nonsense, a 
death-defying move! 

Even …… speculated in their minds that Xu Qingfeng might have known that he would 
die, and that this was just a way to save a little face for his own death! 

At least he is the second in the world, it is reasonable to want to save some face. 

However. 

Xu Qingfeng was unconcerned by the three men’s mocking sneers. 

He snickered and shook his head, “If you don’t dare to go against the heavens, you will 
only be able to stop at earth for the rest of your life. 

The soft whisper dissipated into the roar of the thunderstorm. 

Not even the nearest Heavenly Wolf heard it. 

Immediately afterwards. 

Xu Qingfeng took a step forward, stepping on the “star river” formed by ten thousand 
swords, and headed towards the Heavenly Punishment Thundercloud without pausing 
or hesitating, everything seemed determined and spontaneous. 

He slowly lowered his head and squinted his eyes, shining brightly. 

He looked down at Ye Linglong who was lost in thought below. 

His lips and teeth lightly opened, “Ye girl, run!” 



The voice was very soft, but at this moment, with the Qi energy boost, it was clearly 
transmitted to Ye Linglong’s ears. 

Ye Linglong’s delicate body trembled, as if her soul was instantly brought back by these 
words, her beautiful eyes swished red and her teary eyes were filled with tears. 

She looked at Xu Qingfeng, who was stepping on his sword to meet the thundercloud of 
heavenly punishment, with a complicated glance at the dome of the sky. 

After just one look. 

She then turned around decisively and ran towards the distance. 

The battle just now had affected her, and although she had been saved by the Old 
Ghost of Yin Mountain after jumping down from the city, she was carrying injuries. 

At this moment, Ye Linglong was cloaked in hair, stumbling and hobbling, running 
towards the depths of the Xiongnu King City in a wretched manner. 

Several times she fell and several times she rose again, tears having long since 
covered her forlorn and absolutely beautiful face. 

But her eyes, however, became more and more determined, and even …… carried a 
bitter killing intent! 

The distance is getting farther and farther, losing the sweeping sweep of qi energy, the 
biting cold wind and biting snowflakes, finally ravaging Ye Linglong’s body again. 

But she didn’t care, and while crying, in order to keep herself from crying out, she stiffly 
lifted her left hand and bit her left wrist. 

Perhaps too hard, her wrist was soon crimson. 

And in the vault of the sky. 

When Xu Qingfeng reminded Ye Linglong, Skywolf, the Old Mother of the Leaving 
Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain were stunned at the same time, their minds 
reeling. 

None of them were stupid, and to have lived to this age, they had long since become 
old and wise. 

Xu Qingfeng had come to save Ye Linglong, although the accident had put an end to 
the rescue. 



But in the end, Xu Qingfeng was looking after Ye Linglong, if he really saved his face 
and sought death, would he still have warned Ye Linglong to escape? 

Ask yourself, no one would take the drama to such an extent! 

In a flash. 

The Heavenly Wolf looked down towards the Old Mother of the Outlying Islands and the 
Old Ghost of Yin Mountain. 

The two of them, one wolf and the other, glanced at each other and understood the 
worry in the other’s heart. 

“Ow!” 

The Sky Wolf’s long wail resounded through the night sky. 

Boom! 

The nearest Sky Wolf’s blood light around its body was like star fire, exploding in a flash 
of light, shining brightly and gloriously. 

It was as if the place it was in was an ocean of blood. 

The next second. 

The Sky Wolf took the lead and stepped into the air and charged towards Xu Qingfeng. 

“Old ghost, make a move!” 

“No need for you to say anything!” 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain followed after Skywolf, 
and as their Qi energy was released and surged, they directly dragged their long Qi 
energy and shot towards Xu Qingfeng. 

Heaven and earth roared. 

Lightning and thunder raged. 

Perhaps sensing Xu Qingfeng’s approach, the boundless thunderclouds of Heavenly 
Punishment that had been pressing down on the entire Xiongnu City erupted even more 
powerfully at this moment. 

It was a terrifying pressure that pressed down. 



It seemed to be wrapped in the boundless thunder clouds and the heavenly 
thunderbolts, pouring down and descending directly on King Xiongnu City. 

Even time, at this moment, truly slowed down. 

Buzzing …… 

The sword chanting and mournful chanting seemed to compose a poignant funeral 
song. 

The golden light of the Taiji Bagua spun and spun, splashing out a brilliant golden light, 
seemingly cloaking Xu Qingfeng in a glorious golden armour. 

He is like a god or goddess. 

Walking and grieving with ease. 

With his hands behind his back, Xu Qingfeng took a step forward and looked down at 
the raging Heavenly Wolves and the Old Mother of the Leaving Island and the Old 
Ghost of Yin Mountain below, smiling contemptuously. 

“Can you stop them? It’s too late!” 

“Ow!” 

The Heavenly Wolf roared long, splashing heavenly blood light at this moment, as it 
approached Xu Qingfeng, even overwhelming the golden light of the Taiji Bagua behind 
Xu Qingfeng. 

There was not the slightest hesitation. 

Pure simplicity and brutality. 

The huge body of the Heavenly Wolf, like a great mountain pushing across, blatantly 
crashed into Xu Qingfeng. 

Any extra fancy could have delayed it for an instant at this moment. 

The most primitive movement, simple and brutal, but the most effective. 

Yet. 

The moment the wolf roared and came close to Xu Qingfeng. 

Two beams of brilliant golden light burst out from Xu Qingfeng’s eyes, “Stepping on the 
Sky!” 



Buzz! 

As soon as the words left his mouth, he took a step with his right foot. This step seemed 
to be casual and slow, but at this moment, it seemed to be wrapped in the great power 
of the world and was unstoppable. 

With this step. 

Feeling the pressure of that terrifying momentum, even the momentum of the Heavenly 
Wolf’s onslaught gave a lurch. 

The only thing it could do was to tilt its head back and face Xu Qingfeng’s foot directly 
with its wolf eyes. 

At this moment, all voices were silent. 

It was as if this foot had silenced even the violent and boiling clouds of heavenly 
punishment above the nine heavens. 

Clearly, it was only a single step, but Xu Qingfeng’s right foot landed steadily on top of 
the head of the Heavenly Wolf. 

This slight nod was accompanied by a wailing roar of pain from the wolf. 

Above the sky dome. 

The Heavenly Wolf fell towards the ground extremely fast. 

While Xu Qingfeng was carrying the golden light Taiji Bagua on his back, surrounded by 
ten thousand swords, he went straight up to the green clouds. 

Under the terrified gazes of the Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin 
Mountain. 

His hands on his back finally slowly lifted up and raised them to the top of his head. 

“Heavenly Punishment …… Borrow the Sword!” 

Boom! 

A loud, shocking thunder resounded through the heavens and the earth. 

In a flash, the boundless, layered black clouds in the sky vault were suddenly torn apart 
by a brutal bolt of lightning, and countless streaks of lightning illuminated the heavens 
and earth in a blinding white blur, as if demonic dragons were swaying in the air. 



Numerous currents of lightning, from above and below, penetrated directly into the 
ground. 

The lightning scorched the air for thousands of metres. 

At the moment when thousands of thunderbolts roared and poured down. 

Xu Qingfeng’s raised hands fiercely merged together, as if he was holding something in 
the void. 

“Sword of the Celestial, Must Kill!” 

As a decisive voice resounded through the heavens and the earth, Xu Qingfeng’s vainly 
held hands suddenly slashed down, as if he was holding a long sword in his hands and 
slashing down with a single blow. 

The thousands of thunderbolts above his head were wildly converging at this moment, 
forming an incomparably terrifying lightning longsword that came down with a bang as 
Xu Qingfeng swung down. 

The strokes were straight and overwhelming. 

The endless lightning instantly passed through Xu Qingfeng, who was carrying the 
golden Taiji Bagua, and directly swallowed and annihilated him in a brutal gesture, 
leaving behind only a circle of golden Taiji Bagua, which spread in all directions with 
layers and layers of golden light. 

The long sword, which was formed by the endless lightning, did not stop at devouring 
Xu Qingfeng, but continued charging towards the ground in a supreme and domineering 
gesture. 

“Run, run!” 

The Sky Wolf almost fell to the ground, but at this moment it was no longer possible to 
have the majesty and calmness of the totem faith of the past, and with a great blood 
light all over its body, it rushed like mad towards the ground inside the Xiongnu King 
City. 

The Old Mother of the Island and the Old Ghost of Yin Mountain, who were in mid-air, 
were also in disarray, their faces pale. 

The extreme sense of death crisis had caused both of them to no longer be in the same 
state as before. 

In the midst of the panic, the Old Ghost of Yinshan let out a loud shout and threw the 
boulder at the lightning sword that was slashing down vertically, then when the Old 



Mother of the Island was unprepared, he ghostly went directly behind the Old Mother of 
the Island. 

“Old Mother, it’s better for you to die than for us both to die together!” 

Boom! 

The Old Ghost of Yin Mountain slapped his palm on the back of Old Mother Lijima. 

The Old Mother of the Island let out a miserable cry and flew directly into the vertical 
lightning strike. 

The Old Ghost of Yinshan took advantage of this gap to slap out his palm, and with the 
force of the recoil, dashed straight towards the direction of the ground slash. 

It was all in a matter of moments. 

The Old Mother of the Island merely let out a scream before she was swallowed up by 
the Heavenly Punishment Thunder and died. 

The Old Ghost of Yin Mountain even let out an explosive roar the moment the lightning 
struck, and all his Qi energy broke through his body in an instant to form a thick barrier. 

The next second. 

The endless lightning sank into the ground. 

The ground rumbled and arched upwards, like a tidal wave, spreading out rapidly in all 
directions. 

All buildings instantly collapsed into pieces, and in a violent explosion of smoke and 
dust, it turned into a mushroom cloud hundreds of metres in diameter and shot up 
thousands of metres into the sky. 

A rolling roar resounded through the snowy plains. 

Countless electric currents shot across the ground. 

But in an instant, half of the wall of the kingdom collapsed. 

Ye Linglong, who had already run far away, felt the ground shake violently like a dragon 
turning over, and now focused on the giant mushroom cloud rising from the sky dome, 
the broken golden light of the Taiji Eight Trigrams remaining vaguely visible. 

But there was no longer any figure of Xu Qingfeng on that vault! 



She fell to her knees and kowtowed heavily in the direction where Xu Qingfeng had 
disappeared, sobbing uncontrollably and in grief. 

“Senior, I’m sorry, Linglong deserves to die!” 

When she looked up again, she raised her hand to wipe away the tears on her face, 
and, as if she were a walking corpse, she got up, turned around, and walked towards 
the Xiongnu King’s Palace. 

“Linglong, there’s still your own way to go!” 

The whispered words, incomparably determined, dissipated in the endless wind and 
snow and the ruins of the king’s city destroyed by the heavenly punishment and 
thunderstorm behind them, which no one heard, only Ye Linglong cleared herself. 

 


