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The woman who had a face full of makeup was ultimately apprehended by Zayn. She glared at Zayn
scornfully, “Now who is this little motherf*ck*r, and how dare he stop me? You ’re just asking for me to end

you!”

While she barked aggressively at Zayn, she raised a leg and aimed for his lower body as she ferociously tried
to kick him in the b*lls. She had the reaction speed of no ordinary woman, and she was abnormally strong as
well. It was apparent that this was because she was frequently involved in street brawls. Had Zayn not picked
Faye up from work in advance, she would have been at a huge disadvantage.

Zayn let out a rough grunt as he used his knees to shield the targeted area in advance. An audible thud
resonated through the air. The woman kicked her legs up and down strenuously as she continued to assault
Zayn’s knee. A wretched screech came out of her mouth as she hissed in pain, “Ouch, that f*ck*ng hurts! Are
you asking for a death sentence, you’re already a dead man, do you hear me?”

She had slammed her shin against Zayn’s knee earlier, and her eyes were still watering from the pain. She
glared at Zayn and Faye, her rage and contempt remaining evident despite being clouded by her tears. She
whipped out her phone and made a quick phone call. “Hello, Skyler. Come here quickly! I’ve been hit…”

Even after she had hung up, she continued to glower at them viciously. “Just you wait, b*tches. My man’s on

his way to grind you into pieces, and he won’t stop until the both of you are paralyzed!”

Faye was so threatened that she immediately began to tug at Zayn frantically. “Oh no, we’re in deep trouble.
Let’s just make a run for it, quick!”

“It’s fine. It’s going to be fine, I’m here,” consoled Zayn as he pat Faye’s hand soothingly.

Out of the blue, a familiar face appeared from the sea of onlookers. It was Ruby. At the sight of Zayn and
Faye, she had a plethora of questions to ask. She furrowed her brows. “What are the both of you doing here?
Zayn, I thought you went to go get your car fixed. Is it fixed already?”



“Mom, the car’s already been fixed. It’s parked over there,” answered Zayn as he gestured towards the car
parked next to the road.

“Then why are you just standing there? Go home! And what’s with the crowd surrounding the both of you?
What happened here?” interrogated Ruby curiously. She had just left the company headquarters, so she had
been unable to witness the incident.

Faye clenched her teeth. She was about to explain herself when she heard a malevolent voice call out to her
from the crowd. “I remember now. It’s that Faye Carter and her good-for-nothing husband who married into
her family.”

The statement immediately drew the attention of all the onlookers. They were taken aback by its boldness,
though it quickly incited an animated discussion amongst them.

The Carters were not a powerful family in the slightest. They were already weaklings in comparison to the
Browns or the Smiths, so you could imagine how large the disparity would be if you added the Larsons into

the equation.

However, the Carters were widely known due to the existence of Zayn and Faye.

Faye had always been well recognized for her breathtaking beauty. As soon as she had blossomed into a young
adult in high school, there was no shortage of suitors vying for her hand in marriage. In fact, many of them
were the sons of wealthy families. Everyone was convinced that Faye would marry into a wealthy family. In
spite of that, Faye never did marry anyone famous, instead she found love in a pauper from the countryside a

good-for-nothing deadbeat.

It was the talk of the town at the time almost everybody on the street knew of the event in question, even if
they had never seen the couple with their own two eyes.

“I was just asking myself why they looked so familiar, turns out it is Faye and her deadbeat husband.
Hah-hah-hah, this is going to be good!”



“I was asking around and apparently that woman’s name is Charlotte. She seems to have quite a number of

connections!”

“You’re right. I think she might be Skyler Moore’s plaything!”

“What? Skyler Moore… Isn’t he that burly gangster? Oh no, oh no, Faye is in huge trouble this time…”
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