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Chapter 2 She’s Willing To Do This 

Sebastian Simmons interrupted, ‘Alright, it’s good to have Vanessa back. Let’s go 
inside.” 

Vanessa quietly followed behind them. In order to show kindness and friendliness, 
Queenie kept talking to her while walking, and she just felt a fly buzzing in her ears all 
the time. If not for the fact that her master had once told her to be polite, she would 
probably have told Queenie to shut up. 

A group of people sat on the couch. Elise then couldn’t wait to speak, ‘Master, look at 
our Vanessa, such a beauty. The Anderson family will love it when they see her!” 

Sebastian was worried that Vanessa would put him to shame, after all, she grew up in 
the countryside. But was quite pleased with the way she looked now, ‘Yeah, now 
Vanessa’s back, we could keep our promise to the Anderson family. Good things come 
in pairs!” 

The more Felton listened, the more he felt that something was wrong, and his brow was 
furrowed tightly, ‘Dad, Mrs. Elise, what are you talking about?” 

He only knew that Vanessa was the daughter that the Simmons family got back, but did 
not know that the reason Elise went so much trouble to get Vanessa back was to fulfill 
the marriage with the Anderson family so that her daughter Queenie would not have to 
marry off and suffer. 

Queenie blinked her big innocent eyes, ‘Felton, don’t you know it yet? The Anderson 
family had someone ask the Simmons family to fulfill the engagement years ago. They 
want a daughter of the Simmons family to marry their eldest son, who is mortally ill.” 

Felton’s face changed all of a sudden because he knew about this. The Simmons family 
and the Anderson family used to be close friends, and once promised marriage between 
their eldest son and daughter. However, Vanessa had been missing for years, and the 
eldest son of the Anderson family had an accident a few years ago… 

Felton didn’t expect that they had brought Vanessa back for this! 

‘Dad, you can’t do this! It’s not fair to… to Vanessa!” 

Sebastian obviously didn’t care about that. He only had one outstanding daughter, 
Queenie, and expected to use her marriage to pave the way for his business. It was 
impossible to let Queenie marry that dying eldest son of the Anderson family. The good 
thing was that he found Vanessa, and at that moment, he couldn’t allow others to refute 
him. 



‘What are you yelling about? This is a marriage promised by your grandfather himself. 
The Anderson family has come to propose marriage, do you want me to break the 
contract?” 

‘But…” 

Felton glanced at Vanessa, who was standing quietly to the side and still had not 
figured out the situation, and somewhat felt sorry for her. 

Elise did not want him to ruin her plan, so she quickly came forward to smooth things 
over, ‘Felton, we’re doing this for your sister’s good. If Vanessa could marry into the 
Anderson family, she finally will have someone to rely on. Do you want her to farm in 
the village all the time?” 

What kind of bullshit was this? Since she was his sister, he can support her even if she 
never married for life. There’s no way he could let her be a farmer for the rest of her life. 

However, Vanessa suddenly spoke, ‘In fact, I don’t mind marrying the Anderson family.” 

Felton was stunned, ‘What did you say?” 

Vanessa raised her head and quietly swept over her family with her clear and big eyes, 
‘Since I’m willing to come back, it means I’m not against this. I’m willing to complete this 
marriage.” 

No one expected that Vanessa would say yes, and Elise and Queenie felt like they won 
the lottery. Vanessa just jumped into the fire without their persuasion. God was helping 
them, wasn’t it? 

 


