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The world of gods,

Chaoge.

Su Chen suddenly appeared in a luxurious mansion. He looked around and checked the identity 
assigned to him by the ladder.

Um?

Who am I, the Imperial Guards General of the Royal Palace?

Damn it, why did Tianlai arrange for himself a general to guard the palace?

Su Chen was very speechless after checking the identity.

Dashang had five major gates, and

Tianlai assigned him a guard at any gate. This was better than a Forbidden General guarding the 
palace.

Damn it, delaying the national destiny of Dashang for ten years?

How is this accomplished?

Huh?

The little fox Su Daji has only been in the palace for more than three months?



Jiang Ziya is still in Chaoge City?

So the Battle of the Gods has not yet begun.

After Su Chen checked the situation in Chaoge, he was very confused.

Did the Holy Soul of the Tianglai send him a little too early?

Jiang Ziya has not yet gone to the Western Zhou Dynasty, and the Western Zhou Dynasty has not 
openly rebelled yet, so he still has a lot of time to prepare.

"Informing the general, Queen Jiang announced that the general had entered the palace."

At this time, a soldier outside the room reported to Su Chen,

"knew!"

Su Chen was stunned when he heard the soldier's report,

Queen Jiang?

What does she want from him?

The ladder only assigned him an identity, but did not give him any memory. Su Chen didn't know 
anyone who knew him.

Su Chen Zou He frowned and walked out of the room.

He needed to explore these things by himself, hoping that nothing bad would happen.

"System, hide my cultivation realm, just hide me until the Nascent Soul stage"



"Ding, yes!"

In Chaoge Palace,

Queen Jiang has been restless.

King Zhou has been bewitched by the new imperial concubine Su Daji all day long. In the past 
three months, he has been greedy for pleasure. Even the government has been abandoned. Ministers 
who dare to speak out are punished and even killed. Several ministers were summoned.

Today,

Huang Guifei's sister-in-law was recruited into the palace.

Queen Jiang was worried about what would happen. She now hoped that the Forbidden Army 
General Su Chen would arrive soon. Only Su Chen in the palace could prevent something from 
happening..

A maid came to Queen Jiang and saluted,"Queen, King Wu Cheng has arrived at the palace."

"Um? Why did King Wu Cheng come to the palace?"

Queen Jiang heard that King Wucheng Huang Feihu came to the palace, and she felt something was 
wrong even more.

Huang Feihu's wife had only been in the palace for a long time. Why did King Wucheng Huang 
Feihu also come to the palace?

"This slave doesn’t know!"

"Quick, follow me to Huang Guifei's palace!"

"Yes, Queen!"



At this moment, in Huang Guifei's palace,

King Zhou was teasing Huang Feihu's wife. The surrounding maids were kneeling on the ground 
and did not dare to stop her.

A beautiful woman dodged in a panic and said,

"Your Majesty, my husband, the Wucheng King Huang Feihu, you are teasing the minister's female 
family members like this. Is this what a king calls for?"

King Zhou looked at the beautiful Mrs. Huang and said with a look on his face,

"Beauty, I am the king of Dashang. All the people and things of Dashang belong to me. Even if 
Wucheng King Huang Feihu knows that I am teasing you, what can he do?"

"you....."

"Beauty, if you serve the lonely king well, you will be richly rewarded."

At this moment,

Su Chen was heading towards the palace with a group of soldiers. He didn't know what was 
happening in the palace.

"General Su!"An old man suddenly appeared in the middle of the road and saluted Su Chen and 
shouted, (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen looked at an old man blocking the road and asked,

"Who are you?"

"General Su, veteran Jiang Ziya."



Let me guess, this is Jiang Ziya?

A little scum in the distraction realm?

No wonder Jiang Ziya is a waste, he is already seventy or eighty years old, and his cultivation level 
is that of a cultivator in the distraction realm.

Damn,

Jiang Ziya wants to He is not the statue of a flying bear, but he is also a man destined to become a 
god. This old man is really a good-for-nothing person.

Su Chen asked Jiang Ziya while riding on his horse,"Jiang Ziya, what do you want from me?""

Jiang Ziya offered a hand offering to Su Chen,

"General, the monsters in Xuanyuan Tomb must be eradicated as soon as possible. Prime Minister 
Bi Gan and Prime Minister Shang Rong both agreed to destroy the monsters in Xuanyuan Tomb. I 
would like to ask the general to send some troops to exterminate those monsters with the old 
Taoist."

Destroy the monsters in Xuanyuan Tomb?

Isn't this to destroy Su Daji's sisters?

In Xuanyuan Tomb, there are not only some fox tribes of little foxes, but also nine-headed chicken 
spirits and jade pipa spirits. Su Chen did not expect to meet Jiang Ziya Do you want to burn those 
monsters in Xuanyuan Tomb?

Save those monsters?

Or not?

Su Chen thought about it and decided to save those monsters.



Although Su Daji is not the little fox Su Daji in later generations, they are also the same two people.

Su Chen arrived and sealed the deal. In God's world, the little fox Su Daji will definitely not let her 
make the same mistake again, and Su Chen will not let the little fox Su Daji kill Jiang Ziya again.

Su Chen nodded and said,"Okay, Jiang Ziya, when will you act?""

"General, to avoid a long night and many dreams, we will take action tonight"

"Okay, Jiang Ziya, I will arrange for five thousand forbidden troops to follow your command."

"Thank you, General."

Jiang Ziya was very happy when he heard Su Chen's words. He didn't expect that Su Chen would be 
so easy to talk to. With the assistance of five thousand forbidden troops, Jiang Ziya became more 
confident in destroying those monsters tonight.

"I have something else to do, so I’ll say goodbye!"

Su Chen glanced at Jiang Ziya and left. He was just a puppet.

After becoming a god, Jiang Ziya didn't even get into the divine position. He was one of the most 
miserable people among the gods.

In the palace, after Su Chen arrived,

The Imperial Guards guarding the King saluted Su Chen one after another.

Su Chen checked the Imperial Guards guarding the King's Palace. These Imperial Guards were 
basically cultivators of immortality. Although the strength of the Imperial Guards was still scum, 
they were much stronger than the masters of the martial arts. The Great



Immortal World was indeed a good place. In the ancient immortal world, before the Human 
Emperor disappeared, the human race was still very powerful.

When a deputy general of the Forbidden Army saw Su Chen arriving, he hurriedly saluted Su Chen 
and shouted,

"General, go to Huang Guifei's palace quickly. King Wu Cheng went to Huang Guifei's palace.

Su Chen asked suspiciously when he heard the deputy general's words,"King Wu Cheng?" When 
King Wu Cheng went to Huang Guifei's palace, didn't he go to see his sister?"

"General, the king is in Huang Guifei's palace, and I heard from brothers that the king is teasing 
King Wu Cheng's wife, and even wants King Wu Cheng's wife to sleep with him. Something is 
going to happen in Huang Guifei's palace."

Su Chen rubbed his forehead and felt a headache.

He has just arrived in this world.

Why are things happening one after another?

King Zhou wants to insult King Wucheng Huang Feihu's wife. This has also appeared in the plot. 
King Wucheng's wife seems to be He escaped from the building and committed suicide.

Huh?

No,

Queen Jiang hadn't had her eyes gouged out to death yet, so why did the plot end up at Huang 
Guifei's sister-in-law?

It's his fault.

Is there a deviation between the plot and reality?.



Chapter 2332

Huang Guifei's palace,

Wucheng King Huang Feihu was stopped outside the palace by the imperial army. Queen Jiang was 
not allowed to enter after she arrived. Even Huang Guifei came back in a panic after learning the 
news, and she couldn't even enter her own palace.

King Wucheng Huang Feihu was walking around outside the palace with an angry look on his face.

His wife's screams came from the palace, but there was nothing he could do now.

King Zhou is the king and he is the minister.

Huang Feihu is rebelling if he breaks in now.

After a while,

Huang Feihu couldn't bear it anymore. If he didn't rush in, his wife might be insulted by King Zhou.

"Queen, I have to rush in, or my wife will....Want...."

After Queen Jiang heard what Huang Feihu said, she hurriedly stopped her and said,

"King Wu Cheng, don't be impulsive. I have already informed the Forbidden Army General Su 
Chen and he will be here shortly. Concubine Huang

Guifei said to Huang Feihu with a look of grief and anger,

"Brother, you have all wronged me. If I had not left the palace, my sister-in-law would not have 
been seen by the king."

Huang Guifei did not expect that King Zhou would be interested in her sister-in-law.



She was not in the palace today, and she did not know about her sister-in-law's arrival.

Huang Guifei thought that if she had been in the palace today, her sister-in-law would not be killed 
by King Zhou 900 now. You might even be insulted after teasing.

Huang Feihu said with a serious face,

"Sister, needless to say, this must be the king’s plan for your sister-in-law. Your sister-in-law came 
to the palace this time because King Zhou invited her in your name. I also rushed over after 
realizing something was wrong."

"Brother, let’s go in and rescue my sister-in-law, otherwise we’ll be too late."

"Okay, I'll type in now."

Huang Feihu nodded in agreement with a cold face.

King Zhou wanted to insult his wife, which was already forcing him to rebel.

Three generations of the Huang family were loyal to Dashang, but King Zhou was debauched and 
immoral. Huang Feihu couldn't watch his wife being raped by King Zhou. Wang insulted.

Boom!

Bang, bump, bump!

Huang Feihu quickly took action against the Forbidden Army who blocked him.

Huang Feihu was an immortal cultivator of the golden elixir.

The hundreds of Forbidden Army around him were no match for Huang Feihu. After a while, Huang 
Feihu attacked the surrounding soldiers. After all the imperial troops were defeated, he quickly ran 
towards the palace.



Concubine Huang immediately followed with a cold expression.

Even if she died this time, she would not let King Zhou insult her sister-in-law.

Queen Jiang patted her forehead and Very helpless (cidf), something big is going to happen this 
time.

Huang Feihu defeated hundreds of forbidden soldiers and broke into the palace. This is a crime of 
rebellion.

At this moment,

Su Chen did not go to Huang Guifei's palace.

His current identity is a forbidden soldier. General, Su Chen has just arrived at Huang Guifei's 
palace. Can he stop King Zhou?

Even if Su Chen wants to kill King Zhou, it is impossible.

King Zhou is the current emperor of the world.

Part of the destiny of the human race lies in King Zhou. Even the saints cannot Dare to kill King 
Zhou. If Su Chen kills King Zhou, not to mention that the canonization of gods cannot continue, his 
luck as human emperor may dissipate a lot.

If they are Fuxi and Xuanyuan who have resigned as human emperors, then kill them. , anyway, 
killing those Human Emperors will not be counterattacked by the fate of the human race.

Outside Su Daji's palace,

Su Chen had just arrived, and the surrounding guards and forbidden troops saluted Su Chen one 
after another,



"General!"

"Get out of the way!"

"Yes, General!"

Su Chen looked at Su Daji's bedroom and walked in.

He wanted King Zhou to give up insulting Mrs. Huang.

This had to be stopped by the vixen Su Daji. What happened today must have been the fault of the 
little fox Su Daji. (See For exciting novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen had just entered Su Daji's bedroom. The maids around him looked at Su Chen in 
confusion. These maids did not expect that Su Chen would dare to come to Concubine Su's 
bedroom.

A seductive voice suddenly came over

"General Su, I didn't expect that you would dare to come to my palace. Aren't you afraid that I 
would order you to be killed?"

When Su Chen saw the back of a woman in the gauze curtain, he asked,

"Su Daji?"

At this time,

Su Daji walked out from the gauze curtain.

She looked at Su Chen and smiled and said,



"General Su, if you break into my palace privately, you will be beheaded by the king. Although you 
are a noble, and even a general with a heavy army, the king wants to kill you with just one word."

I'll go!

The little fox turned out to be so beautiful?

This is really stunning!

The beauty is bubbling.

Su Daji was wearing a revealing purple dress, and a large area of fair skin was exposed.

This makes people feel better just looking at the fire.

She also has a voluptuous figure, proudly erect mountains, delicate face, charming eyes, and 
gorgeous red lips.

Su Daji's whole body is full of seductive aura, and her every movement is very attractive.

Damn. ,

Su Chen thought that the little fox had been in seclusion since he came to the Xuantian Realm.

He had not captured the little fox until now, and he had never seen the little fox's true appearance. 
The nine-tailed fox Su Daji was really a charming vixen.

Su Chen looked at Su Daji for a while and then said

"Su Daji, I want to make a deal with you this time. You go and save Huang Feihu’s wife, and I can 
tell you a piece of news about Xuanyuan Tomb."

"Um?"



Su Daji was stunned when she heard Su Chen's words.

Deal?

Xuanyuan Tomb?

What did Su Chen know?

Did Su Chen know the secret of her vixen?

Su Daji looked at Su Chen and frowned. Su Chen and Queen Jiang has a close relationship and may 
even have ulterior secrets.

If Su Chen had not been protecting Queen Jiang, she would have gotten rid of Queen Jiang long 
ago.

Su Daji would also become the queen of Dashang.

Today,

Su Chen actually wanted to After making a deal with herself and even threatening her with the 
tribesmen and sisters from the Xuanyuan Tomb, Su Daji felt that she could no longer keep Su Chen. 
This Forbidden Army general should be removed as soon as possible.

Su Chen saw that Su Daji's face turned cold. He didn't want Su Chen to Daji misunderstood him,

Su Chen said hurriedly,

"Su Daji, I know everything about you, even the little red mole under your left breast. I don’t want 
to be your enemy. You and I can be said to be very close."

"Su Chen, how dare you spy on me?"



Su Daji's face became even colder when she heard Su Chen's words.

This bastard, a Nascent Soul Realm scum dared to spy on her.

Damn it, not even King Zhou has ever seen her body, or even touched it. This shameless bastard, Su 
Daji decided to kill Su Chen tonight.

"Peeping? No, Su Daji, if I spied on you, wouldn't you notice anything? Let me tell you one more 
thing. Your sixth tail is not all white. Ahem, there is a little golden golden hair at the root of your 
sixth tail."
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The information Su Chen revealed was all something he saw with his own eyes.

The red mole under his chest and the golden streak at the root of the sixth tail.

Su Chen only saw it after he stripped the little fox naked, especially the little fox's third

He didn't know about the golden fur on the six tails at first.

It was because the little fox made a bet with him. It was only then that Su Chen discovered the 
difference on the sixth tail.

For this reason,

Su Chen also lost a promise to the little fox.

Su Daji looked at Su Chen in shock.

She didn't expect that Su Chen knew her secret, red mole?

There was a ray of gold on the sixth tail.



No one knew about this at all, not even Su Daji's two monster sisters. How did Su Chen know?

Su Daji stared at Su Chen and asked coldly,

"Su Chen, how do you know this? Who are you?"

Su Chen"993" looked at the charming Su Daji and said with a smile

"Su Daji, you will know who I am in the future. I am not your enemy. You should save Mrs. Huang 
now, otherwise it will be too late. I am worried that Mrs. Huang will commit suicide by jumping off 
the building."

Su Daji frowned and couldn't figure it out, not an enemy?

What does this bastard mean?

Su Chen is the imperial general of the palace.

Her identity as a vixen was discovered by Su Chen. Why didn't Su Chen want to kill her? He even 
went to report her. Himself?

Is he afraid that he will not be his opponent?

Or does this bastard have any intentions?

Su Daji thinks that this bastard knows her privacy. If

Su Chen doesn't say it now, she will have to catch this bastard and torture him.

However,

Su Daji thinks that this bastard may She is not an ordinary person.



After she could not figure out her true identity, Su Daji decided not to touch this shameless bastard.

Su Daji thought about this and asked Su Chen,

"What happened to Xuanyuan Tomb? If you don't make it clear, I won't save Mrs. Huang."

Su Chen was very speechless when he heard Su Daji's words.

A vixen is indeed a vixen.

Su Daji wanted to know about Xuanyuan Tomb first. If Su Chen didn't tell Su Daji about the 
Xuanyuan Tomb, Su Daji, a vixen, might not Care about the life and death of a mortal

"Jiang Ziya will set fire to Xuanyuan Tomb tonight. Su Daji, if you don’t want the monsters in 
Xuanyuan Tomb to be killed, you’d better inform the monsters in Xuanyuan Tomb to leave as soon 
as possible."

"Jiang Ziya? It turns out that Jiang Ziya, Bigan, Shang Rong, these people are simply seeking 
death."

Su Chen has been delayed for some time.

If Su Daji doesn't save Mrs. Huang, Huang Feihu's wife may escape from the building and commit 
suicide.

Damn it,

Su Daji is such a difficult vixen. Memory cannot be transferred in this trial mission. Su Chen has no 
way to deal with the people he knows, even his own woman.

"Su Daji, stop chattering here, go and save Mrs. Huang."

Su Daji smiled when she heard Su Chen's urging.



She looked at Su Chen and asked doubtfully,

"Su Chen, Huang Feihu's wife has nothing to do with you, right? Why do you want to save her?"

Su Chen rubbed his forehead and reminded Su Daji,

"Queen Jiang informed me to come to the palace. If something like this happened in the palace, I 
knew it was you who arranged it without even thinking about it."

"Su Daji, you must think clearly about the consequences of anything you do, and don't overdo it and 
regret it. Sometimes, the saint behind you can't protect you. There are seven saints in the prehistoric 
immortal world. You can think about what I said."

Su Daji looked at Su Chen with a change of expression.

She did not expect that Su Chen knew the person behind her. Su Daji came to harm Dashang on the 
orders of Empress Nuwa. Only Empress Nuwa and their sisters knew about this matter.

How did Su Chen know?

Saint?

This bastard dared to advance the saint.

Did Su Chen want to die?

Mentioning the saint casually will be noticed by the saint. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu 
Novel Network!)

Su Chen is right Su Daji urged again,"Su Daji, don't wait any longer. Hurry up and save Mrs. 
Huang.""

"All right!"



Su Daji nodded and walked out of the palace. She still had many things to ask Su Chen, but this 
bastard kept urging her. Su Daji could only ask this shameless bastard again in the future.

"Damn it, Su Daji, can you walk faster?" Su Chen was very speechless when he saw Su Daji 
walking leisurely. Su Daji walked over leisurely. How could he save someone? Are Su Chen and Su 
Daji going to collect Mrs. Huang's body? ?

"snort!"

Su Daji heard Su Chen urging her again. She glared at Su Chen and sped up.

This bastard.

Su Daji didn't want to save Mrs. Huang.

She wanted to get rid of Wucheng King Huang Feihu this time. The arrival of this bastard disrupted 
the situation. Her plan, Su Daji, because of this bastard, she now has to save that mortal...

In Huang Guifei's palace,

King Wu Cheng had rescued his wife, but the surrounding imperial troops had surrounded King 
Wucheng Huang Feihu, Mrs. Huang, and Huang Guifei.

King Zhou stared at Wucheng King Huang Feihu with a livid face.

He did not expect that Huang Feihu Gaba broke in and even fought back the imperial army 
guarding the palace. King Zhou kicked the table next to him and shouted,"King Wu Cheng, you are 
so brave, are you going to rebel?" Huang Feihu immediately offered his hands and saluted,"Your 
Majesty, I just care about my wife. , please atone for your sins.

"

"Atonement? Your wife, Prince Gu, has taken a liking to her. Do you want to object?"



Huang Feihu's face turned ugly when he heard what King Zhou said. King Zhou was blatantly 
trying to steal his wife. He is such a foolish king.

Huang Feihu clenched his fist tightly and decided to apologize.

"Your Majesty, I will kill or chop you at will in the future, but today, I want to take away my wife!"

"Be brave, come and get Wucheng for me....."

"Your Majesty, wait a moment, King Wu Cheng is very loyal to Dashang, and please forgive King 
Wu Cheng for this offense."

Queen Jiang hurriedly stopped her.

She felt very helpless.

King Zhou was becoming more and more stupid. Today he blatantly wanted to steal the minister's 
wife, and that bastard Su Chen. How long has it been? That bastard. Are you not in Chaoge City?

King Zhou looked at Queen Jiang and said with disgust,

"Queen, there is nothing to do with you here. 3.8 You go back to your palace."

"Concubine Su has arrived, General Su has arrived!"

At this time, a chamberlain shouted outside the palace.

After Su Daji and Su Chen arrived at Huang Guifei's palace together, Su Daji looked at the three 
Huang Feihu who were surrounded by the Forbidden Army.

She smiled at King Zhou and asked,



"King, what happened here? Why does the king look so angry?"

When King Zhou saw Su Daji coming, he hugged Su Daji with a smile on his face and said,"My 
beloved concubine, nothing big happened here, but King Wucheng wanted to rebel. I set up a trap to 
catch him today."

I'll go!

Su Daji's methods are really clever.

King Zhou is hugging a lonely person.

When Su Chen saw King Zhou hugging Su Daji, he was angry and wanted to take action. But after 
he discovered the secret, he felt a little sympathy for Zhou. The king is a fool...
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Although King Zhou was holding Su Daji at the moment, he was only holding a human-shaped 
purple jade.

Purple spirit jade is not only soft and smooth, but also has the same temperature as a woman's body.

This is a high-quality fairy stone.

In this fairy world, purple jade is usually made into jade pillows.

Su Daji, a vixen, really has a way. Even some immortals may not see this trick. King Zhou may hug 
him every night. Sleeping with purple jade.

Su Daji said in a seductive voice,

"Your Majesty, King Wucheng rebelled. You can hand him over to General Su of the Forbidden 
Army. Why do you need to be angry for a rebellious sinner?"

"Haha, my concubine is right."



King Zhou was so confused by Su Daji that he couldn't tell the difference between east, west and 
north. After hearing Su Daji's words, he ordered,"General Su, take down King Wucheng. King 
Wucheng's whole family will be thrown into the prison of the Imperial Army."

Su Chen curled her lips and replied with a smile,

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

Queen Jiang stood aside with a look of silence at this moment. King Zhou treated her and Su Daji 
very differently. King Zhou looked disgusted with her, but he doted on Su Daji and responded to her 
every request. Su

Daji saw that. Seeing Su Chen's expression, she guessed that Su Chen must have seen something.

Su Daji said angrily,

"General Su, your Majesty is talking about the whole family of King Wu Cheng, including 
Concubine Huang. Don’t forget Concubine Huang.

King Zhou also hurriedly ordered,"Yes, General Su and Concubine Huang will also be captured!""

"yes!"

At this moment,

Wucheng King Huang Feihu, Mrs. Huang, and Huang Guifei all looked ugly. King Zhou would 
accuse them of rebellion with just one sentence. The Huang family might even be executed.

Su Chen said before King Zhou and After Su Daji left, he looked at Wucheng King Huang Feihu 
and said expressionlessly,

"King Wu Cheng, you can't escape from the palace.



Queen Jiang walked to Su Chen and said,"Su Chen, can you let King Wu Cheng go?""

After Su Chen heard what Queen Jiang said, he looked at the beautiful woman next to him and 
nodded.

Queen Jiang's graceful and luxurious temperament, beautiful face, plump and proud figure, and 
mature charm are very attractive. , this is an extremely beautiful and glamorous woman.

There is a huge gap between Queen Jiang’s beauty and Su Daji’s, and they are not even comparable.

But it is already very rare for a mortal to be so beautiful and glamorous.

"Queen, do you think I can let King Wu Cheng go~?"

Queen Jiang looked at Su Chen and nodded,

"You can. You just invited Concubine Su here just to help King Wu Cheng. I believe you will let 
King Wu Cheng go!"

Su Chen spread his hands speechlessly and said,

"Queen, I invite Concubine Su to come. This is what I do for the queen. King Wu Cheng has 
nothing to do with me. I can't let him escape. Moreover, if I let King Wu Cheng's family go, the 
king and Concubine Su will be safe. How should I explain there?"

"this....."

"Queen, King Wu Cheng is just being imprisoned now. The ministers in the court will intercede for 
King Wu Cheng. Queen, you don’t have to worry about these things. You should go back to the 
palace to rest."

"Alas, I get it."

Queen Jiang nodded to Su Chen.



She believed what Su Chen said. In the palace, Su Chen was the only one who would not deceive 
her, let alone hurt her.

When Su Chen saw Queen Jiang leaving with her maid, he waved his hand and ordered road,

"Come on, take down King Wu Cheng."

King Wu Cheng looked at the Forbidden Army around him and wanted to take action. He looked at 
Su Chen and was very helpless. The Forbidden Army General Su Chen was very powerful. Even if 
he took action, he might not be able to defeat Su Chen.

King Wu Cheng looked at it. After his wife and sister, he said to Su Chen,

"General Su, I can capture you without mercy, but please treat the women of my Huang family 
kindly."

Su Chen nodded and agreed,"Okay, I won't do anything to women."

"Thank you!" (To read exciting novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"King Wu Cheng was imprisoned, Mrs. Huang and Concubine Huang were placed under house 
arrest in Wenhua Pavilion, Vice General Liu led 5,000 forbidden troops, and everyone in the Huang 
family was imprisoned. Those who resisted were killed without mercy."

"Yes, General!"

In Huang Guifei's palace, a farce ended.

Su Chen had no prejudice against King Wucheng Huang Feihu, and had no intention of saving him. 
King Wucheng was just an insignificant person, and there was no need for him to waste his time 
on... King Wu Cheng.

Su Chen had a headache when he thought of Su Daji.



He had not yet figured out how to deal with Su Daji, as well as the Queen Mother, Queen Mother of 
the West, Chang Xi, and the Holy Mother of the Golden Spirit. These women were all problems in 
the future. In the past few days, the ministers of Dashang pleaded with King Wucheng one after 
another, but King Zhou was deceived by Su Daji, and the pleas of the ministers were of no use. 
King Zhou even ordered that King Wucheng's family be executed in three days.

Su Chen was there In the past few days, I have been learning about the Fengshen thing, the situation 
in Dashang, and some things that happened in the Sage Sect.

In the palace,

Su Chen was thinking in his resting room,

"Nezha hasn't made trouble in the East China Sea yet, but Nezha has been born, so the plot should 
begin. It seems that we have to go to Chentangguan to save the unlucky guy Shi Ji."

A Forbidden Army captain came to the room and saluted Su Chen, saying,

"The general, Mrs. Huang and Concubine Huang have been on hunger strike for two days. They 
have been clamoring to be locked up with King Wu Cheng."

Su Chen waved his hand after hearing the captain's words and said,

"Don't worry about them. If they want to go on a hunger strike, then go on a hunger strike."

"Yes, General!"

A forbidden soldier quickly ran over and shouted,

"Report to the general that something happened to Concubine Su. Concubine Su asked the general 
to come over quickly."

"Um? What happened to Concubine Su?"



"The subordinates don’t know."

Damn it, what can happen to Su Daji, a vixen?

The monsters in Xuanyuan Tomb have escaped. Su Daji cannot have other things that require her 
help. In

Su Daji's palace,

Su Chen discovered the evil spirit here after he arrived. Soaring to the sky, this made Su Chen very 
confused. Su Daji had already hidden the evil spirit. How could there be evil energy in her 
bedroom?

After Su Chen was brought into a room by the maid, he looked at Su Daji with a look of ( Okay) 
I’m so confused, why are Su Daji’s two tails exposed?

Huh?

Is there an immortal doing something to make Su Daji show his true form?

Su Daji saw Su Chen coming, and she was so anxious Su Chen asked for help,

"Su Chen, please help me."

Su Daji didn't expect that a Taoist would deal with her.

The demon mirror hung on the palace made it difficult for her to resist. It won't be long before she 
shows her true form.

In the palace, the only one who can help her is Su Chen.



Su Daji doesn't know that Su Chen Will he help her, but Su Chen said that there is a relationship 
between them, and Su Chen also knows some of her secrets. Su Daji can only regard Su Chen as her 
only hope.

"town!"

Su Chen quickly pointed at Su Daji, and a blue space barrier appeared on Su Daji's body. The blue 
space barrier was instantly hidden in Su Daji's body.

"Su Daji, what on earth is going on?".

Chapter 2335

After Su Chen used a space barrier to isolate Su Daji's breath,

Su Daji returned to normal, and her two exposed tails disappeared. Su Chen looked at Su Daji and 
wanted to know how she could be targeted by a powerful immortal.

"Su Chen is a Taoist. Today, a Taoist told the king that there was evil spirit in the palace. The Taoist 
also hung a demon mirror and a peach wood sword in the palace."

"Taoist?"

Let's go, this can't be Master Taiyi, right?

Su Chen thought that Master Taiyi seemed to have appeared in the plot, and Su Daji was almost 
transformed into his original shape by the demon mirror, but was later fooled by Su Daji.

Su Daji clicked He nodded and replied,

"Well, he is a Taoist, and I feel that the realm of that Taoist is very powerful."

Su Chen sat down and waved his hands and said,



"Su Daji, don't worry, your demonic aura has been hidden by me. Even a saint can't easily discover 
it. That Taoist won't see that you are a vixen."

"who are you?"

Su Daji was very surprised when she heard Su Chen's words.

It's impossible for a saint to easily see her demon?

Who is this bastard?

A cultivator in the Yuanying realm?

Is this a liar?

A Yuanying realm Can he save himself as a Golden Immortal? He can even hide his demonic aura 
so that no saint can find it.

Su Daji felt that her previous guess was good.

This bastard must have hidden his cultivation level.

Su Chen smiled and replied,

"your man!"

"Shameless!"

Su Daji stared at Su Chen and was very ashamed and angry.

This shameless bastard, a man?



She will never have a man in her life.

Su Chen looked at the stunning Su Daji and explained,

"It's true. You will be my wife in the future. Otherwise, how would I know some of your secrets?"

"Also, the Su Daji you possess is the reincarnation of a ray of your soul. You and Su Daji were 
originally the same person. Your soul in the previous life was split into two, and the ray of your soul 
reincarnated into Su Daji. Daji."

Su Daji frowned when she heard Su Chen's words.

She somewhat believed what Su Chen said.

When the little fox took away Su Daji's body, she didn't feel any discomfort at all. Su Daji's body 
was just like her own. The fox had felt strange before.

When Su Chen talked about this this time, she realized that Su Daji was actually the reincarnation 
of her soul.

But, was she really the wife of this shameless man?

At this time, a palace maid came outside to report road,

"The king invites the empress to go to the main hall."

"I know."

Su Chen touched his chin and said,

"Su Daji, it seems that the old man is suspicious of you, but you have hidden your demonic aura 
from me, and it is impossible for the old man to see it.



Su Daji rolled her eyes at Su Chen and said,"What?" Do you still want me to thank you?"

"Haha, there’s no need for that. Su Daji, I’m going to Chentangguan. Please find a reason to let me 
go to Chentangguan."

"What are you doing in Chentangguan?"

"I have one thing to do when I go to Chentangguan. Also, don’t attack Queen Jiang again. She can’t 
threaten you."

"Huh, you pervert!"

Su Daji glared at Su Chen and nodded.

Queen Jiang could not threaten her. She was a mortal woman.

If Su Daji had not wanted to be the queen of Dashang, she would not have taken action against a 
mortal woman.

Su Chen looked at Su Daji's arrogance. After leaving, he shook his head.

Su Daji and the little fox were really the same person, with the same arrogance and the same 
headache.

In the palace hall, Master Taiyi showed surprise on his face after seeing Su Daji.

Expression, (to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Master Taiyi looked at the demon mirror hanging on the palace. The demon mirror was safe and 
sound, with no trace of even being broken.

But why didn’t Su Daji have anything wrong?



Taiyi Master He didn't notice that Su Daji had any demonic aura about him. Could it be that Jiang 
Ziya had misjudged that Su Daji was not a demon at all?

King Zhou glared at Master Taiyi and said coldly,

"Taoist priest, does the lonely king’s beloved concubine have any demonic aura?

Taiyi Zhenren replied awkwardly,"Uh!" Your Majesty, the old Taoist misunderstood before."

"Humph, Taoist Priest, if you hadn't been recommended by Emperor Uncle Bigan and you dared to 
frame my beloved concubine, I would have ordered your death. Leave the palace quickly. I don't 
want to see you again."

"The veteran resigns!"

Master Taiyi glanced at Su Daji again, but he still found nothing. Su Daji was just an ordinary 
human woman.

Master Taiyi shook his head and left.

Jiang Ziya deceived him this time.

What kind of monster?

This was obviously an ordinary human being.

Su Daji's eyes lit up.

She didn't expect that Su Chen's hiding methods were so good. This powerful old man didn't even 
notice that she was a vixen.

However, this old man turned out to be Bigan. Yes, we can’t keep that old guy anymore. Su Daji 
wants to find an opportunity to get rid of Bigan.



"Your Majesty, on a whim, I visit Chentangguan in the East China Sea......"

Su Daji did not forget what Su Chen asked her to do.

She found a reason at random, and

Su Daji asked King Zhou to send Su Chen to Chentangguan in the East China Sea. King Zhou 
agreed without thinking.

At night, in the Forbidden Army Prison, dozens of people appeared sneakily on a tower outside the 
Forbidden Army Prison.

Su Chen watched all this without paying much attention.

These people came to save King Wucheng Huang Feihu. For the useless Huang Feihu, Su Chen I 
don't care whether he lives or lives. It was his luck that

Huang Feihu was able to escape to the Western Zhou Dynasty. If Huang Feihu was caught and 
killed, it would be his fate. Whoosh!

"Su Chen, you actually watched someone rob the prison and didn't care. Su Daji appeared next to 
Su Chen and said with a smile.

Su Chen smelled Su Daji's body fragrance and said with a smile,"You are a scumbag. I don't care 
about his life or death at all. Su Daji, are my affairs done?""

"Huh, I've done it for you. You can go to Chentangguan tomorrow. As the king, you will inspect 
each pass on behalf of the king. You also have the power of life and death of the general soldiers at 
each pass."

"Thank you very much!"

Su Chen hugged Su Daji's small waist with one hand and thanked her.



Damn,

Su Daji's small waist is really soft. It feels much better than the lolita-looking Su Daji.

"Inglorious bastard, let me go!"

Su Daji struggled when Su Chen hugged her.

She didn't expect that this bastard would dare to hug her.

This shameless person,

Su Daji found that she couldn't break free from Su Chen's arms. This bastard was much stronger 
than her.

Su Chen held Su Da tightly in his arms and said,

"Su Daji, let me hug you for a while. I have never hugged you in your true body."

"shameless! you.....Stop it, bastard, if you dare to touch me again, I'm going to do it"

Chapter 2336

Su Daji did not expect that Su Chen not only hugged her and refused to let go, but this bastard even 
dared to touch her.

This bastard's hands kept stroking her waist, and Su Daji wanted to kick this shameless person 
away.

Su Chen stopped hurriedly in embarrassment.

"Ahem, Su Daji, your waist is so soft, so smooth and delicate, I couldn’t hold it back for a while

"You are so shameless!"



Su Daji had a headache when she stared at Su Chen. She couldn't do anything about this bastard.

Beat?

She might not be able to beat this bastard.

Say?

Will this bastard listen to her?

"Someone is robbing the prison, come quickly!"

"Be alert, everyone be alert!"

"Sound the alarm!" There was chaos in the Forbidden Army Prison. The Forbidden Army soldiers 
guarding the Forbidden Army Prison quickly started fighting with the men in black. Su Daji leaned 
into Su Chen's arms and asked doubtfully,"Su Chen, are you really planning to let these people save 
you? Become a king through martial arts?" Su Daji felt very at ease lying in Su Chen's arms. She 
didn't know what was going on, but this feeling made her very familiar. Su Daji felt that she had 
often lied in Su Chen's arms like this before. Su Chen touched She smiled while stroking Su Daji's 
hair,

"King Wu Cheng has nothing to worry about. He has his destiny. It is his luck that King Wu Cheng 
can escape. It is his fate that he cannot escape."

"Why do I think you know so many things?"

"Su Daji, have you ever heard of becoming a god?"

"Become a god? What kind of god?"

Su Daji was very confused when she heard Su Chen's words.



God?

What is this?

The prehistoric fairy world is either immortal or demon, as well as witches, demons, and even other 
races.

God?

Su Daji has never heard of it..Su

Chen looked at Su Daji's confused look. He knew that Su Daji didn't know anything about the 
matter of becoming a god. This fool also died in the end without knowing why.

Su Chen looked at the delicate-looking Su Daji in his arms and said. ,

"Su Daji, it seems that you know nothing about this matter. The three great saints of Zixiao Palace 
have signed a contract to become a god. This is to recruit subordinates for the new prehistoric 
heaven."

"Jiejiao, Chanjiao, Renjiao, and even Western sects, these saint sects will all participate. You are the 
person sent by Nuwa, and Dashang is the top priority for the canonization of gods."

"The disciples of saints, the lucky ones of the human race, and even some immortals who practice 
casual cultivation. As long as they die in the war between Dashang, their souls may be taken away 
by the list of gods. In the future, they will be controlled by the emperor who controls the list of 
gods. This is Conferred God."

Su Daji heard Su Chen's surprise and asked,"What? Is the Great Shang the top priority in becoming 
a god? Will the Saint Sect be involved? How can this be?"

Su Chen looked at the night sky and continued,



"Su Daji, this is a great catastrophe. Since the Lich Catastrophe, the God-conferring Catastrophe has 
begun. You have participated in this catastrophe. Under the catastrophe, countless quasi-sage cities 
have fallen."

"The fate of Dashang has been decided. Only with the demise of Dashang and the filling of the 
divine throne in heaven will the Great Catastrophe of the Gods be ended."

Su Daji looked pale at the moment.

She never thought that she would be involved in the great catastrophe.

Countless powerful people would die during the great catastrophe. During the battle between the 
lich and the lich, countless creatures died in the entire prehistoric world, including quasi-sage 
powerhouses. They have all fallen a lot.

The demon clan and the witch clan have completely reduced from being the rulers of the ancient 
world to a race that everyone shouts and fights. The witch clan hid in the six realms of reincarnation 
and could not escape, and the demon clan was hunted by the immortals and cultivators of the 
ancient world.

At that time There were no saints involved in the

Lich Tribulation. This time, the Saint Sect was involved in the Gods Tribulation.

Su Daji felt frightened when she thought about it. She was just a little golden immortal, and she was 
still involved in this great calamity. Among them, Su Daji felt that it was impossible for her to 
survive the catastrophe.

"Holy shit? Huang Feihu doesn't care about his wife and sister?"(To read Baoshuang novels, go to 
Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen suddenly saw that after Huang Feihu was rescued, he ran away without saving Huang 
Guifei and Mrs. Huang. This made Su Chen somewhat unexpected.

There are no guards at Huang Guifei's place.



It is easy for Huang Feihu to save Mrs. Huang and escape with Huang Guifei.

Damn,

Huang Feihu is not a greedy person who is afraid of death, right? Or will Huang Feihu come to save 
his wife and sister in the future?

Su Daji came back to her senses and snorted disdainfully,

"Humph, this is the man! Su

Chen coughed silently,"Hey, Su Daji, maybe Huang Feihu will come to save his wife and sister in 
the future.""

Su Daji said with a mocking expression,

"Will he come to the rescue in the future? The Huang family will be executed the day after 
tomorrow. Will he still have time to save his wife and sister? Huang Feihu will definitely escape 
from Chaoge overnight, men are unreliable."

Su Chen shook his head speechlessly.

He couldn't believe all the plots in the novel.

Huang Feihu initially attacked the imperial army to save his wife.

However,

Huang Feihu saw that the ministers in the court could not save him, and he would die the day after 
tomorrow. Being executed, Huang Feihu was afraid of death and wanted to escape, even ignoring 
his wife and sister.

Su Chen shook his head and ignored it.



He said to Su Daji in his arms,

"Su Daji, after I leave tomorrow, you can build me a military camp that can accommodate 100,000 
troops, and ask King Zhou to give me the right to recruit 100,000 troops. 550"

"You want to recruit 100,000 troops?"

Su Daji asked in surprise when he heard Su Chen's words.

Su Chen controlled 50,000 forbidden troops in Chaoge City. This bastard wants to recruit 100,000 
troops?

What on earth is Su Chen going to do?

Su Chen smiled and replied ,"I have always had the army, but it was not exposed"

"How many secret armies do you have in private?"

"Three hundred thousand black-armored legions and five thousand angel legions!"

Su Chen hugged Su Daji and kissed her and said,

Black Armor Legion, these are all armies of immortal cultivators. The lowest cultivation level of 
Black Armor Legion is the Golden Core Realm.

Angel Legion,

Su Chen asked for an angel for Kesha. Except for the legion, except for the legion leader and high-
priced angels, the other angel legions are all second-generation angels with divine bodies.

Su Daji was so surprised when she heard Su Chen’s words that she couldn’t even open her mouth 
from ear to ear. She even forgot about Su Chen kissing her..



Three hundred thousand black-armored legions?

What about five thousand angel legions?

Plus fifty thousand forbidden troops.

Is this bastard going to rebel?

How many armies does Dashang have? More than three million troops, and this bastard has control 
in his hands. nearly 400,000 troops

"Su Chen, what are you secretly recruiting so many troops for? What is the Black Armored Legion? 
What is the Angel Legion? Are these all humans?".
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Su Chen watched King Wu Cheng and the man in black leave.

He turned back and said,

"The 300,000 black-armored legion are all human race, the angel legion is angel race, and the 
angels are all beautiful beauties with white wings."

"Shameless!"

After Su Daji heard what Su Chen said, she looked at Su Chen with a mocking look on her face.

A beauty with wings?

And five thousand beautiful angel beauties?

This shameless person is a sex demon.



Su Chen looked at her seriously. Su Daji said,

"Su Daji, you must do what I said as soon as possible. This is related to our future and whether we 
can survive the Great Tribulation of the Gods."

Su Chen didn't know when the Western Zhou Dynasty would rebel.

Jiang Ziya hadn't appeared in the past few days. He suspected that Jiang Ziya had left Chaoge City.

There was also King Wucheng Huang Feihu.

King Wucheng Huang Feihu also fled to the Western Zhou Dynasty. The war between Dashang and 
the Western Zhou Dynasty It will begin, and the Battle of the Gods will also begin. Su Chen doesn’t 
know how much time he has left to prepare. He wants to prepare everything as soon as possible.

"I see."

Su Daji nodded and agreed.

She didn't know whether what Su Chen said was true or not, but Su Daji could still feel the feelings 
this bastard had towards her.

Daji also wanted to bet on the God-Conferred Catastrophe.

It was impossible for her to survive this alone. With this mysterious and powerful bastard around, 
Su Daji had someone to rely on, someone she didn't know whether she could trust yet.

The next day,

Su Chen brought the deployed 10,000 black Legion A set off to

Chentangguan.



Not only did he want to save the unlucky Shi Ji, Su Chen also used Shi Ji to contact the three sisters 
Wudang Holy Mother, Turtle Spirit Holy Mother, and Yunxiao.

These women are very powerful,

In particular, the Wudang Holy Mother, the Jinjin Holy Mother, and Yunxiao, the three of them are 
all quasi-sages. If Su Chen can get three of his future women, he will have some powerful help in 
this battle of the Conferred Gods.

Half a month Later, at Sanshanguan, at this moment,

Hong Jin, the commander-in-chief of Sanshanguan, had received the news that Su Chen was about 
to arrive, but he didn't care at all. He was a disciple of Jiejiao, and

Taishi Wen Zhong was also a disciple of Jiejiao.

Hong Jin was very interested in the general of the Forbidden Army. Su Chen didn't like him at all. 
Although he had practiced some Taoism,

Su Chen was just a scumbag in his eyes. In Sanshan Pass , the deputy general looked at Hong Jin 
who was still resting. He was very The Forbidden Army General Su Chen is about to arrive at 
Sanshan Pass, but Hong Jin has not gone to greet Su Chen. If the Forbidden Army General blames 
him, not only Hong Jin will be unlucky, but he will also be unlucky with Hong Jin. The deputy 
general reminded him,

"Commander-in-Chief, General Su Chen is inspecting various checkpoints under the orders of the 
King. Don’t underestimate the General of the Forbidden Army, Su Chen. He has the power of life 
and death over the commander-in-chief at each checkpoint."

Hong Jin lay on the rocking chair and said with disdain,

"Don't worry, I don't care at all about a scumbag general of the Forbidden Army. Although Sanshan 
Pass is not one of the five major passes, I still have more than 200,000 troops in total, and I am also 
a disciple of Jiejiao. Su Chen would not dare to come even how about me"



"Commander, General Su Chen is the great general of Dashang. You are three levels lower than 
General Su Chen. You should go and greet General Su Chen when he arrives."

"It's really troublesome. There are many rules for mortals. Let's go meet the Forbidden Army 
General Su Chen."

"Yes, Commander!"

At this moment, on a mountain road leading to Sanshanguan, an army of tens of thousands is 
advancing. This army is black-clothed and black-armored. The black-armored army has not yet 
burst out with fighting momentum, but the aura it bursts out does not dare to let people Look down. 
Su Chen was sitting in the carriage that was being guarded in the middle of the black armored 
legion. He was speechless looking at the information in his hand. Hong Jin, the general of Sanshan 
Pass? Hong Jin is one of the few Jiejiao disciples who defected to the Western Zhou Dynasty, ( To 
read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!) And Hong Jin was a lucky man. After Hong 
Jin returned to the Western Zhou Dynasty, he also married Princess Longji, the daughter of the Jade 
Emperor. Princess Longji? According to the information Su Chen knew , Princess Longji is not the 
daughter of the Queen Mother, but the reincarnated daughter of the Emperor of Heaven in the 
human world, an illegitimate daughter. After Su Chen put away the information on Sanshan Pass, he 
whispered,

"A traitor to Jie Jiao, forget it, now is not the time to deal with Hong Jin, otherwise the relationship 
with Jie Jiao will be in trouble."

The captain of the Black Armored Legion saluted outside the carriage,

"General, heavy fog suddenly appeared in Phoenix Mountain ahead. Do we still want to continue 
marching?"

"Phoenix Mountains?"

Let me go, isn't Fenghuang Mountain the place where Princess Long Ji was demoted?

Well, it turns out that Hong Jin and Princess Long Ji met so close, no wonder they fell in love.

Su Chen didn't expect that Princess Long Ji was near Sanshan Pass.



Heavy fog suddenly appeared in Phoenix Mountain.

What was going on?

Su Chen got out of the carriage and looked at Phoenix Mountain not far away. At this time, Phoenix 
Mountain was shrouded in clouds and mist. This was obviously done intentionally by the immortal. 
This was done by Princess Longji. Really?

Su Chen looked at Phoenix Mountain and shouted,

"Princess Longji, put away the clouds, we are just passing through Fenghuang Mountain and have 
no intention of disturbing you."

At this time, a clear and sweet voice came over,

"Phoenix Mountain is a quiet place, and the army cannot pass through here. Since you know my 
identity, please leave quickly."

Holy shit?

The army can't pass?

What's the matter

? There is an official road here.

There are countless armies that have passed through the Great Shang over the past hundreds of 
years. Princess Longji can't even say that the army is not allowed to pass?

Damn it,

Princess Longji This was obviously to prevent him from going to Sanshanguan.



Su Chen looked at Su Chen and shouted coldly,

"Princess Longji, this is the human world. In the human world, this is the land of the Great Shang. 
In the whole world, it is the land of the king. Dashang's army is going to pass through here, do you 
dare to stop it?"

"What's the point of blocking!"

"you wanna die! Space moves!"

Su Chen didn't expect that Princess Long Ji would dare to stop him, so what about Princess 
Tianting? She was an illegitimate daughter and was demoted to Phoenix Mountain. Su Chen was 
not polite to Princess Long Ji either.

Whoosh!

A beautiful woman in white. Suddenly appeared next to Su Chen.

She looked at Su Chen in surprise.

Princess Long Ji was a fairy. She never thought that she would be captured by a human.

Su Chen looked at Princess Long Ji who was moved over by him indifferently. A scum of a fairy. In 
his Merlot Heaven, Princess Longji is not even as good as a fairy.

However,

Princess Longji is really beautiful. She is dressed in white palace clothes and has a cold and 
beautiful face. She has a curvy figure and a slender waist, but her bumps are a little smaller.

Princess Longji shouted with a cold face,

"Human race, you dare to kidnap me, aren't you afraid of heaven's punishment?"



"discipline? There are only two or three kittens in heaven, and you still want to punish me? Princess 
Longji, what can heaven punish me with?".
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Su Chen was very disdainful when he heard Princess Long Ji's words.

The conferring of gods had not yet begun.

In the heaven, only Emperor Haotian and the Queen Mother were powerful, and the others were just 
two or three kittens.

The highest level of Immortal General in Heaven may be the Golden Immortal.

He is a Taiyi Golden Immortal.

Even if there is a Daluo Golden Immortal in Heaven, he is not afraid. Su Chen can resist even the 
Quasi-Sage for a while and escape. He can rely on the innate Lingbao Yin. Die Daluo Jinxian.

After Princess Longji heard what Su Chen said, she pointed at Su Chen angrily and shouted,

"How dare you, a mortal, slander Heaven?"

"receive!"

Su Chen took out the Demonic Tower of Desire and instantly took over Princess Long Ji. She was 
an illegitimate daughter from heaven.

Su Chen was too lazy to talk nonsense with her. As for why Princess Long Ji wanted to intercept 
him this time, Su Chen wanted Princess Long Ji. After suffering in the Demonic Tower of Desire, 
he will have plenty of time to ask Princess Longji about"210". The

Demonic Tower of Desire is open again this time, with a naked and beautiful fairy.



Su Chen can admire it when he is bored.

"Disperse!"

Su Chen waved his hand, and the clouds and fog in Phoenix Mountain immediately dissipated.

He looked at the Captain of the Black Armored Legion and ordered,

"keep going!"

"Yes, General!"

An hour later,

Su Chen's Black Armored Legion arrived outside Sanshan Pass. One hundred thousand troops 
outside Sanshan Pass were arrayed outside Sanshan Pass. The captain of the Black Armored Legion 
saw that no general came out to greet Su Chen, and even one hundred thousand troops outside 
Sanshan Pass He looked menacing and shouted angrily,

"Commander Sanshanguan, where is Hong Jin?"

On the city wall of Sanshanguan,

Hong Jin sat on a rocking chair and replied disdainfully,"I am Hong Jin, the commander-in-chief of 
Sanshanguan."

"You're brave, Hong Jin. When you saw the general's carriage coming, you not only didn't greet 
him, but you dared to sit in your chair and not get up. Do you know your guilt?"

Hong Jin stood up and threatened.

"Young general, don’t be ungrateful. Wen Zhong, the great master of Shang Dynasty, is my fellow 
disciple. If you offend me, I will kill you, and your general Su Chen will not dare to say anything."



"Yeah? Hong Jin, tell me again?"

Su Chen walked out of the carriage with an ugly face.

The disciples of Jie Jiao were rampant.

He had known about them in the ancient immortal world. Su Chen never thought that in the world 
of Fengshen, the disciples of Jie Jiao were really rampant.

A small general, a small Xuanxian, and a third-rate general.

Su Chen never expected that Hong Jin would look down on him, a great general. Since the Jie Jiao 
disciples looked down on the human race, what would Hong Jin do in the mortal world? Enjoy it. 
Prosperity and wealth?

After hearing Su Chen's words, Hong Jin instantly appeared next to Su Chen.

He looked at Su Chen and sneered,

"General Su Chen, so what if I just say it again? You, a cultivator in the Nascent Soul Realm, dare 
to touch me? Let me tell you, I am a disciple of Jie Jiao and an immortal in the realm of Xuanxian. 
Even Grand Master Wen Zhong of Dashang is my senior brother with the same name."

Su Chen said coldly,

"A third-generation Jiejiao disciple, you are truly ignorant and fearless. Hong Jin, since you have 
taken refuge in Dashang, you should abide by the laws of Dashang. If you disrespect me, you are 
disrespectful to the king. I will kill you on the spot."

"Su Chen, do you dare?"

"What a scumbag! Suppression!"

Boom!



Su Chen suddenly burst out with a powerful aura and enveloped Hong Jin.

Hong Jin stared at Su Chen with a pale face. He did not expect that Su Chen was a powerful 
immortal.

He was suppressed by Su Chen and could not move.

Hong Jin regretted it a little.

He didn't expect that Su Chen would hide his cultivation level.

This old scumbag,

Hong Jin could only hope that Su Chen would not dare to kill him because he was a Jie Jiao 
disciple.

"Where is the deputy general of Sanshanguan!"

Su Chen looked at Hong Jin who was suppressed by him and was very disdainful. He is a scumbag.

It has been a long time since anyone dared to ridicule him like this.

Damn, (to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Jiejiao has not been They were really rampant when they destroyed the religion. No wonder the Jie 
Church was targeted by all the saint sects. The arrogant Tongtian was not unjust at all when he 
destroyed the religion. The deputy general of Sanshanguan came immediately and knelt down to Su 
Chen and saluted,"Lieutenant General of Sanshanguan Zhou Wen Hao, see General!"

The deputy general of Sanshanguan was frightened.

He didn't expect the Forbidden Army General Su Chen to be so powerful.



Hong Jin was an immortal, but Hong Jin had no ability to resist in Su Chen's hands. Su Chen just 
suppressed it with a strong momentum. Hong Jin, outside Sanshan Pass, not only the deputy 
generals looked pale, but also the surrounding troops were all pale and did not dare to show their 
faces...........

Su Chen asked expressionlessly,

"Zhou Wenhao, do you know your guilt?"

The deputy general immediately lowered his head and confessed,"General, I have finally found out 
my crime, please punish me!"

"Hum, Zhou Wenhao, considering your attitude of pleading guilty, I will forgive you this time."

"Thank you, General!"

"Hong Jin is arrogant and triggers the law of Dashang. An Lu must be punished. Zhou Wenhao and 
the general of Sanshanguan will be temporarily represented by you."

The deputy general didn't expect that Su Chen would reuse him, which made him very happy.

"Yes, General!"

Su Chen looked at Hong Jin and waved,

"punish!"

"No, I am a disciple of Jie Jiao, Su Chen, if you kill me, you will.....ah!"

Before Hong Jin finished speaking, he disappeared in front of Su Chen. Hong Jin didn't even leave a 
piece of ash behind.



Su Chen activated the law of space to kill Hong Jin, and he didn't even have Hong Jin's soul. Let it 
go.

A little scumbag offended himself.

Hong Jin doesn’t even have to be a god in heaven.

"Zhou Wenhao, arrange for the black-armored army to rest. This general will continue on his 
journey tomorrow."

"Yes, General!"

Jin'ao Island,

Jiejiao, the leader of Tongtian Cult who was closing his eyes suddenly opened his eyes. He reached 
out and moved his fingers and then frowned.

"The great catastrophe is coming, and the heavenly secrets are in chaos."Tongtian Cult Leader 
whispered a word and then closed his eyes.

Tongtian just felt like something happened in 0.5 on a whim, but he didn't calculate anything.

The Great Tribulation of Gods has arrived and the heavens are in chaos.

At this time, he can't calculate anything.

For

Tongtian didn't care about this whim.

His direct disciples and disciples were all on Jin'ao Island. As long as nothing happened to his 
disciples, Tongtian leader did not continue to check for this whim. In



Sanshan Pass, in a gorgeous room,

Su Chen was admiring the naked Princess Long Ji.

In the Demonic Tower of Desire,

Princess Long Ji huddled up naked.

She did not expect that after being put into the Lingbao, the clothes on her body would disappear in 
an instant. No matter what, Princess Long Ji would not Unable to put on her blouse, she hurriedly 
squatted on the ground in shame and anger

"Human race, what kind of evil spirit treasure are you using? Let me out quickly."

Chapter 2339

Su Chen didn't respond when she heard Princess Long Ji's cry.

She felt very good about quietly admiring Princess Long Ji like this.

Princess Long Ji kept letting her stay in the Demon Tower of Desire, a scumbag angel. Even if Su 
Chen accepted her, she would still be a cannon fodder. He might as well appreciate Princess 
Longji's jade body when he had nothing to do.

After Su Chen admired Princess Longji's bumpy body for a while, he touched his chin and thought,

"We will reach Chentangguan in more than ten days. Do you want to kill that arrogant kid Nezha?"

Nezha?

Nuwa's boy, but also a disciple of Chanjiao.

When Su Chen was forced to leave the ancient fairyland, Nezha and his son Li Jing, the king of 
Tota, all took refuge in Buddhism.



Nuwa's boy, a disciple of Chanjiao, finally Take refuge in Buddhism, well, Nezha can be said to be 
a proper slave of the three families.

"Nezha cannot be killed yet. Nezha is not a scumbag like Hong Jin. Master Taiyi uses Nezha to kill 
him. Nezha will definitely be focused on by Master Taiyi."

Chaoge,

Su Daji looked at Shen Gongbao in front of her.

He was a disciple of the Chan Cult, a scumbag of an immortal. He even wanted to be the national 
teacher of Dashang. If Su Chen hadn't told him about this person, he would have even taken him as 
his own. , she is too lazy to deal with this scumbag

"Shen Gongbao, you want to be the national advisor of Dashang. I have to test your abilities. Within 
a month, I need you to recruit some powerful immortals to Dashang. Can you do it?"

When Shen Gongbao heard Su Daji's words, he was secretly happy.

Shen Gongbao had made many friends over the years. If it was just to recruit some powerful 
immortals for Su Daji, it would not be difficult for him at all.

"Don’t worry, your Majesty, within a month, I will definitely recruit some powerful immortals for 
your Majesty to come to Dashang."

Su Daji nodded with a cold face and said,

"Okay, Shen Gongbao, as long as you do it and even satisfy me, Dashang’s Imperial Master will be 
yours.."

"Thank you, empress!"

"Go down!"



"yes!"

Shen Gongbao hurriedly saluted and left.

However, when he was leaving,

Shen Gongbao looked at the two women beside Su Daji. He saw that the two women beside Su Daji 
were monsters.

Shen Gongbao originally wanted to remind Su Daji, but he guessed that Su Daji should Knowing 
that the two girls around him were monsters, otherwise, Su Daji would not have allowed him to 
recruit some powerful immortals.

Beside Su Daji, a beautiful woman in green frowned and said,"Sister, Shen Gongbao should have 
noticed that Pipa and I It's a demon."

Su Daji looked at the two women next to her and smiled.

These two women are sisters who practiced with her. The mature and plump woman in the green 
dress is the Nine-headed Chicken Essence, and the young and beautiful woman in the yellow dress 
is the Jade Piba Essence.

There were a lot of things arranged by Su Chen when she left. It would take some time for her to 
complete them alone, so Su Daji called for the Nine-headed Chicken Essence and the Jade Pipa 
Essence. They could do things that were inconvenient for her to do. Sister, do it.

Su Daji waved her hand and said,

"Don't worry, Shen Gongbao won't talk nonsense. When that bastard Su Chen comes back, I'll ask 
him to help you hide your demonic aura."

Jade Piba Jing asked curiously,"Sister, who is Su Chen? Why do you trust a human race?"

Su Daji had a helpless expression on her face when she heard what Jade Piba Jing said.



She had no way to do anything to Su Chen.

Half a month ago,

Su Daji was taken advantage of by Su Chen. She was even taken advantage of by that man. The 
shameless pervert kissed her. If she didn't feel disgusted with Su Chen in her heart, and she was 
close to Su Chen,

Su Daji would have turned against Su Chen.

"Su Chen is a shameless person and a powerful bastard. Don’t underestimate that bastard. He is 
very powerful. Also, Su Chen and we are allies now. You should be polite when you see that bastard 
Su Chen.." (To read exciting novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Yes, eldest sister!"

The Nine-Headed Chicken Essence and the Jade Pipa Essence looked at each other.

They had just seen Su Daji's blush. They guessed that Su Daji and Su Chen had an ulterior secret. 
There might even be an affair between Su Daji and Su Chen. Love.

Su Daji continued to give instructions,

"Pipa, the camp in the south of Chaoge City, you cast a spell to reinforce it. This is a token. You can 
order the big black armored army in the south of the city to help you."

"Yes, eldest sister!"

Su Daji took out another jade talisman and said,

"Jiuzhi, go to West Kunlun. There is a jade talisman here. You must give it to the Queen Mother of 
the West in person."



After the nine-headed chicken spirit heard Su Daji's words, her expression changed.

Going to West Kunlun?

And meeting the Queen Mother of the West?

Are you asking her to die?

The Queen Mother of the West of West Kunlun is a quasi-sage in the prehistoric immortal world. , 
and she is also the top power among the female fairies. How could she, a little monster, meet the 
Queen Mother of the West?

The Nine-Headed Chicken Essence felt that as soon as she arrived in West Kunlun, the fairies under 
the Queen Mother of the West would destroy her.

The Nine-Headed Chicken Essence patted her His forehead was speechless and he said,

"Sister, do you want me to go to West Kunlun? I might be killed as soon as I arrive in West Kunlun. 
The Queen Mother of the West is the top power in the ancient immortal world. How could she meet 
a little demon like me."

Su Daji took out a jade box.

She looked very uncomfortable looking at the jade box. The item in the jade box was a bellyband. 
When she saw the bellyband in the jade box, Su Daji almost mistakenly thought that Su Chen was 
going to give it to her. Her personal belongings.

However, when she heard Su Chen say that it was for the Queen Mother of the West in West 
Kunlun, Su Daji was confused at the time.

Giving it to the Queen Mother of the West?

Was this shameless person looking for death?



Su Chen did not explain it to her at the time, ( That bastard Wang Dezhao just said that if you go 
there with this jade box, the Queen Mother of the West will not take action against the little demon 
sent by Su Daji.

Su Daji shook her head when she thought of this, and she said to the Nine-headed Chicken Essence,

"Jiuzhi, take this jade box with you. As soon as you reach West Kunlun, the Queen Mother of the 
West will meet you. Jiuzhi, you must not open the jade box, otherwise you will die."

"I understand, sis!"

The Nine-headed Chicken Essence nodded hurriedly.

Does she dare to open this jade box?

This is an item for the Queen Mother of the West, the head of the female immortals of West Kunlun. 
She is a little monster. The Nine-Headed Chicken Essence is not interested in those powerful items. 
Don't dare to take a peek.

At Sanshan Pass, a figure instantly appeared on the mountain outside Sanshan Pass. He looked at 
Sanshan Pass and frowned.

"Black bird? Xuanniao is still alive. Could it be that during the dragon and phoenix catastrophe, 
Xuanniiao's soul escaped?".

Chapter 2340

In Sanshan Pass,

Su Chen was in his room thinking about how to meet Nuwa and the Queen Mother in the future.

Nuwa lived in the chaos, and it was impossible for him, a little Taiyi Golden Immortal, to enter the 
chaos to find Nuwa.

As for the Queen Mother, she is in the heaven.



Although the prehistoric heaven is just an empty shell, the Emperor Haotian is a quasi-sage.

It is very easy for Su Chen to sneak into the Heavenly Court, but if he is discovered by Emperor 
Haotian,

Su Chen will be in danger.

Not only will Emperor Haotian take action against him, but even the arrogant woman Queen 
Mother will also take action against him. He took action, well,

Su Chen didn't want to be killed by his woman for no reason.

Um?

Anyone?

Whoosh!

Su Chen suddenly felt that someone was checking him, and he disappeared from the room in an 
instant.

On a large mountain,

Su Chen appeared here instantly. He looked at a young man next to him and wanted to leave 
immediately.

Damn it, why is Kong Xuan here?

Su Chen felt a little unlucky.

Kong Xuan, the son of Fengzu, was a quasi-sage, and he was also an arrogant person.A slow 
pretender, the first person among saints?



Kong Xuan may be compared to the quasi-sages in the Saint Sect, but does Kong Xuan dare to 
provoke Zhen Yuanzi? Do you dare to provoke Patriarch Styx? Do you dare to provoke the Queen 
Mother of West Kunlun? There are also those quasi-sages from the Witch Clan and Monster Clan.

The Quasi-Saints from the Lich Period are still very powerful now. Although Kong Xuan has five-
color divine light that can slay all things, for those veteran Quasi-Saints, Kong Xuan's five-color 
divine light may not be enough.

At this time,

Kong Xuan saw Su Chen arriving, and he said to Su Chen expressionlessly,

"You came!

Su Chen frowned and asked,"Son of Fengzu, why are you here?""

Kong Xuan ordered indifferently,

"Xuanniao, since you have revived and know that I am the son of Fengzu, you should surrender to 
me. The Phoenix clan, and even the Bird clan, will rise again."

Submit?

What the hell!

Kong Xuan's arrogance made Su Chen not even think of

Xuanniao surrendering to a peacock?

During the prehistoric period when the three clans ruled,

Fengzu did not dare to ask Xuanniao and Qingying to surrender.



Phoenix, Xuanniao, Qingying is the royal family of birds. If it weren't for the fact that both Xuannio 
and Qingying are the only one, and there are so many Phoenix clans, how could the Bird clan 
respect the Phoenix clan?

Su Chen only has the blood of Blackbird, he is not a real The black bird in Su Chen's body was 
angry and wanted to come out of his body.

Su Chen hurriedly calmed the black bird in his body and looked at Kong Xuan. Xuan mocked 
disdainfully,

"Surrender to you? Son of Fengzu, when the three tribes dominated the ancient fairyland, Phoenix, 
Blackbird, and Qingying were all the royal family of birds. Fengzu didn't even ask me to surrender. 
Do you think you are worthy?"

Kong Xuan's expression changed when he heard Su Chen's words.

During the three-clan period, the Phoenix Clan, Xuanniao, and Qingying were all the royal family 
of birds, and the Phoenix Clan did not let Xuanniao and Qingying surrender.

Kong Xuan thought that Su Chen had just recovered. , a scumbag in the Nascent Soul realm, if 
Kong Xuan conquered the black bird, it would be equivalent to conquering the bird clan. However, 
he did not expect that Su Chen still had the memories of the past when he recovered.

"Xuanniiao, you have just recovered now, and your state is like a scumbag. Submit to the Phoenix 
Clan or die!"

Su Chen looked at Kong Xuan and sneered,

"laugh! Phoenix clan? It’s not like I don’t know Tianfeng, the current leader of the Phoenix Clan. 
Son of Feng Zu, you are just a peacock. What qualifications do you have to say that you are from 
the Phoenix Clan?"

Kong Xuan shouted with arrogance,



"Just because I am the son of Fengzu."

Well Dan, the son of Fengzu?

A hybrid peacock. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

It is impossible for the Phoenix Clan to recognize the peacock's status as the crown prince in the 
Feng Clan, otherwise Kong Xuan would not be able to be the prince in the prehistoric times. There 
was chaos in the fairy world, and the Phoenix Clan in the south of the volcano couldn't let Kong 
Xuan stay there.

Su Chen's face turned cold and he said with contempt,

"Son of Fengzu, I call you son of Fengzu to give Fengzu face. To put it bluntly, you are a bastard."

"If Fengzu hadn't encountered the aura of heaven and earth before his death, your existence would 
be the reason for your existence. Your existence would be a shame to the entire Phoenix Clan. Even 
the Phoenix Clan in Nanli Volcano would not be able to accept you."

"you wanna die!"

Boom!

Kong Xuan was completely angry when he heard Su Chen's words.

The Phoenix Clan did not recognize him and would not let him stay in Nanli Volcano, but he was 
indeed the son of Feng Zu. A bastard?

How dare Xuanniao dare to Call him a bastard?

A scumbag, a newly revived bird royal family.

It would be easy for Kong Xuan to kill the black bird.



Su Chen hurriedly resisted Kong Xuan's powerful momentum.

He did not expect that Kong Xuan had murderous intentions.

If Su Chen hadn't He made the system hide his realm, and Kong Xuan only burst out with a little 
momentum this time, otherwise, he would have to use spiritual treasures to resist Kong Xuan's 
powerful momentum.

Su Chen reminded Kong Xuan with a cold face,

"Do you dare to kill me? I am a royal member of the Bird Clan. If you dare to kill me, the entire 
Phoenix Clan, and even all the Bird Clan in the Ancient Immortal Realm will not be able to let you 
go. Even the Great Heaven will punish you with thunder."

After Kong Xuan heard what Su Chen said, he clenched his fists angrily.

Su Chen could not be killed easily. Everyone in the clan would make him an enemy, and Heaven 
would also punish him with thunder.

But Xuanniao was too arrogant, and

Kong Xuan was very angry at this arrogant bastard.

"Xuanniao, I am now a Quasi-Saint Power. No one in the Phoenix Clan, or even the entire Bird 
Clan, is my opponent. Even if Heaven sends thunder punishment, it will only be three or nine 
thunder punishments. Do you think I will be afraid?"

Su Chen curled his lips and reminded,

"Peacock, you are talking big words. The Great Tribulation of the Gods is coming. You appeared in 
the human race. Compared to you, you also know about the Great Tribulation of the Gods. Under 
the great tribulation, many quasi-sage cities will fall. Do you dare to kill me now? ?"

"Xuanniiao, I underestimate you. I can't kill you when the catastrophe comes, but what about after 
the catastrophe? Do you think I will let you go?"



"That depends on whether you survive until after the catastrophe."

"I remember you, Xuanniao, your death will be after the great catastrophe."

After Kong Xuan glared at Su Chen fiercely, he disappeared on the mountain in an instant.

Kong Xuan has no way to deal with Su Chen now.

The catastrophe of becoming a god is coming.

Kong Xuan cannot kill this bastard at this time. , he couldn't let Heaven cast aside him, otherwise he 
might fall under the Catastrophe of Conferring Gods. When

Su Chen saw Kong Xuan disappear and leave, he patted his chest and whispered,

"Damn, I was scared to death."
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