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On the mountain,

Su Chen breathed a sigh of relief after Kong Xuan left. He did not expect that Kong Xuan would be 
near Sanshan Pass.

No,

Kong Xuan seemed to have been the commander-in-chief of Sanshan Pass.

Damn it, is Sanshan Pass still a Feng Shui? Treasure land? Hong Jin is here, Princess Long Ji is near 
Sanshan Pass, and Kong Xuan is also near Sanshan Pass. This place is really unlucky.

Su Chen looked around and whispered,

"This time, Kong Xuan was dealt with. It was impossible for Kong Xuan to take action against him 
before the Great Tribulation of the Gods was over. It seemed that he was going to visit the Feng 
Clan in the future. Su Chen had many things to ask Tianfeng. Regarding Kong Xuan , Tianfeng 
should know a lot."

Ten days later,

Chentangguan,

Su Chen just arrived at Chentangguan. Li Jing, the commander-in-chief of Chentangguan, greeted 
Su Chen outside the pass early. Su Chen didn't say anything to Li Jing, and he was too lazy to talk 
nonsense to a scumbag..Li

Mansion,

Li Jing took Su Chen to a quiet small courtyard.



He saluted Su Chen and said,

"General Su, this is the other courtyard of the mansion. The general can rest here in the future."

Chen looked around and nodded,"Okay, Li Jing, you go and do your business. I'll stay for a few 
days and then leave Chentang Pass 28.""

"Yes, General Su."

Su Chen shook his head when he saw Li Jing leaving. Li Jing looked very respectful to him on the 
surface, but his expression showed disdain.

Su Chen thought of Li Jing's background and cursed road,

"A fool who relies on his son."

If Li Jing didn't have three sons with good backgrounds, would he be the general marshal in heaven 
after becoming a god?

A mediocre person.

Whoosh!

After Su Chen checked Li's house, he appeared in a room in an instant, Qiankun Gong , the Sky-
Suppressing Arrow, this is the treasure that Su Chen is looking for.

Su Chen looked at the Qiankun Bow and the Sky-Suppressing Arrow enshrined on the table, with a 
surprised expression on his face.

Luck?

The luck of the human race?



The Qiankun Bow and the Sky-Suppressing Arrow. There is actually a trace of human luck on the 
arrows?

How is this possible?

The Qiankun Bow and the Sky-Suppressing Arrow are the treasures of the Human Emperor 
Xuanyuan. It is very abnormal for these treasures to appear in Li Jing's mansion.

There are also humans in the Qiankun Bow and the Sky-Suppressing Arrow. Luck, this is even more 
abnormal.

Su Chen thought about it for a while and understood.

"It turns out that the Human Emperor Xuanyuan also participated in the Great Tribulation of the 
Gods. No wonder Nezha was able to pull the Qiankun Bow before he became an immortal."

"Human Emperor Xuanyuan and other Human Emperors, they watched the human race killing each 
other without any action. The Human Emperors in Fire Cloud Cave should have made some deal 
with the saints."

Su Chen saw that the Qiankun Bow and the Sky-Suppressing Arrow were not moving. He wanted to 
know what the Human Emperors' intentions were.

If there was a chance,

Su Chen wouldn't mind killing them again.

"I'll go find that unlucky guy in Shiji tomorrow."

In the other courtyard,

Su Chen was lying on a rocking chair and basking in the sun. This trial mission may take decades. 
This is the longest and most dangerous of his trial missions.



Saint!

He has not been beaten. The saints restricted by heaven are the biggest obstacle to Su Chen's trial 
mission.

A beautiful woman came to the other courtyard with several maids. The beautiful woman saluted Su 
Chen and said,

"General, this is a meal prepared for you!"

"Um!"

Su Chen didn't open his eyes.

He noticed it when these maids arrived.

Beautiful woman?

That beautiful woman should be Li Jing's wife. Su Chen didn't expect that Li Jing would ask her 
wife to bring him food. Li Jing didn't worry about himself. A womanizer?

"General, please use it slowly!"

The beautiful woman left with the maids after the maids prepared the food.

However, the beautiful woman relaxed when she left.

She was very worried that Su Chen was a lecherous general.

Su Chen had a higher official position than Li Jing. Much bigger, and even has the power of life and 
death over the general soldiers at each pass. The reason why the beautiful woman wanted to deliver 
food to Su Chen in person was because Li Jing was worried that the maids would bump into Su 
Chen, so he asked her to deliver it to Su Chen in person. Food.



At this time, a little boy wearing a bellyband appeared in the small courtyard. He looked at Su Chen 
and asked aggressively,

"Who are you? Why did you show up at my house?"

When the beautiful woman who was about to walk out of the courtyard heard the little boy's words, 
she turned pale and hurriedly shouted, (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Nezha, come back quickly, don't mess around here."

Su Chen still didn't open his eyes. He didn't expect Nezha's arrival.

However, Su Chen was too lazy to pay attention to a naughty kid and a distracted scumbag. Nezha 
saw Su Chen with his eyes closed and ignored him. Him, this made him angry,

"How dare you ignore me? Look at the fight!"

"Nezha, no, stop!"When the beautiful woman saw Nezha taking action against Su Chen, she 
screamed in fright to stop her.

"presumptuous!"

In the other courtyard, a team of black-armored soldiers guarding Su Chen quickly intercepted 
Nezha.

"Get out of here!"

After Nezha kicked away a black-armored soldier who intercepted him, he attacked Su Chen.

Nezha was angry when Su Chen ignored him. No one in Chentangguan dared to ignore him. Nezha 
must teach him a lesson. This man dared to ignore him.



After a black-armored soldier was repulsed, the captain of the black-armored legion reminded the 
other soldiers,

"Take down this kid, be careful, he is a cultivator in the distraction realm."

Boom, bump, bump!

347 Twelve black-armored soldiers formed a battle formation and surrounded Nezha.

A captain of thousands in the distraction realm, and eleven black-armored soldiers in the Nascent 
Soul realm, they surrounded Nezha and attacked. Get up, the black-armored soldiers didn’t kill 
Nezha. He was a child.

They just needed to catch Nezha.

"hateful!"

Nezha angrily took out his spiritual treasures, Qiankun Circle, Huoyunqiang, and Hot Wheels, and 
quickly attacked the black-armored soldiers who surrounded him.

"Military formation, trapping the dragon in the formation! bundle!"

Boom!

A powerful aura suddenly burst out. The black-armored soldiers were originally dispersed by 
Nezha's spiritual treasure. However, after the black-armored soldiers burst out with the power of the 
army, Nezha was suppressed in an instant. come down

"Let me out, let me out!"

In the military formation,

Nezha, who was suppressed and unable to move, shouted.



Nezha did not expect that these soldiers could suppress him. He is an immortal cultivator in the 
realm of distraction, and it doesn't even take long to become an immortal.

Beautiful woman Seeing Nezha being suppressed, she was very surprised.

A group of soldiers could suppress Nezha, who was cultivating immortals. How was this possible? 
Could it be that Dashang's imperial army were all cultivators of immortals? The beautiful woman 
came back to her senses and hurriedly asked Su Chen Saluting,

"General, this is my son Nezha. General, please let my son go."

"Come here, have a drink with me, and I'll let your son go"
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Su Chen sat up and looked at the suppressed Nezha, a scumbag in the distraction realm. If Nezha 
didn't have some rubbish spiritual treasures, the black-armored soldiers could suppress Nezha 
without a powerful military formation.

Su Chen waved his hand to Li Jing's wife and said,

"Come here, have a drink with me, and I'll let your son go."

It's not like Su Chen has fallen in love with Li Jing's wife.

He can't execute Nezha yet.

Taiyi Zhenren, that old bastard, has been paying attention to Nezha.

Nezha is his replacement for death. If Nezha is killed, Taiyi Zhenren will fall in the Conferring 
Gods Tribulation, and his soul will be sucked away by the Conferring Gods List, and he will be 
driven by the heaven from now on. Before the

Conferring Gods Tribulation is over,



Taiyi Zhenren will not let anyone kill him. Nezha.

But Nezha offended him, and

Su Chen couldn't possibly have no reaction.

He couldn't touch Nezha now, but the debtor must be repaid, and Li Jing's wife Su Chen wanted to 
tease her.

"What?"

Mrs. Li was stunned when she heard Su Chen's words.

Drinking with her?

How is this possible?

Mrs. Li is a married woman and the wife of Li Jing, the commander-in-chief of Chentangguan. Is 
the Forbidden Army General Su Chen planning to tease her?

Su Chen smiled and said,

"Mrs. Li, your son just offended me. If you don't drink with me, I will execute your son. Mrs. Li 
said hurriedly with a pale face,"General Su, Nezha is still a child, please let the general go.""

Su Chen looked at Nezha who was still struggling and mocked,

"child? A distracted child? If my guard strength is low, your son may kill me. Do you still think 
your son is a child?"

"General Su......"

"At three breaths, Mrs. Li, if you don’t come over and drink with me, your son will be killed."



Su Chen interrupted Mrs. Li with a cold expression.

He had no time to chat with Li Jing's wife here. Although Mrs. Li was pretty good-looking, he was 
not interested in this woman. She was so beautiful and glamorous. As a mortal, if Mrs. Li hadn't 
been Nezha's mother, Su Chen wouldn't bother to talk to her at all.

Mrs. Li looked at Su Chen with a pale face. She didn't expect that the Forbidden Army general was 
really a lecher.

What should she do?

Li Jing didn't In the mansion, the entire Li mansion was filled with black-armored troops. If she 
didn't accompany this lustful general in three breaths , her son Nezha would be killed. Mrs. Li held 
her hands tightly with a look of despair. Mrs. Li Biting his lip, he agreed.

"I'll drink with the general!"

Su Chen waved and said,

"Come here, Mrs. Li, I was not interested in you originally, but who told your son to offend me? 
Your son is still so young, and I can't punish him. You can only bear your son's fault."

Mrs. Li looked at the suppressed Nezha.

She lowered her head and walked towards Su Chen. In order to save Nezha, Mrs. Li had to be 
humiliated by this lustful general.

Looking down on herself?

She didn't believe it at all.

There was also Nezha. , the humiliation she will suffer today is all caused by her son Nezha. If 
Nezha had not been unreasonable before, Mrs. Li would not humiliate and accompany this 
lecherous general.



Nezha is cheating his mother.

Su Chenyi He hugged Mrs. Li who came over, and he felt Mrs. Li's tight body, but Mrs. Li's small 
waist felt good. The prehistoric fairyland was different from the ordinary world. Although Mrs. Li 
had no cultivation, she was not at all older. Not too old, she doesn't look like a mother with three 
children at all

"drink wine!"

"Yes, General!"

Su Chen hugged Mrs. Li and drank together.

Mrs. Li blushed and drank with Su Chen. She wanted to resist when Su Chen hugged her.

But for Nezha, she could only be hugged by Su Chen in humiliation. But fortunately, Su Chen just 
held her and didn't move anything.

Otherwise, she would commit suicide in humiliation in the future. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to 
Feilu Novel Network!)

Nezha was confused at this moment, he even Even the struggle was forgotten. His mother was held 
by the man while drinking.

What was going on?

Half an hour later,

Su Chensong looked at Mrs. Li.

The punishment was over.



However, after Mrs. Li was let go by Su Chen, she leaned She didn't dare to get up in Su Chen's 
arms. Su Chen didn't say anything. If she got up privately, Mrs. Li was worried that Su Chen would 
not keep her words.

Su Chen looked at Mrs. Li and smiled and ordered,"Let Nezha go!""

"Yes, General!"

"Damn it, just wait, I won’t let you go."

After Nezha was released by the black-armored soldiers, he looked at the surrounding black-
armored soldiers and then at Su Chen. He yelled with anger and left quickly.

"Nezha!"

When Mrs. Li saw Nezha's unwillingness to let him go, she became worried.

If Nezha attacked Su Chen again, how could she stop him? How could she convince Su Chen not to 
hurt Nezha?

"Mrs. Li, it seems that your son is still unwilling to give in. You said that if your son attacks me 
again, what do you think I will do to you?"

"General, I'm going to stop my son right now."

After Mrs. Li heard what Su Chen said, she hurriedly got up and ran out of the hospital. She wanted 
to prevent Nezha from committing another murder. What would she do if Nezha attacked Su Chen 
again ? Su Chen just held her, If Nezha attacks Su Chen again, does he want her to sleep with this 
lecherous general? Su Chen watched Mrs. Li leave quickly. He shook his head and did not stop him. 
There was a naughty child at home, and Mrs. Li, a mortal mother, was enough. Helpless. After Su 
Chen stood up and stretched, he looked to one side and shouted,

"Come out, do you still want me to ask you to come out?"

Whoosh!



An old Taoist suddenly appeared in the yard.

He looked at Su Chen and said coldly,

"Human race, you just went too far."

Su Chen saw an old Taoist appear.

He guessed who the old Taoist was.

The space in this area fluctuated previously. Su Chen guessed that it should be Nezha's master. Taiyi 
Zhenren was hiding here.

"Who are you?"

"The Golden Light Cave in Qianyuan Mountain, the old Taoist temple, is the real person of Taiyi."

Master Taiyi was a little surprised when he looked at Su Chen.

A cultivator in the Nascent Soul Realm and a human could actually discover his existence. Did this 
human just make random guesses? Or did he really find himself hiding around?

Su Chen heard that it was indeed Taiyi. After seeing Master Yi, he looked at Master Taiyi and asked 
with a serious face,

"Taiyi Zhenren, one of the Twelve Golds of Chanjiao, what is your purpose in coming to the human 
race? Taiyi

's eyes flashed with golden light and he said coldly,"Can't the old Taoist come to the human race?""

"Master Taiyi, although you are an immortal, this is the human race. If you do something harmful to 
the human race, I advise you to leave as soon as possible."



Su Chen thought of Nezha causing trouble in the sea and killing the third prince of the Dragon Clan.

The Dragon Clan flooded Chentangguan for this.

If there was no plan by Master Taiyi here, Su Chen didn't believe it at all. Master Taiyi had been 
paying attention to Nezha. Wouldn't he know what Nezha was doing?

"A scum of the human race, the old Taoist is the Twelve Golden Immortals of the Chan Cult. Not to 
mention Chentangguan, even the old Taoist from the imperial palace in Chaoge City has been there"
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Taiyi Zhenren did not expect that Su Chen would dare to threaten him, a little scumbag in the 
Nascent Soul Realm, and his thought of killing Su Chen was enough.

However,

Master Taiyi discovered that Su Chen was a general of Dashang. The great catastrophe of becoming 
a god was coming, and his disciples had not stopped him from dying. Master Taiyi could not kill a 
person who deserved the disaster when the great catastrophe was approaching..

Killing the person who deserves to be robbed will cause him to fall into the catastrophe of the gods 
in advance.

Taiyi Zhenren does not want to be haunted by the tribulation energy during the tribulation, or even 
die during the catastrophe and be controlled by the list of gods.

Su Chen heard Taiyi Zhenren's words and mocked,

"Palace? Master Taiyi, you have to behave yourself when entering the Great Shang Palace. Do you 
think the human race's luck is just a decoration? Do you dare to take action against the great Shang 
King Zhou in the palace?"

Taiyi Zhenren looked at Su Chen with a very ugly face. He didn't dare to take action against the 
contemporary human emperor. The contemporary emperor"467" was not only the main figure in the 



Great Tribulation of the Gods, but also the destiny of the human race. The contemporary Human 
Emperor. Even the saints dare not attack the Human Emperor easily. If Taiyi Zhenren takes action 
against King Zhou, Heaven's thunder punishment will destroy him. Taiyi Zhenren snorted at Su 
Chen and threatened,

"Hum, human race, I'm too lazy to talk nonsense with you. I'm warning you, it's best to leave 
Chentangguan. Nezha is my disciple. If you dare to attack Nezha, don't blame me for killing you."

"Kill me? You are.....who?"

Whoosh!

Boom!

Su Chen was about to mock Master Taiyi when he suddenly felt the crisis. He immediately 
teleported and disappeared in place.

Just as Su Chen disappeared, a huge crater was blasted out of the place, and the entire other 
courtyard was destroyed. The black-armored soldiers guarding the other compound also suffered 
hundreds of casualties.

"Be alert, summon the black-armored army, and protect the general!"

Woo woo woo......

In Li's Mansion, the surviving black-armored soldiers immediately blew their horns, and the 
remaining black-armored soldiers were all on alert.

Master Taiyi looked at all this in confusion.

He did not expect that any immortal would dare to take action against the calamity.

The great catastrophe of the Gods is coming. If anyone dares to take action against the calamity, 
they will be entangled in the calamity. During the calamity, , 90% of people who are haunted by the 
calamity will perish in the great calamity.



At this moment, a chubby Taoist stood in the air with an indifferent expression.

He did not expect that Su Chen could dodge his random palm attack. A scumbag in the Nascent 
Soul Realm could sense the crisis in advance and even be able to quickly dodge it. his attack

"Duobao, it’s you."

Zhenren Taiyi saw Duobao, the great disciple of Jiejiao, appearing in the air. He looked at Taoist 
Duobao and was very confused.

Why did Taoist Duobao take action against Su Chen?

Su Chen is the general of Dashang's imperial army and a conferred god. As candidates for the great 
calamity, isn't the relationship between Dashang and Jiejiao very close?

Many of Jiejiao's disciples are officials in Dashang, and even the third generation disciple Wen 
Zhong is also the grand master of Dashang. Why is Duobao Will he take action to kill Dashang's 
Imperial Guard general?

Duobao glanced at Taiyi Zhenren and said,

"Taiyi Zhenren, the general of the imperial army of Dashang killed the disciples of Jiejiao. I came 
here to kill the general of the imperial army."

After Master Taiyi heard Duobao's words, he smiled and said,

"The Imperial Guard general who killed Dashang? Ha ha...., Duobao, you can do whatever you 
want!"

Duobao was very disdainful when he saw the laughing Taiyi Zhenren.

A Forbidden Army General of Dashang,



Su Chen, the Forbidden Army General, is a person who deserves to be robbed, but a Forbidden 
Army General is not important at all. After Su Chen's death, he was named an insignificant person 
at most. As a god, Duobao doesn't mind getting a little bit jinxed.

"Humph, it doesn't matter if he kills a dispensable person."

At this moment,

Su Chen appeared outside Chentang Pass.

After he found out that the person who killed him just now was Taoist Duobao, Su Chen quickly 
contacted The Black Armor Legion evacuated.

He wanted to escape Chentangguan first,

Taoist Duobao?

Su Chen did not expect that Taoist Duobao would come to kill him.

Could it be that the news of killing Hong Jin was learned by Duobao?

Hong Jin was just an ordinary person Even if Hong Jin, a third-generation disciple of Jiejiao, was 
killed, it would be insignificant.

Why would Duobao take action himself?

Su Chen looked at Chentangguan.

He guessed that Duobao's action should not be simple. Su Chen thought that Hong Jin should be 
Duo Bao. Bao's chess piece, even an important piece in the Conferred God Tribulation.

In the air, (to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)



Taoist Duobao looked at Su Chen outside Chentang Pass and said coldly ,

"Forbidden General Su Chen, you can't escape!"

Su Chen curled his lips and mocked,

"Taoist Duobao, then you have to catch me, or even kill me. Goodbye, I will take note of today’s 
grudge."

Su Chen said and disappeared quickly. Taoist Duobao couldn't catch him if he escaped.

However,

Su Chen and Jie Jiao have become enemies.

Duobao, that old cunt, will definitely inform the other Jie Jiao. When other disciples deal with 
themselves, well, there are many Jie Jiao disciples in Dashang. Do we want to kill all Jie Jiao 
disciples?

"Um? Space laws? How is this possible? How can a person in the Yuanying realm know the laws of 
space?"

Duobao saw Su Chen disappear in an instant.

He immediately checked where Su Chen was going, but there was no trace of Su Chen for 
thousands of miles around. Duobao carefully checked the place where Su Chen disappeared just 
now. He found some traces of space. This Obvious traces of the law... the law of space?

Su Chen actually knows the law of space? Taoist Duobao began to think in doubt.

Whoosh!

Taoist Duobao also disappeared in Chentangguan in an instant.



He would not let Su Chen go,

Duobao To find Su Chen, a scumbag in the Nascent Soul Realm , within ten thousand miles ,

Duobao didn't believe that Su Chen knew the laws of space. He guessed that Su Chen should have a 
space spirit treasure. When

Taiyi Zhenren saw Su Chen escape, even Duobao The Taoist could not find any trace of Su Chen's 
disappearance.

He was very surprised.

A scum of the Nascent Soul Realm,

Su Chen escaped twice in succession from a quasi-sage?

Master Taiyi felt that Su Chen was not simple at all. It was even possible that Su Chen had hidden 
his cultivation level. He waved his hand and disappeared in Chentangguan in an instant.

In Chentangguan, the black armored army quickly left Chentangguan after gathering.

In the ruins of the other courtyard, 4.9

Li Jing and Li Madam, and even Nezha who arrived with the Qiankun Bow and the Heaven-
Suppressing Arrow, they looked at all this in confusion.

The other courtyard was destroyed, and the Forbidden Army General Su Chen did not know 
whether to live or die. Madam Li asked with a worried look,

"Husband, what should I do? The general of the imperial army was assassinated at Chentangguan, 
and now his life and death are unknown. The king will definitely anger his husband."

Li Jing said helplessly,"I understand, but the person who assassinated Su Chen was Taoist Duobao 
from Jie Jiao. I will report this to the king first, hoping that the king will not anger our family."



"well!"

At this time, thousands of miles away in Skeleton Mountain, in the Bone Cave, a beautiful fairy in 
white was meditating and practicing.

Suddenly, the fairy in white suddenly opened her eyes and said coldly,

"who?".
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Skull Mountain, Bone Cave!

This is a large mountain with beautiful scenery, surrounded by clouds and mist. The trees on the 
mountain are lush and green, and the clear creek flows slowly. The clouds and mist are lingering 
between the mountains. This is a fairy cave with sufficient aura.

Whoosh!

Su Chen instantly appeared in the Bone Cave.

He came to capture Shi Ji. He could no longer stay in Chentangguan. Su Chen did not forget the 
purpose of coming to Chentangguan this time. Shi Ji, the unlucky guy, would have something to do 
with him in later generations. Due to some origins, he planned to capture Shi Ji first

"who?"

In the Bone Cave,

Shi Ji saw Su Chen appearing in front of her instantly, with a cold look on her face.

Her cave had a barrier formation.



This human race could come in without touching her formation. Shi Ji guessed This human race is 
here with bad intentions

"receive!"

Su Chen didn't have time to look at the beautiful Empress Shi Ji. He took out the Demonic Tower of 
Desire and wanted to take Shi Ji away. When

Su Chen showed up, Taoist Duobao would notice his aura, and he would quickly take Shi Ji away.

"Damn it, what the hell are you?......"

Shi Ji was suddenly enveloped by the Demonic Tower of Desire.

She did not expect that Su Chen would suddenly take action, and Su Chen also had a powerful 
spiritual treasure.

She hurriedly struggled to take action against Su Chen, but her struggle was simply unnecessary, 
and it was only an instant Soon, Empress Shiji was taken in by the Demonic Tower of Desire.

"Another collectible has arrived!"

After Su Chen used the Demonic Tower of Desire to collect Empress Shiji, a smile appeared on his 
face.

Su Chen suddenly thought that if all the beautiful female disciples from Jiejiao were brought into 
the Demonic Tower of Desire, not only would they be able to enjoy the beautiful scenery, He could 
even avoid fighting with the beauties he was familiar with.

The more Su Chen thought about it, he realized that it was feasible.

The disciples of Jie Jiao would hunt him down in the future, and it was impossible for him to kill all 
the beautiful female disciples of Jie Jiao.



"I thought, that old cunt Duobao came so fast, but he got out of the way."

Su Chen suddenly felt a powerful aura coming, and he disappeared into the Bone Cave in an instant, 
whoosh!

"Ran away again?"

After Duobao appeared in the Bone Cave and checked, he frowned.

Taoist Duobao felt that the space spirit treasure in Su Chen's hand must be a top-quality innate spirit 
treasure, otherwise it would be impossible to escape his pursuit..

A top-quality innate spiritual treasure, this is an unexpected surprise for him. As long as Duobao 
kills Su Chen, the top-quality innate spiritual treasure will also fall into his hands.

At this time, all the disciples of Jiejiao have obtained After receiving Duobao's message,

Hong Jin, the third generation disciple of Jie Jiao, was killed, and the person who killed Hong Jin 
was Dashang's Forbidden Army General.

After many disciples of Jie Jiao got the news, some disciples went out to rob and kill the Forbidden 
Army General Su Chen..

Some disciples ignored this.

They thought that since Hong Jin was a minister of Dashang, there might be a reason why Hong Jin 
was killed in the mortal world. After they did not figure out the cause of the matter, these disciples 
would not rashly go to him. Hong Jin took revenge. In a palace on

Jin'ao Island , Our Lady of Jinling, Our Lady of Turtle Spirit, and Our Lady of Wudang were sitting 
together drinking tea. The three of them also received a message from their elder brother, Taoist 
Duobao. The three of them did not go immediately In the mortal world, the third-generation disciple 
Hong Jin was killed, and it was Dashang's imperial army general who killed Hong Jin. They 
guessed there should be a reason. The Holy Mother of Turtle Spirit looked at the Holy Mother of 
Golden Spirit and asked,



"Senior sister, should we go to Dashang to find out why Hong Jin was killed?"

Our Lady of Wudang frowned and shook her head and said,

"Guiling, the great catastrophe of becoming a god is coming, and none of the disciples of Jiejiao can 
leave Jin Ao. This is the teacher's order."(To read exciting novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Our Lady of Turtle Spirit curled her lips and said,

"Second Senior Sister, the teacher has gone into seclusion. Some of the disciples from Jin'ao Island 
were summoned to the mortal world by the senior brother. They are going to rob and kill the 
Imperial Guard general who killed Dashang. It doesn't matter if we go to the mortal world."

The Holy Mother Jin Ling heard the conversation between the two junior sisters, and she shook her 
head helplessly.

The third-generation disciple Hong Jin was killed.

Jiejiao should seek an explanation.

However, the great catastrophe of becoming a god was approaching, and senior brother Duobao 
actually summoned some Disciples emerge from the mortal world, doing so will cause many 
disciples to fall into the catastrophe of becoming gods. Our Lady of Jinling wants to stop those 
disciples who leave the island, but before Tongtian retreat, she asked senior brother Duobao to 
manage Jiejiao, and she cannot violate senior brother Duobao. Bao’s order.

The Golden Spirit Mother thought for a while and said with a serious face,

"You don’t need to say anything. I will inform my disciple Wen Zhong to check the cause of death 
of the third generation disciple Hong Jin. The great catastrophe of becoming a god is coming. Don’t 
leave Jin’ao Island."

"Yes, senior sister!"



A month later,

Su Chen was chased by Taoist Duobao for a month.

However,

Su Chen also captured three beautiful disciples of Jie Jiao, and there were also three more beautiful 
Jie Jiao disciples in the Demon Tower of Desire.

Hanzhixian , Fairy Caiyun, and the three daughters of Our Lady of Fire Spirit. Among the three of 
them, only Our Lady of Fire Spirit came to rob and kill him. Fairy Hanzhi and Fairy Caiyun were 
just unlucky to meet Su Chen. Su Chen frowned and whispered on a big mountain. ,

"Damn it, have all the disciples of Jie Jiao been dispatched? Why are there so many powerful auras 
around?"

Whoosh!

Su Chen fled here in a hurry, and the disciples of Jiejiao began to massacre him.

Although Su Chen knew the laws of space and time, and also had the best innate spiritual treasures 
and innate treasures in his hands.

But his cultivation level It was too low.

If Su Chen was surrounded by many strong men, he might not be able to escape. In

Chaoge City and the palace,

Su Daji also learned that Su Chen was in danger. The eldest disciple of Jiejiao was chasing Su 
Chen. Killing, this made her very worried. Su Daji didn't know whether Su Chen had the ability to 
escape the pursuit of a quasi-sage



, but she couldn't just stand by and watch. The recorded video she got from the captain of the Black 
Armored Legion , Su Daji also knew the cause and effect.

Su Daji thought about it and ordered,

"Come, Grand Master Xuan Wenzhong!"

"Yes, empress!"

Su Daji didn't think of how to save Su Chen, but the recorded video given to her by the Black 
Armored Corps, she thought, would make Jie Jiao give up his pursuit of Su Chen (Zhao Dezhao) 
and kill Xian.

If Jie Jiao still didn't give up on Su Chen, Su Daji could only hope that the Queen Mother of West 
Kunlun would save Su Chen.

After a while,

Wen Zhong came to Su Daji's palace.

He didn't know what Su Daji wanted to see him for.

Wen Zhong was very disdainful of Su Daji. He was used to King Zhou neglecting the government 
affairs. This was all Su Daji trying to trick King Zhou, but King Zhou was obsessed with women. 
Although he reminded him many times, it had no effect at all. King Zhou even let Su Daji handle 
the government affairs.

Wen Zhong If he hadn't seen that Su Daji was not a monster and that Su Daji had not messed up in 
handling state affairs in the past two months, Wen Zhong would have killed Su Daji who was in 
charge of the cholera government. Wen Zhong frowned and saluted Su Daji," The old minister Wen 
Zhong has seen Empress Su!"

"Wen Zhong, you should know about the Forbidden Army General Su Chen. You intercepted and 
killed the Imperial Army General of Dashang. You must give Dashang an explanation for this. Take 
a look at this photo stone first. This is General Su Chen’s subordinate today. The photo stone that 
was just delivered"
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When Wen Zhong heard Su Daji's words, he hurriedly took the photo stone. He also received a 
message from his teacher, Our Lady of Jinling, that Hong Jin, a third-generation disciple of Jiejiao, 
was killed, and it was the general of the Great Shang Imperial Army who killed Hong Jin.

Wen Zhong felt that something was fishy.

He hadn't had time to go to Sanshan Pass to check. Wen Zhong didn't expect that Su Daji also 
summoned him for Su Chen's matter.

Wen Zhong also knew the nature of Jie Jiao's disciples, who were unruly, arrogant, and even looked 
down on the human race. Jie Jiao's disciples who stayed in Dashang basically did it to enjoy the 
glory and wealth. Wen Zhong was also very angry with some Jie Jiao disciples.

After a while,

Wen Zhong looked at the image in the photo stone, and his face was very ugly. Hong Jin was 
arrogant and domineering, and even wanted to use Jiejiao to suppress others. If it were him, Wen 
Zhong would also kill him. Kill the arrogant Hong Jin

"Madam, I know what I have done. Hong Jin is arrogant, domineering and arrogant. He deserved to 
be killed by General Su Chen. I will send the photo stone back to Jiejiao."

Su Daji nodded and said,

"That would be troublesome for Grand Master. Grand Master, our dynasty has already lost King 
Wucheng Huang Feihu. If we lose the Forbidden Army General Su Chen again, this will affect the 
rule of Dashang over the surrounding princes."

"Xiqi has been recruiting troops and horses these years. Xibo Hou Jichang is plotting a rebellion. 
The king ignores the affairs of the government. In the future, he will need the Grand Master to do 
his best."

"Lao Chen understands!"



Wen Zhong looked at Su Daji unexpectedly.

He did not expect that Su Daji would say this. Is this still the demon concubine of the cholera 
government that Bigan and Shang Rong said?

Wen Zhong felt that Bigan and Shang Rong had wronged Su Daji.

He I have seen King Zhou.

King Zhou lived happily with beautiful women in his arms every day. He did not go to court, did 
not take charge of affairs, and fooled around with a group of beauties every day.

In the nearly two months since Wen Zhongping returned from rebellion, he had also seen what Su 
Daji did. Here, the government affairs are handled properly, and even the newly formed black 
armored legion is doing very well.

"Someone come!"

"Empress!"

"Wen Taishi, General Su has obtained a spiritual treasure, the Soul-Cutting Sword. I will hand it 
over to you today. If there are any rebels in the Shang Dynasty, regardless of their official position, 
Taishi can kill them first and then report them."

Wen Zhong did not expect that Su Daji would give him an acquired spiritual treasure, and also give 
him such great rights, which made him even more convinced that Su Daji would not cholera the 
government.

"Thank you, empress!"

Wen Zhong saluted and accepted the spirit-killing knife. After

Wen Zhong left, Su Daji rubbed her forehead and felt very helpless.



Empress Nuwa asked her to harm Dashang, but now she is actually working hard for Dashang.

Su Daji Daji was very worried that if Empress Nuwa knew about it, she might be killed by Empress 
Nuwa.

But for Su Chen,

Su Daji had to do this, and Su Chen gave her some acquired spiritual treasures to win over people. 
Although it was just some acquired spiritual treasures, Su Daji did not have any acquired spiritual 
treasures.

If Su Chen had not given her another high-grade innate spiritual treasure, Su Daji would not have 
been able to use the acquired spiritual treasures to win over people.

"Suchen? I really owed that bastard in my previous life."

Sanxian Island,

Su Chen came to Sanxian Island secretly at this moment.

He hid his aura all the way to Sanxian Island to avoid the limelight. If the Jiejiao disciples didn't 
know what was going on, they would chase him wherever he appeared. Get there.

Su Chen guessed that there was a spiritual treasure being tracked by the Jie Jiao disciples. This time 
he came to Sanxian Island from the prehistoric starry sky. If he was discovered by the Jie Jiao 
disciples again, Su Chen would have to be careful.

Su Chen checked I nodded when I saw Sanxian Island.

Sanxian Island is more picturesque than Skull Mountain, with clouds and mist, surrounded by fairy 
energy, spiritual flowers and grasses everywhere, and even some fairy beasts can be seen 
everywhere on Sanxian Island.



"The spiritual energy of Three Immortals Island is much richer than that of Skull Mountain, but the 
acquired spiritual energy is not as good as the innate spiritual energy. Yunxiao, Qiongxiao, and 
Bixiao don’t know if they are in Three Immortals Island."

Su Chen carefully checked on the Three Immortals Island.

Yun Xiao is a quasi-sage, Qiong Xiao and Bi Xiao are also Daluo Jinxian. Su Chen doesn't want to 
be caught by his woman Yun Xiao.

At this moment, (to read the Baoshuang novel, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

In the Demonic Tower of Desire,

Princess Longji, Empress Shiji, Fairy Caiyun, Madonna of the Fire Spirit, and Fairy Hanzhi, these 
five fairies are all huddled together naked at the moment.

They all have shameful and angry faces covering their faces.

There was no cover for their bodies, so the five of them could only huddle together to protect each 
other's bodies. It had been more than a month since they had been kept naked in the Lingbao, and 
the Fire Spirit Madonna and Shi Ji were attacking. After the Demonic Tower of Desire, they were 
all invaded by the demonic energy of desire, and the desire tortured them. This made the Fire Spirit 
Madonna and Shi Ji almost commit suicide in shame and anger.

"Who is that bastard?"

"I don’t know, I was just locked in the Lingbao for an instant"

"Fairy Caiyun and I were on the road when we were silently captured by that bastard and taken into 
the Lingbao."

"It was Su Chen, the general of the imperial army of Dashang. My teacher Duobao ordered the 
arrest of Su Chen, the general of the imperial army of Dashang. I was received in this spiritual 
treasure when I was about to arrest Su Chen."



Shi Ji and the five girls of the Fire Spirit Madonna were huddled together and talking.

They wanted to know who caught them and what the bastard was going to do if he caught them.

Han Zhixian said doubtfully,

"Suchen? Dashang’s Imperial Guard General? Fire Spirit, why does he want to arrest us?"

Our Lady of Fire Spirit protected her body and said with a blushing face,"Su Chen killed Hong Jin, 
our third-generation disciple of Jie Jiao. I guess Su Chen's arrest of us has something to do with Jie 
Jiao's pursuit of that bastard."

Princess Long Ji said with a face of shame and anger,

"Damn it, you are all disciples of Jie Jiao, and I am the princess of Heaven. That shameless bastard 
not only offended Jie Jiao, does he also want to offend Heaven?

Fairy Caiyun squatted on the ground and said helplessly,"We have to find a way to escape from this 
spiritual treasure now.""

Han Zhixian reminded hurriedly,

"No, we can't attack Lingbao anymore. You have also seen the fate of Our Lady of Fire Spirit and 
Shi Ji. This is a magic weapon. Attacking Lingbao will be invaded by desire."

The other fairies nodded.

They didn't want to try the way Madonna of the Fire Spirit and Shi Ji were invaded by the demonic 
energy of desire. They didn't want to experience human lust. Su Chen sneaked in carefully Three 
Immortals Island, while looking at the scenery in the Demonic Tower of Desire. Among the five 
fairies in the Demonic Tower of Desire, Hanzhixian has the most perfect figure and the biggest 
mountain. Princess Longji has the fairest and most delicate skin. It’s like It’s like they’ve been 
soaked in milk. The other girls are also good, with curvy figures and fair and delicate skin. These 
five fairies are also very beautiful in the ancient fairy world. Although they are not as good as the 
top fairies like Yun Xiao and the Queen Mother, But they are in the prehistoric fairy world, and the 
five fairies, Princess Longji, also belong to the second echelon of beautiful fairies.



"I asked, who is taking a bath in the fairy pool in front? Yunxiao? Qiong Xiao? Or Bi Xiaoyi?".
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On Three Immortals Island,

Su Chen found a fairy bathing in the fairy pond in front of him.

He was stunned when he saw it. The fairy in the fairy pond was carrying him on her back. Su Chen 
could only see the smooth and white back of the fairy. He I dare not check who the fairy is in the 
fairy pond.

Yunxiao, Qiongxiao, and Bixiao are all stronger than him. If Su Chen uses his soul to check the 
fairies in the fairy pool, he will definitely be noticed by the fairies in the fairy pool.

Su Chen touched his chin and guessed,

"Is it Yunxiao? This back looks a bit like Yunxiao, but Qiongxiao’s back is almost the same as 
Yunxiao, damn! Is this Yunxiao? Or Qiong Xiao?"

Su Chen thought about it and decided to meet this fairy.

No matter whether the person in the fairy pool is Yunxiao or Qiongxiao, Su Chen has a way to deal 
with them.

In the bathing pool,

Yunxiao is running around the fairy spring and resting.

She today Feeling a little irritated,

Zhao Gongming, the eldest brother of the three Yunxiao sisters, also went to hunt down Su Chen, 
the imperial general of Dashang, a few days ago.



Yunxiao has reminded Zhao Gongming not to be impulsive.

The Catastrophe of Conferring Gods is coming 28, and she does not want Zhao Gongming to be 
involved in a big disaster. In the midst of the disaster, the upright and bold Zhao Gongming insisted 
on avenging his fellow sect. Yunxiao tried to persuade her to no avail. She felt very bad these days.

"who?"

Whoosh! Boom!

Suddenly,

Yunxiao felt a strange aura. She put on her dress in an instant and slapped it to the side.

"I'm here, Yunxiao, don't do anything, it's me!"

Whoosh!

Su Chen didn't expect that just after he revealed his breath, he would be discovered by Yun Xiao.

Su Chen avoided Yun Xiao's attack and breathed a sigh of relief.

The fairy in the bath was Yun Xiao. Su Chen wanted to convince the gentle and virtuous Yun Xiao 
that it was Yun Xiao. It was very easy.

Yunxiao stood in the sky with a cold face. She saw that the person who appeared was the human 
race that her senior brother Duobao sent the message to, which made her angry.

"Su Chen, General of the Great Shang Forbidden Army, you slaughtered the Jie Jiao disciples and 
dared to break into Sanxian Island to peek at me bathing. You are seeking death!"

Come on!



Gentle and virtuous Yun Xiao?

Damn it!

Why did Yun Xiao have such a hot temper before?

Su Chen saw Yun Xiao slap him again, and he hurriedly escaped and left.

Boom!

After a while,

Su Chen shook the mountain. A big hole was discovered where the place was located.

"Still want to escape? The Three Immortals Island Formation has been activated. You are a scumbag 
in the Nascent Soul Realm. I think you can escape there."

Yunxiao didn't expect Su Chen to dodge her attack. She waved her hand and activated the formation 
of Sanxian Island.

Yunxiao sensed Su Chen's breath and chased after her.

She was taking a bath just now, and this human race sneaked into Sanxian Island. Yunxiao didn't 
know if Su Chen had spied on her

, but she couldn't let this shameless human go if he dared to spy on her.

Su Chen instantly appeared behind a mountain on Sanxian Island, and he didn't hide it Breath, after 
a while,

Su Chen saw Yun Xiao chasing after him, he hurriedly waved his hand and said,

"Yunxiao, you're here. I have something to do with you this time, so don't do anything yet.



Yun Xiao saw Su Chen waving his hand and attacked,"You human thief, die!""

"I go!"

Boom!

Su Chen hurriedly dodged the attack.

He was very speechless when he appeared in the air of Sanxian Island. Yunxiao didn't listen to his 
explanation at all.

How could he deal with Yunxiao?

Yunxiao saw Su Chen dodged her attack again. , which made her a little confused. How could this 
scumbag of a human race avoid his attacks twice?

Although Yunxiao's attack just now was not with full strength, it was impossible for Jinxian to 
block his attack.

A scumbag of a human race. , (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Could it be that this shameless human race has hidden his cultivation?

Is he a strong man?

"Human Race, you actually hid your cultivation level. It seemed to me that I underestimated you 
just now."

"Yunxiao, please listen to my explanation first.....Damn it, top-grade innate spiritual treasure 
Hunyuan Golden Dou!"

Su Chen waved his hands to Yun Xiao and shouted to Yun Xiao in a hurry.



But before he finished speaking,

Su Chen saw that Yun Xiao had taken out the Hunyuan Golden Dou. Was Yun Xiao going to use the 
spirit treasure to kill him?

Yun Xiao held it in one hand. Hunyuan Jindou said indifferently to Su Chen,

"Su Chen, General of the Great Shang Imperial Army, I didn’t want to kill you originally, but you 
dared to break into Sanxian Island and even dared to peek at me. You will die no matter what this 
time."

"go!"

Boom!

Holy shit!

Su Chen saw Yunxiao launching the Hunyuan Golden Dou, and he hurriedly wanted to escape.

Damn it,

Su Chen didn't want the Hunyuan Golden Dou to destroy his Taiyi Golden Immortal cultivation.

Eh?

Su Chen just launched When Space Principle was about to escape, he found that although Hunyuan 
Jindou quickly attacked him, Hunyuan Jindou did not burst out with a powerful attack aura. 
Hunyuan Jindou was spinning around him like a puppy..

Damn it!

What is going on?



Su Chen looked at Hunyuan Jindou in confusion as he circled around him.

He was confused now.

Su Chen couldn't figure out whether it was Yunxiao not killing him? Or Hunyuan Jindou. Don’t kill 
yourself.

Yun Xiao shouted in surprise,

"How can this be? Why is Hunyuan Jindou out of control?"

Yunxiao watched Hunyuan Jindou circling around Su Chen without launching an attack on Su 
Chen, which shocked her.

Yunxiao had completely refined Hunyuan Jindou, and Hunyuan Jindou could not be attacked again. 
210 Other people were in control. Hunyuan Jindou lost control this time. She was so confused that 
she couldn't understand.

"Hunyuan Jindou!"

After Su Chen called out to Hunyuan Jindou, Hunyuan Jindou appeared in Su Chen's hand instantly.

Su Chen looked at the Hunyuan Jindou in his hand, and he had some guesses in his heart. ,

Su Chen was very familiar with Hunyuan Jindou.

Empress Yunxiao would be his woman in future generations, and Hunyuan Jindou was also 
upgraded to the best innate spiritual treasure by him using top-quality immortal-level materials.

Su Chen felt that he should have the future generations of Hunyuan in him. The aura of Yuan 
Jindou, so Hunyuan Jindou in the Conferred God Period would not attack him.

Su Chen played with Hunyuan Jindou and said,



"Yunxiao, I came here just to find you. It was just a misunderstanding. Did you see it? There is a 
connection between us, as evidenced by Hunyuan Jindou."

Yun Xiao looked at Su Chen indifferently and said coldly,

"origin? Shameless human race, I have no connection with you, so give me Hunyuan Jindou."

After Su Chen returned Hunyuan Jindou to Yunxiao, he rubbed his forehead and said,

"Yunxiao, your ears are red. Whenever you are angry, your ears will be red. Also, there is a mark on 
your left thigh, which is a mark of Yunduo. Qiongxiao and Bixiao also have it on their thighs."

"who are you? How do you know this?".
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Su Chen told Yun Xiao these secrets because he didn't want Yun Xiao to continue to attack him.

Yun Xiao knew that he was the general of the Great Shang Forbidden Army.

Su Chen guessed that Duobao informed all the Jie Jiao disciples, and even his image was passed on 
to All Jiejiao disciples.

Su Chen just peeped on Yun Xiao bathing again.

Whether Yun Xiao wanted to avenge Hong Jin, the third-generation disciple of Jie Jiao, or because 
he wanted to kill Yun Xiao just because he peeped at him, Su Chen had to make Yun Xiao 
temporarily put down her attacks on him.

"who are you? How do you know this?"

After Yun Xiao heard Su Chen's words, she was very surprised.



Yun Xiao's ears would turn red when she was angry, and there was also the Yun Duo mark on her 
left thigh. No one else knew about these, not even their eldest brother Zhao Gongming..

Yunxiao thought that even if Su Chen discovered this after peeping on her earlier, what about 
Qiongxiao and Bixiao?

Yunxiao, Qiongxiao, and Bixiao all have the same Yunduo mark, even in the same part. It is 
impossible for Su Chen to know all this..

Su Chen walked towards Yun Xiao and said with a smile,"Yun Xiao, you are my woman, I know 
everything about you."

Yun Xiao heard Su Chen's words and said coldly and threateningly,

"Xio's nonsense, human race, if you dare to talk nonsense again, I will kill you immediately. Tell 
me, how do you know this?"

Su Chen came not far from Yunxiao.

He looked at the cold and beautiful Yunxiao and continued, 583"Yunxiao, what I said is true. Have 
you always liked to wear milky white underwear for millions of years? Or are your little feet always 
cold?"

Su Chen knew everything about Yun Xiao.

After all, they had been sleeping together for several years. Yun Xiao also told her many secrets. 
Yun Xiao even told him some secrets about Qiong Xiao and Bi Xiao. Pass

"you....."

Yun Xiao looked at Su Chen in confusion at this moment.

How could Su Chen know some of her secrets?



Yunxiao couldn't find any reason to doubt Su Chen. Even Qiongxiao and Bixiao didn't know some 
of her privacy, but this human race actually knew everything. Yunxiao looked at Su Chen and felt 
incredible.

Seeing that Yun Xiao believed his words, Su Chen hurriedly continued,

"Yunxiao, I know you are very confused, but these are absolutely true. I also got this information in 
a dream. You will be my woman from now on."

"In a dream?"

"Well, it was in a dream. In the dream, you would become a Taoist couple with me after the Great 
Tribulation of the Gods, so I knew everything about you."

Su Chen had no choice.

Heavenly Ladder wouldn't let him reveal what happened in future generations. Su Chen could only 
use dreams to deceive Yun (ciej) Xiao.

"I still don't believe it!"

"Yunxiao, as long as you don't attack me, you will know whether what I said is true."

"Su Chen, the general of the Great Shang Forbidden Army, then why did you kill Hong Jin, a 
disciple of Jie Jiao?"

"It’s like this, Dashang Sanshan Guan Hongjin and below committed the crime......"

Yun Xiao nodded when he heard Su Chen's words.

If it was true as Su Chen said, Hong Jin, the third-generation disciple of Jiejiao, would have been 
killed unjustly.



However, this shameless human race peeped on her bathing. Yun Xiao had a very bad impression of 
Su Chen.

She thought about becoming a Taoist couple with Su Chen in the future, Yun Xiao's expression was 
cold and she clenched her fists tightly.

How could she have a Taoist partner in the future?

Moreover, the Taoist couple is still a shameless human race.

Whizzing!

At this time,

Qiong Xiao and Bi Xiao suddenly appeared next to Yun Xiao. When they were in retreat just now, 
Sanxian Island was shaken, and the sisters quickly left the retreat to find out what happened.

Bixiao looked at Su Chen and asked Yunxiao,

"Sister, what happened? Who is this human race? How did he come to our Sanxian Island?

Qiong Xiao frowned and asked with a cold face,"Sister, how come this human race appears on our 
Three Immortals Island?""

Yunxiao saw Qiongxiao and Bixiao arriving. She glared at Su Chen and warned him not to talk 
nonsense. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Yunxiao opened her mouth and explained,

"Second sister, third sister, you are in seclusion and don’t know something. Senior Brother Duobao 
Taoist has informed Jiejiao disciples to......"

After Qiong Xiao and Bi Xiao heard Yun Xiao's words, they both looked at Su Chen in surprise.



They did not expect that Su Chen actually killed Hong Jin from the Heavenly Immortal Realm.

Although this was Hong Jin seeking death, a Nascent Soul Realm person How could Zhazha kill a 
Celestial Immortal?

Bixiao shouted in surprise,

"Did this human race kill Hong Jin? Sister, how is this possible? This human race is a scum in the 
Nascent Soul Realm. No matter how useless Hong Jin is, he is still an immortal. How could this 
scum kill Hong Jin?"

Qiong Xiao looked at Su Chen coldly and said coldly,

"Little sister, this human race should have hidden its realm of cultivation."

Su Chen was sitting on a stone at the moment.

After he saw Qiong Xiao and Bi Xiao arriving, Su Chen didn't plan to say anything to Qiong Xiao 
and Bi Xiao.

Even if Yun Xiao didn't warn him,

Su Chen wouldn't talk to Qiong Xiao. Xiao and Bixiao talk nonsense a lot,

Qiongxiao is indifferent and taciturn, and looks cold all day long, keeping away from strangers.

Bixiao is a lively and lovely beauty.

As long as she talks to people she knows, Bixiao can talk endlessly. Speaking of which.

However,



Qiongxiao and Bixiao are both very beautiful, with graceful figures, proudly standing mountains, 
and fairy-like and noble temperaments. One is cold and wants to be conquered, and the other is 
lively and cute. With love in their arms, Qiongxiao and Bixiao could barely be regarded as the top 
beauties in the world.

Yunxiao nodded and said,

"That's right, don't underestimate this.....Human race, I just took two random shots and didn't hurt 
him at all.

Bixiao asked Yunxiao,"Sister, do we want to hand over this human general to our senior brother?""

After Su Chen heard the words of the little beauty Bixiao, he rolled his eyes and said to 
Bixiao,"Bixiao, your sister has explained clearly that Hong Jin deserves to die, why do you still 
want to hand me over? Bi

Xiao put her hands on his small waist and shouted proudly,

"Your name is Su Chen, right? Although our Jie Jiao disciple Hong Jin deserved his death, he was 
still a Jie Jiao disciple. You killed a Jie Jiao disciple without Jie Jiao's permission. This is an offense 
to our Jie Jiao."

Su Chen sneered when he heard Bi Xiao's words,

"Hey, Bixiao, since Hong Jin joined the world and joined the Great Shang, everything he did abides 
by the laws of the Great Shang. If you trigger the law, you will die. You Jiejiao can't control the 
laws of the human race."

Bixiao became angry when she heard Su Chen's words. A little scumbag dared to slander Jie Jiao 
with such shamelessness.

Bixiao looked at Su Chen and shouted maliciously,"Little scumbag, are you preaching to me? ?"

Su Chen looked at Bixiao and said speechlessly,



"Little scumbag? Bixiao, believe it or not, I can suppress you with one hand! Bixiao threatened Su 
Chen with clenched fists,"You are so impudent, little scumbag, do you want me to teach you a 
lesson?""

Bi Xiao said and took out her top-grade innate spiritual treasure golden dragon scissors.

She wanted Su Chen to taste the power of golden dragon scissors.

An ignorant little scum of the human race. Bi Xiao did not believe that she could not suppress this 
arrogance. Bastard.

When Su Chen saw Bi Xiao taking out the golden scissors, he smiled and waved,

"Golden Dragon Scissors, come here!".
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Su Chen was no stranger to the innate high-grade spiritual treasure Golden Dragon Scissors. Su Yan 
had also played with Bixiao's Golden Dragon Scissors for some time.

That girl Su Yan had been pestering him for a long time, asking him to refine the Golden Dragon 
Scissors, but he had no choice but to refine the Golden Dragon Scissors into the best innate spiritual 
treasure.

For this reason,

Su Chen also wasted a lot of top-grade immortal materials.

When Bixiao heard Su Chen call Golden Dragon Scissors, she curled her lips and seemed to laugh.

This idiot,

Golden Dragon Scissors is her spiritual treasure, and Bixiao has also completely refined Golden 
Dragon Scissors. This idiot human race still wants to Summoning her golden dragon scissors was 
simply wishful thinking.



Whoosh!

"Golden dragon scissors, how is this possible?"

Bixiao was about to taunt Su Chen, but she didn't expect that the golden scissors would suddenly 
lose control.

Bixiao wanted to control the golden scissors that struggled to fly out, but the golden scissors still 
fell from her"917" hand. Flying towards Su Chen, Bi Xiao looked at the golden scissors that Su 
Chen lightly grabbed with a confused expression.

Yunxiao looked at Su Chen and started thinking.

She didn't expect that Su Chen could control the golden scissors.

Su Chen Chen was able to control her Hunyuan Golden Dou before, and now she can control 
Bixiao's Golden Dragon Scissors.

Yunxiao believed eight points of what Su Chen said, and the remaining two points were due to Su 
Chen's peeping on her. Yunxiao believed Su Chen's words. Chen peeked at her bathing and still 
didn't put it down.

Qiong Xiao felt very incredible at the moment.

The golden dragon scissors were her little sister's spiritual treasure. How could this human race 
control the golden dragon scissors?

Qiong Xiao thought of her spiritual treasure tied with the fairy rope, and she He was worried that 
his spiritual treasure would also be controlled by Su Chen.

Su Chen played with the golden dragon scissors in his hand and said with a smile,

"Little beauty Bixiao, your golden scissors don’t seem to like you?



Bixiao glared at Su Chen and shouted angrily,"Shameless human race, please return my golden 
scissors quickly.""

"Che, yours? You ask Golden Dragon Shear to see if it agrees?"

Su Chen curled her lips and smiled at Bixiao.

The little beauty Bixiao is really a little tiger girl. She no longer has the golden scissors in her 
hands, and now she still dares to yell at him. Bixiao is indeed brave enough to do it. Stunned Qing 
who takes action from the saint

"Damn it, human race, you are looking for death!"

After Bixiao heard what Su Chen said, she punched Su Chen with an angry face, and a terrifying 
beam of light quickly attacked Su Chen, boom!

"Space moves!"

Su Chen saw Bi Xiao attacking him. He hurriedly used the law of space to deflect Bi Xiao's attack. 
With a bang, a fairy mountain dozens of miles away was shattered and collapsed.

A big Luo Jinxian,

Su Chen really couldn't help it. Why do you care?

He might not be able to defeat the Quasi-Sage, but Su Chen can suppress a Daluo Jinxian without 
using any spiritual treasure.

Yun Xiao looked at Su Chen unexpectedly.

Su Chen said before that he could suppress Bi Xiao with just one hand.



She didn't believe it, but Su Chen After Chen used the law of space, Yunxiao was a little convinced, 
and Su Chen's realm was at least Daluo Jinxian, otherwise this shameless bastard would not have 
known the law of space.

"Bixiao, stop!"

"Big sister?"

Bi Xiao was about to attack Su Chen again. She didn't expect that her eldest sister Yun Xiao would 
stop her, which made her confused.

Yun Xiao coldly shouted to Su Chen,"Su Chen, return the golden scissors to my sister."

"Cough, Yunxiao, me....."

"Give it back to my sister!"

"Okay, I'll give it back!"

Damn it,

Yun Xiao was really domineering in the past.

This is nothing like the gentle Yun Xiao Empress in later generations. (To read Baoshuang novels, 
go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen casually returned the golden scissors to Bi Xiao ,

Yunxiao is his wife, well, she is the wife of future generations, he still has to give this face to 
Yunxiao.

Yunxiao looked at Su Chen and said coldly,



"Su Chen, come with us to the palace. I still have many things to ask you."

"good!"

Su Chen nodded and agreed.

He now has to avoid Jie Jiao's pursuit of him.

If Jie Jiao's tracking Lingbao doesn't find him in Sanxian Island, Su Chen can also stay in Sanxian 
Island to hide for a while. , he could even contact Yunxiao to establish a relationship.

Qiongxiao and Bixiao looked at Yunxiao with some doubts. Although they didn't want to care about 
Su Chen killing the Jiejiao disciples, why did their eldest sister invite this human race to stay on 
Sanxian Island? ?If the elder brother Duobao finds out about this, the three sisters may be punished 
by the elder brother Duobao.

Chaos, Wa Palace!

A gorgeous woman is sitting on the futon. She is the only female saint among the seven saints in the 
prehistoric times. Wa is also the Virgin Mother of the human race.

The saint Nuwa is sitting on the futon, holding her chin in one hand and frowning. She has noticed 
the changes in the great businessman of the human race. The vixen Su Daji still followed her orders 
at the beginning.

But since the third Months ago, it seemed that Su Daji no longer acted according to her orders. 
Although Nuwa did not care about these, she only asked Su Daji to destroy the fortune of Dashang, 
and she did not care about persecuting those mortals...........

However,

Su Daji had changed too much before and after, and Nuwa felt that Su Chen's appearance might be 
the fundamental reason.



"The Great Tribulation of the Gods is approaching, the world is in chaos, and I can't see the future 
direction. However, how can that Su Chen make me feel an inexplicable sense of closeness? What 
relationship does he have with himself, a saint?"

Nu Wa thought about it and decided to meet Su Chen.

However,

Nu Wa first wanted to see if Su Chen could escape Jie Jiao's pursuit. A Taiyi Golden Immortal 
actually disguised himself as a Nascent Soul Realm, and she She didn't see it at first.

Nuwa was very speechless about Su Chen's pretending to be a pig and eating a tiger.

Taiyi Golden Immortal?

Nascent Soul Realm?

This is a huge difference.

Nuwa felt that Su Chen was more powerful than some prehistoric people. Still insidious.

Half a month later,

Jie Jiao!

After receiving the image stone from Wen Zhong, Our Lady of Jinling immediately notified all Jie 
Jiao disciples to stop chasing Su Chen, and even sent the image of the photo stone to They also 
passed it on to all the disciples.

In the palace of Our Lady of Jin Ling,

Our Lady of Jin Ling, Our Lady of Wudang, and Our Lady of Turtle Spirit, the three of them were 
sitting together watching and talking. Our Lady of Turtle Spirit asked doubtfully,



"Senior sister, do you think senior brother will agree to stop chasing that Su Chen?"

The Holy Mother of the Golden Spirit said with a serious face,

"You have to agree if you don't agree. This matter is Hong Jin's own fault. Even if the teacher 
comes out of seclusion on 5.2, the teacher can't care about Hong Jin's life and death."

"Besides, Dashang has a close relationship with our Jiejiao. Our Jiejiao has always relied on 
Dashang to obtain the luck of the human race. It is impossible for the teacher to embarrass an 
important general of Dashang for a traitor."

Our Lady of Wudang stood up from her futon and said,

"Senior sister, why don't I go to Dashang? I want to meet the general of the imperial army of 
Dashang."

After Madonna Jin Ling heard what Madonna Wudang said, she asked speculatively,

"Wudang, do you feel that Su Chen feels familiar?"

Our Lady of Wudang nodded and replied,"Well, ever since I saw Su Chen's image, Su Chen's 
appearance has been appearing in my mind, and I can't explain why."

"Wudang, I'm just like you these days. Su Chen's appearance has been appearing in my mind 
recently, which makes me puzzled."

Chapter 2349

The Holy Mother of Jin Ling did not expect that the Holy Mother of Wudang was the same as her. 
They only kept thinking of Su Chen after seeing Su Chen's images,

Su Chen?

A human race?



Or a Nascent Soul Realm scumbag?

How could their senior sisters be related to Su Chen?

Madam Guiling was confused at this moment.

Madonna Jinling and Madonna Wudang both had Su Chen's appearance in their minds. Why didn't 
the human race's appearance appear in her mind?

The three of them, the junior sisters, have been advancing and retreating together. Mother Turtle 
Spirit doesn't want her to become special.

However, the appearance of that scumbag really doesn't appear in her mind.

Mother Turtle Spirit is a little irritated by this.

Our Lady of Jinling thought for a while and said,

"Wudang, don't go to Dashang now. Let's wait and see about this matter. If we still keep thinking 
about Su Chen, it won't be too late for us to go to Dashang."

"All right!"

Our Lady of Wudang nodded and agreed.

She understood what Our Lady of Jinling meant.

Although Our Lady of Wudang was curious about Su Chen, the Great Tribulation of the Gods was 
coming, and she did not want to be involved in the Tribulation of the Gods. They also didn’t want to 
involve the sisters in the Great Catastrophe of Conferring Gods.

Then,



Holy Mother Jin Ling and Wudang Sheng both looked at Madonna Guiling, and Su Chen’s 
appearance kept appearing in their minds. Where is Madonna Guiling? Is Madonna Guiling

?

Same as them?

"Senior Sister, Second Senior Sister, I am just like you. During this period, Su Chen also appeared 
in my mind."

Mother Guiling saw that Mother Golden Spirit and Mother Wudang were looking at her.

She hurriedly lied and said,

Mother Guiling had no choice. She didn't want to lie to the two senior sisters, but she didn't want to 
be an exception among the senior sisters.

Su Chen ?

It’s all that damn human race!

Our Lady of the Turtle Spirit decided that if she met the human race Su Chen, she would definitely 
teach that little scumbag a lesson.

After the Holy Mother of the Golden Spirit and Our Lady of Wudang heard the words of the Holy 
Mother of the Turtle Spirit, they felt that Su Chen They are all related to their fellow apprentices, 
but none of them have ever met that human race. How could they be related to that scumbag? On

Sanxian Island,

Su Chen rubbed his waist and walked out of a room. He Not with a woman. It has been five days.



Su Chen has been refining the spirit treasure day and night for five days. He refined Yunxiao into 
the Hunyuan Golden Dou. Today he finally advanced the Hunyuan Golden Dou to The best innate 
spiritual treasure.

For this reason,

Su Chen consumed some of the best immortal materials.

When Yunxiao saw Su Chen coming out of seclusion, she hurriedly asked,

"Su Chen, was it successful?"

Su Chen handed the Hunyuan Golden Dou to Yun Xiao and said,

"Nonsense, Yunxiao, if you don’t become my Taoist companion in the future, I will take back the 
Hunyuan Golden Dou."

"Shameless!"

Yunxiao took the Hunyuan Golden Dou and shouted angrily.

After she checked the Hunyuan Golden Dou,

Yunxiao was very happy. The Hunyuan Golden Dou, a top-grade innate spiritual treasure, is now a 
top-grade innate spiritual treasure. She didn't expect Su Chen to really advance Hunyuan Jindou.

Half a month ago, after Yun Xiao learned why Hunyuan Jindou and Jin Jiaojian would be controlled 
by Su Chen, she was very shocked.

Su Chen actually advanced to the level of Hunyuan Golden Dou and Golden Dragon Scissors in his 
dream.

To advance to Lingbao, you need to use a lot of immortal materials, and they are also the best 
immortal materials.



Yun Xiao didn't know if what Su Chen said was true. But she had an idea in her mind. If Su Chen 
could really advance to the level of Lingbao, Yunxiao would believe everything Su Chen said.

Now,

Su Chen had really advanced Hunyuan Jindou to the top level of innate Lingbao, which made 
Yunxiao feel very sad. Uneasy, could she really be this bastard Taoist monk in the future?

Su Chen crossed his arms and smiled,

"Yunxiao, you have believed my words. We are destined to be married, and you will be my Taoist 
companion from now on."

When Yun Xiao heard Su Chen's words, she was very ashamed and angry. (To read Baoshuang 
novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

This shameless human race is destined to be married by fate?

A Taoist monk?

She was very speechless about Su Chen's shamelessness.

Yun Xiao didn't want to Seeing this shameless pervert again, she said with a cold face,

"Su Chen, you can leave Sanxian Island now. Jiejiao has terminated his pursuit of you. Sanxian 
Island does not welcome you now."

I guess!

Is this killing a donkey by killing a person?

Su Chen has just promoted Yunxiao to Lingbao, and before he has a chance to take a rest, Yunxiao 
is going to drive him away?



Is this killing a donkey too fast by killing a donkey?

However,

Jie Jiao actually ended the pursuit of him?

This made Su Chen not think about it.

How could Jie Jiao end the pursuit of him for no reason? Did someone help him?

Su Chen said to Yun Xiao speechlessly,

"Yunxiao, I'm going to stay on Sanxian Island for a few days. You should at least let me rest and 
recover my mana. Yun

Xiaozou frowned and looked at Su Chen and said,"Hmph, three days. Leave Sanxian Island for me 
in three days.""

"knew!"

Su Chen curled his lips and left.

He was going to bask in the sun and have a good rest. He had been busy for five days and his mana 
was almost exhausted.

After Yunxiao returned to her palace,

Qiongxiao and Bixiao Quickly appearing next to Yun Xiao, Bi Xiao anxiously asked Yun 
Xiao,"Sister, is your Hunyuan Jindou really promoted to the top innate spiritual treasure?"

"Not bad, take a look!"



Yun Xiao smiled and took out Hunyuan Jindou.

Hunyuan Jindou was promoted to the best innate spirit treasure by Su Chen. Her strength can be 
increased by nearly 50%.

With the best innate spirit treasure Hunyuan Jindou here,

Yunxiao is the best. Even if she is defeated by the Quasi-Saint at the peak of the Quasi-Saint, she 
will still lose, eh! The premise is that the Quasi-Saint at the peak does not have a powerful spiritual 
treasure. After

Bixiao took the Hunyuan Golden Dou to check, her eyes lit up Yes,

"That scumbag really advanced to the Hunyuan Golden Dou. No, I also want that scumbag to 
advance to the Golden Dragon Scissors. It is a top-notch innate spiritual treasure. I also want to 
have a top-grade innate spiritual treasure."

Bixiao said (Li Mo) and disappeared in an instant.

She wanted to find Su Chentan quickly.

If Su Chen can upgrade the Hunyuan Golden Dou to the top innate spiritual treasure, her Golden 
Dragon Scissors Su Chen will definitely be able to advance as well. , Bixiao didn't want to miss this 
good opportunity.

When Qiongxiao saw Bixiao leaving quickly, she also wanted to find Su Chen.

Qiongxiao's fairy binding rope was just a low-grade innate spiritual treasure, and her spiritual 
treasure was not as good as Yunxiao's. If Yunxiao and Bixiao's spiritual treasures are promoted to 
the top-grade innate spiritual treasures, she will still be a low-grade innate spiritual treasure.

From now on,

Qiong Xiao will have no shame to take out her spiritual treasures again.



Qiong Xiao Embarrassed, he said to Yunxiao,"Sister, I.....I'll go find Su Chen too"

"Go ahead, second sister, your spirit treasure binding fairy rope is just a low-grade innate spirit 
treasure. I guess Su Chen has a top quality innate spirit treasure in his hand. You don’t need to ask 
Su Chen to upgrade you to the fairy binding rope. Just ask Su Chen directly. I want a top-quality 
innate spiritual treasure"

Chapter 2350

Yunxiao guessed that Su Chen should have the best innate spirit treasure in his hand.

Otherwise, why didn't Su Chen care about her Hunyuan Golden Dou

?

Determined to win, even at the expense of their lives - they will compete for innate spiritual 
treasures.

But Su Chen saw that Hunyuan Jindou was not greedy at all, and even looked disgusted. Yunxiao 
guessed that Su Chen had the best innate spiritual treasure in his hand, or even an innate treasure.

"I understand, sister!"

Qiong Xiao looked at Yun Xiao unexpectedly.

She didn't expect Yun Xiao to say that.

He was just a scumbag human race.

Would Su Chen have the best innate spiritual treasure?

And how could Yun Xiao know Su Chen so well? That What is the relationship between the 
scumbag human race and her eldest sister Yun Xiao?

At this moment,



Bi Xiao was pestering Su Chen to ask him to advance her golden dragon. Su Chen lay on the grass 
with his eyes closed and ignored Bi Xiao.

Bi Xiao faced Su Chen. Chen kept shouting,

"Human race, scumbag, Su Chen, did you hear what I said? Quickly upgrade me to the Golden 
Dragon Scissors. I want you to upgrade my Golden Dragon Scissors to the top grade innate spiritual 
treasure."

"Little beauty Bixiao, it’s not dark yet. If you want to dream, you’d better wait until dark."

"Little scumbag, hurry up and give my golden dragon scissors a promotion, or I won’t let you go."

"Here you go, advance yourself!"

Su Chen opened his eyes and took out a crystal and threw it to Bi Xiao. He wants to recover his 
magic power now. If the little beauty Bi Xiao really attacks him, Su Chen will run away. He doesn't 
want to move at all now.

Bi Xiao After Xiao took the crystal that Su Chen threw to her, she looked at the crystal in her hand 
and shouted in surprise,

"Chaos Spiritual Crystal?"

Bixiao looked at Su Chen with a confused face,

Chaos Spirit Crystal?

Chaos Spirit Crystal is not even her master Tongtian Cult Master.

Bixiao heard that



Chaos Spirit Crystal was produced in Chaos, and it was in Chaos Storm. Only in his eyes, Chaos 
Spiritual Crystal is the best among the best immortal-grade weapon refining materials, and it is also 
a necessity to advance to the best innate spirit treasure and innate treasure. How could this little 
scumbag have Chaos Spirit Crystal?

Whoosh!

Qiong Xiao appeared in an instant. In front of Su Chen, she did not look at the confused Bi Xiao.

Qiong Xiao looked uncomfortable and said directly to Su Chen,

"Su Chen, I want a top-quality innate spiritual treasure. My eldest sister Yunxiao asked me to come 
and ask you for it."

What the hell,

Qiong Xiao wants a top-quality innate spiritual treasure?

And Yunxiao asked Qiong Xiao to come and ask him for it?

Damn it, you prodigal bitch!

Su Chen looked at the cold Qiong Xiao in confusion, he I never thought that Yunxiao would let him 
give Qiong Xiao a top-quality innate spiritual treasure.

Is the top-quality innate spiritual treasure a big cabbage?

He has several top-quality innate spiritual treasures in his hand, but these are all the best among the 
best innate spiritual treasures. Su Chen If Qiong Xiao was given a top-quality innate spiritual 
treasure, he would be very jealous.

Su Chen shook his head speechlessly and said,



"Qiong Xiao, you see that I am just a scumbag in the Nascent Soul realm. Do you think I have the 
best innate spiritual treasure?"

Qiong Xiao said indifferently,

"You have it, my eldest sister said you have it, you have it, and you are not a Nascent Soul Realm 
scumbag."

"I'll do it!"

Su Chen was helpless.

Yun Xiao must have guessed something.

Well,

Su Chen had already known and left earlier.

Bi Xiao was even more confused at this moment.

She just came to ask Su Chen to advance her to the Golden Dragon Scissor.

Where is Qiong Xiao?

Her second sister Qiong Xiao is more direct.

Qiong Xiao actually wants to ask Su Chen for a top-quality innate spiritual treasure. Bixiao feels 
bad looking at the Chaos Spiritual Crystal in her hand.

At this moment, (reading the Baoshuang novel, just Go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Yun Xiao looked at Su Chen with a smile on her face. She just wanted to see Su Chen's confused 
and helpless look.



A shameless scumbag still wants to be his Taoist companion?

However,

Yun Xiao wants to know that Su Chen is confused and helpless. Does Chen have a top-grade innate 
spiritual treasure in his hand?

Su Chen’s origin is mysterious, a human race?

How could a human race upgrade a top-grade innate spiritual treasure to a top-grade innate spiritual 
treasure?

This is impossible even for a saint.

"Su Chen, where are you from?"

Outside the palace,

Su Chen, Qiong Xiao, and Bi Xiao didn't speak again.

Su Chen lay on the grass again.

He was too lazy to talk nonsense to Qiong Xiao. He has the best innate spiritual treasures, but those 
top innate spiritual treasures are all Su Chen was reluctant to give the spiritual treasure that was 
useful to him to Qiong Xiao.

Bi Xiao held Qiong Xiao and whispered,

"Second sister, there is no way this scumbag has the best innate spiritual treasure. You might as well 
ask Su Chen to tie up the immortal rope for your promotion."

Qiong Xiao shook her head and said coldly,



"He does, and the eldest sister says he does! Bixiao rolled her eyes at Qiongxiao and said,

"Second sister, even if this scumbag had the best innate spiritual treasure, would he give it to you?"

"That is the best innate spiritual treasure. Immortals will fight for the acquired spiritual treasure 
regardless of life and death. The best innate spiritual treasure, this is the spiritual treasure that even 
the saints covet."

"Su Chen will give it to me, and the eldest sister will not lie."

Bixiao was speechless when she heard Qiongxiao's words.

She didn't think that her second sister Qiongxiao was so upright, and her eldest sister Yunxiao. 
Bixiao couldn't understand why her eldest sister Yunxiao thought that Su Chen had the best innate 
spiritual treasure, and would even give it to her second sister. Sister Qiongxiao gave her a top-
quality innate spiritual treasure.

After Su Chen heard the conversation between Qiongxiao and Bixiao, he didn’t understand why 
Yunxiao was sure that he would give it to Qiongxiao?

A top-quality innate spiritual treasure?

Did Yunxiao want to give it a try? Are you sincere? Or should you give yourself a top-quality innate 
spiritual treasure to propose marriage?

Damn, do you want to give out a top-quality innate spiritual treasure as a token of love?

Su Chen touched his chin and made random guesses.

After a while,

Su Chen sat up Taking out a silver ring, he handed it to the cold beauty Qiong Xiao and said,



"Qiong Xiao, this is for you. This is the top-grade innate spiritual treasure, the Dingtian Ring, which 
can also be called the Dingtian Hairpin. This top-grade innate spiritual treasure has two forms. It 
can be turned into a ring or a hairpin."

"The Fixed Heaven Ring can fix time, space, people and objects. The more mana you inject, the 
wider the scope of the fixation. With your level, even ordinary Daluo Jinxian will be fixed by you 
and can be slaughtered by you."

"Thank you!"

After Qiong Xiao took the Dingtian Ring and checked it, she nodded to Su Chen and disappeared.

Qiong Xiao didn't expect that Su Chen really had the best innate spiritual treasure, and it was also a 
very powerful top innate spiritual treasure,

Dingtian. The ring can fix time, space, people and objects. Qiong Xiao used her realm to activate 
the Dingtian Ring and was able to fix the Da Luo Jinxian. This top-grade innate spiritual treasure is 
too powerful.

Qiong Xiao's Dingtian Ring, oh no, it will be called Dingtian from now on. She was very satisfied 
with the hairpin.

Bixiao looked at Su Chen with shining eyes and shouted hurriedly,

"Su Chen, I don’t want the Chaos Spiritual Crystal anymore, I also want a top-quality innate 
spiritual treasure."

"You're eating farts!"

"Little scumbag, if you don’t give me a top-quality innate spiritual treasure, I will bother you three 
times every day from now on."
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