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Su Chen looked at the Eye of Heaven and wanted to give it a try.

Today's heaven is very strange.

He has some guesses, but Su Chen doesn't know if they are right.

If I swear the oath of heaven, the prehistoric heaven will also lift the thunder punishment, which 
shows that Su Chen's guess is correct.

In this case.

Hongjun was about to be doomed.

Su Chen was 100% sure that he could destroy Hongjun, that old scumbag, and the law of heaven 
would not attack him again.

I asked Su Chen with a dark face,

"Su Chen, are you telling the truth?"

"certainly!"

Su Chen nodded and replied.

He didn't know whether the prehistoric heaven would lift the thunder punishment, but Su Chen was 
80% sure that the prehistoric heaven would lift the thunder punishment.

If I took the oath of heaven, the prehistoric heaven would not lift the thunder punishment. , it’s none 
of his business.



Su Chen can then pester me, saying that it’s too late for me to swear the oath of heaven, and that I 
don’t sincerely swear the oath of heaven. Anyway, Su Chen can pass all the responsibilities to me.

At this moment,

Yuanshi Tianzun and The four great saints of Tongtian all have lingering fears,

Su Chen TaiyinFortunately , they agreed to Su Chen's blackmail, otherwise the primeval heaven 
would have sent down thunder to strike them down.

The surrounding quasi-sage powerful men all looked at me sympathetically.

They originally thought that Su Chen would not blackmail me, but they did not expect that Su Chen 
wanted the ancient law of heaven to strike me with thunder.

It's so insidious.

Could it be that Su Chen doesn't like me?

Or do you want the ancient law of heaven to kill me and scare the monkeys?

"I am the saint of the ancient heaven, Lao Tzu. I swear to the ancient heaven that I will not take 
action against the Emperor Su Chen within a hundred years. If I violate the oath of the heaven, I 
will be obliterated by the heaven, my body will be destroyed, my soul will be shattered, and my true 
spirit will collapse.."

At this time,

I swore the oath of heaven to the prehistoric heaven.

He had no choice but to not make the oath of heaven.

In more than ten years,



I was killed twice.

The damage to his soul was very great, and I also feel that if he dies a few more times, the ancient 
heaven may swallow up his soul.

The heaven is immortal, and the saints will not die!

I regret very much that I entrusted my soul to the ancient heaven. The saint will not die, but After 
the saint dies too many times, the saint's spirit will be swallowed by the ancient heaven, and he will 
become a puppet of the ancient heaven, a puppet without self-awareness.

After Empress Nuwa swore the oath of heaven to me, she looked at Su Chen's voice transmission 
road,

"Su Chen, I have sworn the oath of heaven, can you really lift the thunder punishment of the ancient 
heaven?"

"have no idea!"

"What? have no idea? Little bastard, do you know what you are doing? Are you deceiving another 
saint, or are you deceiving a saint who can burst into anger at any time?"

When Nuwa heard Su Chen's words, her eyes darkened.

What did she hear?

Su Chen couldn't lift the prehistoric heavenly way to kill me?

If this bastard couldn't lift the thunderous punishment of heaven, I would be so angry that the saint 
would kill him even if he died. Su Chen.

Is this bastard trying to die again?



Su Chen shook his head and said to Nuwa Empress,

"Nuwa, let’s take a look at the situation. I have some guesses. The prehistoric heaven will probably 
lift the thunder penalty."

"Just seek death."

After Empress Nuwa glared at Su Chen fiercely, she was ready to deal with me at any time.

This little bastard,

Empress Nuwa was very helpless towards Su Chen.

Boom boom boom....

At this moment, the prehistoric Heavenly Dao responded to Lao Tzu's Heavenly Dao oath.

The terrifying thunderclouds above the nine heavens began to dissipate, and the Eye of Heavenly 
Dao also disappeared above the Nine Heavens.

Su Chen smiled when he saw this.

It was the same as his guess.

The appearance of the Great Desolate Heaven today was because of the saints' calculations against 
him. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Luck?

Merit?

Great merit?



Or is it because of the aura left on him by the destiny of heaven?

Su Chen didn't know if it was because of these, but the prehistoric Tiandao behaved strangely today.

Su Chen understood that he was now like a son of Heaven, and that Heaven would protect him in 
the future. This may be because Heaven felt that it could make the Immortal World develop and 
grow, and that the Immortal World could continue to advance and not decline.

Empress Nuwa looked into the air in disbelief and said,

"Has the Heavenly Thunder Punishment really dissipated?"

"dissipated"

"Su Chen, what's going on?"

"Let’s talk about it when we get back!"

"good!"

The five saints and the surrounding quasi-sages looked at Su Chen with fear one by one.

0 Asking for flowers 0

The appearance of the Great Desolate Heavenly Dao today was too strange.

Su Chen was unscathed, but the Great Desolate Heavenly Dao actually wanted to punish the five 
great saints. The five great saints If they hadn't agreed to Su Chen's blackmail, the ancient heaven 
would have punished them with thunder. Sage Lao Tzu is an example. Swish, swish, swish.......

The five daughters of Jin Ling Holy Mother and Chang'e and Tianfeng returned to Sishui Pass in an 
instant. After they looked at the surrounding situation, the women stood beside Su Chen without 
saying anything.



Then the five Shiji women and the Archangels also came back.

Except for the Queen Mother and the Queen Mother of the West, the other women came back after 
killing their opponents.

"Let's all disperse, there's no good show to watch."

Su Chen saw that the five great saints and the surrounding powerful men had not retreated. He 
waved his hands and shouted silently. The five great saints looked at each other and disappeared one 
after another.

Four quasi-sages, six great Luo Jinxian,

Han Bao and Yinglong and the two great Luo Jinxian, all the strong ones failed this time.

However, the five saints also tried their best. Even if Hongjun knew the result, he would not be 
angry with them.

The five saints would not dare to deal with Su Chen like this in the future.

Su Chen It's so weird.

If Su Chen hadn't opened up the net today, the five great saints would not only be embarrassed in 
the ancient way of heaven, but they would also be injured by the thunder of the way of heaven.

The quasi-sage strongmen around them hugged Su Chen. , they also disappeared into the air one 
after another.

Emperor Su Chen, this is the most untouchable existence in the ancient world of immortality. The 
ancient emperor of heaven will become the real ruling force of the ancient world of immortality in 
the future. According to the order of Emperor Su Chen, there is no one in the ancient world of 
immortality. Dare to disobey, even they quasi-sages dare not disobey.

After Su Chen saw the saints and quasi-sages in the sky leaving, he asked the five girls of Shiji,



"Shi Ji, Long Ji, are you five still entering the Demon Tower of Desire to practice?"

After the five girls, Shi Ji and Princess Long Ji, looked at each other, they felt that it would be better 
to continue practicing in the Demonic Tower of Desire. Women like Guanyin Bodhisattva and Yun 
Xiao are both quasi-sage powers. They can't help if they stay with Su Chen. Busy.

Shi Ji smiled at Su Chen and replied,

"Let’s continue practicing. If you encounter danger in the future, we will always come out to protect 
you."

"Good eight!".

Chapter 2562

After Su Chen put the five Shiji girls into the Demonic Tower of Desire, he looked at the Jin Ling 
Virgin Mother and his daughters with some embarrassment.

Something big happened when Su Chen escaped from the heaven. The Jin Ling Virgin Mary and his 
daughters might have very big opinions on him..

Su Chen rubbed his chin and said,

"Don't look at me like this. Don't blame me for today's incident. The five great saints are looking for 
four quasi-sages and some Da Luo Jinxian to kill me. I haven't encountered them today, and I will 
encounter them in the future."

When the ladies of Jinling Holy Mother and Guanyin Bodhisattva heard Su Chen's words, they all 
glared at Su Chen angrily.

This bastard still dares to quibble?

If Su Chen had not escaped from the heaven, the five great saints would have summoned the quasi-
sage and the great saint. Luo Jinxian wanted to kill Su Chen, but Su Chen was in the heaven, and Su 
Chen was protected by these women. Do these strong men dare to show up and kill Su Chen?



"Su Chen, you will be imprisoned in Heaven in the future. If your cultivation level has not been 
raised to a quasi-sage, we will not let you out of Heaven."

"30Yes, we can't let you continue to seek death."

"This must be imprisonedlittle bastard"

"We will take turns guarding this bastard from now on. We can't let him escape from heaven again."

"Little bastard, don't think about causing trouble again, and we won't let you out of heaven again."

Su Chen's face turned dark when he heard the words of the Golden Spirit Virgin Mary and the girls.

Imprisoned?

Guarded?

Is he a prisoner?

Can Su Chen stay in Heaven?

The mission of Heavenly Ladder only lasts for many years. Can he complete the mission of 
Heavenly Ladder? It depends on how long it takes in the past few years.

Moreover, it seems that the ancient law of heaven is on his side. Su Chen will no longer be too 
timid to take action against the Western Zhou Dynasty.

If Hongjun dares to appear,

Su Chen will let the ancient law of heaven deprive him of Hongjun. As the spokesperson of the 
Heavenly Dao, the ancient Heavenly Dao is now on his side. Su Chen will not let Dashang perish. 
He must complete the trial of the ladder to heaven perfectly.



Su Chen waved his hands to the women and said seriously,

"Listen, I want Dashang to destroy the Western Zhou Dynasty within a few years. Dashang will not 
always defend but not attack."

"I will inform Su Daji to dispatch millions of troops to Sishui Pass. Two years later, the Great 
Chamber of Commerce will launch a full-scale attack on the Western Zhou Dynasty, and the 
Conferred God War will end in two years."

After hearing Su Chen's words, Empress Nuwa asked hurriedly,

"Su Chen, are you sure? The five great saints may not do anything anymore, but what about 
Hongjun? If you let Dashang fully attack the Western Zhou Dynasty, Hongjun will definitely stop 
it."

Su Chen explained with a smile,

"Hongjun? You don’t have to worry, if Hongjun dares to show up to stop him, I will let the Great 
Desolate Heavenly Dao deprive Hongjun of his identity as the spokesperson of Heavenly Dao."

"Hongjun has lost his identity as the spokesperson of Heavenly Dao. He is at most a saint of the 
third level of Heavenly Dao in the Holy Realm. If we don't need to take action, none of the five 
great saints will let Hongjun go."

After the Nuwa Empress and the Golden Spirit Mother heard what Su Chen said, they looked at 
each other.

Can Su Chen deprive Hongjun of his identity as the spokesperson of Honghuang Tiandao?

They didn't know, but Su Chen looked confident. , they felt that Su Chen should be able to do it.

Su Chen told Tianfeng of the Feng Clan,

"Tianfeng, you go back and gather an army of more than one million immortal birds. I will be 
useful in the future."



"Yes, my king!"

"Nuwa, please notify Pingxin and tell her that I need a powerful army of one million from the Wu 
clan."

"Okay, I'll notify Pingxin right away"

"Jin Ling, you, Wudang, and Turtle Ling are going to the Dragon Clan. The Zhulong Society will 
prepare a million Dragon Clan army. You can go and receive it when the time comes."

"Okay, let's go now."

The Holy Mother of the Golden Spirit nodded to Su Chen. She, the Holy Mother of Wudang and the 
Holy Mother of the Turtle Spirit quickly disappeared and left.

Su Chen took out another jade box and handed it to Guanyin Bodhisattva and said,

"Guanyin, you and Yunxiao take the jade box to the Sea of Blood and tell Ancestor Styx to prepare 
an army of more than one million immortals."

"Well, Yunxiao and I will go right away."

After a while, (to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen and Chang'e were the only ones left in Bishui Pass. Su Chen frowned and wondered if 
there was anything else he had forgotten.

Chang'e looked at him with cold eyes. Su Chen asked,

"Su Chen, do you want to start a war?"

Su Chen recruited powerful immortal armies everywhere.



There was no place in the ancient immortal world where Su Chen could launch a war. Chang'e 
couldn't figure out what Su Chen was going to do.

"Well, I'm going to wage war on a place"

"Where?"

"Western realm!"

Su Chen didn't hide it from Chang'e.

He wanted to conquer the Western God Realm.

The prehistoric fairy world in the Heaven Ladder mission is an independent fairy world. There is 
only one Western Realm around it. No other realm will appear. The Chaos Demon God in Chaos 
will also appear in the future. It is impossible to appear.

An independent and huge prehistoric fairyland will be Su Chen's back garden from now on.

Chang'e was very speechless when she heard Su Chen's words.

A Western realm where there is no way of heaven, and the spiritual energy is exhausted, and the 
West can only rely on faith to practice. Gods, what's the point of Su Chen conquering the Western 
Realm?

Su Chen took Chang'e's hand and said,

"Chang'e, let's go to Zhen Yuanzi's Taoist temple. Zhen Yuanzi's Dixian Mansion also has some 
powerful immortals. I want Zhen Yuanzi to also summon an army of one million immortals."

"let me go!"

"Fart, you will be my woman from now on, why should I let you go?"



"Shameless person, I am not your woman!"

Su Chen directly hugged Chang'e's soft waist and said, 450

"Chang'e, you can sense some of your soul to see if you are my woman. By the way, Chang Xi is 
also my woman. You will understand this later."

"Asshole, let me go."

Chang'e struggled when Su Chen hugged her, but she didn't leave Su Chen's arms instantly.

She couldn't understand this either.

A scum of Taiyi Golden Immortal, she could knock this bastard away in an instant, but She couldn't 
do it.

Su Chen was right.

Her soul had been in shock since she met Su Chen, especially after being hugged by Su Chen. Her 
soul was beating happily.

Chang'e believed what Su Chen said, otherwise ,

Chang'e would not have helped Su Chen kill the generals before, and the vibrations of the soul 
would not be fake.

After Su Chen sent a message to the Queen Mother and the Queen Mother of the West who were 
still fighting, he hugged Chang'e and disappeared into Sishui Pass.

The mission of the ladder to heaven He will complete it within three years, and there is not much 
time left for him. If the girls in the mission fairy world want to live stably in this world, Su Chen 
must remove all hidden dangers.



Hongjun!

Five great saints!

Uh, there are also The scumbag Haotian,

Su Chen wants to let the prehistoric heaven deprive them of their holy status. This must advance the 
prehistoric immortal world, and the western realm is the victim of the promotion of the prehistoric 
immortal world.

Chapter 2563

In the prehistoric fairy world, one month later, the immortal armies gathered by the Witch Clan, the 
Dragon Clan, the Shura Clan from the Sea of Blood, Zhen Yuanzi's Earthly Immortal Mansion, the 
Monster Clan, and the Phoenix Clan gathered towards the Heavenly Court.

The creatures in the prehistoric fairy world were in a state of shock. All the creatures looked at the 
various races gathered in the heaven in shock.

Although there are not many immortal armies gathered in the Heavenly Court, the lowest 
cultivation level of these immortal armies is the Heavenly Immortal Realm. This is the most 
powerful immortal army in the prehistoric immortal world.

All the creatures don’t know what the Heavenly Court is going to do. There are already millions of 
immortal armies in the Heavenly Court, and with these immortal armies, this is almost ten million 
powerful immortal armies.

"What is Su Chen going to do? Who is he going to wage war against?"

"I don’t know. There are nearly 10 million immortals and more than the immortal army. This is 
more powerful than the tens of billions of cannon fodder. There is no race in the ancient immortal 
world that can be the opponent of these immortal armies."

"Isn't it that Emperor Su Chen wants to take action against our Saint Sect?"



"No, Su Chen wants to take action against us. Empress Nuwa and those powerful fairies are enough. 
Tens of millions of fairy armies have gathered. This is not to deal with us."

"Is it still necessary to continue the Conferred God War? If Su Chen allowed these powerful 
immortal armies to help Dashang, those 597 immortals in the Western Zhou Dynasty would be 
killed in an instant"

"This is none of our business. The one who has a headache is Taoist Hongjun. We have already 
done what we should do. As for what Taoist Hongjun wants to do, we have no control over it."

Above the nine heavens, the five saints looked at the assembled army of immortals. They started 
talking one after another. Su Chen summoned an army of tens of millions of immortals above the 
heavenly immortals. They didn't know what to do.

Launch a war?

Which race will this war be waged against?

Dealing with their saint sect?

This is obviously impossible.

Boom boom boom.....

Suddenly, the prehistoric fairy world shook, and all the successfully cultivated creatures looked into 
the air.

This was the vibration coming from the heaven, and all the creatures in the heaven were going to 
notify the entire prehistoric fairy world.

Dangdang.....

After the Chaos Bell rang nine times,



Taibai Jinxing appeared outside the Nantian Gate with the decree from heaven.

"The order of the Emperor of Heaven!"

"In the Heavenly Court of the Ancient Immortal Realm, His Majesty the Heavenly Emperor has 
issued an order!"

"One year later, the immortal army from the ancient immortal world will conquer the western 
realm."

"The territorial war has begun"

"All races, forces, and saint sects in the prehistoric fairy world, and the immortals above the mortal 
realm must join the army of immortals in heaven within one year."

"Anyone who disobeys the orders of the Emperor of Heaven shall be killed!"

"Anyone who doesn’t come to the gathering will be killed!"

"Those who are late for no reason will be killed!"

After Taibai Jinxing read out Su Chen's order, he was very excited.

Su Chen was much more courageous and decisive in killing than Haotian. This is the supreme 
person who controls the ancient world of immortals. Only then He is a high and mighty Primeval 
Emperor.

At this moment, all the immortals in the Primeval Immortal World are confused. The Heavenly

Emperor wants to recruit all the Immortals above the Heavenly Immortal in the Primeval Immortal 
Realm?

Launch a realm war?



The Primeval Immortal Realm is vast, and there are more than hundreds of millions of Immortals 
above the Heavenly Immortal. Isn't Emperor Su Chen worried that all the immortals in the 
prehistoric immortal world will object?

"Damn it, Su Chen actually wants to recruit the immortals from our saint sect to gather in heaven, a 
three-kill order? Does Su Chen want to make enemies of all races in the prehistoric immortal 
world?"

"Will our disciples go?"

"Do we dare not to go? Su Chen is a black-hearted bastard. If our disciples don't go, that bastard 
will have an excuse to destroy our orthodoxy."

"Alas, wait and see, let our disciples be ready. If all the races in the prehistoric immortal world 
respond to Su Chen's call, our disciples will also go there."

"Everyone, we Buddhist disciples will immediately go to the heaven to gather. Su Chen is too 
weird, that bastard that our brothers don’t want to offend."

"Zhunti, your disciples have all gone to heaven, where is the Western Zhou Dynasty? Don’t you 
Buddhists intend to help the Western Zhou Dynasty?"

"The Western Zhou Dynasty is hopeless. The Great Shang gathered five million troops to go to 
Sishui Pass. The Great Shang will not defend anymore. Su Chen wants to destroy the Western Zhou 
Dynasty at once. Is it useful for our disciples to stay in the Western Zhou Dynasty?"

The faces of the five great saints were all very ugly at the moment. They talked for a while and 
there was nothing they could do. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Although they are aloof saints, Su Chen is too weird, and that bastard can't stop him at all times. 
Just call out the ancient law of heaven, and these saints are helpless against Su Chen.

Boom boom boom......

Suddenly, the ancient heaven issued an order to launch a realm war.



The creatures participating in the realm war can obtain heavenly merits. The ancient fairy world is 
respected by heaven and the emperor Su Chen is revered. Creatures who disobey the emperor's 
orders will be punished by thunder..

The faces of the five great saints were turning dark at this moment.

As soon as Su Chen issued the recruitment order for the ancient immortal world, the ancient heaven 
responded to Su Chen, and even issued thunderous punishments to the immortals who violated Su 
Chen's orders.

Is this him?

Is Su Chen the illegitimate son of Tiandao?

In the prehistoric fairy world, the immortals above the heavenly immortal realm were heading 
towards the heaven one after another. The immortals above the heavenly immortal realm did not 
dare to disobey Su Chen's order. At this time, the primeval heaven also issued an order, and all the 
immortals above the heavenly immortal realm quickly went to the heaven to assemble..

Some old antiques who have been in seclusion have also come out of seclusion.

If they participate in the realm war, they will get heavenly merits. As long as they participate in the 
realm war and get heavenly merits, their cultivation will improve rapidly, which is much better than 
their retreat practice.

In the heavenly court,

Su Chen and Nuwa Empress and the other girls were all in the peach garden.

However,

Nuwa Empress and the other girls looked at Su Chen in surprise. They did not expect that Su Chen 
had said it right again. In the morning, a recruitment order for the realm war was launched.



Su Chen took a sip of tea and said,

"Don't look at me, this is the inevitable result. As long as we occupy the western realm, this will be 
very beneficial to the prehistoric immortal world, and also very beneficial to the prehistoric 
heaven."

"Although the Western Realm is a dead realm, we are opening up and expanding the territory for the 
prehistoric fairyland."

"The Prehistoric Immortal World has annexed the Western Realm, which will promote the 
Prehistoric Immortal World to a higher level of existence, and the Prehistoric Heavenly Dao will 
become more powerful, and the Prehistoric Heavenly Dao will not be able to object."

Nuwa Empress looked at Su Chen and asked doubtfully,

"Su Chen, what is your purpose for doing this?"

Su Chen stood up and looked at the Nuwa Empress and the girls, and then he said with a serious 
face,

"Complete the way of heaven!"

"If the prehistoric way of heaven is completed, do you think Hongjun is still needed? Do we still 
need those saints whose souls are entrusted in the way of heaven?".

Chapter 2564

When Empress Nuwa and the Queen Mother heard what Su Chen said, they were all shocked from 
ear to ear.

The girls didn't expect Su Chen to have such an amazing plan.

But it’s right to think about it.



After the prehistoric Heavenly Way is completed, does the Prehistoric Heavenly Way still need 
Hongjun to complete the Heavenly Way? Do we still need Hongjun, the spokesperson of Heaven’s 
Law?

Does the ancient way of heaven still need saints to place their trust in the way of heaven?

At that time,

Hongjun will not only be expelled from the Heavenly Dao by the Great Desolate Heavenly Dao, but 
may also be deposed from the Heavenly Dao holy position.

The five great saints are probably no exception.

If the Heavenly Saints were no longer saints, they would no longer be a threat to Su Chen and these 
girls. Su Chen was killing two birds with one stone, not killing multiple birds with one stone.

Queen Mother Xi asked Su Chen,

"Su Chen, is there a high chance of success?"Seventy-seven""

Su Chen shook his head and replied,

"There is a 70% to 80% chance that Hongjun will definitely be expelled by Heaven. As for whether 
other saints will be deprived of Saints by Heaven, this is uncertain. I can only know after 
conquering the Western Realm."

The Queen Mother smiled and said,

"This is already good news. As long as Hongjun is deprived of his identity as Tiandao 
spokesperson, this is already great news for us."

The Golden Spirit Saint nodded and said,

"Yes, as long as there is no threat from Hongjun, other saints can no longer be our enemies."



Empress Nuwa reminded the Holy Mother of the Golden Spirit,

"No, Jin Ling, other saints will definitely become our enemies. The saints will not give up their 
status in the ancient immortal world. They want to continue to be high in the ancient immortal 
world. The saints will definitely try their best to get rid of us."

Empress Pingxin nodded in agreement and said,

"Yes, the saints are all selfish and regard the common people as ants. In order to continue to be high 
in the prehistoric fairyland and continue to control the prehistoric fairyland, the saints will not allow 
us to control the prehistoric fairyland."

Su Chen smiled when he heard the words of the women.

These beautiful women are not vases.

Nuwa and the others are not only powerful, but also have very unique insights.

The independent prehistoric fairy world will be controlled by them in the future. Su Chen was also 
very relieved.

The Western Realm?

When Su Chen thought of the goddesses Hera and Frigga, his expression became a little unnatural.

The goddesses in the Western Realm were either his women or his subordinates.

After the Realm War started,

He also didn’t want the goddesses in the Western Realm to be killed.

Su Chen looked at the women around him and said awkwardly,



"A year later, in the realm war, the Queen Mother and the Queen Mother of the West were in charge. 
The God-King of the Western Realm was a Quasi-Saint Realm, and the other main gods were Daluo 
Jinxian. By the way, the Goddess Queen and the Female Goddess of the Western Realm, please 
don’t kill them. Yes, they are all their own."

When Nuwa and Yunxiao heard what Su Chen said, they all stared at Su Chen angrily. One of our 
own?

What does this bastard mean?

Are the queens and heroines in the Western Realm all related to Su Chen?

The Queen Mother stared at Su Chen and asked,

"Um? Little bastard, you took down all the queens and heroines of the Western Realm?"

"Ahem! Queen Mother, you must have heard of the Ladder to Heaven, right?"

"heard about it!"

The Queen Mother and Guanyin Bodhisattva nodded one after another. Some of them have also 
climbed the mysterious ladder to heaven. Why did Su Chen talk about the mysterious ladder to 
heaven? Could it be that Su Chen also climbed the ladder to heaven? (Read Baoshuang novels, just 
read it. Go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen hurriedly said nonsense,

"I've climbed the ladder to heaven, and I've climbed ten thousand levels"

"The reason why you are familiar with me is because I was a Taoist companion with you during the 
10,000-level trial. The Goddess Queen and the Goddess of the Western God Realm also succeeded 
in my trial."

Nuwa and other ladies looked at Su Chen in surprise, ten thousand floors?



Su Chen actually climbed to the ten thousand floors?

A Taiyi Golden Immortal actually climbed to the ten thousand floors?

Is this possible?

The accuracy of the prehistoric fairy world The Holy Power can climb up to more than three 
thousand floors. How can Su Chen climb up to ten thousand floors?

Empress Nuwa asked Su Chen in confusion,

"Su Chen, are you climbing the next 10,000 levels of the Immortal Cultivator's Ladder?"

Su Chen curled his lips and replied,

"Beauty Nuwa, what you are saying is nonsense, can I climb up to the 10,000-level ladder of 
immortality? Before I became an immortal, I climbed the ladder to the next 10,000 floors....0"

"little bastard!"

Empress Nuwa and Queen Mother Xi all understood at this moment.

No wonder they and Su Chen seemed to have known each other, and their relationship was very 
close. The cause and effect of all this was because Su Chen was a Taoist companion with them in 
the ladder trial.

Su Chen was there He silently said sorry to the girls in his heart.

He did not intentionally deceive Nuwa and the girls. It was impossible for Su Chen to say that he 
came from the period of the journey to the west in later generations, and it was impossible to say 
that this prehistoric fairyland was just a world of trials.

Su Chen put The Nuwa Empress next to her hugged her and told her,



"Nuwa, there is a saint in the Western Realm, a saint in the third heaven of the Holy Realm. Her 
name is Gaia. After the war in the realm begins, if you capture her, she will also be your sister in the 
future."

Nuwa Empress rolled her eyes at Su Chen and snorted coldly,

"Hum, got it!"

Su Chen continued to say to the girls,

"There are three major pantheons in the Western realm, the Greek pantheon, the Nordic pantheon, 
and the god pantheon."

"The Queen Mother is responsible for attacking the Greek pantheon, the Queen Mother of the West 
is responsible for the Nordic pantheon, and Chang'e, you and Chang Xi are responsible for attacking 
the God pantheon."

"The Holy Mother of the Golden Spirit and you ladies helped the Queen Mother and the Queen 
respectively, and all the male god kings and main gods in the Western Realm were destroyed."

The Queen Mother and her daughters all nodded.

A year later, they attacked the Western Realm.

This war in the Western Realm was nothing at all. The quasi-sages of the Western Realm were no 
match for them.

Su Chen also recruited more than 1.9 Immortals from the Ancient Immortal Realm. Immortals, 
within a year, there will be hundreds of millions of immortals above the Celestial Immortal Realm 
in Heaven to gather together. A large number of immortal armies, dozens of powerful quasi-sages, 
even the hundreds of millions of immortal armies can conquer the Western Realm.

Empress Pingxin looked at Su Chen and asked doubtfully,



"Su Chen, you have assigned us a task, what about you? what are you up to?"

Su Chen stood up and said with a serious face,

"Destroyed the Western Zhou Dynasty"

"I sent all the powerful immortals and quasi-sages from the ancient world to conquer the Western 
Realm. There would be no more immortals to help me in the Western Zhou Dynasty. The Great 
Shang had already assembled an army of five million. I wanted to take advantage of the war in the 
realm to conquer the Western Realm. After destroying the Western Zhou Dynasty, the War of 
Conferring Gods will also come to an end."
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Three days later,

Su Daji took Jiuzhi and Pipa to the Heavenly Court.

In less than ten days, the immortal army in the Heavenly Court will set off. The most powerful 
immortal army in history will launch a realm war. The Western Realm will The domain cannot 
resist the immortal army of the prehistoric immortal world.

"Soon, within a month, the mission of the ladder will be completed. I don’t know what the girl on 
the ladder will reward myself? Become a Daluo Jinxian in one step? Or become a quasi-sage in one 
step?"

Su Chen thought for a while and decided that it is better not to reward the cultivation level.

If he is promoted to Daluo Jinxian, the Immortal's 10,000-level ladder will begin to climb.

Su Chen has not been promoted to Daluo Jinxian for so many years. He just doesn't want to climb 
to the 10,000th level. The ladder to heaven.

The girl on the ladder to heaven?

Su Chen hasn't figured out whether the girl on the ladder to heaven has any plot.



If the girl on the ladder to heaven escapes from the ladder, she will still be a demon who will 
destroy the realm. Su Chen's Xuantian realm, his women, His children and relatives will all be in 
great danger.

Su Chen rubbed his forehead and felt very helpless.

"What a headache! Damn girl, you've given yourself a problem"

"Husband, what's wrong with you?"

Queen Jiang came into the study and saw Su Chen rubbing her forehead. She asked Su Chen 
worriedly.

Su Chen waved his hand and replied,

"It's okay, I just have a headache thinking about things"

"Let me rub it for my husband."

Queen Jiang walked behind Su Chen and started massaging Su Chen. Queen Jiang also knew what 
happened in the ancient immortal world recently. She knew what big things Su Chen was going to 
do. She also knew what Su Chen was worried about. Realm wars, seals. The war between gods, the 
war against the Western Zhou Dynasty, those saints, and even Hongjun Daozu, the most powerful 
person in the prehistoric times, Su Chen had to worry about these. Su Chen leaned on Queen Jiang's 
soft mountain and asked,

"Qiang'er, why haven't you seen Mrs. Huang these days?"

Queen Jiang blushed and glanced at Su Chen and replied,

"Mrs. Huang has not been in the palace this month. Her son Huang Tianhua came back some time 
ago. She wants to persuade her son to leave Chan Cult."

"I can't persuade you, Mrs. Huang is wasting her efforts."



"How could Mrs. Huang not know that Chanjiao had seriously bewitched her son, and she wanted 
to try her best to persuade him. After all, Huang Tianhua was also her son."

Su Chen held Jiang Wanggong in his arms and kissed him and said,

"Forget it, let’s not talk about her. You are now a cultivator in the realm of distraction. After this 
war, you and Mrs. Li and the other girls will go to Heaven together. Heaven is rich in spiritual 
energy and has many cultivation resources. You can all do it in less than a year. Become an 
immortal"

"Well, I will listen to my husband’s arrangements."

Queen Jiang leaned in Su Chen's arms and agreed shyly. She had no objection to Su Chen's 
arrangements.

Queen Jiang used to be just an ordinary woman.

Although she was beautiful, there were many beautiful women in the fairy world. Yes, Su Chen fell 
in love with her and respected her very much, which made Queen Mother Jiang also admire Su 
Chen very much.

Boom!

Suddenly, there was a loud noise in the palace, and countless Forbidden Palace troops quickly 
exploded toward her. They gathered at the noisy place.

Queen Jiang asked Su Chen nervously,

"Husband, what happened?"

"Don't worry, there are a few little thieves looking for death."

Su Chen patted Queen Jiang's back and said comfortingly,



Huang Tianhua!

The three Nezha brothers!

And Queen Jiang's two sons!

What the hell, what are these little scumbags doing here? Could it be that they are here separately? 
Want to take away their mother?

Isn't Mrs. Huang not in the palace?

Is Huang Tianhua going to take away Huang Guifei? (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel 
Network!)

Su Chen checked the cultivation realm of these people.

The three Nezha brothers are all earth immortals, Huang Tianhua is a human immortal, Queen 
Jiang's two sons are immortal cultivators who have transcended the tribulation realm, and they are 
some scumbags who can no longer be scumbags. At this moment, in the square of the palace, 
several people Thousands of imperial troops surrounded Nezha and the others, and the immortal 
cultivators guarding the palace also appeared in the air.

In the square,

Mrs. Li and Huang Guifei also appeared here. They heard the message from Nezha and the others.

"See Concubine Li, see Concubine Huang!"

The Imperial Guards on the square saw Mrs. Li and Concubine Huang arriving. All the Imperial 
Guards and cultivators saluted Mrs. Li and Concubine Huang.

Concubine Huang waved her hands and shouted,



"All free of charge!"

"Thank you, concubine! Mrs.

Li looked at her three sons and hurriedly persuaded her,

"Jin Zha, Mu Zha, Nezha, please leave the palace quickly. This is not the place you should come 
to."

Mrs. Li is very helpless.

The three Nezha brothers are her sons, but she is now Su Chen's woman.

Li Jing ran away with Nezha more than ten years ago and abandoned her. Mrs. Li and Li Jing have 
no relationship. She doesn't want to The three Nezha brothers came to the palace to cause trouble 
and were killed.

Su Chen was in the Dashang Palace.

Madam Li had been accompanying Su Chen every day these days.

She could no longer leave Su Chen, and Madam Li didn't want to leave the bastard who tormented 
her to death.

The imperial concubine stared at Huang Tianhua and asked,

"Huang Tianhua, where is your mother? What are you doing in the palace?"

"Mother, you and we should leave the palace quickly. Our brothers are here to help you leave."

"Auntie, I am here to save you from Dashang. All the immortals in Dashang have left to heaven. I 
can save you from Dashang Palace."



Nezha and Huang Tianhua spoke one after another.

They came to Dashang Palace together this time. They all want to save their mother and relatives 
from leaving.

This is an opportunity.

All the immortals and above in the prehistoric fairyland will go to the heaven to gather. , there are 
no powerful immortal guards in Dashang Palace, they will take this opportunity to rescue their 
respective mothers and relatives.

Mrs. Li said with a firm face,

"Nezha, you three brothers, please leave. Although I am your mother, I am also Su Chen's wife. I 
will not leave. There is no need for you to come to me in the future."

Jin Zha shouted after hearing Mrs. Li's words,

"No, you are our mother, you must leave with us, our father will meet us outside Chaoge City, and 
our brothers must take you away from Dashang Palace."

Huang Tianhua also hurriedly shouted to Huang Guifei,

"Auntie, I have sent my mother out of Chaoge City. Please leave with me quickly."

At this time,

Yin Jiao and Yin Hong were very anxious.

Their brothers were too weak to transmit messages to Queen Jiang, and they did not dare to stay in 
the palace for a long time, otherwise the heaven would definitely find out what happened here.

If the heaven A powerful immortal has arrived, and both of their brothers may be killed.



In the study, Su Chen whispered with a dark face after hearing what Nezha and Huang Tianhua 
said ,

"These scumbags really came to save their respective mothers. Damn, why do you feel like you are 
a pervert who robs beautiful women?".
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Queen Jiang blushed and lowered her head when she heard Su Chen's words.

She just checked how many people broke into the palace,

Yin Jiao and Yin Hong?

Her two sons were coming to rescue her and leave.

But can she leave?

Queen Jiang was not imprisoned in the palace by Su Chen, nor was she imprisoned by Su Chen. 
Queen Jiang was Su Chen's woman, and she would always be Su Chen's woman in the future.

Queen Jiang came out of Su Chen's arms and said,"Husband, I'll let them leave the palace."

"Go for it!"

Su Chen nodded and agreed. He is a little scumbag.

He has no interest in caring about your little bastards.

Su Chen still has many big things to do.

As long as his plan succeeds this time, the saints and Hongjun will do it. After being crippled by 
him, these few little scumbags will only be little scumbags in the future, and they will not be able to 
make a big splash.



Queen Jiang straightened her clothes and walked out,

Yin Hong and Yin Jiao, this may be her last When she saw them,

Queen Jiang wanted to say goodbye to the past. Yin Hong and Yin Jiao had grown up, and she no 
longer had to worry about them. Queen Jiang didn't want Yin Hong and Yin Jiao to disturb her life 
anymore.

Su Chen faced The man next to him shouted,

"Angel Alan!"

A beautiful angel 30 appeared next to Su Chen and saluted,

"Your Majesty the Emperor of Heaven!"

Su Chen asked, looking at the beautiful angel Ailan.

"Don’t you, the Angel Legion, want to participate in the Realm War?"

Angel Alan replied with a serious face,

"Your Majesty, our Angel Legion is here to protect Your Majesty. The boundary war in this world is 
nothing. We can return to the main world and participate in the boundary war again."

Su Chen nodded and said,

"You are right, the western realm is the weakest realm"

"in the main world"



"In the future, our Xuantian realm will go to war with the demons and ferocious beast realms 
outside the realm. That will be the real horrific war."

"Several realms to which the Xuantian Realm belongs, all the small worlds, and all the immortals 
will be summoned. Billions, tens of billions, or even hundreds of billions of immortals will be 
recruited."

"By then, we don’t know how many creatures will perish in the realm war, and we don’t know how 
many small worlds will be destroyed."

Angel Ailan saw that Su Chen looked a little sad, and she also understood why.

Once the realm war starts, it will be much crueler than the realm war in this world.

Two powerful realms go to war, or even three , four powerful realms start a war at the same time, I 
am afraid that countless creatures will fall by then, and many small thousand worlds may be 
destroyed.

Angel Ailan guessed that Su Chen couldn't bear the death of the gods in the Xuantian realm, but 
Realm wars cannot be avoided, the deaths and injuries of gods are inevitable, and even the 
destruction of the Small Thousand Worlds is even more impossible to prevent.

Angel Ailan thought for a while and said to Su Chen,

"Your Majesty, all the angel legions of our Angel Nebula, all the angels will fight for Your Majesty, 
and we angels will not be afraid of falling."

"Ha ha......"

Su Chen laughed loudly when he heard Angel Ailan's words. There are several realms under the 
Xuantian Realm, and there are thousands of small worlds.

The life and death of all creatures depend on his thoughts. As long as Su Chen is in the realm, If you 
make a mistake in a domain war, billions or even tens of billions of creatures will die.



The immortal army in the Xuantian Realm is also the most loyal to him.

In addition to his black-armored combat legion, there are also Wu Clan combat legions, Monster 
Clan combat legions, Phoenix Clan combat legions, etc. These combat legions will completely obey 
orders.

Su Chen would not blindly let his troops die, nor would he let his troops fight meaningless wars.

Although Su Chen has been wandering around with nothing to do, even picking up girls! But the 
pressure on him is very high.

Without encountering the outside world of demons and beasts,

Su Chen had to be careful of the Chaos Demon God if he wanted to develop the Xuantian Realm.

After encountering the extraterrestrial demon world and the ferocious beast realm, Su Chen had to 
worry about the invasion of the extraterrestrial demon world and the ferocious beast realm. (To read 
Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

There is also the uncertain factor of the girl on the ladder.

Su Chen has to make accurate judgments on these, he has to think carefully about the consequences, 
and in the end it is up to him to make the decision later.

Damn it, Su Chen will have to make accurate decisions for every major event in the future.

"Alan, after returning to our world"

"The Angel Legion will form an Angel Combat Legion, and angels from the fourth generation or 
above will join. I hope your Angel Combat Legion can be as powerful as other combat legions."

Angel Ailan said happily after hearing Su Chen's words,



"Your Majesty, in the time barrier in Merlot Heaven, we angels are provided with a large amount of 
resources. Whether we are resurrected old angels or new angels, we can upgrade very quickly."

"It doesn't take thousands of years in the time barrier. We angels will have more than 10 million 
powerful angels of the fourth generation, and the angel combat legion will definitely be as powerful 
as other combat legions."

Su Chen nodded and closed his eyes.

The angel combat legion will become stronger.

Su Chen used a huge amount of water of life and 10% of the source of heaven to transform the 
genes of the angels. Otherwise, the angels would be the most powerful. It can only be upgraded to 
the fifth generation.

However, it is all very worthwhile.

The Angel Combat Legion will be as loyal to him as the Black Armor Combat Legion in the future 
and will never betray him.

Angel Ailan looked at it Su Chen disappeared into the room instantly, and she did not disturb Su 
Chen.

Bangpengpeng....

The sound of fighting suddenly broke out in the palace. Su Chen opened his eyes, looked at them 
and then closed them.

Those scumbags are looking for death, and the immortal guards in the 807 palace have not been 
transferred at all.

Su Chen is the Emperor of Heaven.



He has long given orders to the immortals in the Great Shang Palace and the immortals in Sishui 
Pass. These immortals do not need to participate in the realm war, and they will not be punished by 
the thunder of heaven.

At this moment, in the square,

Nezha and Huang Tianhua had just taken action when they were enveloped by more than a dozen 
powerful auras.

For a moment,

Nezha and the others were so frightened that they did not dare to make the slightest move,

Taiyi Golden Immortal?

Daluo Jinxian?

Why are there so many powerful immortals in the palace?

Mrs. Li, Concubine Huang, and Queen Jiang were very angry when they saw the dozens of imperial 
guards being killed.

Nezha and Huang Tianhua left in order to capture the three girls. They did not expect that Nezha 
and the others would kill ordinary imperial soldiers.

Mrs. Li shouted with a serious face,

"Nezha, you disappoint me so much. You three brothers should leave. We will have nothing to do 
with each other from now on."

Huang Guifei scolded Huang Tianhua with a cold face,

"Huang Tianhua, get out of here right now, otherwise you don't have to leave."



Queen Jiang rubbed her forehead and said,

"Yin Jiao, Yin Hong, please leave. Just treat me as your mother. I can forgive you for your 
misbehavior this time, but if you want to die next time, I will not save you again."
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Queen Jiang was extremely disappointed with his two sons.

She had made it clear to Yin Jiao and Yin Hong before, but she did not expect that Yin Jiao and Yin 
Hong actually wanted to seize Dashang.

Can Dashang be captured by Yinjiao and Yinjiao?

Two princes?

Are they still the princes of Dashang?

King Zhou had been in a coma for more than ten years.

The ministers of Dashang all surrendered to Su Chen. All the generals and the generals in various 
places were loyal to Su Chen and him. The tens of millions of troops of Dashang would obey Yin 
Jiao and Yin Hong. An order?

Whoosh!

A Taiyi Golden Immortal appeared in the square instantly.

He hurriedly saluted Queen Jiang and said,

"Seeing the queen, Mrs. Huang was rescued and the traitor Li Jing was caught."

Queen Jiang nodded and ordered,



"Li Jing will be executed immediately, and Mrs. Huang must be protected and returned to the 
palace."

"Yes, Queen!"

Taiyi Jinxian saluted Queen Jiang and disappeared in the square.

Queen Jiang, Mrs. Li, Concubine Huang, and Mrs. Huang. Although these women are scumbag 
cultivators, the immortals guarding the palace did not dare to disrespect them..These women are all 
the women of the Heavenly Emperor Su Chen.

The Heavenly Emperor Su Chen is the supreme being in the ancient immortal world. The quasi-
sages, saints, and even Taoist ancestor Hongjun in the ancient immortal world do not dare to offend 
the Heavenly Emperor Su Chen. Emperor Su Chen even continued to blackmail the saints.

The powerful immortals guarding the palace were also very lucky.

They were arranged to guard the palace in the mortal world.

The best innate spiritual fruit flat peach and the best fairy wine in heaven, these immortals guarding 
the palace Being rewarded every year, countless immortals in heaven envied them the immortals 
who guarded the palace.

When Jin Zha heard Queen Jiang’s order, he hurriedly shouted,

"No, you cannot kill our father."

Muzha shouted angrily,

"Damn it, my father is a disciple of Buddhism. If you kill our father, Buddhism will not let you go."

Nezha also yelled angrily,"We will not let you go even if we explain it."

Mrs. Li looked at the three Nezha brothers and left.



She didn't want to waste her words on the three traitors. Madam Li understood that the three Nezha 
brothers were not coming to save her.

They just felt that her staying in the Dashang Palace had embarrassed them and made them 
embarrassed. They couldn't hold their heads high in their respective sects.

The three Nezha brothers probably wanted her to die so that they would not be ridiculed by other 
brothers.

After Huang Guifei looked at Huang Tianhua coldly, she also left the square with Mrs. Li.

Huang Guifei was too lazy to talk to Huang Tianhua. He was a brainwashed idiot, and the men of 
the Huang family were considered dead.

Queen Jiang said to Yin Jiao and Nezha with a cold face,

"In a moment, you must leave the palace and leave Chaoge City, otherwise you will all be killed."

"mother, you...."

Jiang Wanggong threatened to cut off Yinjiao,

"Shut up, Yin Jiao, I am no longer your mother. You can treat your mother as dead."

"Life or death, I only give you one chance. For a moment, if you don't leave the palace or Chaoge 
City, the immortals in the palace will kill you without hesitation."

After Queen Jiang said that, she turned and left. She didn't want to look at these ungrateful people 
anymore.

Saving people?

Are they coming to save people?



They all came with their own intentions.

Although Queen Jiang felt very sad,

But she doesn't regret doing this.

Queen Jiang just pretends that she doesn't have these two sons.

Besides, she will have Su Chen's children in the future, and she will educate her future children 
well.

"Come on, let's leave quickly"

"Let's go, our respective mothers have changed, they are no longer our respective mothers"

"Let's go or we'll really be killed"

"Yes, we must leave immediately."

Huang Tianhua and Yin Hong talked to each other, and they quickly left the palace. Within a quarter 
of an hour, (to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

If they had not left the palace, they had not left Chaoge City. , they will really be killed by the 
powerful immortals in the palace.

In the evening,

Su Chen woke up from the study room.

He rubbed his swollen head and was very speechless. Su Chen did not expect to sleep and dream?

Since he became an immortal cultivator, , even after becoming an immortal,



Su Chen never had a dream again. Today he had a dream for no reason (daaa)?

Su Chen took a sip of tea, thought about the dream and whispered,

"Damn it, aren't the three sisters Su Yan running away secretly again? The realm of Xuantian is vast 
and vast. Why do the three Su Yan sisters keep going to unfamiliar worlds?"

Su Chen guessed that the three sisters of Su Yan might have really fled again, but he had no choice.

Su Chen was now in the trial world. Even if the three sisters of Su Yan had fled, there was nothing 
he could do.

Mrs. Li came into the study and saw Su Chen When she woke up, she smiled and said,

"Husband, you wake up!"

Su Chen stood up and moved around a bit before replying,"You just woke up, have you all dealt 
with your own affairs?"

"Um!"

Su Chen hugged Mrs. Li's plump waist and said,

"Don't be sad. Your sons have been bewitched by those immortals since they were young. Just 
pretend you don't have those sons."

"I see!"

Su Chen hugged Mrs. Li and touched her pretty face.

Mrs. Li and Mrs. Huang have become more beautiful and attractive since they started practicing.



After Su Chen saw these beautiful and attractive women, he My heart will relax a lot. No wonder 
beautiful women are the best medicine for men to relieve stress. Su Chen thinks this sentence is 
very good.

"Husband!"

Mrs. Li's face turned rosy when she was caressed by Su Chen. She leaned in Su Chen's arms and 
buried her head in Su Chen's chest.

Whoosh!

Su Chen hugged Mrs. Li and disappeared into the study. She was so beautiful, and Mrs. Li today 
We also need to feel reassured. Su Chen will not let Mrs. Li down, and of course there are Queen 
Jiang and the other girls, who will come over soon. In the main world, on the ladder to heaven, the 
three sisters Su Yan are climbing the ladder with difficulty, and they are also They didn't expect that 
the ladder would summon their sisters, and it was also said that they could climb the 10,000-story 
ladder. No matter the number of times, they could climb the ladder countless times in the future.

Elena gasped and screamed, wet all over her body at this moment,

"Sister, I can't do it anymore. I can't climb a thousand floors."

Su Yan looked at Elena's hard climb, and she felt very helpless. Elena is a fairy. She came to climb 
the 10,000-story ladder to embarrass her.

However, the three sisters must advance and retreat together.

The Holy Soul of the Ladder promised them that as long as they climbed a thousand floors, the 
Holy Soul of the Ladder would open a trial world. In order to play in the trial world, Su Yan had to 
take Su Yue and Elena to climb to the thousand floor.

"Elena, come on, you have only climbed over a hundred floors. Keep climbing. As long as we climb 
to a thousand floors, the Holy Spirit of the Ladder will let us go to other worlds. You must persist."

Su Yue also smiled at Elena and cheered,



"Yes, Elena, come on, in order to play in other worlds, you must come on, otherwise my eldest 
sister and I will go to the new world to play, and you will be the only one left in the Merlot 
Heaven!".
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Elena's face turned dark when she heard what Su Yan and Su Yue said, insist?

How could she persist?

The ladder to the ten thousandth floor is much more difficult than the ladder to the next ten 
thousand floors. Every time she climbs a step,

Elena is tired and panting. The ladder to the ten thousand floor is not something that a scumbag like 
her can climb.

"Eldest sister, second sister, I really can’t survive. If I continue to climb, I feel like my legs will give 
out."

Su Yan said with a serious face,

"No, Elena, you have to keep climbing. When you are tired, eat peaches and drink water of life. We 
three sisters must climb a thousand floors. Elena touched her belly and smiled bitterly,

"Sister, I just keep eating peaches and drinking water of life. If I continue to eat, I feel like my 
stomach will burst."

Su Yue ate the flat peach and said with a smile to Elena,

"Elena, you can"613" to rest a little longer"

"There is no time limit for us to climb the ladder. You can climb the ladder slowly. Otherwise, if you 
cannot climb a thousand floors, my eldest sister and I will not be able to take you to the trial world."



Elena looked at Su Yan and Su Yue speechlessly.

Are these still her two sisters?

She is a heavenly being who has climbed the 10,000-level ladder. Elena thinks she is the lowest-
level climber in history.

She She climbed more than a hundred floors until she was exhausted, and she kept eating peaches 
and drinking water of life.

If their father knew that she wasted peaches and water of life in this way, Elena would feel that her 
father would be punished again Locked in a small dark room.

After Su Yan thought about it on the 300th floor, she felt that even if Elena spent a year, it would be 
impossible for Elena to climb to the 1,000th floor.

Elena's strength was too weak..A fairy, she may be the lowest climber on the ladder.

Su Yan touched his smooth little chin and said to Elena,

"Elena, you only need to climb five hundred floors. I will tell you a way to easily climb one 
thousand floors."

"real?"

"Really, how could eldest sister deceive you? You have to work hard"

"Well, I will definitely climb to the 500th floor."

At this time, on the 10,000th floor of the ladder, a looming woman in white stood on the 10,000th 
floor.

She looked at the three sisters Su Yan below and whispered,



"Su Chen, your trial mission is about to be completed."

"After this trial,"

"You will advance to the quasi-sage realm and climb the 10,000-story ladder. I hope you can climb 
the 10,000-story ladder."

"I have been trapped in the ladder for countless years. I hope you can free me from the ladder."

In the world of the Conferred God Trial,

Su Chen has nothing to do these days and hangs out with Queen Jiang and the girls.

However, today Su Chen is out of the sky in Chaoge City, and tomorrow is the time for the 
Immortal Army of the Ancient Immortal Realm to be dispatched. Billions of powerful The Immortal 
Army.

In one year, at most, it can sweep across the Western Realm.

In the Immortal Realm,

Hongjun, the five great saints, and that idiot Haotian, they should also make some moves.

At this moment,

Su Chen wants to communicate with the Ancient Heavenly Dao , but he didn’t want that old cunt 
Hongjun to find out.

It’s just that the system chick was too shady.

Su Chen was struggling with whether to agree to the system chick who was an unscrupulous 
businessman.



"Girl, no matter what, we are all dependent on each other for life and death, can't you not exploit 
me?"

"Ding, host, this is an exchange of equal value, and the system does not exploit the host."

Su Chen yelled with a black face,

"I believe you!"

"I only have a few sources of heaven left, and you still want to take them all. Isn't this exploitation? 
Not long ago, I won the Luck War. You should have obtained some source of heaven, right?" (To 
read exciting novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Ding, host, there are very few sources of heavenly law obtained from the place of destiny, which is 
not enough for the system. Also, host, if the system is upgraded, this system will be of greater help 
to you."

Su Chen rubbed his forehead and said bargainingly,

"Girl, you want too much of the source of heaven. I still have a big family to raise. Can you ask for 
less this time?"

"Ding, what do you think?"

"I said yes!"

"Ding, you are so shameless. It is also the misfortune of this system that you are a shameless and 
shameless host."

"You're unlucky ass!"

"Ding, shameless, host, the minimum is 80%, you have no room for bargaining"

"What the hell!"



Su Chen is helpless at this moment.

The system girl is too obsessed with the origin of heaven.

Su Chen also knows that the system will be upgraded if it gets enough origin of heaven. This is of 
great benefit to him....0

But Su Chen still has people to support a large family.

The threat from the extraterrestrial demon world and the beast realm has arrived, and the realm war 
may start at any time. Su Chen also wants to improve the strength of Nuwa Empress and the saints 
of Gaia.

Otherwise, after the Realm War begins, there will be no powerful saints in the Xuantian Realm, and 
Su Chen may lose the Realm War.

By then, his women, children, relatives, and countless subordinates and troops will all be lost. They 
may all be killed after defeat in Xuantian Realm.

Su Chen looked at the source of Heaven's Law in the system space, and there was a little more.

Damn, the system girl had planned this.

One of the sources of Heaven's Law was going to be exploited by the system chick again. The 
remaining little source of Heaven's Law,

Su Chen I feel very helpless when I look at it. The origin of the way of heaven is that all the women 
in this world are not enough.

"Girl, I agree."

"Ding, within ten breaths, the system will block all exploration here, and the host can safely 
communicate with the ancient heaven."



"Black-hearted girl."

Su Chen discovered that the source of Heavenly Dao disappeared in the system space. He curled his 
lips and mocked the system girl. At this time,

Hongjun from Zixiao Palace in the chaos and the five great saints from the prehistoric fairyland 
were all looking at Su Chen. ,

Su Chen appeared in the air for no reason, and Su Chen's face showed an angry expression for a 
while, and turned black and helpless for a while. They didn't know what Su Chen was doing.

But the prehistoric fairy world was about to launch a boundary war, and

Su Chen's face turned black and helpless.

They must treat Chen's every move with caution

"My fellow Taoist, what is Su Chen doing?"

"I don’t know. I can’t detect Su Chen’s aura at this moment. Su Chen is clearly in the air, but I can’t 
even detect Su Chen’s aura. That bastard is so weird."

"Me too, I could detect Su Chen's aura just now and see the change in Su Chen's expression, but for 
a moment, Su Chen was clearly still in the air, and I couldn't even detect Su Chen's aura at all."

"Su Chen is so weird. He may have found out that we were probing him. Maybe Su Chen used 
some treasure to block our inspection."

"possible!"

"Forget it, Dao Ancestor should be more anxious than us, we should wait for Dao Ancestor’s 
instructions to us."

Chapter 2570



After I talked with the five great saints of Zhunti for a while, they all looked at Su Chen in the sky.

Regarding Su Chen's weirdness today, they guessed that Hongjun would be even more confused. 
The five saints all knew that Hongjun wanted to kill Su Chen , but Su Chen was very difficult to 
kill. The five saints had not sworn to kill Su Chen. To take action was to make an oath of heaven to 
protect Su Chen. These Hongjun all knew that the five saints were not worried that Hongjun would 
force them to take action against Su Chen. However, the five saints also wished that Su Chen would 
be killed and Su Chen would not die. Saints like them had no status in the prehistoric immortal 
world, and Su Chen controlled the entire prehistoric immortal world, which was also very 
disadvantageous to them. After a long time, will the creatures in the ancient immortal world still 
remember their saints? Will any living beings join their respective sects? How can they still preach 
in the prehistoric immortal world? How to get enough luck? At this time, in Zixiao Palace, Hongjun 
stood up and walked around restlessly. He suddenly couldn't see what Su Chen was doing, as if 
something blocked his soul from checking. Su Chen was acting strange today, and Hongjun was 
also worried. What is Su Chen going to do again?

"What on earth is Su Chen going to do?"

"Tomorrow is the time for the Immortal Army from the Ancient Immortal Realm to be dispatched. 
Su Chen is acting weird today. Could it be that Su Chen has calculated that he wants Haotian to take 
action?"

Hongjun thought about it and felt that it was impossible. Su Chen had been doing random things 
these days. If Su Chen had figured out that Haotian was going to take action, Su Chen would not be 
able to stay in the mortal world.

"Haotian will take action in a month."

Hongjun didn't want to delay it any longer. He was worried that something would happen. Hongjun 
was originally going to let Haotian take action after half a year, but Su Chen's weirdness today 
made Hongjun uneasy.

"Yes, Daozu!"

Haotian hurriedly replied.



He didn't expect that Hongjun would ask him to take action so soon.

One month later?

One month later, the billions of immortal armies in the prehistoric immortal world should have just 
arrived in the Western Realm. It seems that Su Chen is interested in Hongjun. The threat was too 
great, and Hongjun couldn't wait to destroy Su Chen.

In the sky of Chaoge City,

Su Chen disappeared with a smile on his face.

Although the Great Heavenly Dao could only dance one or two words, accurate or inaccurate, he In 
this conversation with Primordial Tiandao, Su Chen completed what he wanted to do.

In the palace, after Su Chen appeared in the study, he couldn't wait to enter the Demon Tower of 
Desire.

Su Chen looked at the seductive Bing Ji and Xue Ji, he stepped forward and shouted happily,

"Bing Ji, Xue Ji, please stop practicing first. Xue

Ji saw Su Chen arriving and asked with a smile,"Su Chen, why did you come into the Demon Tower 
of Desire again?""

Bing Ji scolded Su Chen with a cold face,

"Little bastard, get out of here, we just served you not long ago, you bastard, don’t disturb our 
practice."

Bing Ji didn't expect that Su Chen came into the Demon Tower of Desire again.

How long has it passed?



Hundreds of years have passed in the Demon Tower of Desire, but only a few days have passed 
outside. This bastard is so hateful. Bing Ji thought of being tortured to death by Su Chen, Her face 
turned red instantly.

Su Chen held Bing Ji and Xue Ji in his arms and said hurriedly,

"I have business this time, Bing Ji, Xue Ji, I just had a conversation with the Great Desolate 
Heaven. You can appear in the Great Desolate Immortal Realm, but you must have enough merit, 
otherwise the Great Desolate Heaven will not allow you to appear in the Prehistoric Immortal 
World.

Xue Ji shook her head and said,"Merit?" How can we, the Chaos Demon God, have merit?"

Bing Ji grabbed Su Chen's erratic hand and said angrily, (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu 
Novel Network!)

"Little bastard, this is not realistic at all. Although the Great Desolate Heavenly Dao agrees with our 
appearance in the Great Desolate Immortal World, we have no merit. Do you think we can appear in 
the Great Desolate Immortal World?"

Su Chen stroked Xue Ji and Bing Ji respectively and said with a smile,

"The merits for me are many, including the merits of heaven and the great road. I have a lot of them. 
I will pass on the merits to you in a moment."

Although the Great Desolate Heavenly Dao agreed, Xue Ji and Bing Ji appeared in the Great 
Desolate Immortal World, but their appearance in the Great Desolate Immortal World will consume 
their merits.

Su Chen understands the approach of the Great Desolate Heavenly Dao.

After all, Xue Ji and Bing Ji are Chaos Demon Gods, and they have to consume their merits. It 
means that it will not be detrimental to the ancient world. If Xue Ji and Bing Ji have no merit, the 
ancient heaven will immediately expel Xue Ji and Bing Ji.

As for merit,



Su Chen has a lot of merit, and

Xue Ji and Bing Ji appear in the ancient fairy world. Even in ten thousand years, they would not be 
able to use up Su Chen’s merits.

Bing Ji looked at Su Chen and asked doubtfully,

"Little bastard, you don’t need merit?"

Su Chen shook his head and replied,

"Merits are dispensable to me, so you don’t have to worry. I think it will only take a matter of 
minutes to obtain the merits of heaven."

Xue Ji leaned in Su Chen's arms and shook her head and said,

"Forget it, Su Chen, we have been practicing in the Demonic Tower of Desire. It doesn't matter 
whether we can get out or not, and you don't have to waste your merits on us."

Su Chen kissed Xue Ji and explained,

"Xue Ji, I want you to take action this time. There is a saint named Haotian in the ancient immortal 
world. He is a saint in the first level of the holy realm. Haotian may take action against me soon."

"Nuwa is going to the Western Realm tomorrow. There are no saints around me to protect me. I 
think you will kill Haotian."

Bingji frowned and reminded Su Chen,

"saint? Su Chen, if we take action to kill the saint, the laws of heaven will not allow it, right?"

Su Chen stroked Bing Ji's sexy waist and explained,



"Don’t worry, the ancient heaven is on our side now, you can kill Haotian at will"

"If the boundary war hadn't started, and the Great Desolate Heaven had to pay attention to the 
boundary war, that old bastard Hongjun would have blocked the Great Desolate Heaven, and 
Haotian wouldn't have dared to take action against me."

Xue Ji nodded to Su Chen and said,

"Su Chen, as long as the ancient law of heaven does not stop him, it is very easy for us to kill a saint 
who is in the first level of the holy realm."

"You open the sea of luck, and I will pass on the merits to you"

"good!"

After Su Chen opened the Sea of Destiny to Xue Ji (King Nuo's) and Bing Ji, he transferred two 
hundred acres of heavenly merit to Xue Ji and Bing Ji respectively, and also transferred one 
hundred acres of great merit to

Bing Ji. Mei Mu looked at Su Chen and said in surprise,

"Little bastard, I didn’t expect you to have so many heavenly merits, and you even have the great 
virtues."

Su Chen touched Bing Ji's delicate little face and said,

"Bingji, you sound like a little bastard, can't you be more ladylike? No matter what I say, I am still 
your Taoist companion. Look at how gentle and considerate Xue Ji is now."

"Go away, this is my character."

Bing Ji slapped Su Chen's hand away, she was so ashamed and shameless.



When she thought of the disgusting things Su Chen did to her, Bing Ji was so distraught that she 
couldn't practice. Every time Su Chen came to return their tryst, she It will take several months to 
calm down

"Bing Ji, I like your sexy waist very much. I want to see you continue to twist your sexy waist."

"Shameless pervert!".
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