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Xu Zhihu suddenly saw some people coming in at the city gate, and Xu Nian and Li Chungang 
appeared in her eyes.

She became worried.

Wenina wanted to kill Li Chungang.

Xu Zhihu was worried that Xu Nian would also take action.

If Xu Nian took action against Wenina, Xu Zhihu was worried that Wenina and her friends would 
also kill her brother..

Inform Xu Nian and Li Chungang?

Xu Zhihu just thought about it.

Although she was worried about Xu Nian, she didn't want to inform Li Chungang that someone was 
going to kill her.

In the past few days, Wenina had taken great care of her. If it weren't for Wenina's care along the 
way, Xu Zhihu would have been It is impossible for a weak body to come to Emperor Wu City.

Venina drank tea elegantly and said,

"Xu Zhihu, you can inform Li Chungang. Although my friends have not arrived yet, fighting is 
prohibited in Emperor Wu City. You have informed Li Chungang. Does he dare to attack me in 
Emperor Wu City?"

Xu Zhihu said with a smile,



"Huh? You are right!"

"Xu Zhihu, you can join your brother."

Wenina looked at the seven or eight people coming in from the city gate. One of them, the one-
armed old man, was in danger to her. She guessed that the one-armed old man should be Li 
Chungang from the second task.

Wenina checked and became confused. Brows, Li Chungang is a being at the pinnacle of the 
Heavenly Realm, and her cultivation realm is suppressed by the Grand Master. Wenina may not be 
able to kill Li Chungang.

Xu Zhihu shook his head and replied,"Forget it, my brother came to Emperor Wu City because I 
have something to do. I'm just a useless person, a dying person. I won't drag my brother down."

"Xu Zhihu, I can’t cure your disease, but my husband can cure you. It’s just that I haven’t seen my 
husband in more than a year."

"Your husband? Is your husband traveling far away?"

"Traveling far away? My husband is traveling far away."

Wenina shook her head and smiled bitterly, traveling far away?

Wenina and Su Chen are a world apart, and each time they meet, it only lasts a few days.

Su Chen has not participated in the destiny mission several times, and she has not been for a long 
time. Seeing that bastard, Wenina didn't know if Su Chen would participate in this fate mission.

Xu Zhihu looked at Wenina drinking tea. She looked at Xu Nian and wanted to know what Xu Nian 
was going to do.

Retrieve Lao Huang's sword box?



Or does Xu Nian have another purpose?

At this moment, at the gate of Emperor Wu's city,

Zhao Kai appeared at the gate with talisman Hong Jia and Yuan Tingshan. Zhao Kai stopped when 
he saw the old man holding a peach blossom under the tree. Come down.

Yuan Tingshan asked doubtfully,

"What's wrong?"

Zhao Kai said with a serious face,"Peach Blossom Sword God, Mrs. Deng!"

"Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a? Why did the Peach Blossom Sword God also come to 
Emperor Wu City?"

"I don’t know, let’s go into Emperor Wu City"

"good!"

Zhao Kai and vigilantly walked past Deng Tai'a.

The Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a appeared in Emperor Wu's City. They guessed that 
something big might happen in Emperor Wu's City.

Su Chen, Bai Yuekui and Qingniao walked to the gate of Emperor Wu's City. They saw just now 
Zhao Kai and the three people entered Wu Emperor City.

Bai Yuekui asked in confusion,

"Husband, who are the three people in front of you? Su



Chen hugged Bai Yuekui and replied,"The people who killed Xu Nian were the illegitimate son of 
the Emperor of Liyang and the other a selfish speculator. We don't have to worry about them.""

"Haha~ Xu Nian has so many enemies."

Bai Yuekui leaned into Su Chen's arms and laughed.

Over the past few days,

Su Chen had told her that Xu Nian was a disaster star. No matter where Xu Nian appeared, he 
would be assassinated.

"Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a?"

Su Chen appeared next to Deng Tai'a with Bai Yuekui in his arms. He nodded to the old man 
holding the peach branch.

Deng Tai'a, the Peach Blossom Sword God, is good.

In the story in the snow,

Su Chen felt good about Deng Tai'a.

The protagonist Xu Nian, (If you want to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

There is also Xu Nian’s father, Xu Xiao.

Su Chen feels bad about them.

One is a little cunt, the other is an old cunt, and

Xu Xiao is still for the purpose. An unscrupulous old bastard.



Bai Yuekui and Qingniao both looked at Deng Tai'a.

Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a?

They didn't expect that Deng Tai'a, the Peach Blossom Sword God, would also appear in Emperor 
Wu's City. What was Deng Tai'a doing when Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a appeared in 
Emperor Wu's City

? Tai'a asked doubtfully, holding a peach branch in his hand,

"Little friend, do you know me?"

"do not know!"

"Do you have a problem with me?"

"Something happened!"

"What does my little friend want to do with me? Su

Chen threw a pot of wine to Deng Tai'a and said,"Sword God Deng, I want to kill Li Chungang. If 
you don't want Xu Nian to be killed by me, you'd better watch Xu Nian and don't anger me.""

0request flowers

"Kill Li Chungang? I understand. Thank you for the wine, little friend."

Deng Tai'a nodded to Su Chen.

Does Su Chen want to kill Li Chungang?

He felt that Li Chungang was dead.



Ever since Su Chen appeared next to him, Deng Tai'a felt that Su Chen was very dangerous, and he 
was more dangerous than Wang Xianzhi to him. The feeling is a hundred times, a thousand times 
more dangerous, a Zhixuan realm?

Deng Tai'a guessed that Su Chen had hidden his cultivation realm. He couldn't find out Su Chen's 
real cultivation realm, but it would be very easy for Su Chen to kill Li Chungang.

Xu Nian?

Deng Tai'a came to Emperor Wu City to repay his kindness. Xu Nian's mother was kind to him. He 
came to Emperor Wu City to save Xu Nian once. If Xu Nian offended Su Chen regardless of life 
and death, Deng Tai'a would not be able to save Xu Nian..Su

Chen nodded to Deng Tai'a, and he took Bai Yuekui and Qingniao into Emperor Wu City.

"A terrifying young man, who is this person? Why have you never heard of it?"

Deng Tai'a touched his beard and shook his head.

He saw that Su Chen's energy and blood were strong.

Su Chen was not an old monster, but a young man. Why did he have a terrifying aura?

Immortal?

Deng Tai'a thought about it and raised his eyebrows.

Immortal?

He felt that Su Chen could not be an immortal.

Immortals have no desires or desires.



Su Chen had two beautiful beauties around him, one of whom had lost her vitality. It was 
impossible for an immortal to have a woman, and it was even less likely that he would fall in love 
with a mortal. A woman in the room.

On the East China Sea, a ship was about to arrive at Emperor Wu City.

In the cabin,

Mu Ningxue checked Qilin's injuries. She walked out of the cabin with a worried look.

On the deck, a beautiful woman with an indifferent expression saw Mu Ningxue. , she asked 
expressionlessly,"Miss Mu, how is your companion?"

"Miss Xu, my companion's condition is very bad. He may not be able to survive for a few days."

Mun Ningxue was very grateful to the Qing Leng woman.

If she and Qilin had not met the Qing Leng woman, they might have been caught up and killed by 
the masters of the Wudang Sect.

"Miss Mu, your companion's injury is too serious. He has persisted for six or seven days and is 
doing very well. He will arrive at Emperor Wu City in a while. Are you going to prepare for your 
companion's future life?"
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The cold woman was Xu Weixiong.

She got the news a month ago that Xu Nian was going to Emperor Wu City.

A few days ago,

Xu Nian passed by the academy and did not look for her. Xu Weixiong was worried about Xu 
Nian's safety, so she took a boat from the academy to Emperor Emperor City. To protect her brother 
Xu Nian.



On the way,

Xu Weixiong discovered Mu Ningxue and Qilin, who were seriously injured.

She felt that Mu Ningxue and Qilin did not look like villains, so Xu Weixiong let Mu Ningxue and 
Qilin board her ship.

Mu Ningxue shook her head and said,

"Qilin will not die. If my companion is in Emperor Wu City, Qilin's injuries will be cured by my 
companion."

"up to you!"

Xu Weixiong didn't say much.

She checked Qilin's injuries a few days ago.

Qilin's internal organs were displaced and his chest was almost collapsed due to the attack. Xu 
Weixiong didn't think Qilin could be saved.

Mu Ningxue looked at the sea. whispered,

"Su Chen, you must participate in this mission and be in Emperor Wu City, otherwise Qilin will 
really die."

In Emperor Wu's City,

Su Chen was walking on the street with Bai Yuekui and Qingniao. He was not in a hurry to kill Li 
Chungang and destroyImperial City.

There will be a good 02 scene soon.



Su Chen plans to watch the scene first and then complete the remaining two tasks.

"Suchen! Bai Yuekui!"

In the tea shop,

Wenina suddenly discovered Su Chen and Bai Yuekui, and she shouted excitedly.

Xu Zhihu hurriedly looked over, and

Wenina shouted their names excitedly. She guessed that Wenina The person waiting appears

"Venina!"

"Venina, are you alone? Where are Mu Ningxue and Qilin? Have you encountered it?"

Su Chen and Bai Yuekui hurriedly walked into the tea shop. They didn't expect to meet Wenina as 
soon as they entered Emperor Wu City.

Wenina hugged Su Chen and said with a smile,

"I didn’t meet Mu Ningxue and Qilin. Husband, I didn’t expect you to participate in the mission this 
time."

"Venina, you are even more sexy and attractive."

Su Chen hugged Wenina and kissed her fiercely. The sexy and alluring Wenina, her plump body 
could almost squeeze out water, especially the proudly erect mountain. Su Chen couldn't help but 
want to touch and ravage her.

Xu Zhihu and Qingniao saw Su Chen kissing Wenina in public. They both blushed and looked 
away.



However,

Qingniao and Xu Zhihu were very confused about each other.

Qingniao wondered why Xu Zhihu was with Wenina. Could it be that Was Xu Zhihu captured by 
Venina and brought to Emperor Wu City?

Xu Zhihu thought about why Qingniao and Xu Nian were not together.

Xu Nian had just passed by here.

Qingniao was Xu Nian's maid and bodyguard. Xu Zhihu couldn't figure it out. How could Qingniao 
be with Su Chen?

At this moment,

Su Chen and Bai Yuekui talked with Wenina for a while, and they all understood each other's 
experiences during this period.

Su Chen hugged the plump Wenina and said,"Mun Ningxue Nothing will happen to Qilin. We have 
completed mission one. Mu Ningxue and Qilin will also come to Emperor Wu City to join us."

Wenina leaned into Su Chen's arms and smiled,

"Well, husband, I also guessed that other team members would come to Emperor Wu City, so I 
arrived at Emperor Emperor City in advance. Bai

Yuekui poured a cup of tea for Su Chen and asked,"Wenina, have you checked Emperor Wu's 
City?" What level of cultivation is Wang Xianzhi? Venina replied with a serious face,

"I have checked, and I don’t know what level of cultivation Wang Xianzhi is, but I feel that Wang 
Xianzhi may be about to reach the golden elixir level, and he gives me a very dangerous feeling."



Bai Yuekui frowned and said, (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Golden elixir realm? There is some trouble. If our cultivation realm is not suppressed, we can 
suppress a scumbag in the Golden Core realm with our momentum."

Su Chen drank tea and looked at Xu Zhihu. He did not participate in the conversation between Bai 
Yuekui and Wenina.

Xu Zhihu?

Why did this sick beauty come to Emperor Wu City with Wenina?

The plot is messed up.

What if Xu Weixiong also arrived?

The plot will be completely chaotic if the protagonist and supporting characters arrive at Emperor 
Wu City.

However, if both the protagonist and the supporting characters arrive at Emperor Emperor City, the 
city will be even more lively.

"Your name is Su Chen, right? Isn't it a bit too much for you to look at a woman like this?"

Xu Zhihu was a little angry at this moment.

Su Chen looked at her without blinking, and also looked at her figure unabashedly. Xu Zhihu 
blushed and wanted to pour the tea on Su Chen's head.

Su Chen drank it He took a sip of tea and said,"Xu Zhihu, your brother can be said to have a grudge 
against me. I stole your brother Xu Nian's maid Qingniao. Guess what I will do to you!""



Su Chen didn't find out that there is another soul in Xu Zhihu's body. She is the reincarnation of Lu 
Zu's favorite woman, but she is also a brand new human being, not a woman with two souls in one 
body.

Xu Zhihu said indifferently," I'm just a dying person, I can kill or cut into pieces as I please"

"What if I let you sleep with me?"

"Shameless! I will never agree to it"

"Haha ~ Xu Zhihu, maybe you will agree to sleep with me"

"dream!"

Xu Zhihu glared at Su Chen angrily.

She felt that Su Chen was a shameless pervert. Su Chen had kissed Wenina in public before, and 
now he was targeting her again.

Xu Zhihu regretted staying.

She should have been with him before. The younger brothers gathered together and left.

Wenina and Bai Yuekui shook their heads speechlessly. They were too lazy to care about Su Chen 
teasing Xu Zhihu.

As for Xu Zhihu, they guessed that Su Chen was just joking with Xu Zhihu.

Su Chen was from the same realm. Emperor Tian,

what kind of beautiful woman does he want?



Although Xu Zhihu is very attractive and beautiful, no matter how beautiful he is, will he be as 
beautiful as a fairy? They think Su Chen is teasing Xu Zhihu.

Qingniao lowered his head and didn't want to Seeing Su Chen teasing Xu Zhihu, she didn't know 
why Su Chen did this.

However,

Qingniao thought that Su Chen had told Xu Zhihu's identity. Xu Zhihu was the woman Lu Zu liked, 
and she was the reincarnation of someone more than five hundred years ago. She guessed what 
purpose Su Chen might have in teasing Xu Zhihu.

Thinking of Xu Zhihu's illness, Wenina reached out and said to Su Chen,

"Husband, give me some spiritual fruit. We have all used up the spiritual fruit."

Su Chen handed Wenina a space ring and said,

"Here you go, there are thousands of low-level spiritual fruits in the space ring, Venina. There are 
also some fairy fruits and elixirs in the ring. You must not eat those before you become an 
immortal."

When Su Chen decided to participate in the Luck Mission, he asked his men to prepare many low-
level spiritual fruits, as well as some low-level fairy fruits and elixirs.

Wenina and Bai Yuekui had not yet become immortals, so Su Chen gave them to Wenina in 
advance. Several people prepared some training resources

"I know!"

Wenina nodded to Su Chen, she took out a spiritual fruit and handed it to Xu Zhihu and said,

"Xu Zhihu, if you eat this fruit, your illness will be completely recovered."



"Spiritual fruit? Fairy fruit? Space ring? Venina, who are you? How come you have treasures from 
the fairy world?".
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Xu Zhihu looked at Su Chen and Wenina in surprise,

"Lingguo?"

Fairy fruit?

Space ring?

Aren't these the legendary treasures of the fairy world?

How could Su Chen and the others have treasures from the fairy world? Are they from the fairy 
world?

Impossible, they are just powerful humans, they cannot be immortals, and this bastard Su Chen 
doesn't look like an immortal either.

Su Chen asked with a smile,

"Xu Zhihu, you want to know our identities?"

"Want to know!"

"Call me husband and I will tell you"

"Shameless!"

Xu Zhihu angrily picked up the tea cup and threw it at Su Chen. She couldn't bear this shameless 
pervert.



After teasing her again and again,

Su Chen was a shameless bastard.

Bang!

Su Chen bent down to avoid it. After Xu Zhihu threw the teacup, he touched his nose and stopped 
teasing Xu Zhihu.

The sick beauty was really angry.

Su Chen was worried that Xu Zhihu would be mad to death.

Qingniao stood next to Su Chen with his arms folded. She felt very uneasy.

The items Su Chen gave to Wenina were all legendary items in the fairy world.

Qingniao also became curious about the identities of Su Chen, Wenina, and Bai Yuekui, but she 
didn't believe Su Chen813 The three of them are immortals, especially Su Chen.

This bastard is too lustful.

Immortals have no desires and desires. It is impossible to be lustful, and it is even more impossible 
to fall in love with a mortal woman.

Wenina got up from Su Chen's arms, and she walked to Xu Zhihu said next to him,

"Xu Zhihu, eat the spiritual fruit quickly. I'm worried that you will be pissed to death by my 
husband soon."

"good!"

Xu Zhihu glared at Su Chen, and she took the spiritual fruit and ate it.



If the spiritual fruit could cure her disease, Xu Zhihu would not have to suffer from the disease 
anymore.

"Bluebird, you eat too!"

Su Chen took out more than ten low-level spiritual fruits and put them on the table.

Xu Zhihu was eating the spiritual fruits.

They couldn't watch.

Su Chen brought a lot of spiritual fruits this time. Although these spiritual fruits were not very good. 
, but it is still good for Wenina and the girls.

Especially Xu Zhihu and Qingniao.

Eating the spiritual fruit will improve their strength. Qingniao may be promoted to the heavenly 
realm, and

Xu Zhihu should be able to be promoted to the master. , is just an empty-shell grandmaster.

Boom!

Suddenly,

Xu Zhihu and Qingniao began to advance.

In just a few breaths,

Xu Zhihu advanced from the state of no cultivation to the innate state, and he was still advancing.



Qingniao She was originally a grand master, but her realm was suddenly promoted to the great 
master.

A quarter of an hour later, the auras of Xu Zhihu and Qingniao stabilized. Xu Zhihu was the peak 
master (Vajra realm) of the empty shell.

Qingniao was promoted to the heavenly being. In the middle stage of the realm (celestial realm).

Bai Yuekui said to Su Chen,

"Husband, I'll go check out the situation and see if Mu Ningxue and Qilin have arrived."

"Okay, be careful and call us if you need anything"

"I see!"

Bai Yuekui nodded to Su Chen.

She walked out of the tea shop and walked towards a street. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu 
Novel Network!)

Wenina asked in surprise,

"Husband, did you win Bai Yuekui?"

"Of course, is it strange that I won Bai Yuekui? Wenina rolled her eyes at Su Chen and said,"It's not 
surprising. I'm just curious about why you took down Bai Yuekui so late.""

Su Chen touched his chin and smiled.

"Alas, there are too many beauties in the team, and I never had the chance to win over Bai Yuokui."

"You are so shameless!"



Wenina is too lazy to pay attention to this bastard.

Of the two women in the team, maybe Mu Ningxue is the only one who has not been captured by 
Su Chen. This bastard has taken care of all the women in the team.

At this moment,

Xu Zhihu and Qingniao opened Their eyes were closed, with incredible expressions on their faces.

Xu Zhihu's body fully recovered, and she felt very relaxed.

After Qingniao discovered that she had advanced to the celestial realm, a rare smile appeared on her 
unsmiling face. (acab)

Kacha!

Xu Zhihu suddenly broke off a corner of the table with one hand. She looked at the broken wood in 
her hand in confusion.

What happened?

Xu Zhihu just pinched the corner of the table gently. How could she break off the corner of the table 
easily? Next?

Qingniao hurriedly reminded Xu Zhihu,"Miss Xu, you are currently in the Vajra realm, and you 
have not yet mastered your power. You'd better get familiar with your power first."

Xu Zhihu said confusedly,

"Am I in the Vajra realm now? How can this be? A spiritual fruit not only cured my illness, but also 
made me a master of martial arts? It's unbelievable."

Su Chen laughed while drinking tea,



"Beauty Xu, you are just an empty shell of the Vajra Realm. You have an empty realm and no 
strength. You are still a scum to other Vajra Realms. To us, you are just an ant. Xu

Zhihu shouted angrily,"Shameless bastard, you are the scum, you are the ant.""

Su Chen curled his lips to scare Xu Zhihu and said,

"Beauty Xu, I forgot to tell you. If you eat my spiritual fruit, you will become my concubine in the 
future. Otherwise, if you don’t eat the subsequent spiritual fruit ten days later, you will instantly 
become an ugly man of seventy or eighty years old. Old woman.

Xu Zhihu clenched his fists tightly and said,"You are deceiving me, right?" I don't believe what you 
said."

Qingniao also stared at Su Chen.

She didn't know if what Su Chen said was true, but she was also worried that she would become an 
old woman in ten days.

Su Chen took out a red spiritual fruit, shook it and said,

"Beauty Xu, spiritual fruits are not easy to eat. Have you seen this red spiritual fruit?"

"As long as you eat this spiritual fruit, after ten days, not only will you not become an old woman, 
but you will also have an ageless appearance and will always remain your most beautiful and sexy 
age."

Xu Zhihu glared at Su Chen angrily.

She felt that Su Chen had tricked her.

Although a spiritual fruit cured her disease and made her a Vajra realm warrior, what will happen in 
ten days?



She will To become an old woman with gray hair,

Xu Zhihu would rather die than see her gray hair and wrinkled face.

Wenina looked at Su Chen speechlessly.

Su Chen was talking nonsense. She will turn into an old woman in the future. Xu Zhihu will never 
become an old woman even in a hundred years.

There is also a red spiritual fruit.

The red spiritual fruit is just an ordinary spiritual fruit with a sweet and sour taste.

"Bluebird, I give you this spiritual fruit. From now on you will not only be my maid, but also my 
concubine."

After Su Chen gave the red spirit fruit to Qingniao, he looked at Xu Zhihu and smiled.

Xu Zhihu must have been frightened, right?

Will the sick beauty ask him for the spirit fruit?

Qingniao nodded with a cold face. ,

"Yes, master!".

Chapter 2874
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Qingniao lowered her head expressionlessly.

She had already guessed that Su Chen would never let her go, and she had nowhere to go. Ever 
since Qingniao heard what Su Chen said, she would no longer protect Xu Nian, and it was 
impossible for her to do so. Become Xu Nian's dead soldier again.

Qingniao is now in the Celestial Realm. She has the ability to avenge her father and kill Chen 
Zhibao.

If Qingniao takes revenge, she will do her best to be Su Chen's maid, even if she is a concubine

"Shameless pervert!"

Xu Zhihu heard that Su Chen asked Qingniao to be his concubine, and Qingniao agreed without 
hesitation. She couldn't understand why Qingniao agreed. Did Qingniao betray her brother Xu 
Nian?

Su Chen curled his lips and mocked,

"Hey, Miss Xu, just wait until you become an old woman in ten days."

"Even if I become an old woman, I will never agree to be the concubine of a bastard like you." 
143""

Xu Zhihu has never been so angry.

She has always been calm. Even when she encounters the most angry things, she never curses and 
reprimands loudly.

But this bastard was so shameless and shameless.

Xu Zhihu couldn't bear it and scolded this bastard.



Su Chen drank tea and ignored Xu Zhihu.

He was a little strange now.

Wouldn't Xu Nian provoke Wang Xianzhi when he came to Emperor Wu City?

It's been more than an hour since Xu Nian entered Emperor Wu's city. Why hasn't he provoked 
Wang Xianzhi yet?

Didn't he take Old Huang's sword box?

Or does Xu Nian have any plans?

In the tea shop,

Wenina rested against Su Chen's body.

She liked to smell Su Chen's scent, and she also liked to rest in Su Chen's arms like this.

Qingniao stood beside Su Chen like a bodyguard.

Xu Zhihu glared at Su Chen angrily.

She felt ignored by Su Chen, a shameless bastard.

Xu Zhihu wanted to yell at Su Chen. , she can't curse now.

At this time, Xu Nian and Li Chungang were sitting together in a small restaurant, drinking wine. 
Xu Nian was going to go to the tower to get Lao Huang's sword box, but was stopped by Li 
Chungang.

Xu Nian asked while drinking,



"Senior Li, why can't I get the sword box now? Can't you contain Wang Xianzhi?"

Li Chungang reminded with a serious face,

"Xu Xiaozi, you must know that Su Chen has also come to Emperor Wu City. Let's first see what Su 
Chen does when he comes to Emperor Emperor City.

Xu Nian continued to ask confused,"Su Chen?" Senior Li, you have returned to the fairyland on 
land, are you still afraid of that Su Chen?"

Li Chungang shook his head and replied,

"It's not that I'm afraid, Mr. Xu, I'm worried that Su Chen has impure thoughts when he comes to 
Emperor Wu City. If, if I fight with Wang Xianzhi, my fight with Wang Xianzhi may open the gate 
of heaven."

"I guessed that Su Chen might take advantage of my fight with Wang Xianzhi, and that Su Chen 
would enter the fairy world after the Tianmen opened. I would not let Su Chen use me and Wang 
Xianzhi to enter the fairy world."

Jiang Ni asked doubtfully next to him,

"Senior, is there really a fairyland in this world?"

Li Chungang nodded and replied,

"have!

Jiang Ni frowned and asked,"Yes?" Why have I never heard of anyone entering the fairy world?"

Li Chungang explained while stroking his beard,

"Haha ~ Girl Jiang, more than five hundred years ago, Lu Zu opened the gate of heaven, but he did 
not enter the fairy world because of something. The fairy world is a real existence."



Jiang Ni and Xu Nian, as well as Wei Shuyang and Shu Sha, were very surprised when they heard 
Li Chungang's words.

The immortal world really exists, and there are still people who can enter the immortal world 
without entering,

Lu Zu!

All of them have heard of Lu Zu Zu, a terrifying top powerhouse hundreds of years ago.

Wang Xianzhi claims to be the second best in the world. (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu 
Novel Network!)

He dare not claim to be the best in the world because of Lu Zu.

Next to him, he is eating The kid's eyes lit up.

He was the living ancestor of Longhu Mountain,

Zhao Xuansu.

The reason why Zhao Xuansu came to Emperor Wu City with Xu Nian was not only to kill Xu Nian 
and Zhao Kai, but also to open the Tianmen due to the battle between Li Chungang and Wang 
Xianzhi. His goal.

Zhao Xuansu has lived too long.

If he cannot ascend to the immortal world, he will not live long in the human world.

The battle between Li Chungang and Wang Xianzhi is his chance, and it may be his only chance in 
this life. As long as the gate of heaven is opened, Zhao Xuansu will Will take the opportunity to 
enter the gate of heaven and ascend to the fairy world



【Suchen? I hope you don’t destroy your good deeds, otherwise the ancestor will kill you, and 

anyone who prevents you from ascending will die. 】

Xu Nian bent down to Li Chungang and said,

"Senior Li, let's rest in Emperor Wu City for a while and check the situation tomorrow. If Su Chen 
doesn't do anything, I will go to the city tower to get the sword box. Wang Xianzhi will ask Senior 
Li. 0.."

Li Chungang nodded in agreement,

"Okay, as long as Su Chen doesn't do anything, I also want to have a good fight with Wang 
Xianzhi"

"Thank you, senior"

"Boy, you're welcome, I'm doing it for Girl Jiang."

Jiang Nibai glanced at Li Chungang speechlessly.

She was very uneasy at the moment.

Ever since she knew that Su Chen had been following them, Jiang Ni wanted to ask more than once 
why Su Chen asked his wife to kill Cao Changqing.

【When I go to see that bastard tonight, I must ask Su Chen why that bastard asked his wife to kill 
Cao Changqing. ]

In the evening, Su Chen rented an independent small courtyard in an inn in Emperor Wu City , and 
the four girls Wenina and Bai Yuekui lived in their own rooms in the small courtyard. In the 
pavilion in the small courtyard, Su Chen, Bai Yuekui and the other girls were sitting here and 
resting. Bai Yuekui drank tea and asked doubtfully,

"Husband, Li Chungang and Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a have all arrived at Emperor Wu 
City, why didn't Wang Xianzhi show up?"



Su Chen replied with a smile,

"Wang Xianzhi may consider himself superior and powerful, and he doesn't care about Li Chungang 
and Deng Tai'a. Venina said in disbelief,

"is it possible? No matter how you say it, Wang Xianzhi is the top person in the world. No matter 
how self-righteous he is, he cannot underestimate the powerful Li Chungang and Deng Tai'a."

"Who knows, maybe Wang Xian 0.6 Chi is here.....Um? Mu Ningxue’s ice magic? Mu Ningxue is 
fighting?"

Su Chen and the girls were making random guesses as to why Wang Xianzhi didn't show up. He 
suddenly sensed Mu Ningxue's fighting aura outside Emperor Wu's city.

Wenina asked hurriedly,

"Husband, Mu Ningxue comes to Emperor Wu City? Who is she fighting?"

"You guys wait for me here, I'll go over and take a look."

Su Chen said to Wenina and Bai Yuekui.

He disappeared in the pavilion instantly.

Mu Ningxue didn't know who she was fighting with. Su Chen was also worried that Mu Ningxue 
would encounter a powerful enemy.

Wenina saw Su Chen disappeared instantly, and she asked Bai Yuekui beside her,

"Mu Ningxue arrived at Emperor Wu City, where is Qilin? Bai Yuekui, do you think Qilin will also 
come to Emperor Wu City?"



"I don’t know, I didn’t notice the breath of Qilin this afternoon, but Qilin will definitely come to 
Emperor Wu City"

Chapter 2875

Bai Yuekui didn't know who Mu Ningxue was fighting, but Mu Ningxue appeared.

Where was Qilin?

That Qilin who always stayed quietly aside, she didn't know if something would happen to Qilin.

Bai Yuekui felt uneasy for the past few days, so she looked for Mu Ningxue and Qilin when she 
arrived at Emperor Wu City.

In her world,

Bai Yuekui would always get into trouble if he was restless. Now that Mu Ningxue had appeared, 
could it be that something had happened if Qilin didn't show up?

Venina smiled and said,

"Forget it, Su Chen went over, hoping that Mu Ningxue and Qilin would be together so that all the 
members of our team would be gathered."

Xu Zhihu and Qingniao were thinking about it.

There were two other friends of Su Chen.

One seemed to be fighting outside Emperor Wu's city, and the other was still missing.

They couldn't figure out who Su Chen and these people were.

Qingniao thought that besides the terror, In addition to Su Chen,



Wenina and Bai Yuekui are also very powerful.

The other people who have not come should also be very powerful. What are these people going to 
do when they come to Emperor Wu City?

Xu Zhihu's face is very pale.

She understands that Su Chen and Wenina are What do people want to do?

Kill Cao Changqing, kill Li Chungang, and destroy Emperor Wu City.

Xu Zhihu became worried about her brother Xu Nian. Su Chen used a spiritual fruit to make her a 
master 430 player. She guessed that Su Chen and Wenina and others are very powerful.

If, if, her brother Xu Nian goes against Su Chen, Xu Zhihu guesses that Su Chen will kill her 
brother Xu Nian.

At this time, on the beach outside Emperor Wu City,

Muning Xue was fighting with seven Wudang Sect masters. Xu Weixiong took the seriously injured 
Qilin and fled towards Emperor Wu.

However, other disciples of the Wudang Sect surrounded Xu Weixiong and Qilin. If it weren't for 
the Wudang Sect disciples, they would have captured Xu Weixiong alive. and Qilin, they had long 
died under the swords of Wudang disciples.

Xu Weixiong supported Qilin and stood aside.

She looked at the more than ten disciples around and felt helpless. These disciples were all in the 
Vajra realm, and she could deal with one or two , but there were more than ten Wudang Sect 
disciples, and Xu Weixiong was no match for them.

A Wudang Sect disciple shouted indifferently,



"You'd better not act rashly, or you'll die! Woman, we have nothing against you, you can leave. Xu

Weixiong asked with an indifferent expression,"Wudang Sect disciples, why do you want to kill 
innocent people indiscriminately?""

"It's none of your business."

Qilin covered his chest and said with a pale face,

"Miss Xu, please leave (acda), the Wudang Sect disciples are going to kill us, you don’t have to die 
for me. Xu

Weixiong shook his head and replied,"No, I promise Mu Ningxue to take you into Emperor Wu 
City, and I will not abandon you and escape.""

Poof!

Qilin spat out a mouthful of blood and said,

"Miss Xu, thank you, but no, I hope Miss Xu will go to Emperor Wu City to look for Bai Yuekui, 
Wenina, and Su Chen. As long as you tell them what happened, you will help Mu Ningxue and me."

"Qilin, are you okay?"

"I can't die yet, Miss Xu, I beg you. Mu Ningxue and I will die this time. I hope you can tell our 
friends about our deaths."

"OK, I agree......"

Whoosh!

At this time,



Su Chen suddenly appeared next to Qilin. He looked at the seriously injured Qilin and asked 
hurriedly,

"Kirin? Qilin, how could you be seriously injured?"

"Su Chen, you are finally here, save Mu Ningxue quickly, she is being surrounded by Wudang Sect 
masters."

Bang bang bang....(To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Su Chen waved his hand with an ugly expression, and more than a dozen Wudang Sect disciples 
around him shot their heads to death.

The Wudang Clan dared to surround and kill Mu Ningxue and Qilin, and there was no need for the 
Wudang Clan to exist.

Su Chen hurriedly took out a fairy fruit and squeezed out the juice, and dropped it into Qilin's 
mouth drop by drop.

After five drops,

Su Chen did not dare to drop any more.

He was worried that Qilin would be burst by the fairy fruit. Five drops of fairy fruit juice was 
enough. Restore Qilin's injuries.

Xu Weixiong looked at Su Chen in surprise.

Su Chen just waved his hand, and more than a dozen Wudang disciples in the Vajra realm shot their 
heads to death without even screaming.

How powerful is this person?

Outside Emperor Wu's City, masters appeared one after another.



These masters wanted to see who was fighting, but when everyone saw Su Chen slaying more than 
ten Vajra Realms with his hands, the masters outside Emperor Wu's City were very shocked.

"Who is that person? How could a Zhixuan realm kill more than ten Vajra realms with just a wave 
of his hand?"

"It’s unclear. He seemed to be rescuing a seriously injured man. The person who was killed was a 
disciple of the Wudang Sect. What happened? Why would a Wu-Tang Clan disciple hunt down a 
man?"

"She is a disciple of the Wudang Sect. Look, there are still seven Wudang Sect disciples 
surrounding and killing a woman on the beach. The seven Wudang Sect disciples are all 
Zhixuanjing (Grand Master)"

"A man and a woman should have offended the Wudang Clan, but that young man should have 
killed seven masters of the Wudang Clan."

"Well, a man and a woman should be friends with this young man. Wudang Sect is going to be in 
trouble. This young man may not refer to the Xuan Realm. He should be a powerful Celestial 
Realm expert."

At this moment,

Li Chungang and Xu Nian saw Su Chen and Xu Weixiong. They also heard the conversations of the 
people around them.

Xu Nian had no intention of calling Xu Weixiong over.

He was worried that Su Chen knew that Xu Weixiong was his sister. , Su Chen would take action 
against his sister Xu Weixiong

"Senior Li, a man and a woman should be friends of Su Chen. The Wudang Sect may be destroyed 
by Su Chen. Su Chen came to Emperor Wu City to wait for his friends."



Li Chungang nodded and said,

"Well, the Wu-Tang Clan is about to end. Su Chen’s friend was almost killed, and he will not let the 
Wu-Dang Clan go."

"Senior Li, Su Chen came to Emperor Wu City to wait for his friends. I plan to pick up the sword 
box tomorrow."

"Yes, I will challenge Wang Xianzhi tomorrow. However, Mr. Xu, there are still twelve sword 
slaves in Emperor Wu City. The strength of the twelve sword slaves is not weak. They can only be 
dealt with by you."

"I understand, thank you senior," at this time, Su Chen said to Xu Weixiong after Qilin's injury 
stabilized ,

"You take care of Qilin, I'll kill the Wudang disciples"

"OK!"

Xu Weixiong nodded hurriedly.

She saw Su Chen's expressionless look.

Xu Weixiong guessed that Su Chen was very angry. For a powerful man, the Wudang Sect might be 
in trouble.

Boom boom boom boom......

Su Chen appeared on the beach in an instant.

He quickly kicked away seven Wudang Sect masters. Su Chen did not kill these people 
immediately. He wanted to find out why the Wudang Sect wanted to kill Mu Ningxue and Qilin.



Mu Ningxue was in a panic when she saw Su Chen appear. She wiped the sweat from her face and 
shouted,

"Su Chen, you finally showed up. Hurry, go and save Qilin. Qilin is seriously injured and he won't 
be able to hold on anymore."

Chapter 2876

Su Chen stepped forward and hugged Mu Ningxue to check.

Mu Ningxue was just a little embarrassed, but she was not physically injured.

Su Chen stroked Mu Ningxue's hair and said,"Mu Ningxue, don't worry, I treated Qilin and he will 
be fine.""

"As long as nothing happens to Qilin."

Mun Ningxue rested in Su Chen's arms.

She was too tired, and her magic was overused. Mu Ningxue's mental strength was very exhausted.

"Mu Ningxue, who are these people? Why are they surrounding you?"

Mu Ningxue leaned into Su Chen's arms and replied,

"We are disciples of the Wudang Sect. Qilin and I appeared in this world on the Wudang Sect 
Mountain. A young man from the Wudang Sect was very powerful. He saw Qilin and I suddenly 
appeared and attacked us without saying a word. Qilin tried to save me - I suffered seriously 
injured."

Wudang Sect?

A powerful young man?

Is the young man the reincarnation of Lu Zu?



But why did he kill Mu Ningxue and Qilin? Did Lu Zu see that Mu Ningxue and Qilin are not from 
this world?

Su Chen hugged Mu Ningxue and couldn't figure it out, but it didn't matter.

Wudang Clan and Lu Zu dared to take action against Mu Ningxue and Qilin, and there was no need 
for them to live.

Boom boom boom....

Su Chen waved his palm and killed six Wudang disciples next to him. The remaining Wudang 
disciple looked at Su Chen in fear.

His brother was killed by Su Chen from the air, and the bodies were also torn into pieces. Wudang 
The remaining disciples fell to the ground in panic.

Su Chen said with an indifferent expression,"Go back and tell the head of the Wudang Sect and the 
young master that I will wait for them to come over in Emperor Wu City. If they don't come, the 
Wudang Sect will not leave them alone."

The Wudang Sect disciple hurriedly nodded and replied,"I....I know, I will definitely tell the leader 
and Hong Xixiang"

"get out!"

Su Chen carried Mu Ningxue and headed towards Martial Emperor City.

Mu Ningxue and Qilin also joined him. Their team members were all gathered together.

Although Qilin was seriously injured, after being treated with the fairy fruit, he recovered within an 
hour. Will recover as before.

Outside Emperor Wu City, all the masters saw Su Chen easily killing six Zhixuan Realm masters. 
They looked at Su Chen with fear.



The six Zhixuan Realm masters were the mainstays in some sects. There is a master in the small 
sect.

However, the seven Zhixuan realms had no ability to resist Su Chen. Su Chen instantly killed six 
people and spared one person. They felt that Su Chen and Wang Xianzhi should be the same level 
of strong men.

"Let’s go to Emperor Wu City!"

Su Chen picked up the recovering Qilin, and he took Mu Ningxue and Xu Weixiong into Emperor 
Wu's City.

As for the warriors watching the excitement around him,

Su Chen didn't care.

As long as these warriors didn't have the intention to kill him, Su Chen didn't bother to care. These 
scumbags

"What an eventful time!"

Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a looked at Su Chen and shook his head.

Su Chen's strength may have only been exposed a little.

He felt that he was not Su Chen's opponent, especially Su Chen's murderous intention exposed in 
anger. Deng Tai'a felt that Su Chen Killed thousands of people.

Deng Tai'a stroked his beard and whispered,"Tianmen? Fairyland? I hope Su Chen won't be 
interested in the fairy world, otherwise he won't be able to prevent the Heavenly Gate from being 
opened."

On the high tower of Emperor Wu City,



Wang Xianzhi stood here with an expressionless face. He was a young master, a young man who he 
couldn't understand.

Wang Xianzhi found that Su Chen was not an ordinary person. He felt that he might have a fight 
with Su Chen.

"Sister, why are you in Emperor Wu City?"

"Wei Xiong, why did you come to Emperor Wu City?"

In the small courtyard of the inn, (to read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Xu Weixiong and Xu Zhihu were very surprised when they saw each other.

Su Chen did not expect that the woman beside him was Xu Wei Xiong,

Daman, the siblings of the Xu family, except for the fool from Longhu Mountain, Xu Nian, Xu 
Zhihu, and Xu Weixiong were all here.

Wenina and Bai Yuekui saw Su Chen hugging Qilin, and there was blood on Qilin's body Banban's 
face was so pale that there was no blood. They did not expect that Qilin was seriously injured.

Wenina asked Mu Ningxue with a cold face,"Ning Xue, what happened to Qilin? What happened to 
you?"

"We were pursued by the Wu-Tang Clan...."

Mu Ningxue sat down and took a sip of tea and told the story.

The team members had arrived, and

Qilin was also treated by Su Chen.



Mu Ningxue was very relaxed at the moment. She was very exhausted physically and mentally after 
running away for several days without sleep.

After a while,

Su Chen came back after sending Qilin into the room.

0 Asking for flowers

, he saw Sister Xu Zhihu talking to one side, and Mu Ningxue and the other girls talking in the 
pavilion.

He walked to the small pond in the pavilion and thought about it.

The Wudang Clan dared to attack Mu Ningxue and Qilin.

After completing the three tasks, the Wudang Clan and Hong Xixiang would be destroyed.

After a while,

Su Chen asked the blue bird who came to him,

"Qingniao, if I destroy Emperor Wu City, would I be considered a good person or a bad person?"

Qingniao replied with a cold face,

"Master, I can't answer, but it might be a good thing if Emperor Wu City is destroyed."

Su Chen asked doubtfully,

"Um? Why?"



Qingniao explained to Su Chen,

"Master, fighting and killing are prohibited in Emperor Wu City. For decades, bandits, murderers, 
robbers, flower pickers, etc. who have come to take refuge in Emperor Wu City have done all kinds 
of evil."

"But with Wang Xianzhi in Emperor Wu City and the rules set by Wang Xianzhi, how many people 
wanted to avenge their loved ones but were unable to do so, and how many people died with their 
eyes open.

"Emperor Wu City is outside the law and is not bound by court laws. Ninety percent of the people 
in Emperor Wu City are people who do all kinds of evil, so there is no need for Emperor City Wu to 
exist."

Su Chen nodded when he heard Qingniao's words.

Emperor Wu City can be said to be a place where filth and evil practices are hidden, even worse 
than Buddhism. There are murderers, fugitives, flower thieves, scum of the world, etc. These people 
are unnecessary. survive

"It's very late, Bluebird, go back and rest."

Su Chen saw Wenina coming over.

Bai Yuekui took Mu Ningxue into the room. Sister Xu Zhihu also entered the room.

He wanted to send the blue bird away.

Su Chen and the plump and attractive Wenina hadn't seen each other for a long time. Today Tonight 
is a full moon night, and it is also a romantic night

"Yes, master!"

The blue bird saluted Su Chen and left.



She also found Wenina coming over.

The blue bird guessed what Su Chen and Wenina were going to do. She blushed and hurried to the 
room. Suchen hugged Wenina's plump and attractive body. , kissed him and asked,

"Beauty, the moonlight is so sultry tonight, should we do something?"

"My man, what do you want to do? I will cooperate with your husband"

Chapter 2877

In the inn, after Su Chen entered the room holding the sexy and attractive Wenina,

Bai Yuekui and Mu Ningxue appeared in the corridor. They looked at each other with blushing 
faces. They were also going to find Su Chen, but Wenina arrived early. Take a step ahead of them.

Bai Yuekui smoothed her hair and said,"Mu Ningxue, you can come over in a moment. Wenina is 
no match for Su Chen."

Mu Ningxue waved her hand hurriedly,

"J."

Bai Yuekui shook her head with a blush on her cold face.

She was going to leave in a while.

For the past few days,

Bai Yuekui and Su Chen had been fooling around.

She didn't mind the way other people looked at her.



Bai Yuekui was with the one she loved. She didn't feel ashamed or ashamed.

Late at night,

Bai Yuekui entered Su Chen's room with a blushing face under Mu Ningxue's surprised expression.

Mu Ningxue patted her forehead and said helplessly,

"I'm really going crazy. Bai Yuekui has always been cold and strong, how could she change so 
much?"

At this moment,

Xu Zhihu and Xu Weixiong did not rest in the middle of the night.

The sisters talked for several hours.

They talked about Su Chen, Wenina, Mu Ningxue, Qilin Bai Yuekui, Xu Zhihu and Xu Weixiong 
respectively. situation.

Xu Weixiong asked in surprise,

"Sister, are you saying that Wenina and Su Chen are going to kill Cao Changqing, Li Chungang, and 
destroy Emperor Wu City? Xu

Zhihu nodded and replied,"Yes, I heard what Wenina said with my own ears, and Wenina did not 
deny it."

Xu Weixiong felt very uneasy.

People like Su Chen were obviously not ordinary people.



Her eldest sister's disease was cured by one of Su Chen's spiritual fruits, and Xu Zhihu, who had no 
power to bind a chicken, became a Vajra state. Xu Weixiong couldn't guess how people like Su 

Chen came to 㡳.

Xu Weixiong said with a serious face,

"Sister, let’s go find Xu Nian tomorrow. I’m worried that Xu Nian will provoke people like Su 
Chen."

Xu Zhihu said hurriedly,"No, it's a bear. We can't go see Xu Nian."

"Why? eldest sister"

"Xiong, there is something I should tell you. I hope you won't be angry after hearing it."

Xu Zhihu planned to tell Xu Weixiong's true identity.

Su Chen knew Xu Weixiong's identity, and

Qingniao also reminded her.

Xu Zhihu was worried that if Xu Weixiong's identity was not told at this moment, Su Chen might 
tell Xu Wei Xiong, if Xu Weixiong discovers her identity, the consequences may be very serious.

"Sister, tell me, I’m not angry or angry"

"Wei Xiong, you are actually not my sister, nor are you from the Xu family. Your identity is......"

The night passed. No one in the courtyard had much rest yesterday night. Su Chen, Wenina, and Bai 
Yuekui were having a romantic time together. Xu Zhihu and Xu Weixiong talked for a long time. 
Mu Ningxue could not rest. , she was thinking about Su Chen all night, thinking about the scene 
between Wenina, Bai Yuekui and Su Chen. Blue Bird is silently guarding the courtyard. She is Su 
Chen's maid and bodyguard. She has the responsibility to protect the safety of the courtyard. There 
is also Qilin. Qilin has been practicing all night since he recovered from his injury. In the morning, 
Su Chen walked out of the room and stretched. In the yard, Su Chen saw Xu Zhihu and Xu 



Weixiong sitting on the stone bench and talking. Both women were a little haggard and their faces 
were very pale. The spirit is obviously not good. Su Chen walked over and asked, (To read 
Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Didn't you have any rest all night?"

Xu Weixiong shouted with an indifferent expression,

"none of your business! Su

Chen said in confusion,"Let me tell you, Xu Weixiong, have you taken gunpowder?" Why do you 
speak so hastily?"

"Go away, don't interrupt our conversation"

"Tsk, Xu Weixiong, I am the husband of your sister Xu Zhihu and your brother-in-law. If you dare 
to be rude to me again, I will teach you a lesson."

"Suchen, you bastard."

Xu Zhihu shouted at Su Chen with shame and anger,"

What kind of husband?

What kind of brother-in-law?

She has nothing to do with Su Chen.

This shameless pervert is getting more and more excessive.

Bang!

Xu Weixiong slapped the stone hard. The table shouted angrily,



"Su Chen, although I am no match for you, if you dare to speak rudely to my eldest sister again or 
tease my eldest sister again, I will drag you to be buried with you even if you die."

Su Chen crossed his arms and mocked,

"Xu Weixiong, is Xu Zhihu your eldest sister? Don't you know the shame of having a thief as your 
father for so many years?"

"you.....I...."

Xu Weixiong didn't know how to refute for a moment.

His family could be said to have died in Xu Xiao's hands.

Chen Zhibao was Xu Xiao's subordinate. His father was killed. Her mother, siblings were dragged 
to death by Chen Zhibao on horseback.

Xu Weixiong She also recognized Xu Xiao as her father, and she foolishly became Xu Nian's first 
soldier. Thinking about it, Xu Weixiong hated herself very much.

Su Chen took a sip of wine and asked,"It seems that you know your identity. Xu Weixiong, do you 
think you are an idiot woman? Do you think you are a fool?" Xu Zhihu shouted angrily,

" Su Chen, shut up."

Su Chen mocked disdainfully,

"Xu Zhihu, you're not going anywhere. In Xu Xiao's eyes, you're just a tool, a dispensable tool, a 
tool that allows Xu Nian to inherit the throne of Northern Liang."

"you...."

Xu Zhihu glared at Su Chen angrily.



Although what Su Chen said was true, was this bastard just rubbing salt into her wounds?

Doesn't Xu Zhihu know that she is a tool? Doesn't she know that Xu Xiao only has Xu Nian's son in 
his eyes?

"Wang Xianzhi, I want to take away Jian Jiuhuang's sword box today. Whether you agree or not, I 
have decided to take it today. If you hand over Jian Jiuhuang's sword box, everything will be easy. 
If you don't hand over Jian Jiuhuang's sword box, everything will be easy. sword box, I will beat 
you into a sweet potato."

Suddenly,

Xu Nian's arrogant shouting came from Emperor Wu's City. All the warriors in Emperor Wu's City 
ran towards the central area. Someone wanted to cause trouble in Emperor Wu's City. The warriors 
in Emperor Wu's City wanted to take a look. Who wants to die? Su Chen laughed when he heard Xu 
Nian's shouts,

"Hey, Xu Nian is really seeking death. A scumbag who has just advanced to the Zhixuan realm. 
What qualifications does he have to dare to challenge Wang Xianzhi? Just rely on a disabled Li 
Chungang?"

Xu Zhihu and Xu Weixiong looked at each other.

They also felt that Xu Nian was too arrogant.

Wang Xianzhi is the top powerhouse in the world. What qualifications does Xu Nian have to call 
Ban Wang Xianzhi like this?

Swish swish swish......

Qilin, Qingniao, Bai Yuekui, Wenina, and Mu Ningxue quickly appeared next to Su Chen. They all 
heard



Xu Nian's arrogance and domineering behavior just now. Qilin asked expressionlessly,"Su Chen, are 
we going to take action today?".

Chapter 2878

Su Chen looked at Wenina and the others and shook his head.

Li Chungang couldn't escape when he arrived at Emperor Wu City.

Emperor Emperor City was right here, and it was impossible to escape with long legs.

Tasks two and three must be completed, but not now.

Su Chen planned to wait. The Wu-Tang Clan and the Flooding Elephant are coming. If the Wu-Tang 
Clan and the Flooding Elephant are coming today.

Su Chen will catch all these people in one fell swoop

"Husband, why don’t we take action today?"

Wenina saw Su Chen shaking his head and wondering.

Li Chungang was in Emperor Wu City.

They killed Li Chungang and destroyed Emperor Wu City. This time the task could be completed. 
Why did Su Chen shake his head and refuse?

Su Chen explained. ,

"Waiting and seeing for now, I wonder if the Wu-Tang Clan and the Flood Elephant are coming."

When Xu Zhihu heard Su Chen talking about Hong Xixiang, she asked hurriedly,

"Flooding elephant? Su Chen, do you want to kill Hong Xixiang? Su



Chen glanced at Xu Zhihu and said,"Xu Zhihu, I understand what you want to say. Hong Xixiang 
dares to attack Qilin and Mu Ningxue. He is dead. No one can save him." Xu

Zhihu asked complicatedly,"Su Chen, do you really want to kill Hong Xixiang?" Can we let the 
Xiang Xiang go for once?"

Su Chen took a sip of wine and reminded,

887"Xu Zhihu, Hong Xixiang is not Hong Xixiang. He is the reincarnation of Lu Zu more than five 
hundred years ago. It can also be said to be a person of reconstruction. He should be at this moment. 
After recovering his memory, he also knew that he was Lu Zu from more than five hundred years 
ago, otherwise he would not have the strength to hurt Qilin. Xu

Zhihu shouted excitedly,"It's impossible. How could Hong Xixiang be Lu Zu? Are you talking 
nonsense?""

"Hey, Xu Zhihu, do you think I need to deceive you? It would be easy for me to kill a scumbag 
Xixiang. Would I lie about his identity?"

"you..."

Su Chen waved his hand to interrupt Xu Zhihu and said,

"Xu Zhihu, you actually have a close relationship with Lu Zu. I’m not talking about you and Hong 
Xixiang. More than five hundred years ago, Lu Zu didn’t ascend to heaven just because of you."

"In this life, you and Hong Xixiang have an entangled fate. However, Hong Xixiang doesn’t seem 
to be a man. No, he should be trying to restore Lu Zu’s strength and memory."

"Lu Zu doesn't care whether you marry or not. He may not mind that you are a wasted flower, or 
maybe Lu Zu regrets not ascending to heaven for you five hundred years ago."

Xu Zhihu slumped down on the stool after hearing Su Chen's words.



Hong Xixiang?

Lu Zu?

Lu Zu gave up his ascension for her more than five hundred years ago?

What about this life?

Hong Xixiang knew clearly that she wanted to get married, so he just had to speak If he asked her to 
stay, Xu Zhihu would elope with him.

Why didn't Hong Xixiang agree?

Is it really what Su Chen said?

Xu Weixiong looked at Su Chen in shock for a while, and then again Looking at Xu Zhihu, what Su 
Chen said was too scary.

Is Hong Xi like Lu Zu?

Lu Zu also gave up flying to heaven for Xu Zhihu?

Wenina and others didn't find it strange.

Some of them heard Su Chen say,

Some people know Hong Xixiang's identity but don't care.

A person who has ascended to the heaven is not yet an immortal. With Su Chen, the emperor of the 
immortal world, Hong Xixiang is still a scum even if he is an immortal. How could they care about 
Hong Xi? elephant

"Li Chungang, a battle on the East China Sea"



"Well, one above the East China Sea."

Over Emperor Wu City, the two old men flew quickly towards the East China Sea.

Su Chen saw Wang Xianzhi and Li Chungang going to fight in the East China Sea. He touched his 
chin and thought for a while and said,

"The fun has begun, let’s go to the city wall to see the excitement"

"good!"

Su Chen stood up and walked outside with Wenina and others. Xu Zhihu and Xu Weixiong also 
hurriedly followed.

At this time, in the central area of Emperor Wu City, after Wang Xianzhi and Li Chungang left, Xu 
Nian took Wei Shuyang and Some of Ning Emei's men were about to take action.

Wei Shuyang reminded Xu Nian, (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Young Master, Wang Xianzhi’s twelve sword slaves are not weak, we may not be our opponents."

"Try it first."

Xu Nian looked at Lao Huang's sword box on the sword wall.

He would not give up (aceb) to retrieve the sword box.

Wang Xianzhi's twelve sword slaves are very powerful. They are not weak either. Xu Nian is 
confident. He could defeat the Twelve Sword Slaves, but he also had to retrieve Lao Huang's sword 
box.

Not far from the sword wall,



Zhao Kai and Yuan Tingshan saw that Xu Nian was about to take action, and they both had 
expressions of disdain on their faces

"Those who are looking for death are looking for death, Yuan Tingshan, we may not need to take 
action, Xu Nian will die in Emperor Wu City"

"Xu Nian is too conceited. Although Li Chungang held back Wang Xianzhi, the Twelve Sword 
Slaves all refer to the Xuan Realm. Xu Nian and those people cannot be the opponents of the 
Twelve Sword Slaves."

"Haha~, it would be best if Xu Nian is killed. If Xu Nian escapes by chance, it will not be too late 
for us to take action."

"Let's watch the show first."

Su Chen appeared under the sword wall with Wenina and others. They walked to a tea shop nearby 
and sat down.

Su Chen sat down and looked at the fighting scene and said,

"At first, Xu Nian took advantage of Zhao Xuansu from Longhu Mountain, but Zhao Xuansu would 
come back to bite Xu Nian after a while."

Wenina looked at the fight between Zhao Xuansu and the six sword slaves, and she said with a 
puzzled expression,

"Su Chen, that kid hid his cultivation. It was very easy for him to kill six sword slaves."

"Well, Zhao Xuansu had another purpose. He was probably deliberately holding back the six sword 
slaves."

Bai Yuekui said coldly,



"Xu Nian's people can't do it, and the six sword slaves left on the city wall are no match for Xu 
Nian's people."

Su Chen touched his chin and said to Qilin,

"Qilin, go outside the city gate and tell the old man holding the peach branch not to mind his own 
business, otherwise Xu Nian will be killed."

"good!"

Qilin nodded to Su Chen and hurried out of the city gate.

Qilin didn't know what Su Chen was going to do, but Su Chen was their captain and his life and 
death friend. Qilin would not object to what Su Chen wanted to do. thing

"You guys are drinking tea and watching a show here, and I'm going to tease a little beauty."

Su Chen saw Jiang Ni under the city wall, and he planned to tease the little beauty without a ditch.

There was no plot about Jiang Ni in Emperor Wu City, but after Cao Changqing was killed by Bai 
Yuekui, Jiang Ni should have been forced to continue to be with Xu Nian. Together.

Winina rolled her eyes at Su Chen and said,

"you are so boring"

"Venina, let's continue looking at the stars tonight"

"Shameless!"

Wenina looked at Su Chen who left with shame and anger.

Looking at the stars?



Are they looking at the stars?

A shameless pervert.

When Winina thought of what happened on the city wall yesterday night, she blushed and wanted to 
strangle Su to death. In the morning,

Bai Yuekui's face turned red.

She was also brought to the city wall by Su Chen late last night, especially what Su Chen did to her 
on the city wall. Bai Yuekui wanted to bite Su Chen to death just thinking about it.

Xu Zhihu was confused. Asked Venina,

"Venina, you and Suchen went to see the stars yesterday night? Didn't you have a rest all night?".

Chapter 2879

Wenina's face turned red and she was at a loss.

What did Xu Zhihu mean?

Doesn't she understand what Su Chen means?

Stargazing?

Who would look at the stars for a night?

Wasn't Xu Zhihu married before?

Why doesn’t she know anything about men and women?



"Sister, don’t ask."

Xu Weixiong pulled Xu Zhihu speechlessly. She did not expect that Xu Zhihu would ask such an 
idiotic question.

However, she also understood Xu Zhihu's ignorance.

Although Xu Zhihu was married, she did not have a bridal husband. He died.

Xu Zhihu was a well-educated lady, and it was impossible for Xu Zhihu to know about the affairs of 
men and women.

Bai Yuekui and Mu Ningxue lowered their heads.

They understood what it meant to look at the stars, and they also understood that Su Chen How do 
you and Wenina look at the stars?

Bai Yuekui experienced looking at the stars yesterday night.

She was shy and worried that other people would ask her too. At this moment

,

Su Chen came to the sword wall.

There were swords stuck everywhere on the wall.

The number was shocking. It is unimaginable that the owners of these swords may have come to 
Emperor Wu City 02 to challenge Wang Xianzhi and were killed by Wang Xianzhi. They may also 
be people who came to Emperor Wu City to take revenge. They were killed by Wang Xianzhi 
before they could take revenge.

Wang Xianzhi was also a murderer. , a person who killed countless people for the sake of 
reputation.



Su Chen saw Jiang Ni looking nervously at the city wall.

Jiang Ni probably didn't notice his arrival.

Su Chen quickly touched Jiang Ni's little face and asked,

"Little beauty, aren't you afraid of being left here alone?"

"Suchen? You bastard, why did you let Bai Yuekui kill Cao Changqing?"

Jiang Ni saw Su Chen appearing next to her and touching her face.

Jiang Ni was frightened and hurriedly backed away. She didn't expect that Su Chen would come and 
tease her.

There was no one around Jiang Ni at the moment, and she was worried about Su Chen. Will they 
catch her and humiliate her?

Su Chen asked speechlessly,

"Do you need a reason to kill?

Jiang Ni glared at Su Chen and asked angrily,"Don't you need a reason to kill someone?""

"If you don't like it, kill him. I don't need a reason."

"You are a murderer."

Su Chen asked with a disdainful expression.



"Jiang Ni, Xu Xiao killed countless people in the Chu Kingdom. Your parents were killed by Xu 
Xiao. Your father's concubines seemed to have been humiliated by Xu Xiao's men. Even Xu Nian, 
did he kill few people along the way?"

Jiang Ni looked at Su Chen at a loss,"I.....you....."

Su Chen continued to mock,

"Jiang Ni, I don’t want you and me anymore, you are just a stupid idiot. Think about how your 
parents died, think about the misery of your father’s concubines, and think about those Chu people 
who were killed."

"You like Xu Nian, you like the son of an enemy, and you like Xu Nian who takes advantage of 
you. Aren't you worried about having nightmares at night? Aren't you worried that your parents will 
die in peace?"

Jiang Ni lowered her head with a pale face.

She felt very uncomfortable, but what can she do?

What can she do?

Jiang Ni is just a woman, an ordinary woman. She can't take revenge, and she can't Attacking Xu 
Nian, whom they grew up with since childhood,

"Ahem, Jiang Ni, I just talked nonsense, don't take it to heart, and don't think too much."

Su Chen saw Jiang Ni's despair. He was worried that the little beauty Jiang Ni would be distracted 
and seek death.

Damn, did he go too far just now?

If Jiang Ni committed suicide,



Su Chen could say that she would be indirectly harmed. His woman died.

Although this Jiang Ni was not his woman Jiang Ni, she was essentially the same. He did not want 
to see Jiang Ni commit suicide.

Jiang Ni glared at Su Chen and shouted,"Get away, I don't want to see you!"

Nonsense? (To read Baoshuang novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

Why don't you let her think wildly?

What does Su Chen mean?

Is this bastard afraid that she will commit suicide? Or does Su Chen want to humiliate her but is 
worried that she will seek death?

"Chi, Jiang Ni, do you want to go up to the city wall and take a look?"

Su Chen saw Zhao Xuansu on the city wall.

The show on the city wall was about to begin. Su Chen planned to go and see who would come to 
save Xu Nian.

"snort!"

Jiang Ni snorted and walked towards the steps of the city wall.

With Su Chen here, she guessed that no one would dare to take action against her, and no one at the 
city wall would dare to intercept her.

Jiang Ni wanted to know if Xu Nian could retrieve the sword box. , she didn't care about Xu Nian's 
life or death.



Su Chen's words made her understand the hesitation of more than ten years. Jiang Ni will not kill 
Xu Nian, but she will not save Xu Nian. Whether he lives or dies depends on Xu Nian. of good 
fortune

"A little beauty with personality!"

Su Chen touched his chin and followed Jiang Ni.

Along the way,

Wei Shuyang and Shu Sha saw Jiang Ni coming. They wanted to tell Jiang Ni to leave quickly, but 
they saw Su Chen and Wei Shuyang behind

Jiang Ni. He Shu was so worried that he didn't dare to speak.

"Little girl, if you dare to step forward again and die!"

The six sword slaves under the city wall saw Jiang Ni going up to the city wall. One of them 
shouted and threatened Jiang Ni.

Boom!

Suddenly, a powerful aura enveloped the six sword slaves.

In just an instant, the six sword slaves The slaves fell to the ground and bled to death. Their internal 
organs were shattered by the powerful momentum.

Jiang Ni looked back at Su Chen.

She did not expect that Su Chen would be so terrifying. Wei Shuyang and Shu Sha didn't even hit 
the city wall for a long time. Su Chen just burst out with 373 momentum, and six powerful sword 
slaves were killed.

Wei Shuyang, Shu Sha and the others looked at Su Chen in fear.



It was too powerful and terrifying.

They didn't even have the courage to face Su Chen at the moment.

City Wall On the top,

Xu Nian and Ning Emei faced six Zhixuan realm sword slaves. Xu Nian was riding a tiger and it 
was difficult to get off.

He was a Zhixuan realm, and

Ning Emei was also a Zhixuan realm, but there were six Zhixuan realms opposite them. What?

Zhao Kai and Yuan Tingshan were also eyeing him, and the child Zhao Xuansu was looking at him 
with a smile.

Xu Nian encountered the biggest life and death crisis. If no one came to save him, he might die in 
Emperor Wu City.

Su After Chen and Jiang Ni climbed up to the city wall, he looked at Xu Nian and mocked,

"Huh? Why didn't the fight start? Xu Nian, weren't you trying to get the sword box with your 
awesome coaxing just now? Aren’t you going to beat Wang Xianzhi into a sweet potato? Why do 
you look so ugly?

Xu Nian asked with an ugly face,"Su Chen, what do you mean?""

Su Chen said disdainfully,

"What's the meaning? I'm here to see a show, Xu Nian, have you ever heard of this sentence?"

"What words?"



"If you have the strength to show off, that's awesome. If you don't have the strength to show off, 
that's a fool. Now you're just a fool, an idiot who doesn't know the so-called, a clown who failed to 
show off."

Chapter 2880

Su Chen mocked Xu Nian rudely.

He had no grudge against Xu Nian.

If he wanted to blame it, it was because Xu Nian was too ostentatious and he couldn't stand it. If he 
wanted to blame it, it was because Xu Nian's relationship with Jiang Ni made him unhappy.

Everyone nearby looked at Su Chen.

They thought that Su Chen was here to save Xu Nian. After all, Su Chen and Jiang Ni came 
together.

Now, they felt that they were wrong.

They guessed that Su Chen and Xu Nian were also enemies.

"Su Chen, there is no grudge between you and me. What do you mean by this?"

Xu Nian clenched his fists tightly.

He didn't expect Su Chen to be so rude to him.

Could it be because of what happened on Huishan Mountain?

But Su Chen had already taught Li Chungang a lesson and killed Cao Changqing for no reason.

Xu Nian I don’t understand why Su Chen can’t stand him?



And Jiang Ni?

What is Su Chen going to do when he brings Jiang Ni? This bastard has already snatched the blue 
bird, is he going to snatch Jiang Ni too?

Su Chen hugged his side Jiang Ni kissed her and said,"What now? Do we have a grudge?"

"Shameless pervert, I'm going to kill you."

Jiang Ni was suddenly hugged and kissed by Su Chen. She took out a dagger and stabbed Su Chen 
in shame and anger.

Su Chen quickly took the dagger from Jiang Ni's hand.

He touched Jiang Ni's delicate face and said,

"Little beauty, your dagger is good, and it is the national treasure of Chu State, but you are a little 
scumbag who doesn’t know martial arts. Even if I give you a spiritual treasure, you can’t kill me."

Jiang Ni struggled and cursed,

"Inglorious bastard, let me go. Xu

Nian yelled angrily,"Su Chen, you are not worthy of being a strong man. Let go of Jiang Ni.""

"Hey, Xu Nian, I just won’t let go of Jiang Ni, what can you do to me?"

"Su Chen, you are seeking death!"

Boom!

Su Chen hugged Jiang Ni and kicked Xu Nian away in an instant.



He was an idiot who didn't know how to live or die, a little scumbag.

Xu Nian hadn't seen the situation clearly until now. Su Chen really wanted to crush Xu Nian to 
death with one hand.

"Cough cough cough....｀"

"Crown Prince......"

Xu Nian was kicked and hit against a stone wall. He vomited blood and fell to the ground. Ning 
Emei hurriedly ran over to help Xu Nian and checked his injuries.

Su Chen hugged Jiang Ni and said to the people around him,"If you want to kill Xu Nian, kill him 
quickly. After Li Chungang arrives soon, it will be much more difficult for you to kill him." The 
people around looked at each other and did not move.

They all saw that

Su Chen had snatched Xu Nian's woman.

Su Chen wanted them to kill Xu Nian so that he could get a beautiful woman without having to take 
action.

Zhao Kai and the six sword slaves did not take action.

They guessed that Su Chen would not let Xu Nian go. As long as they waited for a while, Su Chen 
would kill Xu Nian for them.

"Damn, they are all old foxes."

Su Chen hugged the struggling Jiang Ni and looked at the people around him.

These people seemed to have no intention of taking action.



They might be worried that he would kill them, or they might think that he would take action to kill 
Xu Nian.

Jiang Ni was angry. Struggle said,

"let me go!"

Su Chen touched Jiang Ni's slender waist and warned,"Little beauty, if you dare to struggle again, I 
will kiss you again."

"Shameless!"

Jiang Ni stared at Su Chen with a red face.

It was so shameless.

This bastard was too despicable.

Jiang Ni didn't dare to struggle anymore.

She was worried that Su Chen would kiss her again in public.

Suddenly,

Su Chen hugged Jiang Ni. Looking at Zhao Xuansu, an old immortal,

Su Chen did not expect that Zhao Xuansu would take action against Xu Nian or Zhao Kai.

Boom!

Zhao Xuansu and Su Chen exchanged palms, and



Su Chen held Jiang in one hand. The mud did not retreat. Zhao Xuansu took six or seven steps back 
before he could stand firm.

"Zhao Xuansu, do you want to die?

Zhao Xuansu asked with a serious face,"Who are you?" How do you know who I am?"

"Zhao Xuansu, you will definitely die if you attack me. As for your identity, many people know it."

"Boy, you can't kill me yet." (To read exciting novels, go to Feilu Novel Network!)

"Yeah? I do not think so!"

"kill!"

Zhao Xuansu ducked and quickly killed Su Chen.

Su Chen was holding a woman at the moment. Zhao Xuansu wanted to take the opportunity to kill 
Su Chen and kill the enemy who was a huge threat to him. Boom, bang, bang, bang......

Su Chen held Jiang Ni and quickly attacked Zhao Xuansu.

He did not use all his strength.

Outside the city wall, the Peach Blossom Sword God was coming quickly.

Although Qilin was intercepting it, the Peach Blossom Sword God was faster than Qilin. Qilin did 
not stop the Peach Blossom Sword God Deng for a while. Too. swish swish.....

After a while, on the city wall, the Peach Blossom Sword God Deng Tai'a arrived quickly, followed 
by Qilin, Wenina, Mu Ningxue, and Bai Yuekui also arrived one after another.



"You don’t need to take action."

Su Chen said to Qilin and the others.

He held Jiang Ni and fought with Zhao Xuansu quickly.

On the narrow city wall,

Su Chen and Zhao Xuansu attacked and destroyed the surrounding city walls. People around them 
retreated to avoid the battle between Su Chen and Zhao Xuansu.

Jiang Ni was a little dizzy at the moment.

Su Chen's speed was too fast.

She was held by Su Chen and fought with Zhao Xuansu. Su Chen attacked and dodged quickly. 
Jiang Ni couldn't see clearly at all.

Suddenly,

Jiang Ni's face turned red.

She didn't Thinking of Su Chen holding her and fighting, this bastard didn't forget to take advantage 
of her.

A quarter of an hour later,

Su Chen found that Deng Tai'a had no intention of taking action.

He shook his head speechlessly.

Su Chen deliberately exposed some flaws during the fight. He I want to see if the Peach Blossom 
Sword God Deng Tai'a will take action.



If Deng Tai'a doesn't take action, there is no need for Su Chen to continue playing with Zhao 
Xuansu

"'That's it!"

Crack!

Su Chen appeared next to Zhao Xuansu in an instant. He reached out and grabbed Zhao Xuansu's 
neck and crushed (Zhao Hao's))

"Um? soul? Destroy!"

"No! I haven't entered the fairyland yet...."

After Su Chen squeezed Zhao Xuansu to death, he didn't expect that Zhao Xuansu's soul would 
leave his body and become a scumbag.

Su Chen waved away Zhao Xuansu's soul.

Qilin and Wenina saw Su Chen squeezing Zhao Xuansu to death, and they shook their heads 
speechlessly.

Su Chen and Zhao Xuansu were fighting before, and they looked very confused.

It was easy for Su Chen to kill Zhao Xuansu. Qilin and the others thought I don’t understand why 
Su Chen didn’t kill Zhao Xuansu before.

Su Chen pinched Zhao Xuansu to death.

They speculated that Su Chen was showing off or deliberately taking advantage of Jiang Ni.

Su Chen hugged Jiang Ni and asked,"Peach Blossom Sword God, are you not going to take action?"



Deng Tai'a said with a serious face,

"I just want to save Xu Nian's life, and I also ask my little brother to give me a face and let Xu Nian 
go."
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