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Su Chen rubbed his chin and thought about what to do with the two women.

Ran Bing and Sheng Caier couldn't be killed, the lucky ones?

Su Chen is also their senior.

He doesn't want to kill two beautiful beauties, but what should he do with them?

Su Chen said to Ran Bing and the other two,"If you just surrender, I won't kill you."

Sheng Cai'er said coldly,"We won't surrender without surrender."

Su Chen crossed his arms and said,"Blind beauty, if you surrender, I can cure you." Eyes."

Sheng Cai'er remained expressionless and didn't speak.

Can he cure her eyes? is it possible?

Sheng Cai'er's eyes cannot be cured by medicine.

She will lose her six senses if she uses the reincarnation furnace. Sheng Cai'er has already lost her 
sense of taste and vision.

Su Chen threatened Yan Dan,"Yan Dan, in three breaths, if you don't get caught, I'll shoot"two-nine-
three" to kill you.""

"I surrender, I surrender."



Yan Dan hurriedly knelt down and surrendered.

He didn't want to be shot into a hornet's nest like Linghu Chong.

Yan Dan was very lucky to be a lucky person.

He didn't want to die.

He wanted to be strong. He wanted to kill Qin King Ying Zheng. Yan Dan wanted to kill Qin King 
Ying Zheng.

To become the king of Yan, he will also become the most powerful king among all the countries.

Yan Dan is still in the Qin Empire as a hostage.

He will be rewarded for completing the destiny mission. After Yan Dan becomes strong, he can 
escape from Qin.

Su Chen He waved his hand and ordered,"Seize Yan Dan and seal Yan Dan's cultivation level.""

"Yes, Your Majesty."

Xiao Wu quickly walked towards Yan Dan to seal his cultivation.

After a while,

Su Chen saw that Yan Dan was tapping the acupoints with his cultivation sealed, and he walked 
towards Sheng Cai'er with a smile.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er ignored Yan Dan. Dan was greedy for life and afraid of death. They did 
not expect that Su Chen would come towards them.

Su Chen was an ordinary person.



They were assassins who broke into the palace. Wasn't Su Chen worried that they would assassinate 
him?

Xu Zhihu looked at Su Chen worriedly,

She didn't expect that Su Chen would walk towards Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er. Is that bastard so 
horny?

Xu Fengnian said with a mocking expression,"King Jiangnan is really horny. An ordinary person 
dares to walk towards two assassins.""

Li Chungang and Wei Shuyang shook their heads.

They felt that Su Chen was reckless.

The assassins were surrounded by secret guards and black-armored troops. There was no need for 
Su Chen to take risks for beauty.

At this moment,

Su Chen walked to Sheng Cai'er. The person beside him whispered,"Sheng Cai'er, the saint of the 
Assassin Reincarnation Temple, you used the Reincarnation Spiritual Furnace and lost your sense of 
taste and vision. Am I right?

Sheng Cai'er looked surprised and asked,"Who are you?" How do you know this?"

"Sheng Cai'er, you and Ran Bing go to the study with me, and the three of us will talk."

"good!"

Sheng Cai'er nodded to Su Chen.

She was very confused about Su Chen.



Even Ran Bing and others didn't know Sheng Cai'er's identity. How could Su Chen in this world 
know about it?

She guessed that Su Chen's identity was unusual.

It's possible that Su Chen is not from this world.

Ran Bing looked at Su Chen and then at Sheng Cai'er.

Why did she feel weird?

Su Chen knew Sheng Cai'er?

How could people in the snow world know Sheng Cai'er? Er?

Ran Bing is just a scumbag.

Sheng Cai'er agreed to leave with Su Chen. She could only leave with Su Chen as a foil.

Su Chen ordered before leaving,"Xiao Wu, execute Yan Dan at a later date.""

"Yes, Your Majesty."

Yan Dan was frightened and hurriedly shouted,"No, I surrender, don't kill me, don't execute me in 
Lingchi."

Su Chen curled his lips and ignored Yan Dan.

He led Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er towards the study. The secret guards were guarding Ran Bing 
and Sheng Cai'er beside Su Chen.



Xu Fengnian frowned and asked in confusion,"what happened? What did King Jiangnan and Sheng 
Caier say? Why did the two female assassins leave with King Jiangnan? Li

Chungang touched his beard and guessed,"Boy, King Jiangnan seems to know that woman named 
Sheng Caier.""

Wei Shuyang said to Xu Fengnian,

"Yes, the way Sheng Caier looked surprised just now means that King Jiangnan must have said 
something that surprised Sheng Caier."

Xu Fengnian said with an ugly face,"Damn it, how could King Jiangnan know a strong person in 
the Celestial Realm? Li

Chungang frowned and reminded,"Boy, something is wrong with Sheng Cai'er. She gives me the 
feeling of being very dangerous." Xu

Fengnian asked in surprise with wide eyes.

"What? Senior, even if you fall into the celestial realm, you are still the strongest in the celestial 
realm."

"Sheng Cai'er is in the Celestial Elephant Realm at a young age. She may have pushed others to 
become the Celestial Elephant Realm. She is probably not as powerful as the Zhixuan Realm. How 
could you feel threatened?"

Li Chungang touched his beard and shook his head.

His feeling is not wrong.

If Li Chungang fights with Sheng Cai'er, his current strength is no match for Sheng Cai'er.

If Li Chungang returns to the land of fairyland, he will not be able to defeat Sheng Cai'er. He will 
not be defeated.



Who is Sheng Cai'er?

How come she is in the Celestial Realm at such a young age? And she even makes him feel 
threatened0....

Qingniao and Ning Emei were very surprised.

Li Chungang felt that Sheng Cai'er was in danger. Is Sheng Cai'er even more powerful than Li 
Chungang?

Xu Zhihu held his hand tightly and felt nervous.

Why did Su Chen leave with Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er?

Do they know each other?

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er were both stunning beauties with perfect figures. They were both 
masters of the martial arts world. Xu Zhihu felt uncomfortable when she thought of Su Chen 
leaving with the two women.

Xu Zhihu thought for a while and said,"Er Qiao, you take the maid to arrange for Fengnian and the 
others to stay while I go to the study to take a look."

"Yes, ma'am!"

"Fengnian, you go and rest first, I have to deal with some things."

Xu Zhihu said and hurriedly walked towards the study with her clothes. She wanted to know the 
relationship between Su Chen and Sheng Caier.

Xu Fengnian and others stood there in confusion.

Yu Youwei said:"Jiang Ni, what's going on? Is the eldest lady jealous?"



5.8 Jiang Ni:"I don't know, it seems, maybe, probably, Qingniao, do you see anything?"

Blue Bird:"I don't know, but something is wrong with the eldest lady! Shu Sha:"

I feel like the eldest lady is jealous.""[]

"King Jiangnan left with two beautiful beauties. The eldest lady is the princess of King Jiangnan. I 
guess the eldest lady is worried that King Jiangnan has fallen in love with two beautiful assassins."

Xu Fengnian heard the conversation between Jiang Ni and the girls behind him, and his face 
became even more gloomy.

Jealous?

Is his eldest sister Xu Zhihu jealous?

Xu Fengnian guessed that Xu Zhihu was not kidnapped by Su Chen.

Su Chen should be with Xu Zhihu Su Chen would massacre the Lu family for Xu Zhihu because of 
an affair.

Xu Fengnian thought with a gloomy face, [Damn it, the eldest sister must not be with the King of 
Jiangnan, otherwise, the Emperor Liyang will not agree to his hereditary succession as the King of 

Northern Liang.】
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In the study, after Su Chen invited Sheng Cai'er and Ran Bing to sit down,

Sheng Cai'er said coldly,"Tell me, how do you know that I am the Saint of Reincarnation? How do 
you know that I have lost my sense of taste and vision?"

Su Chen smiled. Ran Bing replied in surprise,"Because I am also a lucky person."

Hearing Su Chen's words, Ran Bing exclaimed in surprise,



"What? Are you a lucky person? How can it be? There are only five people in our team, and Qi 
Luck Tiandao also told us that there are only five people in our team. How can you be a lucky 
person?

Sheng Cai'er held the handle tightly and asked,"Are you not from this world?""

"I am not from this world. There are only five lucky ones in your team. I am not one of your lucky 
ones.

Ran Bing asked confusedly,"Aren't you from this group of lucky ones?" Are there still several 
groups of lucky people?"

Su Chen poured tea for the two girls and replied,

"I am your last batch of luck seekers. The last five-member team have all become immortals. Qi 
Luck Tiandao has re-selected the five of you as luck seekers. The five of us can now be said to be 
masters."

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er were very shocked.

The last batch of lucky people?

The last batch of lucky people have become immortals?

It's incredible, no, the last batch of lucky people have become immortals.

Su Chen is the last one. A lucky person, how come he appears in this world without any strength?

Ran Bing took a sip of tea and asked,"Are you an immortal? Why do I feel like you don't have any 
strength? Su

Chen looked at the short-haired Ran Bing's figure and said,"My strength has been sealed into this 
world. Otherwise, if my aura is exposed even a little bit, this world will shatter and die."



Sheng Cai'er asked Su Chen,"How did you know about me?" Have you been to Minecraft?"

"your world? No, I haven't been to your world, but I know you very well, maybe it's fate.

Sheng Cai'er whispered in confusion,"You haven't been there?" destiny?"

Su Chen patted Sheng Cai'er on the shoulder and said,

"Sheng Caier, you have been tortured since you were a child, tortured in the dark. This is the cause 
and effect that the Saint of Reincarnation must bear. Don’t blame your parents for being cruel. They 
also love you very much."

"Your spiritual power reaches 100, and you are a saint of the Temple of Reincarnation. This is the 
pain you must go through. Your tragic and painful experience makes your parents feel even more 
painful. Sheng

Cai'er slapped Su Chen's hand away and said coldly,"I have no parents.""

Sheng Cai'er hated her parents very much.

She was pushed into a black hole at a young age, without food and water, and had to endure torture 
and endless pain. Her wailing, her crying, and her expectations were not answered.

After a tragic experience,

Sheng Cai'er's heart is already dead.

She will be a weapon without emotions in the future.

"Putting all this aside, Sheng Caier, has the selection for the demon hunting group started?"

"There is still one month left to start the selection"



"One month left?"

Su Chen touched his chin and thought.

The plot of the divine seal has just begun.

Sheng Cai'er has not yet met the grown-up Long Haochen.

Long Haochen is a good protagonist. Do you want to break up Sheng Cai'er and Long Haochen?

Su Chen thought silently and shook his head.

Forget it,

Sheng Cai'er is just an insignificant woman.

He has gone to Hongmeng World.

There are many sexy and beautiful beauties and fairies. Besides, he may never see Sheng Cai'er 
again in the future. Son.

Let nature take its course. 

Su Chen took out a jade box and said,

"Sheng Cai'er, if you eat this Heaven and Earth Spirit Fruit, your sense of taste and vision will 
recover. I will give you some more Heaven and Earth Spirit Fruit. After you use the Reincarnation 
Spirit Furnace in the future, there will be no side effects from eating the Heaven and Earth Spirit 
Fruit."

"Thank you!"



Sheng Cai'er took the jade box and opened it to take it. The

Heaven and Earth Spirit Fruit can cure her sense of taste and vision. This is very good news for her.

Sheng Cai'er doesn't want to lose her six senses.

She wants to smell the fragrance of flowers. , seeing beautiful things, hearing birdsong and other 
people talking.

Su Chen saw Sheng Caier eating spiritual fruit, and he asked the white-haired beauty Ran 
Bing,"Ran Bing, what world are you from? Ran

Bing said with a calm expression,

"I come from a doomsday world. My world has been destroyed. Except for some surviving people 
on the lighthouse, there are no humans elsewhere. There are many pole-devouring beasts in my 
world."

"Doomsday world? lighthouse? The Devouring Beast?"

Su Chen was very surprised when he heard Ran Bing's words.

He looked at Ran Bing and remembered who the white-haired beauty was.

The adjutant of the scavenger Mark, [] was also a sniper and a beautiful pistachio beauty.

In the plot, Ran Bing Bing fell in love with Mark, but her ending was very bad. She was burned to 
death and turned into ashes.

Ran Bing and Bai Yuekui actually came from the same world.

However,



Ran Bing and Bai Yuokui should be in different small worlds. Bai Yuokui had already destroyed the 
earth. The story of the pole-eating beast on Ran Bing’s spiritual cage world should have just begun.

"｀Ran Bing, I understand your world.

Ran Bing asked in surprise,"Do you know my world?""

"Yes, one of my teammates comes from your world. No, I should say he comes from the same 
world as you."

"What do you mean by saying this?"

"Let's put it this way, there are some identical small worlds in the universe, and the characters in 
them may be the same. You can think of it as a mirror world. Although my teammates are in the 
same world as you, you are in different small worlds."

"So that's it."

Ran Bing understood.

In all the worlds, the same world may exist.

Su Chen's teammates are also from her world, but they are two different small worlds.

"Su Chen, what is the name of your teammate (the good king)? She should also exist in my world."

Su Chen replied while drinking tea,

"Her name is Bai Yuekui, the most powerful being in your world. Ran Bing, the lighthouse cannot 
be trusted. There are still humans on the ground. Bai Yuekui brought some humans to survive on the 
ground. She also found a way to deal with the pole-devouring beast.

Ran Bing stood up in shock and shouted,"What?" Are there humans living on the ground? The 
lighthouse can’t be trusted?"



"Yes, I think you should take my word for it."

Su Chen said and walked towards the door of the study.

He saw a person standing outside the study. The secret guards did not stop her from eavesdropping. 
Su Chen guessed that Xu Zhihu was at the door. Xu Zhihu didn't know how many messages he 
heard..Click!

Su Chen opened the study door and saw the panicked Xu Zhihu and asked,"Beautiful beauty, what 
do you want to do when you come to the study and don't come in?" Are you going to eavesdrop on 
my conversation with two beauties?".

Chapter 3063

Xu Zhihu lowered his head in embarrassment.

She didn't expect Su Chen to find her eavesdropping outside.

"I didn't eavesdrop, I came here to see who the two assassins were."

Although Xu Zhihu overheard some words outside the door, she didn't understand any of them.

However,

Xu Zhihu also understood some of them.

Su Chen was very familiar with Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er. Xu Zhihu guessed that Su Chen went to 
the place where Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er were.

"I agree with everything you said."

Su Chen took Xu Zhihu with one hand and held her in his arms.



Xu Zhihu was a plump and mature beauty. Her sickly look made people look very pitiful.

Xu Zhihu cried out in embarrassment as Su Chen hugged her. ,"Let me go"

"Xu Zhihu, you are my princess, is it wrong for me to hold you? Isn’t it natural for me to hold you?"

"Shameless, I am not your princess, let me go"

"no? The maids, secret guards, and soldiers in the mansion all call you princess. You don’t seem to 
object, right?"

"I'm too lazy to say the opposite.....Wuwuwu~"

Xu Zhihu said when Su Chen suddenly kissed her.

She pushed Su Chen with wide eyes, but Su Chen held her tightly.

Xu Zhihu was still a woman with no strength to restrain a chicken. , she couldn't push away the 
bastard who kissed her.

After a while,

Xu Zhihu closed his eyes and responded to Su Chen's kiss.

For three days,

Su Chen's shadow had been in her heart. As long as Xu Zhihu closed his eyes and slept, she would 
She couldn't help but think of Su Chen, of Su Chen's teasing, tolerance, accommodation, and trust 
in her. The surrounding secret guards and troops turned around quickly, and everyone was alert to 
the surrounding assassins. Assassination.

In the study, after Sheng Cai'er took the Heaven and Earth Spirit Fruit, her sense of taste and vision 
were completely restored. She could smell the fragrance of flowers in the study and could also see 
Ran Bing next to her.



Ran Bing saw Sheng Cai'er's bright eyes and asked He said,"Sheng Cai'er, have your eyes 
recovered? Sheng

Cai'er nodded and replied,"Recovered, Ran Bing, I didn't expect your hair to be white.""

"Your hair is also very beautiful, the purple hair is very beautiful. Sheng

Cai'er tapped her fingers on the table and asked,"Ran Bing, do you believe what Su Chen said?" 
Ran

Bing said with a sweet smile,

"Believe it, how could I not believe it? Su Chen knows my world very well. His teammates are also 
from my world. Although they are not in the same world, the development rules of the world are the 
same. Sheng

Cai'er frowned and asked,"I also believe what Su Chen said, but why did Su Chen kill Yan Dan and 
Linghu Chong?" Ran

Bing poured tea for Sheng Caier and replied.

"I don't know. There must be a reason why Su Chen killed them. Sheng Cai'er, Yan Dan and Linghu 
Chong are not good people."

"Yan Dan is arrogant and condescending, Linghu Chong is a libertine, his words and actions are not 
reliable at all,"

"Also, when Su Chen killed Yan Dan,"

"Yan Dan was so frightened that he knelt down and begged for mercy. We don't need teammates 
who are greedy for life and death."

Sheng Cai'er nodded.



She didn't care about the deaths of Yan Dan and Linghu Chong.

The five-person team just met today.

Except for the old man who went to complete another task,

Sheng Cai'er, Yan Dan, and Linghu Chong only knew each other by name. They were waiting for 
each other. We hadn't been together for half a day.

Ran Bing saw him outside the door and said in embarrassment,"Damn it, Su Chen actually hugged 
Xu Zhihu and kissed her outside the door."

Sheng Cai'er looked at her with no expression.

She was not interested in any of this, but Xu Zhihu was their team's mission, and Su Chen was Xu 
Zhihu's man. It would be difficult for Sheng Cai'er to capture Xu Zhihu within a month.

Su Chen hugged Xu Zhihu and said with a smile,"Xu Zhihu, you have been stamped by me, and 
you will be my woman from now on.""

"You are shameless!"

Xu Zhihu blushed and adjusted her clothes in a panic.

She didn't expect that Su Chen not only kissed her, but also touched her body. There were many 
secret guards and black-armored troops around, and there were two assassin women in the study. 
This bastard was too Shameless and shameless.

Su Chen touched Xu Zhihu's delicate little face and said,"Haha~, Madam, go and ask the maid to 
prepare meals for the two girls in the study. I have something to talk to them about.""

"good!"



Xu Zhihu blushed and left quickly, holding up her skirt. She was so shy that she didn't want to stay 
with Su Chen for a moment.

Madam?

She will be Su Chen's wife in the future.

Xu Zhihu's heart has never been so sweet.

She has been there for more than ten years. Tortured by illness, she fell in love with someone when 
she grew up, but she was entrusted to someone else. The person Xu Zhihu liked knew that she 
wanted to get married, but that person was indifferent. Not only did he not say that he wanted to 
take her away, but he also said that he could not conquer the world. The first one refused to go 
down the mountain.

Xu Zhihu married into the Lu family in Jiangnan with sadness and disappointment.

On the wedding day, the newlywed husband fell ill and died within a few days. Xu Zhihu became a 
widow at a young age.

Over the past few years,

Xu Zhihu For the sake of Beiliang and to pave the way for her brother Xu Fengnian,

Zhihu kept the Lu family.

Over the past few years, she had been criticized and gossiped about as Kefu's widow, a shameless 
woman, a dirty woman, how could Xu Zhihu It can be said that life has been difficult for the past 
few years.

Xu Zhihu didn't care about this. She wanted to pave the way for Xu Fengnian before she died, but 
Su Chen appeared three days ago, and

Su Chen shamelessly threatened to kidnap her. Arrive at Jiangnan Palace.



Xu Zhihu's life has been the easiest in the past three days.

Su Chen teases her every day. Xu Zhihu is ashamed and angry, but also finds it funny.

Fate?

Or fate?

Xu Zhihu doesn't want to know, she There is not much time to live, maybe a year, maybe a month, 
maybe she will die tomorrow.

Xu Zhihu wants to live for herself once before she dies. She will treat her life as if it was not in 
vain.

"Interesting Xu Zhihu."

Su Chen looked at Xu Zhihu leaving in a panic and smiled. The plump beauty must have been taken 
care of.

Tonight,

Su Chen can enjoy Xu Zhihu's plump body, proud body, and sexy delicate red lips.

Su Chen left He entered the study and asked,"Sheng Cai'er, have your sense of taste and vision 
recovered?

Sheng Cai'er nodded and replied,"Thank you, I have fully recovered.""

Su Chen sat next to Ran Bing and asked,"Sheng Cai'er, Ran Bing, what is your destiny mission?"

"We have three destiny missions. Mission one is to kidnap Xu Zhihu for a month. Mission two is to 
kidnap Xu Weixiong for a month. Mission three is to kill Xu Fengniankou in Emperor Wu City."

Chapter 3064



Ran Bing told Su Chen about their destiny mission.

Su Chen was also a destiny person before.

Ran Bing hoped to get help from Su Chen. She believed that Su Chen would help her and Sheng 
Cai'er.

Su Chen touched his chin and asked doubtfully,

"Three luck missions? Ran Bing, why did you arrest Xu Zhihu and Xu Weixiong for a month? Ran

Bing replied with a sweet smile,"Su Chen, mission one and mission two, after we capture sisters Xu 
Zhihu and Xu Weixiong, they must stay with us for a month before the mission is completed.""

Su Chen was speechless when he heard Ran Bing's words.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er's mission overlapped with his. Su Chen kidnapped Xu Zhihu and 
wanted to stay with him for three months. Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er wanted to He kidnapped Xu 
Zhihu and kept him with him for a month.

Ran Bing blinked and asked,"Su Chen, can you help us complete our mission?""

Su Chen thought for a while and replied,

"Ran Bing, I can help you complete tasks one and two. For task three, Sheng Caier can assassinate 
Xu Fengnian by herself. She is a level 508 assassin after all."

Cai'er drank tea and said,

"Su Chen, my strength is limited by the destiny of heaven. I can only use the second level of 
strength, which is equivalent to the strength of the peak of the celestial realm. My reincarnation 
spiritual furnace cannot be used."



"Strength is limited? Peak of Celestial Realm?"

Su Chen looked at Sheng Cai'er unexpectedly.

Previously, the black armored army and the secret guards surrounded and killed the four of Sheng 
Cai'er. No wonder Sheng Cai'er was helpless and unable to kill the secret guards and troops. It 
turned out that Sheng Cai'er's strength was blocked by luck. The law of heaven is restricted.

The peak of the Celestial Realm?

Li Chungang has not gone to Longhu Mountain and has not returned to the land of gods. Sheng 
Cai'er can kill Li Chungang at this moment.

However, the third task of Sheng Cai'er and Ran Bing is to kill Xu Fengnian in Emperor Wu City.

If Li Chungang is killed now,

Xu Fengnian may not dare to go to Emperor Wu City.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er can coerce Xu Fengnian to go to Emperor Wu City, but on the way to 
Emperor Wu City,

Beiliang will definitely send someone to rescue Xu Fengnian, and the Peach Blossom Sword God 
will also take action to rescue Xu Fengnian. , Ran Bing and Sheng Caier may not be able to take Xu 
Fengnian to Emperor Wu City

"By the way, don’t you have five people in your team? What about the other person? Ran

Bing returned to Su Chen and said,

"Another teammate of ours is called Uncle Jiu. He is a Taoist priest. Uncle Jiu went to capture Xu 
Weixiong."

I'll go,



Uncle Jiu?

Taoist?

Uncle Jiu won't be Uncle Jiu in the zombie world, right?

But, can Uncle Jiu succeed in catching Xu Weixiong?

Xu Weixiong is pretty good, and

Uncle Jiu uses Taoism to deal with zombies and The little demon is okay, but he may be vulnerable 
to the masters of the martial arts world.

Ran Bing said with a pitiful expression,

"Su Chen, Sheng Cai'er and I need your help. Xu Zhihu is at your residence. We are just capturing 
her for a month and will not harm her. The same goes for Xu Weixiong."

"And Xu Fengnian, we heard that there is a strong man in Emperor Wu City, who is also the 
strongest man in the snow world. We cannot kill Xu Fengnian in Emperor Emperor City. You have 
to help us complete three tasks."

Su Chen touched his chin and smiled,"I can help you, but how do you thank me?

Ran Bing asked with his eyes wide open,"How do you want us to thank you?""

Su Chen looked at the two women's curvy figures and said,"Let's do this, each of you kiss me, and I 
will help you."

Ran Bing rolled his eyes at Su Chen speechlessly and said,

"You are so shameless!"



"dream!"

Sheng Cai'er stared at Xiao Yu coldly, kiss?

She won't kiss anyone, no, there is one person, a little boy Sheng Cai'er knew when she was a child.

Several years have passed, and the little boy doesn't know how he is doing now. Sheng Cai'er I don't 
know if I can see him again.

Su Chen curled his lips and reminded,

"Ran Bing, there will be no consequences for your love for Mark. You should understand that, 
besides, you have become a lucky person, and there will be no consequences for you and Mark. I 
can tell you a secret."

"Mark is not a pure human being. He is Experimental Subject No. 4, a combination of Mary's 
ecology. He will become a pole-devouring beast in the future."

Su Chen was very angry when he read the plot of The Spirit Cage.

Except for the hunters and some servants, the people on the lighthouse were all lunatics, and no one 
was normal. 

Mark is also an idiot. He clearly controls the Hunters, so why can't he lead the Hunters to kill the 
madman Charles?

Ran Bing shouted in disbelief,"You are talking nonsense, how can Mark be an experimental 
subject?" How could he become a pole-devouring beast?"

Su Chen patted Ran Bing on the shoulder and said,"You believe what I say, don't you?

Ran Bingjiang hurriedly asked Su Chen,"Su Chen, can you save Mark?" I don't want him to turn 
into a beast."



Su Chen took the teapot and poured tea, shaking his head and saying,

"I can't save him, my strength is sealed, my items can only take out low-level spiritual fruits, I can't 
save Mark, and I have no intention of saving a fool, a virgin bitch."

Ran Bing fell silent.

She also knew that Mark was an idiot and a virgin bitch.

All the resources on the lighthouse depended on Mark to take the hunters to collect them.

Every time he went to collect supplies, a lot of hunters would die. People, the superiors on the 
lighthouse are just enjoying their gains, and they continue to punish the hunters with disciplines. []

Ran Bing thought of the breeding mission in the Golden Hall, and she held her hands tightly with a 
determined expression.

Xiao Yu saw Ran Bing thinking deeply,

200 He asked Sheng Caier,"Sheng Caier, are you thinking about the little boy you knew when you 
were a child?

Sheng Cai'er asked hurriedly,"You know?""

Su Chen replied while drinking tea,

"I know, you'll meet him in hunting group competitions"

"Sheng Cai'er, Long Haochen's identity is not simple"

"His father is the owner of the Throne of the Seal of Doom and Killing, and his mother is the 
daughter of the sixth generation Demon God Emperor. Don't tell anyone about this, just know it 
yourself."



Sheng Cai'er's expressionless face revealed a look of surprise.

Is Long Haochen's father the holder of the Divine Seal Throne, or the Divine Seal Throne of Doom 
and Slaughter, and his mother is actually the daughter of the sixth generation Demon God Emperor?

How could this happen,

Long Haochen Are they actually the descendants of humans and demons?

Su Chen saw Sheng Cai'er's surprised expression and smiled and said,"Sheng Cai'er, Long Haochen 
is not simple either. He has ninety-seven points of innate spiritual power. He is also the son of light. 
He is also the son of light." The double knights of punishment and protection. Sheng

Cai'er asked, holding hands tightly.

"Su Chen, how do you know this? Can you see what's going to happen in the future?"

"That's right"

"What counts? You must know, right?"

"Sheng Caier, what do you want to know? What is your future with Long Haochen? Or something 
else? By the way, something big will happen in the assassin exorcism level where your parents are 
stationed soon."

Chapter 3065

Su Chen has revealed enough about Sheng Cai'er. He won't say anything to Sheng Cai'er anymore.

Well,

Sheng Cai'er seems to only have Long Haochen in his heart.



After Su Chen met Sheng Cai'er and Ran Bing this time, I'm afraid they won't meet again in the 
future.

Forget it,

Su Chen is just a small powerhouse in the Hongmeng world. It does n't matter whether ordinary 
human women accept her or not. If Su Chen hadn't met Sheng Cai'er on the road if it weren't for the 
fact that Sheng Caier is the heroine, Wouldn't even look at it twice.

Ran Bing whispered to Su Chen gossiping,

"Su Chen, what do you mean? Sheng Caier liked the little boy she met before?"

Su Chen patted Ran Bing's head and said,"Little white girl, you can ask Sheng Cai'er. Ran

Bing raised her fist and asked,"Little white girl?" Su Chen, I just have white hair, why am I a little 
white girl? Su

Chen looked at Ran Bing's figure and said,"Your skin is very white, your long legs are also very 
white, and your bare chest is even whiter. What are you if you're not a little white girl?""

"You are so shameless."

Ran Bing didn't expect Su Chen to say this.

Su Chen has become an immortal.

Aren't immortals free from desires?

Aren't immortals unable to like women?

Why does Su Chen look so lustful? Could it be that Su Chen is an immortal who has done many 
evil things? ?



At this moment,

Sheng Cai'er has been staring at Su Chen.

Su Chen's words made her calm heart beat very fast, 070 Long Haochen?

The person she has always missed since childhood,

Sheng Cai'er has been thinking about meeting Long again. Haochen, during the Demon Hunting 
Team competition,

Su Chen said she would meet Long Haochen.

However,

Long Haochen's father and mother were not ordinary people. Long Haochen was also a double 
knight.

Sheng Cai'er didn't know whether she should meet Long Haochen. Haochen recognizes her, she is a 
lucky one, she will become more and more powerful in the future,

Sheng Caier may one day become an immortal like Su Chen,

Long Haochen?

Should he forget?

Or should he recognize Long Haochen ? ?

There is also the Exorcism Pass.

Su Chen said that something big will happen in the Exorcism Pass soon. What big event will it be? 
Will the devil attack the Exorcism Pass?



Sheng Caier wanted to ask clearly, but she saw that Su Chen seemed unwilling to say Go down, 
why?

Can’t the secret be leaked?

At this time,

Xu Zhihu pushed the door open and came in and said,"Su Chen, the food is ready"

"Ran Bing, Sheng Cai'er, let's go to dinner. Don't be impulsive when you see and hear anything."

Su Chen stood up and said to Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er.

He pulled Xu Zhihu towards the (aiag) hall.

Ran Bing asked Sheng Cai'er in confusion,"Sheng Cai'er, what Su Chen said is What's the meaning? 
Sheng

Cai'er thought thoughtfully and replied,"There should be other people in the hall who may be our 
mission targets. Let's go and take a look first. Don't act rashly.""

"good!"

In the hall,

Xu Fengnian and others were sitting together drinking tea.

Li Chungang and Jiang Ni saw Xu Fengnian's gloomy face, and they did not speak.

Li Chungang found Jiang Ni looking at him in a daze and asked,"Xiao Nizi, What are you looking 
at?"



"Didn't see anything."

Jiang Ni hurriedly waved her hands and sat down.

What are you looking at?

Can she tell you?

Sitting here, Jiang Ni happened to see the left aisle outside the hall.

In the aisle,

Su Chen was hugging Xu Zhihu and kissing her. 

Jiang Ni was very confused when he saw Su Chen and Xu Zhihu kissing in the aisle in broad 
daylight. Xu Zhihu didn’t resist Su Chen yet. Jiang Ni said to everyone The ladylike Xu Zhihu felt 
very strange. After a while, Su Chen pulled the blushing Xu Zhihu into the hall. He looked at Xu 
Fengnian and others but ignored them.

"Ran Bing, Sheng Caier, you and I are sitting here."

Su Chen waved to the two women behind him, and he led them to the dining table next to him.

"Su Chen, I'm going to greet my brother."

Xu Zhihu saw that Su Chen didn't want to see Xu Fengnian's people.

Xu Fengnian and his people would leave tomorrow. She didn't want Su Chen and Xu Fengnian to 
conflict.

Su Chen let go of Xu Zhihu and said with a smile,

"good."



Xu Zhihu nodded to Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er. She held up her dress and walked towards Xu 
Fengnian.

Ran Bing sat next to Su Chen and asked,"Su Chen, who is that person over there? You don't seem to 
want to see them"[]

Su Chen patted Ran Bing's shoulder and said,"Little white girl, didn't you hear what Xu Zhihu 
said?"

Ran Bing suddenly understood and said,

"younger brother? Xu Zhihu’s younger brother Xu Fengnian? The character target we want to kill in 
mission three."

Sheng Caier looked at Xu Fengnian with squinted eyes.

The third target of the mission appeared.

However, they could only kill Xu Fengnian in Emperor Wu City. There was a strong man beside Xu 
Fengnian.

Sheng Caier looked at Xu Fengnian drinking tea.

They had According to the news about Xu Fengnian, they can kill Xu Fengnian in Emperor Wu 
City.

After the wine and food were brought by the maid,

Su Chen and Ran Bing began to eat, and they didn't care about the people next to them.

After a while,



Su Chen looked at Li Chungang's face Ugami yelled,"You old man, if you dare to pick your nose in 
the hall again, I will kick you out."

Su Chen was disgusted.

Damn it, everyone in the hall was eating again, and

Li Chungang was actually picking his nose. Disgusting old bastard, even if Su Chen retained a little 
bit of his sealed strength, he would not be able to resist beating Li Chungang to death.

The women in the hall were so disgusted that they stopped eating. It was so disgusting.

If Su Chen didn't say anything,

Some of them haven't noticed yet, but Su Chen mentioned picking his nose in public, and the 
women in the hall couldn't help but feel nauseated.

Li Chungang shouted angrily and threatened,"King Jiangnan, do you want to die?"

"Immortal old man, do you want to die?"

"Hum, King Jiangnan, you are a scumbag. If you don’t have an army, I can crush you to death with 
one hand."

Su Chen disdainfully threatened,

"Scumbag? army? Immortal, what am I? What is your identity? Do you believe that I ordered an 
army of 200,000 to surround and kill you? Do you believe that I offer a reward of one million taels 
of gold for your life?"

Xu Fengnian stood up and said with a serious face,

"King Jiangnan, you have gone too far. Senior Li did not offend you. Are you deliberately looking 
for trouble?"



Su Chen curled his lips and sneered at Xu Fengnian,

"Hey, Xu Fengnian, who do you think you are? Can you talk to Wang Jue like this?"

"The King of Northern Liang, Xu Xiao, and I are both princes. You are just the crown prince 
without a title. To be clear, you are a scumbag. Didn’t Xu Xiao teach you the rules and etiquette? 
Do you want me to pay you any courtesy?"

Jiang Ni stood up in a hurry and said,"King Jiangnan, our young master drank too much, please 
don't take offense."

"Little maid, do you have the right to speak here? There are no rules at all, huh? Little maid, I didn’t 
expect you to be pure and beautiful. Come and drink with me, or I will kill you with a stick."
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Su Chen didn't expect Jiang Ni to stand up.

This is good.

The second task is to kidnap Jiang Ni within ten days.

Jiang Ni is speaking for Xu Fengnian at the moment. Su Chen can also take this opportunity to keep 
Jiang Ni.

"Drink with you....drink wine?"

Jiang Ni looked at Su Chen in confusion.

What do you mean?

Su Chen asked her to drink with her?



Drink with her?

Jiang Ni would be killed if she didn't drink with Su Chen?

Xu Fengnian stood up angrily and shouted,"King Jiangnan, you want to fight with Su Chen? Is 
Beiliang an enemy?"

Let Jiang Ni drink with you?

Just drink with her?

Xu Fengnian guessed that Su Chen fell in love with Jiang Ni, and Su Chen might humiliate Jiang 
Ni.

Qingniao and Yu Youwei were disgusted, but they didn't expect that Su Chen would Let Jiang Ni 
drink with him.

The girls in Jade Bird looked at Jiang Ni one after another.

They guessed that Su Chen was attracted to Jiang Ni. Su Chen might force the 610 Office to force 
Jiang Ni to stay and humiliate her.

Xu Zhihu took a sip of tea and shook it. She shook her head.

She didn't want to persuade Su Chen, and she wouldn't persuade Su Chen.

Su Chen was right in scolding Li Chungang earlier.

Everyone was eating, but Li Chungang was disgustingly picking his nose. No matter who saw it, he 
would feel disgusted.

What qualifications does Xu Fengnian have to question Su Chen?



Su Chen is the king of Jiangnan.

Xu Fengnian is just a white prince.

Without Xu Xiao,

Xu Fengnian is nothing.

A white man questions a prince?

Xu Fengnian is asking for trouble.

Xu Zhihu only needs to guarantee Xu Fengnian Unless she is killed, she will let Su Chen do 
whatever she wants.

Su Chen will be her man in the future, and Xu Zhihu will no longer have anything to do with 
Beiliang in the short time of his life.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er can't figure it out at the moment. Clear your mind, what is Su Chen 
going to do?

Su Chen first angrily denounced the disgusting Li Chungang, and then threatened Xu Fengnian. 
Now he wants to rob the daughter of the people?

Su Chen asked disdainfully,"Xu Fengnian, does Beiliang want to start a war with me?"

Xu Fengnian threatened with a gloomy face,

"Su Chen, don't think that you can be arrogant because you have a powerful army in your hands. 
You are in the hall now and there are no powerful masters around you. If I want to kill you, you 
can't hide."

Su Chen hugged Ran Bing beside him and mocked,



"No expert? kill me?"

"Xu Fengnian, are you blind? Didn't you see the purple-haired woman next to me? You ask Li 
Chungang if he dares to take action? If you dare to take action, none of you will be able to leave 
Yangcheng? Ran

Bing blushed and whispered to Su Chen,"Su Chen, you are so shameless, let me go.""

Su Chen stroked Ran Bing's small waist and said,"Little white girl, I don't have any strength now, 
you and Sheng Cai'er have to protect me."

"Shameless pervert."

Ran Bing glared at Su Chen in shame.

She didn't push Su Chen away.

Ran Bing understood what Su Chen wanted to do.

She was just a scumbag.

If Xu Fengnian's powerful subordinates took action, Sheng Cai'er would protect them and leave..

Sheng Cai'er did not speak.

After she heard Su Chen's threats to Xu Fengnian, Sheng Cai'er had been wary of Li Chungang.

She would not let Su Chen be killed.

If Li Chungang dared to take action,

Sheng Cai'er would take Su Chen and Ran Bing quickly escaped from the hall.



Wei Shuyang hurriedly persuaded Xu Fengnian,

"Young Master, you have to calm down. The purple-haired woman is a strong one. If we take 
action, the purple-haired woman will protect King Jiangnan from leaving. When the time comes, we 
will be surrounded by tens of thousands of black-armored troops. Ning

Emei said with a serious face,"Young Master, the overall situation is important. Beiliang cannot 
offend the King of Jiangnan." Li

Chungang said with a cold face,"Boy, if you kill King Jiangnan, I can restrain the purple-haired 
woman." Xu

Zhihu shouted angrily,

"Shut up, Li Jianshen, what do you mean?" 

"Kill Su Chen? Xu Fengnian dares to order his men to take action. Whether you kill Su Chen or not, 
Jiangnan and Beiliang will start a war. Do you want Beiliang to be devastated?"

Xu Zhihu had to speak.

She didn't expect that Li Chungang would ask Xu Fengnian to kill Su Chen.

Kill Su Chen?

Xu Zhihu didn't know if the two Sheng Caier girls would save Su Chen, but she didn't want Su 
Chen to be killed by Xu Fengnian's men. Death.

Moreover, it is still unknown whether Xu Fengnian can kill Su Chen.

If Xu Fengnian orders his men to take action and Su Chen is rescued, a war will definitely break out 
between Jiangnan and Beiliang.

At that time,



Liyang Kingdom will also take the opportunity to send troops to Beiliang, and

Beiliang will The surrounding states will also add insult to injury. Will Beiliang be an opponent in 
the face of many enemies?

Wei Shuyang and Qingniao looked at Li Chungang in shock. They were also frightened by Li 
Chungang's words.

Kill Su Chen?

Do they dare?

This is Jiangnan, []

This is Su Chen's base camp.

There are thousands of black-armored troops and secret guards in Jiangnan Palace. There are tens of 
thousands of black-armored troops outside Jiangnan Palace. What about outside Yangcheng?

There may be more than 100,000 black-armored troops waiting outside Yangcheng.

If Xu Fengnian dares If they attack Su Chen, whether they kill Su Chen or not, the black armored 
army will surround and kill them all.0.........

Li Chungang said with murderous intent flashing in his eyes,

"Xu Zhihu, even if we don't kill Su Chen, will he let us go? Will he let Jiang Ni go?"

Li Chungang hates Su Chen very much.

No one can insult him. He is a dandy prince and a scumbag who doesn't know martial arts.



Li Chungang will not let Su Chen go. He will definitely kill Su Chen brutally.

Xu Zhihu's face was cold. Said,"With me here, Xu Fengnian can take you out of Jiangnan safely."

Wei Shuyang and Qingniao looked at each other.

They understood that

Xu Zhihu was really together with Su Chen.

Previously, the secret guards and black-armored troops of the Jiangnan Palace, as well as the maids 
and servants, everyone had a crush on Xu Zhihu. Very respectfully,

Xu Zhihu said in public that he would let them leave safely.

Su Chen had not yet refuted.

Qingniao and others guessed that Su Chen really liked Xu Zhihu, otherwise Xu Zhihu would not 
have said these words.

Xu Fengnian's face was gloomy as he thought,

He had heard the discussions of several people around him.

Killing Su Chen?

He didn't dare, especially during the critical period when Xu Xiao was hereditary king of Northern 
Liang.

If Xu Fengnian dared to take action against Su Chen 3.6,

Li YangThe emperor will not allow him to be hereditary king of Northern Liang.



The Jiangnan Black Armor Army will also launch a war against Northern Liang. The Liyang 
Kingdom and the feudal kings of various states will also launch a war against Northern Liang.

At that time, not only will the lives of Northern Liang be devastated, but the Xu family of Northern 
Liang will also They will all be eradicated.

Xu Fengnian said with a serious face,"King Jiangnan, it's my fault this time. I will leave with my 
men today."

Su Chen hugged Ran Bing and drank wine and said,

"leave? Can!"

"but!"

"The little beauty with dimples stays"

"There are also cold beauties in cyan clothes who have to stay."

"I can pretend that you didn’t say anything before, otherwise, I will write to Emperor Liyang that 
the Crown Prince of Beiliang and below want to kill me, and I will ask Emperor Liyang to issue an 
order to launch a war against Beiliang."
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Su Chen doesn't care whether Xu Fengnian compromises or not,

Jiang Ni must stay. There is also Qingniao, a good and cold beauty. Su Chen will get Qingniao no 
matter in the Shenyu Continent or in the trial world. Su Chen will not If he lets Qingniao follow Xu 
Fengnian again, he will not let Qingniao continue to be Xu Fengnian's dead soldier. Xu Fengnian 
stood up with a dark face and shouted,

"King Jiangnan, don't go too far. Jiang Ni and Qingniao are both my maids, and they will not stay."

Su Chen curled his lips and mocked,



"maid? Xu Fengnian, do you think I am a fool?"

"Jiang Ni's real name is Jiang Si, the lost princess of Western Chu, Qingniao, whose real name is 
Wang Qingniao, the daughter of the Spear Immortal Wang Xiu, and one of the Four Deadly Soldiers 
trained by Xu Xiao for you."

Xu Fengnian was very surprised when he heard Su Chen's words.

Jiang Ni's identity was exposed.

How could Su Chen know that Jiang Ni was the princess of Xi Chu?

It's troublesome.

If Emperor Li Yang knew about Jiang Ni's existence,

Jiang Ni would still be adopted by Xu Xiao. Emperor

Liyang will definitely use this to deal with Beiliang Palace. Xu Xiao may not be safe in Liyang 
Palace. Jiang Ni and Qingniao looked at Su Chen in shock. How could Su Chen know their 
identities?

Jiang Ni has been at Beiliang Palace all the time. , she rarely comes out.

How could Su Chen know that she is Princess Xichu?

Qingniao felt very uneasy.

She is the daughter of the Spear Immortal Wang Xiu?

He also knew that she was C among the four dead men in heaven?



How could Su Chen know this? Secret?

Su Chen may find out the identity of Qingniao, but only Xu Xiao knows the identity of her dead 
soldier. Xu Fengnian doesn't know it. How could Su Chen know it?

People in the hall looked at Jiang Ni,

Princess Xichu?

Jiang Ni His identity is very sensitive.

If Emperor Liyang knew about this,

Northern Liang King Xu Xiao would be in big trouble. Emperor Liyang would not let Xu Xiao go, 
let alone Beiliang.

Xu Zhihu opened his mouth and wanted to tell Su Chen She thought about what to say but did not 
say it.

Su Chen revealed Jiang Ni's identity at this moment. Xu Zhihu guessed that Su Chen was just to 
threaten Xu Fengnian. She believed that Su Chen would not reveal Jiang Ni's identity to Emperor Li 
Yang.

Su Chen looked Xiang Jiang Ni said nonsense,

"Jiang Ni, you are just a stupid idiot woman"

"Your father was killed by Xu Xiao, your mother, your sisters, and many of your father's concubines 
were all humiliated and died by the Northern Liang Army. You actually fell in love with the son of 
your enemy."

"Jiang Ni, haven't you ever thought about why Xu Xiao didn't kill you? Why do you want to stay 
with Xu Fengnian?"



"Idiot woman"

"Xu Xiao is known as the Human Slaughterer, he has killed countless people, and he is also a 
scheming old bastard. If you are of no use, will Xu Xiao take the risk of leaving you without killing 
you? Jiang

Ni said with a pale face,

"I....I know, I know, I'm just an ordinary woman, what can I do?"

"Idiot woman, I'm too lazy to say anything to you."

Su Chen glanced at Jiang Ni and said to Qingniao,"Qingniao, your father was killed by Chen 
Zhibao. Why did Chen Zhibao kill your father? You should understand whose order it was."

"Xu Xiao can be said to be your father-killing enemy, but you are stupid enough to become Xu 
Fengnian's slain soldier, a slain soldier who can die for Xu Fengnian. Do you think you are a stupid 
idiot?"

"I admire Xu Xiao very much. He can actually train his enemy's daughter into a dead soldier or a 
chess piece."

"Jiang Ni is the princess of Western Chu. If Xu Fengnian marries Jiang Ni in the future, the old 
ministers of Western Chu or the remaining troops loyal to Western Chu will become Xu Fengnian's 
subordinates."

"What about you, Blue Bird?"

"If you follow Xu Fengnian, you will not only die for Xu Fengnian, but you will also become Xu 
Fengnian's concubine."

"Xu Xiao can be said to be a murderer and a murderer."

"The enemy's daughter died for his son, and the enemy's daughter could become his son's pawn. Xu 
Xiao was worthy of being a human butcher, and worthy of being an old fox full of conspiracies."



Qingniao held Chang Ge tightly, with an angry look in her eyes.

Su Chen was right, she was a very stupid woman, but she didn't know her identity. She didn't know 
that her father was raped by Chen Zhibao. She didn't know that Xu Xiao had been using her to kill 
people and punish her heart? 

Qingniao thought that if she died to protect Xu Fengnian, what face would she have to face her 
father after her death? ?

How can we face our family?

Jiang Ni collapsed on the ground, with a look of death in her eyes.

Yu Youwei squatted down and hugged Jiang Ni and said,"Princess, let's leave Xu Fengnian, we 
don't want to be with Xu Fengnian.""

Jiang Ni said with a look of death and pain,

"I'm a fool, I'm an idiot, Youwei, I saw my father glaring at me angrily, I saw the miserable deaths 
of my sisters and my father's concubines who had been insulted, and I had no face to face them."

Wei Shuyang, Ning Emei, and Li Chungang all looked ugly.

Xu Xiao's conspiracy and calculations made them shudder. The enemy's daughter was used as a 
chess piece to die, killing people to kill people?

This is not killing people to kill people's hearts.

This is obvious. To make Qingniao and Jiang Ni die with their eyes open,

Jiang Ni and Qingniao were treated as chess pieces and dead soldiers?

What about them? []



What do they think of them in Xu Xiao's eyes? Pawns? Dead soldiers? Or cannon fodder?

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er was very shocked.

Although they did not understand the full meaning, they understood that Jiang Ni and Qingniao 
were used as chess pieces and dead soldiers, and became the chess pieces and dead soldiers of the 
enemy's son.

Xu Xiao? Xu

Xiao, the king of Northern Liang, is really cruel,

Xu Xiao He killed Jiang Ni and Qingniao's family members and trained the two girls to be chess 
pieces and dead soldiers.

Such a person is too scary and insidious.

Xu Zhihu looked at Xu Fengnian with a complicated expression and lowered his head.

Jiang Ni and Qingniao were chess pieces and dead soldiers. ?

What about her?

Xu (Li Hao) Zhihu is just a bargaining chip in Xu Xiao’s hands.

For Beiliang and for Xu Fengnian’s paving the way,

Xu Xiao can give up and use his own daughter. It’s not surprising that Jiang Ni and Qingniao are 
used.

Su Chen Seeing Jiang Ni's deathly expression, he hurriedly said,"Jiang Ni, you are not an idiot. I 
just talked nonsense. You must not seek death, and you must not believe my words.""



Damn it,

Jiang Ni must not commit suicide in grief.

Su Chen's second mission still requires Jiang Ni to be alive.

If Jiang Ni commits suicide, his mission will also fail.

Su Chen regrets that he said too much to Jiang Ni.

Jiang Ni Ni glared at Su Chen and asked,"King Jiangnan, I know if I am a stupid idiot, are you 
afraid that I will commit suicide?"

Su Chen replied with a smile,"Of course, you are pure and beautiful, with very cute dimples and an 
attractive figure. I don't want a little beauty to become a withered skeleton after death."

Chapter 3068

Su Chen looked at Jiang Ni and put down his worries.

Jiang Ni didn't look like he was going to commit suicide.

He didn't have to worry about the little beauty losing her beauty, and he didn't have to worry about 
not being able to complete the second trial task.

Jiang Ni glared at Su Chen and shouted in shame,"King Jiangnan, your shamelessness is not like 
that of a nobleman or a noble king."

Su Chen curled his lips and mocked,"I'm not a nobleman, and I'm not a king either. Lord, little 
beauty, you are the real nobleman, a stupid princess.-"

"you....."



Jiang Ni was so angry that her chest was about to burst.

Her previous frustration had disappeared without a trace. Now Jiang Ni wanted to strangle the 
shameless Su Chen.

How stupid can you be?

Stupid idiot?

Jiang Ni admitted that she was a stupid idiot and a very stupid woman, but did this have anything to 
do with Su Chen?

Do she and Su Chen know each other?

Familiar?

Why did he shamelessly mock her again and again?

Su Chen shouted to Xu Fengnian who lowered his head and had a sullen face,

"Xu Fengnian, get out of Yangcheng quickly, otherwise Jiang Ni’s identity will be known to 
Emperor Li Yang. If it weren’t for your sister’s sake, you would die in Jiangnan."

Xu Fengnian raised his head and looked at Su Chen gloomily.

He knew that Jiang Ni and Qingniao could not be taken away, and Jiang Ni and Qingniao would 
never leave him again.

Su Chen?

Jiangnan King Suchen?

Jiang Ni's identity and Qingniao's identity, why Su Chen Will it be clear?



Is there Su Chen's spy in Beiliang Prince's Palace?

Who could it be?

These secrets are not accessible to ordinary people. Who could be hiding in Beiliang Prince's 
Palace?

Su Chen's face was cold and threatening,"Young bitch, look What to see? If you don’t leave with 
your men and the disgusting old bastard within a quarter of an hour, you don’t have to leave either."

"let's go!"

Xu Fengnian glared at Su Chen angrily.

He led Wei Shuyang and others outside.

Xu Fengnian couldn't afford to offend Su Chen now.

If Su Chen told Emperor Liyang about Jiang Ni's identity,

Xu Xiao would be executed in the capital of Liyang, and

Beiliang would also be killed. He would be attacked by Li Yang Kingdom and the surrounding 
states, and he could not justly claim the title of King of Northern Liang.

Li Chungang frowned and looked at Su Chen.

He followed Xu Fengnian and left.

Jiang Ni would no longer be with Xu Fengnian. Although Li Chungang did not want to protect Xu 
Fengnian anymore. , but after all, he has received kindness from Xu Xiao, and he cannot give up 
halfway for the sake of reputation.



As for Su Chen,

Li Chungang will find opportunities to assassinate Su Chen in the future, and he will not let go of 
the lustful nobles who mocked him.

"Hey, pretty cat-hugging beauty, why don’t you leave with Xu Fengnian? Don't you like Xu 
Fengnian?"

Su Chen found out that Yu Youwei did not leave with Xu Fengnian. He understood that Yu Youwei 
did it for Jiang Ni,

Daman, leaving two beauties behind and sending one away.

Su Chen thought and shook his head and was too lazy to talk to Yu Youwei.

Yu Youwei Wei ignored Su Chen.

She stood next to Jiang Ni as if I didn't exist.

Su Chen said to the two women beside him,

"Ran Bing, Sheng Caier, you stay in my mansion. As for your remaining teammates, I will send 
someone to contact him. Ran

Bing said with a smile,

"Su Chen, we will stay in your mansion, don't forget to promise to help us complete our mission."

Sheng Cai'er nodded to Su Chen.

She and Ran Bing will not leave.



Xu Zhihu on mission 1 is at Su Chen's mansion. If Sheng Cai'er leaves, she will take Xu Zhihu with 
her.

"Don't worry, I will definitely do what I promised."

Su Chen shrugged at Ran Bing, walked towards Jiang Ni and Qingniao and said,

"Qingniao, Jiang Ni, you will be my concubines from now on, don’t object, your objections will be 
ineffective."

Jiang Shaan glared at Xiao Yu and yelled,"Shameless pervert!"

"I will be your concubine."

Qingniao nodded in agreement expressionlessly.

She wanted to take revenge.

She wanted to kill Chen Zhibao and Xu Xiao, but she could not take revenge alone.

Su Chen had 200,000 in his hands. The elite black-armored army, Blue Bird committed to Su Chen 
and could use Su Chen's power to take revenge.

"Bluebird, you....."

"Ginger paste, needless to say, I have my choice"

"I see."

Jiang Ni nodded with a complex expression.

She understood that Qingniao had to rely on Su Chen to take revenge.



What about her?

She would probably be killed if she left Su Chen's mansion.

Xu Xiao, the king of Northern Liang, would not let her live anymore, and Xu Fengnian might also 
do it for her. His father killed him,

Jiang Ni held hands tightly and begged for flowers0 []

Blue Bird can sacrifice his innocence for revenge, why can't she?

In the entire Liyang Kingdom, only Su Chen's Jiangnan Black Armor Army could defeat the 
Beiliang Army. Jiang Ni decided to commit herself to this bastard with Qingniao.

In order to get revenge, she could treat it as a dog bite.

Su Chen walked to Xu Zhihu and said,"Madam, let's go to your room to talk."

"Can!"

Xu Zhihu rolled his eyes at Su Chen and left the hall with his maid Er Qiao.

She understood that Su Chen wanted to give her an explanation.

Xu Zhihu saw that Su Chen had a purpose in leaving Jiang Ni.

As for Qingniao, she guessed that Su Chen wanted to Qingniao was kept as a supplement, and

Yu Youwei was not even considered as a supplement.

Xu Zhihu wanted to know why Su Chen kept Jiang Ni, and she also wanted to hear the explanation 
Su Chen gave her.



"You can take care of yourself in the mansion. If you need anything, you can tell the maid."

Su Chen said to Ran Bing and Jiang Ni, and he quickly followed Xu Zhihu out of the hall.

At this time,

Xu Fengnian had been in a daze since he came out of Jiangnan Palace.

Ten thousand black-armored troops came out of Jiangnan Palace. After Yangcheng, they saw 
another hundred thousand black-armored cavalry.

Wei Shuyang said with lingering fear,"Master, it was too dangerous just now. If we attack King 
Jiangnan in the Jiangnan Palace, King Jiangnan's army alone will be able to swarm us to death.""

Ning Emei looked at the black armored cavalry and said seriously,

"Yes, the Black Armored Army is very elite, and our Beiliang Cavalry is no match for the Black 
Armored Army."

Li Chungang was very lucky in his heart.

There were too many black-armored cavalry.

Even if he returned to the fairy land on land, he could not be an opponent of a hundred thousand 
black-armored troops.

As a noble who is greedy for life and afraid of death,

Li Chungang did not expect that Su Chen would arrange more than ten cavalry. Thousands of black 
armored troops,

"Let's go to Longhu Mountain."



Xu Fengnian was very uneasy.

Su Chen had already prepared an army.

If Xu Fengnian attacked Su Chen in the palace,

Sheng Cai'er would lead Su Chen to escape from the palace, and they would also be surrounded and 
killed by more than 100,000 black-armored troops.

Chapter 1 The next morning, bang!

A noise came from Xu Zhihu’s room.

"Su Chen, are you done yet? It's already dawn, if you dare to touch and torment me again, I'll....I'll 
bite you to death"

Chapter 3069

In the room,

Xu Zhihu hugged the quilt and stared angrily at Su Chen under the bed.

One night, she was harmed by Su Chen several times.

It was already dawn, and

Su Chen was still touching her to harm her. She was so shameless. Do you want to torture her to 
death?

Su Chen shook his head while wearing clothes and said,"Madam, you kicked me off the bed. Is 
there any woman who treats her husband like you?"

Xu Zhihu said with a blush,



"Inglorious bastard, you asked for it. Leave the room. I need to take a rest."

"Okay, you take a rest for a while, and I'll come over at noon to ask you to eat."

Su Chen hugged Xu Zhihu, kissed him and left the room. He was worried that he would turn into a 
wolf again if he didn't leave.

Xu Zhihu's half-naked fair body, his looming body was very attractive, especially Xu Zhihu's 
charming appearance. Zhihu is as alluring as he wants at this moment

"What a bastard."

Xu Zhihu lay down again with a shy expression.

Yesterday night,

Su Chen was nostalgic for her 12-year-old body,

Su Chen was obsessed with her body, and

Su Chen kept tossing her.

If Xu Zhihu hadn't eaten the spirit of heaven and earth, If her body recovered, she might have been 
tortured to death by Su Chen yesterday evening.

"Bad fate?"

Xu Zhihu thought of what Su Chen said to her yesterday night, and she didn't want to ask anymore 
questions.

Xu Zhihu is now Su Chen's wife and the princess of Jiangnan. Her disease was cured by Su Chen's 
Heaven and Earth Spirit Fruit.



Xu Zhihu Reborn, she has paid enough for

Beiliang and Xu Fengnian. Xu Zhihu will live for herself, Su Chen, and her and Su Chen’s children 
in the future. Ten days later, Su Chen He lived a very comfortable life in the mansion, and the 
plump and attractive Xu Zhihu made him linger. Xu Zhihu became more and more sexy and 
charming after being moisturized, and his plump figure became more and more mature and 
attractive. In the garden, Su Chen was lying down Basking in the sun on the rocking chair, Ran 
Bing pulled Sheng Caier over and shouted,

"Su Chen, it has been ten days. You have been basking in the sun in the mansion every day. Have 
you forgotten what you promised us?"

Su Chen opened his eyes and said,"Little white girl, I haven't forgotten that in a few days, we will 
go to Longhu Mountain.

Ran Bing asked Su Chen doubtfully,"Longhu Mountain?" Why do we go to Longhu Mountain?"

"Don’t ask too many questions, you will understand when the time comes."Su Chen shook his head 
at Ran Bing and said to Sheng Cai'er,

"Little beauty, we will encounter an enemy when we go to Longhu Mountain. He is not as strong as 
you. You are responsible for killing him.

Sheng Cai'er nodded to Su Chen and said,"Okay, you will give me three more Heaven and Earth 
Spirit Fruits." Ran

Bing hurriedly grabbed Su Chen's clothes and said,

"Su Chen, and me"

"Give me another one of your red fruits

"I am now in the Vajra realm of this world, and I have mastered the martial arts secrets you gave me 
to the beginning. If I eat another red fruit, I will become a strong person in the Celestial Realm."



Su Chen curled his lips and said,

"Ran Bing, don't dream. Eating one Zhu Guo can improve your cultivation level. Eating more can 
only heal your injuries and restore your true energy and spiritual power, but will not improve your 
cultivation level."

Su Chen was also speechless.

For ten days,

Sheng Cai'er asked him for the Heaven and Earth Spirit Fruit almost every day.

Su Chen asked Sheng Cai'er to give him a massage.

Sheng Cai'er didn't refuse to massage him directly, but after the massage, she reached out and asked 
for one. A heaven and earth spiritual fruit.

There was also Ran Bing.

Su Chen disliked Ran Bing's low strength, so he gave Ran Bing a low-level red fruit to improve his 
cultivation.

After Ran Bing became a warrior, he also asked for martial arts secrets.

Su Chen picked him up and kissed her. Ran Bing had given him several top martial arts secret 
books several times.

Hearing Su Chen's words, Ran Bing said helplessly,"Eating one Zhu Guo will have the effect. I also 
want to eat Zhu Guo and be promoted to the Celestial Realm. It seems that I You can't reach the sky 
in one step."

Su Chen hugged Ran Bing's small waist and said,"Little white girl, do you still want to reach the 
sky in one step? Why don't you just go to heaven?"



Ran Bing leaned into Su Chen's arms and asked,"I really want to go to heaven, Su Chen, will we 
meet again in the future?"

Sheng Cai'er also looked at Su Chen hurriedly.

She wanted to know if she would see Su Chen again.

After ten days of getting along,

Sheng Cai'er's cold heart began to melt,

Ran Bing's cute nonsense,

Su Chen's help and occupation of her. She is cheap.

Sheng Cai'er doesn't want to not see Su Chen in the future. After all, she only has two friends, Ran 
Bing and Su Chen.

Su Chen stroked Ran Bing's small waist and said,

"it should be OK. Ran

Bing grabbed Su Chen's erratic hand and asked,

"What should be OK?"

"We will meet, your world I want to find can be found, and I can also go to your world.

Ran Bing opened his eyes wide and asked,"Really?""

Su Chen kissed Ran Bing and said,[]



"Really, let’s talk about this later, I will find your respective worlds"

"By the way, why aren't your teammates here yet? If he doesn't come in the next few days, we will 
go to Longhu Mountain. Ran

Bing blushed and replied shyly,"We don't know either. Your men said that Uncle Jiu drugged Xu 
Weixiong and knocked him out. Six days have passed. It stands to reason that Uncle Jiu will 
arrive.""

"Forget it, I'll send someone to look for Uncle Jiu later."

"Haha, thank you, Su Chen, 583 Cai'er and I are going to practice the Divine Sword Controlling 
Thunder Sword Art. You can continue to bask in the sun in the garden."

Ran Bing got up from Su Chen's arms.

She pulled Sheng Cai'er and left quickly.

Ran Bing was worried that if she continued to stay in Su Chen's arms, Su Chen would take off her 
clothes and eat her.

Su Chen lay down again and muttered to himself,

"Keep going. In a few days, Xu Fengnian and the others should arrive at Longhu Mountain. Cao 
Changqing should appear at Longhu Mountain. For Jiang Ni, Sheng Caier will assassinate Cao 
Changqing. Cao Changqing cannot avoid the assassin Sheng Caier. assassination."

In the study room of the palace,

Xu Zhihu was speechless looking at the documents sent from various counties.

She had been dealing with affairs of various counties every day for ten days. Su Chen had either 
tormented her or teased Jiang Ni and the girls all day long.



Xu Zhihu said She tried several times to no avail, and she was too lazy to care about that bastard 
anymore.

Er Qiao came over with tea and said,"Madam, you should rest for a while.

Xu Zhihu stretched his plump body and asked,"Er Qiao, what is my husband doing?""

"Madam, the young master is sunbathing in the garden"

"Are Jiang Ni and Qingniao serving Su Chen?"

"No, Jiang Ni, Qingniao, and Yu Youwei are all practicing. They have reached an agreement with 
the young master. If they practice to the celestial realm within three months, the young master said 
they can let them go."

Chapter 3070

A smile appeared on Xu Zhihu's lips.

She had already guessed that

Su Chen had no idea about Jiang Ni and Qingniao.

For ten days,

Su Chen went to her room every night to harm her. She knew that Su Chen was obsessed with her 
body.

Three months?

Cultivation to the celestial realm?

Xu Zhihu, Jiang Ni, and Yu Youwei all ate the red fruit. They were considered empty shells of the 
Vajra Realm.



Blue Bird ate the red fruit and advanced to the celestial realm.

Su Chen also took out several top martial arts secret books for them to practice.

Xu Zhihu was not interested in practicing. Besides, she was too busy managing the counties in 
Jiangnan and had no time to practice.

Xu Zhihu guessed that Su Chen would let Jiang Ni, Blue Bird, and Fish Young Wei leave after Jiang 
Ni had reached the Celestial Realm, or three months later.

Er Qiao thought for a while and said to Xu Zhihu,"Madam, I heard earlier that the young master 
seemed to be going to Longhu Mountain."

"Longhu Mountain?"

Xu Zhihu touched his fair chin and thought, what is Su Chen going to Longhu Mountain for?

Xu Fengnian should have gone to Longhu Mountain. Could it be that Su Chen is going to Longhu 
Mountain to trouble Xu Fengnian?

Is it possible?

If Su Chen doesn't let go After Xu Fengnian passed, how could he let Xu Fengnian leave Jiangnan?

"Er Qiao, come with me to the garden"

"Yes, ma'am."

Not far outside Yangcheng in the south of the Yangtze River, a carriage came towards Yangcheng. 
The old Taoist priest driving the carriage had a constipated and sad face.

The old Taoist priest was Uncle Jiu.



He was also a teammate of Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er.

Ran Bing and the others were going The Prince of Jiangnan arrested Xu Zhihu, and he volunteered 
to go to the academy to catch Xu Weixiong.

Uncle Jiu thought it would be an easy arrest, but he did not expect that Xu Weixiong was a master 
of martial arts. Uncle Nine was beaten several times by Xu Weixiong, and he used the magic 
weapon to arrest him. The magic talisman stunned Xu Weixiong.

However, for a few days,

Xu Weixiong treated him as a servant and kept asking him to do this and that every day.

Uncle Jiu knew that he was wrong and followed Xu Weixiong. Xu Weixiong is driving me crazy 
these days. A cold female voice came from the carriage,"Old Taoist priest, I'm thirsty. I'm looking 
for a tea shop. Uncle Jiu said with a helpless expression,"Miss Xu, we will arrive in Yangcheng in a 
quarter of an hour. I beg you not to torment me anymore.""

"Old Taoist priest, we will arrive in Yangcheng soon. Why don't you tell me the purpose of arresting 
me?"

"Miss Xu, don’t worry, Lao Tao has no intention of harming you. As long as you stay with me and a 
few friends for a month, Lao Tao will let you go safely."

"A month? Why?"

In the carriage,

Xu Weixiong leaned on the soft couch and was very confused.

Ever since she was stunned and taken away by Uncle Jiu, Xu Weixiong tested Uncle Jiu many times 
along the way. She saw that Uncle Jiu was not a bad person, but that Uncle Jiu was not a bad 
person. Why did he arrest her for a month? What is his purpose in doing this? Yangcheng? Xu 
Weixiong's eldest sister is in Yangcheng. Will the friend that Uncle Jiu mentioned also arrested her 



eldest sister Xu Zhihu? Uncle Jiu is driving the carriage Shaking his head, he replied,"Ms. Xu, I 
can't say that you will leave safely in a month."

"

"Okay, I won't ask anymore."

A quarter of an hour later, when the carriage arrived at the gate of Yangcheng City, a group of 
thousands of black-armored cavalry surrounded the carriage.

Uncle Jiu was very nervous when he saw the army surrounding the carriage.

He was just a scumbag.

If the black-armored cavalry attacked him, Uncle Jiu would be shot dead by the black-armored 
cavalry in an instant.

Uncle Jiu saluted a general and asked,"General, I am just a civilian. What will the general do if he 
stops me?""

The captain in black armor shouted coldly,"Don't ask questions that shouldn't be asked. The people 
in the carriage come down."

"Okay, okay, I'll ask the people in the carriage to get down."

Uncle Jiu secretly healed Xu Weixiong's weak Taoist skills.

The black-armored cavalry came with bad intentions. 

He didn't want Xu Weixiong to be caught by the black-armored cavalry.

After all, Xu Weixiong is a beautiful beauty. Uncle Jiu is worried that the black armored cavalry 
will be interested in Xu Weixiong.



"Miss Xu, I will remove the Taoist talismans that are all over your body. You can run away as soon 
as you realize something is wrong."

Xu Weixiong got off the carriage and looked at the black armored cavalry around him.

The Jiangnan Black Armored Army?

Legend has it that it is even more powerful than the Beiliang Cavalry.

Xu Weixiong felt that the legend was true.

The black armored cavalry were very tough and elite. They were in the celestial realm. I'm afraid 
they are no match for a thousand black-armored cavalry.

Xu Weixiong is only in the Vajra realm, and there is no possibility for her to escape from the black-
armored cavalry.

Half an hour later, the black-armored cavalry surrounded Xu Weixiong and Jiu Shu. The cavalry did 
not question them or kill them. Xu Weixiong and Uncle Jiu were very confused.

Xu Weixiong frowned and said,"Uncle Jiu, what's going on? Why are the black armored cavalry 
ignoring us? Didn't they arrest us?"

Uncle Jiu stroked his beard and shook his head and replied,

"I don’t know. It’s the first time you and I have come to Yangcheng. It’s impossible for us to offend 
the Jiangnan government, and I can’t figure out what the black armored cavalry is going to do to 
us."

Da da da......

Suddenly, there was a sound of horse hooves, and dozens of horses came galloping towards 
Yangcheng City, led by two beautiful beauties.



The commander hurriedly dismounted and saluted,"The ninth legion of black armored cavalry, 
commander Su Yi, see Madam Ran, see Madam Saint."

"See Madame Ran, see Madame Saint."

The black-armored cavalry dismounted and saluted the two women who arrived.

Uncle Jiu was very confused when he saw the two women.

Ran Bing and Sheng Caier?

Why did the black-armored cavalry salute them?

What kind of ladies are they?

Xu Weixiong looked at them doubtfully. Looking at Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er, [] two beautiful 
little beauties, they are both perfect virgins, how can the black armored cavalry call them madam?

Ran Bing blushed and waved her hand and ordered,"Su Yi, take your The army leaves, you are not 
needed here"

"Yes, ma'am!"

After Su Yi saluted Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er, he quickly left the city gate with the black armored 
cavalry.

Ran Bing clenched his fist and said to Sheng Cai'er,

"Cai'er, the black-armored army calls us madam. The secret guards and maids in the mansion also 
call us madam. I guess Su Chen deliberately let the army call us this."

"good."



Sheng Cai'er's face turned red under the veil.

For ten days, the maids and secret guards in the mansion, as well as the black-armored troops, all 
called her madam.

Sheng Cai'er understood that it was Su Chen who was responsible.

She was still in the mansion. She didn't feel anything, but there were many people around the city 
gate. Sheng Cai'er was blushing and her heart was beating very fast.

Ran Bing waved to Uncle Jiu and called,"Old Taoist priest, don't be confused. Take Xu Weixiong 
and us in quickly." Jono"
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