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Chapter 3071

Ran Bing was a little amused when she saw the confused Uncle Jiu.

After a while, she and Sheng Cai'er took Uncle Jiu to Jiangnan Palace. Uncle Jiu might be even 
more confused.

Ran Bing waved to the secret guard next to him and ordered,"An Shiba, escort the carriage back to 
the palace."

"Yes, ma'am."

Dozens of secret guards quickly protected the carriage in the middle.

After Uncle Jiu asked Xu Weixiong to get on the carriage again, he drove the carriage into the city 
under the protection of the secret guards.

Xu Weixiong asked in the carriage,"Uncle Jiu, do you know him? The two women in front?"

Uncle Jiu patted his confused head and said,"We know them, they are my friends."

"friend? Uncle Jiu, the status of these two women is very noble. The Jiangnan Black Armor Army 
and the guards of the Jiangnan Prince's Palace all obey the orders of the two women. They are also 
called madam. The two women are probably the women of the Prince of Jiangnan."

Xu Weixiong felt something was very wrong.

Are the two girls friends of Uncle Jiu?

Uncle Jiu also captured her and brought her to Jiangnan Yangcheng?



Xu Weixiong guessed that the person who wanted to arrest her should be the King of Jiangnan.

However,

Beiliang and Jiangnan are not in conflict with each other. , Beiliang did not offend Jiang 15 Nan, 
why did King Jiangnan arrest her?

"The woman of King Jiangnan?"

Uncle Jiu frowned and couldn't understand.

He and Ran Bing had been separated for less than half a month. How could Ran Bing and Sheng 
Cai'er become the women of the King of Jiangnan?

Were they arrested and threatened?

Uncle Jiu didn't look like it,

Ran Bing Are Bing and Sheng Cai'er taking advantage of King Jiangnan? Are they pretending to be 
King Jiangnan's woman to capture Xu Zhihu? In

Jiangnan Palace,

Su Chen and Xu Zhihu were sitting together drinking tea.

Xu Zhihu asked Su Chen to go to Longhu Mountain When asked, Su Chen didn't know how to 
explain it to Xu Zhihu.

Xu Zhihu drank tea and asked with a smile,"What? Are you thinking how to fool me?"

Su Chen leaned on the chair and shook his head and said,



"No, madam, I have no intention of taking action against Xu Fengnian. You should understand that 
if I want to kill Xu Fengnian, he will not be able to leave Jiangnan even if he is protected by Li 
Chungang. Xu

Zhihu rolled his eyes at Su Chen and asked,"I understand. I just want to know what you are doing in 
Longhu Mountain. Don't tell me what scenery you want to see in Longhu Mountain?""

"There are some things to do. Let Sheng Caier kill someone by the way."

"Who to kill?"

"Cao Changqing.

Xu Zhihu said in surprise,"Cao Changqing?" Could it be that he was an old minister of Western 
Chu, also known as the invincible Cao Changqing?"

Su Chen held Xu Zhihu in his arms and nodded,

"good.

Xu Zhihu looked at the maid next to him and asked,"Husband, why did you want to kill Cao 
Changqing?""

"Madam, I don’t want to kill Cao Changqing, but Cao Changqing will kill me."

"Cao Changqing kills you? Have you offended Cao Changqing?"

Su Chen hugged Xu Zhihu and kissed him and said,

"No, madam, this is a game, and Jiang Ni is a part of it. Your father started the game more than ten 
years ago, and the Lu family is just a part of it. I will talk to you about this later."



"As for why Cao Changqing wanted to kill me, your brother Xu Fengnian would tell Cao 
Changqing that I had kidnapped Jiang Ni, and that I would humiliate Jiang Ni in my imprisonment. 
Do you think Cao Changqing would not kill me?"

Su Chen thought of the plot.

After Jiang Ni's identity was discovered by the Lu family,

Li Chungang and Cao Changqing pretended to have a fight and took Jiang Ni away.

Su Chen admired Xu Xiao very much.

The old yin forced Xu Xiao to use Jiang Ni for more than ten years. Jiang Ni's exposure in Jiangnan 
killed three birds with one stone.

First, although Jiang Ni's identity was exposed, Jiang Ni kept assassinating Xu Fengnian. Li 
Chungang and Cao Changqing had another fight. Those who suspected Xu Xiao had other agendas 
had nothing to say. It can be said.

Second, because of the appearance of Princess Xichu, Jiang Ni was taken to Xishu by Cao 
Changqing. In order for Liyang Kingdom to let Northern Liang deal with Western Chu, Xu Xiao 
successfully allowed Xu Fengnian to inherit the hereditary king of Northern Liang.

Third, Jiang Ni versus Xu Fengnian If Jiang Ni marries Xu Fengnian, the old ministers and troops 
of Western Chu will also become Xu Fengnian's subordinates. The old yin should have settled this 
long ago.

However, the appearance of Su Chen broke Xu Xiao's plan, and

Jiang Ni's identity was not revealed

Even if Jiang Ni's identity is revealed by Xu Fengnian, Emperor Liyang will be more assured that 
the Princess of Western Chu is in Su Chen's hands. After all , with the Jiangnan Black Armor Army 
facing the remnants of Western Chu, Emperor Liyang doesn't need Beiliang to deal with it. The 
remnants of Western Chu, Xu Xiao’s wishful thinking is that he wants Xu Fengnian to be hereditary 
King of Northern Liang



"Xu Fengnian?"

Xu Zhihu understood.

She understood why Su Chen wanted to kill Cao Changqing and

Xu Fengnian?

If Xu Fengnian knew Jiang Ni's identity as Cao Changqing, Cao Changqing would indeed come to 
kill Su Chen.

After all, it was because of Xu Fengnian, no, 

It may be her father's early calculations.

Jiang Ni is very pitiful, her country was destroyed, her parents were killed, she was also constantly 
used by Xu Xiao, and she also fell in love with the enemy's son, Jiang Ni must be in great pain.

Xu Zhihu leaned into Su Chen's arms and whispered,

"Husband, I don’t care about other things, and I don’t care how you deal with Xu Fengnian and my 
father in the future."

"From now on, I will be part of the Su family and your wife."

"I have only one request, my brother Xu Longxiang, he is mentally retarded, just like a child. If a 
war breaks out between you and the Xu family one day, I hope you will not hurt Xu Longxiang."

Su Chen hugged Xu Zhihu and smiled,"Don't worry, I won't take action against Xu Longxiang, I 
can swear"

"I trust you."



Er Qiao quickly ran over and saluted,"Madam, Second Miss Xu Weixiong appeared in the mansion. 
She seems to have been captured by Miss Ran Bing's 213 friends."

Xu Zhihu waved his hand and said,"I understand, don't panic."

"Yes, ma'am."

Xu Zhihu stood up from Su Chen's arms and said,"Husband, I'm going to see my sister."

Su Chen touched Xu Zhihu's face and said,

"Well, madam, you should also tell her Xu Weixiong’s identity."

"Paper cannot contain the fire. Xu Weixiong will find out sooner or later. If you tell her now, Xu 
Weixiong can still treat you as a sister. If Xu Weixiong finds out about this, she may hate you.

Xu Zhihu said with a troubled expression,"Husband, I will think about it again.""

"All right."

At this time, in the hall of the palace,

Ran Bing told Uncle Jiu about Su Chen.

Uncle Jiu was confused and worried when listening to Ran Bing's story.

Su Chen turned out to be the previous lucky one?

Su Chen also killed Yan Dan and Linghu Chong?

Originally, when Uncle Jiu heard that Su Chen would help them complete their mission, he showed 
a happy expression.



However,

Su Chen killed two men in the team. Uncle Jiu was also a man. Will Su Chen Kill him too?

Uncle Jiu asked Ran Bing anxiously,"Little girl, Su Chen killed Yan Dan and Linghu Chong, do you 
think Su Chen will kill me too?".

Chapter 3072

When Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er heard Uncle Jiu's words, they had strange expressions on their 
faces.

Why did Su Chen kill Yan Dan and Linghu Chong?

They also asked Su Chen. Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er didn't believe

Su Chen's explanation at all. Especially in the past few days, the shameless pervert had hugged and 
teased them. Su Chen probably couldn't bear to see other men around them. As for Uncle Jiu, an old 
Taoist priest, it is impossible for Uncle Jiu to have any thoughts about them. How could Su Chen 
kill Uncle Jiu, an old Taoist priest? Ran Bing smiled and said,"Uncle Jiu, Yan Dan and Linghu 
Chong are worthy of death. Su Chen will not kill you, you can rest assured."

"

"real?"

"Really, how could I deceive you? You have also met Yan Dan and Linghu Chong. You should be 
able to tell who they are."

"Too."

Uncle Jiu stroked his beard and nodded.

Regarding Yan Dan and Linghu Chong,



Uncle Jiu felt that Yan Dan had impure thoughts.

Yan Dan looked like a gentleman on the surface.

The five of them wanted to be the leader as soon as they introduced Yan Dan. Dan also had evil 
thoughts about Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er.

What about Linghu Chong?

He was a libertine, or a heartless libertine.

From Linghu Chong's tone of voice, Uncle Jiu could tell that Linghu Chong was a good person, but 
he was also not good at it. Be human.

Uncle Jiu thought and shook his head.

He didn't care too much about the deaths of Yan Dan and Linghu Chong 807. After all, they had 
only known each other for less than an hour.

Xu Weixiong was beside him in a daze all the time.

Uncle Jiu and Ran Bing, She didn't understand a word of the conversation between Sheng Cai'er 
and the three of them.

What was the Luck Master?

What was the previous Luck Master?

What about killing teammates?

Xu Weixiong felt like he was listening to a book from heaven.



Ran Bing walked to Xu Weixiong and said,"Xu Weixiong, you will stay with us for the next month, 
and after one month, we will let you go. Xu

Weixiong asked coldly,"My eldest sister Xu Zhihu, was she also captured by you?""

"You mean Xu Zhihu?"

"good!"

"Xu Weixiong, you will understand in a moment."

Ran Bing shook his head at Xu Zhihu and sat aside, arresting Xu Zhihu?

Do they need to arrest him?

Xu Zhihu is Su Chen's bastard wife, or the mistress of the Jiangnan Palace.

Xu Weixiong wants to know later,

Ran Bing guessed Xu Weixiong would continue to be confused.

Uncle Jiu asked Ran Bing doubtfully,"Ran Bing, you didn't arrest Xu Zhihu? Ran

Bing replied while drinking tea,

"Uncle Jiu, we have finally captured Zhihu, and our first two tasks will be completed."

"Stomach bear!"

Xu Zhihu then walked into the hall with his maid.



Xu Weixiong hurriedly walked towards Xu Zhihu and asked,"Sister, were you captured by King 
Jiangnan and brought to the palace?"

"No, I will make it clear to you in a moment."

Xu Zhihu smiled at Xu Weixiong and shook her head.

She said to Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er,"Ran Bing, Cai'er, I'll take my sister away first. I'll arrange 
for the maid to prepare a banquet later to help your friends..

Ran Bing hurriedly thanked Xu Zhihu,"Sister Xu, thank you very much.""

"You're welcome, they are all sisters."

Xu Zhihu waved his hand and led Xu Weixiong out of the hall. Regarding Ran Bing and Sheng 
Cai'er, Xu Zhihu learned a little about Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er from Su Chen.

Although Su Chen didn't explain it clearly to her, Xu Zhihu guessed The origins of Ran Bing and 
Sheng Cai'er were unusual. They were here to capture her and Xu Weixiong. As long as the sisters 
stayed with Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er for a month , Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er would leave. 
However,  Xu Zhihu guessed that Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er would not leave. Su Chen had been 
teasing the two girls for several days, and both Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er were hugged by Su 
Chen. However, Ran Bing was kissed many times by Su Chen. Su Chen's body was too strong, and 
Xu Zhihu also hoped that Suchena would marry Ran Bing and Sheng Caier, so that she would not 
have to be tortured to death by Su Chen every day. The two After the Queen of Heaven, ten 
thousand black-armored cavalry gathered outside the palace, and hundreds of secret guards guarded 
two luxurious carriages. Outside the palace, (bfdi) Ran Bing, Sheng Cai'er, Uncle Jiu, Jiang Ni, 
Qingniao, Yu Youwei and others The women stood outside the palace. Xu Weixiong stood aside 
with a cold face. In the past two days, Xu Weixiong understood everything. Xu Zhihu also told her 
about the enemy whose parents were killed. Xu Weixiong felt that she was in harmony with Jiang 
Ni. The two girls in Qingniao are equally stupid. Their family members were killed by Xu Xiao. Xu 
Weixiong is still stupid enough to be Xu Fengnian's death soldier. She is a stupid idiot.

Blue Bird:"Jiang Ni, how long will it take for you to advance to the Celestial Realm?"

Jiang Ni:"I don't know, I guess it may take about half a year, but I have mastered the Divine Sword 
Controlling Thunder Sword Technique to the beginning."



Yu Youwei:"I'm still far behind. My skills and martial arts have not reached the basic level. I am 
just an empty shell in the Vajra realm."

Qingniao:"Su Chen said he would let us leave in three months. Do you want to leave?"

Jiang Ni:"If I don't leave, I have nowhere to go."

Yu Youwei:"I will follow the princess. If the princess doesn't leave, I won't leave either."

Qingniao, Jiang Ni, and Yu Youwei talked in a low voice. They all thought about it individually.

For more than ten days,

Su Chen did not insult them or make them concubines.

Su Chen not only allowed them to take Zhu Guo to improve their strength, but also taught them top-
notch martial arts. Jade Bird and Jiang Ni and the three girls couldn't understand Su Chen's purpose 
of doing this.

Let them leave after three months?

Where do they leave in three months?

Jiang Ni stroked her hair and said,

"Bluebird, why do I feel that after Su Chen helped us become stronger, Su Chen had no intention of 
keeping us."

Qingniao nodded coldly and replied,"Well, Zhu Guo, a top martial artist, Su Chen has been helping 
us after three months. He probably wants us to leave after we have the ability to protect ourselves."

"Forget it, I'm living a good life in Su Chen's mansion, I won't leave"



"I won't leave either."

Xu Weixiong heard the conversation between Jiang Ni and the three girls and shook his head.

If she hadn't been related to Xu Zhihu,

Su Chen would have let her leave in a month.

Xu Weixiong thought that Xu Zhihu's body had not only recovered. , there were more happy smiles,

Princess of Jiangnan?

Xu Zhihu is the real Princess of Jiangnan.

At this time,

Su Chen pulled Xu Zhihu over and said,

"Everyone, are you ready? Let's go to Longhu Mountain now."

"Jiang Ni, Qingniao, Yu Youwei, Xu Weixiong, you four ladies will ride in the carriage at the back. 
Ran Bing, Sheng Caier, you will sit in the carriage in front with us."

"By the way, Uncle Jiu, you and the secret guards are following the carriage on horseback."
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Jiang Ni and Ran Bing got on the carriage one after another.

Uncle Jiu took the horse rope from the secret guard with a confused look on his face.

Was he disliked?



Su Chen asked all the women to enter the carriage, but he was the only man left.

Uncle Jiu reacted and shook his head.

The carriage was full of women. If Su Chen let him enter the carriage, Uncle Jiu would not sit in the 
carriage with women..

After the black-armored cavalry and secret guards escorted the carriage away, in the carriage 
behind,

Jiang Ni waved his little fist and said,

"Su Chen is so hateful"

"Although our carriage was also very luxurious, it was incomparable with the carriage in front of 
us. The carriage in front of us was very wide, and that bastard didn't even let us sit in the carriage in 
front of us."

Yu Youwei pulled Jiang Ni and said,

"Princess, don't be angry"

"The woman in the carriage in front is related to Su Chen in the"550" relationship. Xu Zhihu is Su 
Chen's wife, Ran Bing and Sheng Caier are Su Chen's confidante, and we are just insignificant 
women. Jiang

Ni rolled her eyes at Yu Youwei and said,"I know, I'm just angry.""

Qingniao and Xu Weixiong were speechless.

Qingniao could sit in any carriage. She just felt a little regretful that she did not protect Su Chen 
personally.



Xu Weixiong held hands tightly and was very angry.

She is Xu Zhihu's sister, although she is not a close relative. Sister, but Xu Zhihu regarded him as 
his biological sister, and she also regarded Xu Zhihu as her biological sister.

That bastard Su Chen actually let her sit in the carriage at the back and prevented her sister Xu 
Zhihu from inviting her. Xu Weixiong had previously I almost couldn't help but take action against 
Su Chen.

At this time, in the carriage in front,

Su Chen was lying on Xu Zhihu's lap with his eyes closed.

It would take six or seven days at the fastest from Jiangnan to Longhu Mountain.

Xu Fengnian met Cao Changqing on the road. , met Xuanyuan Qing again, Xu Fengnian should 
have gone to Longhu Mountain the day after tomorrow, and

Su Chen would be about three days later than Xu Fengnian.

Three days?

Xu Fengnian should have been to the Xuanyuan family, and Li Chungang returned to the land of 
God before leaving Longhu Mountain. Wonderland.

Bang bang!

Ran Bing slapped Su Chen's legs and shouted,"Su Chen, put your stinky feet aside. The soft couch 
in the carriage is so big, why do you put your feet on me.""

Su Chen opened his eyes and smiled,"Ran Bing, your body is very soft. I just want my feet to be 
more comfortable."

"Shameless!"



Ran Bing was speechless at Su Chen's shamelessness.

Although she could beat Su Chen or push Su Chen's stinky feet away,

Ran

Bing thought of what Su Chen had done for her and Sheng Cai'er. She was also affected by the 
shameless Su Chen's misbehavior.

Xu Zhihu massaged Su Chen's head and said,

"Husband, please calm down, we haven’t even left Yangzhou yet, and you’ve already started to be 
dishonest."

"Madam, it's okay, I was just joking with Ran Bing"

"I am too lazy to pay attention to you, husband. Let me remind you that Ran Bing is a master of 
martial arts and you are just a scumbag ordinary person. If you anger Ran Bing, Ran Bing will beat 
you up."

"Cut, scumbag? If Ran Bing dares to teach me a lesson, I will take off her clothes and spank her.

Xu Zhihu:"Shameless!" Ran Bing:"

Shameless.""

Sheng Cai'er rolled her eyes at Su Chen speechlessly.

She had nothing to say about Su Chen's shamelessness, and she was too lazy to talk to the 
shameless bastard.

Su Chen stretched her feet on Sheng Cai'er's legs and said,



"Cai'er, the hidden weapon I gave you can be used three times. If you are in danger, you can use the 
hidden weapon. It can kill you instantly in the celestial realm, and it can also seriously injure you in 
the terrestrial fairyland."

"I see."

Sheng Cai'er picked off Su Chen's feet with a green bamboo stick.

She didn't expect that Su Chen would start teasing her again.

Yesterday night,

Su Chen not only took off her veil, but also kissed her.

The blood marks on Su Chen's neck were She left the dagger behind.

Sheng Cai'er didn't cut Su Chen's throat last night, so she was showing mercy to Su Chen.

Ran Bing hurriedly shouted to Su Chen,"Su Chen, when will you give me the hidden weapon of 
Seven-Star Begonia?""

"Little white girl, I told you, as long as you serve me for three days, I will give you the Seven-Star 
Begonia Hidden Weapon." 

"you are so shameless"

"Haha~"

Four days later,

Su Chen and the girls were less than twenty miles away from Longhu Mountain. They could arrive 
at the foot of Longhu Mountain before noon.



By the Guandao Lake, an old man wearing a bamboo hat was fishing by the lake.

His eyes His eyes were bright and full of murderous intent, and he kept looking at the official way 
to Longhu Mountain.

The old man in the bamboo hat murmured to himself,

"Ten thousand black armored cavalry? Five hundred secret guards? There is another strong person 
in the Celestial Realm? King Jiangnan, you protected me very well during your outing, but for the 
sake of Xi Chu and to save Her Royal Highness, you must die........"

Whoosh!

"who?"

Suddenly, a dagger almost cut off the head of the old man in Dou Li. The old man in Dou Li quickly 
turned back and struck a fatal blow.

Sheng Cai'er appeared at the edge of the small lake. She looked at the old man in Dou Li with a 
cold expression.

The old man in Dou Li shouted in surprise,"Celestial Realm, are you the daughter of the King of 
Jiangnan?"[]

Sheng Caier said coldly,

"Cao Changqing, I originally wanted to kill you with one blow, but I'm in a bad mood, so prepare to 
be tortured to death by me."

Sheng Cai'er felt very uneasy.

Just now, she was hugged and kissed by Su Chen.



That bastard Su Chen wanted to take off her dress.

Sheng Cai'er reacted and kicked Su Chen away, but her dress was still on She was half taken off, 
and her upper body was exposed to Su Chen.

Sheng Cai'er was very angry, but she couldn't hate Su Chen.

These days,

Su Chen had been harassing her and Ran Bing, especially in the carriage. One day,

Sheng Cai'er was also held by Su Chen to sleep, and that bastard's hand was still inserted into her 
skirt.

Sheng Cai'er wanted to kill someone, and she wanted to vent some of her inner anger.

Sheng Cai'er would not take action against Su Chen. , but she can kill Cao Changqing as Su Chen

"kill!"

Cao Changqing quickly attacked Sheng Cai'er with light kung fu, whoosh!

Sheng Cai'er instantly became invisible and disappeared in place.

She is an assassin.

Although more than half of her strength has been sealed, Sheng Cai'er can still easily assassinate a 
celestial phenomenon.

"Ah~"

Suddenly,



Cao Changqing shouted as one of his arms was cut off by Sheng Cai'er.

Not far away,

Su Chen and Ran Bing were watching the battle ahead under a big tree.

They saw Sheng Cai'er cutting off one of Cao Changqing's arms. Arm, Su Chen and Ran Bing 
looked at each other and were very surprised.

Su Chen hugged Ran Bing's small waist and shouted,"I'm going, Ran Bing, Cai'er can easily 
assassinate Cao Changqing, she actually cut off Cao Changqing's arm, what do you think?" Is Cai'er 
venting?"

"Humph, Cai'er must have thought that Cao Changqing was being tortured by you. You almost took 
off Cai Yi's dress earlier. It's your good luck that Cai'er didn't cut your neck."
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Ran Bing stared at Su Chen with an expression of shame and anger.

Su Chen was too shameless and shameless.

Previously, the three of them were hiding in the woods to check on Cao Changqing in the distance. 
Su Chen and Sheng Cai'er told some secrets while

Sheng Cai'er was stunned. While thinking about it,

Su Chen actually took the opportunity to strip off Sheng Cai'er's clothes.

If Sheng Cai'er hadn't reacted and kicked Su Chen away, Su Chen would have stripped off Sheng 
Cai'er's clothes.

Even so,



Sheng Cai'er's dress was still half stripped off, and her upper body was completely exposed by Su 
Chen. Sheng Cai'er was so angry that she didn't kill Su Chen on the spot. Su Chen should be very 
lucky.

Su Chen kissed Ran Bing and smiled,"Little white girl, are you envious of the close contact I had 
with Cai'er just now?"

Ran Bing wiped his mouth and threatened angrily,

"I'm so jealous, Su Chen, if you dare to kiss me again, I will kick you away."

"Yeah? I do not believe"

"Do not believe? Su Chen, you don’t have any strength now, I can knock you down with just one 
hand."

"You won't make a move on me, little white girl, you are getting more and more sexy and charming, 
why don't you just become my concubine. Ran

Bing leaned into Su Chen's arms and said shyly,"Su Chen, you are not only very shameless and 
lustful, but also very shameless.""

Concubine

, she is a shameless pervert, she is just a concubine.

Ran Bing did not expect that in just over ten days, she would develop feelings for Su Chen. Ran 
Bing felt like he was in a dream just thinking about it.

She liked Mark, and this paragraph Ran Bing also forgot all the time. Thinking about it,

Ran Bing felt that she didn't like Mark.



During several years of dangerous material collection missions, Ran Bing regarded Mark as 
someone to rely on.

She was attached to Mark during the battle, not because of liking, not because of love.

Mark should also care for her as his sister.

Su Chen looked towards the lake and shouted in surprise,"I'm going, Ran Bing, look, Cai'er is going 
to torture Cao Changqing to death. Do you think Cai'er will come back soon?" Will beat me 

again.？"

By the lake,

Cao Changqing's arms were cut off by Sheng Cai'er, and he was stabbed several times with Sheng 
Cai'er's dagger. Cao Changqing was covered in blood and miserable.

Ran Bing said to Su Chen funnyly,

"Are you scared now? Don't worry, Cai'er is venting her anger on Cao Changqing and won't attack 
you again."

"Ran Bing, you go notify Qingniao and order the troops to come over. I'll go take a look at the 
front."

"Su Chen, what are you going to do? There may be danger ahead, so don’t go there."

"Don't worry, there can't be any danger ahead"

"you...."

"Little white girl, go and inform Qingniao, we will see you soon."

Su Chen touched Ran Bing and ran down the hillside quickly.



Damn,

Ran Bing's figure is so plump and attractive. Su Chen couldn't help but want to eat Ran Bing.

"Damn pervert!"

Ran Bing rubbed her chest and wanted to strangle Su Chen.

What a bastard. Such a shameless bastard.

Ran Bing couldn't do anything to Su Chen.

It was useless for her to scold Su Chen. She couldn't bear to beat Su Chen. Beat up the shameless 
bastard.

Whoosh!

Ran Bing quickly went to inform Qingniao.

She was worried that Su Chen would be threatened when he went to the front. The black-armored 
troops and secret guards had to rush to the front to protect Su Chen.

"Cai'er."

Su Chen appeared not far away from Cao Changqing and shouted,

Whoosh!

Sheng Cai'er instantly appeared and said in a cold voice,"What are you doing here alone? Do you 
want to die?"

"Aren't you here?"



"Humph, did I say I would protect you?"

"Let me go, Cai'er, I have a close relationship. If you don't protect me, you will become a widow 
after I die." 

"Shameless!"

Sheng Cai'er's face turned red under her veil. She wanted to stop Su Chen's bad mouth.

Widow?

Is she Su Chen's woman?

Even if Su Chen died, would she become a widow?

Sheng Cai'er felt that she had changed She used to not care about anything and didn't like to talk, 
but since she met Su Chen and this shameless bastard, Sheng Cai'er talked more and more, and her 
cold heart was no longer cold and ruthless.

Sheng Cai'er sometimes He would smile, sometimes he would be very angry, sometimes he would 
feel sweet in his heart, sometimes he would be ashamed and angry and want to strangle Su Chen, 
and sometimes he would miss the shameless bastard at night. Su Chen hugged Sheng Cai'er's waist 
and shouted to Cao Changqing ,"Cao Changqing, you are very miserable at the moment."

"Who are you?"

Cao Changqing stood up with difficulty and looked at Su Chen.

His arms were cut off by Sheng Cai'er, and his body was pierced by daggers in many places. He was 
completely crippled by Sheng Cai'er.[]

Cao Changqing saw Su Chen holding Sheng Cai'er.



Sheng Cai'er had not resisted yet. Zha Zha, who did not know martial arts, was holding the celestial 
realm assassin. Cao Changqing probably guessed Su Chen's identity.

Su Chen walked forward with Sheng Cai'er in his arms and said,"Who am I? Aren't you trying to 
kill me here?"

Cao Changqing asked while vomiting blood.

"Jiangnan Wang Suchen? Su

Chen nodded and admitted,"Yes, Cao Changqing, do you regret coming to kill me?"

Cao Changqing glared at Su Chen and shouted,"Repent?" I don’t regret coming to kill you, I just 
regret not rescuing my princess, Da Chu. Even if I die, I will never die in peace."

Su Chen mocked disdainfully,

"Tsk, Cao Changqing"

"You and I have no grievances. Have you ever thought that if Jiang Ni marries me, my army will be 
Jiang Ni's army. With me here, do you think Emperor Liyang dares to touch Jiang Ni?"

Cao Changqing took a few steps forward and laughed,

"Haha~King Jiangnan"

"You think I don’t know your plan. You kidnapped Princess Jiang Ni and forcibly married her in 
order to get the remnants of Chu’s army and to get knowledgeable people who were loyal to Chu."

Su Chen shook his head speechlessly.

Cao Changqing was brainwashed by Xu Fengnian.



Well, everyone in the world knew that he was a playboy and an Adou who could not be supported.

Even Emperor Liyang was very relieved of him.

Cao Changqing is an idiot. Did he snatch Jiang Ni to get the remnants of the Chu State? Was he 
trying to get the knowledgeable people of the Chu State?

Sheng Cai'er grabbed Su Chen's hand and said,"Su Chen, kill him." Well, he is going to kill you"

"Cai'er, kill him, a stubborn old man, a stupid idiot who is used as cannon fodder, and send him to 
see the Queen of Chu. After all, Cao Changqing loves the Queen of Chu very much."

"So good!"

Sheng Cai'er glanced at Su Chen unexpectedly.

Cao Changqing admired the Queen of Chu? Isn't the Queen of Chu Jiang Ni's biological mother?

There was some confusion.

Cao Changqing came to save Jiang Ni.

Did he save Jiang Ni for the Queen of Chu? Or do you have evil intentions towards Jiang Ni?.

Chapter 3075

Cao Changqing was very surprised when he heard what Su Chen said. How could Su Chen know 
about his admiration for the Queen of Chu ? Twenty or thirty years have passed. Only a few people 
knew that Cao Changqing loved the Queen of Chu. They still died in the war between Chu and 
Liyang. How did Su Chen know that he loved the Queen of Chu? Are there any old friends from 
Chu who are still alive?

"King Jiangnan, you don’t know how I love you....ah!"

Before Cao Changqing finished speaking,



Sheng Cai'er quickly cut Cao Changqing's throat. Cao Changqing fell to the ground, convulsed and 
stared and died.

Dong Dong Dong~

At this time, black-armored cavalry escorted two carriages and came quickly from a distance.

Su Chen pulled Resident Sheng Cai'er said,"Cai'er, let's go back to the carriage."

"let me go. Sheng

Cai'er saw that the carriage was about to arrive. She didn't want other women to see Su Chen 
pulling her.

Su Chen pulled Sheng Cai'er and said,"Stop it, you will be mine from now on.""

"I'm not your person"

"Then I am your person"

"Shameless!"

Sheng Cai'er glanced at Su Chen speechlessly.

She found that Su Chen was becoming more and more shameless.

Who is her?

Is this what a man should say? Does Su Chen have no face at all?

After more than an hour,



The black-armored army escorted the carriage to the foot of Longhu Mountain.

In the carriage,

Su Chen looked at the secret message sent by the secret guard and frowned. Why did Xu Fengnian 
go to the Xuanyuan family today?

How is it possible?

Xu Fengnian had been at Longhu Mountain for at least three days. Shouldn't we go to the Xuanyuan 
family on the first day?

Xu Zhihu leaned in Su Chen's arms and asked,"Husband, what's wrong?"

Su Chen handed the secret letter to Xu Zhihu and said,"Madam, you will know after reading the 
secret letter."

Xu Zhihu took the secret letter and read it in confusion.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er ignored Su Chen. They looked at the martial arts secrets in their hands 
and talked to each other.

After a while,

Xu Zhihu touched his fair chin and thought,

Xu Fengnian After going to the Xuanyuan family, she guessed why.

The Xuanyuan family controls the land and water of Liyang. Xu Fengnian should want to form an 
alliance with the Xuanyuan family.

However, is the Xuanyuan family so easy to control?



Will Xu Fengnian conspire against the Xuanyuan family? Or Are you digging a hole to plot against 
the Xuanyuan family?

Xu Zhihu asked Su Chen,"Husband, what are you going to do? what you up to?"

Su Chen hugged Xu Zhihu and said with a smile,

"I won't do anything, madam, we came here just to kill Cao Changqing. Cao Changqing has been 
killed. We can see the scenery at Longhu Mountain. You can also meet your brother Xu Longxiang, 
and then we will go to Emperor Wu City to have fun.

Xu Zhihu blinked and asked,"Really?""

"certainly"

"Forget it, where should we go first? Shall we go to Longhu Mountain first? Or go to Huishan 
Xuanyuan Family?"

"Let’s go to Huishan Xuanyuan Family to watch a play first, and then go to Longhu Mountain to see 
the scenery and meet your brother."

"All right.

Su Chen said to the two girls next to him,"Ran Bing, Cai'er, don't read the martial arts secret books. 
Let's go to the Xuanyuan Family in Huishan to watch a show.""

"knew."

Ran Bing rolled her eyes at Su Chen.

She was very resentful towards Su Chen. Su Chen only explained some of the techniques of 
cultivating the Immortal Sword to her. Ran Bing asked Su Chen to explain the essence of 
cultivation to her. Su Chen took the opportunity to impose excessive conditions and was shameless. 
Under such dirty conditions, Ran Bing almost kicked the shameless pervert away. At this moment, 



the Xuanyuan family in Huishan, Xuanyuan Jingcheng and Xuanyuan Dapan were fighting on the 
heavy snow level. Xuanyuan Jingcheng’s condition is not good. He has multiple injuries on his 
body and is constantly vomiting blood in his mouth. Next to him, Xu Fengnian said to Li 
Chungang,

"Senior Li, after Xuanyuan Jingcheng was promoted to the celestial realm, he was still no match for 
Xuanyuan Dapan."

Li Chungang touched the nonsense and nodded and said,"Well, Xuanyuan Dapan is a strong man in 
the celestial realm who has been famous for many years. If Xuanyuan Jingcheng didn't have a 
backup plan, he would be killed by Xuanyuan Dapan."

Xu Fengnian frowned and looked at Xuanyuan Qingfeng next to him.

He wants to control the Xuanyuan family.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng cannot die, but Xuanyuan Jingcheng must die. If Xuanyuan Jingcheng does not 
die, Xu Fengnian will not be able to control the Xuanyuan family. Even if he forms an alliance with 
the Xuanyuan family , the Xuanyuan family would not help him wholeheartedly.

Ning Emei quickly ran over and shouted,

"Master, what's wrong, Cao Changqing was killed, and the King of Jiangnan came with his people 
to the Xuanyuan family in Huishan."

Xu Fengnian shouted in surprise,

"What? Cao Changqing was killed so soon?"Why did the King of Jiangnan come to the Xuanyuan 
Family?"

Li Chungang and Wei Shuyang were also very surprised. []

They didn't expect that Cao Changqing was killed so quickly.



Jiangnan King Suchen also came to the Xuanyuan Family. Why did Su Chen come to the Xuanyuan 
Family? Could it be that Xu Fengnian encouraged Cao Changqing to kill Su Chen? Su Chen is 
coming to take revenge on Xu Fengnian?

Li Chungang asked with a serious face,"Xu Fengnian, when will the Beiliang Cavalry arrive?"

Xu Fengnian said with an ugly face,

"There is still one day to go, Huishan is within the territory of Liyang Kingdom, and the five 
thousand Beiliang Iron Cavalry cannot come here openly, and they have to hide their whereabouts 
along the way. The Beiliang Iron Cavalry will arrive at the fastest speed tomorrow. Wei

Shuyang hurriedly persuaded Xu Fengnian,"Master, let's leave quickly. I guess the King of Jiangnan 
may be coming with bad intentions.""

Ning Emei shook his head and reminded,

"It’s too late. There are 10,000 black-armored cavalry at the foot of Huishan Mountain. The King of 
Jiangnan is coming up to Huishan Mountain with hundreds of guards."

"Don’t worry, King Jiangnan will not take action against me."

Xu Fengnian waved his hands to the people next to him.

He didn't believe that Su Chen would take action against him.

In Jiangnan,

Su Chen didn't kill them in his territory.

In Huishan,

Xu Fengnian didn't know why Su Chen came to the Xuanyuan family, but He didn't believe that Su 
Chen would come to kill him.



After a while, hundreds of secret guards escorted Su Chen and Xu Zhihu to Daxueping.

The rain falling in the sky became heavier and heavier.

Su Chen held an umbrella for Xu Zhihu to watch. To the people on the Daxueping,

Xuanyuan

Jingcheng and Xuanyuan Dapan were fighting fiercely on the Daxueping.

Next to them,

Xu Fengnian and more than ten people were standing on one side, dozens of people from the 
Xuanyuan family were on the other side, and Xuanyuan Qingfeng was alone. Watching the battle in 
the rain.

Su Chen wiped the rain from his face and said,

"Damn it, the battle between Xuanyuan Jingcheng and Xuanyuan Dapan changed the color of the 
sky. If I hadn't known that it was thundering and raining today, I would have thought that the fight 
between two celestial realms would cause strange phenomena in the world. Xu

Zhihu reminded with a smile,"Husband, please speak more civilly. You are a noble, not a 
gangster.""

Xu Zhihu was very happy.

The man held the umbrella for the woman.

Her man was a nobleman, or a prince who controlled a state with heavy troops.

Xu Zhihu was very satisfied with her husband. She was also very lucky to have a man who cared 
about him. The man three..



Chapter 3076

Xu Weixiong and Jiang Ni looked at Xu Zhihu one after another.

Su Chen held an umbrella for Xu Zhihu and would rather get wet by the rain. He didn't let Xu 
Zhihu's clothes get wet. They were all very envious of Su Chen. Love for Xu Zhihu.

Xu Weixiong's face was complicated as he thought,

【My sister has found a good man. Although Su Chen is a shameless bastard and shameless, he is 
really kind to her. She will live a very happy life in the future. ]

Yu Youwei held an umbrella and said with an envious look,"Su Chen is not bad, I'm even envious of 
Xu Zhihu."

Jiang Ni nodded and said,

"Shameless sex is good, and he loves Xu Zhihu very much."

Qingniao said with a cold face,"Xu Zhihu will be very happy in the future. She was tortured by 
illness in the first half of her life and was treated as goods for marriage. It is her luck that Xu Zhihu 
met Su Chen. Ran

Bing curled his lips and said to Sheng Cai'er,"Cai'er, you don't have to look. That bastard Su Chen 
will also hold an umbrella for you in the future. If you hadn't avoided it earlier, Su Chen would have 
held an umbrella for you.""19 Ran Bing regretted not getting close to Su Chen before. Su Chen held 
an umbrella for Xu Zhihu in the rain, which made her very envious. In the rain, there were 
mountain roads, green trees, a beautiful woman in white, and a handsome man in blue. Su Chen and 
Xu Zhihu is a perfect match together. They are like a beautiful painting.

Sheng Cai'er rolled her eyes at Ran Bing.

She looked at Su Chen and Xu Zhihu with some envy.



Su Chen wanted to hold an umbrella for her earlier, but Sheng Cai'er didn't. Ignoring Su Chen, she 
went up the mountain with an umbrella.

At this moment, she saw Su Chen holding an umbrella for Xu Zhihu in the rain. In the rain, the two 
of them matched each other like a landscape painting. Sheng Cai'er said it was a lie if she said she 
didn't regret it.

Xuanyuan saw Su Chen respectfully. The men shouted threats,"Who are you? This is the forbidden 
area of the Xuanyuan family in Huishan. Leave Huishan as soon as possible or die."

Xu Fengnian and Li Chungang looked at Xuanyuan Qingsong. They had nothing to say to 
Xuanyuan Qingsong, who was seeking death. They threatened to kill Su Chen?

People in the Xuanyuan family are idiots.

Even if Xuanyuan Qingsong didn't know Su Chen's identity, Didn't he see the secret guard beside 
Su Chen?

"Xuanyuan respect is dead"

"What an idiot. The Xuanyuan family is getting more and more arrogant."

"The King of Jiangnan will not let go of Xuanyuan's respect. A Jianghu force dares to threaten a 
prince, which angers Jiangnan King Su Chen. Su Chen may kill the entire Xuanyuan family."

"No matter if Xuanyuan Qingzong is dead, I will kill him even if he is not killed by Su Chen."

Xu Fengnian and Li Chungang were talking. They had no intention of meddling, and they did not 
dare to offend Su Chen.

Xu Fengnian did not care about Xuanyuan Qingfeng's death.

In order to control the Xuanyuan family, in addition to Xuanyuan Qingfeng, Xuanyuan Qingfeng's 
The uncles will all die.



Su Chen waved his hand and ordered,"Ready the crossbow!"

The five hundred secret guards held crossbows and faced Xuanyuan Zongzong.

As long as Su Chen gave the order, the secret guards would not hesitate to shoot Xuanyuan 
Zongzong.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er and the other girls showed disdain. They did not expect Xuanyuan 
Zhongzong. Dare to threaten them.

If you don't leave, you will die?

Is Xuanyuan Qingzong an idiot?

Not only do they have hundreds of secret guards here, Sheng Cai'er is also a strong person in the 
Celestial Realm, and the other women are either in the Golden Steel Realm or the Xuan Realm. 
They are idiots of the Xuanyuan family. I'm tired of living and want to die.

"You are so brave. You dare to be arrogant in the Xuanyuan family in Huishan. Come on, kill them 
all."

Xuanyuan Qingzong saw that the secret guards were about to shoot him.

He waved his hands angrily and ordered his subordinates and retainers to kill Su Chen. The 
Xuanyuan family's subordinates and retainers were all masters. Xuanyuan Qingzong believed that 
he could quickly kill more than five hundred secret guards.

Su Chen Chen waved his hand and ordered,"Kill them all, leaving no one behind."

Su Wu, the leader of the secret guards, shouted,"The king has an order to kill them all without 
leaving any one behind. We will attack them with crossbows and shoot them to death."

Swish swish~



"Ah~"

"No, those guards have repeating crossbows in their hands. Don't....Ah~"

"Retreat, let’s retreat quickly"

"No, even my protective evil energy can't stop the crossbow arrow. This is no ordinary crossbow 
arrow."

"Second Master, save us, save....Ah~"......

Five hundred secret guards shot and killed the men who paid tribute to Xuanyuan.

Before Xuanyuan's men and retainers rushed over, more than half of the dozens of people were shot 
and killed. The

Qi-Breaking Army Crossbow was specially designed to deal with Jianghu people.

Even Jianghu masters used their internal strength. Even if they resist, they can't resist the attack of 
the Qi-breaking crossbow.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng frowned and looked at it but didn't care.

She hated Xuanyuan Qingfeng very much.

If possible,

Xuanyuan Qingfeng wanted to kill Xuanyuan Qingfeng with her own hands.

However, she couldn't tell who Su Chen was. Su Chen's guards were very elite, and the crossbows 
were also very terrifying. Xuanyuan Qingfeng couldn't think of anyone with such elite guards.

At this moment, 



Su Chen didn't care about Xuanyuan Zongzong's people, some scum,

Xuanyuan Zongzong was the one who pointed to the Xuan Realm, and the five hundred secret 
guards holding military crossbows were shooting at them non-stop, Xuanyuan Qingzong couldn't 
escape even if he wanted to.

Xu Zhihu smiled and asked Su Chen,"Husband, are we here to watch the excitement in Huishan?"

Su Chen touched his nose and said awkwardly,"Madam, the people in the Xuanyuan family are too 
foul-mouthed and arrogant. I'm worried that... Kill them only if they interfere with our enjoyment."

"Husband, I didn’t say you don’t.....Huh? The woman next to me came over."

Xu Zhihu said as she suddenly saw Xuanyuan Qingfeng coming over.

She was a little curious.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng was standing alone on one side.

They didn't know Xuanyuan Qingfeng, so how could Xuanyuan Qingfeng come to their side.

Su Chen looked at Xuanyuan Qing and mocked,"What a stupid woman.

Ran Bing asked Su Chen curiously,"Su Chen, do you know the woman who came over?" Xu

Weixiong showed a disdainful expression and said coldly,"As long as the shameless pervert is a 
beautiful woman, he will probably know her."

Jiang Ni quickly nodded in agreement,"That's right. Su Chen must have something to do with that 
woman.""[]

Qingniao and Yu Youwei were also nodding their little heads beside them.



They all knew that Su Chen was lustful and shameless, and

Xuanyuan Qingfeng was plump and attractive, and she was also a beautiful beauty. They guessed 
that Su Chen and Xuan Qingfeng knew each other, and Su Chen might have been there before. He 
had played with Xuanyuan Qingfeng's feelings.

Su Chen stared at Jiang Ni and the girls with a dark face.

Did he know Xuanyuan Qingfeng?

He knows nothing, uh,

Su Chen knows Xuanyuan Qingfeng, but the Xuanyuan Qingfeng he knows is not the Xuanyuan 
Qingfeng of this world.

The secret guard noticed Xuanyuan Qingfeng approaching and warned,"Stop, if you go forward, 
you will be killed without mercy!"

Xu Zhihu ordered,"Let her come over"

"Yes, princess! Xuanyuan

Qingfeng came over and asked doubtfully,"I am Xuanyuan Qingfeng of the Xuanyuan family. Who 
are you?"".

Chapter 3077

Xuanyuan Qingfeng was very surprised when he heard the secret guard's words,

Princess?

Xu Zhihu is the princess?



There are five or six hereditary princes in Liyang Kingdom.

Will Xu Zhihu be the princess of that prince? What happens when she comes to the Xuanyuan 
family?

Su Chen curled his lips and said,"Xuanyuan Qingfeng, we came to Huishan just to see the scenery. 
If you have nothing to do, you should pay more attention to your father."

Xuanyuan Qingfeng frowned and asked in disbelief,"Looking at the scenery? You guys look at it. 
Does Scenery kill members of the Xuanyuan family?"

"You want revenge for those idiots?"

"Won't"

"Stupid woman, leave without revenge. Xu Fengnian has been watching you. I don’t want to have a 
conflict with Xu Fengnian later."

"you....."

Xuanyuan Qingfeng's chest was rising and falling because of Su Chen's anger.

Stupid woman?

Why did Su Chen call her a stupid woman?

Why does this bastard call her a stupid woman?

Does she know Su Chen?

Has she ever offended Su Chen?

Xuanyuan Qingfeng was so angry that he wanted to kill Su Chen with a sword.



Xu Zhihu and Ran Bing shook their heads one after another.

Su Chen is not serious again, a stupid woman?

They saw that Su Chen and Xuanyuan Qingfeng didn't know each other.

Since Su Chen didn't know Xuanyuan Qingfeng, there was no way they could have any issues. Why 
did he call Xuanyuan Qingfeng a stupid woman? Even Xu Zhihu and Ran Bing couldn't understand.

Su Chen disdainfully mocked Xuanyuan Qingfeng,

"Xuanyuan Qingfeng, isn’t she a stupid woman?"

"If it weren't for you, would your father die soon?"

"If in a few years your father kills Xuanyuan Dapan like a chicken, there will be no good person in 
the Xuanyuan family except your father Xuanyuan Jingcheng, especially your mother."

Xuanyuan Qingfeng drew out his long sword and pointed at Su Chen and shouted,

"What nonsense are you talking about? I admit that it was because of me that my father came to kill 
Xuanyuan Dapan. Why are you talking about my mother? If you don't tell me clearly today, I will 
kill you."

After Su Chen handed the umbrella to Xu Zhihu, he took a few steps forward and asked,

"Xuanyuan Qingfeng, you have been mocking your father for several years because your father 
does not know martial arts and is a loser. Now that you see that your father knows martial arts and 
is a strong man in the Celestial Realm, you don’t want to think about why your father has been 
hiding for so many years. Cultivation?"

"I......"



Xuanyuan Qingfeng didn't know how to answer for a moment, yes!

Her father is obviously a strong man, why should he hide his cultivation level?

Xuanyuan Qingfeng was called back to the family by Xuanyuan Dapan this time.

Xuanyuan Dapan actually wanted to practice dual cultivation with her.

Her father exposed his martial arts skills and wanted to kill Xuanyuan Dapan. Why didn't her father 
reveal his martial arts skills before?

Xuanyuan Qingfeng glared at Su Chen and asked,"I was sorry for my father before. I don't know 
why my father hid his cultivation, but why did you say bad things about my mother?"

Su Chen touched his chin and asked,"Your mother ?Xuanyuan Qingfeng, does your mother say that 
the Xuanyuan family is too dirty?"

"Yes, my mother said that the Xuanyuan family was too dirty."

Su Chen took out a bottle of wine and drank it and said,

"The Xuanyuan family is too dirty, Xuanyuan Dapan is an old pervert, basically all the women in 
the Xuanyuan family have been insulted by Xuanyuan Dapan, your second uncle and third uncle are 
both profit-seeking people.

"In order to keep Xuanyuan Big Pan in the celestial realm, and to keep the Xuanyuan family 
standing in the world, they not only watched Xuanyuan Big Pan humiliate the women in the family, 
but also personally sent the women in the family to be humiliated by Xuanyuan Big Pan. As for 
your mother?"

Su Chen was very disgusted with Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother. She was a brothel girl.

She was redeemed from the brothel by Xuanyuan Jingcheng. Xuanyuan Jingcheng even told the 
matchmaker that he was marrying her as his wife.



What about Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother?

She likes a woman disguised as a man. There is nothing wrong with the woman, but in order to 
anger Xuanyuan Jingcheng, she shamelessly slept with Xuanyuan Dabaan.

She still has the nerve to call the Xuanyuan family dirty?

A brothel girl calls other people dirty?

It's really ridiculous.

"Is everything you said true?"

Xuanyuan Qingfeng held her hands tightly and bit her lip.

She guessed that what Su (caag) Chen said was true.

Since coming back this time, the second uncle and third uncle have done very dirty things. 
Xuanyuan Qingfeng guessed that the women in the family were really raped. Xuanyuan Great Pan 
was ruined, where is her mother? 

Could it be that her mother was also ruined by Xuanyuan Great Pan? Xuanyuan Qingfeng felt even 
more uneasy and angry thinking about it.

Su Chen He shook his head and said to Xuanyuan Qingfeng,

"Do you really know what's going on?"

"As for your mother, I can’t tell you. However, your mother is a dirty woman, a disgusting woman, 
and a shameless woman.

"Xuanyuan Qingfeng, you can ask your mother about her background and what shameless things 
she has done."



Bang!

Xuanyuan Qingfeng's sword fell to the ground in despair. She stood unconscious in the rain and her 
mind was very confused. Is her mother a dirty woman?

Is she a disgusting woman?

Or is she a shameless woman?

Ran Bing was disrespectful to Su Chen. asked in a voice,

"Su Chen, what is the origin of Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother? Why do you call her a dirty woman? 
Why do you hate her? Why do you say she is a shameless woman?"

Xu Zhihu and Jiang Ni came to Su Chen one after another. They all wanted to know what Su Chen 
meant by what he just said.

Dirty?

Disgusted? []

Shameless?

Why did Su Chen say this about Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother? ?

Jiang Ni patted Su Chen on the shoulder and asked,"Su Chen, what do you mean?"

Su Chen said with a dark face,"You are all women, you don't need to know these shameful things. 
Xu

Zhihu smiled and said to Su Chen,"Husband, you have already said half of what you said. If you 
don't explain clearly, we will keep thinking about these things. You should tell us." Xu



Weixiong stared at Su Chen and said coldly,"Shameless pervert, you didn't tell us on purpose, 
right?""

Ran Bing and the Qingniao girls stared at Su Chen.

Although they didn't have to know the shameful thing,

Su Chen stopped talking after half of what he said. They also wanted to hear the whole thing after 
listening to half of it.

Su Chen had no choice but to whisper. He said to Xu Zhihu and his daughters,"Okay, let me tell 
you, Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother used to be a brothel girl, and she even had an affair with 
Xuanyuan Dapan."

Xu Zhihu and Jiang Ni were all confused.

A woman from a brothel? She had sex with Xuanyuan Dapan?

Su Chen was right.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother was indeed a dirty woman, and she was also a shameless woman.

Jiang Ni touched her fair chin and asked doubtfully,

"Su Chen, how do you know about Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother? You seem to know many secret 
things, my affairs, and the bluebird's affairs. What else do you know?".

Chapter 3078

Jiang Ni felt that Su Chen was very mysterious.

Su Chen seemed to know everything.

He knew that she was the princess of Chu, and that Qingniao was Xu Fengnian's dead soldier. 
Qingniao's family was killed by Chen Zhibao.



What now?

Su Chen actually knew about the scandals of the Xuanyuan family. He even knew that Xuanyuan 
Qingfeng's mother was a brothel girl and that Xuanyuan Qingfeng's mother was having an affair 
with Xuanyuan Dapan.

Jiang Ni couldn't understand how Su Chen knew this. She felt more and more mysterious about Su 
Chen. There were spiritual fruits of heaven and earth, red fruits that improved cultivation, top 
martial arts secrets, and even secrets of cultivating immortals.

But Su Chen How could he be a scumbag without martial arts?

Jiang Ni guessed that Su Chen was hiding something. Su Chen might be a very powerful warrior.

Qingniao, Xu Weixiong, Xu Zhihu, and Yuxiao"Four Seventy" Wei, the other girls also looked at Su 
Chen and felt strange.

Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er didn't feel strange.

Su Chen was the lucky one in the past.

He was still an immortal.

They guessed that Su Chen had experienced the snow world before, so Su Chen knew everything 
about the snow world.

"There are many things I know about Jiang Ni. For example, there is a small red mole on your 
chest, a birthmark on Qingniao’s butt, and Xu Weixiong’s belly button.....Cough cough cough!"

Su Chen suddenly saw the women staring at him with unkind eyes. He hurriedly coughed and 
pretended to look at the secret guard and shot Xuanyuan in tribute.

Damn,



I was careless.

Why couldn't I keep my mouth shut?

Su Chen was so interested in the bodies of these women. He knew very well that although they 
looked different from the characters in the snow in other worlds, they had the same physical 
characteristics.

Su Chen also discovered the characteristics from Xu Zhihu. He guessed that Jiang Ni and Qingniao 
would also have the same characteristics that he was familiar with. Characteristics.

Jiang Ni’s face turned red and she shouted,"Su Chen, I want to kill you, but you actually peeped on 
me."

Qingniao also blushed and stared at Su Chen calmly and shouted,"You are shameless!"

Xu Weixiong pulled out his long sword and pointed it at Su Chen and shouted coldly,"Shameless 
pervert, do you want to die?"

Xu Zhihu, Ran Bing, Sheng Cai'er, and Yu Youwei were very confused. They didn't expect that Su 
Chen knew so much about Jiang Ni's body.

Peeping?

They guessed that Su Chen might have peeped on Jiang Ni's three daughters.

However, they also Thinking that Su Chen didn't have any strength, it was impossible for Su Chen 
to spy on the three Jiang Ni girls silently.

Su Chen hurriedly backed away and said,"Misunderstandings are all misunderstandings. What I just 
said was nonsense. Don't take it seriously."

Jiang Ni stared at Su Chen and shouted angrily,



"Misunderstand? Nonsense? Do you think we believe it? If you are talking nonsense, can you tell 
my chest at once?.....Su Chen, you are dead, I will cut you into pieces."

Su Chen touched his chin and threatened,

"Jiang Ni, I advise you to be kind. Have you seen the secret guard next to you? Look at Sheng Caier 
and Ran Bing, if you dare to attack me, I will let the secret guards and Ran Bing catch you, and I 
will even strip you of your clothes."

"You are shameless!"

Jiang Ni's chest is going to burst with anger.

Take off her clothes?

Shameless pervert,

Su Chen has probably seen her all the time.

The shameless bastard still wants to take off her clothes in an honest way. Jiang Ni wants to stab her 
with a sword. Damn this bastard,

Jiang Ni has just advanced to the Zhixuan realm, but she is no match for Ran Bing and Sheng 
Cai'er, let alone the hundreds of secret guards holding crossbows around her.

Qingniao and Xu Weixiong stared at Su Chen coldly,

Qingniao thought She will be Su Chen's concubine in the future, and it doesn't matter if she is 
looked upon by Su Chen.

Xu Weixiong is held tightly by Xu Zhihu, and she cannot beat up the shameless Su Chen.

At this moment,



Xuanyuan Qingfeng Looking at Su Chen and Jiang Ni, she was very speechless.

She was still sad and sad.

Su Chen and Jiang Ni actually started playing around. Xuanyuan Qingfeng wanted to leave with a 
dark face, but she thought of what Su Chen said. Xuanyuan Qingfeng wanted to leave.

Qingfeng was very uneasy.

She was afraid that her mother was a shameless woman, and she was also worried that her mother 
would betray her father.

Shu Sha walked to Xuanyuan Qingfeng and said,"Miss Xuanyuan, our young master invites you to 
come over."

"Xu Fengnian?"

Xuanyuan Qingfeng frowned and looked at Xu Fengnian aside. 

She had a very bad impression of Xu Fengnian.

Xu Fengnian not only molested her a few years ago, Xu Fengnian's father Xu Xiao was also A 
scheming person, Xuanyuan Qingfeng guessed that Xu Fengnian had bad intentions when he came 
to the Xuanyuan family.

The situation in Beiliang was very bad.

Liyang State suppressed Beiliang, and several states around Beiliang were even wary of Beiliang.

Xu Fengnian At this time, Xu Fengnian came to the Xuanyuan family, probably to form an alliance 
with the Xuanyuan family, or to control the land and water of the Xuanyuan family....

Xuanyuan Qingfeng suddenly thought of the sword god Li Chungang.



If Xu Fengnian asked Li Chungang to help her father, her father would not be killed by Xuanyuan 
Dapan.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng hurriedly walked towards Xu Fengnian.

She wanted to persuade Xu Fengnian to let Li Chungang help her father. She did not want her father 
to be killed. Xuanyuan Dapan killed

"Don't kill me, don't kill me, I am the second son of the Xuanyuan family.....ah!"

Xuanyuan Qingfeng shouted and was shot into a hornet's nest by the secret guards. All of Xuanyuan 
Qingfeng's subordinates and retainers were also shot dead by the secret guards.

Xu Zhihu pulled Xu Weixiong and said to Su Chen,"Husband, Xuanyuan Qingfeng went to Xu 
Fengnian there."

Su Chen looked at Xuanyuan Qingfeng and shook his head,

"I know exactly what the stupid woman wants to do to find Xu Fengnian. She will not succeed and 
she is destined to be disappointed."[]

Jiang Ni raised his fist and snorted coldly,"Hmph, do you know what Xuanyuan Qingfeng did to 
find Xu Fengnian?"

"certainly"

"What is Xuanyuan Qingfeng going to do?"

"Who am I to tell you?"

Jiang Ni shouted with shame and anger,"Shameless pervert, you can see all of me just by peeping."

"I'll do it!"



Su Chen's face turned dark and he wanted to slap Jiang Ni's little ass.

When did he peek at Jiang Ni? Did he see Jiang Ni's 3.0 body characteristics through peeping?

Su Chen curled his lips and teased,

"Little beauty, even if I see you all, can you say it openly and honestly? Are you planning to be my 
concubine? Ran Bing:"

Su Chen, you are indeed a lecher."

Sheng Cai'er:"Shameless!""

Xu Weixiong:"Shameless bastard, I can't help but stab the damn pervert with a sword."

Yu Youwei:"The princess's innocence was ruined by Su Chen."

Blue Bird:"It's so shameless."

Xu Zhihu rolled his eyes at Su Chen speechlessly.

She was too lazy to care about Su Chen.

Su Chen's body was very powerful.

Xu Zhihu thought that she could not satisfy Su Chen.

She hoped that Su Chen would accept Jiang Ni and Qingniao as concubines. This way , Xu Zhihu 
will be much more relaxed in the future..

Chapter 3079



Jiang Ni stared at Su Chen in confusion.

She didn't expect to say something shameful.

Xu Zhihu and the Qingniao girls all heard her words. Jiang Ni's face instantly turned red and she 
lowered her head.

It was over, her words had destroyed her innocence, but

Jiang Ni thought about it, could she still be innocent?

Su Chen probably spied on her more than once or twice.

The red mole on her chest was seen by Su Chen. Jiang Ni guessed that her whole body was looked 
at by Su Chen many times. boom!

Suddenly,

Xuanyuan Jingcheng was blasted away by Xuanyuan Dashan and hit a big tree. He vomited blood 
and stood up, glaring at Xuanyuan Dashan.

It still failed.

The celestial realm could not kill Xuanyuan Dayan.

Xuanyuan Jingcheng looked back at Xuanyuan Qingfeng and decided to use secret techniques to 
kill Xuanyuan Dayan. Xuanyuan Jingcheng would not let Xuanyuan Qingfeng be ruined by 
Xuanyuan Dayan.

Xuanyuan Dapan stroked his beard and said proudly,

"Xuanyuan Jingcheng, you have hidden yourself too deeply. For decades, I have not noticed that 
you have any level of cultivation."



"But it's a pity that although you are in the Celestial Realm, I am a Celestial Realm who has been 
famous for many years, so you can't kill me."

Xuanyuan Jingcheng wiped the blood from his mouth and shouted,"If the celestial realm can't kill 
you, what about the terrestrial fairyland?"

"Arrogant, I haven’t advanced to the land of gods for hundreds of years. Do you think you can 
advance to the land of gods?"

"Why not."

Xuanyuan Jingcheng said that he would use secret techniques to improve his cultivation level. He 
understood that using secret techniques would deplete his vitality, but he had no choice.

For his daughter,

Xuanyuan Jingcheng must kill Xuanyuan Dapan.

Boom boom boom ~

Thunder in the sky The roar continued, the rain fell heavier and heavier, and the aura on Xuanyuan 
Jingcheng's body became more and more terrifying.

Xuanyuan Dapan showed a surprised expression and shouted,"How is that possible? How can it be? 
How can Xuanyuan Jingcheng still improve his cultivation level? Can he really advance to the 
terrestrial fairyland?

Next to her,

Sheng Cai'er asked Su Chen in confusion,"Su Chen, how can Xuanyuan Jingcheng still improve his 
cultivation level?""

Xu Zhihu and Ran Bing also looked at Su Chen.



Xuanyuan Jingcheng is so weird.

How can one say that one's cultivation level will increase as one improves?

Xuanyuan Jingcheng had previously hidden his level of cultivation? Is he really a powerful person 
in the land of gods?

Su Chen looked at Xuanyuan Jingcheng and said to the girls,"Xuanyuan Jingcheng must have used 
some secret technique. He is consuming his vitality to improve his cultivation level. Ran

Bing asked with a shocked expression.

"Consume vitality? Even if Xuanyuan Jingcheng is promoted to the terrestrial fairyland, he won't 
live long?"

"It’s not that he can’t live long, Xuanyuan Jingxuan consumes his life force to ascend to the realm 
of land gods. He has less than ten breaths to live. The land gods will consume all Xuanyuan 
Jingcheng’s life.

"Ten breaths? Xuanyuan Jingcheng has no intention of living anymore. Xuanyuan Qingfeng is very 
lucky to have such a father."

Xu Zhihu thought of her father Xu Xiao.

Xu Xiao and Xuanyuan Jingcheng were incomparable.

Xuanyuan Jingxuan could die for his daughter Xuanyuan Qingfeng, but Xu Xiao would not die for 
her. In Xu Xiao's eyes, Xu Zhihu It's just a bargaining chip, a valuable chess piece.

Su Chen hugged Xu Zhihu and said,

"Xuanyuan Jingcheng is good, but Xuanyuan Qingfeng is not sure. The stupid woman will blame 
herself very much and be sad in the future."



Xu Zhihu leaned into Su Chen's arms and said,"Xuanyuan Qingfeng will blame himself and be sad 
in the future. Jiang

Nimei stared at Su Chen and asked,"Su Chen, can Xuanyuan Jingcheng kill Xuanyuan Dapan?""

"Yes, Xuanyuan Jingcheng will kill Xuanyuan Dapan, and he will be like an epiphyllum, defeated 
as soon as it blooms."

"Like an epiphyllum? Failed at first start?"

Jiang Ni and the other girls looked at Xuanyuan Jingcheng one after another.

They respected Xuanyuan Jingcheng very much. A father who could die for his daughter, such a 
person deserves their respect.

"Father~"

Xuanyuan Qingfeng screamed heartbrokenly next to her. After hearing Li Chungang's words, she 
understood that her father had used secret techniques to kill Xuanyuan Dapan and would die 
together with Xuanyuan Dapan.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng regretted it very much.

She She regretted why she looked down on her father before and why she called her father a 
coward. It was her fault.

Everything was her fault.

Xuanyuan Qingfeng wanted to commit suicide and beg her father to forgive her.

"Qingfeng, your mother will be taken care of by you from now on."Xuanyuan Jingcheng smiled at 
Xuanyuan Qingfeng, and he quickly rushed towards Xuanyuan Dapan and shouted,"Xuanyuan 
Jingcheng, I invite our ancestors to return to heaven today." 



"No, Xuanyuan Jingcheng, if I don’t want to practice dual cultivation with your daughter, you 
should quickly withdraw your secret skills, otherwise you will die too."

"Please return to heaven!"

Boom!

Xuanyuan Jingcheng advanced to the terrestrial fairyland. He flew up and slapped Xuanyuan Big 
Rock with his palm.

"No! I am the ancestor of the Xuanyuan family, Xuanyuan Jingcheng, you are killing me.....ah!"

Bang bang!

With a loud noise,

Xuanyuan Jingcheng instantly killed Xuanyuan Dayan, and a huge pit appeared on the snow flat. 
Xuanyuan Dayan died in the pit like rotten meat.

"It's over, let's leave."

Su Chen saw Xuanyuan Dapan being killed by Xuanyuan Jingcheng. He didn't care at all what 
would happen to the Xuanyuan family in the future. Can Xu Fengnian control the Xuanyuan 
family? Su Chen didn't care even more. [] Ran Bing and Sheng Cai'er's mission The third step is to 
kill Xu Fengnian. Even if Xu Fengnian controls the Xuanyuan family, he still cannot escape death. 
Xu Zhihu smiled and nodded,"Okay, let's leave. It's raining today. Wei Xiong and I will go to 
Longhu Mountain to visit our brother tomorrow."

"

"Let's go back and rest. Damn, the rain is getting heavier and heavier. My clothes are getting 
soaked."

"You're so rude"



"Rude? Little beauty Jiang Ni, are you a little lively now? Let's go see the stars later"

"Shameless pervert!"

After a while, (Good Money Good) Su Chen, Jiang Ni and the other girls left Daxueping noisily.

People like Xu Fengnian were very puzzled when they saw Su Chen leaving.

Xuanyuan Dapan was killed, why did Su Chen bring the girls and secret guards with him? Left? 
They couldn't guess Su Chen's purpose of coming to the Xuanyuan family.

Xu Fengnian asked Li Chungang,"Senior Li, do you see Su Chen's purpose of coming to the 
Xuanyuan family?" Li

Chungang stroked his beard and shook his head and replied,"No, I don't know why Su Chen came 
to the Xuanyuan family.""

Xu Fengnian frowned and looked at Xuanyuan Qingfeng.

Xuanyuan Jingcheng was going to die soon.

He indirectly controlled the Xuanyuan family.

However,

Su Chen came to the Xuanyuan family strangely and left strangely. Xu Fengnian felt that Su Chen 
had some conspiracy.

Xu Fengnian thought about Xu Wei with a black face and thought,

【Why is the second sister by Su Chen's side? Su Chen insulted his eldest sister. Could it be that he 

also didn't let his second sister off? 】.

Chapter 3080



At night, at the foot of Longhu Mountain,

Su Chen came out of the woods by the river with Jiang Ni in her arms. Jiang Ni's face was red and 
she was adjusting her clothes.

Su Chen kissed Jiang Ni and smiled and said,"Jiang Ni, your service makes my tooth hurt. You need 
to practice the service I teach you more.""

"Shameless pervert, don't even think about it."

Jiang Ni was so ashamed and angry that she wanted to strangle the shameless pervert to death. Did 
she serve?

Was she just serving?

Jiang Ni thought of the disgusting things she had done to Su Chen.

She regretted that she had angered Su Chen before. She also regretted that she had done it to Su 
Chen by accident. It's disgusting.

Jiang Ni felt uncomfortable all over.

Su Chen stroked Jiang Ni's small waist and said,"What should I think about? You are my woman, 
we are husband and wife, and it is only natural that we have sex together."

Jiang Ni blushed and glared at Su Chen,

""753" She was too lazy to talk to the shameless pervert, woman?

Husband and wife?

Jiang Ni felt better after hearing Su Chen's words.



At least she was not Su Chen's forbidden plaything.

Jiang Ni thought that Xu Zhihu was the only woman like Su Chen, and she In the future, she will be 
Su Chen's concubine, and she will be Su Chen's legitimate wife. Jiang Ni is not a concubine without 
status. A romantic affair?

Are Su Chen and her in a romantic relationship?

Has she lost her virginity?

Although Su Chen put her clothes on Although Jiang Ni had taken off her skirt, they did not have 
sex as husband and wife. Jiang Ni was still intact. Strictly speaking, she was not Su Chen's woman.

However,

Jiang Ni thought of Su Chen taking off her skirt and touching her.

She She also did disgusting things to Su Chen. Jiang Ni is also a shameless and perverted woman.

"Um? Anyone?"

Jiang Ni suddenly sensed someone not far away. She hurriedly got down from Su Chen's arms and 
took out the magic dagger.

Su Chen was a waste.

Jiang Ni was worried that an assassin would assassinate Su Chen.

Su Chen frowned and asked,"Jiang Ni, is there anyone? Several people? Jiang

Ni pulled Su Chen and replied,"Two, no, three. I heard the footsteps of three people.""



"three people?"

Su Chen was thinking about who would come to the foot of Longhu Mountain in the middle of the 
night?

Three people?

Huh?

Su Chen suddenly thought of who appeared at the foot of Longhu Mountain. He guessed that it was 
Zhao Kai with the golden armor and the remaining one. He should It was Yuan Tingshan who was 
unscrupulous for profit.

Whoosh!

Two men appeared not far away with quick Qinggong, and then the golden-armored puppet ran 
over.

Jiang Ni hurriedly protected the scumbag Su Chen behind her, and she was alert to the arrival. Two 
people and one puppet

"Who are you?"

A man in white said with a smile and clasped his fists,

"King Jiangnan, I never expected to meet you in the mountains and forests, and I never expected 
that you would have an affair with a woman in the mountains and forests. My name is Zhao Kai, 
and I am not your enemy."

Su Chen hugged Jiang Ni's small waist and said,

"Zhao Kai, I know you, you are the illegitimate son of Emperor Liyang, and I also know what you 
want to do when you come to Longhu Mountain."



Jiang Ni pinched Su Chen's waist in shame and annoyance, having an affair?

She and Su Chen were having an affair in the mountains and forests.

Jiang Ni didn't expect to be discovered by others. Jiang Ni blushed and was so embarrassed that she 
didn't have the face to see anyone.

Su Chen hurriedly caught her Jiang Ni's hand shouted,"I'm going, Jiang Ni, don't pinch my waist.""

"snort!"

Zhao Kai said with a serious face,"King Jiangnan, I didn't expect you to know my identity."

Yuan Tingshan stood aside with a frown.

He didn't expect that Su Chen would be the King of Jiangnan and

Zhao Kai would be the illegitimate son of Emperor Liyang.

Both Su Chen and Zhao Kai had a lot of backgrounds. Yuan Tingshan thought about whether he 
could learn from Su Chen. Chen Chen and Zhao Kai benefited from it. 

Su Chen explained with a smile,"This is not a secret, Han Diao Si is your master, and he also 
handed over the red armor to you. As long as someone is interested, they will know your identity."

"That's right, King Jiangnan, I know you robbed Xu Fengnian's eldest sister. I guess you came to 
Longhu Mountain to deal with Xu Fengnian. We can cooperate. What do you think?"

Su Chen curled his lips and said to Zhao Kai,"Cooperate with you? What if I disagree?"

Zhao Kai touched his chin and said coldly,

"disagree?"



"King Jiangnan, if you die at the foot of Longhu Mountain"

"I think a war will break out between Jiangnan and Beiliang, and your men and troops will attack 
Beiliang to avenge you. I suddenly feel that it would be more beneficial to me if you died."

Su Chen looked around and asked,"You want to kill me?"

"Have this idea....."

"Zhao Kai, you can't kill me"

"I don’t think there is only a woman in the Zhixuan realm next to you. Yuan Tingshan and I are both 
in the Zhixuan realm. I also have the powerful golden armor among the red armors. Why can’t I kill 
you?"

"Yeah? Zhao Kai, do you think there will be no one to protect me if I have an affair with a woman 
in the mountains and forests?"

"Um?"

Zhao Kai and Yuan Tingshan hurriedly looked around.

They thought that Su Chen was a king and had many powerful men.

Su Chen's men might really be protecting him.

Jiang Ni asked Su Chen with a face on his face,"Su Chen , are your secret guards around?"

"No!"

"No?"



"yes no"

"Were you talking nonsense just now?"

Su Chen touched Jiang Ni's little face and said,"Little beauty, I have a master of the Zhixuan realm 
like you by my side. Do I need the protection of a secret guard?"

Jiang Ni slapped Su Chen's hand away and said speechlessly,

"Bastard, I am an empty shell of Zhixuan Realm, and I have not successfully cultivated Kung Fu or 
martial arts. How can I protect you?

Zhao Kai shouted with an ugly face,"King Jiangnan, are you deceiving me?" There's no one around 
at all"

"Zhao Kai, get out of here. I think you are pitiful and don’t want to deal with me. If you are looking 
for death, I don’t mind killing you."

"kill me? King Jiangnan, haven’t you seen the situation clearly yet? Now you are a fish on the 5.7 
chopping board, I can kill you at will"

"Damn it, do you really want to die?"

Su Chen frowned, thinking about whether to kill Zhao Kai.

Zhao Kai and Xu Fengnian were fighting to the death, and he could be considered a small helper.

However,

Zhao Kai wanted to kill him and cause a war between Jiangnan and Beiliang.

Even if Su Chen didn't kill him. The unlucky Zhao Kai, Zhao Kai would probably kill him carefully.



Zhao Kai shouted to Yuan Tingshan next to him,"Yuan Tingshan, let's take action together to 
quickly kill Jiangnan Suchen. Yuan

Tingshan frowned and asked,"Zhao Kai, are you really determined to kill King Jiangnan?""

"kill!"

Bah bang bang~

Su Chen clapped his hands and shook his head and shouted,

"Little beauty, why don’t you come out yet? If you don't come out, I will be killed by these idiots 
and you will become a widow."
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