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Chapter 371

In Su Chen's room, Li Xiuning looked at Su Chen in shock after hearing what Su Chen said to her. 
She did not expect that Su Chen, a bastard, would start to fight for dominance in the Sui Dynasty, 
and she heard Su Chen's military deployment. Just a moment of shock.

Li Xiuning didn't expect that this bastard Su Chen would give her 80,000 Xiaoguo troops and 
20,000 Nether Cavalry troops, and there were also 10,000 heavy armored cavalry troops in the 
Nether Cavalry army. This made Li Xiuning look at Su Chen with a vague emotion in her eyes.

After Su Chen told Li Xiuning his plan, he asked,"Li Xiuning, this is what I said, do you think you 
can do it?"

Li Xiuning stood up in a hurry and said excitedly,"Yes, absolutely yes, if I command these The 
army believes that it will take less than half a year to capture the south, and even if Shen Luoyan 
and I join forces, the Song clan will capture it quickly."

Li Xiuning is a female general, and this time she can command more than 200,000 troops. Although 
the main force There are only about 100,000 troops, but these main armies are very powerful. Those 
rebels are simply incapable ofLi Xiuning, the opponent of these armies, could completely destroy 
many forces in the south in the shortest time.

Li Xiuning didn't expect that bastard Su Chen would believe in her like this. Even in the Li clan, she 
couldn't get so many troops at once.

More than 200,000 troops! This is more than all the troops of the Li clan combined. This is the army 
he got. Shen Luoyan also got more than 200,000 troops. Su Chen, a bastard, actually had more than 
500,000 troops in the Sui Dynasty. It seems that This bastard has been plotting against Sui since 
early in the morning.

"Li Xiuning, Yuwen Clan of Jiangdu and Yang Guang should not move for now. I will handle 
Jiangdu personally."

Su Chen reminded Li Xiuning, who was a little excited.



Su Chen thought that if he started to send troops to the southern part of the Sui Dynasty and 
Luoyang, he believed that the Yuwen Clan would definitely be unable to sit still, but the Yuwen 
Clan no longer had the trump card of the Xiaoguo Army. The army, the nearly 80,000 Xiaoguo 
Army is now his own army, and even Yu Wenhuaji can no longer order it to move.

As for Yang Lin, the patron king of Luoyang, he will definitely not rebel against him at this time. 
The middle-level members of his army have already The secret guards have almost figured it out, 
and most of the leading generals have surrendered to him. I believe that the patron king Yang Lin 
will make the right decision.

"yes i understand"

"Well, from now on you can contact Shen Luoyan, and you will directly take orders from Murong 
Qiudi."

Li Xiuning looked at Su Chen in surprise. She didn't expect that this bastard Su Chen would teach 
his wife all these things. Isn't this bastard Su Chen afraid that the harem will interfere with politics 
in the future? Li Xiuning said something meaningful. He reminded Su Chen,"You are so trusting of 
your wife."

Su Chen looked at Li Xiuning and smiled but did not answer her. Those things about the harem 
interfering with politics will definitely not happen in his place. If it does happen, it will be arranged 
by him. If his women are capable of managing Su Chen, they will be given a chance. Anyway, His 
lifespan will definitely be very long in the future, and Su Chen is not worried that the empire he has 
built will collapse overnight. At this time, the black widow came to Su Chen's room and said 
hurriedly,

"Your Majesty, something happened in Luoyang. The princess wants you to go to the main hall 
quickly."

"Something happened in Luoyang? Let's go and see what happened in Luoyang?"

Su Chen was not worried when he heard that something happened in Luoyang. After all, there are 
hundreds of thousands of troops in Luoyang, and Lu Xiaofeng and others are also in Luoyang. The 
masters of the Yinkui Sect are also in Luoyang. Su Chen guessed that Luoyang might have gotten 
some bad things. The news came specially to inform him.



When Su Chen brought Li Xiuning and Black Widow to the meeting hall, Su Yan hurriedly came to 
Su Chen and handed the secret letter to Su Chen and said,

"Dad, something happened to Cihang Jingzhai. Now Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan are being hunted 
by Cihang Jingzhai, and Cihang Jingzhai’s Di Ni is not dead. Di Ni is a land god in the heaven-
human realm, Murong Qiu Aunt Di also said that the heavenly monk from Jingnian Temple in 
Luoyang might not be dead either, and he might also be a land immortal in the realm of heaven and 
man."

Su Chen quickly read the secret message while listening to Su Yan's words. Su Chen did not expect 
that Fan Qinghui's master Di Ni was not dead, and was now mixed with the Li family. Fan Qinghui 
and Shi Feixuan might now be together. There was some crisis, so Su Chen decided to rescue them 
personally this time.

Su Chen thought about it and then told Black Widow,"Black Widow, order the secret guard to notify 
the Moon God of the Eastern Continent and ask her to contact Bai Ruobing and Donghuang Taiyi 
immediately. Said something happened to me and I need their help"

"Yes, master"

"Youruo"

"Owner"

"Send some shadow assassins to find Shi Guanyin and ask her to come over quickly and help me 
kill a few people."

"Yes, master."

Su Chen thought about what he had not missed and then looked at Shen Luoyan and said,

"Shen Luoyan, 50,000 Netherworld Cavalry Legion has assembled five miles away from Pegasus 
Ranch. You will take the token to receive the Netherworld Cavalry Legion in a moment, and protect 
Su Yan and the others as they go to Luoyang tomorrow."

"Yes, Your Majesty."



Shen Luoyan immediately saluted Su Chen.

Su Chen turned back to look at Li Xiuning and said,"Li Xiuning, the 10,000 Netherworld heavy 
armored cavalry in Pegasus Ranch are now under your command. After Su Yan and the others 
return to Luoyang safely, After that, you go to Yangzhou to receive the troops there. At that time, 
you can dispatch the troops at will without asking for instructions."

"Yes, Your Majesty."

Su Chen touched Su Yan's head next to him and said with a smile,"Yan'er, I will leave in a moment. 
You will go to Luoyang with the army tomorrow. I will save Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan. Return 
to Luoyang."

Su Yan is a little reluctant to leave Su Chen now. She and her father have only been together for a 
few days and are about to separate. This makes Su Yan feel very depressed.

"Well, Dad, you have to be more careful."

Black Widow looked at the worried Su Yan and said reassuringly,"Don't worry, Princess, I will 
protect my master."

"Su Chen, shall I go with you?"

Meng walked up to Su Chen with the Qiu Li Sword and said that this time Su Chen was going to 
rescue people and she was also worried that something would happen to Su Chen. Xiaomeng didn't 
want anything to happen to Su Chen now.

Xue Nu held her jade flute and wanted to help Su Chen, but when she saw so many people around 
her, Xue Nu could not open her mouth to help this bastard Su Chen.

Su Chen hugged Xiao Meng and kissed her in public and said,"No, Xiao Meng, you know my 
abilities well. If you can't defeat me, you can run away. Luoyang is not peaceful now, and the Jing 
Nian Temple in Luoyang will definitely not be able to do so at this time either." An Fen, you and 
Xue Nu go to Luoyang to help and protect my daughter Su Yan."



Xiao Meng blushed a little and promised Su Chen,"Okay, Su Yan, I will protect her."

Su Chen then hugged her again. After hugging the Snow Girl, this cold woman was almost melted 
by him. Su Chen believed that it wouldn't be long before he could appreciate the Snow Girl's dance.

Su Chen nodded to Shang Xiuxun and Song Yuhua and disappeared with the black widow in his 
arms. This time the situation was a bit urgent. Su Chen did not dare to delay any longer, otherwise 
Su Chen would not forgive himself if something happened to Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan..

Chapter 372

After returning to Daming in the Ming Dynasty, Chu Liuxiang came to the hermitage of his master 
Ye Di, but Chu Liuxiang did not find his master here, and Chu Liuxiang came non-stop to the 
hermitage of his master, Mrs. Ye Di.

Chu Liuxiang now hopes that his master's wife can come forward to kill Wu Xiangjun. Although he 
has also contacted Xie Xiaofeng and the people from the Song Dynasty Beggar Clan, those low-
powered people cannot be the opponent of that bastard Wu Xiangjun.

His master's wife was also a master in the heaven-human realm, and she had an eccentric 
personality and was a bit competitive. Chu Liuxiang believed that his master's wife could help him 
kill Wu Xiangjun.

When Chu Liuxiang came to a house, he saluted to the house and said,"Master, Chu Liuxiang wants 
to see you.""

"Chu Liuxiang, why are you here?"A crisp and sweet voice came from the room.

This crisp and sweet voice didn't sound like the voice of an old woman at all, but rather like the 
voice of a beautiful and beautiful woman, which made people feel very comfortable.

When Chu Liuxiang heard Master's voice, she said excitedly,"Master, I want to ask you to come 
down the mountain and help me take revenge.""

"Um? Huh? Chu Liuxiang, why is your right arm missing?"



Suddenly, Chu Liuxiang felt a gust of wind, and a beautiful woman with a dignified and beautiful 
appearance suddenly appeared in front of him. The beautiful woman looked at Chu Liuxiang's 
broken arm and asked doubtfully.

Chu Liuxiang hurriedly saw Madam Ye Di appearing. He knelt down and begged,"Master, I was 
harmed by an adulterer, and now my right arm has been cut off by an adulterer. I hope that I can 
take revenge this time.""

Mrs. Ye Di shook her head when she looked at Chu Liuxiang. This Chu Liuxiang has been stealing 
treasures in the Ming Dynasty in the name of a bandit commander. This time he must have offended 
someone he shouldn't have offended.

In the Ming Dynasty, no one should make things difficult for Chu Liuxiang. I'm afraid that this time 
Chu Liuxiang was so arrogant that he went to steal treasures in other continents and was injured like 
this. He was also to blame for this.

Chu Liuxiang didn't practice martial arts well, and he went around stealing treasures all day long for 
the reputation of the bandit commander. How could he not get into trouble?

Mrs. Ye Di shook her head when she saw Chu Liuxiang's current appearance. She would not go to 
other continents to cause trouble for this thief, nor did she want a descendant of a thief to ruin her 
reputation.

"Haha, Chu Liuxiang, you should know that I am no longer your master's wife. You should go find 
your master, that old bastard."

"Teacher's wife....."

"I said I'm not your master's wife."

Just when Chu Liuxiang asked Mrs. Ye Di again, Mrs. Ye Di suddenly accentuated her accent to 
stop Chu Liuxiang.

Mrs. Ye Di and Ye Di parted ways, and the Ye Di who only knew Mingzhe's self-protection and 
quiet temper made Mrs. Ye Di more and more angry. They disliked him, and they even got into a 
fight on one occasion, and in the end, they separated their things and never exchanged them.



"division......Madam, but the bastard who injured me insulted you and said that he would take 
Madam as his wife and concubine in the future."

Boom boom boom

"Chu Liuxiang, do you know what you are talking about?"

When Mrs. Ye Di heard Chu Liuxiang's words, she burst into anger. The surrounding rocks and 
trees were instantly destroyed by Mrs. Ye Di's breath. Mrs. Ye Di didn't believe Chu Liuxiang's 
words. She had not appeared in the area for decades. In the world of martial arts, even if someone 
knows about him, they may not have seen his true face, not to mention that he is still a terrestrial 
immortal in the heaven and human realm. Is there anyone who is looking for death to offend him?

Chu Liuxiang is also riding a tiger and is in trouble. This time he If his master Ye Di is not found, 
then it is possible that Ye Di has gone out to wander again. It will definitely not be easy for him to 
find his master. Chu Liuxiang is just trying to arouse Mrs. Ye Di's violent temper. In this way, under 
Mrs. Ye Di's rage , that bastard Wu Xiangjun will definitely be wiped out by Mrs. Ye Di’s palm.

Chu Liuxiang said with difficulty despite the strong momentum of Mrs. Ye 
Di,"Master.....husband......Madam, that's all I said.....It's all true"

"who is it?"

When Chu Liuxiang heard Mrs. Ye Di asking him, he hurriedly told the lie he had made up in 
advance to Mrs. Ye Di.

"It was Wu Xiangjun of the Song Dynasty. He was a complete sex demon. Basically all the beauties 
on this generation’s martial arts beauties ranking list were taken over by this bastard. Moreover, that 
bastard also ranked the beauties on the previous generation’s martial arts beauties ranking list. , 
Madam, you are one of his targets. He said in front of me that he would take you into his room."

"Lord Wu Xiang of the Great Song Dynasty? A monarch is so overestimating his own abilities. It 
seems that he wants to die early and be reincarnated."



Mrs. Ye Di did not expect that the person who wanted to get her was actually a top noble. A 
nobleman would dare to have her idea. This did not occur to Madam Ye Di. Moreover, most of the 
beauties on this year's martial arts beauties ranking list were defeated by that Wu Xiang. Jun 
occupied it, which made Mrs. Ye Di somewhat interested in this Lord Wu Xiang.

Chu Liuxiang was afraid that Mrs. Ye Di wouldn't believe him, so he hurriedly told Mrs. Ye Di 
about Wu Xiang Jun's affairs and power,

"Madam, Lord Wu Xiang is very powerful. Now he has defeated half of the Song Dynasty. He is 
also very powerful in the Sui Dynasty. He even has his power in the Eastern Continent, and the 
martial arts masters around him are very powerful. There are countless masters and great masters."

Mrs. Ye Di didn't expect that Wu Xiangjun had so many masters and grand masters under his 
command. She thought about it and asked Chu Liuxiang,

"oh? This Lord Wu Xiang actually has such a powerful force? How old is he this year?"

"Um, in his twenties."

Chu Liuxiang said with some embarrassment. Wu Xiangjun is too young. Now Chu Liuxiang is also 
worried that Madam Ye Di will not believe his words, but he does not dare to hide these things from 
Madam Ye Di. After all, as long as Madam Ye Di asks Jiang Hu by the way, As a person, she will 
know everything about Wu Xiangjun

"Haha, in your twenties? Chu Liuxiang, did you really not deceive me this time?"Mrs. Ye Di stared 
at Chu Liuxiang with her beautiful eyes and asked sternly.

Mrs. Ye Di didn't believe that a 20-year-old Wu Xiangjun would have an idea for her, a woman who 
can be his grandmother. Now Mrs. Ye Di is 70% sure. This Chu Liuxiang is deceiving her

"Madam, this is true. As long as Madam asks around in the world, she will know that that bastard 
Wu Xiangjun is as lustful as life, Fan Qinghui from Cihang Jingzhai, Zhu Yuyan from Yinkui Sect, 
and even Yao Yue Lianxing from Ming Dynasty Yihua Palace. They are all that bastard's confidante, 
and they are much older than Wu Xiangjun."



Chu Liuxiang saw that Mrs. Ye Di became suspicious when she heard Wu Xiangjun's age. He 
hurriedly told Mrs. Ye Di about Wu Xiangjun's powerful confidante. Only in this way did Mrs. Ye 
Di not suspect that what he said was false. of

"Um? Fan Qinghui from Cihang Jingzhai, Zhu Yuyan from Yinkui Sect, Yaoyue and Lianxing from 
Yihua Palace, I know these women, if what you say is true, I will kill this Wu Xiangjun, Chu 
Liuxiang, you You can go back now, and don’t come to my place again."

Mrs. Ye Di frowned after hearing Chu Liuxiang's words.

Madam Ye Di heard from Chu Liuxiang's tone that these must be true.

Madam Ye Di also didn't expect that people like Yao Yue and Zhu Yuyan would have so many 
friends with a little girl. Men have something to do with each other. Mrs. Ye Di felt that she had 
better go to see the Wu Xiangjun who bullied her in person to see if Wu Xiangjun wanted to take 
her as his wife and concubine as Chu Liuxiang said.

"Yes, ma'am"

Chapter 373

Chu Liuxiang wiped the sweat on his head when he came down from the mountain. This time he 
had deceived Mrs. Ye Di. He hoped that Mrs. Ye Di would let him go in the face of his master if she 
found out.

"Now everything is ready, Mr. Wu Xiang, I hope you can tease the beautiful Madam Ye Di a few 
words after you see her, so that you can die faster."

"And that Bai Yifei, I don’t know how many people he has contacted to deal with Wu Xiangjun. If 
Mrs. Ye Di kills Wu Xiangjun this time, Bai Yifei, that cold man, may have his work in vain."

In the Sui Dynasty, Youlin Villa was built in a bamboo forest. In a bamboo house, Shi Qingxuan 
looked helpless at Shi Zhixuan outside. Shi Zhixuan had been staying with her for almost a month, 
which made Shi Qingxuan, who liked quietness, a little bit unable to stand Shi Zhixuan's visit this 
time. For disturbing her.



For nearly a month, Shi Zhixuan happily sent her some supplements every day for her to take. At 
first, Shi Qingxuan thought that Shi Zhixuan's schizophrenia was cured, and these were his 
compensation for herself.

But once Shi Zhixuan actually asked her to raise the fetus with peace of mind, which made Shi 
Qingxuan stupid in front of her.

What kind of fetus was she raising?

What kind of fetus was she raising when she was not pregnant at all?

Shi Qingxuan thought that Shi Zhixuan's illness had developed, but when she got the news from Shi 
Zhixuan Finally, Shi Qingxuan couldn't sit still anymore.

Shi Qingxuan left Youlin Xiaozhu and started to inquire about the rivers and lakes, but by the way, 
everyone in the rivers and lakes knew that Shi Qingxuan was pregnant, and she was still pregnant 
with Wu Xiangjun's child. This made her character The cold Shi Qingxuan couldn't help but want to 
kill the person who spread the rumors.

Shi Qingxuan was still a perfect woman, what the hell was she pregnant with? She had never seen 
that Wu Xiangjun at all, which made Shi Qingxuan even cruel to Wu Xiangjun. But her reputation 
was ruined by that bastard Wu Xiangjun.

Outside the bamboo house, Shi Zhixuan happily held some supplements and placed them outside 
the bamboo house.

"Qingxuan, dad brought you some bird's nests this time. You must replenish them, otherwise my 
granddaughter may become weak."

Shi Qingxuan came back to her senses when she heard Shi Zhixuan's voice. She now wants Shi 
Zhixuan to disappear here immediately. Why is she not pregnant?

What kind of granddaughter is she?

What the hell is this?



Does Shi Zhixuan still know what children she will have in the future?

Shi Qingxuan didn't look at the supplements outside. These days, she was just thinking about that 
bastard who was ruining her reputation. Now there were rumors everywhere that she was pregnant.

And that Wu Xiangjun, someone was obviously involved in this matter. Rumor-mongering, but Wu 
Xiangjun never stood up to refute the rumor? Isn’t that bastard afraid of ruining his reputation?

Shi Qingxuan thought about it and shook his head and stopped thinking about it. Sooner or later, 
these things will be clear to her, and she doesn’t need to Thinking about these troublesome things.

Not far from Youlin Xiaozhu,

Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan are fleeing here. They have been chased by Cihang Jingzhai's people 
for two days and two nights. If that bastard Su Chen doesn't come to save them, I'm afraid they will 
really be killed by these people from Cihang Jingzhai.

Shi Fei Xuan supported Fan Qinghui and carefully observed the surroundings. They were now in an 
extremely embarrassed state. The clothes on their bodies were in tatters, and they had large patches 
of snow-white skin. With everything exposed,

Shi Feixuan looked around with the Se Kong Sword in one hand and said to Fan Qinghui,

"Master, why don’t I recognize any of these disciples from Cihang Jingzhai who are chasing us?"

Fan Qinghui covered her chest and gasped,

"These should have been trained by my master Dini over the years. I'm afraid we are in danger this 
time. There are more than ten masters among these disciples. I don't know how they were trained by 
master Dini."

"So that's it. It seems that the master was preparing something early in the morning. This time, that 
bastard Su Chen might have bumped into the master's hand."



Shi Feixuan now also understands why she is not familiar with any of the Cihang Jingzhai disciples 
who are chasing them. These disciples were secretly trained by the master. Shi Feixuan thought 
about how many masters master Di Ni secretly trained. What to do?

Her master and she did not betray Cihang Jingzhai, why would the master not tolerate their master 
and apprentice?

Is it because their master and apprentice are close to that bastard Su Chen?

Fan Qinghui looked at it with a complicated expression Master Feixuan, this time she has caused 
trouble for her apprentice. It’s all the fault of that bastard Su Chen. If she hadn’t been thinking about 
that bastard, their master and apprentice wouldn’t be in the predicament they are in today.

Fan Qinghui thought about what Di Ni had done. Everything, even pretending to die to deceive the 
entire Cihang Jingzhai, Fan Qinghui also had some guesses about everything Di Ni had done.

"Feixuan, these days I have been guessing why Di Ni did this, and now I may have some insights."

Master Feixuan was a little confused and asked hurriedly,"Master, what is Master going to do?"

Fan Qinghui said to Shi Feixuan with a serious expression,

"I guess the agreement between Dini and Li Clan is that Li Clan will fully support Buddhism after 
Li Clan takes over the world. Your master and Tianseng should use Li Clan's national destiny to 
break through their cultivation realm and achieve ascension."

Shi Feixuan was shocked when she heard Fan Qinghui's words and said,

"This is impossible, right? Using something as elusive and non-existent as the destiny of the 
country is simply fanciful. How could Master have such an idea?"

Fan Qinghui touched the surprised Shi Feixuan's head and said with a smile,

"Haha, this is not a fantasy. Some Qi practitioners in ancient times were able to ascend with the help 
of national luck. These are all recorded in our Cihangjingzhai. However, at that time, the spiritual 



energy of heaven and earth was sufficient. Since the collapse of the Great Zhou Dynasty, the luck of 
the human race has changed. Jiuding was lost, and the aura of heaven and earth gradually 
disappeared. Until now, there is no trace of aura of heaven and earth in the world."

"Master, are there immortals in this world?"

"Maybe."

Master Fei Xuan was stunned for a moment, are there really immortals in the world? Although the 
master did not have an accurate answer, he should believe that there are really immortals in the 
world, but how is this possible? There is no trace of the aura of heaven and earth in the world now. 
Wouldn't it be a dead end for immortals to stay among humans?

"Feixuan, don’t think so much. Now we have to escape from the pursuit of Cihang Jingzhai’s 
disciple. Not far ahead is the residence of my registered disciple Shi Qingxuan. Let’s go to her first 
to avoid those Cihang Jingzhai who are chasing us. Zhai disciple

"Yes, master."

Mexi Town,

Su Chen stood on the second floor of the inn and looked at the people coming and going on the 
street. This is the only way to Luoyang. Su Chen has been here for two days. He gathered all the 
secret guards and All the shadow assassins were sent out to look for Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan.

Su Chen was a little anxious now. In the past two days, he had used his mental power to search for 
Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan here, but there was still no news at all. Su Chen was now worried that 
Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan would be caught by that dini.

At this time, the black widow went upstairs and saluted Su Chen,

"Master, a secret guard came back to report that traces of fighting were found in the mountains to 
the west, and that the mountains to the west are the hermitage of Shi Qingxuan, the daughter of the 
evil king Shi Zhixuan."



"In the mountains to the west? Signs of a fight? Shi Qingxuan? Black Widow ordered all the secret 
guards and shadow assassins to go to Shi Qingxuan's secluded place. Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan 
must have gone to Shi Qingxuan for help. After all, Shi Qingxuan is Fan Qinghui's registered 
disciple."

"Yes, master"

Chapter 374

In Youlin Xiaozhu, Shi Qingxuan looked at Shi Zhixuan who had not left outside and was helpless. 
She had not said a word to Shi Zhixuan for almost half a month, but Shi Zhixuan was determined 
not to leave and sent her some supplements every day.

This makes Shi Qingxuan sometimes can't help but want Shi Zhixuan not to do this, and even let 
Shi Zhixuan do what he should do, but every time she thinks of her mother's death, she clenches her 
fists and resists talking to Shi Zhixuan. With a bang,

Shi Qingxuan saw the sound of fighting in the distance, which made Shi Qingxuan frown. This was 
her secluded place, and she didn't want to be disturbed by vendettas in the world. Besides, this place 
was also her mother's burial place

"Qingxuan, don't come out of the house. Dad will deal with these people. Don't let your baby 
breathe."Shi Zhixuan looked at Shi Qingxuan in the bamboo house nervously and ordered.

Shi Zhixuan is very angry now. His daughter is pregnant now. These vendettas in the world dare to 
disturb her daughter's rest. Shi Zhixuan believes that he would like to kill them to disturb him. The 
Jianghu man whose daughter is resting.

When Shi Zhixuan heard Shi Zhixuan's words, Shi Qingxuan felt a twinge of fear in her head. Shi 
Qingxuan wanted to tell Shi Zhixuan loudly that she was not pregnant, but Shi Qingxuan did not 
want to talk to Shi Zhixuan. She looked at Shi Zhixuan with a face filled with shame and Look at 
the person coming

""Master"

Shi Qingxuan did not expect that those who arrived were Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan, the masters 
of Cihang Jingzhai, and they looked as embarrassed as ever. Shi Qingxuan hurriedly came out to 
help Fan Qinghui, who was about to fall.



"Qingxuan, I’m afraid I’ll bring you trouble this time."Fan Qinghui said to Shi Qingxuan with a 
very weak breath,

"Master, what's going on? Senior Sister Feixuan, are you okay?"

"This is a long story."Fan Qinghui shook his head when he looked at Cihang Jingzhai's pursuers 
who were about to catch up.

Junior Concubine Xuan looked at this junior sister she had never met before and said,"Junior Sister 
Qingxuan, I have nothing to do. Somewhat exhausted."

Shi Zhixuan didn't expect Fan Qinghui to be injured so seriously. Cihang Jingzhai is a giant. Who 
wants to kill Master Fan Qinghui? Shi Zhixuan looked at the people who were about to arrive and 
was a little curious. Shi Zhixuan looked at The embarrassed Fan Qinghui laughed and said,

"Old nun, you look a little embarrassed. Who is chasing you?"

Fan Qinghui didn't expect Evil King Shi Zhixuan to be here. Seeing his former enemies laughing at 
him, Fan Qinghui was speechless."Evil King, I didn't expect you to be here. The ones who are 
chasing us are Cihang Jingzhai's disciples. Our master and disciple are now regarded as traitors by 
Cihang Jingzhai."

"Haha, this is retribution from heaven, making you Cihang Jingzhai chase me every day before"

"Evil King, you will protect Shi Qingxuan and Shi Feixuan from leaving in a moment, and I will 
block Cihang Jingzhai’s pursuers."

"Haha, as long as I'm here, the people in Cihang Jingzhai won't have anything to worry about."

Fan Qinghui looked at Shi Zhixuan's nonchalant look and hurriedly reminded him,"Evil King, 
please stop bragging here. This time, there are more than ten masters coming, including even great 
masters."



"What? More than a dozen masters? And the Grand Master? It is impossible for you Cihang 
Jingzhai to have so many strong men."

Shi Zhixuan was a little confused after hearing Fan Qinghui's words. Is Cihang Jingzhai so 
powerful? If Cihang Jingzhai is so powerful, why did he rely on Ning Daoqi and the four holy 
monks of Jingnian Zen Academy to round him up before?

And this At that moment, hundreds of women in white clothes appeared here with long swords. Led 
by fourteen powerful middle-aged women, they surrounded Fan Qinghui and Shi Zhixuan.

A middle-aged nun faced Fan Qinghui He Shifeixuan said indifferently,"Fan Qinghui and 
Shifeixuan, the master of the nunnery has an order. If you don't surrender, I will be captured without 
mercy.""

"Haha, if you want to kill, just kill. It is impossible for us to surrender and be captured."Fan 
Qinghui pointed her long sword at the nuns in Cihang Jingzhai and said angrily.

Fan Qinghui will not go back with these people. Her perverted master is now disowned. If she and 
the master concubine Xuan surrender, I'm afraid she will wait. Their life is worse than death

"Then go to hell and kill these people for me"

"yes"

""Immortal printing" boom boom boom

Shi Zhixuan saw that these people who pretended he didn't exist were about to take action, so he 
casually knocked away more than ten disciples of Cihang Jingzhai who were about to kill him.

The middle-aged nun saw Shi Zhixuan take action. She felt that this person was a great master. She 
did not expect that there would be a great master here. No wonder Fan Qinghui and his disciples 
wanted to escape here.

"Grandmaster? Who are you? This is our Cihang Jingzhai matter. Can irrelevant people leave?"



Shi Zhixuan looked at the middle-aged nun, the master, strangely. He, Shi Zhixuan, was the main 
enemy of Cihang Jingzhai, but these people from Cihang Jingzhai didn't even know him. This made 
Shi Zhixuan a little confused and said with a smile,

"Haha, I don’t even recognize the people from Cihang Jingzhai anymore. Fan Qinghui, is this a 
person from Cihang Jingzhai?"

"This was cultivated by Di Ni personally. They may not even know the Evil King."

"That old nun from Dini is not dead? No wonder you were hunted down by people from Cihang 
Jingzhai"

"Evil King Shi Zhixuan? Are you the Evil King Shi Zhixuan?"

This middle-aged nun took a few steps back when she heard that the great master was the evil king 
Shi Zhixuan. She knew the strength of the evil king Shi Zhixuan. I am afraid that all of them 
together are no match for the evil king Shi Zhixuan. She now hopes that Yan Jing'an will The 
nunnery master came quickly

"Yes, I am the Evil King Shi Zhixuan"

"Evil King Shi Zhixuan, these things have nothing to do with you. I hope you won’t ask for 
trouble."

"What if I have to ask for trouble?"

"Then you will perish here today."At this time, a very gentle voice came from a distance.

Shi Zhixuan and Fan Qinghui looked at a woman in white clothes who appeared opposite them in a 
flash. This woman was very beautiful and beautiful, and she looked soft and frail. , with long black 
hair tied around her head, she can’t tell how old she is, but she should be at least about the same age 
as Fan Qinghui

"See"Master Yan Jing'an".



When all the women in Cihang Jingzhai saw this woman appearing, they all saluted her and said,

"Grandmaster, I didn’t expect that Cihang Jingzhai actually had a great master."

Shi Zhixuan's face is a little solemn now. The existence of a great master is not easy to deal with 
now. There are more than ten master masters and hundreds of Xiantian realm Cihang Jingzhai 
disciples Fan Qinghui, Shi Feixuan, Shi Qingxuan and others. He must be unable to deal with the 
remaining people. If he is entangled by this great master, I'm afraid they will all be killed.

Yan Jing'an looked at Shi Zhixuan and smiled and asked,"Shi Zhixuan, are you still asking for 
trouble now? ?"

Shi Zhixuan looked at his daughter Shi Qingxuan and knew that he could not take Shi Qingxuan 
away. I am afraid that Shi Qingxuan would not abandon her master and leave at this time. Shi 
Zhixuan could not ignore his daughter's life or death. Shi

Zhixuan said to Yan Jing'an proudly ,

"why not?"

"Then we, Cihang Jingzhai, will kill you, including your daughter Shi Qingxuan."

"Then you can try it."
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Yan Jing'an didn't expect Shi Zhixuan to be so tough and not even care about his daughter's safety. 
This made Yan Jing'an confused about Shi Zhixuan.

Shouldn't Shi Zhixuan not care about the life and death of Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan? After all, 
Fan Qinghui had led the four holy monks from Jingnian Temple to round up Shi Zhixuan before.

Yan Jing'an looked at Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan and felt pity for them, but there was nothing she 
could do. If she dared to betray Master Fan Qinghui and his disciples, she would be killed 
mercilessly by Di Ni.



Yan Jing'an took a breath and ordered,"I'll restrain Shi Zhixuan. You kill Fan Qinghui and Shi 
Feixuan. You can't kill Shi Qingxuan.""

"Yes, nunnery master"

"Shi Zhixuan, today I will learn about your Immortal Seal."

"Hey, are you worthy?"

"Seeking death, Sword Master Changhong!"

Boom boom boom Yan Jing'an drew out his long sword and attacked Shi Zhixuan. This Shi Zhixuan 
was too arrogant. Yan Jing'an was also angered by this evil king.

"Immortal Seal"

Shi Zhixuan didn't dare to be careless when it came to this Yan Jing'an. After all, this woman was 
trained by Di Ni, and she only appeared after hiding for decades. Shi Zhixuan didn't want to capsize 
in the gutter.

And here, Cihang Jingzhai The other disciples, led by more than a dozen masters, came to kill Fan 
Qinghui and Shi Feixuan.

Fan Qinghui, Shi Feixuan, and Shi Qingxuan looked nervously back to back at the Cihang Jingzhai 
disciples who came over.

Stabbed! Stabbed. La!

Just when the disciples of Cihang Jingzhai were about to kill them, each of the disciples of Cihang 
Jingzhai suddenly had their throats cut to death. The remaining disciples of Cihang Jingzhai were 
frightened by the sudden change and quickly retreated, but they The response was too slow, and 
when these Cihang Jingzhai retreated, more than twenty Cihang Jingzhai disciples had their throats 
cut and died.



The incident here was also discovered by Yan Jing'an and Shi Zhixuan, who each gave them a 
beating. The palms were separated, and Shi Zhixuan and Yan Jing'an also wanted to know what 
happened just now.

Fan Qinghui, Shi Feixuan, and Shi Qingxuan didn't know what happened, but the person who came 
must be from their side, otherwise they wouldn't have been there just now. Kill those disciples of 
Cihang Jingzhai

"who is it? Who wants to help Fan Qinghui?"

Yan Jing'an asked angrily as he looked at the more than thirty disciples of Cihang Jingzhai who 
were suddenly killed. Among these thirty or so disciples of Cihang Jingzhai, there were two 
masters. Yan Jing'an saw that Even the master master Yu Li was assassinated without resisting, 
which made her a little confused and afraid.

"Is that friend coming?"Fan Qinghui also wanted to know who saved them, and she also shouted to 
the people around her.

Just after Fan Qinghui shouted to the people around her, a masked woman in black clothes suddenly 
appeared next to Fan Qinghui and saluted,

"Shadow Team 3, Captain Youxue has met Madam"

""Have you met Madam?"

After this masked woman in black clothes appeared, twelve more masked women in black clothes 
appeared one after another, and they also saluted Fan Qinghui one after another.

Fan Qinghui was filled with joy when she saw these women calling her Madam. Her face turned red 
and she guessed that these people must be the subordinates of that bastard Su Chen, otherwise it 
would be impossible to call her that. Fan Qinghui also knew that everyone here was looking at her.

She exhaled and asked with some embarrassment,

"Are you Su Chen's subordinates?"



"Yes, ma'am, the master is on his way here"

"Su Chen is here, even that bastard still has some conscience."

Fan Qinghui relaxed a little when he heard Su Chen coming over. If that bastard comes over, the 
crisis here will be lifted. I am afraid that no one from Cihang Jingzhai will be able to leave this 
time. That bastard Su Chen will not let go. After seeing these people who dealt with her and Shi 
Feixuan.

When Yan Jing'an saw this, she also knew that these women in black were the subordinates of Fan 
Qinghui's concubine. When she looked at Fan Qinghui, she never thought that Fan Qinghui at such 
an old age would have Man, this made Yan Jing'an a little speechless,

"Fan Qinghui didn't expect you to get married. It seems that the master will kill you this time and he 
will not be unjust to you."

"Yan Jing'an, don't talk sarcastically here. It doesn't matter whether I marry someone or not. Yan

Jing'an looked at Fan Qinghui who was blushing and said disdainfully,"Tsk, you really embarrass us 
Cihang Jingzhai.""

"Yan Jing'an, I hope your mouth can still be so eloquent."

Fan Qinghui is a little embarrassed and angry now.

How did that bastard Su Chen tell his subordinates? This time she has been completely 
embarrassed. She has nothing to do with that bastard Su Chen. That bastard must have deliberately 
let his subordinates call him that..Swish swish swish

"Shadow Team 4 met Madam"

"Shadow Team 5 met Madam"

"Shadow Team 6 met Madam".............



Just like that, hundreds of shadow assassins appeared here. After these shadow assassins appeared, 
they also saluted Fan Qinghui.

Fan Qinghui angrily thought about killing that bastard Su Chen. That bastard obviously wanted to 
ruin her reputation. How would she be seen in the future?

Shi Feixuan smiled as she saw more and more shadow assassins appearing. She knew that that 
bastard Su Chen had nothing to do with her master. It must be that bastard who was teasing her 
master again this time.

Dong Dong Dong Dong Dong Dong

Just at this moment, there was a sound of footsteps. When the people here turned their heads and 
looked over, they found hundreds of men in black approaching quickly. These men in black were 
holding military weapons in their hands. With crossbows and short blades hanging on their waists, 
they surrounded them like an army.

Shi Qingxuan was a little confused now. She looked at her master Fan Qinghui with some doubts. 
Shi Qingxuan had not seen Fan Qinghui for several years. Her master was actually married, and it 
seemed that the person her master Fan Qinghui married was a very powerful person. This made Shi 
Qingxuan look at Fan Qinghui with a strange expression. Shi Qingxuan wanted to know who the 
person who married her master was?

When these men in black surrounded the place, a man in black quickly came to Fan Qinghui and 
saluted,

"The deputy commander of the secret guard, Wang Chu, met his wife"

"Where are you, Your Majesty?"

"Madam, Your Majesty will be here soon."

Fan Qinghui doesn't care now. They can call these people whatever they want. After that bastard Su 
Chen arrives, she will settle the score with that bastard Su Chen.



Fan Qinghui looked at Yan An who was a little uneasy and said with a smile. ,"Yan Jing'an, now 
you surrender, I can spare your life."

Yan Jing'an was a little angry and scolded Fan Qinghui,"Fan Qinghui, do you think this is possible 
for a shameless woman like you who pretends to be powerful?"

Fan Qinghui looked at Yan Jing'an who was furious and said with a smile,

"What happened to me pretending to be powerful? You can also pretend to be a tiger. Have you seen 
the crossbows in the hands of the secret guards? These are Qi-breaking crossbows. Do you think 
these disciples of Cihang Jingzhai can dodge the attacks of these Qi-breaking crossbows?"

"you......."

"Yan Jing'an, you have to think clearly. There are not only Qi-breaking crossbows here, but you 
can't deal with these shadow assassins around me. Your decision is related to the life and death of 
hundreds of people."
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Yan Jing'an looked at the secret guards around her and the shadow assassins around Fan Qinghui 
and was a little at a loss. The Qi-popping crossbows in the hands of those secret guards were 
powerful weapons, although she was not afraid of these hundreds of Po-Qi soldiers. Crossbow, but 
ordinary disciples of Cihang Jingzhai cannot.

These Qi-breaking crossbows could instantly kill ordinary disciples of Cihang Jingzhai, not to 
mention those elusive shadow assassins whose auras she couldn't detect, which made Yan Jing'an 
even more afraid to act rashly.

Fan Qinghui looked at the junior sister she met for the first time with the support of Shi Feixuan and 
Shi Qingxuan. Fan Qinghui also did not expect that Yan Jing'an was actually a grand master. Her 
master was well hidden.

This was because Di Ni wanted to depose her, the former owner of Cihang Jingzhai, early on. This 
made Fan Qinghui no longer have any affection for Di Ni as a master and disciple.

On a big tree not far from Youlin Villa,



Su Chen held the black widow and looked at the people who were surrounded by Cihang Jingzhai 
and smiled. He finally caught up this time, otherwise Fan Qinghui and... Feixuan may be in trouble 
this time.

Su Chen also didn't expect that Cihang Jingzhai's Di Ni would hide so many masters, and even a 
great master.

Black Widow was held by Su Chen and asked with some confusion,"Master, why don't we go?"

"You're stupid. I plotted against Fan Qinghui just now. If we show up now, that crazy woman Fan 
Qinghui will definitely take revenge on me. Besides, the evil king Shi Zhixuan is also here. Once I 
show up, I'm afraid Shi Zhixuan will drag me to marry his daughter directly. , let’s wait and see."

Su Chen tapped the black widow's forehead and was speechless.

Wouldn't going down at this time attract firepower?

If Su Chen went down at this time, I'm afraid that crazy woman Fan Qinghui would definitely not 
let him go, and Shi Qingxuan was also there.

If Shi Zhixuan told Shi Qingxuan's words may make things even more difficult to control. Anyway, 
there is no problem with their safety now. Su Chen should wait and see before talking.

Black Widow looked at Su Chen speechlessly. Fan Qinghui was obviously interested in her master. , 
Aren’t these things the master did a little redundant? But it’s not bad to see Fan Qinghui of Cihang 
Jingzhai blushing. The black widow looked at Su Chen and said with a smile,"Haha, master, you are 
slandering Fan Qinghui like this. is this okay?"

"I was just joking with her. This woman Fan Qinghui has been wavering. This time I will see if she 
will go against me in the future."

"Master, it is obvious that Fan Qinghui betrayed Cihang Jingzhai this time because of you. Isn’t it 
unnecessary for you to do this?"



Su Chen held the black widow's soft body and looked at Fan Qinghui below and said,

"It’s different. This woman, Fan Qinghui, has always pretended to be noble and aloof, but this time 
she is extremely embarrassed. If I spread these false news deliberately again, although Fan Qinghui 
will be cruel to me in the future, Fan Qinghui will be ours in the future. One of our own, even if she 
regains control of Cihang Jingzhai in the future, it will still be our Cihang Jingzhai"

"I think the master is lusting after Fan Qinghui's body."

Black Widow looked at Fan Qinghui's plump body and beautiful appearance and guessed that Fan 
Qinghui had a noble temperament. Su Chen must have fallen in love with Fan Qinghui and wanted 
to conquer the nunnery master of Cihang Jingzhai.

Su Chen hugged the black widow, kissed her and said with a smile,"I'm still hungry for your body.""

"host...."People"

Here in Youlin Xiaozhu, Fan Qinghui looked at Yan Jing'an who couldn't make up her mind and 
shook her head. Yan Jing'an was still hesitant at this time. She was not worthy of being the leader of 
a faction.

Fan Qinghui would not give Yan Jing'an any trouble. An had too much time to think about it, but 
she was a decisive woman. When dealing with her enemies, Fan Qinghui always wanted to kill 
them all.

Fan Qinghui looked at Cihang Jingzhai and other disciples, then stretched out his hand and 
ordered,"Prepare the Qi-breaking crossbow, fire."

Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh! Whoosh!

Ah! Ah! Ah! Ah!

"Lord, save me"

"kill these guards"



"My legs, cover me"

"I......"

"Spread out quickly and don't gather together."

Under a single volley from the secret guards, dozens of Cihang Jingzhai's disciples were killed or 
injured. Some of Cihang Jingzhai's disciples tried to rush over, but they were shot dead before they 
could rush over. This round was broken. After the Qi Army Crossbow shot, Fan Qinghui asked the 
secret guards to stop shooting

"Fan Qinghui!"

Yan Jing'an looked at Cihang Jingzhai's disciples who had suffered heavy losses and shouted 
angrily at Fan Qinghui.

Fan Qinghui looked at Yan Jing'an's angry look and threatened him rudely.

"Yan Jing'an, I'll give you three more breaths. If you don't surrender, don't blame me for being rude. 
If you dare to escape, these disciples will be executed."

"You are so vicious"

"Am I vicious? Yan Jing'an, this is so funny coming from your mouth. Who has been chasing our 
master and disciple these past few days? What have we done to endanger Cihang Jingzhai? That’s 
why you guys spare no effort to hunt down our master and disciples."

"This is the master's order, I'm just obeying it"

"Just obey the order and stop talking nonsense. You only have three breaths. If you don't surrender 
after three breaths, then don't blame me."



Fan Qinghui was too lazy to talk nonsense with these people. She was also afraid that things would 
change. After all, her master Dini was a land god in the heavenly realm. If Dini came over, I'm 
afraid none of them would be alive. Leave.

Shi Zhixuan has been observing the shadow assassins. These shadow assassins have surprised Shi 
Zhixuan since they appeared. He is a very powerful assassin, but he has not sensed the aura of these 
shadow assassins since they appeared. The hidden abilities of these shadow assassins Even stronger 
than him, this surprised Shi Zhixuan.

Shi Zhixuan looked around and wondered if that bastard Su Chen was here. Not only did that 
bastard make his daughter's belly bigger, but that bastard also had sex with Fan Qinghui. The old 
woman got involved, which made Shi Zhixuan not know whether to praise that bastard Su Chen or 
to kill that bastard.

Shi Zhixuan looked at the old woman Fan Qinghui from time to time, uh! You can't say that it's an 
old woman, this Fan Qinghui is long She is very beautiful, especially her plump body. One look at it 
will make people imagine.

Shi Zhixuan thought that if Fan Qinghui is also Su Chen's bastard woman in the future, what will 
Fan Qinghui call herself in the future? After all, she is Su Chen Shi Zhixuan laughed thinking about 
that bastard father-in-law. He felt that this matter was getting more and more interesting.

Yan Jing'an felt helpless when he looked at the remaining Cihang Jingzhai disciples. The Cihang 
Jingzhai disciples here were probably This time she is doomed. Although she can escape, with the 
Evil King Shi Zhixuan around, it may not be easy for her to escape.

"Master, you can run away and don't worry about us."

"Yes, nunnery master, run away quickly and avenge us later."

"Lord of the nunnery, we are not afraid of death. We will protect these enemies for the nunnery."

"Please let the nunnery master go first. We disciples of Cihang Jingzhai are not afraid of death."..

Chapter 377



Yan Jing'an is very helpless now. She can't leave these disciples of Cihang Jingzhai. If she does this, 
she will be punished mercilessly by her master Dini when she goes back.

Yan Jing'an looks at Fan Qinghui She also knew that if she didn't make a decision, I'm afraid that 
ruthless woman Fan Qinghui would directly order them to be killed.

Yan Jing'an stared at Fan Qinghui and said helplessly,"Huh, Fan Qinghui, you win, we will 
surrender and capture you.""

"The nunnery master?"

"Master, we can't just surrender."

"Yes, nunnery master, we fought with them"

"Master, even if we die, we cannot surrender."

"Master of the nunnery, we will fight a way for you, you can escape on your own."

When Cihang Jingzhai's disciples heard that Yan Jing'an wanted to surrender, they all spoke up. 
They were Cihang Jingzhai, the leader of the righteous martial arts in the Sui Dynasty. How could 
they surrender to a traitor?

Yan Jing'an looked at these Cihang Jingzhai’s disciples talked about it and said angrily,

"Shut up, if you think I am the nunnery master, then obey my orders."

Fan Qinghui saw that Yan Jing'an was about to surrender and said directly,"Yan Jing'an, claim your 
own cultivation level, and the disciples of Cihang Jingzhai will also claim their own cultivation 
level."

""Coward,"

Yan Jing'an said with disdain when she saw that Fan Qinghui was still cautious.



Yan Jing'an looked at the Cihang Jingzhai disciples around her and quickly tapped her body a few 
times. This was Yan Jing'an's own seal. Her level of cultivation

"You all claim to be in the realm of your cultivation." Yan Jing'an looked at the disciples of Cihang 
Jingzhai and ordered.

""Yes, nunnery master."

After the disciples of Cihang Jingzhai declared themselves in the realm of cultivation, Fan Qinghui 
waved and asked the secret guards to arrest all the people in Cihang Jingzhai.

Master Fei Xuan saw Yan Jing'an and Cihang Jing'an After all the disciples of Hang Jingzhai were 
caught, she breathed a sigh of relief, but Shi Feixuan realized that some time had passed and that 
bastard Su Chen hadn't arrived yet.

Shi Feixuan asked with some worry,"Master , Why hasn’t Su Chen come over yet? He won't have 
an accident on the road, right?"

"That bastard had been here a long time ago, but he just didn't show up."Fan Qinghui looked around 
and said angrily.

Fan Qinghui is now very sure that that bastard Su Chen is watching here. Maybe he is afraid that he 
will cause trouble for him. This bastard doesn't dare to show up.

"Is Su Chen here?"

Shi Feixuan immediately observed this place. She has lost her judgment now. This time she has 
experienced a life and death escape. After hearing that Su Chen was coming, she has been waiting 
for that bastard to appear. Shi Feixuan has She had a lot to say to Su Chen, and she would not dare 
to like Su Chen like before.

When Fan Qinghui saw that Su Chen still didn't show up, she shouted to the people around her,"Su 
Chen, you bastard didn't show up yet." ? How long are you going to hide it for?"



"Fan Qinghui, you are still so irritable."Su Chen suddenly appeared next to Shi Feixuan with the 
black widow in his arms. He hugged Shi Feixuan and said with a smile.

Su Chen also knew that he could not hide forever. This Fan Qinghui was really the leader of a sect. 
She actually guessed He hid around when he came out. When Su Chen appeared, he nodded to Fan 
Qinghui.

"Suchen!"

Shi Feixuan happily hugged Su Chen's waist when she saw Su Chen holding her. She was also very 
happy to see this bastard Su Chen again. Shi Feixuan hadn't seen this bad guy in several months.

"Feixuan, I’m here, I won’t let you be in danger again."

"Well."

Fan Qinghui hugged Shi Feixuan when she saw this bastard appear. She was a little upset and 
cursed at Su Chen,

"You bastard, you have the nerve to show up? Forget it, I'll settle the score with you, this bastard, in 
the future."

Fan Qinghui was so angry when she saw Su Chen appeared that she wanted to teach this bastard a 
lesson directly. However, she was powerless now. Her injuries were quite serious.

Fan Qinghui didn't want to let this bastard fail to step down at this time. After all, there were 
hundreds of him here. Several subordinates, and Yan Jing'an and the disciples of Cihang Jingzhai 
were also nearby.

Seeing Su Chen appear, Shi Zhixuan came to Su Chen and said hurriedly,

"Mr. Wu Xiang, you bastard is finally here. Hurry, your marriage to my daughter will be arranged 
immediately. Otherwise, it will be bad if my daughter gives birth to a child. This will damage the 
reputation of my woman."



"Wait, what wedding?"Shi Qingxuan next to her asked directly in confusion.

Although Shi Qingxuan was a little surprised to see this Wu Xiangjun appear, she had an affair with 
this Wu Xiangjun, and it was rumored that she was pregnant with Wu Xiangjun's child, but the 
marriage What the hell? Moreover, her father seemed to know Wu Xiangjun, which made Shi 
Qingxuan very confused.

When Shi Zhixuan saw that Shi Qingxuan was still confused, he said to Shi Qingxuan with hatred 
that iron cannot become steel,

"Qingxuan, dad knows that you have an affair with this bastard, and now you are pregnant. If this 
bastard doesn’t give you an explanation, dad will not let him go."

"Pregnant?"

Shi Feixuan and Fan Qinghui exclaimed when they looked at Shi Qingxuan. They had heard this 
rumor before. Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan thought the rumor was false, but now looking at Shi 
Zhixuan's expression, it doesn't look like it is false. Yes? When did this bastard Su Chen get 
involved with Shi Qingxuan?

"I'm not, I'm not pregnant, don't get me wrong."Shi Qingxuan blushed when she saw Fan Qinghui 
and Shi Feixuan looking at her belly and hurriedly explained.

It's just that Shi Qingxuan didn't explain. Her explanation made Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan even 
more sure that Shi Qingxuan might really be pregnant. She didn't want to explain to them without 
blushing.

Su Chen was a little embarrassed now. These were all his nonsense. Su Chen didn't expect that the 
trouble would be like this. He looked at Shi Qingxuan's blushing face and knew that this time No 
matter how she explains, no one here will believe it.

Su Chen has no way to help Shi Qingxuan now. If Su Chen denies that Shi Qingxuan is pregnant, 
Shi Zhixuan, who has schizophrenia, will immediately go berserk and want to kill him.

Yan Jing'an and these The disciples of Cihang Jingzhai are now just a bunch of melon-eaters. They 
did not expect that there would be such interesting things after Fan Qinghui's man appeared. The 



disciples of Yan Jing'an and Cihang Jingzhai have also forgotten that they are prisoners. They all 
stretched out their arms. My neck is listening to these gossips

"Hey, the secret guards took all the people from Cihang Jingzhai back to Luoyang. Youxue, please 
step back too."

"Yes, Your Majesty"

"Yes, master."

After the secret guards left with the prisoners of Cihang Jingzhai, the shadow assassins also 
disappeared one by one. Now only Fan Qinghui, Shi Feixuan, Black Widow, Shi Qingxuan and Shi 
Zhixuan were left at the scene.

Su Chenqin Shi Fei Xuan said to these people,"Well, I will go into the room with Shi Qingxuan to 
talk first, and you guys will wait here for a while."

Su Chen can only tell Shi Qingxuan what happened now, hoping that this elegant woman can 
cooperate with him, otherwise Su Chen may start a war with Shi Zhixuan.

"Shi Qingxuan, I have something to tell you. Come into the room with me."

Chapter 378

Su Chen didn't care about the others. After telling Shi Qingxuan, he went directly into the bamboo 
house. After Su Chen entered the bamboo house, he regretted it. When he entered, he saw colorful 
things on the table. He knew what these things were. After all, he But someone who has several 
wives.

Su Chen was very speechless when he saw these things. How could Shi Qingxuan, an elegant 
woman, leave these in the living room? Was Shi Qingxuan making these bellybands before?

"Close your eyes."

Shi Qingxuan hurriedly ran in after Su Chen came in directly. She remembered that she was 
mending her personal belongings before, and she forgot to put them away before Fan Qinghui and 



Shi Feixuan came. When Shi Qingxuan came in, she saw that The bastard stared at the personal 
belongings on the table, and she shouted to Su Chen with a red face.

"Oh, oh, these are not bad, I quite like them"

"Shut up."

Shi Qingxuan saw this bastard saying these things shamelessly, which made her even more angry. 
What do you like? What does this have to do with you, bastard? Shi Qingxuan stared at this bastard 
and wanted to strangle him to death. Shi Qingxuan panicked and hurriedly put it away. These 
personal belongings of hers.

After packing up her personal belongings, Shi Qingxuan asked Su Chen rudely,"What are you going 
to say to me, you bastard?" And how did you meet Shi Zhixuan?"

Su Chen looked at the beautiful and elegant Shi Qingxuan and told Shi Qingxuan what happened in 
the Han Country in the Eastern Continent. Su Chen also hoped that Shi Qingxuan would not blame 
herself after hearing what she said. After all, it was her father who wanted to kill her. He and Su 
Chen were helpless at that time.

After hearing Su Chen's words, Shi Qingxuan stood up and grabbed Su Chen's clothes and said 
angrily,

"It turns out that you, the bastard, are ruining my reputation. How could you, the bastard, do this? 
How can you let me see anyone in the future?"

Su Chen felt a little embarrassed when he looked at Shi Qingxuan who was so close. He found that 
he actually reacted. How could this be possible? It's not like he didn't have a woman. He couldn't 
see the elegant Shi Qingxuan like this.

Su Chen smelled Shi Qingxuan's Ti Xiang explained,"Shi Qingxuan, I had no choice at that time. 
Your father wanted to kill me. If I didn't say so, I'm afraid your father would have killed me right 
then."

Shi Qingxuan stared at her beautiful eyes and said angrily,



"He is not my father. What does it have to do with me whether you are alive or dead, you bastard?"

Su Chen was also angered by Shi Qingxuan's ruthlessness,"Damn it, Shi Qingxuan, would I have 
said this if your father hadn't come to kill me? This is all caused by your father."

Su Chen looked at Shi Qingxuan's pink face and pinched it. Shi Qingxuan's red face looked like it 
wanted to be bitten. Su Chen shook his head to wake himself up. Now is not the time to think about 
these things. ,

Shi Qingxuan pushed Su Chen and said to her in shame,

"Bastard, I said he is not my father. Explain to them immediately after you go out. I have nothing to 
do with you, and I don’t want to have anything to do with you. This is a pure place. You can get out 
now."

Shi Qingxuan just found out that this bastard has been staring at her. This Wu Xiangjun is not a 
good person at first glance. Shi Qingxuan will not care about the life and death of this bastard. She 
also can't understand how Fan Qinghui and Shi Feixuan could be with this bastard. There is a 
relationship, and it is a somewhat shocking relationship.

Damn it, didn't you say that Shi Qingxuan is a gentle and elegant woman? Why do all the women he 
meets become so grumpy? Su Chen looked at The angry Shi Qingxuan sat directly on the chair next 
to him. If he couldn't get Shi Qingxuan to cooperate this time, he might kill Shi Zhixuan or escape 
immediately with Fan Qinghui and the others.

Su Chen didn't want to escape, and Shi Qingxuan couldn't watch. Watching him and Shi Zhixuan 
fight to the death, Shi Qingxuan should still care about Shi Zhixuan, otherwise Shi Zhixuan would 
not be able to stay here with Ben.

"Shi Qingxuan, you should know that if I go out and explain clearly, your father Shi Zhixuan and I 
will become life-and-death enemies. Do you want me to have a conflict with your father? Maybe 
one of us will die here?"

"Hey, what does your life and death have to do with me? If you want to start a war, stay away from 
me. Don't destroy my small secluded forest building."

"Do you really not care about the life and death of me and your father?"



"Do I have anything to do with you bastard? my father is dead"

"You are considered powerful, Shi Qingxuan, then are you going to collect Shi Zhixuan's body? You 
should know that I have many subordinates here. Although Shi Zhixuan is a great master, it 
shouldn't be difficult for me to kill him."

Su Chen looked at the indifferent Shi Qingxuan and had no choice. It would be crazy to ask this 
cold Shi Qingxuan to help him. He hoped that Shi Zhixuan would not seek death after he got out. If 
Shi Zhixuan really wanted to take action, Su Chen would be merciless. Kill Shi Zhixuan.

Shi Qingxuan is also very entangled now. She knows that what this bastard said has some truth. If 
she does not cooperate with this bastard this time, I am afraid that Shi Zhixuan will definitely fight 
with this bastard after a while. Although Shi Qingxuan hates Shi Zhixuan, she She didn’t want Shi 
Zhixuan to die like this. She was very aware of what Shi Zhixuan had done for her over the years.

""Wait a minute."

Just when Su Chen was about to leave, Shi Qingxuan suddenly stopped him. Su Chen looked at Shi 
Qingxuan who hesitated and was speechless. This beauty stopped her but didn't speak. Did she 
really not want to care about Shi Zhixuan? Life or death?

"Beauty Shi, why did you stop me? If you don't say anything, I will go out and fight Shi Zhixuan."

Su Chen deliberately said to Shi Qingxuan that he was going to start a war with Shi Zhixuan. He 
wanted to see if Shi Qingxuan would stop him.

Shi Qingxuan sighed and said to Su Chen angrily,"I will cooperate with you this time, but you will 
have to Explain these things clearly."

It's impossible for Shi Qingxuan not to care about Shi Zhixuan's life and death. She also saw that 
this bastard's subordinates were extremelyIf there really was a fight, Shi Zhixuan would really be 
killed. With a complicated expression in her eyes, Shi Qingxuan decided to help this bastard once. 
Anyway, her reputation was ruined by this bastard.



"Don't worry, I will definitely explain it clearly to the world in the future."Su Chen said hurriedly 
when he saw Shi Qingxuan agreed.

As for what will happen in the future? Su Chen can just explain it. How could he let go of a 
beautiful woman like Shi Qingxuan? The beauty in his hands is his. Su Chen can do it in the future. 
Take your time to deal with Shi Qingxuan.

Shi Qingxuan looked at Su Chen and asked with disbelief,"Why do I think you are not telling the 
truth?"

Su Chen didn't expect that Shi Qingxuan would see that he was cheating on her, so he hurriedly 
assured Shi Qingxuan,"Everything I said was from the bottom of my heart. I can swear in the name 
of my future wife that I will definitely explain these things in the future. clear"

"Bah, you can tell at a glance that you are not a good person. You still have the nerve to swear on 
your future wife. Whoever wants to marry you in the future will be unlucky for eight lifetimes."

Su Chen looked at Shi Qingxuan and whispered,"Aren't you my future wife?"

"What did you say?"

When Shi Qingxuan saw this bastard muttering, she knew that he didn't have anything nice to say. 
She didn't bother to care about this bastard now. Once she fooled Shi Zhixuan, she would tell this 
bastard to get out of her Youlin Villa immediately.

"Ah, I said let's go out, you just need to cooperate with me for a while."

Chapter 379

Four days later, Su Chen, Fan Qinghui and the others also arrived outside Luoyang City, but there 
was one more Shi Qingxuan among them. There was nothing that could be done about it. Yan 
Jing'an and the others from Cihang Jingzhai were arrested in Youlin Xiaozhu. If Shi Qingxuan 
continues to stay there

, I'm afraid she will be captured by Cihang Jingzhai's people, or even killed on the spot. Shi Zhixuan 
and Fan Qinghui are not worried about Shi Qingxuan, so they took her with them despite Shi 
Qingxuan's protest. Luoyang.



Shi Qingxuan looked at the bastard riding in front of him with an unsympathetic expression. It was 
all this bastard's fault. If it weren't for her, Shi Qingxuan would still be living freely in his small 
house in the forest. Shi Qingxuan wants to beat this bastard right now.

""See you, Your Majesty."

When the soldiers at the entrance of Luoyang City saw Su Chen coming, they left and knelt down to 
salute.

Su Chen was a little strange. These were not his troops directly. How could they have seen him? Su 
Chen was curious about these troops. road,

"Do you know me?"

The general at the gate of Luoyang City said respectfully to Su Chen,

"Your Majesty, the princess specially left your portrait of your Majesty a few days ago. We can 
know that your Majesty has seen your portrait."

This general actually didn't tell the truth. Princess Su Yan said that as long as someone appears with 
some beautiful beauties, that person will most likely be Lord Wu Xiang.

The troops guarding the city gate have been paying attention these days. With this in mind, today 
they saw a man coming with four beauties, and they knew that this man must be Lord Wu Xiang.

When the troops guarding the city gate saluted Su Chen, the people outside Luoyang City also They 
looked at Su Chen curiously. They didn't know who this young man was. But the person who could 
make the Luoyang City Guards salute must be a noble.

"So that’s it, you continue to guard the city gate"

"Yes, Your Majesty."



Su Chen rode his horse and took Fan Qinghui and the others directly into Luoyang City. They came 
to Luoyang City again. Su Chen was considered the master of Luoyang City this time. Wang 
Shichong should have been assassinated by the Shadow Assassin. Dugu The boss has taken refuge 
with him, and Luoyang City will have the final say in the future.

"You bastard took control of Luoyang City?"

Shi Qingxuan was a little surprised when she looked at Su Chen. Luoyang City is the territory of 
Wang Shichong and the Dugu Clan, but? The city guards in Luoyang actually saluted this bastard. 
This obviously means that Luoyang City is the territory of this bastard, which shocked Shi 
Qingxuan

"Uh-huh."

Su Chen nodded arrogantly, looking at Su Chen as a bastard, and Shi Qingxuan couldn't help but 
said,"Uh-huh, you're so stupid, don't you know how to speak well?"

Su Chen didn't expect Shi Qingxuan to say dirty words, which surprised Su Chen. It was like how 
the cold Shi Qingxuan had grown into a Sun Erniang since she was with him.

"Let me tell you, Shi Qingxuan, you want a lady, does the lady know? You are not at all the gentle 
and elegant Mr. Shi that I imagined."

Shi Qingxuan also blushed a little. She didn't know what was wrong with her. Ever since she met 
this bastard, Shi Qingxuan couldn't help but yell at him.

Shi Qingxuan thought about what happened in Youlin Xiaozhu and said to Su Chen in shame and 
anger,

"Do I need to be gentle with you asshole? I haven't settled the matter with you, you bastard, for 
taking advantage of me in Youlin Xiaozhu."

Su Chen was also a little helpless.

If Su Chen didn't stay close to Shi Qingxuan in Youlin Xiaozhu, would his insane father Shi 
Zhixuan believe it?



Su Chen just hugged Shi Qingxuan's waist, but this woman didn't Try to keep a good look on him, 
but he always makes trouble for himself.

When Su Chen saw Shi Qingxuan's shameful and angry look, he smiled and said,

"Shi Qingxuan, didn’t I explain that? That's just to make your father believe that we are a couple. 
Besides, aren't you going to pretend to be pregnant? If your father doesn't believe me if I don't hold 
you, wouldn't your disguise be false?"

"Can you touch me as you please while holding me?"

Shi Qingxuan lowered her head in shame after saying these words. She had just forgotten that Fan 
Qinghui and the others were nearby. Now she had exposed what this bastard Su Chen had done to 
her. Shi Qingxuan looked at her secretly with a red face. Seeing Fan Qinghui and the others, they 
glared at Su Chen.

Su Chen was a little embarrassed. She didn't expect Shi Qingxuan to say this at this time. Did she 
really not care about her reputation? Fan Qinghui and the others heard these words clearly.

Su Chen was also a little helpless because he couldn't control his hands at that time. Shi Qingxuan 
had a very good figure. Su Chen held Shi Qingxuan and wanted to know how good her figure was. 
So his hand couldn't help but measure Shi Qingxuan. figure,

"Forehead! That's why I couldn't hold it back for a while. Who asked you to be so beautiful? It's all 
your fault."

"Shameless."

Fan Qinghui and the others were speechless when they looked at the two people arguing with each 
other in front of them. Shi Qingxuan and Su Chen never stopped calmly along the way. Today they 
even heard the secret between them. This made Fan Qinghui and the others look at Su Chen's eyes 
were a little unkind

"See your Majesty"



""See you, Your Majesty."

Before Su Chen and the others arrived at the Dugu Clan's mansion, the guards here all saluted Su 
Chen.

Su Chen looked at these secret guards and nodded. With these secret guards here, I believe Murong 
Qiudi and Su It is said that nothing will happen to their safety

"father"

"Haha, good daughter."

When Su Chen saw Su Yan running out of the house, he quickly dismounted and hugged Su Yan 
who ran over.

""Husband,"

Murong Qiudi also came out of the house. When she saw Su Chen returning safely, she shouted 
with a smile. When

Su Chen saw the beautiful Murong Qiudi, he hugged Su Yan and walked over to hug Murong Qiudi.

""Madam,"

Murong Qiudi said to Su Chen with a blush after being hugged by Su Chen,"Husband, let me go 
quickly, there are many people here."

"Haha, it’s okay, these are our own people."

Su Chen doesn't care about this. He hasn't seen Murong Qiudi for several months. He doesn't care 
what people here think of him.

After Su Chen and the others entered the house, Xiaomeng, Xue Nu, Shang Xiuxun and Shang 
Xiufang, Zhu Yuyan, Huanwan, Lianxing, and Bai Qing'er were all waiting for Su Chen in the hall.



Su Chen was very excited when he saw the room of peerless beauties. He would never let go of 
these beauties in the future, but that's not what he was thinking about now. At that time, the Jing 
Nian Zen Temple was in Luoyang, where there was a terrestrial immortal in the realm of heaven 
and humanity. Su Chen had to find a way to get rid of the Jing Nian Zen Temple in Luoyang first.

Su Chen let go of Su Yan and Murong Qiudi and walked to Lian Xing. Holding the recovered 
Lianxing, he asked with a smile,

"Lianxing, where is your sister Yaoyue?"

Lianxing blushed while being held by Su Chen and leaned into Su Chen's arms and 
whispered,"Sister has returned to Daming. There are still things to deal with in Yihua Palace. She 
will go to deal with matters in Yihua Palace first."

Su Chen originally wanted Yao Yue to use the Sui Hou Bead. Although the system said that a grand 
master could break through to the Heavenly Realm, Su Chen decided to let Yao Yue, a later grand 
master, use the Sui Hou Bead for the sake of insurance. But now I'm afraid No, that woman Yao Yue 
is not here this time

"Back to Daming? Forget it, Qiudi, you, Fan Qinghui, Zhu Yuyan, Huanwan, and Shi Feixuan will 
find a secret room in a while. I will let you all break through to the level of cultivation of a great 
master."

Chapter 380

Murong Qiudi and Fan Qinghui looked at Su Chen in disbelief. They did not expect that Su Chen 
would promote all five masters to grand masters at once. How could this be possible?

Even Xiao Meng, Xue Nu, and the other five or six people next to them looked at Su Chen in 
disbelief. What Su Chen said was too hard for them to believe. They also didn't believe that Su 
Chen could raise five masters to a great level at once. Grandmaster.

Seeing that Su Chen didn't believe any of this, he took out the Suihou Bead from the system space 
and told them the use of the Suihou Bead, and even told them the spiritual power inside the Suihou 
Bead.



Murong Qiudi looked at the beautiful Suihou Pearl in her hand and asked in disbelief,"Is this true? 
Is there really spiritual power in the Suihou Pearl?"

Su Chen looked at Murong Qiudi and the others' shocked looks. He smiled and said,

"It's true. Originally, I wanted Yao Yue to be promoted to the Heavenly Realm first, but Yao Yue is 
not here now, and the threat from the Jing Nian Chanyuan is too great. We can't wait for Yao Yue to 
return. If you can improve your strength now, you can improve it. This way we will at least have 
some ability to protect ourselves in the future."

"Then let's use the Suihou Pearl now."Murong Qiudi said to Su Chen after knowing that this Suihou 
Pearl could indeed improve his strength,

"Well, of course, the faster you improve your strength, the better. In this way, we can handle it even 
if there are any changes."

"Su Chen, then let’s improve our strength."

"Go ahead."

Su Chen hugged Murong Qiudi and kissed her, and then hugged the pouting Hanwen and kissed 
her. This little enchantress seemed to accept her in the future, and then Su Chen hugged Shi Feixuan 
again. , Fan Qinghui and Zhu Yuyan.

Fan Qinghui and Zhu Yuyan blushed a little when they were hugged by this bastard Su Chen. This 
bastard became more and more bold, and now he dared to hug them in front of so many people. 
This made Fan Qinghui and Zhu Yuyan Zhu Yuyan was a little uncomfortable.

After Murong Qiudi and the other five left, Su Chen looked at the remaining beauties and smiled 
and took out the Heshi Bi. Although this Heshi Bi did not have the Suihou Pearl, it was Heshi Bi. Bi 
is also a rare treasure.

Su Chen looked at the remaining beauties and shook his head. Lianxing and Xiaomeng are powerful 
here. Xue Nu is only a master in the middle stage of the master. She is not as powerful as Black 
Widow. , the rest are some innate cultivation realms, this He's Bi should be able to improve the 
cultivation realm of these innate realm people.



Su Chen looked at the rest and said to Bai Qing'er,"Bai Qing'er, go and get the Dugufeng called 
over"

""Yes, Your Majesty." When

Bai Qing'er saw Su Chen taking out another treasure, her heart became hot. Just now, Huan Huan 
got an opportunity to improve her strength. This time, it should be Wu Xiangjun who wants to 
improve the cultivation of the remaining people. Realm, Bai Qing'er thought that she would 
definitely have a chance this time.

After a while, Bai Qing'er brought the muscular Dugu Feng over. Su Chen's eyes lit up when he saw 
Dugu Feng in a warrior uniform. This Dugu Feng's figure is comparable to Xiaomeng's, and her and 
Xiaomeng's long legs are the prettiest among the girls.

"This is He's Bi. The essence inside can improve your cultivation realm after being absorbed. As for 
how much you can improve, it depends on how much you can absorb. But you must remember to 
do your best and don't absorb too much. You guys are exhausted"

"This time He's Bi will be absorbed by Xue Nu, Shi Qingxuan, Bai Qing'er, Dugu Feng, Shang 
Xiuxun, Shang Xiufang, and Su Yan. Remember, the essence in He's Bi can not only improve your 
strength, but also It can also expand the meridians. You should do your best and don’t absorb too 
much."

""We know,"

Bai Qing'er, Shang Xiuxun and Dugu Feng said hurriedly. They are also looking forward to the 
possibility of improving their strength this time. Anyway, they are either Su Chen's men or Su 
Chen's women, and they will not be polite to Su Chen.

Shi Qingxuan Monk Xiufang was a little hesitant. They had nothing to do with Su Chen, a bastard. 
Su Chen asked them to improve their strength this time. Although it was very attractive, Shi 
Qingxuan, Shang Xiufang and the others still didn't want to absorb this He's Bi.

"Got it dad, let’s go and absorb it quickly, I’m going to become a martial arts master."



No matter how much Su Yan does, she is very happy to be able to improve her strength this time. 
The Zhu Guo was used by her to regulate her body last time. If she absorbs the essence of He's Bi 
this time, she might be able to advance to the innate level. , Su Yan didn't want to give up this 
opportunity.

Su Yan took Bai Qing'er and Xue Nu and ran outside. Shang Xiuxun took Shang Xiufang and Dugu 
Feng, who were not romantically involved, and went out together. Shi Qingxuan stood still and 
didn't move. , Shi Qingxuan didn't want to get the benefits of Su Chen, a bastard, for no reason.

Su Chen asked suspiciously when he found that Shi Qingxuan was standing aside and did not go 
with Bai Qing'er and the others,

"Shi Qingxuan, why don’t you go?"

"I have nothing to do with you bastard, just forget about improving your strength."

"Don't we have a relationship?"

Su Chen was a little speechless when he heard Shi Qingxuan's words. This Shi Qingxuan is also a 
bit arrogant. It seems that she will be given a strong medicine.

Su Chen walked to Shi Qingxuan and suddenly hugged her and kissed her. Shi Qingxuan was in Su 
Chen's eyes. She was on guard against this bastard when she came over. She was afraid that this 
bastard would do something outrageous again, but she didn't expect that this bastard Su Chen would 
hug her and kiss her in an instant.

Shi Qingxuan looked at Su Chen with wide eyes. Kissing herself, she even forgot to push this 
bastard away. Su Chen hugged Shi Qingxuan and kissed her for a while, then let go of her and said 
with a smile,

"Now we have a relationship, my mother. Shi

Qingxuan reacted and punched the shameless man,"Shameless, you go to hell.""

Su Chen directly grabbed Shi Qingxuan's fist and said with a smile,"Haha, you are no match for me. 
Now hurry up and absorb He's Bi. When you become stronger, you can teach me a lesson."



"You bastard, wait for me, I won't let you go."

Shi Qingxuan looked at Xiaomeng and Lianxing with a red face and hurriedly ran out. She didn't 
want to be embarrassed here. As for that bastard Shi Qingxuan, she wouldn't let him go.

"You are so shameless."

Xiao Meng looked at Su Chen and smiled and said, although Su Chen is a bit shameless as a 
bastard, Xiao Meng also saw that Su Chen was doing this for Shi Qingxuan's good, otherwise Su 
Chen would not have treated Shi Qingxuan like this.

"I have something even more shameless, Xiaomeng, do you want us to try it later?"

"Get lost, I don't want to try"

"Haha, Black Widow, sent people to look for Lu Xiaofeng, Sikong Zhaixing, Ximen Chuixue and 
others in Luoyang City, and asked them to come to Dugu Mansion tomorrow."

"Yes, master."

After Su Chen saw Black Widow leaving, he hugged Xiaomeng and walked directly to a room. 
When Su Chen left, he winked at Lianxing, which made Lianxing's face flush when he saw Su 
Chen's wink. Very red

"what you do?"Su Chen"

Xiaomeng saw this bastard Su Chen carrying her and walking towards a room. She became very 
nervous. Xiaomeng knew what this bastard was going to do to her, but she was not ready yet.

Su Chen looked at his face Xiaomeng, who started to blush, kissed her and said with a smile,

"You and I will know in a moment."



Xiaomeng blushed when she saw Su Chen's evil smile and started to struggle,"Asshole, let me go 
quickly, we can't do this now."

"It’s late, Mrs. Xiaomeng, today you arefor me"

"Shameless...…"
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