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Sun Buer was very anxious when she saw that Su Chen still refused to let her go with him. Did she 
really just go to see how the Dayuan army was going to attack Chang'an City this time?

Chang'an City is related to the life and death of hundreds of thousands of people. She will not watch 
the Yuan army break through Chang'an City and massacre the people here.

Sun Buer also wanted to know whether the Song Dynasty's army could defend Chang'an City, but 
this bastard detained her as a prisoner, which made Sun Buer very angry.

Su Chen gave Sun Buer the middle finger and said,

"Why don't you tell me what the name of that mountain is? You will be imprisoned for the rest of 
your life."

Su Chen looked at Sun Buer and left with the Yagyu Yuki sisters.

This Sun Buer is really a bit whimsical. He will not believe what Sun Buer said, even if what Sun 
Buer said is true. It was impossible for Su Chen to risk taking her there.

"Shameless bastard, you must die a good death"

-

On the wall of Chang'an,

Mu Guiying stood on the wall wearing a military uniform and felt helpless looking at the dark Yuan 
army under the wall.

Since the Dayuan army appeared, there have been more and more troops under the city wall. Just at 
the east gate of Chang'an City, there are now no less than 100,000 troops.



More and more siege equipment also appeared. Cloud ladders, city-breaking hammers, catapults 
and other siege equipment all appeared in the Yuan army.

Mu Guiying looked at this place and ordered Xiao He who was also dressed in armor next to her,

"Xiaohe, order all the 70,000 elite troops we integrated to guard the east wall of the city. This may 
be Dayuan's main attack gate. The remaining gates should be guarded by the old, weak, sick and 
disabled troops."

"Yes, General."

After Xiao He left, Mu Guiying looked at the Yuan army that was still gathering and shook her 
head.

She knew that if the Song Dynasty did not send troops to support Chang'an City, she might not be 
able to defend Chang'an City.

On the city wall, When Qin Hongmian and the others arrived here, they were very shocked when 
they saw the dark Yuan army under the city wall.

Women like them had no chance to arm such a huge army. They were trembling in their hearts just 
seeing these huge armies. There was no way to move, not to mention the murderous intent erupted 
by this huge army.

Zhong Ling looked at the Dayuan army and asked tremblingly to Mu Guiying beside him,"

"Sister, can Chang'an City be defended?"

"I don’t know, just leave it to fate."

Mu Guiying didn't know how to answer Zhong Ling.

If she said she couldn't hold on, they would be even more frightened. But Mu Guiying didn't want 
to deceive them. She was really powerless this time.



The Song and Yuan armies simply couldn't They are not on the same level. Now these Song armies 
on the city wall are all timid.

If the Yuan army attacks later, I am afraid that there will be deserters in these Song armies 
immediately. By then, I am afraid that it will be difficult for her to control them even if they want 
to. These troops. When

Qin Hongmian and others heard Mu Guiying's words, their faces became even more ugly. They all 
saw from Mu Guiying's expression that she might not be sure about this war. Even General Mu 
Guiying felt that Chang'an City could no longer be defended.

At this time, a secret guard arrived and saluted Mu Guiying and said,"Madam, the secret guard's 
secret message, the master asked me to deliver it to you."

Mu Guiying heard the secret message from the secret guard and it was sent by Su Chenrang. She 
hurriedly opened it and read it.

But after reading it, her face became even more ugly.

Mu Guiying did not expect that Dayuan sent ten more people. Ten thousand troops are trying to 
force her to death!

She is powerless with the current Dayuan army, not to mention the 100,000 Dayuan troops that will 
arrive soon.

Qin Hongmian and the others saw that Mu Guiying had seen the bastard gave her Mi Xin's face was 
very ugly, and they didn't know what happened. Not only did they women think that the bastard had 
escaped Chang'an City? Did this make Mu Guiying look ugly?

Woo! Woo! Woo! Woo!

Right there At this time, the horns of the Dayuan army suddenly sounded again. Mu Guiying and 
the others hurriedly looked at the Dayuan army outside the city wall. At this time, thousands of 
cavalry suddenly appeared in the Dayuan army and came towards Chang'an City. Mu Guiying and 
the others hurriedly looked at the Dayuan army outside the city wall.



Guiying saw thousands of cavalry coming and knew that the Yuan army did not want to attack this 
time. This time it was probably to negotiate or surrender.

"You guys wait for me here while I go down to meet General Dayuan who is coming this time."Mu 
Guiying looked at the approaching Dayuan cavalry and said to Zhong Ling and the others,

"Sister, be careful"

"General Mu, you have to be careful"

"Yes, these Great Yuan aliens are not trustworthy, so don’t believe their words easily."

Qin Hongmian and the others looked at Mu Guiying and said to her worriedly.

This time Dayuan came to negotiate, they were also afraid that it was Dayuan's conspiracy. If 
something happened to Mu Guiying at this time, I'm afraid Chang'an City would be destroyed. It's 
really going to be over

"I will be careful."

Mu Guiying nodded to Qin Hongmian and the others. She looked at the secret guards Su Wu who 
was protecting her and ordered,"Order the secret guards to assemble. I want to see who is leading 
the Yuan army this time?"

"Yes, ma'am."

Qin Hongmian and the others saw Mu Guiying and the secret guards leaving the city wall and 
looked at the Dayuan army outside the city wall. They didn't know that the negotiation would be 
like this, but it was impossible for Dayuan to give up attacking Chang'an City.

Chang'an City In the outer Dayuan army, Zha Yadu and King Jinlun brought the cavalry escort to 
Chang'an City one mile away and waited for the arrival of the Chang'an City guard.



This time they wanted to hate the bastard in Chang'an City to the core. They will all be unwilling to 
kill that bastard this time.

"Dharmaraja, who is that powerful woman who saved us? do you know?"

Zha Yadu was very confused when he thought of the pretty girl who appeared when he was 
arresting them.

If they hadn't met the unidentified powerful woman, I'm afraid he and Jinlun Dharma King would 
have been caught by that charming woman.

Jin Lun Dharma King is also uneasy now. He did not expect that the enchanting woman Su Chen 
has been holding is actually a great master, even more powerful than him.

Those colorless spider webs almost killed him, if not for that enchanting woman To capture him and 
Zha Yadu alive, they must have been killed before they could escape from Chang'an City.

Jin Lun Dharma King was even more frightened by the masked woman who appeared to save them.

That powerful woman was more powerful than he had ever seen in the Yuan Dynasty. The feeling 
that Shi Pang Ban gave him was even stronger, and even that masked woman could kill him with 
just one look.

If that woman hadn't been interested in Su Chen's woman, I'm afraid she wouldn't have cared about 
his life and death with Zha Ya Du.

Chapter 572

Jinlun Dharma King looked at Zha Yadu and said cautiously,"My dear prince, let's not ask who that 
woman is. We can't afford to offend her, not even the Imperial Master. Just pretend that we have 
never met her." She."

Zayadu trembled as he thought of that woman,"Well, well, I know, I don't want to see her again, that 
horrible woman. I almost died just seeing her eyes, that horrible woman That woman is too scary 
and too powerful."



Zha Yadu said and quickly looked around, he was afraid that the scary woman would suddenly 
appear here.

Although Zaya Du was very lustful, that terrifying woman also had a good figure. She might even 
be a peerless beauty.

But he didn't dare to think anything wrong about that powerful and terrifying masked woman. He 
didn't dare to have any ideas about her. He didn't even dare to think about it. He wouldn't anger that 
powerful woman. Fearing women and seeking death

"General Mu Guiying of the Song Dynasty came."After King Jinlun saw the Chang'an city gate 
open, hundreds of guards were protecting a female general coming here. He guessed that the female 
general should be General Mu Guiying who was guarding Chang'an City.

Zha Yadu heard that it was Mu Guiying. When Guiying arrived this time, he thought of the rumors 
that Mu Guiying kept a pretty boy in Chang'an City.

Zayadu did not expect that Mu Guiying really fell out with the Yang family, and even everyone in 
the Yang family might be executed by her. It was just that bewitchment Who is Mu Guiying's pretty 
boy?

This made Zaya Du very interested in that pretty boy.

When Zaya Du saw Mu Guiying coming, he smiled and said,"His Holiness, it seems that something 
happened to the Yang family. , otherwise Chang'an City might not have the turn of Mu Guiying, a 
female general, to defend the city."

Jinlun Dharma King didn't care about Mu Guiying keeping a pretty boy. He was just surprised that 
Mu Guiying could quickly integrate the troops in Chang'an City.

"Well, this Mu Guiying is not simple either. In just a few days after arriving in Chang'an City, she 
not only eliminated the Yang family, she even took control of more than 100,000 troops in Chang'an 
City. Her abilities are also very good."

Zha Yadu licked his lips and said with a smile,"I wonder if Mu Guiying will surrender to our 
Dayuan? I heard that this woman is still very beautiful, but her life is a bit disorderly."



"You will know after a while, Mu Guiying should also know that the Song Dynasty army cannot 
defend Chang'an City with the old, weak, sick and disabled."

On the wall of Chang'an City,

Su Chen put on his mask again and came here with the sisters Yagyu Shengxueji, but this time he 
came a little late. Mu Guiying had already led the secret guards out of the city to negotiate with 
General Dayuan.

Qin Hongmian and the others were very surprised when they found Su Chen's arrival. They thought 
that this bastard had written a letter to Mu Guiying and escaped.

Chen's appearance on the city wall now made them feel a little incredible.

Qin Hongmian looked at Su Chen and was confused. asked,

"You bastard didn't run away?"

Su Chen looked outside Chang'an City and wanted to know who the general of Dayuan's army was 
this time.

He also didn't know what General Dayuan would talk to Mu Guiying this time.

But Su Chen guessed that General Dayuan might have the last thought. You want to recruit Mu 
Guiying to surrender? But this may be in vain.

Mu Guiying will not be surrendered by the Yuan Dynasty. I am afraid that even if Mu Guiying dies 
in battle, he will not be able to surrender to the foreign tribes of the Yuan Dynasty.

Su Chen heard Qin Hongmian's words He couldn't help but cursed and said,

"Just run away, who told you that I ran away? Now hundreds of thousands of troops from the Yuan 
Dynasty are tightly besieging the city of Chang'an. Go out and see if you can escape?"



Qin Hongmian looked like he suddenly realized something and laughed at Su Chen,"Oh? It turns 
out that you escaped, but you were killed by the Yuan army after you failed to escape."

Su Chen didn't expect that after not seeing these women for a while, Qin Hongmian would become 
lawless and dare to laugh at him. This made Su Chen, who was already in a bad mood, threaten Qin 
Hongmian,

"You bastard, Qin Hongmian, are you a little brave now? How dare you laugh at me here?"

Su Chen said and walked towards Qin Hongmian. This woman was a little irritated to him now. He 
was originally worried about the Black Widow not arriving for so long and the additional troops 
sent by Dayuan.

This Qin Hongmian happened to hit him this time. On the muzzle of his gun.

Qin Hongmian was very nervous when she saw Su Chen walking towards him,"What are you going 
to do? There are tens of thousands of Song troops here. You'd better not act rashly, otherwise these 
troops will catch you."

"laugh! Whose army are these? It belongs to Mu Guiying. Whose woman is Mu Guiying? She is my 
woman, do you think these troops dare to attack me?"Su Chen saw Qin Hongmian's scared look and 
said sarcastically, this Qin Hongmian actually threatened him with the army of the Song Dynasty 
here?

Doesn't she know the relationship between Mu Guiying and him?

Does the army of the Song Dynasty here dare to take action against him? ?

It seems that Duan Zhengchun’s mistresses are all big-breasted and stupid women. No wonder they 
were deceived by Duan Zhengchun.

Even after Duan Zhengchun’s death, these mistresses wanted to avenge him. Sure enough, they 
were big-breasted and stupid women. easiest to deceive



"Let me go, what are you going to do? Ruan Xingzhu, please come and save me."Qin Hongmian 
panicked when she saw Su Chen grabbing her arm. She was worried that this pervert would do 
those gangster things to her.

Ruan Xingzhu, Gan Baobao, Mu Wanqing and other women saw Su Chen grabbing her arm. Qin 
Hongmian, they wanted to save Qin Hongmian.

But when they saw Yagyu Yuki and Yagyu Piaoxu standing in front of them, they women did not 
dare to move.

Yagyu Yuki and the sisters were no match. , not to mention that there are dozens of guards of this 
bastard around, and when the Song army here saw this, they pretended not to see it.

This made Ruan Xingzhu and the others know that there was nothing they could do to save Qin 
Hongmian. Maybe Qin Hongmian this time Will Mian really be humiliated by this bastard?

"Ha ha! Even if you scream, no one will come to save you."Su Chen hugged Qin Hongmian and 
laughed and walked into a fortress on the city wall.

This time he had to teach the somewhat arrogant Qin Hongmian a lesson to see if she would dare to 
laugh at him in the future.

"Let go of my mother, you damn bastard, and I will kill you."

Mu Wanqing saw Su Chen carrying her mother into the nearby fortress, and she was about to save 
her mother, but A'Zhu and Zhong Ling hurriedly stopped Mu Wanqing.

A'Zhu and the others didn't want Mu Wanqing to After being killed by the sisters Yagyu Yukiji, they 
could only stop Mu Wanqing from letting her pass.

Outside Chang'an City, Mu Guiying led the secret guards to the opposite side of the Dayuan army. 
When she looked at the Dayuan army, she discovered Jinlun Dharma King was also here, which 
surprised her.

Mu Guiying did not expect that Jinlun Dharma King could leave Chang'an City alive. Could it be 
that that bastard Su Chen didn't have the ability to kill Jinlun Dharma King?



Zha Yadu felt refreshed when he saw the heroic appearance. And Mu Guiying, who is also very 
beautiful, is moved. Although Mu Guiying has some irregularities in his life, he doesn't care about 
it.

If he can persuade this beautiful Mu Guiying to surrender, Zayadu will not only get a capable 
woman General, you can even enjoy this beautiful general.

Thinking of this, Zayadu smiled and said to Mu Guiying,"General Mu Guiying, I am the 
commander-in-chief of the Dayuan army this time. Zayadu is also fighting against Dayuan." The 
little prince of the empire"

"This time I came to negotiate with you because I hope you can surrender to our Dayuan. You 
should understand that you can’t hold Chang’an City. As long as you surrender to our Dayuan, I can 
make an exception and let you be my woman."

"You can even become the female general of our Dayuan in the future. I can give you all the glory, 
wealth, power and status in the future."

"How about it? Do you agree to surrender to us Dae Yuan and be my woman?"

Chapter 573

After hearing Zha Yadu's words, Mu Guiying looked at him coldly. She did not expect that this 
young prince of Dayuan was also a lustful playboy.

Zha Yadu not only asked her to surrender to Dayuan this time, he even wanted to become this 
perverted woman himself.

When Mu Guiying heard this, she wanted to stab this lecherous Zayadu to death.

Although he was the commander-in-chief of the Dayuan army's attack on Chang'an City, Mu 
Guiying looked at this young prince and knew that he was a good-for-nothing dude.

If King Jinlun hadn't been here this time, Mu Guiying would have killed the commander of the 
Yuan army.



Anyway, it was difficult for her to hold Chang'an City. If the commander of the Yuan army was 
killed here, it would be worth it for Mu Guiying to die in this war.

But there was no one here who could rival Jinlun Dharma King, so Zha Yadu had no choice but to 
give up on killing this young prince.

Mu Guiying was riding on a war horse and said to Zha Yadu expressionlessly,

"Little Prince Zha Yadu, don’t be wishful thinking here. If you want to break through Chang’an 
City, you can only pass through my body, Mu Guiying. It is impossible for me to surrender to you, 
the foreign tribe of the Great Yuan Dynasty. There is no need for you to waste your efforts here."

"Mu Guiying, aren't you afraid of death?"

"fear death? Of course I'm afraid of death, but even if I'm afraid of death, I can't surrender to you 
alien race."

"good! good! Mu Guiying, when our Dayuan army breaks Chang'an City, I will order the massacre 
of Chang'an City. I will kill all the chickens and dogs in Chang'an City."

"laugh! Then you must also attack Chang'an City"

"Mu Guiying, wait for my Dayuan army to attack. I hope you will not regret your choice this 
time."Zayadu took one look at the beautiful Mu Guiying, then rode back towards Dayuan's army.

Zayadu did not succeed in recruiting Mu Guiying to surrender this time, and he was not angry. 
Anyway, he attacked Chang'an City this time. Guaranteed victory.

In at most three days, Chang'an City will be captured by their Yuan army.

Mu Guiying will also let people capture her alive. Since Mu Guiying doesn't want to be his woman, 
then capture her and make her his slave girl. It would be nice to have a female general from the 
Song Dynasty as his slave.



Jinlun Dharma King looked at Mu Guiying and left with Zha Yadu.

Jinlun Dharma King had sensed Mu Guiying’s murderous intention just now, but he didn’t even He 
didn't care about Mu Guiying's murderous intention towards Zha Yadu. A woman with an innate 
cultivation level was not worthy of his Jinlun Dharma King personally killing her.

"Let’s go back to Chang’an City."

When Mu Guiying saw Zha Yadu and King Jinlun leaving, she also led the secret guards back to 
Chang'an City. She knew that the Dayuan army would attack soon.

Mu Guiying was now worried about the people of Chang'an City Come to think of it, the Yuan army 
will definitely massacre the city after they break through Chang'an City this time.

After all, Chang'an City is an important city in the north of the Song Dynasty. When foreigners 
conquer some important cities, they usually choose to massacre the city.

Mu Guiying can only pray for the Song Dynasty to meet Reinforcements were sent to save 
Chang'an City, otherwise the hundreds of thousands of Song people in Chang'an City would have 
been massacred by the Yuan army. In

Chang'an City, a woman with a perfect figure wearing a veil and a black widow stood in Chang'an 
City. On a high tower, they watched the Dayuan army outside the city talking to each other.

Black Widow was very helpless now. Originally, she was about to capture Jinlun Dharma King and 
Zha Yadu, but this powerful woman suddenly appeared. Caught herself.

Black Widow had no power to resist in her hands.

This woman was much stronger than her. Black Widow knew from this woman's aura that she must 
be a terrestrial immortal in the heavenly realm.

This woman did not intend to let her go after asking her some strange questions. She even took her 
to Chang'an City to see the upcoming war between the Yuan army and the Song army.



This made the Black Widow worry about this. A strong woman will not let her go,"Senior, I have 
told you everything you need to say, can you let me go, senior?""

The veiled woman looked at the black widow and said to her in a soft voice,

"Don't worry, who is your master? I'm a little curious about him being able to have a great master 
like you as his subordinate."

"I.....My master is not here, he is in the Eastern Continent."The black widow was very nervous 
when she heard that this woman wanted to see Su Chen. The black widow didn't know whether this 
woman was a friend or an enemy. She didn't dare to tell where Su Chen was. If she wanted to take 
action against Su Chen, it wouldn't be her. Did she harm her master?

"Black Widow, are you nervous about your master? In fact, it doesn't matter whether you tell me or 
not. Even if you don't tell me, I can still use the soul-searching secret method to know whether your 
master is here. Can you tell me now?"

"you......."

Black Widow was completely frightened after hearing this woman's words. If this powerful woman 
used the secret soul-searching method on her, I'm afraid this woman would not only know where Su 
Chen was, but even Su Chen's identity would be exposed. Can Black Widow let her know that Su 
Chen was there?

This powerful woman knew that Su Chen was here, so she took out a dagger from her body and 
stabbed it into her heart. The black widow could not let this powerful woman know of Su Chen's 
existence even if she died.

Whoosh!

When this powerful woman saw that Black Widow was about to commit suicide, she waved her 
hand, and Black Widow's dagger was snatched away from her.

She took the dagger and looked at it and threw it aside.



This powerful woman did not expect that the black widow would die without telling her who her 
master was. It seemed that the black widow was loyal to her master, but this made her even more 
sad. She's going to meet the Black Widow's owner.

"You can't die in front of me. Even if you die, I can use the soul-searching secret method to know 
where your master is. If you commit suicide again, I won't stop you. I can find your master 
anyway."

"I can tell you where my master is, but you must swear not to hurt my master."Black Widow has no 
choice. This woman's methods are too sinister. If

Black Widow doesn't agree to this woman, even if she commits suicide, I'm afraid this powerful 
woman can use the soul-searching secret method to know everything about Su Chen in her mind. 
Something.

The woman looked at Black Widow, smiled and said softly,

"I have no interest in killing here. If I don’t find someone, I want to find someone and live in 
Chang’an City for a while. I have no interest in killing your master. You can rest assured."

"Come with me, I hope you keep your word."

Black Widow looked at this powerful woman and nodded.

She thought that this woman was a terrestrial immortal in the heavenly realm, so she shouldn't lie. 
And even if Black Widow didn't agree now, it would be fine.

On the wall of Chang'an City,

Mu Gui When Ying came back, she saw that Zhong Ling and the others seemed to be under control, 
and they were still controlled by two beautiful women and dozens of secret guards. This made Mu 
Guiying look a little confused. Mu Guiying knew this. They were all subordinates of that bastard Su 
Chen. Did that bastard Su Chen come over? But why did he control women like Zhong Ling?

When Zhong Ling saw Mu Guiying arriving, she hurriedly shouted to her,



"Sister Mu Guiying, please go and save Sister Wanqing’s mother Qin Hongmian. She was captured 
by that bastard and taken to the fortress to be humiliated. Sister Mu Guiying, please go and save Qin 
Hongmian."

"Damn you pervert, does he want to die?"

Chapter 574

Mu Guiying was very surprised when she heard Zhong Ling's words. She didn't expect that bastard 
Su Chen would arrest a woman and humiliate her when he arrived. That damn bastard was really a 
hopeless pervert.

"Sorry ma'am, you can't go in."

Just when Mu Guiying was about to enter the fortress angrily, Yagyu Xueji and Yagyu Piaoxu 
stopped Mu Guiying.

They didn't care whether Mu Guiying was Su Chen's wife, but they couldn't do it without the 
master's order. May let anyone into the fort

""Get out of the way."

Mu Guiying did not expect that these two beautiful beauties would dare to stop her. This made Mu 
Guiying angry and shouted at sisters Yagyu Yuki.

Yagyu Yuki and Yagyu Piaoxu did not get out of the way. Yagyu Yuki faced Mu Guiying saluted and 
said,"Madam, you are not allowed to go in without the master's order. Madam, please don't 
embarrass us.""

"Come on, get them for me."Mu Guiying looked at Yagyu Xueji and Yagyu Piaoxu and knew that 
they could not get out of the way easily. She ordered the surrounding secret guards.

After Mu Guiying ordered, she suddenly saw the secret guards standing There was no movement 
there, which made Mu Guiying furious.



She thought that these secret guards were all that bastard's men, and now that bastard was inside, 
these secret guards must not dare to disturb that bastard.

Mu Guiying was angry He ordered again to the surrounding secret guards,"Didn't you hear my 
order? Come to me, don't forget that you are all my guards now."

Hundreds of secret guards bowed their heads after hearing Mu Guiying's order.

The secret guards would not obey Mu Guiying's orders at this time. The person inside was their 
Lord Wu Xiang.

They were all direct The secret guards belonging to the king, although they are now owned by Mrs. 
Mu Guiying, they still take charge of the king's matters concerning the king, Wu Xiangjun.

"You are all assholes."

Mu Guiying has no choice now. The fortress is guarded by these two beauties and dozens of secret 
guards. Now her secret guards do not obey her orders. It is impossible for her to rush in.

Mu Guiying She looked at Zhong Ling and the others awkwardly and sat next to them. Now she 
could only wait for that bastard Su Chen to come out.

Zhong Ling and the others saw that there was nothing they could do when they saw Mu Guiying. 
None of the guards here followed Mu Guiying's orders. They also knew that Mu Guiying was 
helpless against that bastard now.

When Mu Wanqing saw this, she collapsed on the ground. She knew that everything was over. Her 
mother had probably been humiliated by that bastard.

Mu Wanqing looked at it angrily. Xiang Bao could not wait for that bastard to come out and kill 
him.

At this moment, two women suddenly appeared here. After the two women appeared, the secret 
guards pointed at them with their air-breaking crossbows.



"Stop it all."

Black Widow hurriedly shouted when she saw that the secret guards were trying to kill them.

"Met the adults."

When the secret guards discovered that it was the Black Widow, they all received their Qi-breaking 
crossbows and saluted the Black Widow,

"Everyone, get up. Where is the master?"

"My lord, the master is in the fortress."

After the Black Widow heard this, she looked towards the fortress next to her, but she saw 
Yukihime Yagyu and her sisters guarding the fortress, while the women next to them looked at the 
fortress unkindly, which made the Black Widow a little confused. What happened here?

The veiled woman's eyes lit up when she looked at the secret guards here. She didn't expect that the 
guards here would be so elite.

Moreover, these guards actually had Qi-breaking crossbows. This was a big surprise. She became 
more interested in Black Widow's owner

""I have met the master."

Yagyu Yuki and Yagyu Piaoxu knew that this black widow was Su Chen's woman, but the guards 
here did not call her madam but called her"sir". Yagyu Yuki's sisters also followed suit and called 
the black widow"sir"

"The master is here?"

"Yes, the master has something to do inside. No one can enter without the master's order."

"I see."



The Black Widow didn't dare to go in after hearing Yagyu Yukiji's words. She just asked this 
powerful woman to wait for Su Chen here. She didn't know if she would be angry. The

Black Widow said carefully to the veiled woman," Senior, why don't we wait for a while, the master 
may have something to do inside."

"Can"

"Thank you."

When the Black Widow saw that the powerful woman agreed, she hurriedly arranged for the secret 
guards to move tables and chairs for the powerful woman to sit here and rest.

Mu Guiying was very curious when she looked at the Black Widow and the veiled woman. She 
could tell that the black widow was Su Chen's subordinate.

But the veiled woman made Mu Guiying very puzzled. The black widow was cautious about this 
woman, as if she was afraid that the veiled woman would be angry.

This veiled woman Who is the veiled woman?

Woo! Woo! Woo! Woo!

Mu Guiying suddenly heard the horn sound of the Dayuan army and stood up hurriedly. She knew 
that the Dayuan army was about to attack.

This war is the real beginning. Got it

"Beat the war drum and prepare to face the enemy!"

"Yes, general!"

Boom! Boom! Boom! Boom!



As the war drums of the Song Dynasty sounded, the Song Dynasty troops on the wall of Chang'an 
City hurriedly took their weapons and looked at the Yuan army outside the city wall.

Outside Chang'an City, ten The tens of thousands of troops were divided into several battle 
formations and marched towards Chang'an City.

Mu Guiying and others felt the powerful murderous aura erupted from the Yuan army on the city 
wall.

These battle-hardened Yuan armies were stronger than those of the Song Dynasty. Too many.

Mu Guiying watched the Yuan army approach Chang'an City step by step. She looked seriously at 
the Song army on the city wall and ordered,

"Archers prepare!"

"Archers prepare! Archers prepare!"The messenger hurriedly repeated Mu Guiying's order and 
shouted loudly on the city wall,"

Tap! Tread! Tread! Tread!"

The Dayuan army stomped with heavy footsteps and stopped outside the shooting range of the 
Chang'an City archers. Tens of thousands of Dayuan troops looked at Chang'an City without 
making a sound. Outside Chang'an City, there were only the gasps of Dayuan troops and the 
neighing of war horses.

Standing in front of the Dayuan army with high spirits, Zha Ya Du shouted loudly to the people on 
Chang'an City. Mu Guiying said,

"Mu Guiying, it's still too late for Dayuan to surrender with your army. This is your final surrender."

"You are dreaming. Even if our Song army dies in battle, we still cannot surrender to your Yuan 
tribe."Mu Guiying didn't expect that Zayadu was still obsessed with her. She knew Zayadu's evil 
intentions.



Mu Guiying looked back at the fortress and was very angry. She was about to go to war with the 
Yuan army now.

But that The bastard was actually having fun in the fortress on the city wall, and even the women 
were forced to do so.

Although Mu Guiying didn't mind Su Chen having fun, she also understood that it had to be done at 
some point, and that men had three wives and four concubines. It's just that this bastard forced a 
decent woman to make her very angry.

Forget it, they would all be killed by the Yuan army in a few days anyway, so let this bastard do 
whatever he wants.

Mu Guiying shook her head and no longer wanted to care. Su Chen is such a bastard.

When Zayadu saw that Mu Guiying was still stubborn, he waved his hand and shouted an order,

"Attack, after breaking the city, Dayuan's warriors can kill the Central Plains people in the city at 
will."

"kill! kill! Kill!"
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Following Zha Yadu's order, the Dayuan army in one phalanx of the Dayuan army rushed towards 
Chang'an City pushing a ladder, while the Dayuan army in another phalanx pushed a huge Breaking 
the city and beating towards the city gate to kill.

When Mu Guiying saw the Dayuan army beginning to attack the city, he hurriedly 
ordered,"Archers, shoot arrows.""

"Archers, shoot! Archers, shoot!......"

Swish swish swish swish......



The Song army on the wall of Chang'an began to shoot at the Dayuan army below the city. For a 
while, the sky was filled with arrows and they were shot at the Dayuan army. Although the Dayuan 
army was protected by shields, there were still many Dayuan soldiers. shot to death

"Damn it, order our archers to shoot the Song army on the wall."Zha Yadu saw that the Yuan army 
was suppressed by the Song army, and there were casualties even at the beginning of the war, he 
angrily ordered to the messenger,

"Yes, General."

Jinlun Dharma King saw Zha Yadu's angry look and tried to dissuade him,"Little prince, we can't 
break Chang'an City today. You should understand this."

"I know that today we are just trying the defense of Chang'an City, and tomorrow will be the real 
attack of our Dayuan army."

Jinlun Dharma King nodded his head as Zha Yadu was able to control his emotions and said,

"As long as you understand, we have more than 200,000 troops. Even the old, weak, sick and 
disabled troops of the Song Dynasty cannot stop our Yuan army from attacking."

"Today we also want to let the Song army see the strength of our Yuan army. As long as we cause 
some damage to the Song army today, I am afraid there will be deserters from the Song army 
tomorrow, and even some Song troops will surrender to our Yuan army."

Zayadu nodded when he heard the words of Jinlun Dharma King. These were all strategies 
discussed by their generals.

Although Zayadu was very unhappy, in order to get this military honor, Zayadu had no choice but to 
Follow the strategies of the generals to attack Chang'an City.

On the wall of Chang'an City,

Mu Guiying saw the archers of the Yuan army shooting down the Song army on the wall. She also 
ordered the army to shoot those archers first while dodging the arrows.



But many soldiers of the Song Dynasty were still shot dead by the archers of the Yuan army. When

Mu Guiying saw the Yuan army pushing the huge broken city and beating them under the cover of 
the shield soldiers, she He commanded expressionlessly,

"Get ready to log!"

"Get ready to log! Get ready to log!......"

"Throwing logs"

"Throw the log! Throw the log!......."

Following Mu Guiying's order, the Song army carried huge rolling logs and pushed them under the 
city wall. For a time, countless rolling logs were pushed down from the city wall.

The Dayuan army under the city wall wanted to avoid the huge rolling logs when they saw them. 
However, there were too many Dayuan troops here, so they could only watch as the huge rolling 
logs fell towards them.

The Dayuan army under the city wall was instantly covered with blood after being hit by rolling 
logs. Broken arms and limbs were everywhere, and rivers of blood immediately flowed under the 
city wall.

"Get away quickly, ah!"

"Go back, go back quickly"

"Get out of the way, let me out"

"Damn it, get out of here."



The Dayuan army under the city wall was hit by countless rolling logs and suffered heavy 
casualties. They all shouted to avoid these huge rolling logs.

However, the rolling logs were still pushed down from the city wall. Although the Dayuan soldiers 
held up their shields to protect them. , but the huge rolling wood directly smashed these Dayuan 
soldiers to pieces.

"Prepare kerosene and burn those broken city hammers for me."Mu Guiying saw that the crisis at 
the city gate had been resolved. She looked at several huge city-breaking hammers and ordered,

"Yes, General."

Ruan Xingzhu and the others felt very uncomfortable when they saw the cruel war. Although they 
were prepared for the cruelty of the war, women like them couldn't help but vomit when they saw 
broken arms and limbs and even blood everywhere under the city wall. Come out.

Mu Guiying looked at these women and frowned. These women should not stay here. If they are 
allowed to vomit here, I am afraid that the surrounding Song troops will be infected by them and 
will vomit.

"General, the ladder, the ladder of the Yuan army is coming."When a messenger next to Mu Guiying 
saw dozens of huge ladders being pushed over, he hurriedly said to Mu Guiying,

"Order archers, rockets ready"

"Archers, rockets ready! Archers, rockets ready!......."

"target ladder, put"

"Target ladder, shoot arrows! Target ladder, shoot arrows!......."

Swish swish swish swish......

A series of rockets were fired at the huge ladder, but this time the rockets did not ignite the ladder at 
all. The rockets on the ladder did not ignite the ladder until it went out.



"Animal skin? The ladder was covered with a layer of animal skin that had been treated to prevent 
fire."When Mu Guiying saw that the rocket was useless, she discovered the condition of the ladder's 
surface.

"Someone came and ordered Lieutenant General Xiao He to gather on the city wall with the 
spearmen."Mu Guiying can only rely on the city wall to block the enemies on the ladder.

Mu Guiying does not want the enemies on the ladder to reach the city wall. If the Yuan army climbs 
the city wall, I am afraid the Song army will appear. Huge casualties, which is very detrimental to 
the defense of Chang'an City

"Yes, General."

Zhong Ling endured her physical discomfort and nervously said to Gan Baobao with a long sword,

"Mother, can we help too later? Those huge ladders, like Sister Mu Guiying's army, cannot stop 
their arrival."

Gan Baobao patted Zhong Ling on the back and said comfortingly,"Let's take a look. If General Mu 
Guiying's army can't stop it, we will help kill the enemy."

Ruan Xingzhu and the others nodded beside them.

After all, this is related to national justice. Although they were frightened by the cruelty of the army, 
this is a life-and-death war.

If they had the ability at this time and did not help, I am afraid that Chang'an City After being 
broken, their fate will be very miserable.

Bang!

At this time, the door of the fortress on the city wall suddenly opened, and a disheveled woman 
staggered out and appeared. After she came out, she hurriedly ran towards the wooden wall. 
Wanqing and the others



"Mother"

"Qin Hongmian!"

"Aunt Qin!"

""Senior sister,"

Mu Wanqing and the others shouted when they saw Qin Hongmian coming out disheveled. When 
they saw Qin Hongmian's disheveled appearance, they guessed what happened to her.

They were now more certain that Qin Hongmian had already I was insulted by that bastard

"Mother, are you okay?"Mu Wanqing asked hurriedly when she saw Qin Hongmian sweating 
profusely.

Although she knew that her mother Qin Hongmian had been insulted by that bastard, she saw Qin 
Hongmian sweating profusely and panting. She was afraid that her mother would be harmed in 
some other way

"I'm fine, just a little tired."

Chapter 576

Qin Hongmian is really afraid of that bastard now. That bastard Su Chen is not a human being at all. 
She was tortured to death by that bastard in the fortress.

Qin Hongmian is still very scared when he thinks about it now. Qin Hongmian will never dare to 
provoke that bastard again.

Qin Hong wiped the sweat from her head and patted Mu Wanqing's back. She didn't have any 
strength now, but when she saw her daughter Mu Wanqing's worried look, she wanted to comfort 
her.



At this time,

Su Chen walked out of the fortress with a smile, holding a chicken feather. He felt much more 
comfortable now. I am afraid that Qin Hongmian would not dare to offend him in the future.

Su Chen made Qin Hongmian laugh for almost half the time. It took an hour, but he almost couldn't 
hold back and wanted Qin Hongmian.

Su Chen looked at Qin Hongmian's daughters who were afraid of him and smiled. After this time, 
these women would probably stay on their own for a while, otherwise Qin Hongmian's fate would 
be their example.

Su Chen was surprised when he saw the sounds of fighting and shouting on the city wall,"Huh? The 
war has started?"

After Su Chen came out, Yagyu Yuki and Yagyu Yuki and the secret guards saluted Su Chen, and 
Ruan Xingzhu When they saw Su Chen coming out, they all avoided Su Chen's eyes. They didn't 
want to be caught and humiliated by this bastard.

Mu Wanqing was pulled by Qin Hongmian to prevent her from offending Su Chen. Qin Hongmian 
was afraid that that bastard Su Chen would do that to her daughter.

The black widow came to Su Chen and knelt down to him and said,"Master, I'm back, but I didn't 
complete the master's mission. Please punish me."

Su Chen raised the black widow's chin and asked doubtfully,

"Black Widow, tell me what happened? With your strength, King Jinlun and Zha Yadu should be 
able to capture them."

The black widow looked at the powerful veiled woman next to her. She also knew that she could 
not offend her now, otherwise the master and everyone here would be killed by her. The black 
widow could only deceive Su Chen first and said,

"Master, this was an accident. I met a senior on the road and was accidentally escaped by King 
Jinlun and Zha Yadu."



Su Chen looked at the veiled woman next to him after hearing Black Widow's words. He knew that 
Black Widow would carry out his orders very seriously.

Although Black Widow said that she had met this woman, she did not capture Jinlun Dharma King 
and Zha. Yadu.

But Su Chen believed even more that it was the veiled woman who threatened the black widow and 
allowed King Jinlun and Yadu to escape.

"Come on, we didn’t catch Jinlun Dharma King and Zha Yadu. We can just catch them later."

"Yes, master."

Black Widow stood up and stood next to Su Chen after hearing Su Chen's words. She was also 
worried that this woman of unknown origin would take action against Su Chen.

Although she was not the opponent of this veiled woman, she only needed to buy Su Chen some 
time. Su Chen could use his teleportation to escape.

When Su Chen looked at the veiled woman, he felt that she was very dangerous.

Who was this woman who suddenly appeared?

Why did he want to save Jinlun Dharma King and Zha Yadu?

Could it be that she Also from Dayuan?

Su Chen looked at the woman drinking tea leisurely and said deliberately,"Who is this woman? 
Why are you wearing a veil? Is it shameful?"

"Are you not only wearing a mask, you bastard?"Mu Wanqing shouted unceremoniously to Su Chen 
from a distance.



Mu Wanqing now hates this bastard Su Chen very much. She didn't expect that this bastard really 
did something to insult her mother. If she hadn't Her strength is not good enough, now she wants to 
tear this bastard into pieces

"Qin Hongmian, take care of your daughter, otherwise you will know the consequences." Su Chen 
threatened Qin Hongmian by shaking the chicken feathers in his hand.

Qin Hongmian hugged Mu Wanqing in panic and said hurriedly,"I....I know she won't dare to do 
this again."

"It'd better be so."

When the veiled woman heard Su Chen's words, she lifted her veil and took a sip of tea. She didn't 
pay attention to the provocative words Su Chen said. The owner of this black widow seems to have 
an identity. He is also wearing a mask here, maybe he just doesn't want to Let the people here 
discover his identity.

This made her feel a little bit amused when she was bored.

When the black widow heard Su Chen provoking the veiled woman, she anxiously reminded Su 
Chen in his ear,"Master, she Very powerful, her strength is probably that of a land fairy in the 
heavenly realm"

【I guess?】

【Is this woman a deity in the realm of heaven and earth?】

【Me him? Him! This is really hell】

【Why are so many powerful women appearing during this time?】

【He had just finished Madam Ye Di not long ago, so why did a terrestrial fairy in the female 

heavenly realm appear again today? 】



Su Chen was speechless looking at this veiled woman who seemed to have no strength at all. He 
was now worried that he would be retaliated against for provoking this woman just now.

Su Chen initially felt that this veiled woman was very dangerous, so he guessed that she might be a 
great master.

Who the hell knew that this veiled woman could actually be a deity in the realm of heaven and 
earth?

Su Chen felt that he was seeking death by causing trouble again.

Su Chen looked at the city wall and saw that some Dayuan soldiers had already attacked the city 
wall. He said to Black Widow and the others,

"Black Widow, take Yagyu Yuki and the others to help Mu Guiying, and send someone to inform Fu 
Hongxue and Shangguan Jinhong that they are needed here to help."

"Yes, master"

"Qin Hongmian, you all go and help defend the city. This is not a place for you to go sightseeing."

"we know."

Su Chen saw that Black Widow, Qin Hongmian and others had gone to help defend the city, so he 
waved to the secret guards next to him and told them to leave. Su Chen wanted to meet this veiled 
woman.

"What's your last name, beauty?"

Su Chen came and sat down next to the veiled woman. He was very curious about this veiled 
woman coming here. The veiled woman didn't teach him a lesson just now.

Su Chen guessed that she might have some purpose in approaching him, and he didn't He was afraid 
that the veiled woman would suddenly take action against him.



The veiled woman frowned when she saw Su Chen sitting next to her and said softly,"I'm just a 
shameless woman, what's the use of knowing my name?""

The veiled woman doesn't want any man to get close to her. None of these stinky men are good.

Just now, the owner of the black widow bullied that woman in the fortress. The veiled woman 
knows that this man is also a lustful person.

"makes sense."

Su Chen touched his chin solemnly and said.

The veiled woman looked at this bastard in surprise. She didn't think that this bastard actually dared 
to say this.

Just now, the black widow secretly told this bastard that she was a master in the heaven and human 
realm. , but she heard it clearly.

She didn't expect that after this man knew that she was a land god in the heavenly realm, this 
bastard would dare to provoke her.

This made her look at this bastard very surprised,

"Do you want to die?"

Su Chen felt that the veiled woman's powerful aura was intimidating him, and he was not afraid. If 
this veiled woman wanted to kill him, I'm afraid she wouldn't be here to drink tea leisurely.

"Your voice is really nice, soft and cold. As soon as I hear your voice, I know that you are a 
beautiful woman. Why don't you let me see your beautiful face?"
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The veiled woman looked at Su Chen and felt that he was very bold. Now he dared to tease her. The 
veiled woman thought that no one had dared to tease her like this for decades. This made the veiled 
woman look at Su Chen in a daze. morning.



Su Chen looked at this veiled woman while drinking tea. Now he also wants to know who this 
veiled woman is.

There are not many land fairy women in the Celestial Realm. Su Chen knows a lot of land fairy 
women in the Celestial Realm, but who is this veiled woman?

Su Chen also had some guesses.

The veiled woman looked at Su Chen who was also drinking tea leisurely and said with a 
smile,"You are really brave, aren't you afraid that I will kill you?"

"you can't kill me"

"are you sure?"

Su Chen is not afraid of this veiled woman. It's just that this veiled woman has murderous intentions 
towards him. Su Chen can teleport away immediately. Although this veiled woman is powerful, she 
really can't do anything to him.

Su Chen took a sip of tea. He smiled and said,"Of course, if you don't have any strength, would you 
dare to talk to you like this in the heavenly realm?"

"It's not like I haven't seen land gods in the heavenly realm. Even my woman has land gods in the 
heavenly realm, and there are more than one. Do you think I will be afraid of you?"

The veiled woman doesn't believe what Su Chen said. The land gods in the Celestial Realm are 
almost a hundred years old, and this little bastard is only in his twenties. How could he have 
anything to do with a woman in the Celestial Realm?

"hehe! You little bastard didn't even blink when you said such big things. It seems like you really 
lied a lot."



Su Chen stood up and looked at the veiled woman and said seriously,"You don't believe it? The 
Marquis Bai Ruobing of the Eastern Continent and the Eastern Emperor Taiyi of the Yin Yang 
Family are both my women. If you don’t believe me, you can go and ask?"

Su Chen also wants to shock this veiled woman now. He can only use the mysterious woman 
Donghuang Taiyi in this way first, and apologize to her again when he sees Donghuang Taiyi later.

Su Chen is also afraid that Bai Ruobing is not this person. The opponent of the veiled woman is 
Donghuang Taiyi. With the two of them here, even if the veiled woman is really powerful, I am 
afraid she cannot be the opponent of Bai Ruobing and Donghuang Taiyi.

"who are you?"

The veiled woman looked at Su Chen and asked in disbelief.

She had been to the Eastern Continent and knew about the Marquise of the Cold Country in the 
Eastern Continent. The veiled woman did not expect that this man was the Marquise's man. This 
made her feel very An accident.

If she hadn't been looking for someone and had no time to check out the Marquise's man, she could 
have found out who this man was in the Eastern Continent.

And the mysterious Eastern Emperor Taiyi of the Yin Yang Family was also this man's woman. It 
was something she didn't expect

"you guess?"

Su Chen leaned on the chair and looked at the surprised Jellyfish Yin Ji and smiled.

This Jellyfish Yin Ji has been to the Eastern Continent to look for Shi Guanyin. She must also know 
about Bai Ruobing.

This time Su Chen will be very angry with this The jellyfish Yinji who grabbed his women 
everywhere.



When the jellyfish Yinji saw this bastard who was deliberately teasing her, she immediately grabbed 
his neck and threatened,

"Bastard, are you going to tell me?"

"Let me go, let me go if you want to be a man or a woman or not."Su Chen panicked when the 
veiled woman suddenly strangled his neck.

He didn't expect the veiled woman to take action so quickly, and he didn't even have time to react.

"Tell me who you are or you might die?"The veiled woman grabbed Su Chen's neck and threatened 
Su Chen.

Now she doesn't want to continue guessing with this bastard. This bastard makes her very 
interested. She is also very curious about the identity of this bastard.

Su Chen is now After being choked by this veiled woman, she shouted directly,"Jellyfish Yinji, let 
me go, are you going to kill me?""

"Do you know who I am? How can this be?"Jellyfish Yinji didn't expect that this bastard actually 
knew her identity, which made her feel that this bastard was not simple.

Jellyfish Yinji hadn't appeared in the world for decades. If she hadn't come out to look for Shi 
Guanyin, I'm afraid she would have never been there. He would never appear in the arena in 
Shenshui Palace.

Su Chen heard the veiled woman admit that he was the Jellyfish Yin Ji, which made Su Chen's 
guess correct. This woman must have come to the Song Dynasty to catch Stone Guanyin.

This The homosexual is really chasing after his wife Shi Guanyin. Fortunately, Shi Guanyin has 
left, otherwise this pervert would really find her. But is n't Jellyfish Yinji a tall and masculine 
woman?

Why are you looking at it now ? Jellyfish Yinji looks like a peerless beauty?



Especially Jellyfish Yinji's perfect figure and her water snake waist. Su Chen wanted to hug her 
water snake waist just looking at her.

When Su Chen saw the secret guards coming around one after another, he hurriedly said,"You Let 
me go first, otherwise my men may misunderstand that you want to kill me."

"Bastard, I want to kill you now, now tell me how do you know my identity? And who are 
you?"Jellyfish Yinji saw that the secret guards around her were coming, so she let go of this 
bastard's neck.

Jellyfish Yinji didn't really want to kill this bastard, and she had no interest in killing people who 
had nothing to do with her. Su

Chen sat down again and waved to the secret guards to tell them not to come. He smiled at Jellyfish 
Yinji and said,

"Is there anything to guess about this? There are only a few female land gods in the Heavenly 
Realm."

"Except for my woman and the celestial realm land gods I know, I only know about the remaining 
female celestial realm land gods who will be with you, Jellyfish Yinji, in the future."

"So I will make a guess between you and the future. You will not appear on the mainland in the 
future, but you, Jellyfish Yinji, may not be sure. I know some of your styles clearly."

Jellyfish Yinji was a little panicked when she heard Su Chen's words. She didn't expect that this 
bastard knew her secret, which made her want to kill this bastard who knew her secret right now.

Su Chen saw Jellyfish Yinji's eyes were unkind. Looking at him, he felt that Jellyfish Yinji was 
going to kill him and silence him.

"I'll beat you up, Jellyfish Yin Ji, even if you want to kill me now, you can't keep your secret. Don't 
think that I'm the only one who knows your secret."

"Damn it, who the hell are you?"



Su Chen took off his mask, looked at Jellyfish Yin Ji, smiled and said,"Now do you know who I 
am?"

Jellyfish Yinji looked at this handsome man, but she didn't recognize him. She felt that this bastard 
seemed to be known to everyone in the world, which made Jellyfish Yinji laugh when she looked at 
this bastard.

"who are you? Don't think that I will recognize you if you take off the mask"

"I'll do it! You haven't heard of me? I am very famous in mainland China"

"What does your fame have to do with me?"

"Damn it, I forgot, you are only interested in women, and a handsome guy like me cannot attract 
your attention."Su Chen patted his forehead and was very speechless.

Su Chen had forgotten that this jellyfish Yin Ji was not interested in men at all.

How could a lesbian pay attention to men?

Su Chen shook his head and felt that he had taken off his mask this time. Some mistakes were 
made.

Jellyfish Yinji looked around nervously and angrily threatened Su Chen,"Are you going to die?" 
You bastard dare to mention this again, I will kill you now."

At this time,

Qin Hongmian was supported by Mu Wanqing and came here to take a rest.

She had also been consumed by Su Chen a lot of energy just now. After a while of fighting, she was 
tired and wanted to take a rest.



But she saw that she had taken it off Su Chen, who was wearing a mask, was very surprised.

She didn't expect that this bastard was Wu Xiangjun who killed Duan Zhengchun. She remembered 
Wu Xiangjun's face and portrait clearly.

"Mr. Wu Xiang? You bastard is actually Lord Wu Xiang, I’m going to kill you."

Chapter 578

Mu Wanqing was also very shocked when she looked at Su Chen.

She didn't expect that this bastard was actually Wu Xiangjun. No wonder he was wearing a mask 
and shouldn't show it to others.

It was impossible for Mu Wanqing to see the wrong person. She was forced by her mother to 
remember Wu Xiangjun's portrait deeply.

The appearance of this bastard was deeply etched in Mu Wanqing's mind, and she would never 
forget this bastard even if she died.

When Jellyfish Yinji heard Qin Hongmian's cry, she instantly thought of who this bastard was.

"Mr. Wu Xiang? You bastard is the Wu Xiangjun Su Chen who almost wiped out all the peerless 
beauties on this year's martial arts beauty ranking list?"

Su Chen ignored Jellyfish Yin Ji now. This time Qin Hongmian discovered his identity. Su Chen 
was also very surprised. Su Chen looked at Jellyfish Yin Ji and was very unkind. If Jellyfish Yin Ji 
hadn't arrived this time, he would have It is impossible for Qin Hongmian to get carried away and 
discover his identity.

"Qin Hongmian, if you want to die, I will help you mother and daughter."Su Chen didn't expect that 
Qin Hongmian and her daughter would come back at this time. His identity was discovered by Qin 
Hongmian and Mu Wanqing, which made Su Chen feel difficult.

Su Chen waved to the side and summoned the secret guards. Come here, Qin Hongmian, mother 
and daughter Su Chen cannot let them leave, otherwise his identity will be completely exposed.



"Mr. Wu Xiang, I’m going to kill you, you bastard."Qin Hongmian stabbed Su Chen with her long 
sword.

She had always wanted to avenge Duan Zhengchun in the past, but she had given up on avenging 
Duan Zhengchun at the martial arts conference.

She even wanted to fight with Ruan Xingzhu and the others. She also wants to live a good life with 
her daughter in the future and no longer wants to avenge Duan Zhengchun.

But when Qin Hongmian thinks about this bastard hiding his identity and humiliating her, she 
becomes very angry.

Qin Hongmian thinks about this bastard who first attacked her The words"maid" engraved on her 
body were just another example of the bullying she had suffered in the city wall fortress.

Qin Hongmian's anger suddenly burst out.

Bang!

Su Chen kicked Qin Hongmian away who came to kill him. This time he was not merciful. If Qin 
Hongmian did not know whether to live or die, he would not mind sending her to reunite with Duan 
Zhengchun.

"Mom, are you okay?"When Mu Wanqing saw Qin Hongmian being kicked away, she hurried over 
to help Qin Hongmian and asked worriedly.

Qin Hongmian vomited blood and looked at Su Chen and said angrily to Mu Wanqing,"Ahem, 
cough, cough! I'm fine, cough! Wanqing, go kill this bastard. This time, our mother and daughter 
will kill this damn bastard even if they die here."

"Mom, it may not work, we are surrounded by Wu Xiangjun's guards."When Mu Wanqing saw that 
Su Chen's secret guards had surrounded them, she knew that Su Chen would definitely not let them 
go this time.



After all, they knew Su Chen's true identity, and there was no way that bastard would let them 
Exposing his identity.

This is the territory of the Song Dynasty, not that bastard. Wu Xiangjun may have some conspiracy 
to hide his identity in Chang'an City of the Song Dynasty. I am afraid that their mother and daughter 
are really dead this time.

"Their mute acupuncture points were tapped, and they were captured and sent back to Mu Guiying's 
house for safekeeping."Su Chen ordered when he saw Qin Hongmian and Mu Wanqing being 
surrounded by secret guards,

"Yes, Your Majesty."After receiving the order, the secret guards held crossbows to capture Qin 
Hongmian, mother and daughter.

"Mother, no!"

When Mu Wanqing saw the surrounding secret guards threatening their mother and daughter with 
crossbows, she held down Qin Hongmian who was about to resist and shook her head.

Mu Wanqing didn't want her mother to resist again at this time. If they angered Lord Wu Xiang, 
they might really be executed on the city wall by this bastard.

Qin Hongmian dropped the long sword in her hand when she saw Mu Wanqing worried about her. 
She knew that she couldn't kill the bastard at this time.

She could only wait until she had the opportunity to assassinate this bastard Wu Xiangjun again.

Qin Hongmian and Mu Wanqing were taken away by the secret guards without resistance.

After Qin Hongmian and the others were captured, Su Chen He put on the mask again and this time 
he didn't dare to be careless again.

Seeing that this bastard didn't answer her, Jellyfish Yinji even glared at her, which made the always 
aloof Jellyfish Yinji a little angry.



"Mr. Wu Xiang, I also know your identity. Do you want to arrest me too?"

Su Chen looked at Jellyfish Yinji's angry look and smiled and said,"Jellyfish Yinji, if I am afraid 
that you know my identity, will I expose my identity in front of you?"

"oh? Why do you think I won't reveal your identity?"Jellyfish Yinji looked at Su Chen with some 
confusion and asked,

"Stone Guanyin!"

Su Chen leaned back on the chair with a triumphant look.

What does Jellyfish Yinji care about most?

Of course it is the whereabouts of Shi Guanyin.

This perverted woman has always been obsessed with his wife Shi Guanyin. As long as she seizes 
the weakness of Jellyfish Yinji , Su Chen didn't believe that she would dare to reveal his identity. 
Jellyfish Yinji was stunned when Su Chen mentioned Shi Guanyin. Jellyfish Yinji didn't expect that 
this bastard actually knew about her relationship with Shi Guanyin. This made Jellyfish Yinji's 
veiled face turn very red instantly. Jellyfish Yinji felt that she didn't have any secrets in front of this 
bastard, and he seemed to know her very well. This made Jellyfish Yinji a little confused as to why. 
How could this bastard know her like this? Jellyfish Yinji put aside these thoughts and hurriedly 
said to Su Chen,"You bastard, do you know where Shi Guanyin is?" Tell me quickly?

"

"Why should I tell you? We have nothing to do with each other, so don't threaten me. I won't be 
threatened by you."Su Chen looked at the approaching Jellyfish Yin Ji and shook his head.

How could he tell the Jellyfish Yin Ji the whereabouts of Shi Guanyin?

This time he wanted to take advantage of this powerful Jellyfish Yin Ji, who has the most powerful 
person in the realm of heaven and human beings. The powerful Jellyfish Yinji is here, and Su Chen 
plans to let her solve the crisis in Chang'an City.



This super thug who comes to the door automatically, if Su Chen doesn't use her here, he will be 
sorry for his status as a time traveler.

Jellyfish Yinji heard Su Chen smiled angrily and said,"Aren't you afraid that I will kill those women 
of yours?"

Su Chen didn't care about the threat of Jellyfish Yin Ji. He smiled mysteriously while drinking tea 
and said,

"You do not dare!"

Jellyfish Yinji looked at Su Chen in surprise.

Why is this bastard so sure that she doesn't dare to kill anyone?

Does he only rely on two women, Bai Ruobing and Donghuang Taiyi?

"I can not? Is there anything in this world that I dare not do? Do you think Bai Ruobing and 
Donghuang Taiyi can do anything to me? It would be easy for me to kill them"

"Jellyfish Yin Ji, who is half a step into the golden elixir realm, is of course very powerful, but what 
about Shi Guanyin? You are so powerful, why can't you find Shi Guanyin after more than ten 
years?"

Chapter 579

Jellyfish Yinji looked at Su Chen and was very surprised. Does this bastard know where Shi 
Guanyin is? Otherwise, he wouldn't have said this to her so calmly.

Jellyfish Yinji knew that threatening this bastard might not work this time.

Shi Guanyin was someone she liked very much. Otherwise, she would not have been searching for 
her whereabouts for decades.



Jellyfish Yin Ji calmed down and said,"Tell me the whereabouts of Shi Guanyin and I will reward 
you.""

"Not now. You have to make up for me first if you ruined my business. I might tell you where Shi 
Guanyin is in the future."

Su Chen shook his head and laughed.

Jellyfish Yin Ji really cares about Shi Guanyin.

This pervert is really passionate about his wife Shi Guanyin.

It's just a pity for this stunning beauty. Jellyfish Yin Ji likes women. What a waste of her perfect 
figure and waist.

"you......"Jellyfish Yinji stood up angrily when she heard Su Chen's words. She didn't expect that 
this bastard would take advantage of her.

She had previously stopped Black Widow from catching the two Yuan aliens, but Jellyfish Yinji 
didn't expect that this bastard was so vindictive and wanted to take revenge now.

Su Chen interrupted Jellyfish Yinji and said to her,

"As long as you catch Jinlun Dharma King and Zha Ya Du back to me, maybe I will tell you the 
whereabouts of Shi Guanyin. You don’t have to answer me now. I will give you one day to think 
about it. You can answer me again tomorrow, or catch the gold. King Lunfa and Zha Yadu came 
over."

Su Chen said and walked towards the place where the battle was taking place on the city wall. Now 
the city wall was attacked by thousands of Yuan troops. The Song troops on the city wall suffered a 
lot of casualties. These Song troops were really... Waste, several times more than the enemy and so 
many people were killed. It seems that the Song Dynasty is really hopeless.

Jellyfish Yinji looked at Su Chen leaving and lowered her head thinking about Su Chen's words. 
She might really find Shi Guanyin. She really needs this bastard.



She has not found Shi Guanyin for decades, but today this bastard actually knows the whereabouts 
of Shi Guanyin, and she can't do anything about this bastard. This bastard knows her too well, even 
when she is There is no privacy in front of this bastard.

He knows all her secrets. This makes Jellyfish Yinji unable to do anything to this bastard.

Now that this bastard has mastered her only weakness, Jellyfish Yinji can't even threaten this 
bastard..Although she can kill this bastard, Jellyfish Yinji has been looking for Shi Guanyin for too 
long, and she has not found Shi Guanyin for decades.

She does not want the only person who knows the whereabouts of Shi Guanyin to die like this. This 
bastard wants to die. I can only find Shi Guanyin myself and then kill him.

"Your army is really bad."Su Chen came to Mu Guiying and looked at the continuous stream of 
Yuan troops attacking the city under the city wall, and said mockingly.

Mu Guiying was nervously commanding the Song army. Now there are more and more Yuan troops 
on the city wall..

Although with the help of powerful women like Black Widow, the Yuan army attacked the city wall 
without fear of death, which caused heavy losses to the Song army on the city wall. If this 
continues, I am afraid there will be deserters in the Song army. , this is also the reason why Mu 
Guiying is nervous.

She is now thinking about how to defeat the attack of the Dayuan army today.

After hearing Su Chen's voice, Mu Guiying hurriedly said to him,"What are you doing here, you 
bastard?" Go back quickly, this is not the place you should stay."

Mu Guiying is very worried about the safety of this bastard. Although this bastard is stronger than 
her, this is an army war.

In an army of tens of thousands, no matter how strong this bastard is, it is useless. Mu Guiying 
doesn't want this. The bastard died here.



Su Chen was speechless when he heard what Mu Guiying said.

【What the hell!】

【Does this little girl Mu Guiying really think of him as a pretty boy?】

【I am much more powerful than this girl, so why do I act like a burden?】

【If he hadn't been worried about this little girl, how could he have appeared here?】

【well!】

【He felt very helpless with such a stubborn woman. 】

Su Chen looked at Mu Guiying's nervous look and said,"Girl, don't worry, I'm just here to take a 
look. You should command your useless army. I won't mess up."

Su Chen said Seeing the black widow destroying the huge ladders under the city wall made Su 
Chen worried.

Although Black Widow is powerful, there are more than 100,000 Great Yuan troops under the city 
wall. Su Chen is worried that Black Widow's true energy will be consumed too quickly, and she will 
be surrounded by tens of thousands of Great Yuan troops.

"Damn it, don't make sarcastic remarks here, these are the soldiers who protect our country."When 
Mu Guiying heard Su Chen's words, she scolded Su Chen angrily.

She just thought that it was impossible for her to win this war, and even she and this bastard would 
die here.

Mu Guiying touched Su Chen Her face gently dissuaded her,"You go back and continue playing 
with your woman, this is not the place you should come."

Su Chen didn't expect that Mu Guiying would let him play with women?



What is all this?

Has Mu Guiying been driven crazy by these Dayuan troops?

Su Chen looked at the now gentle Mu Guiying and asked in confusion ,

"Mu Guiying, what kind of woman am I playing with? What are you talking about, little girl?

Mu Guiying saw Su Chen's confused look and said angrily,"You bastard, I don't mind if you play 
with women as you please, why are you pretending to be in front of me?""

"Husband, I'm afraid I won't be able to marry you in the future. This war may be the end of our 
lives. I'll do whatever you want now. I won't stop you."

Su Chen became even more confused after hearing Mu Guiying's words,"Hey, what are you talking 
about? Why didn't I understand at all? Forget it, isn't it just the siege of the Yuan army? I will help 
you fight off these Dayuan troops today."

Su Chen is confused by Mu Guiying now.

He doesn't even understand why Mu Guiying asked him to play with women?

Is this woman trying to find a woman to leave offspring because she knows she can't defend 
Chang'an City? ?

Su Chen ordered to the soldiers next to him,"Find me some kerosene, get more.""

"Yes, my lord"

"Husband, what are you going to do? Don't you ever take risks?"When Mu Guiying heard Su Chen 
asked for kerosene, she held his hand and said worriedly,



"It's okay. I haven't slept with you yet. How can I go looking for death? I will burn those huge 
ladders later so that the Yuan army will not be able to attack the city wall. Now order your army to 
destroy the people on the city wall with all your strength. Those Yuan armies."

Chapter 580

Su Chen hugged Mu Guiying and kissed her before walking to the kerosene prepared by the 
soldiers. Su Chen picked up the two cans of kerosene and nodded to Mu Guiying before 
disappearing.

Those huge ladders are the biggest threat to Chang'an City.

As long as Su Chen burns more than ten ladders, the Dayuan army will not be able to attack the 
Chang'an city wall, and Mu Guiying will have less pressure to defend the city.

"Husband, be careful!"When Mu Guiying saw Su Chen disappearing with the kerosene in his arms, 
she hurried to the city wall and shouted loudly.

Mu Guiying didn't know if Su Chen could hear her cry, but she was very worried about Su Chen's 
safety. If If something happens to Su Chen this time, I'm afraid she won't forgive herself even if she 
dies.

Jellyfish Yinji saw that bastard Su Chen helping the Song army to defend the city, which made her 
dumbfounded.

A Song Dynasty is the most powerful The enemies of the enemy actually help the hostile forces 
defend the city?

This bastard really will do anything for women. No wonder this bastard has so many martial arts 
beauties who like him.

Jellyfish Yin Ji now admires this bastard, but if it is Shi Guanyin is here, maybe she is crazier than 
Su Chen, right?

"Shi Guanyin, I will definitely find you, and you can only belong to me."Jellyfish Yinji murmured 
to herself infatuatedly when she thought of Shi Guanyin.



The next time,

Su Chen suddenly appeared on OnePlus' huge ladder. After he appeared, he kicked down the 
Dayuan soldiers around him one by one. Then he poured kerosene on the ladder and lit it.

"Get one, it's too easy, move on."Su Chen watched the ladder being burned by the raging fire, and 
he teleported away directly. Doing these things was child's play for him, and it was not difficult at 
all. When

Mu Guiying saw a ladder being ignited and burning, she She was very happy. She didn't expect that 
Su Chen could build a huge ladder so quickly. This bastard's ability was too powerful.

Su Chen suddenly appeared next to Mu Guiying and said with a smile,"Beauty, how are you? I've 
built a ladder"

"Come on, go on, your powers are just for sneak attacks. Husband, the city of Chang'an depends on 
you."

"I'll do it! Mu Guiying, you have changed too much. You were worried about me just now. Why are 
you not worried about me being in danger now?"

"Now is not the time to talk about this. We will talk about it in detail after all those ladders are 
burned."Mu Guiying hurriedly picked up two cans of kerosene from the side and stuffed them into 
Su Chen's arms and said with a smile.

Su Chen was very speechless when he looked at Mu Guiying.

Forget it, this woman is probably nervous because of this war. ,

I’ll teach her a lesson later.

Then Su Chen kept going back and forth between the city wall and the ladders, but in less than a 
quarter of an hour, more than ten ladders were set on fire by Su Chen, and the Yuan soldiers on the 
wall had no support. , and now they were almost destroyed by the Song army and women like 
Yagyu Yukihime. At this time,



Su Chen suddenly appeared next to Black Widow. He was very surprised when he saw that nearly 
tens of thousands of Yuan troops were killed by Black Widow. , this black widow is too powerful, 
but her current situation is not very good. The black widow's clothes are all wet now, and these are 
all her sweat. I'm afraid the black widow is exhausted now, right?

Su Chen picked up Black Widow and said to her with an ugly expression,"Black Widow, who told 
you to go down to the city wall privately? Do you think war is a child's play? Look how much of 
your true energy is left?"

Su Chen was very angry that Black Widow came down the city wall this time. Fortunately, there 
were no powerful masters to entangle Black Widow this time.

If there were several powerful masters to entangle Black Widow, I'm afraid she would be besieged 
and killed by the Yuan army..

Black Widow leaned into Su Chen's arms and gasped awkwardly,

"Master, I originally wanted to burn those huge ladders, but I didn’t expect to be surrounded here. I 
was careless this time."

Black Widow also saw that the Song army was no match for the Yuan army. If she did not come 
down and burn these ladders, I am afraid that the Yuan army would continue to attack the Chang'an 
city wall.

And the Song army on the wall was simply Without effectively stopping the Dayuan army,

I am afraid that Chang'an City will be breached soon.

In this way, she has not completed the task that Su Chen asked them to help Mu Guiying defend 
Chang'an City.

"Let's go, don't be careless next time."Su Chen saw that Dayuan's army was about to shoot arrows 
here, and the black widow also retracted her cobweb love thread. Su Chen hugged her and 
disappeared here instantly.



In Dayuan's military tent,

Jinlun Dharma King Sitting here with Zha Yadu are waiting for the results of today's attack.

Although today is just a trial attack, they also want to know whether they can hurt the Song 
Dynasty's army this time?

Even if they understand the war, the Song Dynasty army will not dare to face it. They surrendered 
or escaped due to Dayuan's attack.

Zha Yadu looked at the letters on the table, drank a glass of wine, and asked doubtfully,

"His Holiness, why do you think the Southern Army suddenly sent 100,000 troops? Are they here to 
grab the credit?"

Jin Lun Dharma King shook his head and said with great certainty,

"Impossible, the Southern Army did not come here to take credit for the 100,000 cavalry, and the 
cavalry is not suitable for attacking the city. I also don’t understand why the Southern Army sent 
100,000 cavalry."

Jinlun Dharma King was also a little confused as to why the Southern Army sent 100,000 cavalry to 
Chang'an City of the Song Dynasty when they attacked the Kingdom of Jin.

Is there a Southern Army here that wants to find people or items?

The Southern Army is the third party of Princess Zhao Min. One of the large direct legions, the 
Southern Legion with an army of 300,000, sent 100,000 cavalry to Chang'an City at this time.

What is Princess Zhao Min going to do?

After hearing the words of King Jinlun, Zha Yadu thought, since Zhao Min's army is not coming 
Are those who are taking the credit here to help him?



Princess Zhao Min has 30,000 wolf cavalry here to help him attack the Song Dynasty.

This time Princess Zhao Min sent another 100,000 cavalry.

Could it be that Princess Zhao Min saw that they had grown up together? Come to help him break 
through Chang'an City?

The more Zayadu thought about it, the more it seemed possible. Although there were rumors that 
Princess Zhao Min was closely related to the rebel Wu Xiangjun of the Song Dynasty, he did not 
believe those rumors.

Princess Zhao Min commanded hundreds of thousands of troops during the Great Yuan Dynasty. 
The real power princess, the rebellious Wu Xiangjun is not worthy of the identity of Princess Zhao 
Min.

He is the only one in the entire Dayuan whose identity can be compared with Zhao Min, and Zhao 
Min can only be his wife in the future.

"His Holiness, do you think it’s possible that Zhao Min wants to help us conquer Chang’an City? 
After all, Princess Zhao Min and I are childhood sweethearts who grew up together. This is my first 
time to lead an army to attack Chang'an City in the Song Dynasty. It is possible that Princess Zhao 
Min will send someone to help me."
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