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Chapter 631

Su Chen also didn't expect that Princess Che would beg him in a low voice, but he didn't intend to 
care about the lives of the widows of the Yang family.

Although he was somewhat interested in collecting those Seven Widows, Mu Guiying was 
commanding the army this time, and Su Chen didn't want Mu Guiying to discover some of his 
hobbies.

If those widows could survive this war or even be caught, Su Chen might not kill them, but if he 
were asked to save those widows now, Su Chen would not do that.

If Su Chen really intervenes in Mu Guiying's war to save Zou Lanxiu this time, not only will Mu 
Guiying not let him go, but all the soldiers here will probably look at him differently.

Princess Che's eyes were dull now and her face was lifeless. After hearing Su Chen's rejection of 
her words, she knew that this bastard would not easily agree to her saving people.

Princess Che took a breath and promised Su Chen with a pale face,

"Mr. Wu Xiang, as long as you save Zou Lanxiu, you will not execute other women in the Yang 
family in the future. I will be yours from now on."

Princess Che is now helpless with this bastard. What this bastard said is really going to piss her off. 
She can only deceive this shameless pervert first, otherwise her second sister-in-law Zou Lanxiu 
will really be killed..

Su Chen said unceremoniously to Widow Chai with a look of disdain,

"You are eating shit, you are a widow with a dead look on your face and you want to die, do you 
think I will believe what you say?"



"You shameless bastard, everything I said is true."The Princess Che did not expect that this 
shameless pervert was so smart. He also guessed that he was going to commit suicide after this 
bastard saved the Yang family woman.

"Dream on you!"

"you........."

"I don't care whether they live or die. I am not commanding the army to fight now. Don't be too 
wild here. War is war. Whether they live or die depends on whether they are tough or not."

Su Chen didn't let Princess Che say anything else. He looked at the battlefield and muttered to 
himself.

Seeing that this shameless pervert didn't let her continue, Princess Che knew that this bastard really 
didn't intend to save anyone this time. However, she couldn't just watch the women of the Yang 
family being killed one by one in front of her.

Princess Che bit her lip and drew blood. She was really powerless, so the men of the Yang family 
were dead. It will be a month later, and this time the women of the Yang family will also be killed 
soon after. This is really cruel to these women.

Su Chen said helplessly when he saw the blood on the corner of Princess Che's mouth,

"If those widows had not died on the battlefield, I would not have executed them. If they widows 
had been killed on the battlefield, then perhaps they deserved this fate."

Princess Chai was shocked when she heard Su Chen's words. She didn't expect Su Chen to say this, 
but it was settled for the women of the Yang family. At least the widow of the Yang family had a 
chance to survive.

Princess Chai She looked at Su Chen and ignored him. Now she wanted to know if Zou Lanxiu 
would be caught. She didn't want Zou Lanxiu to be killed on the battlefield. On the battlefield



, as the wolf cavalry rushed over, the Song army's Countless people have been killed in the cavalry 
army. After seeing that there was no hope of escape, some soldiers of the Song Dynasty cavalry 
army knelt down and threw away their weapons and surrendered.

As some Song soldiers surrendered, more and more soldiers The soldiers began to surrender, and a 
strange scene appeared on the battlefield.

The soldiers of the Song Dynasty and Yuan Dynasty who were kneeling on the ground ignored 
them, and passed by them and massacred those soldiers who did not surrender.

Zou Lanxiu also discovered that her army had begun to land. They surrendered one after another, 
and she did not blame these surrendering soldiers.

This war was a life-and-death battle.

If these surrendering soldiers would not be killed by Mu Guiying in the future, this might be a good 
thing for those soldiers who want to live. the best

"kill!"

Zou Lanxiu never thought about surrendering, and she didn't think about escaping alive this time. 
Now she can kill as many of these aliens as she can, and she can't do anything to destroy the siege 
ladder next to her.

"Archers, prepare to shoot that female general of the Song Dynasty for me."A commander in the 
Dayuan Army saw Zou Lanxiu's martial arts skills. Countless soldiers of their Dayuan Army were 
killed by this female general.

"damn it!"

When Zou Lanxiu saw hundreds of archers gathered around her, she knew she was in trouble.

"Shoot the arrow!"



Swish swish swish...... bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump 
bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump 
bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump bump...... ah!

Although Zou Lanxiu used a long spear to knock away the bows and arrows that were shooting at 
her, as more and more archers joined in shooting her, Zou Lanxiu was also shot by bows and 
arrows. She fell to the ground after being hit by several bows and arrows. on the ground

"See if she is dead? If not, just catch her. This is a great achievement."

"Yes, Captain."

After hearing the order, the soldiers of the Great Yuan army immediately moved towards Zou 
Lanxiu to see if she was dead.

On the battlefield, after Zou Lanxiu was shot by an archer and fell to the ground, the remaining 
Great Song cavalry were either killed or surrendered. , the 30,000 Song Dynasty Royal Forest Army 
cavalry were completely wiped out this time.

Under the banner of the Great Yuan Commander, Mu Guiying saw that the Song Dynasty cavalry 
army had been destroyed, and she breathed a sigh of relief. This time her plan had succeeded. Half, 
the rest is to conquer Chang'an City

"The messenger ordered the Yuan army to send out another 40,000 troops to pretend to attack 
Chang'an City."Mu Guiying smiled and ordered to the messenger next to him,

"Yes, Commander."

She looked at the east gate of Chang'an City and shook her head. She hoped that Taijun She would 
not discover the gate she really wanted to break this time. She wanted to take advantage of Taijun 
She to annihilate the Song Dynasty cavalry army in one fell swoop. Capture Chang'an City

"Secret guard, send a signal to the Xuanwu Legion, and have the 60,000 Xuanwu Legion attack the 
other three gates of Chang'an City in three groups. I want them to break through Chang'an City in 
the shortest possible time.his city gate"



""Yes, madam."

Mu Guiying commanded the army to attack Chang'an City in an orderly manner under the 
commander's flag, but this time she did not restrain her hands like she was guarding Chang'an City.

This time her army completed her mission very well. Order, this made Mu Guiying feel that the gap 
between the elite army and the weak army was very big.

Mu Guiying looked at Chang'an City and shouted to the side,

"Youxue"

"Madam," a woman in black suddenly appeared next to Mu Guiying and saluted her,

"Let Fu Hongxue and Shangguan Jinhong in Chang'an City cooperate with the Xuanwu Legion."

"Yes, ma'am."

Chapter 632

The war on the battlefield was over. After the Song cavalry was either killed or captured, and Zou 
Lanxiu didn't know whether he was alive or dead, Su Chen didn't care. He just watched Mu 
Guiying's heroic appearance from behind the army. commanding the army.

When he saw that Mu Guiying sent an additional 40,000 Dayuan troops to attack Chang'an City, Su 
Chen understood that Mu Guiying was still preparing to feint to attack the east gate of Chang'an 
City this time. The other three gates of Chang'an City should It was the city gate she mainly 
attacked.

Seeing Zou Lanxiu fall to the ground after being hit by an arrow, Princess Chei hurriedly said to Su 
Chen,"I want to go over, Mr. Wu Xiang, I want to go over to see if my second sister-in-law Zou 
Lanxiu is dead.""

"no!"

Su Chen shook his head and refused while holding



Widow Chai in his arms. He didn't want Widow Chai to go to the battlefield at this time. Although 
the war on the battlefield is over now, if he unlocked Widow Chai's acupuncture points, she would 
find out Now that the widow Zou Lanxiu is dead, I am afraid that Widow Chai will not be able to 
help but take action against the soldiers of Dayuan Army.

Seeing that this bastard did not agree, Widow Chai even hugged her tightly, which made her very 
angry and scolded Su Chen. road,

"Bastard, you shameless pervert, let me go quickly, I want to go over"

"Stop dreaming, you know it's impossible"

"How can you let me pass?"

"It's not impossible to think about it, but should you express it?"

After Princess Che heard what Su Chen said, she yelled at Su Chen with anger,"Shameless, you 
shameless pervert, stop dreaming, I will never agree to this even if I die, you bastard. shameless 
request"

"That's really a pity."

Su Chen let go of Princess Chai and spread his hands and said with a smile.

He didn't believe that Widow Chai didn't care about Zou Lanxiu's life and death. Although Widow 
Chai was resolute now, he believed Widow Chai would change her mind after a while..

Su Chen also wanted to use this opportunity to get rid of Widow Chai. After all, Widow Chai was 
much more beautiful than those widows of the Yang family, and even her mature charm was very 
attractive, especially the turbulent waves on her chest, which made Su Chen's mouth felt a little dry 
when he saw it.

But after all, he had ordered the death of her husband and children. This Widow Chai was not so 
easy for him to deal with.



Ahem, cough, cough!

It's too far away.

Su Chen patted his head and said Putting these messy things aside, he now made Widow Chai not 
think about committing suicide in the future, and even gradually accepted him as a new man.

And then, the four-thousand-person team of Dayuan Army and The remaining army of less than 
20,000 soldiers began to attack Chang'an City with great fanfare. Only this time, only the archers 
kept shooting at the Song army on the city wall, and the siege ladders were still slowly being 
attacked by the Yuan soldiers. Pushing closer to the Chang'an city wall.

On the Chang'an city wall,

She Taijun watched the archers of the Dayuan army keep shooting at the city wall. But why didn't 
those siege ladders move to the city wall as soon as possible?

Without the siege ladders, it would be impossible for the Dayuan army. Attacking the city wall, this 
made her very confused.

"Why do I feel like something is wrong with the attack of Dayuan's army?"

"Mom, was the second sister-in-law shot to death?"Ma Yueying ignored the attacks of the Yuan 
troops. She looked at the prisoners who were escorting the Song cavalry outside Chang'an City and 
said sadly. She

Taijun shouted to the still sad Ma Yueying,"Aying, your second sister-in-law. He is already dead. 
Now we have to deal with this siege. If we want to take revenge, we must defend Chang'an City 
first."

"Sorry, mother, I understand."Ma Yueying said hurriedly when she saw Taijun She's stern look.

She also knew that Zou Lanxiu was probably in danger, but she really didn't want her second sister-
in-law Zou Lanxiu to be killed like this.



Taijun She didn't care about Ma Yueying's current mood. She looked at her fingers Looking at the 
Dayuan army under the Chang'an city wall, he asked Ma Yueying,

"Look at the attack of the Dayuan army commanded by Mu Guiying. Is there something wrong?"

Ma Yueying looked at it for a while and found that the attack of the Dayuan army was very 
abnormal. She felt that the actions of these armies were a bit delayed. Didn't the Dayuan army really 
want to break through Chang'an City this time?

She saw Then he told Taijun She about the doubts in his heart,

"Yes, there are some. These Dayuan troops should be able to quickly use siege ladders to attack the 
Chang'an city wall, but this time they seem to be delaying the attack. Does Mu Guiying have any 
other conspiracy?"

"You're not sure. Go and tell the army to be careful. We can't fall into Mu Guiying's tricks again."

"Yes, Commander."

At this moment, a messenger hurried over and saluted,"Report to the commander-in-chief, the west 
gate, north gate, and south gate of Chang'an City have all been attacked by Wu Xiangjun's army. 
Now the north gate is in danger. Got it"

When Taijun She heard what the messenger said, her eyesight went dark,"What? The other three 
city gates were attacked? How come the north gate was lost so quickly?"

"Commander, the north gate was attacked by some Jianghu people. Now the city gate has been 
opened. Although the Royal Forest Army is resisting the attack of Wu Xiangjun's army, I'm afraid 
they won't be able to hold on for long."

Taijun She calmed down and said with an ugly face,



"Damn it, what Mu Guiying originally wanted to attack was not the east gate of Chang'an City. That 
shameless woman was pretending to attack the east gate of Chang'an City. Her main goal was the 
other three gates."

Ma Yueying is now without a master. If the North City Gate is breached, Chang'an City will be 
completely destroyed.

"Mom, what should we do? There are not many troops guarding the other three city gates. Do you 
want us to send some of the troops here to support the other city gates?"

Taijun She looked desperate when she saw hundreds of thousands of Dawu Xiangjun's troops 
outside the east city wall. She knew that if there was any movement in the army here, I am afraid 
that the Dayuan troops who were pretending to attack under the city wall would really start to attack 
the city.

Chang'an City It's over.

She Taijun can no longer defend Chang'an City. She

Taijun laughed as he thought about it.

All of the Yang family might really die here this time. He didn't expect that the widows not only did 
not take revenge, but also Chang'an City was also captured by the Yang family. Future generations 
will definitely look down on the Yang family, right?

"Ha ha! It's too late, everything is too late. Although I knew that I couldn't defend Chang'an City 
this time, I didn't expect that Chang'an City would be breached in less than a day."

"There are also those Jianghu people who did not expect that they did not help the Song Dynasty, 
but helped Lord Wu Xiang. Could it be that those Jianghu heroes who kept saying they served the 
country and the people were also disappointed with the Song Dynasty court?"

"Report, Commander, the north gate has been breached, and Wu Xiangjun's army has rushed into 
Chang'an City."



"Ma Yueying is now leading all the troops here to break out towards the south gate, and every one 
of them can escape."

Chapter 633

Taijun She no longer wants to leave. She knows she can't escape, and she has no intention of 
escaping. Her husband and seven sons have all died here, and she is just living an ignoble existence.

Taijun She now hopes that the remaining widows of the Yang family can escape from Chang'an 
City. The Yang family has been sorry to these women for more than ten years.

They have been left as widows for more than ten years, which makes Mrs. She really can't bear to 
let them die together with her, an old woman.

"Mom, if you want to escape, I will go with you, and you can’t stay."When Ma Yueying heard what 
Taijun She said, she hurriedly pulled her and said,

Ma Yueying now understood that Taijun She wanted to die, and she could not let Taijun She wait for 
death here.

Taijun She touched Ma Yueying's hair and said seriously,"Aying, I I'm old and there's no way I can 
escape with you. You have to rush out of Chang'an City with the others."

"No, I won't leave my mother and run away."

"Aying, in order for you to avenge your husbands in the future, you all must escape. Otherwise, we 
will all die here. Who else can avenge the men of the Yang family in the future?"

"mother......."

Taijun She interrupted Ma Yueying and pushed her away. She gave her final explanation to Ma 
Yueying,

"It’s settled. When you go to the south gate, remember to call the third and fourth wives from the 
west gate. The eldest daughter-in-law from the north gate may be in danger. You take all the troops 



here and leave as soon as possible. Otherwise, I'm afraid it will be too late. Let's go quickly. Do you 
want me to die with my eyes open?"

Mr. She will not escape with them under any circumstances at this time.

Chang'an City is the city that her husband and sons have been guarding, and this time Chang'an City 
was still in the hands of the Yang family and was captured by the army commanded by Mu Guiying.

If she were running away now, she would not be able to face her dead husband and sons even if she 
died in the future.

Ma Yueying also knew that Taijun She would not leave under any circumstances this time. She 
kowtowed to Taijun She with tears streaming down her face and said ,

"Mom, as long as we live in the future, we will definitely avenge everyone in the Yang family."

Taijun She looked at Ma Yueying and smiled, waved her hands and said,"Leave quickly. If you want 
to escape this time, you must take revenge when you are sure. Don't make fearless sacrifices again."

"Um!"

Ma Yueying took a deep look at Taijun She, nodded and turned around to leave. She wanted to 
gather the army as soon as possible to get down from the Chang'an city wall and prepare to break 
out of the south gate.

At this moment, when Mu Guiying learned that the north gate of Chang'an city had been breached, 
she Looking at the east gate of Chang'an City, She Taijun must also know that the north gate has 
been breached. I wonder what She Taijun will do this time?

"Youxue"

"Madam,"

Mu Guiying looked at the east gate of Chang'an City and ordered to the shadow assassin Youxue,



"Youxue, order the Netherworld Cavalry Army to send 10,000 Netherworld Cavalry to each city 
gate. If they encounter the Song Dynasty army that wants to break out, I must intercept them all."

"Yes, madam."

Mu Guiying ordered the messenger beside her when she saw Youxue disappearing,

"Messenger, order the army to start attacking the city. Don’t pretend to attack this time."

"Yes, Commander!" woo woo woo woo........

"Attack the city and capture the city of Chang'an for Lord Wu Xiang!"

"kill! kill! kill!"

When the attack horn sounded, the Dayuan army quickly pushed the siege ladder to start the real 
siege.

And Su Chen was the only one left here. Princess Chei finally compromised with Su Chen , after 
agreeing to some of Su Chen's conditions, Su Chen asked the secret guards to go with her to see if 
Zou Lanxiu was dead.

Now that Su Chen heard the sound of the attack horn, he guessed that other gates in Chang'an City 
might was breached, otherwise Mu Guiying would not have been able to order the army to begin the 
real siege.

"From now on, the city of Chang'an belongs to you. If Huang Rong sends out troops in the past few 
days, I am afraid that the Song Dynasty will be destroyed within a few months."

"Someone come!"

"Your Majesty"



"Pass my order, after the army enters Chang'an City, they will kill innocent people indiscriminately, 
kill! Those who rob and fornicate must be killed! Those who oppress the people shall be killed!"

"Yes, Your Majesty."

Su Chen doesn't want the Dayuan army to start massacring the people after entering Chang'an City, 
and even arrest the women of Chang'an City to humiliate them.

He absolutely doesn't want to see these things. After all, these people are not only from the Central 
Plains of China like him, but they will also be there in the future. They are his people.

Su Chen will not let these Dayuan aliens massacre the people of Chang'an City. If the Dayuan aliens 
dare to disobey his orders, Su Chen will not mind killing the Dayuan aliens.

On the wall of Chang'an City,

After seeing Ma Yueying leaving with the army, She Taijun discovered that the Dayuan army was 
about to push the siege ladder over quickly. She knew that Mu Guiying couldn't wait to take 
Chang'an City this time. She

Taijun faced the banner of the Dayuan commander. Mu Guiying shouted loudly,

"Mu Guiying, do you dare to talk to me?"

"Mrs. She, if you have anything to say, just say it."After hearing Taijun She's words, Mu Guiying 
also learned about the situation at the east gate of Chang'an City. She led tens of thousands of troops 
towards the east gate and looked at Taijun She who was left on the wall and said, Taijun She saw 
the people under the wall. Mu Guiying was very angry. This Mu Guiying, who was originally the 
granddaughter-in-law of their Yang family, now actually destroyed their Yang family. Even the Yang 
family suffered this time because of this shameless woman. She

Taijun was angry while standing on the city wall. pointed at Mu Guiying and shouted,

"Mu Guiying, as a general of the Song Dynasty, you took refuge in the traitor Wu Xiangjun. This is 
disloyal! Now they are leading aliens to attack Chang'an City. This is unjust! Aren't you, an 
unfaithful and shameless slut, afraid of going to hell after death?"



Mu Guiying burst out laughing when she heard what Taijun She said. She knew that Taijun She had 
a death wish if she stayed alone.

This time Taijun She scolded her in front of her army.

Will this ruin her reputation in the future?

Or even Do you still want to curse yourself for not having a good death in the future?

"Hahahaha, Taijun She, you are wrong. My Mu family is loyal to the Song Dynasty, but how did the 
Emperor of the Song Dynasty treat my Mu family? Did he kill everyone in my family?"

"Besides, why should I seek refuge with Mr. Wu Xiang? Wu Xiangjun Su Chen is my husband-in-
law, do I need to seek refuge with him?"

"And all the troops here in Dayuan are the troops of my husband Su Chen, so what if they are 
foreigners? As long as the alien troops here are loyal to my husband, do I care if they fight?"

"Mrs. She, are you alone at the east city gate now? Are you planning to let your daughters-in-law 
escape?"

"But none of the widows can escape this time. Do you think I wouldn’t have thought that you would 
break through after the city of Chang’an was broken? Those widows will also go after the men of 
your Yang family one by one."

"Shameless adulterers and adulterers, you will all have a bad death in the future."When Taijun She 
heard Mu Guiying's words, she vomited a mouthful of blood and cursed angrily at the city wall,

"Your Majesty, children, I'm here to find you."

Then,

Taijun She chattered silently for a few times before jumping down from the Chang'an city wall.



Chapter 634

In Chang'an City, since the north gate was breached, other city gates were breached one after 
another, and Mu Guiying also entered Chang'an City with hundreds of thousands of troops.

There are very few rebel troops in Chang'an City. The original defenders of Chang'an City stayed in 
the camp in Chang'an City and did not resist at all. They surrendered voluntarily after the arrival of 
the Xuanwu Legion.

Mu Guiying was riding a horse, looking at the deserted Chang'an City, and asked the secret guard 
next to him,

"What happened to the tens of thousands of Imperial Guardsmen who escaped from the North Gate 
now?"

"Madam, the Xuanwu Legion and the Netherworld Cavalry have surrounded the Imperial Guards 
who escaped from the north gate. Those Imperial Guards cannot escape."

"Well, send some more troops to the north city gate. I don’t want those widows to escape."

"Yes, ma'am."

Mu Guiying shook her head when she saw the secret guards leaving.

I am afraid that in this war, as long as there are Xuanwu Legion and Netherworld Cavalry, Chang'an 
City can be completely captured. That bastard Su Chen's army is too powerful.

At this time , dozens of secret guards riding horses on the streets of Chang'an City kept shouting,

"Lord Wu Xiang has an order, and all the troops obey it:"

"Kill innocent people indiscriminately, kill!"

"Those who rob and fornicate must be killed!"



"Those who oppress the people shall be killed!"

"This nosy bastard had already ordered these things himself."Mu Guiying smiled after hearing the 
shouts of the secret guards.

When the army entered Chang'an City, she gave the order not to disturb the people and not to 
massacre the people. She did not expect that Su Chen would also think of this, but she Still very 
happy, this shows that Su Chen really cares about the people.

Outside Chang'an City,

Su Chen was not in a hurry to enter Chang'an City. He just got the secret guard's report and knew 
what happened at the North City Gate. Now he Standing on a high slope outside the North City 
Gate, I looked at the tens of thousands of Song Dynasty imperial soldiers who were besieged by the 
Xuanwu Legion and the Netherworld Cavalry.

"Your Majesty, Mrs. Xue Nu and Mrs. Shi Qingxuan have left seclusion."A secret guard came and 
saluted Su Chen and said,

"oh? Out of quarantine? Where are they now?"Su Chen was very happy when he heard that Xue Nu 
and Shi Qingxuan were released from seclusion.

Xue Nu and the others have been in seclusion since they arrived in Chang'an City. They don't know 
what happened in Chang'an City these days. If they knew what they were doing these days, I am 
afraid that he will be a disaster again.

The secret guard hurriedly replied,"Your Majesty, the ladies are now with Lin Chaoying and others 
from the Ancient Tomb Sect."

"With that liar? Forget it, ignore them for now."Su Chen curled his lips when he heard that Xue Nu 
and the others were together with the liar Lin Chaoying.

He had not forgotten that the liar Lin Chaoying deceived him about Zhu Guo.



But this time he would not let the liar go. He would have to teach him a lesson. Teach Lin Chaoying 
a lesson, I'm afraid that woman will still deceive him in the future.

And the next time, outside the north gate of Chang'an City, under the siege of the Xuanwu Legion 
and the Netherworld Cavalry, the Imperial Forest Army of the Song Dynasty completely collapsed, 
and there were constant soldiers of the Song Dynasty on the battlefield. The army knelt down and 
surrendered, and the imperial guards who tried to escape were killed one by one by the crossbows 
of the Xuanwu Legion.

Ma Yueying and the other widows were helpless now. The huge shields of the Xuanwu Legion 
surrounded them, even the three widows among them. The fourth widow and the fourth widow have 
been wounded by military crossbows.

Now Ma Yueying and the seventh widow Du Qingmei have to take care of the other two while 
resisting the Xuanwu Legion. They are almost exhausted now. The third widow Dong Yuee is 
covering her head Looking at the arrow wounds on his abdomen, Ma Yueying and Du Qingmei 
hurriedly said to them,"This won't work. Aying, hello, Qingmei, please leave us alone, otherwise we 
will all die here.""

"Yes, your third sister-in-law and I are of low strength. If you stay here, we will die together. You 
run away quickly."The fourth widow Danyang also hurriedly said to Ma Yueying and the others that 
her leg was injured by a crossbow. It was impossible for her to escape. This time she was ready to 
die.

Ma Yueying heard what they said. I am very helpless.

Can I still escape now?

The army here is just surrounding them and has not killed them, the widows, otherwise they would 
have been shot to death by these troops.

"Don’t say it anymore. It’s impossible for us to escape now. These armies are too powerful. They 
may want to capture us alive, otherwise we would have been shot dead by those crossbows."

"Why do these armies want to capture us alive?"Du Qingmei is also very confused now.



They did not attack the troops that besieged them, but these troops only surrounded them and did 
not take action. She also couldn't understand this.

"Damn it, that Wu Xiangjun should be the one who wants to capture us alive. She might want to 
humiliate us."

"That damn shameless pervert, we can't let that bastard catch us even if we die."

"Yes, we will commit suicide if the situation goes wrong."

These widows are now holding their spears and looking at the troops surrounding them with 
vigilance. They can't kill them now, but they can't be captured alive and let that bastard humiliate 
them.

"Huh? Why didn't the Xuanwu Legion kill those widows? Didn't even catch them? What is going 
on?"Su Chen stood on a high slope and watched some soldiers of the Xuanwu Legion surrounding 
the four widows there without taking action. He was very confused.

His army didn't care about beautiful women or not. As long as they were enemies, they would not 
do anything. Those who do not hesitate will be killed.

But what is the situation now?

Just when Su Chen was confused, he suddenly saw Widow Chai appearing on the battlefield with 
his secret guards, and even rode towards the widows.

【What's going on with him?】

【Why did Widow Chai come back here?】

【Shouldn't she go see if the widow Zou Lanxiu is dead?】

【I'll do it!】



【What the hell! Could it be that Widow Chai gave the order to her army not to kill these widows? 

】

Su Chen couldn't sit still here. This time, his guess was probably right. This Widow Chai must have 
faked his order to save the widows here. Is this really him?

At this time,

Ma Yueying and the others were very surprised to see the appearance of Princess Che, and when 
they saw that the army here was still obeying her orders.

The eyes of these widows changed when they looked at Princess Che, and they all wondered if 
Princess Che had surrendered to Lord Wu Xiang?

Ma Yueying looked at Princess Che angrily and asked angrily,

"Sixth sister? How come you are here? Why do these armies listen to your orders?"

Princess Chei saw the suspicious eyes of Ma Yueying and the others, so she hurriedly explained to 
them,

"Fifth sister-in-law, you don’t have to doubt me. I didn’t surrender to that shameless pervert. I 
pretended to be his order to save you this time. I saved both the eldest sister-in-law and the second 
sister-in-law, and they didn’t die."

"Really?"

Ma Yueying and the others breathed a sigh of relief when they heard what Princess Che said. Now 
they looked at Princess Che with a bit of embarrassment. After all, they were very suspicious of 
Princess Che just now.

Now that they thought about it, they felt that they had thought too much. , among the widows, the 
one least likely to surrender is probably Princess Chei. After all, not only was her husband executed 
by Wu Xiangjun, but her son was also killed on Wu Xiangjun's order.



""Really,"

Princess Chei nodded heavily and replied.

Du Qingmei looked at the troops still besieging them and said doubtfully,"Sixth sister-in-law, then 
why don't you let these troops let us leave directly?""

"That's because she doesn't have the power. Widow Chai, you are so brave. How dare you fake my 
order to ask my army to let these widows go?"

Chapter 635

Princess Chei shrank in fright when she saw Su Chen arriving. She didn't expect that the shameless 
pervert didn't enter Chang'an City this time.

This time it was troublesome. It was discovered that I had falsely conveyed his order to capture the 
Yang family's widows alive.

At this time,

Su Chen walked in from outside the Xuanwu Legion soldiers. Seeing Su Chen's arrival, the Xuanwu 
Legion soldiers knelt down and saluted Su Chen.

Su Chen waved to the Xuanwu Legion and asked them to get up. , he looked at the four widows 
surrounded by the Xuanwu Legion and smiled disdainfully.

These widows have not yet understood the formality, and they dare to grin at themselves and glare 
at them.

Su Chen was not used to these widows. He waved his hand and ordered all the soldiers here,

"All crossbows, prepare!"

Swish, swish, swish!



The Qi-breaking crossbows in the hands of the Xuanwu Legion and the secret guards quickly aimed 
at the widows Ma Yueying and the others who were besieged by them. As long as Su Chen ordered 
them, they would shoot without hesitation. Kill these widows.

Seeing that Su Chen was about to shoot Ma Yueying and the others, Princess Chei hurriedly stood 
in front of them and shouted to Su Chen,

"Stop it, what are you going to do, you bastard?"

Ma Yueying and the others were very nervous as they held their weapons. They did not expect that 
Lord Wu Xiang would come here. Now it seems that he has discovered that Princess Che has faked 
his order. It seems that they are dead this time. Got it

"Kill people!"

Su Chen looked at Princess Che and smiled and said.

When Princess Che heard what Su Chen said, she angrily cursed at him,

"Shameless pervert, didn't you say you wouldn't embarrass them if they were caught or didn't die on 
the battlefield? Are you going to go back on your word now?"

Su Chen looked at Widow Chai who looked like an idiot and didn't want to talk to her.

This time she pretended to pass on her orders without asking her to settle the matter. Widow Chai 
still dared to scold herself like this. It seems that Widow Chai can't be allowed to take advantage of 
her in the future.

This Widow Chai is not a simple person.

How did she pretend to pass on her orders?

Are the secret guards and the army who guarded her blind?



How could the secret guards and the army listen to this prisoner ?

"Why don't you answer?"

Princess Chee saw that Su Chen didn't answer her, and the expression on this shameless pervert's 
expression was very unspeakable. This made her very worried that this shameless pervert would kill 
Ma Yueying and the others at all costs.

Su Chen pointed at the spears in Ma Yueying and the others' hands and said mockingly,"Hi! Are 
they caught now? Are these widows holding fire sticks in their hands?"

Princess Chai was speechless when she saw the weapons in Ma Yueying and the others' hands.

If she had known that this bastard was coming, she would have asked Ma Yueying and the others to 
put down their weapons first. But now it is probably impossible for her to ask Ma Yueying and the 
others to put down their weapons..

Princess Chee knew that they, the widows, hated this bastard Suchen so much that they didn’t take 
action against this bastard now because he had tens of thousands of troops here.

If this bastard had appeared here alone, they would have been killed long ago. They cut this bastard 
Su Chen into pieces.

Uh!

It seems that this bastard is very powerful. Maybe women like them will be killed by this shameless 
pervert.

Princess Chei walked to Ma Yueying and the others and whispered,"You all put down your weapons 
or you will be killed."

The third widow Dong Yuee looked at Princess Che and asked in confusion,

"Sixth sister, what is your relationship with this bastard? Why didn't he lock you up? Can you even 
move around?"



The other widows also looked at Princess Che and hoped that she would explain to them. Although 
they did not believe that Princess Che surrendered to the man who killed her husband, this is too 
abnormal.

"Don't ask anymore, as long as we can kill this shameless pervert and Mu Guiying, that shameless 
woman, that's enough"

"Sixth sister, you......."Ma Yueying guessed something when she looked at Princess Che, but she 
thought that if they relied on their strength, they might not be able to get revenge in their lifetime.

But is Princess Che’s sacrifice too big?

Dong Yue'e and the others also looked at Princess Che with surprise. They now understood what 
was going on, but they must have been in extreme pain when they thought that Princess Che had 
committed herself to this enemy.

Princess Che did not let Ma Yueying say those words. She knew that Ma Yueying had already 
guessed it, but she didn't want them to know about the drunken insult she had received from that 
bastard Wu Xiangjun.

Anyway, she has already lost her virginity to this bastard. When she can take advantage of this 
bastard to relax in the future, she will take the opportunity to kill this shameless pervert.

Princess Cheche said to them as if nothing had happened,"Nothing, as long as you can get revenge, 
you can pay a high price no matter how high the price is."

Su Chen watched these widows talking like this in front of him, and even They are still discussing 
how to kill themselves in the future. Do these widows really think of themselves as idiots?

Bang! Bang! Bang! Bang!

Ma Yueying and the others saw that Princess Che could pay such a high price for revenge, why 
couldn't they?



They didn't want Princess Cheche to bear this alone. After all, revenge was their business.

At this time, they all threw their weapons on the ground.

【What the hell!】

【Didn’t he say that the widows of the Yang family would not surrender even if they died?】

【Aren’t all the female generals of the Yang family loyal and loyal?】

【Why are you surrendering now?】

【Do they all want to follow Widow Chai's example and deliberately approach him, and then 
assassinate him when he relaxes?

Su Chen raised one hand and was about to give the order to kill these widows, but now he didn't 
know whether to give the order to kill these widows.

Su Chen waved his hand in embarrassment. The Xuanwu Legion and the secret guards put away 
their crossbows when they saw Su Chen's gesture.

Even if Su Chen wanted to kill these widows now, he would be embarrassed to give the order.

If these widows resisted, he would not hesitate to order their execution.

But now these widows have all surrendered, which makes Su Chen very depressed.

Su Chen looked at these widows and said speechlessly,

"Come on, let me catch all the widows here and imprison them first. No one is allowed to release 
them without my order."

"Yes, Your Majesty."



After hearing Su Chen's order, the secret guards immediately came to Ma Yueying and the others, 
sealed the cultivation realm of these widows, and then tied them up with specially processed beef 
tendons.

Su Chen Seeing Ma Yueying and the other widows being tied up by the secret guards without 
resisting, it made him feel that these widows were all his ruthless characters. Was he prepared to 
serve the tiger with his body?

But what happened to Widow Chai ? What happened?

He just mentioned all the widows here. Why didn't these secret guards tie up Widow Chai?

Su Chen looked ugly and cursed at the secret guards.

"Are they all deaf? I said of all the widows here, isn’t Widow Chai a widow?"

Chapter 636

As Su Chen yelled and cursed, the secret guards and soldiers of the Xuanwu Legion lowered their 
heads one after another.

The secret guards and soldiers all felt numb in their hearts.

Their subordinates all know about Princess Chai and Lord Wu Xiang. I am afraid that Widow Chai 
will be either Wu Xiangjun's wife or concubine, or one of Wu Xiangjun's secret mistresses.

Do these subordinates dare to tie them up?

Dare you offend?

When Su Chen saw the secret guards and the Xuanwu Legion soldiers lowering their heads, he was 
very speechless. He understood what he said, why didn't these bastards take action?



Su Chen angrily pointed at Widow Chai and shouted at the secret guards and Xuanwu Legion 
soldiers,

"What are you doing standing there in a daze to pay him back? Tie up the remaining widow for me"

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

Princess Chai heard that Su Chen wanted to tie her up, which made her very anxious. She has not 
rescued Taijun She yet. If her freedom is restricted now, I am afraid that Taijun She will be killed by 
this bastard's army.

Chai When the Princess saw that the secret guards were about to come up and tie her up, Princess 
Che became nervous and shouted to Su Chen,

"No, you can't arrest me now, Mr. Wu Xiang. I agreed to your shameless demands. You can no 
longer restrict my freedom."

"You have violated my rules and your freedom will be restricted from now on."Su Chen said to 
Princess Chai expressionlessly, and then he ordered the secret guards responsible for monitoring 
Widow Chai,

"The secret guards of the sixth team have given me an idea. From now on, Widow Chai will not be 
allowed to agree to anything she says. She will be a prisoner from now on, a prisoner. Do you 
understand me?"

"Yes, Your Majesty," the secret guards responsible for monitoring and preventing Widow Chai from 
escaping said immediately and said salute.

When Princess Chai saw the secret guards coming to arrest her, she hurriedly avoided and yelled at 
Su Chen,"You shameless pervert, You don't mean what you say, you don't deserve to be a noble."

After Ma Yueying and the other widows heard the conversation between Princess Che and Wu 
Xiangjun after being tied up, they also understood that Princess Che must have agreed to some of 
the shameless demands of this shameless pervert in order to save them women. This made them 
women owe Lord Chai very much.



Su Chen saw that Widow Chai was still scolding him in an arrogant manner at this time, which 
made him very disgusted with this shameless Widow Chai.

If he hadn't done this last night, I would be sorry Regarding Widow Chai, now he will execute 
Widow Chai and the widows of the Yang family.

Su Chen pointed at Widow Chai and said angrily,

"Widow Chai, I only promised you to see if the widow Zou Shilan was dead, but what did you, the 
damn widow, do? You actually secretly passed on my order to intervene in the war to save these 
widows. I think you are tired of living."

"Even if I violate your rules, just give me another hour and I will let you handle it from now 
on."Princess Chei knew that she was in the wrong this time, but for the sake of women like the 
Yang family, she would not regret it even if she was executed by this bastard.

Now there is still Taijun She who she did not have time to save, Princess Che, no matter how much 
she paid We must also save Taijun She.

Su Chen looked at Widow Chai and smiled disdainfully. He also guessed what Widow Chai wanted 
to do, but this Widow Chai was destined to be disappointed.

Su Chen looked at Widow Chai and laughed. said,

"laugh! Are you going to save that Taijun She? You don’t need to go. Taijun She had already 
committed suicide by jumping off the city wall before capturing the east gate of Chang’an City. You 
better give up on this idea, Widow Chai."

"What? Mom, she actually jumped off the city wall and committed suicide?"

"Mother is dead?"

"Why is this happening? Why did my mother die?"

"It's all you damn bastard, I'm going to kill you."



After hearing what Su Chen said, the widows of the Yang family didn't believe it was true. Although 
they knew that Taijun She would commit suicide after Chang'an City was breached, after learning 
that Taijun She was dead, they looked at Su Chen and hated him even more. Shameless bastard.

Dong Yue'e was tied up and bumped towards Su Chen who was approaching Chichi,"You shameless 
bastard, I'm going to kill you.""

Bang!

When Su Chen saw the widow bumping into him, he kicked away the widow Dong who bumped 
into him.

"Third sister-in-law?"

"Sister-in-law, are you okay?"

"Bastard, I'm going to kill you!"

The other widows saw Su Chen kicking Dong Yue'e away. They looked at Dong Yue'e's situation 
and rushed towards Su Chen. Su Chen saw that these tied widows were not honest now. He He 
waved his hand and did not let the secret guards stop these widows. Even though these widows 
wanted to be beaten, Su Chen was very willing to help them.

Bang! Bang! Bang!

When Su Chen saw the widows rushing over, he kicked them one by one. After kicking these 
widows away, Su Chen felt very comfortable.

Although it was impossible for him to kill these widows, if he was unhappy in the future, he would 
take it out on these widows. Not bad either.

Su Chen saw these widows falling to the ground one by one and vomiting blood and said coldly,



"You are all idiotic women. If it weren't for the sake of your surrender, none of you would be alive. 
Take them all down with me. When I see you, I will be afraid and can't help but execute you."

Su Chen doesn't want to see these idiot women anymore.

At this time, these idiot women want to kill him.

Do they really regard themselves as a person without temper?

"Yes, Your Majesty."

After hearing Su Chen's order, the secret guards seized all the widows and took them back to 
Chang'an City. This time, the secret guards did not care about the life or death of these widows. As 
long as these widows resisted, they would Violently escorted them back to Chang'an City.

After Su Chen saw the secret guards escorting Widow Chai and other widows away, he no longer 
watched the war here. Anyway, as long as the imperial guards did not surrender, they would be 
killed. The war here There is no suspense anymore.

He is going back to Chang'an City and is preparing to leave here. From now on, Chang'an City will 
be handed over to Mu Guiying, and the treasures of the Jin Kingdom are still waiting for him to 
discover. Chang'an City, Mu Guiying's Mansion.

Su Chen is here After meeting Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan, they found that they are now masters in 
the late stage of the Grand Master. This time they did not retreat in vain. It seems that Xue Nu and 
Shi Qingxuan will be able to stand alone in the future.

Su Chen saw the return of Mu Guiying, who had been in the dust. Then he said to her,"Mu Guiying, 
I will leave tomorrow, and the city of Chang'an will be handed over to you from now on."

When Mu Guiying came back, she saw this bastard hugging Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan and teasing 
them. Before she could talk to this bastard, she heard Su Chen saying that he would leave tomorrow.

This made her very confused.



Chang'an City had just arrived. Capture, why is this bastard so eager to leave?

"Are you leaving tomorrow? Why are you in such a hurry to leave?"

Chapter 637

Mu Guiying doesn't want Su Chen to leave tomorrow. She hasn't really been Su Chen's woman yet. 
If this bastard leaves tomorrow, I'm afraid she doesn't know how many women this bastard will 
have in the future. She doesn't want to have many women in the future. Let her call her sister.

Seeing Mu Guiying's reluctant eyes, Su Chen smiled and said,

"Mu Guiying, you should know that I did not kill Sun Buer of the Quanzhen Sect. Wang 
Chongyang of the Quanzhen Sect gave me a treasure map of the Kingdom of Jin, and this treasure 
map is only half of it. Not noted"

"Wang Chongyang told Sun Buer when he was dying. This was also Wang Chongyang giving Sun 
Buer a chance to live. I am very interested in the treasures that the Jin Kingdom has plundered over 
the past hundred years. If I destroy the Song Dynasty in the future, I will Jianguo cannot be built 
without money."

"Golden treasure? Are you going to find the treasure of the Kingdom of Jin?"

"Yes, the Kingdom of Jin is about to be destroyed by Dayuan. I am also afraid that the treasure will 
be spread out. If the treasure is not found as soon as possible now, I am afraid that many people and 
the country will know about the treasure of the Kingdom of Jin in the future. At that time, it will 
probably be very troublesome to search for the treasures of the Golden Kingdom."

Xue Nu leaned in Su Chen's arms and said hurriedly when she heard Su Chen's words,

"Husband, then we will accompany you to search for the treasure of the Golden Kingdom. Now 
sister Shi Qingxuan and I are both great masters. It will be helpful for you to go with us."

Shi Qingxuan also said gently to Su Chen,



"Yes, we are all masters in the late stage of Grand Master now, and we will help my husband in the 
future."

Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan are very worried about what accidents will happen this time when Su 
Chen goes to search for the treasure of the Golden Kingdom. After all, this bastard will cause 
trouble no matter where he goes.

They are just retreating this time, but this bastard actually caused such a big trouble in Chang'an 
City. Trouble, this makes them worried that this bastard is going to find the treasure of the Golden 
Kingdom alone.

Su Chen shook his head and refused.

Mu Guiying doesn't have a master to protect her now. If some masters from the Song Dynasty come 
to assassinate Mu Gui Ying, I'm afraid her life will really be in danger.

If there are two great masters, Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan, protecting Mu Guiying, Su Chen will be 
very relieved.

Su Chen hugged Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan, kissed them and said with a smile,

"No, this time you stay to help Mu Guiying. After all, Chang'an City has just been captured, and Mu 
Guiying will launch a war against the Song Dynasty in the future. I am not worried about her 
staying here alone."

Mu Guiying's eyes lit up after hearing Su Chen's words. She was very excited about destroying the 
Song Dynasty. If she could destroy the Song Dynasty, she could also avenge her father and 
everyone in the Mu family.

"Husband, do you want to launch a war of annihilation against the Song Dynasty?"

Su Chen stood up, hugged Mu Guiying and said with a smile,

"Yes, Huang Rong from Gusu City should be able to gather an army to launch an attack on the Song 
Dynasty in the next few days."



"Mu Guiying, after you take care of Chang'an City, you will also start a war against the Song 
Dynasty."

"This time I want you and Huang Rong to attack the Song Dynasty from the south and the north at 
the same time. There is no need for the Song Dynasty court to exist anymore."

Mu Guiying blushed and nodded to Su Chen when she was hugged by Su Chen,"Yeah! I will 
definitely cooperate with Huang Rong to destroy the Song Dynasty."

Xue Nu looked at Su Chen and Mu Guiying and shook her head. This time she and Shi Qingxuan 
must be separated from Su Chen. After all, this war of annihilation is of great concern, and they also 
have to stay and protect Mu Guiying. After all, if the commander-in-chief of an army is 
assassinated, the army will probably be in chaos.

Xue Nu took Shi Qingxuan and told Su Chen,"Husband, then we will stay to protect sister Mu 
Guiying, but if you go to find the Kingdom of Jin The treasure can't cause trouble any more. It must 
come back safely."

"Got it, when did I cause trouble."Su Chen was very speechless after hearing Xue Nu's words. He 
had never taken the initiative to cause trouble. Every time, he was involuntarily involved in some 
disputes.

"You're always causing trouble!"

Xue Nu, Shi Qingxuan and Mu Guiying heard Su Chen's words and said in unison,

"Let me tell you, are you all going to rebel? See how I deal with you."Su Chen carried Mu Guiying 
and walked towards the backyard. Today he was going to teach Mu Guiying and Xue Nu a lesson. 
When

Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan saw Su Chen taking Mu Guiying away, they both looked at each other 
with blushes. They walked towards the backyard. After all, Su Chen would leave tomorrow. They 
also cherished the time they spent with Su Chen today. The



Emperor of the Song Dynasty was in Kaifeng, and the palace was very depressing today. Ancestor 
Sunflower was very helpless now. He didn't expect that a powerful enemy would come to him.

And this time, the powerful enemy came with bad intentions. This time, the powerful enemy in the 
palace was suppressed with momentum, just to force him out of the palace.

Ancestor Sunflower Knowing that he could no longer hide, otherwise he would be found by the 
powerful terrestrial immortal in the Heavenly Realm before long. He looked around and 
disappeared into the Song Dynasty Palace. A big mountain outside Kaifeng, the capital of the Song 
Dynasty. On the mountain, a veiled woman noticed that Patriarch Sunflower appeared on this 
mountain, and she suddenly appeared in front of Patriarch Sunflower.

"Ancestor Sunflower, you finally came out."

Ancestor Sunflower was very surprised when he looked at the veiled woman in front of him. He 
didn't expect that he would be discovered as soon as he appeared here. This woman in the Heavenly 
Realm is probably much stronger than him.

Patriarch Sunflower looked at this veiled woman. The woman asked in confusion,"Who are you? 
Why are you forcing me out? There doesn't seem to be any hatred between us, right?"

"Hahaha! Ancestor Sunflower, you have no hatred towards me, but your existence has affected one 
person, so it’s better for you to die."

"Want to kill me? We are both land gods in the heavenly realm. Do you think you can kill me?"

"Yeah? Then see if I can kill you now."This veiled woman suddenly burst out with a powerful aura 
and enveloped Ancestor Sunflower.

This time she had murderous intentions towards Ancestor Sunflower. She would not let Ancestor 
Sunflower escape from her alive.

Ancestor Sunflower was killed by this terrifying After locking his breath, he shouted in horror,

"this? You are actually half a step into the golden elixir realm. How is this possible? who are you?"



"There is no need for a dead person to know that much."

Boom!

This veiled woman didn't say anything else to Patriarch Sunflower. She struck at Patriarch 
Sunflower with one palm.

"Damn it! Ancestor, I will not be killed by you so easily, Sunflower Body Technique!"

Boom! Boom! Boom!"

"oh? What a weird movement technique, you managed to avoid my attack?"

"Sunflower Silver Needle!"

After Patriarch Sunflower shot countless silver needles at this terrifying woman, he turned around 
and ran away. This terrifying woman was not something he could deal with.

Patriarch Sunflower just wanted to use his weird body skills to escape from here. He will find out 
again that this horror is why a woman wants to kill him

"Tiny little trick"

Ding ding ding ding!"

"Want to escape? Do you think you can be like that asshole?"

After the veiled woman knocked off the silver needle of the Sunflower Ancestor, she smiled and 
said when she saw the Sunflower Ancestor running away,

"The sky is as heavy as the water!"



And at this time, a drop of white light was suddenly shot by the veiled woman towards the escaping 
Ancestor Sunflower.

Ah!

Ancestor Sunflower suddenly found something entering his body, and at this time his body 
suddenly began to swell.

Ancestor Sunflower It felt like if he didn't force out the thing that had entered his body, he would 
explode and die after a while.

"You won't be able to force yourself out if you've been hit hard by me."

"Ahhhh! You are the jellyfish Yinji of Shenshui Palace. Why? I have no enmity with you, why do 
you want to kill me?"

"Why? For the sake of a bastard, you took him for granted. I don’t want that bastard to be killed by 
you in the future. Patriarch Sunflower, have a good journey!"

"I am so unwilling!"

Bang!

In the unwilling shout of Sunflower Ancestor, his body exploded. For a moment, the place was 
filled with the pieces of Sunflower Ancestor's flesh. When

Jellyfish Yinji saw Sunflower Ancestor explode and die, she looked at He said to himself in the 
direction of Chang'an City,

"Shameless pervert, after I kill Patriarch Sunflower, no one should be able to hurt you. I’ll come 
back to you when I get out of seclusion."

Chapter 638

The next morning, in Mu Guiying's mansion in Chang'an City.



Su Chen came out of the backyard and sat down in a room. He was a little tired last night. It seemed 
that he would practice his skills in the future.

Su Chen drank the tea poured by the maid and leisurely thought about who to take with him when 
leaving today. There should be no danger to the Golden Treasure this time. After all, the Golden 
Treasure has not been spread yet.

"Master, do you want me to give you a massage?"Black Widow saw Su Chen rubbing her waist and 
came to Su Chen with a smile and said,

Black Widow knew what Su Chen did last night. It was funny when she saw Su Chen looking tired. 
Although she didn't In the past, she had been guarding the backyard all night.

Su Chen was very speechless when he saw the black widow. Is this black widow laughing at herself 
again?

Su Chen didn't want to embarrass himself. He was suffering from back pain right now. Not 
intending to let Black Widow give him a massage,

Su Chen waved her hand to Black Widow and refused,

"Forget it, you can give me a massage when you have a chance in the future, Black Widow, order 
the secret guards to notify all the captains to come to the house at noon. I will integrate these troops 
before I leave."

"Yes, master!"

When the black widow heard Su Chen's instructions, she twisted her perfect body and walked 
outside step by step.

Su Chen twitched the corner of his mouth when he saw the black widow looking like she was trying 
to seduce him.

"I really can't stand it, everyone is such a monster."



Su Chen picked up the tea served by the maid and took a gulp of it. He had to calm down now, 
otherwise it would be very ugly if someone discovered his physical condition later. After drinking 
the tea,

Su Chen thought of the Song Dynasty. The Sunflower Ancestor is still a threat. If he is not removed, 
I am afraid that the two commanders Huang Rong and Mu Guiying will be assassinated by the 
Sunflower Ancestor.

It seems that a woman in the heavenly realm is going to be recalled, but who is going to be 
recalled?

Marquis Bai Ruobing She and Donghuang Taiyi were looking for some secret place in the Eastern 
Continent, and it might not be easy to find them at this time.

Shuirou (Mrs. Yedi) and Lianxing went to Yihua Palace. Something must have happened there, and 
Shuirou was there. In Yihua Palace, Su Chen didn't have to worry about anything happening to Yao 
Yue, so Shui Rou couldn't be recalled either.

Then only Shi Guanyin was left. Fortunately, he had taken care of the perverted woman Jellyfish 
Yin Ji, so there was no need to be afraid even if Shi Guanyin showed up. The jellyfish Yin Ji found 
and kidnapped her.

Su Chen thought about it and decided to call Shi Guanyin back to kill Sunflower Ancestor.

"Someone come!"

"Your Majesty"

"After sending a message to Mrs. Jingbao and asking her to recall Shi Guanyin, Patriarch Sunflower 
in the Song Dynasty Palace asked Shi Guanyin to kill him."

""Yes, Your Majesty."



After Su Chen waved his hand and asked the secret guard to go down, he was thinking about 
whether there were any arrangements in Chang'an City and who he would take with him to find the 
treasure of the Golden Kingdom.

Just when Su Chen was thinking about these When things were messy,

Lin Chaoying and her two apprentices came in. Lin Chaoying saw Su Chen sitting here alone and 
asked suspiciously,

"Where are Wu Xiangjun, Xue Nu and Shi Qingxuan?"

Su Chen was very angry when he saw Lin Chaoying arriving. He was still worried about Lin 
Chaoying deceiving him about Zhu Guo.

Su Chen was not angry and taunted Lin Chaoying,"Liar, you still have the nerve to come to me. Fu 
Li, do you really think I will forget that you lied to me?"

Lin Chaoying didn't expect that this bastard was still brooding about what happened last time. She 
looked at Su Chen and defended,

"Bastard, I'm not a liar. Besides, didn't Sun Buer already promise to tell you where the treasure is?"

"His! That stinky woman Sun Buer agreed, but she didn’t say a specific time. If that woman didn’t 
tell me for the rest of her life, would I have to wait for the rest of my life?"

"You bastard, don't say bad words in front of me, or I won't help you anymore."

"Shit, what else can you help me with? Warm bed?"Su Chen looked at Lin Chaoying and said 
speechlessly. Although Su Chen had some bad thoughts about Lin Chaoying, she thought that Lin 
Chaoying was a dedicated woman. I'm afraid she would not be interested in a passionate man. 
Moreover, she thought that Lin Chaoying was a dedicated woman.

Lin Chaoying is a crazy woman. If he dares to use force to do something bad to Lin Chaoying, I am 
afraid that Lin Chaoying will pursue him relentlessly in the future. When



Lin Chaoying heard what this bastard said, she turned red with anger. He glared at Su Chen and 
cursed,

"Shameless, you are a shameless pervert."

Li Mochou doesn't want Master and Wu Xiangjun to continue fighting each other like this. She 
knows that Master is in love with Wu Xiangjun.

Otherwise, she wouldn't have been nagging Wu Xiangjun every day in the past few days, even more 
than once. She was about to leave the city to see Wu Xiangjun.

If she and Xiao Longnu hadn't stopped her, the master would have secretly left the city to help Wu 
Xiangjun.

Li Mochou thought that her master had not rested all night last night just to persuade Sun Buer to 
tell him Su Chen's treasure mountain, but now the master didn't tell Wu Xiangjun directly.

This made Li Mochou couldn't help but interjected,"Wu Xiangjun, my master yesterday convinced 
Sun Buer to tell you where the mountain is." Somewhere, you really wronged my master this time."

Xiao Longnu was also very angry and scolded her master,

"That is, my master didn't take any rest last night just to convince Sun Buer that you, bastard, are a 
shameless bastard."

Su Chen looked at Lin Chaoying in surprise. He didn't expect that Lin Chaoying would convince 
the old stubborn.

But when he heard Xiao Longnu scolding him, he rolled his eyes and ignored her. A pair of A-level 
women cannot do anything.

Although Xia Xiaolongnu is very beautiful, but he doesn't have any thoughts about women who are 
not well-developed.



Su Chen smiled and came to Lin Chaoying and said,"I guess, Lin Chaoying, you are doing your 
best." Atonement?"

"Go away, I don't want to deal with you, you shameless bastard."When Lin Chaoying saw how 
close this bastard was to her, she blushed and pushed Su Chen away and said angrily,

"Hahaha!"

At noon, all the captains of the army have arrived at Mu Guiying's house, and Mu Guiying, Xue Nu, 
and Shi Qingxuan also got up at almost noon.

Although they were still a little tired, this time Su Chen wanted to arrange things for the army, and 
these women had to come over.

In the hall, thirty-nine captains of ten thousand men were sitting aside waiting for Su Chen's arrival. 
They also got the news that this time Wu Xiangjun wanted to integrate all the people here. The 
army, and even organized these troops into a legion.

This made all the captains of Dayuan very happy. If a powerful legion was formed, then they would 
be the legion directly under Wu Xiangjun in the future.

Chapter 639

Su Chen accompanied Mu Guiying and Xue Nu after dinner and was about to meet the captains. He 
had already thought about how to form a large combat legion, and would even form multiple such 
legions in the future.

Mu Guiying, Huang Rong, Shen Luoyan, Li Xiuning, and even Zhao Min are all outstanding 
commanders. Su Chen will form a powerful army for these women in the future.

From now on, the marching and fighting matters will be left to them, and the women at home 
cannot be idle. To see which of them can manage the country, Su Chen decided to leave the locked-
down matters to them.

Women like Zhu Yuyan, Fan Qinghui, Yao Yue and other women are all managers of a powerful 
sect. If they are allowed to manage the country in the future, they should be able to do it. After all, 
those women are not just flower vases.



Lin Chaoying, who was next to Su Chen, saw Su Chen's absent-minded look and asked 
suspiciously,

"What are you thinking, you bastard?"

"Never mind your business, just eat your food."Su Chen said angrily when he heard Lin Chaoying's 
words.

This time he and his women were supposed to have dinner together, but Lin Chaoying, a crazy 
woman, also came to join in the fun. This made Su Chen very unhappy.

"you......Do you want to die? Lin Chaoying angrily crushed her chopsticks and threatened Su Chen.

She really wanted to strangle this bastard to death. She finally convinced Sun Buer, but this bastard 
still lied to her. The incident made Lin Chaoying resentful and helpless towards this bastard.

Su Chen swallowed his saliva when he looked at Lin Chaoying's two trembling mountains.

"Lin Chaoying, can you kill me? Look at my women around you. They are stronger than you. Do 
you care if you do anything to me?"

"shameless bastard!"

"Ha ha! I just like to see you helpless against me."

Xue Nu was very speechless when she looked at Su Chen and Lin Chaoying. She could see that Lin 
Chaoying had feelings for Su Chen, and Su Chen, a bastard, might also have ideas for Lin 
Chaoying.

But now they are constantly fighting each other. , Xue Nu wanted to help Su Chen. As long as Su 
Chen helped Lin Chaoying improve her strength, I believed that the relationship between them 
would develop for the better in the future.

Xue Nu stood up and came to Su Chen and said to him,



"Husband, give one of your Zhu Guo to Sister Lin. Sister Lin is now at the peak of Grandmaster 
strength. If she eats the Zhu Guo, she will definitely become a master in the late stage of Grand 
Master. Sister Lin’s decades of practice are very good. of solid."

Su Chen didn't expect that Xue Nu would let him give Lin Chaoying a red fruit, but it would be fine 
if he gave Lin Chaoying a red fruit. After all, Lin Chaoying was good to him.

But just giving this crazy woman a red fruit would make him Isn’t it too cheap for her?

Su Chen thought about it and said to Xue Nu,

"Husband, I have no red fruit. I have given this crazy woman a red fruit, and this crazy woman also 
cheated me of a red fruit. Now I have no red fruit."

"Forehead! Already given?"

Xue Nu didn't expect that Su Chen had already given Lin Chaoying the red fruits.

She looked at Lin Chaoying and smiled awkwardly. Although she didn't know why Lin Chaoying 
didn't eat the red fruits, it wasn't something she should be concerned about.

Su Chen saw Xue Nu's embarrassed look and said to her,

"Yes, I gave them, but this crazy woman gave those red fruits to her disciples. It was really a waste 
of two red fruits."

"Bastard, why did I waste my apprenticeship?"Lin Chaoying is now so angry with this bastard that 
she is going crazy.

Fortunately, her disciples are not here this time. If they were here, I am afraid they would feel very 
guilty after hearing Su Chen's words.

She also knows that one Zhu Guo can raise a master master to the level of a great master.



But his disciples' cultivation level is a bit low after all, and now the world and every country is in 
chaos.

Lin Chaoying is also worried about what her disciples will do in the future. Safety allows them to 
improve their strength. After all, beautiful women are very insecure.

"Ah! Ah! as long as you are happy!"

"Damn, what the hell is that expression on your face?"

"Mu Guiying, let's go to the hall. The captains of ten thousand have arrived. I'll leave it to you to 
integrate the army."

"Okay, husband."

Su Chen didn't pay attention to Lin Chaoying. He wanted to give this crazy woman a break first. 
After he arranged things here, he would give Lin Chaoying a red fruit to increase his strength. 
However, this crazy woman couldn't do it without giving her some benefits.

"Your Majesty, I have met all the ladies."

After Su Chen brought Mu Guiying, Xue Nu, Shi Qingxuan and the others to the hall, the captains 
here saluted Su Chen, Mu Guiying and the others and said,

"Everyone, sit down!"

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

After Su Chen and Mu Guiying sat down, Su Chen saw that Lin Chaoying had also followed, which 
made Su Chen very speechless. Why was this Lin Chaoying following him so hauntingly? Now it 
made him even more confused. The captains all misunderstood that she was also their woman.

Lin Chaoying sat next to the snow girl with a red face and felt very embarrassed. If she knew that 
these captains would call her this, she would not join in the fun.



Su Chen looked at the thirty-nine ten thousand captains sitting here. The Yuan army also suffered 
tens of thousands of casualties after the war. I am afraid that some of the ten thousand captains do 
not have many troops now. Su Chen looked at these ten thousand captains. The commander ordered 
with a serious expression,

"From today on, all your troops will belong to the newly formed Northern Army. The Northern 
Army has a total strength of 600,000. The commander of the Northern Army is Mu Guiying."

"There are five combat legions under the Northern Army. The first combat legion of the Northern 
Army consists of four Netherworld Iron Legions with 10,000 troops."

"The second combat legion of the Northern Army is composed of six thousand troops of the 
Xuanwu Legion, and the third combat legion of the Northern Army is composed of three cavalry 
troops of ten thousand men of the Wolf Cavalry."

"The Fourth Combat Legion of the Northern Army was composed of the original cavalry army with 
ninety thousand soldiers, and the Fifth Combat Army of the Northern Army was composed of the 
infantry army with fourteen thousand soldiers."

"The Fourth Combat Regiment of the Northern Army was henceforth named the Ranger Regiment, 
and the Fifth Combat Regiment of the Northern Army was named the Black Hawk Regiment."

"The Northern Army now has a total of 360,000 troops. I will replenish the remaining troops for 
you later. You now have 39 commanders of 10,000. The remaining 21 commanders of 10,000 are 
commanded by Commander Mu Guiying."

"After the integration of the Dayuan army, it will become my direct army. From now on, you will 
no longer be the army of the Dayuan Kingdom. You will be my direct army, and you can only be 
loyal to me in the future."

"After the integration, all the armies of Dayuan will be treated the same as those directly under my 
corps. Whether it is military pay or war benefits, you will be treated the same as those directly 
under my corps."

"I have only one request from you, obey! You must obey any of my orders without hesitation, and 
you must resolutely execute my orders even if you die. Do you understand me?"



"clear!"

All the captains of Dayuan in the hall immediately stood up and saluted, saying,

"Who will you fight for in the future?"Su Chen stood up and looked at all the ten thousand captains 
here and asked loudly.

At this time, whether it was the ten thousand captains before the Great Yuan Dynasty, or all the ten 
thousand captains of the Netherworld Iron Legion and the Xuanwu Legion, they all looked at Su 
Chen. He saluted and shouted loudly,

"Fighting for Lord Wu Xiang, it is not a pity to die!"

"Fighting for Lord Wu Xiang, it is not a pity to die!"

"Fighting for Lord Wu Xiang, it is not a pity to die!"

Chapter 640

All the captains of Dayuan are very excited now. Now that they have become the direct regiment of 
Wu Xiangjun, their treatment will be very good in the future.

From what they learned about the Netherworld Iron Legion and the Xuanwu Legion, an ordinary 
soldier earns one tael of silver a month as military pay, one tael of silver.

Their soldiers in the Great Yuan Army earn less than 200 taels of silver a month, and even have At 
that time, Fang's army was not paid yet.

And the salary of a ten thousand husband for one month is enough to get one tael of gold, which is 
something they dare not even think about.

Although in the past they could plunder the people and wealthy merchants and nobles in the city 
after attacking the city, the money they robbed was still taken away by the commander of the army, 
and they did not get much in the end. Moreover, during the war, there were war benefits, such as 



fine wine, They will be able to enjoy soaps, tea and other luxury goods produced in Gusu City in 
the future, not to mention the provision of sophisticated armor and weapons.

Mu Guiying, Xue Nu, Shi Qingxuan and others were very happy after seeing all the ten thousand 
captains' loyalty to Su Chen, especially Su Chen's current performance, which they had never seen 
before.

This time, Mu Guiying, Xue Nu, Shi Qingxuan and others were very surprised when they looked at 
Su Chen.

Is this still the obscure playboy Suchen they often see?

At this moment, Su Chen was full of domineering and majestic. Their man was indeed worthy of a 
top noble, a born ruler.

Lin Chaoying is also looking at Su Chen with beautiful eyes. Although she knows that Su Chen is 
Wu Xiangjun, a top noble, she has never seen Su Chen like this.

She saw Su Chen angrily issuing orders, and Lin Chaoying now wanted to express her feelings to 
Su Chen immediately.

But she thought that now was not the time, and besides, this bastard Su Chen hadn't pursued her yet. 
In addition to being angry with her, that bastard was still angry with her.

Lin Chaoying shook her head bitterly and looked at Su Chen, who was very complicated.

She was now very worried that that bastard would stop because of her age.

After Su Chen saw the expressions of all the captains, he waved his hands to make them quiet 
down. Su Chen took out a token and a big seal from the system space and handed it to Mu Guiying 
and said,

"Mu Guiying, this token is the fire phoenix token. This is the commander seal of the Northern 
Army. The commander flag of the Northern Army is the red fire phoenix flag. The commander flag 
is being made at a fast pace and should be ready by night."



"Husband, where is the blue bird jade pendant?"After Mu Guiying took over the Fire Phoenix 
Token and the Commandery Seal of the Northern Legion, she looked at Su Chen and asked with a 
smile,

"Here you go, how do you know about the Blue Bird Jade Pendant?"Su Chen didn't expect that Mu 
Guiying also knew about the Blue Bird Jade Pendant. Fortunately, he still had a few Blue Bird Jade 
Pendants in his system space, otherwise he might disappoint Mu Guiying this time.

"hehe! Sister Xue Nu told me, how can I represent my identity without the Blue Bird Jade Pendant? 
You bastard, if I don’t tell you, are you not going to give me the Blue Bird Jade Pendant?"

"how could be? Didn't I forget that I had been thinking about forming the Northern Army?"

"Huh, I hope so."

Mu Guiying didn't care so much about Su Chen. Anyway, she already had the Blue Bird Jade 
Pendant, and she was now a veritable wife of Wu Xiangjun. She didn't embarrass Su Chen anymore.

Su Chen thought of the supplies she had prepared for Mu Guiying. supplies, he hurriedly said to Mu 
Guiying,

"Madam, I left the army's food and grass for three years in the Netherworld Iron Legion, as well as 
200,000 sets of weapons and armor, 100,000 horses, and one million taels of gold in money. You 
can go to the Netherworld Iron Legion in the future. Receive inside."

Su Chen left all the supplies he got from the system to Mu Guiying's Northern Army this time.

After all, the Northern Army has nothing now. If they march and fight in the future, I'm afraid Mu 
Guiying will also give up for supplies. I have a headache.

Mu Guiying looked at Su Chen in surprise and asked,

"How come you have so many supplies? How come I don’t know when you prepared it?"



Su Chen didn't want to tell Mu Guiying that he had system space. He made a haha and said with a 
smile,

"You will know this later. With these supplies, I believe you can launch a war against the Song 
Dynasty after integrating the Northern Army."

"Well, I originally wanted to sort out the material supplies in Chang'an City to see if I could launch 
a war against the Song Dynasty. With so much material supplies this time, I think I can launch a war 
against the Song Dynasty soon."

"By the way, you can also recruit the garrison of Chang'an City. It would be good if these troops are 
strictly trained. I have sent the secret guard to pass the order to Gusu City. I am afraid that the 
additional troops of the Northern Army will not arrive so soon."

"I understand, I will recruit the defenders of Chang'an City"

"Well, you and Yuki and the others can take these captains to arrange things for the Northern Army. 
I'll leave at night. You don't have to worry about me leaving now."

""Okay."

Mu Guiying and Xue Nu nodded to Su Chen, and they took the captains of ten thousand to the 
military camp to arrange the military deployment of each legion.

After Mu Guiying, Xue Nu and the others left with the captains of ten thousand, Su Chen He began 
to think about who to take with him when he left this time.

That stubborn woman Sun Buer would definitely take her away this time. If she didn't go with him, 
I'm afraid Sun Buer wouldn't tell him where the mountain was.

There is also Widow Chai. She must be taken with her this time, otherwise she will not know what 
trouble she will cause here. Su Chen is also worried that Mu Guiying and Xue Nu will find out 
about their relationship with Widow Chai.

Black Widow is his bodyguard. Concubine, she also wants to leave with herself. In this way, three 
women will leave with herself. Su Chen also feels that there is no need to take others with him.



"Su Chen, are you leaving at night?"Lin Chaoying looked at Su Chen holding her chin and thinking 
about something and asked.

After Lin Chaoying learned that Su Chen left at night, she felt very uncomfortable, especially when 
she saw Mu Guiying's face full of joy this time. , Mu Guiying even got Su Chen's blue bird jade 
pendant, which made Lin Chaoying very envious.

Su Chen was startled by Lin Chaoying's sudden voice. He didn't expect Lin Chaoying to still stay 
here.

"Let me guess, Lin Chaoying, why are you still here? I thought you were out"

"Bastard, go to hell!"

Lin Chaoying didn't expect that this bastard didn't even notice her here. This made her angrily grab 
Su Chen's arm and bite it.

"Damn it, Lin Chaoying, it’s wrong for you to bite someone."Su Chen didn't expect Lin Chaoying 
to bite her, which made Su Chen very confused.

Could it be that Lin Chaoying had thoughts about herself?

Isn't this Lin Chaoying attracted by her beauty?

""Shameless bastard"

Lin Chaoying glared at Su Chen and left. She didn't want to see this shameless bastard now, but she 
didn't want to feel better about this bastard. She would also go to the Golden Treasure.

"Neuropathy! As expected, the woman is untouchable, but would Lin Chaoying still be like that at 
such an old age? It seems that I have never asked such a question to other older women. It seems 
that I will ask it some time in the future."
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