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Chapter 801

Su Yan smiled after hearing the Ming Emperor's order to capture her.

She was not afraid of all the masters here.

With the Black Bird, they could deal with these so-called masters.

Moreover, there were a large number of shadow assassins around her, even half a step away. Shi 
Guanyin of the Golden Core Realm is also protecting her by her side, and Jellyfish Yinji will arrive 
today. With these masters, Su Yan has nothing to worry about.

Su Chen felt very helpless now.

Just now, Shi Guanyin and Fairy Yunmeng had sent messages to him, and even the old lady Hua 
Baifeng had sent messages to threaten him.

He did not expect that there were land gods in the Celestial Realm in the palace. They were all his 
people, which made him worry in vain all night.

Su Chen also told them the information about Ye Di's presence, but he didn't expect that they all 
knew it.

Moreover, Shi Guanyin also said that the jellyfish Yinji would arrive today, which made Su Chen 
not worried about anything, even if his identity was exposed, it would not matter.

Su Chen looked at Su Yan and thought that no wonder this girl dared to reveal her identity.

This little girl was becoming more and more lawless, and now she even went to the Ming Palace to 
show off.



This made Su Chen look at Su Yan and thought that she must teach her a lesson in the future. Her, 
otherwise she will be even more lawless in the future

"Lord Shen, Uncle Emperor, what's wrong with you?"The Ming Emperor also feels something is 
wrong now.

He knows that even if his uncle Zhu ignores his orders, Cao Zhengchun, Liu Jin, and even Zhuge 
Zheng will obey them.

But now Cao Zhengchun and Liu Jin are so wet that they are about to collapse. On the ground, 
Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Wuwu were sweating constantly on their foreheads.

Emperor Ming guessed that something might have happened to these people.

Zhuge Zhengwo looked at Emperor Ming and said helplessly,

"Your Majesty, there are experts in the palace who are land gods in the heaven and human realm. 
We are all locked by the land gods in the heaven and human realm. If we have any intention, I am 
afraid we will be killed immediately."

"sky.....sky.....A terrestrial immortal in the heavenly realm?"The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty 
stood up immediately in surprise.

He did not expect that Princess Su Yan would be protected by a terrestrial immortal in the heavenly 
realm.

No wonder she dared to appear alone in the palace of the Ming Empire, but there were also 
heavenly beings in his palace. The land immortal in the realm of heaven and earth, and the most 
powerful existence among the land gods in the heaven-human realm.

Emperor Ming looked at Chu Liuxiang and regained his composure and said,"Chu Liuxiang, let 
your master come over!"

Chu Liuxiang didn't expect that Princess Su Yan had land gods in the heaven and human realm, but 
what's the use?



His master Ye Di had even killed land gods in the heaven and human realm.

Princess Su Yan was in the heaven and human realm. The protection of land gods is also useless. It 
is impossible for her to escape from the Ming Palace this time.

"Emperor, my master must have discovered this place. He may be nearby. You don't have to worry."

"That’s good!"

Su Yan smiled when he heard the conversation between Emperor Ming and Chu Liuxiang and said,

"oh?"

"Didn’t you expect that there were land gods in the Heavenly Realm in the Ming Dynasty Palace?"

"Chu Liuxiang, I know you. Su Rongrong and Li Hongxiu seemed to be your confidante before, but 
they are now my father's maids."

"It seems that your arm was also chopped off by my father. Do you want me to chop off your other 
arm now?"

Chu Liuxiang said with a ferocious face when she heard Su Yan's words,"Damn it, if I catch you 
this time, I will make your life worse than death."

"presumptuous!"

Boom!

When Cheng Yi heard Chu Liuxiang's words, she quickly knocked Chu Liuxiang away with a palm.

She had no mercy.



This time, even if Chu Liuxiang survived, he would probably be seriously injured.

Cough, cough, cough!

"Damn it, you attacked me unexpectedly!"

"A scumbag like a grandmaster, can you use me to sneak attack you? Chengyi looked at Chu 
Liuxiang and said disdainfully,

"Cheng Yi, leave him alive first, I will take care of him later."

When Su Yan saw that Cheng Yi was about to kill Chu Liuxiang, she waved her hand to stop him. 
She would not let Chu Liuxiang die like this, and she would not let anyone who dared threaten her 
have an easy time.

"Yes, Princess! Su

Yan looked at Emperor Ming, walked towards him and asked with a smile,"Emperor Ming, are you 
going to come down by yourself or should I have someone throw you down?""

"you...you......Someone, come and protect me! Come and protect me!"The Emperor of the Ming 
Dynasty shouted worriedly when he saw Su Yan walking towards him with the Black Bird Envoy.

Duan Tianya and Gui Haiyi Dao, the four secret agents, and Cheng Shifei immediately came to 
guard the emperor.

And the cold-blooded soldiers of the four famous arresters He Zhuiming also came to protect the 
emperor.

Hundreds of imperial guards and imperial guards in the palace, as well as eunuchs from the East 
and West Factory, all of them also guarded the Ming Emperor under the throne.

Shangguan Haitang and Qingwu did not take action, and even Qingqing held him back. They didn't 
want to be enemies with Su Chen.



All the officials in the court hurriedly hid aside. These ministers didn't know martial arts. Now they 
just wanted to save their lives.

"Kill them!"Su Yan ordered expressionlessly when he saw these desperate people and the imperial 
army,

"Yes, Princess."

Green clothes and yellow clothes led the twelve black bird guards to kill the Forbidden Army and 
Duan Tianya, while orange clothes stayed with Princess Su Yan to protect her.

Su Yan saw Shangguan Haitang and Wuqing next to him Without taking action, she smiled slyly 
and said,"Shangguan Haitang, Wu Qing, you are indeed my father's confidante. You didn't take 
action this time. I will tell my father later."

Shangguan Haitang and Qing Wu's faces turned dark when they heard Su Yan's words.

Is this girl trying to force them? Can they still stay in the Ming Dynasty after this girl says this?

I'm afraid they will have to stay with this girl after this incident. If they had left, they would have 
been imprisoned by the Ming Emperor if they had stayed in the Ming Dynasty.

Shangguan Haitang looked at Su Yan and said with a dark face,"You girl, are you forcing us to 
escape the Ming Dynasty with you? Su

Yan smiled and said to Shangguan Haitang,"Since you know my father, why are you still staying in 
this decadent empire of Ming Dynasty?""

"After all, we have our big friends here, how could we leave?" Wuqing looked at Zhuge Zhengwo 
and Lengxue and the others and said helplessly.

Although she said so, I'm afraid she won't be able to leave this time.

If she continues to stay, I'm afraid she may implicate Zhuge Zhengwo, Lengxue and the others. 
People.



Su Yan bent his head and looked at Qing Wuqing and said playfully,"You don't have to worry about 
it now, I have already made the decision for you."

Shangguan Haitang glanced at Su Chen next to him and said helplessly,"We are so unlucky to know 
you father and daughter."

"Hey hey hey! What's so good about the Ming Empire? As long as you leave with me, I'll leave you 
a legion commander in my Black Bird Legion. This is an elite legion that commands tens of 
thousands of troops. How about that? Am I not bad to you?"

Chapter 802

Su Yan is preparing to strengthen her Black Bird Legion. This time she will not only recruit 
Shangguan Haitang and Qingwu into her Black Bird Legion, but even Lu Xiaofeng and Su Yan will 
also join her Black Bird Legion.

Lu Xiaofeng and others are very good in strength.

Although they cannot be the commanders of the subordinate legions of the Black Bird Legion, they 
are still very good as the master guards of the Black Bird Legion.

In the palace hall, they led the twelve black bird guards in green to continuously attack and kill the 
imperial guards and the imperial guards in the court. Under the charge of the two great masters in 
green and yellow, the imperial guards, the imperial guards, Dongxi The eunuchs in the factory were 
being killed one after another.

Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu ignored these great masters.

Now they could only watch the palace guards being killed one after another.

They did not dare to make any move now. The land gods in the heavenly realm were not something 
they could resist.

Duan Tianya, Gui Hai Yidao, and others are now nervously guarding the Ming Emperor. They can 
only wait for time to let the imperial army outside the palace hall come to the court to rescue him.



Emperor Ming saw that the imperial guards in the court were about to be killed, and he hurriedly 
gave an order to the court,"Send me a message to the imperial guards outside the hall to come to the 
rescue."

A eunuch said with a mournful face at the door of the hall,"Your Majesty, we They couldn't get out 
of the main hall. The main hall of the imperial palace was blocked by experts. The eunuchs and 
imperial guards who went out of the main hall died silently."

Emperor Ming was a little scared when he heard the eunuch's words.

He didn't expect that the main hall of the palace was blocked. The main hall The tens of thousands 
of forbidden troops outside cannot be notified now.

Does Princess Su Yan want to kill him, the Ming Emperor?

Emperor Ming looked at Su Yan and asked with an ugly expression,"Damn it, Princess Su Yan, do 
you want to kill me?"

"Emperor Ming, when did I say I wanted to kill you?"Su Yan pulled the confused Princess Yunluo 
and looked at Emperor Ming and said with a smile,

"Don't you want to kill me? Then why did you order your men to kill these guards?"

"I just don’t want you to sit there and talk to me. Emperor Ming, if you don’t want to be kicked off 
the throne, just leave the throne now."

The Ming Emperor's face became gloomy when he heard Su Yan's words.

He knew that if he continued to sit on the throne, he would be kicked off sooner or later. By then, 
he, the Ming Emperor, would definitely lose face in front of all the officials.

But if he wants to do it now By leaving the throne in despair, he also wanted to disgrace the Ming 
Empire.



Emperor Zhu Houzhao of the Ming Dynasty did not know what to do now.

On the one hand, he, the emperor, was kicked off the throne, and on the other hand, he left the 
emperor in despair. This is all to bring shame to him and the Ming Empire.

Zhuge Zhengyi looked at the gloomy Emperor Ming.

He knew that this was not the time to think about the shame.

If the Emperor did not leave the throne, he might use It won't be long before he will be kicked off 
the throne, so the Emperor of Ming Dynasty may really lose his face.

Zhuge Zhengyi looked at Emperor Ming Dynasty and sighed and said,"Your Majesty, if you keep 
the green hills, you don't have to worry about not having firewood." Please ask the Holy Spirit to 
come to Weichen."

When Zhuge Zhengwu heard what Zhuge Zhengwo said, he hurriedly said to the Ming 
Emperor,"Please, Your Majesty, please move!""

"Please, Your Majesty, please move!"

The officials in the court also knelt down and saluted the Ming Emperor at the edge of the court 
hall.

"Go, move your car!"

The Ming Emperor looked at the battle below, then he stood up and said to Duan Tianya and the 
others who were guarding him with a gloomy face,

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

When Su Yan saw the Ming Emperor coming down from the throne, she curled her lips and glanced 
at the Ming Emperor with disdain.



This Ming Emperor was really an incompetent emperor.

Su Yan looked at the green clothes and the others who were still killing the imperial guards. She 
waved her hands and ordered the others in green clothes,

"Green clothes, you can come back"

"Yes, Princess!"

Su Yan pulled Princess Yunluo and walked towards the emperor's throne in the court hall.

She had never sat on any emperor's throne before.

This time she wanted to try the difference of this emperor's throne.

Su Yan was taking Yun Luo When Princess Luo walked towards the emperor's throne, she suddenly 
turned back to look at Shangguan Haitang and Qingwu and said with a smile,"Shangguan Haitang, 
Wuqing, you can come with me too!"

Shangguan Haitang and Qingqing looked at each other and walked over together.

They were both tricked by this little princess.

Even if they stay here, I am afraid that the people of the Ming Empire will trust them again and 
even arrest them both. Or kill him.

When Tie Shou saw the wink Wu Qing gave him, he was very helpless and followed Qing Wu.

He couldn't even figure out what happened now.

He was confused by Qing Wu now. With that, Tie Shou will support anything decided by Wu Qing. 
This is something he owes Qing Qing, and he will protect Qing Qing’s safety throughout his life. Su 
Yan and Princess Yunluo are walking along the steps towards the emperor’s throne, Cheng Yi and 
the others were guarding Su Yan one by one. All the Ming officials in the court were looking at Su 



Yan with ugly expressions. This was something that had never happened since the founding of the 
Ming Empire. The Ming Empire had lost all face this time.. As Su Yan walked, he asked Princess 
Yunluo beside him,"Princess Yunluo, have you ever sat on the emperor's throne?

"

"How could I have sat there? Su Yan, is it really okay for you to do this?"Princess Yunluo looked at 
the Ming Emperor in the court and shook her head.

Princess Yunluo was also frightened by Princess Su Yan's decisive killing.

She did not expect that Princess Su Yan was actually in the Ming court. She ordered her 
subordinates to kill people, and also forced her emperor brother to leave the throne of the Ming 
Emperor.

This made Princess Yunluo feel very uneasy.

Su Yan smiled and waved his hand and said,"No problem, it's not a big deal. matter."

When Su Yan sat on the throne of the Ming Emperor, she didn't think there was anything good 
about the emperor's throne. It was just a little comfortable to sit on.

Su Yan looked at Cheng Yi and asked,"Cheng Yi, my aunt's Zhao. The order hasn't been read out 
yet, right?"

"Princess, the Emperor of Ming Dynasty has no order to take Mrs. Jun." Chengyi bowed down and 
saluted Su Yan.

Su Yan looked at the officials of the Ming Dynasty hiding on both sides of the court and 
ordered,"Now you can read out my aunt's decree. Let all the officials of the Ming Dynasty come to 
the middle of the hall to listen to me. Aunt's order"

"Yes, Princess!"After Cheng Yi heard Su Yan's order, she looked at the officials of the Ming 
Dynasty on both sides of the court and threatened,"All officials of the Ming Dynasty come to the 
middle of the court or die!""



When hundreds of officials in the Ming Dynasty heard Cheng Yi's threat, they all looked at each 
other and did not take any action. They were worried that if they obeyed Cheng Yi's order now, the 
Ming Emperor would settle accounts with them in the future.

"Let's all go!"

The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty was helpless now.

He saw that the twelve guards under Su Yan had come down the steps.

If the officials of the Ming Dynasty did not obey the orders, I am afraid that those guards would kill 
all the officials of the Ming Dynasty.

Cheng Yi saw that the officials of the Ming Dynasty had been killed. The officials were already 
standing in the court, so she took out the golden scroll, held it up and said loudly,

"Madam Jun’s order!"

"Emperor Ming!"

"Hundreds of officials of the Ming Dynasty!"

"Listen to Zhao!"

Chapter 803

In the palace court, after Cheng Yi took out Concubine Yan's order again, all the officials in the 
court were at a loss what to do.

The Emperor of Ming Dynasty looked at the Zhaoling in Cheng Yi's hand with very helpless eyes. 
He just asked him to get up and listen to Mrs. Jun's Zhaoling, but now he was kicked off the throne 
and stood in the court to listen to and read Mrs. Jun's Zhaoling. , which made Emperor Ming 
clenched his hands tightly in his sleeves and was very angry.



Green Yi, Huang Yi and the Twelve Black Bird Guards all knelt down in front of Cheng Yi after he 
raised Madam Jun's order.

"Kneel down and listen, or die?"

When Cheng Yi saw that the Emperor of Ming Dynasty and the officials of Ming Dynasty were just 
standing and not kneeling, she threatened without expression,"

Boom!

Just when Cheng Yi threatened the Emperor of Ming Dynasty and the officials in the court, a 
powerful aura enveloped them. In the court.

Plop! Plop! Plop!

Forced by this powerful momentum, the Emperor of Ming Dynasty and all the officials of Ming 
Dynasty were forced to kneel down one by one with pale faces. The

Emperor of Ming Dynasty was very frightened when he knelt on the ground.

No wonder Zhuge Zhu and I ignored the cold sweat on our foreheads just now. It turns out that the 
aura and pressure of the Heavenly Realm are so powerful, but why hasn't Emperor Ye appeared yet?

Does Emperor Ye want to see him, the Ming Emperor, being humiliated here?

Even in the court hall Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Yiyi, the great masters, all knelt down one by one.

They all looked at each other with cold sweats all over their bodies.

This powerful aura was even more powerful than the aura that threatened them just now. They 
Everyone guessed that Princess Su Yan might have more than one land immortal in the Celestial 
Realm protecting her.

Jiang Yuyan knelt down with cold sweat on her head.



She felt very uneasy now. There was a huge gap between the Grand Master and the Celestial Realm. 
It was so big that she still hadn't discovered where the Heavenly Realm that threatened her was.

Princess Yunluo, Shangguan Haitang, and Wuqing beside Su Yan were also forced to kneel down by 
this powerful aura. They couldn't stop this powerful momentum. In the entire Ming Dynasty hall, 
there were people holding Mrs. Jun's orange clothes and sitting on the Ming throne. Su Yan did not 
kneel down.

Oh!

And Jiang Yu Su Chen behind Yan did not kneel down either.

Su Chen looked at Jiang Yuyan kneeling in front of him and wanted to slap her butt.

He did not expect that Jiang Yuyan's bulging body was very attractive.

But at this time

After Chengyi looked at the Ming Emperor and Ming officials who were kneeling, she opened the 
golden scroll and prepared to read.

After the golden scroll was opened, a golden phoenix pattern appeared on the back of the golden 
scroll, followed by a crisp phoenix cry. There was a sudden sound.

Chirp! -.

In the imperial palace hall, a huge golden phoenix phantom appeared in the Ming Dynasty Hall. 
After this huge phoenix phantom flew around the Ming Dynasty Hall, it returned again. The 
Zhaoling in Cheng Yi's hand disappeared.

All the people in the court knelt on the ground and looked at the illusory phoenix. They were all 
stunned and at a loss.

They did not expect that such a strange phenomenon would appear in the Zhaoling of Mrs. Jun..



Is Mr. Wu Xiang the emperor who was destined to be the emperor?

Is Mrs. Jun also the queen to whom the destiny was destined?

Su Chen rubbed his head and felt very helpless when he saw the illusory phoenix that appeared.

People here may not know what is going on. It happened, but he knew that this must have been 
done by Concubine Yan using Yin Yang.

Concubine Yan's Yin Yang was very powerful.

She could transform into a golden crow to attack, so it would probably be easy for her to create an 
illusory phoenix. thing.

Is this necessary?

Su Yan also looked at the phoenix that appeared with great interest.

She had seen these scenes before, but before she saw the golden crow, this time it was a phoenix!

Su Yan touched her Little Chin wanted to ask Concubine Yan to get a black bird for her after she 
returned to Gusu City, so that her black bird army would be a real black bird army.

Xuan Niao made Cheng Yi unfold his expressionless hands and read out the order seriously,

"Gusu City, Madam Jun, Phoenix Zhaoling!"

"The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty, all officials of the Ming Dynasty listen to Zhao!"

"Yingtianshunshun! Take Ziming’s orders!"



"Wu Xiangjun was assassinated and disappeared in the Ming Empire. The Ming Empire has an 
unshirkable responsibility"

"Jin Zhao!"

"The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty captured the Wudang Clan and the Ghost Palace members 
within three days of the decree and handed them over to Gusu City."

"The Ming Empire compensated Gusu City with 10 million taels of gold"

"Other!"

"Mingzhou City in the south and Shanhaiguan in the north of the Ming Empire were handed over to 
Gusu City for one year."

"like!"

"The Ming Empire refused to allow it!"

"Millions of troops in Gusu City will take it from themselves!"

"This is Zhao!"

"In Tianxuan Calendar, it is the 100th and 109th year, and the 17th day of the 3rd month."

The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty glared at Su Yan angrily when he heard Madam Jun's order.

He did not expect that Madam Jun of Gusu City would issue such an order.

This conflicted with the foundation of the Ming Dynasty.

All emperors of the Ming Empire followed the ancestral order. Training: No marriage! No tribute! 
No submission! The emperor will guard the country, and the king will die in the country!



If he, the Ming Emperor, agrees to the conditions proposed by Madam Jun, I am afraid that he, the 
Ming Emperor, will also go to the end. When all the officials of the Ming Dynasty heard Madam 
Jun, Zhao Ling looked at each other.

They did not expect that Madam Jun would make such a condition.

I am afraid that the Emperor Ming would not agree.

The Emperor of Ming Dynasty was originally prepared to use the power of the whole country to 
fight against Gusu City. Now Madam Jun's condition, I am afraid that it will The Emperor of Ming 
Dynasty was even more angry and determined to go to war with Gusu City.

After Cheng Yi read out Mrs. Jun's order, the aura and coercion in the court disappeared, and 
everyone in the court stood up unsteadily. , but these people looked at Princess Su Yan on the throne 
with different expressions. The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty looked at Su Yan with anger, while 
the officials of the Ming Dynasty looked at Su Yan with horror, and looked at Su Yan with 
admiration. He looked at Su Yan angrily.

Su Yan sat on the throne and smiled and asked Emperor Ming,"Emperor Ming, do you want to 
fulfill my aunt's order?""

The Emperor of Ming Dynasty looked at Su Yan and shouted coldly with no expression on his face,

"I! He will never agree to Madam Jun's conditions. If he wants to start a war, he will start a war. The 
Ming Empire will not compromise on Gusu City."

Su Yan clapped his hands and praised the Ming Emperor,

"good! Emperor Ming, I hope you will not regret your decision this time. Mingzhou City and 
Shanhaiguan City, our Gusu City, have to be decided."

"But when our army from Gusu City begins to attack, it will not stop at Mingzhou City and 
Shanhaiguan."



"I hope that your Ming Empire’s army is promising and will not be as vulnerable as those countries 
that our Gusu City destroyed before.

Emperor Ming clenched his fist and said angrily,"Me!" You will not regret your decision. However, 
Commander Su Yan, please be careful that your army will be destroyed by our Ming army."

"Just wishful thinking!"

Chapter 804

In the Ming court,

Su Yan didn't care at all about the threat from the Ming Emperor.

The army of the Ming Empire still wanted to defeat the army of Gusu City. This was a bit fanciful.

"Who are you?"

Su Yan looked at Su Chen at this time and asked him.

Su Yan didn't care about this ugly middle-aged man before, but just now when her aunt used her 
momentum to overwhelm the entire court.

Everyone knelt down. , but this ugly middle-aged man did not kneel down, and was even secretly 
looking at the emperor's concubine in front of him.

This made Su Yan suspicious of this ugly middle-aged man.

Su Yan now looked carefully Su Chen, she felt that this ugly middle-aged man felt very familiar to 
her, but she couldn't remember where she had seen this ugly middle-aged man.

Su Chen was very helpless when Su Yan noticed him, It seems that he was exposed just now when 
everyone here knelt down.

Su Yan may have recognized him.



"I? Just a nobody.

Su Yan rolled his eyes and ordered Cheng Yi and the others with a sly smile,"Nobody?" It turns out 
to be a nobody, so let’s kill him!"

When Su Chen heard that Su Yan was going to order the Black Bird Messenger to kill him, a black 
line appeared on his head.

Is this little girl going to kill her father to sacrifice to heaven?

When Su Chen saw the Black Bird Knight, they were about to come over and kill him. Himself, he 
waved his hand to Su Yan and said hurriedly,"I'll do it! Little girl, is it really okay for you to kill 
someone at every turn?"

"Tell me who you are? Or die!"Su Yan looked at Su Chen with a gleam of golden light in his eyes.

This is Su Yan's innate ability [awareness of words].

It is like a clairvoyant eye that can clearly see the enemy's disguise and flaws.

Su Chen saw Su Yan's His eyes were glowing with gold, and he knew that she was about to discover 
his disguise.

He knew Su Yan's"Sense of Moment" very clearly. He even asked Su Yan Qin to learn this talent of 
hers. This time he would fall into the hands of her daughter. Yes,

"Jiang Yulang! My name is Jiang Yulang."Su Chen is now worried that Su Yan will expose Tian's 
identity.

Although he is not worried about his identity being exposed at this time, after all, it is better to have 
one less thing to worry about.

"Hahaha!"



Su Yan looked at Su Chen and laughed.

This time she was very happy.

She didn't expect that her father was right next to her, even pretending to be an ugly middle-aged 
man.

If she hadn't had [Observe Moment and Color] 】 ability.

She couldn't find out that this ugly middle-aged man was her father.

In the court,

Emperor Ming and Zhuge Zhengwo, Zhu Yiyi, these great masters looked at Su Chen and were very 
confused. A master master was not killed by the sky. The aura of a terrestrial god in the human 
realm is suppressed?

How is this possible?

This ugly middle-aged man must not be simple, he?

Who is he?

Jiang Yuyan was also very confused about Su Chen.

When she was forced to kneel down just now , although she knew that the lewd thief did not kneel 
down, and that the lewd thief was still staring at her body, but was this lewd thief so powerful to 
resist the aura and pressure of the heavenly realm?

Chu Liuxiang covered his chest and When he came to Emperor Ming's side, he asked 
doubtfully,"Jiang Yulang? Emperor, is this person your subordinate? I'm afraid his strength is not 
simple."



"No, this is Concubine Yan's guard."The Emperor of Ming Dynasty looked at Su Chen and shook 
his head and said.

The Emperor of Ming Dynasty is also very doubtful about Su Chen's identity.

Who is this powerful and ugly man Jiang Yulang?

The aura and pressure of the terrestrial immortal in the Heavenly Realm just now, but Zhuge 
Zhengga and the others, the great masters, were forced to their knees, but Jiang Yulang, who was in 
the master realm, was unscathed?

He didn't even care at all about the power and pressure of the land gods in the heavenly realm?

Chu Liuxiang looked at Jiang Yuyan with a puzzled expression Asked,"Concubine Yan? This 
concubine of yours is actually stronger than me?"

"Um? Concubine Yan is a young lady from a martial arts family. She has some strength. Is 
Concubine Yan really stronger than you?"The Emperor of Ming Dynasty was very surprised when 
he heard Chu Liuxiang's words.

Concubine Yan is more powerful than Chu Liuxiang?

Could it be that Concubine Yan is also a powerful master of martial arts?

Zhu Wuwu looked at Jiang Yuyan and reminded the Emperor of Ming Dynasty,"Your Majesty, Yan 
The concubine is a great master, and her cultivation level is the same as mine."

"hiss! Grandmaster? Unexpectedly, Concubine Yan turned out to be a great master."The Emperor of 
Ming Dynasty was a little happy when he looked at Concubine Yan.

If Concubine Yan is really a great master, then he can rest easy in the future.

As long as Zhuge Zheng and I can cure his stubborn illness, Concubine Yan will be his real 
concubine from now on.



The Emperor of Ming Dynasty believed that Concubine Yan would do her best to help him in the 
future.

Shangguan Haitang and Qingqing saw Su Yan start to embarrass Su Chen, which made them feel 
that there was something good to watch.

The bastard had been hiding his identity and watching the show. This time, he saw that How would 
a bastard deal with Su Yan's troubles?

Su Yan looked at Su Chen with a smile and teased,"Jiang Yulang, right? Your name doesn't seem to 
match your appearance. Why don't you change your name?""

"change name? This can be done."Su Chen nodded hurriedly when he heard Su Yan's words.

He didn't like this unfortunate guy's name very much.

If Jiang Yuyan hadn't given it a random name, he wouldn't have agreed to it.

"So what are you going to call it?"Su Yan didn't expect that his father also didn't like the name Jiang 
Yulang, which made her feel that she was going to mess up this time.

She originally wanted to tease her father, but she was afraid that she wanted to help her father this 
time.

Su Chen dumped him directly His hair smiled and said,"Tall, rich and handsome!" How about this 
name? This name means that I am a tall, handsome and rich man."

Ugh!

Su Yan was disgusted by Su Chen's current appearance.

Her father appearedBut there is a very, very ugly middle-aged man, but he is still flipping his hair so 
cool and cool. Why should he be called tall, rich and handsome?



She didn't expect her father to be so shameless.

Su Yan was completely speechless towards her father.

Jiang Yuyan, who was next to Su Chen, had her mouth twitching all the time.

She finally understood this damn lecher, and he was probably the most shameless and shameless 
man she had ever encountered.

Shangguan Haitang and Qing Wu looked at Su Chen with dark faces.

They were really helpless towards Su Chen, this shameless bastard. This bastard really had no face 
at all.

Is this still a top noble?

This bastard is simply a gangster.

When Su Chen saw Shangguan Haitang and others looking at him with contempt, he felt 
embarrassed and hurriedly called Su Yan,

"Little girl, if you have nothing to do, leave as soon as possible. There is a powerful half-step Jindan 
realm master in the palace."

"I have one more thing, I will leave after finishing it, but, father! You're leaving with me this time"

"knew!"

Chapter 806

In the court hall of the Ming Dynasty Palace, three beautiful and glamorous women appeared in the 
court hall at some unknown time and said.

After these three powerful and beautiful women appeared, they looked at Ye Emperor with their 
eyes full of anger.



They didn't expect that the dignified Ye Di, who was half a step into the Golden Core realm, would 
take action against a little girl.

If Su Chen hadn't quickly rescued Su Yan, I'm afraid Su Yan would have been injured this time, or 
even killed by Ye Di.

After the Emperor Ye and the three powerful beautiful women restrained their pressure, the people 
in the court were very surprised when they looked at the three beautiful women who appeared. The 
appearance of the three land gods in the heaven and human realm made them None of them could 
have imagined it.

Moreover, these three powerful celestial beings are still very beautiful and glamorous women, 
which surprised these Ming officials.

"Father!"

After Su Yan was rescued by Su Chen, she hugged Su Chen tightly and didn't let go. She was 
frightened just now.

She didn't expect that a powerful man with a half-step golden elixir realm would take action against 
her. This was something she didn't expect

"The girl is fine, don't be afraid."Su Chen patted Su Yan's back and said comfortingly,

"Um!"

"Chengyi, come here and take care of Su Yan."Su Chen looked at Cheng Yi and the others next to 
him and waved and said,

"Yes, master!"

When Cheng Yi and the others heard Su Chen's words, they hurriedly came over to take care of Su 
Yan.



Cheng Yi and the others had just heard Su Yan call this ugly man his father, which made them all 
guess that this ugly man was Wu Xiangjun pretending to be Wu Xiangjun. Nothing happened to Mr. 
Xiang, which made them very happy.

Su Chen placed Su Yan on the dragon throne of the Ming Emperor.

He looked at the people around him expressionlessly.

Now there was no need for him to hide his identity. Su Yan was almost injured this time, but it made 
him very angry.

Su Chen looked at Ye Di and said expressionlessly,

"Ye Di, I kind of look down on you. For hundreds of years, I thought you were at least an admirable 
senior expert. I never thought you would attack a little girl."

Ye Di said with a cold face and a sneer,"Hi! The strong are respected! Survival of the fittest! I am a 
strong man at the half-step golden elixir realm, and a strong man will not be humiliated by ants."

Ye Di looked at Su Chen and felt that Duan Yu might be fake.

He had rescued Princess Su Yan just now. Even he didn't see clearly how this person rescued 
Princess Su Yan.

This person is now Ye Di. It was a little hard to see through.

Su Chen looked at Ye Emperor and felt that the old saying was right, the older a person gets, the 
less shameless he is. This Ye Emperor is over a hundred years old, and I am afraid that his face is 
even thicker than his own.

It can be said that someone in the Golden Core Realm attacked a six-year-old girl in such a grand 
manner.

This really overturned Su Chen's perception of shamelessness.



"You are so thick-skinned. No wonder you failed to seize the throne at a young age. What ability 
does a narrow-minded person have to ascend to the throne? Now you are so arrogant that you call 
him Emperor of Night. Why don't you just call him Emperor of Heaven?"

The corner of Ye Di's mouth twitched when he heard Su Chen's words.

When he looked at Su Chen, his eyes were filled with murderous intent. Who is this bastard who 
deceived him before?

"Who are you? You can't be Duan Yu of Dali?"

Chu Liuxiang looked at Su Chen at this time and was very sure of his identity.

He could never forget the movement skills of this bastard just now, and only that bastard Wu 
Xiangjun could use the elusive movement skills.

This bastard was not dead?

He even He disguised himself as an ugly middle-aged man and appeared in the Ming Palace. There 
is a way to heaven. If you don't go, there is no door to hell. You broke in. This bastard Wu Xiangjun 
is dead this time.

Chu Liuxiang looked at Su Chen and said He hurriedly shouted to Ye Di,"Master, he is not Duan 
Yu, he is Wu Xiangjun Su Chen."

Boom!

Everyone in the Ming Dynasty Hall was very shocked when they heard Chu Liuxiang's words.

They did not expect that Wu Xiangjun, whose life and death were unknown, would appear in the 
Ming Dynasty Hall, and no one even noticed it.

If Wu Xiangjun hadn't saved him this time. Daughter, I'm afraid people here haven't discovered that 
this ugly man is Wu Xiangjun's fake one.



Su Chen took off the human skin mask on his face and smiled.

This time, his identity was completely exposed, but this feeling It's really good. He doesn't want to 
pretend to be an ugly middle-aged man all the time.

"See the owner!"

"See you, Your Majesty!"

When Chengyi and the others saw Su Chen's true face, they all knelt down and saluted Su Chen. 
The twelve black bird guards also knelt down and saluted Su Chen.

Su Chen waved his hands to the black bird envoy and the black bird guards. He looked at Chu 
Liuxiang and said with a smile,"Chu Liuxiang, I didn't expect you to understand me like this. It 
seems that you really hate me."

"I will never forget the revenge of my broken arm."Chu Liuxiang looked at Su Chen and said 
angrily.

Su Chen shook his head and said with a smile,

"Ha ha! Isn't it just a feud with a broken arm? Where are Su Rongrong and Li Hongxiu? Your 
confidante is now my maid, and I can even visit them anytime."

"By the way, I forgot to tell you"

"Song Tian'er is also in Gusu City now. Your three great confidantes are all mine. Chu Liuxiang, 
what's the point of living for you?"

Shangguan Haitang and Qingqing in the court were speechless when they heard Su Chen's words.

This bastard is simply a shameless pervert.

How could he say these words?



Although they knew that Su Chen might be angry at Chu Liuxiang, they couldn't You're doing this 
with a woman's reputation!

Jiang Yuyan was standing aside in confusion.

She didn't even react now.

Jiang Yuyan looked at Su Chen's delicate and handsome face. She never thought that this lewd thief 
turned out to be Wu Xiangjun..

Wu Xiangjun, who is famous in Tianxuan Continent, actually had an entanglement with her.

No wonder this pervert wanted to help her settle Yihua Palace.

Yihua Palace was the harem of this shameless pervert. People will definitely obey.

The Emperor of the Ming Dynasty and the officials of the Ming Dynasty were stunned when they 
saw Su Chen's original face.

This person turned out to be Lord Wu Xiang.

Then why did Lord Wu Xiang get involved with Concubine Yan? The officials of the Ming Dynasty 
were stunned. When the officials thought of Su Chen's reputation, they looked at Concubine Yan in 
shock. Now they all thought that Concubine Yan Jiang Yuyan might have had a relationship with 
Lord Wu Xiang.

Their Ming Emperor was actually cuckolded by Lord Wu Xiang?

Yun Luo The princess now looked at Wu Xiangjun in shock.

She saw clearly when Wu Xiangjun rescued Su Yan just now, but Wu Xiangjun would appear in the 
Ming Dynasty hall in disguise?



How could this make her confused ? Unexpected.

Princess Yunluo is still in a daze now.

She feels that what happened today is more terrifying than yesterday.

Yesterday, she was worried that the Grand Master's Concubine Yan would take revenge on her. Now 
the Grand Master may be nothing here.

There are four super masters above the Celestial Realm in the court. I wonder if there will be other 
Celestial Realm masters?

Pfft!. When Chu Liuxiang heard Su Chen’s words, he spat out a mouthful of blood.

He didn't expect that a top nobleman like Wu Xiangjun would say such shameless words.

But he thought about Su Rongrong and Li Hong having sex with Su Chen in the future, which made 
him so angry that he wanted to kill this bastard immediately.

Chu Liuxiang's eyes were bloodshot. He glared at Su Chen and yelled angrily,

"Wu Xiangjun, you deserve to die!"

"A scumbag in the master realm should stop talking nonsense here."

Chapter 807

Su Chen didn't care about the enemy Chu Liuxiang at all, no!

Chu Liuxiang was no longer worthy of being his enemy.

If he hadn't wanted to wipe out all the anti-Soviet alliances in one fell swoop, Chu Liuxiang, an 
idiot, would still be useful. This idiot with a broken arm would have been killed by his order long 
ago.



Su Chen's current enemy was Ye Di, who was halfway to the Golden Core realm.

He had no intention of letting Ye Di go since Ye Di attacked Su Yan.

What's more, there is the matter of Ye Di's wife Shui Rou.

Su Chen had soaked Ye Di's wife Shui Rou. It can be said that Ye Di and him are eternal enemies.

Chu Liuxiang glared angrily at Su Chen and felt very helpless.

He really couldn't defeat this bastard.

He might not even be able to get close to this bastard and would be killed by his men.

Although this bastard is also at the level of a grandmaster, his weird body skills are hard to guard 
against, and he cannot avoid the attack from this bastard Wu Xiangjun.

Ye Di was speechless when he saw Su Chen forcing Chu Liuxiang, and even made Chu Liuxiang's 
mood very unstable.

No wonder Chu Liuxiang never broke through to the Grand Master?

Chu Liuxiang has a shameless enemy like Wu Xiangjun.

I'm afraid he won't be able to break through the demonic barrier without killing Wu Xiangjun, and 
he won't be able to break through to the Grand Master.

"Mr. Wu Xiang, you are very brave and dare to appear in the Ming Palace in disguise. Do you think 
you can escape this time?"

"Night Emperor, do you think you can kill me?"Su Chen shook his head when he heard Ye Di's 
words.



Su Chen, who must have been calm and collected by Ye Di, threatened with an expressionless 
face,"I want to kill you, you can't hide!"

"Anyone can talk nonsense, but I’m here and you try to kill me?"Su Chen curled his lips and said 
disdainfully,

"Um? Are you really not afraid of death?"

Ye Di didn't expect that Su Chen didn't care at all about his half-step golden elixir realm. Did Su 
Chen think that there were three powerful women here and he couldn't kill him?

Ye Di looked at Shi Guanyin San The woman didn't care.

Although it would be impossible to determine the winner immediately if they fought, he could kill 
Wu Xiangjun quickly.

"laugh!"

"court death!"

Boom, boom, boom!

When Emperor Ye saw Su Chen sneering at him, he waved his hand angrily towards Su Chen.

Shi Guanyin and the others also attacked Ye Emperor one after another.

The pillars of the entire court hall were instantly blocked by these four powerful The attack 
destroyed

"No, the hall is about to be trampled. Leave the hall quickly."

The main hall of the Ming Dynasty has begun to collapse, and huge rocks are falling from the top of 
the hall.



Dozens of ministers who have no martial arts skills in the hall are now running out of the hall in 
panic, but they are constantly falling. The huge rocks continued to smash to death the Ming officials 
who were fleeing for their lives.

Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Wuwu escorted the Ming Emperor and fled towards the main hall.

The Ming Dynasty's court hall suffered an unreasonable disaster this time. Four powerful super 
masters were in the court. They fought in the main hall of the Ming Dynasty. The Ming Dynasty's 
main hall could not be saved.

Su Chen teleported to avoid Ye Di's attack. He was now paying 100% of his mental power to pay 
attention to the old bastard Ye Di.

Su Chen faced a half As a super master in the Jindan realm, he did not dare to be careless.

When the Great Ming Dynasty Hall was about to collapse,

Su Chen looked at the confrontation between Shi Guanyin, the three girls, and Ye Di, and he looked 
towards the court hall. Among these people in the main hall, more than ten officials of the Ming 
Dynasty have been killed or injured, and the Emperor of the Ming Dynasty, who is being guarded 
by Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Yiwu, is about to escape from the main hall.

Su Yan has Cheng Yi and they will have no problem,

And Jiang Yuyan, a woman who didn't recognize her relatives, didn't quickly escape from the court 
hall at this time?

This made Su Chen look a little baffled.

"Xuanniao asks you to take people out of the court hall as soon as possible!"He teleported to Su 
Yan's side and ordered Cheng Yi and the others next to him,

"Yes, master!"



He looked at Shi Guanyin and the others, then hugged her and Princess Yunluo and disappeared into 
the main hall.

In the palace square, the people here were already impatient to wait.

It was already past Chen hour, but the Emperor of Ming Dynasty still There was no order to open 
the palace gate and let the Jianghu people leave.

The Jianghu people in the Palace Square were all irritable and noisy.

Boom boom boom!

"what happened?"

"Holy shit! Look, one of the palace halls is about to collapse."

"Is there a fight inside? Did the black bird envoy from Gusu City break up with the Ming Emperor? 
But how could a palace be destroyed? Has a super master appeared?"

"Look, those ministers are running out, huh? emperor? The Emperor of Ming Dynasty also ran out 
under escort"

"What's going on inside? How could a whole hall be destroyed?"

The people in the palace square were talking as they looked at the collapsing court halls. This 
sudden change surprised them.

There are many masters in the Ming Dynasty Palace, and there are only three great masters in Gusu 
City.

How could the main hall of the imperial palace be destroyed when the Bird Envoy entered ?

Are there other masters appearing in the main hall of the Ming Dynasty?



"The Imperial Guards rushed to protect the Holy Lord."A Ming general saw this situation and 
immediately ordered,

"Yes, General!"

Tens of thousands of forbidden troops rushed to the palace hall to protect the escaped Ming 
Emperor.

"alert! Defensive formation!"After the captain of the Black Bird Guard saw the collapsed palace 
hall, he immediately ordered the Black Bird Guard to be on guard.

Although he didn't know what happened in the palace hall, it was probably related to the Black Bird 
Envoy who entered the palace hall. He had to deal with the impending battle.

Lu Xiaofeng and others looked at the collapsed court hall and had no idea what was going on, but 
they all guessed that it must have something to do with the black bird envoy who entered the palace, 
or maybe even Su Yan. The girl caused trouble.

Sikong Zhaixing looked at the people escaping from the court hall and asked in confusion,

"Lu Xiaoji, what should we do? Lu

Xiaofeng rubbed his forehead and said helplessly,"Wait and see, if the Emperor of Ming Dynasty 
takes action against Xuanniiao, we will help him." Zhu

Qiqi stood aside and looked at the escaped Ming Emperor and suddenly asked,"Why hasn't that girl 
Su Yan appeared yet?" Could she also be in the court hall?"

"this......That girl isn't really in the court hall, is she?"Zhou Zhiruo said with worry on her face when 
she heard Zhu Qiqi's words.

Ximen Chuixue walked towards the court hall expressionlessly when she heard Zhou Zhiruo's 
words. Others also stood up and prepared to go there. They were all very worried about Su. Yan's 
safety.



Lu Xiaofeng appeared in front of everyone and stopped him,"Don't worry, everyone, if Su Yan is in 
the court hall, the Black Bird Envoy will protect her at the risk of his life. Let's not act rashly now, 
let's check the situation first."

Ximen Chuixue and Fu Hongxue also stopped after listening to Lu Xiaofeng's words.

The situation in the Ming Dynasty Hall is unknown now, and they can't act rashly.

If Su Yan hadn't caused the situation in the Ming Dynasty Hall, they might have taken action. It 
would cause big trouble.

After Emperor Ming came out under the protection of Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Yiyi, he looked at 
the collapsed court hall with a gloomy face.

First, the top of the Forbidden City was destroyed by Wu Xiangjun's sworn brother. Halfway 
through, he was humiliated by Princess Su Yan in the court hall. Now the Ming Dynasty's court hall 
was about to completely collapse. The

Ming Emperor was very angry now.

He ordered the Forbidden Army General next to him: ,"General of the Forbidden Army, order the 
Forbidden Army to surround these Gusu City troops. Not a single soldier of these Gusu City troops 
is allowed to leave.""

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

Chapter 808

In the Palace Square, the Forbidden Army General ordered 30,000 Imperial Guards to begin 
besieging the Black Bird Guards.

When tens of thousands of Imperial Guards began to besiege the Black Bird Guards, the people in 
the Palace Square retreated one after another. They did not want to participate in this senseless act. 
battle



"Black Bird Guards are on alert! Prepare the Qi-Breaking Crossbow!"The Black Bird Guards 
formed a circle and looked at the Ming Forbidden Army who were surrounding them from all 
directions. The commander of the Black Bird Guards waved his hands and ordered with an 
expressionless face.

Hundreds of Black Bird Guards held giant shields and formed a circular formation. , hundreds of 
black bird guards inside holding military crossbows pointed at the Ming Forbidden Army and 
surrounded them. The remaining black bird guards held Chang Ge and waited for the killing order 
with murderous expressions on their faces.

"A fight is about to begin. It seems that the talks between Ming Dynasty and Gusu City have 
completely broken down."

"Holy shit! Thousands of black bird guards fought against more than 30,000 forbidden troops. This 
time, all the black bird guards in Gusu City may be wiped out."

"The disparity between the armies is too great. Although the Blackbird Guards in Gusu City are 
very elite, they may be unable to save themselves when faced with dozens of times the Ming 
Forbidden Army."

"Who do you think was responsible for the collapse of the palace hall? There are Zhuge Zhengwo 
and Zhu Wuwu in the Chaotang hall, and even Cao Zhengchun from Dongchang and Liu Jin from 
Xichang. They are all great masters. Can only three Black Bird Envoys destroy the Chaotang hall?"

"There must be other masters in the court hall. I felt the pressure just now. It was very powerful. 
Now I am still sweating all over my body."

"Yes, I felt it too. I saw a super master in the court hall."

The Jianghu people in the palace square were hiding aside and talking.

They were also preparing to watch the Black Bird Guards and the Ming Forbidden Army who were 
about to fight. This time, the Black Bird Guards in Gusu City would probably be wiped out. After 
all, their The number of people was too small.

At this time,



Su Chen appeared in the Xuantiao Guard's formation with Su Yan and Princess Yunluo in his arms. 
When the Captain of the Xuannio Guard saw that it was Su Chen and Su Yan who were arriving, he 
hurriedly said to them. Su Chen and Su Yan said politely,

"Xuannio Guards, Commander Zhao Liwu, see you, Your Majesty! See the princess!"

Thousands of black bird guards also knelt down and saluted Su Chen and Su Yan in order,"See you, 
Your Majesty! See the princess!"

"No gift!"

Su Chen let go of Su Yan and the confused Princess Yunluo, waved his hand and said.

Su Chen looked at the Ming Emperor who was not far away and was guarded by layers of forbidden 
troops and smiled.

This Ming Emperor is probably going to swell again.

The tens of thousands of forbidden troops in the Ming Palace and the more than 100,000 city guards 
outside the Ming Palace may have emboldened the Ming Emperor. I am afraid that the humiliation 
the Ming Emperor suffered in the court will be recovered at this time.

Boom!

At this time, the Ming Court The main hall completely collapsed, and everyone inside also escaped. 
Those who did not escape may have been smashed to death in the main hall of the court.

Chengyi and the others also came to Su Chen with the twelve black bird guards. Shangguan 
Haitang, Qing Wu, and Tie Shou also came over.

Su Chen looked at the main hall and wanted to know how the battle between Shi Guanyin and the 
others was going with Ye Di?

Although they only fought for a few short rounds,



Ye Di After all, it is a very powerful half-step golden elixir realm.

Shi Guanyin and the three of them together may not be the opponent of Ye Di. There is a world of 
difference between the heavenly realm and the half-step golden elixir realm. The higher the 
cultivation level, the higher the level of cultivation. Later, the difference in strength was very 
obvious.

Su Chen touched his chin and wanted to know when the Jellyfish Yinji would arrive. If Jellyfish 
Yinji arrived late this time, I'm afraid Shi Guanyin and the others would be damaged this time. They 
may even be killed by the Night Emperor.

The palace square is very quiet now.

They did not expect that Lord Wu Xiang of Gusu City was not dead and even appeared in the 
Daming Palace. This shocked the people here.

Lu Xiaofeng and the others looked at Su Chen in shock.

They didn't expect that this bastard Su Chen would show up in the palace without any injuries, and 
that this bastard would make such a big fuss when he appeared. This made them laugh. Twitching.

Lu Xiaofeng looked at Su Chen and said to Ximen Chuixue and the others,

"We didn't expect that bastard Su Chen to show up in the past. What happened in the palace hall this 
time must be related to this bastard, or even done by this bastard."

Sikong Zhaixing looked at Su Chen and Su Yan and said helplessly,"What's more, Su Yan and Su 
Chen are both restless masters. Now they are together. Together, I am afraid that the Ming Palace 
will be destroyed by the father and daughter."

Others also looked helpless.

They are probably no longer in the eyes of Emperor Ming. Even Emperor Ming doesn't care about 
them at all.



If a bastard like Wu Xiangjun appears in the palace, I'm afraid Emperor Ming will do whatever it 
takes. We must also catch Wu Xiangjun.

When Lu Xiaofeng and the others came towards Su Chen, more than 20 guards from Fairy 
Yunmeng also came towards Su Chen with Yilin and Ning Zhongze’s mother and daughter.

"Let those people come over!"Su Chen smiled and ordered when he saw Lu Xiaofeng, Fairy 
Yunmeng, and Fairy Yunmeng coming over with Yi Lin.

However, Su Chen frowned when he saw Ning Zhongze and his daughter.

He didn't think about how Ning Zhongze and his daughter could do this. With Yilin, did something 
happen again last night?

"Yes, Your Majesty!"

Shangguan Haitang looked at the tens of thousands of forbidden troops surrounding this place.

When she came to Su Chen, she asked him,"Su Chen, what are you going to do this time? There are 
tens of thousands of forbidden troops in the Ming Palace, and there are more than 100,000 city 
guards outside the palace. How do you leave the Ming Empire safely?"

Su Yan looked at Shangguan Haitang and said with a smile,"Hehe, Shangguan Haitang, you don't 
have to worry, it's very easy for us to leave. The Ming army here can't stop us from leaving."

Su Yan has recovered now.

She was frightened in the palace hall just now.

She was just a six-year-old girl. She had never experienced such a threat before. This time she 
understood how powerful she was. This time ,

Su Yan saw that in addition to Shi Guanyin, there were two powerful land gods in the Celestial 
Realm. Those two beauties in the Celestial Realm were probably her father's confidante.



And there was also a very The powerful Jellyfish Yinji has not arrived, but I am afraid that the 
Jellyfish Yinji will arrive soon.

They have four powerful super masters here.

It is impossible for the army of the Ming Empire to stop them from leaving, and the Emperor of the 
Ming Dynasty does not dare to stop them from leaving. , unless the Emperor of the Ming Dynasty 
did not want to live anymore.

Shangguan Haitang lowered his head and thought after hearing Su Yan's words.

The three land gods who appeared just now were probably Su Yan's back-up, but the Ming Dynasty 
also had a very terrifying existence.

The Night Emperor She had heard the legend that Ye Di, who had even killed the Heavenly Realm, 
was very powerful.

Shangguan Haitang was afraid that the three Heavenly Realm masters who protected Su Yan this 
time were no match for Ye Di.

Lu Xiaofeng, Ximen Chuixue and the others After these people arrived, they greeted Su Chen one 
after another.

Lu Xiaofeng took a sip of wine from the wine gourd and smiled at Su Chen and said,

"Su Chen, you are really a disaster star. No matter where you appear, big things will happen. What 
did you do in the court hall of the Ming Dynasty this time?"

Su Chen said speechlessly after hearing Lu Xiaofeng's words,"I didn't do anything in the Ming 
Dynasty Palace. You should ask my daughter Su Yan about what happened in the palace."

"Father, you fell in love with the Ming Emperor"

"Holy shit! You bastard actually stole the Ming Emperor's concubine?"



Chapter 809

Su Yan heard her father Su Chen put all the blame on her, which made her look at Su Chen and curl 
her lips.

Although she was the one who caused this matter in the Ming Palace, as a father, Su Chen Can't you 
shirk responsibility like this?

Shouldn't a father protect his daughter?

Shouldn't the father take the responsibility for the trouble his daughter causes?

Su Yan looked at Su Chen and revealed the affair between him and Concubine Yan Jiang Yuyan. 
She didn't believe that her father had nothing to do with the beautiful Concubine Yan.

When Lu Xiaofeng and the others heard Su Yan's words, they all looked at Su Chen in surprise.

They didn't expect that this bastard Su Chen had cheated on the Emperor of Ming Dynasty.

So this time it might be really over. After the Emperor of Ming Dynasty knew that he had been 
cheated on, he would The Ming Emperor who could not let Su Chen go would probably not be able 
to let this shameless pervert off this time no matter what.

Next to them, Shangguan Haitang, Wuqing, Zhu Qiqi, Zhou Zhiruo, and even Ning Zhongze, his 
mother and daughter, and Princess Yunluo all looked at Su Chen in shock.

None of them expected that Su Chen had fallen in love with the Ming Emperor.

Only Yilin was dumbfounded. She didn't know what green meant.

She looked at Wu Xiangjun, who was an ugly man yesterday and now looks handsome.

Yilin looked at Su Chen with a bulging face and was very angry.



She was going to ask Su Chen why he wanted to He deceived her, but there were a lot of people 
here, and she was just embarrassed to question this bad guy now.

Yilin was very confused when she heard Su Yan's words just now.

Why did Princess Su Yan say that Su Chen had an affair with the Ming Emperor?

Everyone here looked at Su Chen strangely, even with expressions of surprise.

The little nun Yilin stupidly asked Su Yan,"Princess Su Yan, why did your father cheat on the Ming 
Emperor? Did your father splash green ink all over the Ming Emperor?"

Pfft!

"Ha ha ha ha......."

Lu Xiaofeng and others burst out laughing when they heard the little nun's words, and even the two 
ice cubes, Ximen Chuixue and Ye Gucheng, kept twitching on their faces.

Women such as Shangguan Haitang and Zhu Qiqi all had slightly red faces and were very 
uncomfortable.

Su Chen looked at the little nun Yilin with a speechless expression.

This little nun is too simple.

She has been walking in the world for several years. I am afraid that apart from some basic daily 
life in the secular world, she has nothing else. I don't know.

There is a huge gap between the little nun and her sister Dongfang Bubai.

"I go! Little nun, you don’t know this?"Su Yan looked at Yi Lin with a puzzled look and asked in 
surprise,



"I do not know!"

"Little nun, you are really a simple little woman. Fortunately you met my father, otherwise your 
future experience would definitely be very miserable."

Qingqing pulled the little girl Yilin and said to Su Yan,"It's not a good thing to meet such a 
shameless pervert like your father."

"Yes, your father is not a good person, he is just a shameless pervert."Shangguan Haitang was also 
staring at Su Chen and said,

"Well, Su Yan, your father is a big bad guy."Zhu Qiqi gestured to Su Chen and said angrily.

Zhou Zhiruo looked at these people speechlessly.

Now they are surrounded by tens of thousands of forbidden troops, but these people have forgotten 
about the tens of thousands of forbidden troops surrounding them. Are you there?

Is now the time to talk about this?

At this time, four powerful people appeared in the sky above the Daming Palace. They all stood in 
the air and faced each other.

Su Chen saw that nothing happened to Shi Guanyin and the others, and he thought Now is not the 
time to kill Ye Di, and Shi Guanyin and the others cannot kill Ye Di.

Now that Jellyfish Yin Ji has not arrived,

Su Chen can only think of ways to delay the time.

As long as Jellyfish Yin Ji arrives,

Su Chen will not Let Emperor Ye leave the Ming Palace alive.



He hurriedly shouted to Shi Guanyin and the others,"Shi Guanyin, Yunmeng, Hua Baifeng, you all 
come over!""

Whoosh whoosh!

When Su Chen called Shi Guanyin and the others back, Shi Guanyin and the others appeared next 
to Su Chen one by one in an instant. However, Shi Guanyin and Fairy Yunmeng smiled at Su Chen 
and stood beside him.

Hua Baifeng, on the other hand, stared at Su Chen angrily.

If this was not the time to teach this bastard a lesson, Hua Baifeng would have beaten this bastard 
severely.

In the palace square,

Emperor Ming looked at Wu Xiangjun and the others who were surrounded. He was very happy.

He wanted to take revenge for the humiliation he suffered in the court hall just now.

Also, Concubine Yan, that bitch, was sleeping with that bastard Wu Xiangjun. This was a cuckold 
for him. And it was still seen by all the officials of the Ming Dynasty.

This made the Emperor of the Ming Dynasty want to kill these two bitches immediately.

Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Yi ignored them, but their faces were very ugly now.

There were three heavenly beings in Wu Xiangjun's place. There are even more than ten super 
masters in the realm, and there are even more than ten grand masters, and there are dozens of master 
masters.

This makes them very worried that the Ming Emperor will be hot-headed and order an attack when 
they look at Wu Wuxiangjun.



Zhuge Zhengyi and Zhuge Zhengyi Ignoring them is also very speechless for Shangguan Haitang 
and Qingwu.

Wu Xiangjun's method of deceiving women is too powerful.

Shangguan Haitang and Qingwu were deceived by Wu Xiangjun at some time. Even Shangguan 
Haitang and Wuqing may have been cheated long ago. They knew that Lord Wu Xiang was in the 
palace, but they didn't tell either of them.

Zhu Mingwu and Zhuge Zheng looked at each other very helplessly.

But they saw that the four famous arresters and the remaining four spies were all It's because they 
are absent-minded. I'm afraid it's because Shangguan Haitang, Qingqing and the others have turned 
their backs on people like them, which makes them confused.

"Mr. Wu Xiang, you are unable to fly now. Surrender now."The Ming Emperor looked at the tens of 
thousands of forbidden troops around him and shouted loudly to Su Chen.

Su Chen looked at the now awesome Ming Emperor and said disdainfully,"Tsk! Emperor Ming, are 
you powerful now? You just knelt down for my daughter. Did you forget it so quickly?"

When Emperor Ming heard Su Chen's words, his face was full of anger. This bastard did it on 
purpose.

He must be humiliating himself on purpose.

Emperor Ming saw the stupid expressions of the imperial guards, and those people in the world 
were pointing and pointing without knowing what they were talking about.

He understood that he, the Ming Emperor, had lost all his dignity this time.

"Damn it! Mr. Wu Xiang, if I catch you in a while, your life will be worse than death."

"Emperor Ming, do you believe that I can kill you right now?"Su Chen pointed at the Ming 
Emperor and threatened with an expressionless expression,



"Escort! Escort!"

The Emperor of Ming Dynasty thought of Su Chen's elusive ability, and he was so frightened that 
he screamed.

Zhuge Zhengwo and Zhu Yi ignored, Cao Zhengchun, and Liu Jin immediately stood beside the 
Ming Emperor. They were also very impressed by Su Chen's elusive ability. Be vigilant.

If Lord Wu Xiang takes action against Emperor Ming,

I am afraid that Emperor Ming will not be able to escape Lord Wu Xiang’s attack.

The imperial guards around Emperor Ming are vigilant to protect Emperor Ming, although they are 
very jealous of Emperor Ming. disappointed, but after all, the Emperor of Ming Dynasty is their 
monarch and the supreme existence of Ming Dynasty.

"You are as timid as a rat!"

Chapter 810

Su Chen shook his head when he saw Emperor Ming who was so frightened that he called for escort 
just because of his threat.

It’s no wonder that the Ming Dynasty had such an emperor and his country was not destroyed.

No wonder that the Ming Dynasty’s tens of thousands of miles of territory, tens of millions of 
people, and millions of troops couldn’t even destroy a small Jurchen?

The emperor was just greedy for pleasure and squandered the legacy left by his ancestors.

If he hadn't appeared in this world,

I'm afraid the Ming Dynasty would have been destroyed by the Jurchens just like history.



At this time,

Ye Di was standing in the air with an expressionless face.

He was also undecided whether to kill Wu Xiangjun.

Wu Xiangjun was now protected by three powerful women. If he didn't kill these three A strong 
woman may not be able to kill Lord Wu Xiang.

Wu Xiangjun's teleportation ability made him somewhat helpless.

If he tried his best to kill Wu Xiangjun, he might be able to kill him, but would the three powerful 
women around Wu Xiangjun give him a chance?

Emperor Ye looked at the three girls Shi Guanyin and was very helpless.

He could kill Shi Guanyin and the others if he wanted to, but he would also pay a huge price.

This is not what he wants to see.

It is very important for Ye Emperor to advance to the Golden Core Realm.

If he is injured here, I am afraid that his promotion to the Golden Core Realm will be far away, and 
even the possibility of advancing to the Golden Core Realm will be cut off.

If a woman from the Heavenly Realm appears this time,

Ye Di can kill her without any damage, but there are two Heavenly Realm women here, and one is a 
woman who has just advanced to the Half-Step Golden Core Realm.

This made him unable to make up his mind whether to kill these powerful women with all his 
strength.



Su Chen looked at Ye Di in the sky and couldn't understand why he didn't fight Shi Guanyin and the 
others if he was so powerful?

Doesn't Emperor Ye not want to stand up for Emperor Ming?

But this isn’t right either?

In the palace hall, Emperor Ye's attitude was already very obvious. There was no way he would let 
him and Su Yan leave.

Then why doesn't the powerful Ye Di take action?

Su Chen hugged Shi Guanyin and Fairy Yunmeng beside him and asked doubtfully,"Madam, why 
didn't Ye Emperor start a fight with you?"

Shi Guanyin hugged them when he saw this bastard in full view of everyone, which made Shi 
Guanyin look a little confused. Reddish.

But she was very happy to be able to lean into Su Chen's arms. After all, she hadn't seen this bastard 
for several months.

Shi Guanyin smiled, hugged Su Chen's arm and said,

"He has concerns. The cultivation realm of Ye Emperor is probably about to advance to the Golden 
Core realm. If he starts a war with us at this time, although he can kill us, he will also be injured. If 
Ye Emperor is seriously injured at this time, I am afraid that he will advance to the Jindan realm. He 
will fail at the Golden Core Realm, and may even be cut off from his ability to advance to the 
Golden Core Realm in the future.

Fairy Yunmeng leaned into Su Chen's arms and said shyly,"Yeah!" If Emperor Ye goes out with all 
his strength to kill us, we cannot stop him, but under our counterattack regardless of life and death, 
Emperor Ye will also be seriously injured. This will be very unfavorable for him to advance to the 
golden elixir realm to resist the catastrophe in the future. As a last resort, Ye Di will definitely not 
risk killing us at this time."

Su Chen understood after hearing the words of Shi Guanyin and Fairy Yunmeng.



The old bastard Ye Di is really powerful. He is about to advance to the Golden Core Realm now. I 
am afraid that among his women, only Jellyfish Yinji can beat him.

"So this is ah! No wonder Ye Di didn't take action in a hurry. It seems that God is helping me this 
time. It may be impossible for Ye Di to advance to the Golden Core Realm this time. It's not even 
sure whether he has a chance to escape this time."

Hua Baifeng looked down upon this bastard hugging Shi Guanyin and Fairy Yunmeng in front of 
everyone.

This bastard is indeed a romantic ghost.

At this time, he still has time to make love with his woman.

Hua Baifeng looked at Su Chen and reminded,

"Shameless pervert, although Ye Di has not taken action this time, he may take action. You'd better 
not anger that old guy too much. It's better not to become an enemy. Su

Chen looked at the otaku Hua Baifeng and smiled helplessly and said,"Hua Baifeng, there is a life-
and-death relationship between Ye Di and I. From now on, either he dies or I die. There is no way 
we can resolve our grudges.""

Su Chen has captured Ye Di's wife.

If Hua Baifeng knew about it, he would definitely not say this.

If Ye Di knew about it,

I'm afraid he would desperately want to kill him.

He and Ye Di might have no choice but to To live alone, this is the hatred of seizing his wife.



For a master like Ye Di, at his level of cultivation,

I am afraid that face is more important than anything else, otherwise he would not be able to attack 
Su Yan in the main hall.

Huai Bai Feng heard Su Chen's words and asked in confusion,"Huh?" Is the hatred between you and 
Ye Di that big? Why didn't I see the hatred towards you from Emperor Ye's eyes?"

"That's something Ye Di doesn't know I've done yet."Su Chen looked at Ye Di in the sky and said 
softly,

"What did you do to anger Emperor Ye?"Hua Baifeng is now very sure that this bastard Su Chen 
must have offended Ye Emperor.

He is even afraid that it is impossible to resolve his offense against Ye Emperor, but how could this 
bastard offend someone as powerful as Ye Emperor?

Lu Xiaofeng and Sikong Zhaixing , Ximen Chuixue and the three of them twitched their mouths 
and looked very unnatural.

The three of them knew how Su Chen offended Ye Emperor.

This shameless pervert had deceived Ye Emperor's wife and even returned his favor. After 
becoming his wife, this bastard has a very powerful ability to commit suicide.

Fu Hongxue, Hua Manlou, and Ye Gucheng all felt that Lu Xiaofeng, Sikong Zhaixing, and the 
others were a little uncomfortable. They all guessed that Lu Xiaofeng and the others might know 
that Su Chen and The hatred of Emperor Ye.

Fu Hongxue couldn't help but asked Lu Xiaofeng,"Lu Xiaofeng, what grudges and hatred do Su 
Chen and Emperor Ye have?"

Women such as Shangguan Haitang and Zhu Qiqi also looked at Lu Xiaofeng. They also wanted to 
know what kind of hatred Su Chen and Ye Di had.



Su Yan saw that these people wanted to know about this matter, so she smiled and shook her head. ,

Lu Xiaofeng and the others would not dare to say anything about this matter, and even people who 
knew about it would not say it.

After all, it would be a bit bad for Madam Ye Di’s reputation.

The name Madam Ye Di would completely disappear from Tianxuan Continent in the future. Here, 
the name Shui Rou, Wu Xiangjun’s wife, will continue to appear in Tianxuan Continent.

Shi Guanyin also smiled and did not tell Hua Baifeng.

When she saw Fairy Yunmeng also looking like she wanted to know, she asked Fairy Yunmeng 
shook her head.

Su Chen looked at Hua Baifeng's curious look and turned away and ignored her.

How could he say this?

People who know this in the future will also slowly forget about it. Even if Ye Di was killed,

Su Chen didn't want anyone to mention this matter again.

Lu Xiaofeng looked at Fu Hongxue and other women like Shangguan Haitang and looked at him, 
which made Lu Xiaofeng almost run away.

This matter can Did he say it out loud?

If he told this matter, I'm afraid Ye Di would kill Su Chen at all costs.

Lu Xiaofeng's face turned dark and she hurriedly waved her hands to them and said,"I don't know, 
you don't have to look at me like this." We, we really don't know"



"Lu Xiaoji, you know how I feel? Are you afraid to speak out?"
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